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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Joseph H. Vicari

] ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn Tel: (732)929-2005
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea Fax: (732)505-1918
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: January 18, 2023 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED to Driftwood Deli & Sub
Shop LLC and Greenwald Caterers, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on ltem Nos. 11b,
11c¢, 12b, 13b, 14a, 14b, 14c, 15a, 15b and 15c¢. All no bid items will be rebid. All other items will be rebid to
obtain additional vendors. (B2023-01)

Official Resolution# [2023000035
Meeting Date 01/18/2023
Introduced Date 01/18/2023
Adopted Date 01/18/2023
Agenda ltem n-1

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-01
Result Adopted
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaue \. Guotkrar”

Clerk Of The Board
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CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
RS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES,

RESOLUTION

January 18, 2023

WHEREAS, on November 29, 2022, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED for the
County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Driftwood Deli & Sub Shop LLC Greenwald Caterers

936 Fischer Blvd. 72B Park Avenue

Toms River, NJ 08753 Lakewood, NJ 08701

(732) 270-3811 (732) 370-8300

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely that of, DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB
SHOP LLC and GREENWALD CATERERS. No bids were received on item Nos. 11b, 11c,
12b, 13b, 14a, 14b, 14c, 15a, 15b and 15¢. All no bid items will be rebid. All other items will
be rebid to obtain additional vendors.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED for the County
of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through January 17, 2024, a period of
one (1) year, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the

right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

Introduced on: January 18, 2023
Adopted on: January 18, 2023
Official Resoluti¢n#: 2023000035
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A DRIFTWOOD DEL]I & SUB SHOP LLC for thirty three (33) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1a, 1b, Ic, 2a, 2b, 2¢, 3, 4, 5a, 5b, Sc, 6a, 6b, 6¢, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11a, 12a, 12¢, 12d,

13a, 13¢, 13d, 16a, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 16e, 16f, 16g and 17.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. GREENWALD CATERERS for forty four (44) items, to wit:

ITEMS NO. 18a, 18b, 18c, 19a, 19b, 19c¢, 20, 21, 22a, 22b, 22c¢, 23a, 23b, 23c, 24, 25, 26,
27, 28a, 28b, 28c, 29a, 29b, 29¢, 29d, 30a, 30b, 30c, 30d, 31a, 31b, 31c, 32a, 32b, 32¢, 33a,
33b, 33c, 33d, 33e, 33f, 33g, 34 and 35.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by
the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed
quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-01.

4. Be it further resolved that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made
available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

and the successful bidders.
Introduced on: January 18, 2023
Adopted on: January 18, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023000035
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP LLC

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

8. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection. -

Confirmed

9. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line Iltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

SECTION | - VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
BREAKFAST MENU
la Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $9.95
1b Breakfast Menu to serve 26 to 75 pe‘op|e, price per person EA $9.95
Y
1c Breakfast Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $9.95
Introduc : uary 18 2023 ’
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP LLC g

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
LUNCH MENU
\/ 2a Lunch Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $14.25
J 2b Lunch Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $14.25
\/ 2c Lunch Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $14.25
LUNCH OPTION
J 3 Lunch Option - Side Salads, price per person EA $2.25
COLD BEVERAGE SERVICE
J 4 Cold Beverage Service, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $1.85
HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE
/ 5a Hot Beverage Service to serve 1to 25 people, price per person EA $1.85
\/ Sb Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $1.85
\/ 5¢ Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $1.85
SELF-SERVE HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE
J 6a Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $1.85
/ 6b Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $1.85
J 6¢ Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $1.85
Introduced on: January 18, 2023
Aoy AP ERORT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

MEALS, DELIVERED

DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP LLC

Res-Pg:n.1-6

SCLNPN

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
ASSORTED PLATTERS -
7 Assorted Cheese & Cracker Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $4.10
8 Assorted Cookie Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $3.00
9 Assorted Vegetable Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $4.10
10 Assorted Fruit Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $4.10

SECTION JI - SHERIFF'S DEPARTMENT RADIOLOGICAL EMERGENCY RESPONSE PLAN {(RERP) AND FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS UPON DECLARED STATE OF

EMERGENCY
BREAKFAST MENU
J 11a Cold Breakfast, price per person (minimum of 10 people} EA $9.95
11b Hot Breakfast, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA No Bid X
11c Self-Serve Hot Beverage, price per person (minimum of 10 people) CEA No Bid X
LUNCH MENU
\/ 12a Cold Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $14.25
12b Hot Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 people} EA No Bid X
J 12¢ Side Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.25
\/ 12d Self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $1.85
DINNER MENU

Introduced on:

Janyary 18, 2023

AdoptedpRDPOSAL DOOUARENTIRPORT

Official Regolyfientts 28#1908%¥o
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Res-Pg:n.1-7
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP LLC | g

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line ftem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
\/ 13a Cold Dinner, price per person (minimum of 10 people} EA $14.25
13b Hot Dinner, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA No 8Bid X
\/ 13c Side Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.25
J 13d Self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $1.85

PIZZA - EACH PIZZA SHALL SERVE TWO (2) PEOPLE

14a Large Plain Pie and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA No Bid X

14b Large Pie with one (1) topping and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person {minimum EA No Bid X
of 10 people)

1l4c Large Pie with two (2) toppings and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person {minimum EA No Bid X
of 10 people)

SECTION IIl - JUVENILE SERVICES

WHOLE PIZZAS
15a Large 16" Plain Cheese Pizza, No Toppings, price per pizza EA No Bid X
15b Large 16" Cheese Pizza with one (1) Topping, price per pizza EA No Bid X
15c¢ Large 16" Cheese Pizza with two (2) Toppings, price per pizza EA No Bid X
SUBMARINE SANDWICHES
\/ 16a 12" Turkey & Provolone Cheese Submarine SandWich, price per sandwich EA $17.99
Introdu 18, 2023
AdoptedpROPOSAL DROUAWENTZREPORT
official Regelyfients 28810 RED
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP LLC Res-Pg:n.1-8

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

J 12" Roast Beef & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich

j 16¢ 12" Ham, Capicola & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99

/ 16d 12" Ham & American Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99
16e 12" Tuna Fish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99
16f 12" Chicken Salad Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99

\/ ' 16g 12" Assorted three (3) Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99

SALAD
J 17 Tossed Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.25

SECTION iV- KOSHER MEALS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

BREAKFAST MENU
18a Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA No Bid X
18b Breakfast Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA No Bid X
18c Breakfast Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA No Bid X
LUNCH MENU
19a Lunch Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA No Bid X
19b Lunch Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA No Bid X
Introduced on: January 18, 2023

AdoptedoppOSAL DEFOLANE ST F2SORT
Offiial Resolyonts AAZR00NIR,
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Res-Pg:n.1-9
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ~ GREENWALD CATERERS ,

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
16b 12" Roast Beef & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA No Bid X
16¢ 12" Ham, Capicola & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA No Bid X
16d 12" Ham & American Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA No Bid X
16e 12" Tuna Fish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA No Bid X
16f 12" Chicken Salad Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA No Bid X
16g 12" Assorted three (3) Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA No Bid X
SALAD
17 Tossed Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA " No Bid X

SECTION IV- KOSHER MEALS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

BREAKFAST MENU
J 18a Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $20.00
J 18b Breakfast Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $20.00
18¢c Breakfast Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $18.50
LUNCH MENU
19a Lunch Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $30.00
J 19b Lunch Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $28.00
Introduced on: January 18, 2023
ggffggdmoorosm ! DRCVANENTIEPORT
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Res-Pg:n.1-10
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT GREENWALD CATERERS g

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

\/ 19¢ Lunch Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per person
LUNCH OPTION

\/' 20 Lunch Option - Side Salads, price per person | EA $4.50
COLD BEVERAGE SERVICE

J 21 Cold Beverage Service, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $8.50
HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE

J 22a Hot Beverage Service to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $7.50

/ 22b Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $6.50

/ 22¢ Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $5.50

SELF-SERVE HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE

23a Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $7.50
/ 23b Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $6.50
23c Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $5.50
ASSORTED PLATTERS
24 Assorted Cheese & Cracker Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $12.00
j 25 Assorted Cookie Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $10.00
Introduced on; January 18, 2023
gg;g;ﬁggq POSAL HORIMARTAEPORT
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Res-Pg:n.1-11
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT GREENWALD CATERERS

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No 8id Comments:
Measure
\/ 26 Assorted Vegetable Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $12.00
\/ 27 Assorted Fruit Platter, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $9.50
SECTION V - KOSHER MEALS FOR THE SHERIFF'S DEPARTMENT RADIOLOGICAL EMERGENCY RESPONSE PLAN (RERP) AND FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS UPON
DECLARED STATE OF EMERGENCY
BREAKFAST MENU
\/ 28a Cold Breakfast, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $25.00
/ 28b Hot Breakfast, price per person {minimum of 10 people) ' EA $30.00
J 28c Self-Serve Hot Beveragé, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $30.00
LUNCH MENU
J 29%a Cold Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $23.00
\/ 29b Hot Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $30.00
29c Side Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $4.50
/ 29d Self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $8.50
DINNER MENU
\/ 30a Cold Dinner, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $24.00
\/ 30b Hot Dinner, price per person (minimum of 10 people) . EA $31.00
J 30c Side Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $4.50
Introduced on; January 18, 2023
AdoptedpRDPOSAL DBOUANENTI2BORT
oriial Regolyfents 24Nk
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Res-Pg:n.1-12
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT GREENWALD CATERERS

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

A

30d Self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $8.50

PIZZA - EACH P12ZA SHALL SERVE TWO (2) PEOPLE

31a Large Plain Pie and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $15.00

31b Large Pie with one (1) topping (NO MEAT) and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person EA $14.00
{minimum of 10 people)

31c Large Pie with two (2} toppings {(NO MEAT) and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per EA $19.00
person (minimum of 10 people)

LGN

SECTION VI - KOSHER MEALS FOR JUVENILE SERVICES

WHOLE PIZZAS

32a Large 16" Plain Cheese Pizza, No Toppings, price per pizza EA $23.00

32b Large 16" Cheese Pizza with one (1) Topping (NO MEAT), price per pizza EA $25.00

32c Large 16" Cheese Pizza with two (2) Toppings (NO MEAT), price per pizza EA $28.00

SUBMARINE SANDWICHES

/ 33a 12" Turkey or Chicken with Grilled Vegetables, price per sandwich EA $18.00

33b 12" Turkey or Chicken with Fresh Vegetables, price per sandwich EA $18.00
33c 12" Roast Beef and Grilled Vegetables, price per sandwich ' EA $22.00
J 33d 12" Roast Beef and Fresh Vegetables, price per sandwich EA $16.00
Introduced on: January 18, 2023
ggf?!?tﬁd PROl POSAL JEIMARTZREPORT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT GREENWALD CATERERS

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

12" Tuna Fish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich (Shall NOT be served with
any other meat options)

33f 12" Chicken Salad Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $14.00

33g 12" Assorted three {3) Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich {Shall NOT EA $14.00
be offered at the same meal as Turkey, Beef or Chicken)

SALAD

34 Tossed Salad, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $5.50

ONSITE FEE FOR RABBI OR MASHGIACH

RN EY

35 Flat Fee for Onsite Supervision by a Rabbi or Mashgiach, per event EA $450.00

Res-Pg:n.1-13

Introduced on:

January 18. 2023

Adopted pRO POSAL GOTUMNART2RZPORT

Official Resplyfioryt: 2053000036
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