

KR



Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Barbara Jo Crea
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191
(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: April 17, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER TO A.T. Northern New Jersey, LLC; Bellmawr Truck Repair Co., Inc.; Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Cherry Valley Tractor; Foley, Incorporated; Groff Tractor Mid Atlantic, LLC DBA GT Mid Atlantic; H.A. Dehart & Son, Inc.; Johnson & Towers, LLC; On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; and Thomas Makuch, LLC DBA Accurate Towing Service, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were receiv ...

Official Resolution#	202400522						
Meeting Date	04/17/2024						
Introduced Date	04/17/2024						
Adopted Date	04/17/2024						
Agenda Item	k-5						
CAF #							
Purchase Req. #	B2024-48						
Result	Adopted						
COUNTY COMMISSIONER	PRES.	ABS.	MOVE	SEC	AYE	NAY	ABST.
Crea	<						
Quinn	<			<	<		
Haines	<				<		
Kelly	<		<		<		
Sadeghi	<				<		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Michelle I. Gunther

Clerk Of The Board

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS
NO. B2024-48

RESOLUTION

April 17, 2024

WHEREAS, on February 21, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefore, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder

A. T. Northern New Jersey, LLC
525 Linden Ave. West
Linden, NJ 07036
(908) 862-8181

Campbell Freightliner, LLC
1015 Cranbury South River Road
Monroe, NJ 08831
(732) 287-1500

Foley, Incorporated
855 Centennial Avenue
Piscataway, NJ 08854
(732) 885-5555

H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.
311 Crown Point Road
Thorofare, NJ 08086
(856) 845-2800

On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.
36 Edgeboro Road
East Brunswick, NJ 08816
(732) 651-1600

R.J. Sherman & Associates, Inc.
DBA Vermeer North Atlantic
7 Maple Avenue
Lumberton, NJ 08048
(800) 624-0623

Name and Address of Bidder

Belmawr Truck Repair, Co., Inc.
781 Creek Road
Bellmawr, NJ 08031
(856) 933-3942

Cherry Valley Tractor
35 West Route 70
Marlton, NJ 08053
(856) 983-0111

Groff Tractor Mid Atlantic, LLC
dba GT Mid Atlantic
551 N Harding Highway
Vineland, NJ 08360
(908) 910-1899

Johnson & Towers, LLC
2701 Fire Road
Egg Harbor, NJ 08234
(757) 673-7141

Thomas Makuch, LLC dba
Accurate Towing Service
46 Reney Street
Toms River, NJ 08753
(732) 664-4441

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications, be accepted, in each instance, namely, A.T. NORTHERN NEW JERSEY, LLC; BELLMAWR TRUCK REPAIR CO. INC.; CAMPBELL FREIGHTLINER, LLC; CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR; FOLEY, INCORPORATED; GROFF TRACTOR MID ATLANTIC, LLC DBA GT MID ATLANTIC; H.A. DEHART & SON, INC.; JOHNSON & TOWERS, LLC; ON-SITE FLEET SERVICE, INC.; THOMAS MAKUCH, LLC DBA ACCURATE TOWING SERVICE. No bids were received on Item Nos. 3, 4, 8, 11, 12, 17, 18, 19, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 29, 31, 34, 38, 41, 44, 45, 49, 50, 52, 53, 60, 66, 67, 68, 72, 73, 74, 76, 77, 78 and 80. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 5, 15, 16, 28, 30, 33, 37, 47, 51 and 79. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. Item Nos. 2, 6, 7, 9, 10, 20, 26, 27, 32, 35, 36, 39, 40, 42, 43, 46, 54, 58, 62, 63, 64, 65, 75, 81, 82, 83, 85, 86, 87 and 88 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of Repair Services for Vehicles and Equipment with GVWR 15,000 Lbs. or Greater for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through April 16, 2026, a period of two (2) years or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. A.T. NORTHERN NEW JERSEY, LLC. for three (3) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 26, 27 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. BELLMAWR TRUCK REPAIR CO. INC. for ten (10) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 55, 56, 57, 59, 61, 62, 65, 69, 84 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. CAMPBELL FREIGHTLINER, LLC for six (6) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 13, 14, 20, 43, 54 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

D. CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR for five (5) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 32, 35, 36, 46 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

E. FOLEY, INCORPORATED for two (2) items, to wit:

ITEMS NO. 10 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

F. GROFF TRACTOR MID ATLANTIC, LLC DBA GET MID ATLANTIC

for two (2) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 9 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

F. H.A. DEHART & SON, INC. for seven (7) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 6, 7, 39, 40, 42, 48 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

G. JOHNSON & TOWERS, LLC for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 2, 13, 14 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

H. ON-SITE FLEET SERVICE, INC. for twelve (12) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 48, 55, 56, 57, 59, 61, 64, 65, 69, 70, 71 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

I. THOMAS MAKUCH LLC DBA ACCURATE TOWING SERVICE for
thirteen (13) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 58, 63, 70, 71, 75, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87 and 88.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials and services to be acquired by these contracts shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-48.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Purchasing Department, Department of Finance, Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

A. T. NORTHERN NEW JERSEY, LLC

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Item	Description	Est Qty	Unit of Measure	Est Price	Max Bid	Contact Name & Phone #	Comments
13	Cummins	50	HR	\$160.00	\$8,000.00	KYLE MIHANSKY	
14	Detroit Diesel		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
15	Eldorado		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
16	Elgin		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
17	Elliot		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
18	Extec		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
19	Ford Heavy Duty Trucks		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
20	Freightliner		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
21	General Motors		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
22	Girardin		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
23	Glaval		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
24	Goodall		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
25	Goshen		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
26	International Bus	50	HR	\$160.00	\$8,000.00	KYLE MIHANSKY	EXT.4266
27	International	150	HR	\$160.00	\$24,000.00	KYLE MIHANSKY	EXT.4266
28	Isuzu		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X
29	John Deere		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X

A. T. NORTHERN NEW JERSEY, LLC

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Location	Description	Est. Qty	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Alt Bid	Cost per Sq. Ft. & Comments
83	Hydraulic Pump Motors		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
84	PTO		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
85	Starters		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
86	Alternators		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
87	Fuel Tanks		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Group/Price Line 85:							
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10= \$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x _____%)=	1	LS	\$181,720.00	\$181,720.00		BILL LOFTUS -35.1%

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted Resolution: 202400522

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

BELMAWR TRUCK REPAIR

Res-Pg:k.5-7

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est Qty	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	No Bid	Contact Name & Phone #
49	Vac Con		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
50	Vactor		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
51	Vermeer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
52	Versalift East		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
53	Volvo		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
54	Western Star		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major							
55	Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major	50	HR	\$85.00	\$4,250.00		
Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor							
56	Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor	50	HR	\$85.00	\$4,250.00		
Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major							
57	Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major	500	HR	\$85.00	\$42,500.00		
Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes							
58	Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates							
59	Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates	50	HR	\$85.00	\$4,250.00		
Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts							
60	Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	

Introduced On: April 17, 2024

Adopted Response Document Report

Official Bid: REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Notes	Contact Name & Phone #	Comments
Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's								
61	Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's	100	HR	\$85.00	\$8,500.00			
Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders								
62	Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders	50	HR	\$85.00	\$4,250.00			
Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches								
63	Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats								
64	Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers								
65	Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers	500	HR	\$85.00	\$42,500.00			
Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges								
66	Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers								
67	Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools								
68	Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines								
69	Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines	500	HR	\$85.00	\$42,500.00			

BELMAWR TRUCK REPAIR

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price	No Bid	Contact Name & Phone #	Comments
84	PTO	50	HR	\$85.00	\$4,250.00			
85	Starters		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
86	Alternators		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
87	Fuel Tanks		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Group/Price Line 85:								
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10= \$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x _____%)=	1	LS	-\$0.15	-\$0.15		42,000.00	1590
					\$238,000			

CAMPBELL FREIGHTLINER, LLC

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Item No.	Manufacturer	Est. Qty	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Quantity	Estimate Name & Phone #
13	Cummins	50	HR	\$199.00	\$9,950.00		PJ Farrell 732-287-1500
14	Detroit Diesel	50	HR	\$199.00	\$9,950.00		PJ Farrell 732-287-1500
15	Eldorado		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
16	Elgin		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
17	Elliot		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
18	Extec		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
19	Ford Heavy Duty Trucks		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
20	Freightliner	50	HR	\$199.00	\$9,950.00		PJ Farrell 732-287-1500
21	General Motors		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
22	Girardin		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
23	Glaval		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
24	Goodall		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
25	Goshen		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
26	International Bus		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
27	International		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

CAMPBELL FREIGHTLINER, LLC

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Item Item	Description	Unit Qty	Unit Price	Material	Quantity	Material	Quantity	Material	Quantity	Material	Quantity
28	Isuzu			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
29	John Deere			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
30	Kenworth			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
31	Komtech			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
32	Kubota			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
33	Mack			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
34	McCloskey			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
35	New Holland Agriculture			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
36	New Holland Construction			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
37	Peterbilt			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
38	Powerscreen			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
39	Ricon			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
40	Schwarze			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
41	Startrans			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
42	Stellar Crane			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
43	Sterling	50		HR	\$199.00	\$9,950.00				PJ Farrell 732-287- 1500	
44	Supreme			HR	No Bid	No Bid	X				

CAMPBELL FREIGHTLINER, LLC

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price	No Bid	Contact Name & Phone #	Comments
80	Versa Lift East		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild								
81	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
82	Hydraulic Rams		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
83	Hydraulic Pump Motors		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
84	PTO		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
85	Starters		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
86	Alternators		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
87	Fuel Tanks		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Group/Price Line 85:								
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10=\$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST: \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x ___%)=	1	LS	\$266,000.00	\$266,000.00		Phil Solomine, 732-287-1500	5%

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est Qty	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Bid or Not	Contact Name	Comments
31	Komtech		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
32	Kubota	50	HR	\$140.00	\$7,000.00		Brian Wright	
33	Mack		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
34	McCloskey		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
35	New Holland Agriculture	120	HR	\$140.00	\$16,800.00		Brian Wright	
36	New Holland Construction	50	HR	\$140.00	\$7,000.00		Brian Wright	
37	Peterbilt		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
38	Powerscreen		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
39	Ricon		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
40	Schwarze		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
41	Startrans		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
42	Stellar Crane		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
43	Sterling		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
44	Supreme		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
45	Sweeprite		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
45	Sweeper	50	HR	\$140.00	\$7,000.00		Brian Wright	

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted on: APRIL 17, 2024

Official Resolution: 2024060522

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Unit	Qty	Unit Price	Subtotal	Unit Price	Subtotal	Unit Price	Subtotal	Contact Name	Phone #
82	Hydraulic Rams	HR		No Bid		No Bid		X			
83	Hydraulic Pump Motors	HR		No Bid		No Bid		X			
84	PTO	HR		No Bid		No Bid		X			
85	Starters	HR		No Bid		No Bid		X			
86	Alternators	HR		No Bid		No Bid		X			
87	Fuel Tanks	HR		No Bid		No Bid		X			
Group/Price Line 88:											
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10= \$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x _____%)=		1	LS	\$238,000.00	\$238,000.00				Brian Wright	-15%

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted by: RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution: 2024-00152

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

FOLEY, INCORPORATED

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Measure	Est. Price	Info. Price	Notes	Contract Name & Project #	Comments
10	Caterpillar Construction	1,000	HR	\$305.00	\$305,000.00		Mark Helsen 215-245-2737	This is a single blended shop & field rate and assumes Ocean County does not pay for travel time, mileage nor miscellaneous charges.
11	Chevrolet		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
12	Collins		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
13	Cummins		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
14	Detroit Diesel		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
15	Eldorado		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
16	Elgin		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
17	Elliot		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
18	Extac		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
19	Ford Heavy Duty Trucks		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
20	Freightliner		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
21	General Motors		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
22	Girardin		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted by Resolution No. 2024-0015 on April 17, 2024

Official Record No. 2024-0015

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

FOLEY, INCORPORATED

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Marked	Contact Name & Phone #
77	PSC Pressure Washer	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
78	Riveer	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
79	Vermeer	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
80	Versa Lift East	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild						
81	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
82	Hydraulic Rams	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
83	Hydraulic Pump Motors	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
84	PTO	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
85	Starters	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
86	Alternators	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
87	Fuel Tanks	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Group/Price Line 85:						
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10= \$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % In the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x _____%)=	LS	\$280,000.00	\$280,000.00		Mark Heisen 215-245-2737
0% discount; there is no Unit Cost column so the figure was entered in the Unit Price column						

GROFF TRACTOR MID ATLANTIC, LLC DBA GT MID ATLANTIC

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES

Item	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	No Bid	Contact Name & Phone #	Comments
Category 1: OEM Repairs and Preventive Maintenance: Major								
1	Altec	260	HR	\$160.00	\$41,600.00			
2	Allison Transmission		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
3	American Rolloff		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
4	Aquatech		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
5	Blue Bird		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
6	Braun		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
7	Camel		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
8	Case IH		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
9	Case Construction	50	HR	\$150.00	\$7,500.00			
10	Caterpillar Construction		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
11	Chevrolet		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
12	Collins		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
13	Cummins		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
14	Detroit Diesel		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted by: RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution: 2024000522

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

GROFF TRACTOR MID ATLANTIC, LLC DBA GT MID ATLANTIC

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Bid Bid	Contact Name & Phone #
85	Alternators		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
87	Fuel Tanks		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Group/Price Line 85:							
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10=\$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount: % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x _____%)=	1	LS	\$283,200.00	\$269,200.00		-\$16,800.00 6% off CASE parts Only

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted on: APRIL 17, 2024
Official Response Document Report
Official Resolution # 2024000522

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response. Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES

Line Item	Description	Est Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price	No Bid	Contact Name & Phone #	Comments
Category 1: OEM Repairs and Preventive Maintenance: Major								
1	Altec		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
2	Allison Transmission		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
3	American Roll-off		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
4	Aquatech		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
5	Blue Bird		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
6	Braun	25	HR	\$142.50	\$3,562.50		Chuck Chaplick 856-845-2800	
7	Camel	50	HR	\$135.00	\$6,750.00		Rich Treharne 856-845-2800	
8	Case IH		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
9	Case Construction		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted for RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Release for BIDDING REPORT

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. T8D

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Material	Contract Number & Project #	Comments
28	Isuzu		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
29	John Deere		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
30	Kenworth		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
31	Kompletech		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
32	Kubota		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
33	Mack		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
34	McCloskey		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
35	New Holland Agriculture		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
36	New Holland Construction		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
37	Peterbilt		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
38	Powerscreen		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
39	Ricon	50	HR	\$142.50	\$7,125.00		Chuck Chaplick 856-845-2800	
40	Schwarze	50	HR	\$135.00	\$6,750.00		Rich Treharne 856-845-2800	
41	Startrans		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted on: April 17, 2024

Official Response Document Report

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GWWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Estimate	Accepted	Supplier
42	Stellar Crane	50	HR	\$135.00	\$6,750.00			Rich Treharne 856-845-2800
43	Sterling		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
44	Supreme		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
45	Sweeprite		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
46	Sweepster		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
47	Terax		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
48	Thomas	50	HR	\$142.50	\$7,125.00			Chuck Chaplick 856-845-2800
49	Vac Con		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
50	Vactor		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
51	Vermeer		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
52	Versalift East		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
53	Volvo		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
54	Western Star		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major								
55	Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major				No Bid		X	

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted on: APRIL 16, 2024
 Official Response Document Report
 Resolution # 2024060522

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GWWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

H.A. DEHART & SON, INC.

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Vendor Name & Phone #	Comments
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10= \$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(280,000.00 x _____%)=	1	LS	\$5,600.00	\$5,600.00	Rich Treharne 856-845-2800	2% Off List
					\$274,400		

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted by: H.A. DEHART & SON, INC. APR 17 2024

Official: [Signature]

Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

1.1. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response. Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES

Item #	Description	Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Material	Category	Comments
1	Altec	260	HR	\$205.00	\$53,300.00		Gary Wright (609) 272-1415	Service Writer/Service Manager
2	Allison Transmission	50	HR	\$165.00	\$8,250.00		Gary Wright (609) 272-1415	Service Writer/Service Manager
3	American Rolloff		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
4	Aquatech		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
5	Blue Bird	50	HR	\$165.00	\$8,250.00		Gary Wright (609) 272-1415	Service Writer/Service Manager
6	Braun		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
7	Camel		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		

Category 1: OEM Repairs and Preventive Maintenance: Major

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Item No.	Description	Unit	Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Material	Manpower	Equipment	Other	Notes
8	Case IH	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			
9	Case Construction	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			
10	Caterpillar Construction	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			
11	Chevrolet	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			
12	Collins	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			
13	Cummins	HR	50	\$165.00	\$8,250.00					Service Writer/Service Manager Gary Wright (609) 272-1415
14	Detroit Diesel	HR	50	\$165.00	\$8,250.00					Service Writer/Service Manager Gary Wright (609) 272-1415
15	Eldorado	HR	25	\$165.00	\$4,125.00					Service Writer/Service Manager Gary Wright (609) 272-1415
16	Elgin	HR	50	\$165.00	\$8,250.00					Service Writer/Service Manager Gary Wright (609) 272-1415
17	Elliot	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			
18	Extec	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			
19	Ford Heavy Duty Trucks	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			
20	Freightliner	HR	50	\$165.00	\$8,250.00					Service Writer/Service Manager Gary Wright (609) 272-1415
21	General Motors	HR		No Bid	No Bid		X			

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Unit	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Est. Price	Accepted	Contact Name & Phone #
81	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	HR		No Bid	No Bid	X	
82	Hydraulic Rams	HR		No Bid	No Bid	X	
83	Hydraulic Pump Motors	HR		No Bid	No Bid	X	
84	PTO	HR		No Bid	No Bid	X	
85	Starters	HR		No Bid	No Bid	X	
86	Alternators	HR		No Bid	No Bid	X	
87	Fuel Tanks	HR		No Bid	No Bid	X	
Group/Price Line 85:							
38	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10= \$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x ____%)=	LS	1	\$235,200.00	\$235,200.00		List less 16%, Contact: Kurt Lofink, Parts Manager, (856) 222-2405

ON-SITE FLEET SERVICE, INC.

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit of Measure	Est. Price	Total Price	Take Home	No Bid	Central Agency & Property
33	Mack		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
34	McCloskey		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
35	New Holland Agriculture		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
36	New Holland Construction		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
37	Peterbilt		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
38	Powerscreen		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
39	Ricon		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
40	Schwarze		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
41	Startrans		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
42	Stellar Crane		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
43	Sterling		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
44	Supreme		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
45	Sweeprite		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
46	Sweepster		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
47	Terex		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
48	Thomas	50	HR	\$125.00	\$6,250.00			
49	Vac Con		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	
50	Vactor		HR	No Bid	No Bid		X	

ON-SITE FLEET SERVICE, INC.

Res-Pg:k.5-28

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Item #	Description	Est. Qty	Unit of Measure	Est. Price	Max Bid	Contact Name & Phone #	Comments
51	Vermeer		HR	No Bid	X		
52	Versalift East		HR	No Bid	X		
53	Volvo		HR	No Bid	X		
54	Western Star		HR	No Bid	X		
Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major							
55	Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major	50	HR	\$100.00	\$5,000.00		
Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor							
56	Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor	50	HR	\$100.00	\$5,000.00		
Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major							
57	Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major	500	HR	\$100.00	\$50,000.00		
Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes							
58	Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes		HR	No Bid	X		
Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates							
59	Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates	50	HR	\$95.00	\$4,750.00		
Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts							
60	Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts		HR	No Bid	X		
Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's							
61	Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's	100	HR	\$105.00	\$10,500.00		

ON-SITE FLEET SERVICE, INC.

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	No Bid	Contact Agency	Comments
Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders							
62	Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches							
63	Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats							
64	Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats	50	\$105.00	\$5,250.00			
Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers							
65	Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers	500	\$105.00	\$52,500.00			
Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges							
66	Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers							
67	Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools							
68	Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines							
69	Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines	500	\$105.00	\$52,500.00			
Category 17: Non-OEM Repairs: Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Coolers, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers							
70	Category 17: Non-OEM Repairs: Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Coolers, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	200	\$105.00	\$21,000.00			

Introduction: April 17, 2024

Adopted RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Response: SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Accepted	Company Name & Phone #
Category 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust							
71	Category 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust	50	HR	\$105.00	\$5,250.00		
Category 19: County Location Repairs							
72	Aladdin Pressure Washer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
73	Aftac		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
74	Cyclomator		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
75	Hydraulic Systems		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
76	McCloskey		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
77	PSC Pressure Washer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
78	Riveer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
79	Vermeyer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
80	Versa Lift East		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild							
81	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
82	Hydraulic Rams		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
83	Hydraulic Pump Motors		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
84	PTO		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
85	Starters		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	

ON-SITE FLEET SERVICE, INC.

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit Price	Total Price	Na Bid	Contract Award & Payment	Comments
86	Alternators		HR	No Bid	X		
87	Fuel Tanks		HR	No Bid	X		
Group/Price Line 85:							
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10= \$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x _____%)=	1	LS	\$48,666.00	No Bid		0%
				\$287,000.00			

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Official Response to RFP #24-00000002
 BID - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

THOMAS MAKUCH, LLC DBA ACCURATE TOWING SERVICE

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Total Price	No Bid	Comments
51	Vermeer			No Bid	X	
52	Versalift East			No Bid	X	
53	Volvo			No Bid	X	
54	Western Star			No Bid	X	
Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major						
55	Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major	50	\$125.00	\$6,250.00		
Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor						
56	Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor	50	\$125.00	\$6,250.00		
Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major						
57	Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major	500	\$155.00	\$77,500.00		
Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes						
58	Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes	50	\$155.00	\$7,750.00		
Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates						
59	Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates			No Bid	X	
Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts						
60	Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts			No Bid	X	
Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's						
61	Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's	100	\$155.00	\$15,500.00		

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Response ID: 20240522

THOMAS MAKUCH, LLC DBA ACCURATE TOWING SERVICE

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Notes	Comments
Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders						
62	Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches						
63	Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches	50	\$155.00	\$7,750.00		
Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats						
64	Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers						
65	Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers	500	\$155.00	\$77,500.00		
Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges						
66	Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers						
67	Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools						
68	Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools	HR	No Bid	No Bid	X	
Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines						
69	Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines	500	\$155.00	\$77,500.00		
Category 17: Non-OEM Repairs: Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Coolers, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers						
70	Category 17: Non-OEM Repairs: Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Coolers, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	200	\$125.00	\$25,000.00		

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopted RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Official Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

THOMAS MAKUCH, LLC DBA ACCURATE TOWING SERVICE

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Item #	Description	Est Qty	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Revised	Contact Name & Phone #	Comments
Category 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust								
71	Category 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust	50	HR	\$125.00	\$6,250.00			
Category 19: County Location Repairs								
72	Aladdin Pressure Washer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
73	Altec		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
74	Cyclonator		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
75	Hydraulic Systems	80	HR	\$185.00	\$14,800.00			
76	McCloskey		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
77	PSC Pressure Washer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
78	Riveer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
79	Vermeer		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
80	Versa Lift-East		HR	No Bid	No Bid	X		
Category 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild								
81	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$125.00	\$6,250.00			
82	Hydraulic Rams	350	HR	\$155.00	\$54,250.00			
83	Hydraulic Pump Motors	75	HR	\$155.00	\$11,625.00			
84	PTO	50	HR	\$155.00	\$7,750.00			
85	Starters	50	HR	\$125.00	\$6,250.00			

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

ADOPTED RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Official Bid - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

THOMAS MAKUCH, LLC DBA ACCURATE TOWING SERVICE

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER

Line Item	Description	Est Qty	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Total Price	Method	Contact Person & Phone #	Comments
86	Alternators	50	HR	\$125.00	\$6,250.00			
87	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$155.00	\$7,750.00			
Group/Price Line 85:								
88	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS AND IN THE VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE) Example: \$280,000.00 by 10%=\$28,000.00 or \$280,000.00 by .10= \$28,000.00 Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right under UNIT COST \$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x _____%)=	1	LS	\$8,400.00 S/D \$27,100.00	\$8,400.00 \$27,100.00			370 J

Introduced On: April 17, 2024

Adopted RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution # 202400522

BID - REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER