

### Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly

101 Hooper Avenue Toms River, New Jersey 08754-2191

Tel: (732)929-2005 Fax: (732)505-1918

### **Board Meeting Agenda**

Date: July 19, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building

Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II to Continental Hardware, Inc.; US Electrical Services, Inc. dba Franklin Griffith and Sid Tool Co., Inc. dba MSC Industrial Supply Co., the lowest qualified bidders. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 64, 66, 68, 69, 75 and 76 as non-responsive. They will not be rebid as they were previously awarded. (B2023-143)

Official Resoluti	on#	ŧ	2	02	300	102	25	
Meeting Date			C	7/1	9/2	02	3	
Introduced Date			C	7/1	9/2	02	3	
Adopted Date			C	7/1	9/2	02	3	
Agenda Item			r	n-8				
CAF#			Γ					
Purchase Req. #			E	320	23-	143	3	
Result			A	١do	pte	d		
COUNTY COMMISSIONER	PRES.	ABS.		MOVE	SEC	AYE	NAY	ABST.
Vicari		~						
Quinn	~					~		
Crea	~				~	~		
Haines	~					~		
Kelly	~			~		~		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Clerk Of The Board



### RESOLUTION

July 19, 2023

WHEREAS, on June 27, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder

Continental Hardware, Inc. 400 Delancy Street Newark, NJ 07105 (973) 589-3929

Sid Tool Co., Inc. d/b/a MSC Industrial Supply Co. 515 Broadhollow, Suite 1000 Melville, NY 11747 (973) 580-1129

Plastic Express, Inc. 667 Lehigh Ave. Union, NJ 07036 (718) 499-1119

Name and Address of Bidder

US Electrical Services, Inc. D/B/A Franklin Griffith 5 Second Street Trenton, NJ 08611 (609) 695-6121

Eppy's Tool & Equipment Warehouse, Inc. 809 East 42nd St. Brooklyn, NY 11210 (718) 434-7878

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications, in each instance, namely that of, CONTINENTAL HARDWARE, INC.; US ELECTRICAL SERVICES, INC., D/B/A FRANKLIN GRIFFITH and SID TOOL CO., INC. D/B/A MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY CO. be accepted. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 64, 66, 68, 69, 75 and 76. Item Nos. 64, 66, 68, 69, 75 and 76 are rejected as nonresponsive. They will not be rebid as they were previously awarded. In the event of tie bids pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-6.1(d), bids are awarded to the bidder(s) in closest distance to the Ocean County Administration Building, 101 Hooper Avenue, Toms River, NJ, using the address indicated on their bid documentation.

Introduced on: Adopted on: Official Resolution#: 2023001025

July 19, 2023 July 19, 2023

JULY 19, 2023

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Hand Tools, Cases and Storage Containers No. II, for the contract period from date of award through May 16, 2024 or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

### A. <u>CONTINENTAL TRADING & HARDWARE, INC.</u> for twelve (12)

items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 65, 72, 73 and 74.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. US ELECTRICAL SERVICES, INC. D/B/A FRANKLIN GRIFFITH for four (4) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 32, 33, 43 and 51.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. SID TOOL CO., INC. D/B/A MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY CO. for three (3) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 67, 70 and 71.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

- 2. Payments for the equipment and materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.
- 3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-143.
- 4. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance, Central Supply Warehouse, Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: Adopted on: Official Resolution#: 2023001025

Bid No. TBD PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

## HAND TOOLS CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

Line item	Lestraption	qualitity	Of III Of IVIESSULE	OTHER	Lotal Char	NO ON	Collinelle.
SECTION (II - POWER TOOLS	VER TOOLS						
32	Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet with battery 12V DC, 30 ft-lb fastening torque, Milwaukee part number 2456-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	(J	ĘĄ	\$163.00	\$815.00		NEW PART 2456-20
33	Mitwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool kit, 12V, Milwaukee part number 2426-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	щ Ж	\$250.00	\$1,250.00		NEW PART NUMBER 2526- 21XC
43	Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/4" hex 18V DC, 2,000 in-lb Max. Torque. Milwaukee Part Number 2853-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS		ĘĄ	\$157.00	\$785.00		NEW PART 2850-20
51	Milwaukee 1/2 in M8 FUEL hole Hawg cordless right angle drill kit, 18.0 V Voltage, battery included. Milwaukee Part Number: 2707-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	ν <sub>1</sub>	EV	\$340.00	\$1,700.00		NEW PART NUMBER 2807- 20. all kits have been discountinued onlt bare tool available

### SECTION IV - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Torque Fools % Screwdrivers %	_	Line Item 56 57	Tool Storage  Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2"  Wrenches	Unit of Measure % %	Percentage 25% 25% 25%
58         Wrenches         %           59         Torque Tools         %           60         Screwdrivers         %	4	57	Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2"	%	25%
59 Torque Tools % 60 Screwdrivers %	4	58	Wrenches	%	25%
60 Screwdrivers %	4	59	Torque Tools	%	25%
	5	60	Screwdrivers	%	25%

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

Introduced on: July 19, 2023 Adopted on: July 19, 2023 Official Resolution#: 2023001025

### CONTINENTAL HARDWARE, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

BId No. TBD HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

	_	\	4			.,,,	<del></del>				.,		<u></u>	4
75	74	73	72	71	70	69	68	67	66	65	64	63	62	61
Diagnostics	Safety	Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, Vacuums, Shop Fans)	Shop Equipment (ie: Lighting, Creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, presses)	Cooling	Air Conditioning	Battery Service	Undercar	Welding	Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, Analyzers, fuel and engine systems)	Power Tools	Set Building	General Hand Tools (ie: Files, Scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, diesel, other)	Punches/Chisels/Hammers	Pliers
%	*	%	%	8	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%
No Bid	25%	25%	25%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25%	No Bid	25%	25%	25%
×				×	×	*	×	<b>×</b>	×		   ×			

BIG - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Introduced on: July 19, 2023 Adopted on: July 19, 2023 Official Resolution#: 2023001025

# US ELECTRICAL SERVICES, INC. D/B/A FRANKLIN-GRIFFITH

Bid No. TBD

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

	Line item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
	SECTION III - POWER TOOLS	WER TOOLS						
4	32	Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet with battery 12V DC, 30 ft-lb fastening torque, Milwaukee part number 2456-21 NO SU8STITUTIONS	5	ΕA	\$184.00	\$920.00		
_	33	Milwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool kit, 12V, Milwaukee part number 2426-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	и	EA	\$211.00	\$1,055.00		
4	43	Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/4" hex 18V DC, 2,000 in-lb Max. Torque. Milwaukee Part Number 2853-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Ś	ĘĄ	\$144.00	\$720.00		
4	51	Milwaukee 1/2 in M8 FUEL hole Hawg cordless right angle drill kit, 18.0 V Voltage, battery included. Milwaukee Part Number: 2707-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	Ę.	\$565.00	\$2,825.00		

### SECTION IV - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	No Bid
56	Tool Storage	%	15%	.,,
57	Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2"	%	15%	
85	Wrenches	%	15%	
59	Torque Tools	%	15%	
60	Screwdrivers	%	15%	
61	Pliers	%	15%	
62	Punches/Chisels/Hammers	*	15%	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

BIG - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

SID TOOL CO., INC. D/B/A MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY CO.

Bid No. TBD

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

4	4			۷.	,			F	,	<b>,</b> , ,	<del>,</del>		<b>,</b>		
71	70	69	68	67	. 66	65	64	63	62	61	60	59	58	57	Line Item
Cooling	Air Conditioning	Battery Service	Undercar	Welding	Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, Analyzers, fuel and engine systems)	Power Tools	Set Building	General Hand Tools (ie: Files, Scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, diesel, other)	Punches/Chisels/Hammers	Pliers	Screwdrivers	Torque Tools	Wrenches	Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2"	Description
%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	%	Unit of Measure
20%	20%	No Bid	No Bid	15%	No Bid	18%	No Bid	25%	25%	25%	25%	18%	25%	18%	Percentage
		×	×		×		×								No Bid

Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Introduced on: July 19, 2023 Adopted on: July 19, 2023 Official Resolution#: 2023001025