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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
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Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
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Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of EQUI
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Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

PMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND

MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. Il to Gerhart Systems and Controls Corp.; Houpert
Fleet Services, LLC; Komptech Americas, LLC; and Norcia Corporation, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids

were received on ltem Nos. 19, 21, 22, 23, 25, 26, 27, 31, 34, 36 an

d 37. They will not be rebid as they were

previously awarded. ltem Nos. 1, 2, 3 and 4 are rejected as unresponsive. Recommendation is made to
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie \. Gurstnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on|
Adopted on:

:j.5-2

: Res-P;q
ONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON A1
PAPEH%, DOCUMENTS, INVQICES, VOUCHERS

BARAIIS-13

RESOLUTION

February 5, 2025

WHEREAS, on December 17, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND
MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. 1I for the County of Ocean;
and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Gerhart Systems and Controls Corp Houpert Fleet Services, LLC
300 Bushkill Street 115 S. Atlantic Avenue
Tatamy, PA 18085 Berlin, NJ 08009

(610) 264-2800 (856)767-2828

Komptech Americas, LLC Norcia Corporation

6345 Downing Street 451 Black Horse Lane
Denver, CO 80216 North Brunswick, NJ 08902
(720) 229-3426 (732) 297-1101

MSA Safety Sales, LLC

1000 Cranberry Woods Drive
Cranberry Twp, PA 16066
(800) 672-4678

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, be accepted, namely that of GERHART SYSTEMS AND CONTROLS CORP;
HOUPERT FLEET SERVICES, LLC; KOMPTECH AMERICAS, LLC, and NORCIA
CORPORATION. No bids were received on Item Nos, 19, 21, 22, 23, 25, 26, 27, 31, 34, 36
and 37. They will not be rebid as they were previously awarded. Recommendation is made to
reject Item Nos. I, 2, 3 and 4 as unresponsive. Recommendation is made to authorize the
County Purchasing Agent to enter into a negotiated contract pursuantto N.J.S.A, 40A:11-5(3)

for all rejected items, as no responsive bids were received for a second time.

WHEREAS, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) provides that, in the event no qualified bids

are received on two (2) occasions, a governing body may enter into a negotiable contract,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

February 5, 2025
February 5, 2025

Official Resoldifion#: 2025000132

¢




Res-Pg:j.5-3

BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 FEBRUARY 5, 2025

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Equipment Parts, Repairs and
Maintenance for Solid Waste Management No. II for the County of Ocean, from date of award
through December 3, 2026, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County

reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A, GERHART SYSTEMS AND CONTROLS CORP for nine (9) items, to wit:
I[TEM NOS. 5,6,7,8,9,10,11, 12 and 13.
For a Total Lump Sum Amount Section 2 (Item Nos. 5-13) of $99,275.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.,

B. HOUPERT FLEET SERVICES., LLC for thirteen (13) items, to wit:
[TEM NOS. 17,18, 20, 24, 28, 30, 32, 33, 35, 38, 39, 41 and 43.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. KOMPTECH AMERICAS. LLC for two (2) items, to wit:
[TEM NOS. 29 and 43,
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

. NORCIA CORPORATION for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 40,41, 42 and 43.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.,

2. Payments for the materials and equipment to be acquired by this contract
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures, Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Otder issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the equipment shall be available within the following funding

source: Solid Waste Managernent O.E.

Introduced or: February 5, 2025
Adopted on: February 5, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025000132




Res-Pg:j.5-
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 FEBRUARY 90259 -24

4, The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-13.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Solid Waste Management, and the successful bidders.

Introduced ony February 5, 2025
Adopted on: February 5, 2025
Official Resolfifion#: 2025000132




Res-Pg:j.5-5
[KOMPTECH AMERICAS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. ||

Line tem Description Quantity Unlt of Unit Cast Total No Bid Comments;

Measure
19 Dynapak - Repair Sarvice - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid Ne Bid X
20 Efgin Sweeper - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
21 Elliot Water Tanker - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid Na Bid X
22 ESD Washwater Recycling System - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate | HR No 8ld No Bld X
23 lobin Deere - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR Mo Bid No gid X
24 Globe Law Boy Trailer - Repalir Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No 8id No Bid X
25 Heil Traller/\Water Tanker - Repalr Service - Hourly Labar Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
26 Hiab Crane - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
27 |gloos/Fibrex - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR N 8id No Bid X
28 18] Trailer - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
\// g 29 Komptech Equipment - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate . 75 HR $225,00 | $16,875.00
30 MAC Walking Floor Trailars - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
31 MeCloskey Sereen Equipment - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
32 Rogers Low Bay Trailer - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rata HR No Bid No Bid X
33 RS Body Cofinternational Truck Dump Trailer ~ Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
34 Russe Water Tannker/Roll-Off Truck - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR Mo Bid Mo Bid X
35 $carab Windrow Turner - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bld Na Bid X
36 $peedaire {Alr Compressor) - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No 8id X
37 staoltzfus Spreader (Wet Line Spreader) - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
Introduced on: Fehruary 5§ 2025

AdopteqKVIPTECH PAVERIY/S5 PRES PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RegolutaifbARRPPRHRTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. If
Page 8



[KOMPTECH AMERICAS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD :
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. I

Res-Pg:j.5-6

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit-of Unit Cost Total No B81d Comments:
Measure
a8 Titan Trailer - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bicl X
39 Vanguard Box Traller - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X

SPECIALTY LABOR RATES FOR SERVICES ON ALL EQUIPMENT LISTED IN THIS 21D

40 Roll-Off Contalnet Reconditioning/Painting - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bld No Bid X

41 Hydraullc Services for ALL Equipment Listed in this Bid - Repalr Service - Hourly'Labor Rate HR Mo Bl No Bid X
42 Welding Services for ALL Equipment Listed in this bid - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Did N6 Bid X

PARTS/% DISCOUNT FOR [TEMS 17 - 43

43 Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume 1 LS $25,000,00 | $25,000.00

Ly parts at $25,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying-$25,000,00 by your

\/ discount {show'bid discount IN COMMENTS) Example: $25,000.00 by 10%=52,500.00 or $25,000.00

by .10= $2,500,00, ENTER CALCULATED RESULT IN UNIT COST COLUMN: $25,000.00-{$25,000,00 %
%)=

525,000,
by Q% =
$25,000.00.

Introducedon:__ February 5.2025
Adopted KM PTECH PeUtRIGSS RATSPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official ResolubgnitindBRPPRMR?S, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. [l
Page 9



Res-Pg:j.5-7
[HOUPERT FLEET SERVICE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPQRT
Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. I

SECTION 2 - TRUCK SCALES AT NORTHERN AND SOUTHERN RECYCLING CENTERS

Linetem Description Quantity Unitaf Unit Cost! Tatal Mo Bid  Comments:

Meastira

5 Truck Scale Quarterly Maintenance Service - Four {4) Scales - Prica per Quarter QTR No Bid No Bid % NOBID
6 Annual Hydraulie Cleaning Maintenance of the Seales — Four {4) Scales - Price per Year YR No Bid No Bid X NOQ BID
7 Annual Hydraulic Preventive Malntenance Program — Four (4) Scales - Price per Year YR No Bid No 8id X NO BID
8 Norrrral Work Hours ta - Hourly Rate ‘ MR Na 8id No Bld X NO BID
9 Overtime Work Hours - Hourly Rate HR No Bid No Bid X NOBID
10 Utilisy Truek, as Required - Flat Rate per Each Usage EA No Bid No Bid X NO BID
11 Test Truck, as Required - Flat Rate per Each Usage ‘ EA Na Bid No Bid X NO BID
12 Util]tv Van, as Required - Flat Rate per Each Usage EA No Bid No Bid X NQ BID
DISCOUNT ON PARTS FOR TRUCK SCALES

13 Truck Scale Parts - Percentage of Discount Offered (NOT LESS THAN) - Assume $25,000 for LS No Bid iNo Bid X NOBID

Twuo {2) Years, Enter Discount In COMMENTS, Enter Calculated Result in UNIT COST.

Example: 10% X 325,000 = 2,500, OR 10 X $25,000145 $2,500, THEN $25,000 - 2,500 =

£22,500. You would enter the.Discount in the Comments and the calculated total In-the

UNIT COST.

TOTAL $0.00

SECTION 4 - EQUIPMENT LIST FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT - ITEMS 17 - 43

Line [tem Description Cluantity Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
i Meastre

v 17 Blg Tex Traller - Rapair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR 475.00 45,625.00

e 18 Donovan Tarp Systems - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR %75.00 $5,625.00

%
Introduced on:. _ _ February 5 2025
AdoptefHOWIPERT FLEEPSERIFCEPRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

OfficialRgsok:igI ERPPHRATE, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. I
Page 7




Res-Pg:j.5-8
[HOUPERT FLEET SERVICE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NQ. I

Line ltam Description Quantity Unif; of Unit Cost Tatal No Bid Commants:

Measura

19 Dynapak - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid Ny Biel X NQ BID

V/ 20 Elgin Sweepar - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 7% ‘ HR $75.00 $5,625.00
21 Elliot Water Tanker - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR Mo Bid No Bid X NO BID
22 ESD Washwater Recycling Systern - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rata HR No Bid Ne Bid X NO BID
23 John Deere - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No 8id No Bid X NO BID

V/ 24 Globe Low Boy Traller - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR 475,00 $5,625.00
25 Heil TrailerMatar Tanker - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X NO BID
26 Hiah Crane - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR Na Bld No 8id b3 NO BID
27 |gloos/Fibrex ~ Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bld No Bid X NO BID

l// 28 J&! Trailer - Repair Service -~ Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR $75.00 45,625.00
29 Komptach Equipment - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid Ma Bid X NQ BID

'// 30 MAC Walking Floor Trallers - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR $75.00 $5,625,00
3l McCloskey Screen Equipment - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X NG BID

l// 32 Rogers Low Boy Traller - Repair Sarvice - Hourly Laboy Rate 75 HR $75.00 $5,625.00

33 RS Body Co/international Truck Dump Trailer - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR 575.00 45,625.00
34 Russe Water Tannker/Roll-Off Truck - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X NOBID

t/// 35 Searab Windrow Turner - Repair Setvice - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR 575,00 45,625.00
36 Spaedaire {Alr Compressor) - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bld X NOBID
37 Stoltzfus Spreader {Wet Line Spreader] - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR Na Bid No #id X NO BIDV

Introduded-on: Febru -

ary-5,2025
Adopte{HBUPERT FLERATGERMICEIRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resoktiong\RA4F09813Z, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. I
Fage &



. Res-Pg:j.5-9
[HOUPERT FLEET SERVICE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NQO. [l

Line.[tem Diescription Quantlty Unit.of Unit Cost Tatal No Bid Comments:
Measure

W 38 Titan Trailer - Rapair Service - Haurly Labor Rate 75 HR $75.00 55,625.00
39 Vanguard Box Traller - Repair Service - HouEIy Labor Rate 75 HR $75.00 $5,625.00
SPECIALTY LABOR RATES FOR SERVICES ON ALL EQUIPMENT LISTED IN THIS BID
40 Roll-OFf Container Reconditioning/Painting - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X NO BID
\// 41 Hydraulic Services for. ALL Equipment Uisted in this Bid - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR 475.00 §5,625,00
43 Welding Services for ALL Equipment Listed In this bid - Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid Mo Bid X NO BID
PARTS/% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS 17 - 43
/ 43 Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggasted retail price list. For bid burposes assume 1 L% $20,500,00 { $20,500.00
V parts at $25,000.00. Calculate percantage of discount on parts by multiplying $25,000.00 by your é)
discount {show bid discount IN COMMENTS) Example; $25,000,00 by 10%=52,500.00 or $25,000.00
by . 10= $2,500.00, ENTER CALCULATED RESULT IN UNIT COST COLUMN: $25,000.00-(525,000.00 x
— %=
Introduced.an: Fﬂ],r_u,a_ry 5 2025

Adopte@HDUPERT FLEETT8BRVACEIZBESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official gesoltionnA383098k%s, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. 1|
Page 9



Res-Pg:j.5-10
[GERHART SYSTEMS AND CONTROLS CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. [I

SECTION 2 - TRUCK SCALES AT NORTHERN AND SOUTHERN RECYCLING CENTERS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit, Cast Tatal NoBid  Comments:

Measure.
\-/’ 5 Truck Sr:‘ale Ouarterly Maintenance Servica - Four (4] Scales - Price per Quarter 8 OTR £1,430,00 (411,440.00
V/ 6 Annual Hydraulic Cleaning Malntenance of the Scales — Four (4) Scales - Price per Year 2 YR $2,640.00 | £5,280.00
\/ VY Annual Hydraulic Preventive Maintenance Program — Four {4) Scales - Price per Year 2 YR $2,640,00 | $5,280.00
.\,/ 8 Marmal Work Houirs to - Hourly Rate ; 100 HR $121.00 [$12,100,00
\// 9 Overtime Work Hours - Hourly Rate 100 HR 418150 |518,150.00
\// 10 Utllity Truck, as Required - Flat Rate per Each Usage 25 EA $193.00 | 54,825.00
\/ L 11 Test Truck, a5 Required - Flat Rate per Each Usage 25 EA $495.00 (%$12,375.00
\/’ 12 Utitity Van, as Required - Flat Rate per Each Usage 25 EA $193.00 | $4,825,00

DISCOUNT ON PARTS FOR TRUCK SCALES

13 Truck Scale Parts - Percentaga of Discount Offered (NOT LESS THAN] - Assume $25,000 1 L% $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 0%
Lo for Two (2) Years. Enter Discount In COMMENTS, Enter Caloulated Result in UNTT COST.
" Example: 10% X $25,000 = 2,500, OR .10 X $25,000 |s $2,500. THEN $25,000 - $2,500 =
$22,500. You would enter the Discount in the Comments and the calculated total in the
UNIT COST.
TOTAL £99,275.00

SECTION 4 - EQUIPMENT LIST FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT - ITEMS 17 - 43

Line Item Description Quantity Unit.of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
Meastre
17 Big Tex Trailer - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No 8id X
18 Donovan Tarp Systems - Rapair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR Mo Bld No Bid X

Introducedon: = February 5 20258
AdoptedZBAHART SYEEBMEARREINTROLS CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official ResolHon# RM4PIR%4%, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. I
Page 7




Res-Pg:j.5-11

[NORCIA CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. 1l

Line Iterm Description Quantlt\'." Unitof Unit. Cost Tatal No Bld Comments:
¥ Measure
38 Titan Trailer - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR Na Bid No Bld X
a9 Vanguard Box Traller - Repair Service - Hourly Lubor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X

SPECIALTY LABOR RATES FOR SERVICES ON ALL EQUIPMENT LISTED IN THIS BID

\// 40 Roll-OFff Container Reconditioning/Painting - Repair Service - Hourly Labar Rate 75 HR 490,00 46,750.00
V/ 41 Hydraulic Services far ALL Equipment Listad in this Bid - Repalr Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR 490,00 %6,750.,00
\// 42 Welding Services far ALL Equipment Listed in this bid - Repair Service - Houtly Labor Rate 75 HR $90,00 56,750.00
PARTS/% DISCOUNT FORTEMS 17 - 43
/ 43 Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list, For bid purposes assume 1 Ls 51,500,000 | $1,500,00
\/ parts at $25,000.00. Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying $25,000.00 by your . U
discount (show bid discount IN COMMENTS) Example: $25,000.00 by 10%=%2,500.00 or $25,000.00 C)
by .10= $2,500.00. ENTER CALCULATED RESULT IN UNIT COST COLUMN: $25,000.00-($25,000.00 %
%)=
U'
Introduced on: Eebruary 5, 2025 ;

Adopted|MORCIA CORPORATIOMPRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Feggoluiofe a8t PIARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT NO. ||
Page 9



