Res-Pg:m.1-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari

Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Commissioner John P. Kelly

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

Tel: (732)929-2005
Fax: (732)505-1918

February 15, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN
FOODS, AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES to Mivila Foods, the sole qualified bidder. No bids were received on ltem
No. 24. Recommendation is made to reject ltem No. 48 as unresponsive. ltem Nos. 24 and 48 will not be rebid

as they are no longer needed. (B2023-24)

Official Resolution# [2023000244
Meeting Date 02/15/2023
Introduced Date 02/15/2023
Adopted Date 02/15/2023
Agenda ltem m-1

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-24
Result Adopted
cowry —_ Tal, T8 T, 2
COMMISSIONER &7 | 5 % > g 2
Joseph H. v v

Gary v v v
Barbara Jo v v
Virginia E. v v

John P. v v |v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

WMichaue, . Guaor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:m.1-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ONALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

NO._E Dac BE}__” _____.._.____LJ‘A |

RESOLUTION

February 15, 2023

WHEREAS, on January 10, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
scaled bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of MISCELLANEOUS
GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS, AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES for the County of Ocean;

and
WHEREAS, at the advertised time, one response was received frofn the
following bidder:
Name of Bidder Address of Bidder
Mivila Foods 226 Getty Avenue

Paterson; NJ 07503
(973) 278-4148

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County
Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the sole qualified bid,
according to specifications, be accepted, namely that of MIVILA FOODS. No bids were
received on Item No. 24. Recommendation is made to reject Item No. 48 as unresponsive.

Item No. 24 and Item 48 will not be re-bid as they are no longer needed.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as
follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed
to enter into a contract for the furnishing and delivery of MISCELLANEOUS
GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS, AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES for the County of Ocean,
for the contract period from date of award through February 14, 2024, a period of one (1)
year, or until delivéry is complete. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the

contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

Introduced on February 15, 2023
Adopted on: February 15, 2023
Official Resolytjon#: 2023000244




BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 FEBRUARY ResePg:m.1-3

MIVILA FOODS for two hundred twenty four (224) items, to wit:

ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9, 10,11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 25,
26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 49, 50,
51,52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74,
75,76, 717,78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98,
99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116,
117,118, 119, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134,
135,136, 137, 138, 139, 140, 141, 142, 143, 144, 145, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 151, 152,
153, 154, 155, 156, 157, 158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164, 165, 166, 167, 168, 169, 170,
171,172,173, 174, 175, 176, 177, 178, 179, 180, 181, 182, 183, 184, 185, 186, 187, 188,
189, 190, 191, 192, 193, 194, 195, 196, 197, 198, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205, 206,
207, 208, 209, 210, 211, 212, 213, 214, 215, 216, 217, 218, 219, 220, 221, 222, 223, 224,
225 and 226.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be
made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance
with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations
and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices
and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-24.

4. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution
shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing,

Department of Finance, Juvenile Services and Mivila Foods, the successful bidder.

Introduced on!: February 15, 2023
Adopted on: February 15, 2023
Official Resole ion#: 2023000244




MIVILA FOODS ‘Res-Pg:m.1-4
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES FROZEN FOODS AND KlTCHEN SUPPLIES

8. Acknowledgement of Submlssmn of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package All documents should be from th|s bid
package as forms change frequently and thé most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these'instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

9. Submission of Bid Package*

- By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
. solicitation must be submitted and that failure to'do so may be cause for rejection.

-Bidder also understands that only one (1) b|d submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response
SubmJttlng a manual response in addition to the eIectronlc response is cause for rejection of your bid. :

Confirmed

R R PRICE TABLES Sy
- - MISCELLANEQUS GROCERIES FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost i i Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments

Brand/Packaging
SECTION | - CANNED VEGETABLES
’ 1 Beans, Green 7 ‘ CASE $32.95 ’ $230.65 ' HANOVER, 6/#10
: (6/10) - '
7 —
2 Beans, Vegetarian "3 ) CASE $32.95 $98.85 : EMBASSY, 6/#10
k {6/10) ' ’
/i ¢
\/ 3 Carrots, Sliced, 5. CASE $31.95 $15_9.75 ' PACKER'S LABEL,
; Coin Cut (6/10) : ‘ 6/#10

Introduc@ROPROSAL FEBUMEND; RERORT -

Adopted
Sdopte ﬁgso]u AISCE mfeﬁ’@%mm FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

. MIVILA FOODS : Res-Pg:m.1-5

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Camments

Brand/Packaging

v 4 Corn, Whole 6 - CASE $38.95 $233.70 HANOVER, 6/#10
\/ Kernel (6/10) .
5 Peas & Carrots g 3 " CASE . $36.95 ' $110.85 ' PACKER'S LABEL,
 |te/10) _ 6/#10
6 Peppers, Roasted, C 4 CASE $39.85 $159.40 7 RUBY, 6/#10

Red, In Oil (6/10)

7 Potatoes, Whole 9 ‘ CASE $39.85 $358.65 PACKER'S LABEL,
White (6/10) : ' ' 6/#10
8 Sauerkraut (6/10) 2 CASE $32.90 $65.80 | PACKER'S LABEL,
6/#10
9 Sweet Potatoes, 7. CASE $36.50 $255.50 NORTHEAST,
' Syrup Pack (6/10) . 6/#10

SECTION Il - CANNED FRUITS

e N NN

10 Applesauce, . . 3 . CASE . - $42.95 $128.85 . PACKER'S LABEL,
{6/10) T s 6/#10

11 Cranberry Sauce 4 CASE $49.95 $199.80 RUBY KIST, 6/#10
{(6/10) :

12 Fruit Cocktail, 4 . CASE $52.90° $211.60 PACKER'S LABEL,
Light Syrup (6/10) . 6/#10

13 - Peaches, Sliced, -3 CASE $54.90 $164.70 - PACKER'S LABEL, - IN JUICE
Unsweetened 6/#10
(6/10)

14 Pineapple, Chunks 6 CASE ' $52.00 $312.00 . PACKER'S LABEL, - .
(6/10) _ _ 6/#10

introduceROPROSAL heyaneMs RE30ORT
Adopted

H Fe _ ‘
Sdopte e%@éﬁgﬁ%ﬁ%ﬁmms, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Page




| - MIVILA FOODS | \ - Res-Pa-m.1-
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT F | - Res-Pg:m.1-6
Bid No. TBD o S ' ‘
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging

15 Dole Fruit Bowls, - 24 CASE $26.85 $644.40 - DOLE, 36/40Z
Tropical Fruit '
Salad Packed in
Natural Juice, or
Equal (36 - 4 oz.
containers/case),

16 Dole Fruit Gel 9 CASE $26.85 $241.65 DOLE, 36/40Z
Bowls, Mandarin ) : ,
Orange (36 - 4 oz. ] . i
containers/case) : .

SECTION 11l - CANNED SOUPS

17 Chicken Noodle, - 6 CASE * $69.85 $419.10 . L CAMPBELL'S,
Campbell's, or ] ' . 12/4#5

equal (12/5 per ’
case)

Campbell's, or 12/#5
equal {12/5 per .
case)

SECTION IV - CONCENTRATES AND OILS

19 Beef Base, Low 4 . CASE” $35.85 $143.40 MA.IOR, 6/1LB
: Sodium, [6- 1
|b/case)

7 iy i
o \/ 18 Vegetable, 4 CASE $89.75 $350.00 . CAMPBELL'S, ' VEGETABLE BEEF,

20 Fry Max, or qual 40 . CASE $47.85 $1,914.00 - ’ ROYAL TREASURE, ) : 'CREAMY LIQUID :
(35 lbs./case) 35LB SHORTENING.
21 Vegetable 5 CASE $69.85 $349:25 EMBASSY, 6/1GAL o SALAD OIL
\/ Cooking Oil {6 -1 : : C
gal.

containers/case)

Introduc@ROROSAL FOGUMENS, RERORT '
Adopted ~ 5 .
oo Rgg% ﬁgﬁg%}f@%ﬁmg FRQZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES | '




: MIVILA FOODS .
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT . F : Res-Pg:m.1-7
Bid No. TBD : |
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES
,

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging

SECTIONV - BREAKFASf ITEMS, NUTS, PASTRIES AND SNACKS

22 Almonds, Whole, -6 CASE $32.85 $197.10 BLUE DIAMOND,
\/ ' Shelled, Snack ' 32/.6250Z
Size, Wonderful ’
or Equal (24 - 1.5
o0z per case)

23 Austin Peanut 50 BX ' $28.75 $1,437.50 ' LANCE, 40/1.50Z
. Butter on Cheese b

Sandwich
Crackers or equal

24 113802 pack 8 ' CASE No Bid No Bid ' X
packs per box

25 Cliff Bars, or 15 BX $39.85 $597.75 CLF, 24/2.40Z VARIETY PACK
Equal, Variety Lo ) '
Pack, (12 - 2.4 oz.

bars/box)
26 Combos, Cheese 15- BX $21.85 $327.75 MUNCHIES SNACK
and Pizza, 1.8 oz . ) : MIX CHEESE FIX,
bags/18 per box ° ] ' . 32/1.750Z
27 i Cookies, Devils 9 CASE $54.90 $494.10 : OREOQ, NOT FAT FREE
Food, Fat Free i 120/1.5902

Snackwell, or
Equal (48- 1.1 oz.
pkgs/case)

28 Cookies, Fat-Free 6 CASE $59.85 $359.10 T NABISCO, 24/20Z
Fig Newton, : ’
Nabisco, or Equal
- 1(48-2.10z.
pkgs/case)

NN

Introduci . ;

Adoptedeé]ﬁglpOSAL é@@%@%ORT .

Official RBEbNUAEERDADIDOR4E GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES
Page 8 ' - ) :




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ’ :
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

MIVILA FOODS | ' : 'R“es-Pg:vm.

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments

) Brand/Packaging
29 Cookies, Oatmeal 8 CASE $49.85 5398.80' GRANDMA'S
\/ Raisin , Famous . . ' . . 60/2.502
Amos, or Equal
(60-2 oz.
pkgs/case)
‘ 30 | Cookies, 4 CASE $33.95° $135.80 _ | GRANDMAYS, NOT REDUCED" .
\/ Snackwell, Vanilla 60/2.12027 : " FAT, MINI
‘ Cream Sandwich,. . . . VANILLA CREME
Reduced Fat, or { . COOKIES
Equal (48- 1.7 oz. ' '
pkgs/case)
31 Corn Chips, 10 CASE $25.85 $258.50 POPCORNERS, VARIETY PACK
\/ . |Original Singles, I 28/102 : - -
. Sunchips, or Equal )
(64-1.50z .
bags/case)
32 Danish, 3.5 oz. 8 PKG ) $36.95 $295.60 . SARA LEE,
. ' Assorted with _ : 24/3.250Z
) Filling, 12 per pkg .
. R 33 Doritos Brand 8 ' CASE $49.85 $398.80 . DORITOS,
Nacho Chips Cool 104/10Z
Ranch (64 - 1.75
oz. bags/case)
. 34 Graham Crackers, 4' " CASE $36.95 - $147.80 ° KELLOGGS,
\/ 2 Crackers/Pack 200/2CT
. (200 packs/case) :
35 Granola Bars (12 - 1 © CASE ' $21.85 $240.35 "QUAKER, . VARIETYPACK
; 1 oz. bars/case) 60/.840Z ‘ .
/ 36 Hersey Bars {1.55 10 . BX $43.85 $438.50 HERSHEY,
oz. - 36 per box) 36/1.550Z

IntroduceROROSAL DODUAENS, REFORT _
Adoptedon: |
olopte R?;Sagéu%/i%% gmy}‘f@%ﬁm& FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES




. ' MIVILA FOODS
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPQRT o
Bid No. TBD

MISCELLANEQUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.1-9

. N .
Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments

Line ltem Description Quantity

. Brand/Packaging
37 v KIND Healthy 45 BX $32.95 $1,482.75 KIND, 18CT VARIETY PACK
\/ Snack Bars, or . ’ -
Equal, Variety
Pack, (12 ’
bars/box)
38 Kit-Kat Bérs (1.5 15 BX $43.85 $657.75 KIT KAT, 36/1.502 :
J oz - 36 per box) :
39 Milky Way candy 15 BX $45.85 $687.75 MILKY WAY,
- bar 1.84 oxz 36 36/1.8407
\/ bars per box, may
be soid in the golf
shop I
. 40 Mixed Nuts, 5 CASE $32.95 $164.75 PLANTERS, NUTRITION iy
\/ Single Serve (1.75 12/1.50Z HEART HEALTHY
oz eaach, 72 per MIX
‘case)
41 - Nacho Chips (4-1 8 CASE $23.85 $190.80 TOSITIOS, 4/160Z B'AKED SCOOPS
) \/ |b. bags/case) : .
42 Peanuts by the .4 CASE $29.85 $119.40 " | PLANTERS,
\/ bag, Approx 1 oz. 48/107
| bags (100
bags/case)
. 43 Popcorn, 8 CASE $35.75 $286.00 SMART FOOD,
\/ Individual Bags 50/.6250Z
: (72-1o0z t -
bags/case)
44 Potato Chips, 1 |b. 15 CASE $35.85 $537.75 "LAYS, 8/160Z
. bag, (4 bags/case) o
\// . 45 Pretzels, 1 1b. bag 15 CASE '$19.85 $297.75 ROLD GOLD, . MINI PRETZEL
(4 bags/case) . ’ 6/160Z .

Z‘;"O‘i“;el"RGPOSAL BERTURYE T F02PORT

opted gn; ,

olopte Rgégm%%@gmg@jféﬁ&mm& FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES
age . I




o MIVILA FOODS
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD :
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.1-10

|
Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
! Brand/Packaging

p 46 Saltines, Nabisco, | . 12 - CASE $29.85 $358.20 " |ZESTA, 500/2PK
\/ or Equal (240 : -

crackers/box, 4
boxes/case)

47 Snickers candy 15 BX $54.95 $824.25 SNICKERS,
bar 1.86 0z 48 - A - 48/1.860Z

\/ bars per box, may )

be sold in the golf

shop

453 Twizzlers, or 4 ' BX $19.85 $79.40 STARBURST, 5407 ORIGINAL FRUITY
Equal, Strawberry ) ) JAR CHEWY CANDY
Flavored, -

Individually ) :
Wrapped, (105 - : , : . ) . . =
twizzlers/box)

SECTION VI - CEREALS

49 Frosted Mini- 8 : CASE © $49.85 ‘ $398.80 KELLOGGS,

\/ Wheats, Self _ ' 96/10ZBOWLS | °
. Serve Bowls NOT . ’

Boxes, Kelloggs,
or Equal, {60- 2
oz. bowls/case)

Cereal, 3/4 oz. ) 96/10Z BOWLS
Self Serve Bowl,

NOT Boxes,

Kellogg's, or
Equal, (96 -
bowls/case)

\/ 50 Frosted Flakes 8 CASE $49:85 ’ $398.'80 KELLOGGS,

ra

" IntroduceARGPOSAL EXDOAN BIT2REPORT
Adopted ey _ X - -
o R%%gégtli\fﬂ’{l‘%%’gggﬁ @REICERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITGHEN SUPPLIES
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MIVILA FOODS
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.1-11

I
Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost ] i Proposed

Brand/Packaging

. \/ "|Golden Grahams” - . $299.10 GENERAL MILLS,

Cereal, 3/4 oz. ) ) 96/10Z BOWLS
Self Serve Bowi, ' ’

NOT Boxes, (96
bowls/case)

Delivery A.R.O.

Comments

52 Oatmeal, Quick 6 CASE $33.95 . $203.70 MAYPO, 8/420Z
: Qats, (8-42 oz.
pkgs/case)

SECTION VII - MACARONI, MIXE$ AND RICE .

\/ 53 Macaroni, Eibow ’ 6 V CASE i $21.95 $131.70 . ’ PASTA CITY,
' (20# bulk) - _ : 2/10LB
54 . Macaroni, 6 CASE $21.95 $131.70 PASTA CITY,
\/ ’ Spaghetti, Fine - ’ ‘ 2/10LB
: (20# bulk)
55 Orzo, Divella or 6 CASE $22.50 $135.00 - . HELIOS, 12/160Z '
/ Equal, 17 oz. )
boxes, (24 ) - )
boxes/case)
56° Potatoes, Instant : 6 CASE $79.85 $479.10 BASIC AMERICAN,
\/ " |Whip, Carnation, ) 6/#10

or Equal {6/10)

57 - | Rice, Brown, Par 4 CASE* $23.85 $95.40. PAR EXCELLENCE,
< | . |Boiled, uncle 2518
Ben's or Equal '
(25# bulk)
58 Rice, Yellow, B 4 . CASE $56.90 $227.60 GOYA, 18/140Z
\/ 6/6/3.5Ib

SECTION VIl - BOTTLED WATER, COCOA, COFFEE, JUICE, SODA AND TEA

lnfroduceqsmPOSALF@@@@MENM@PORT
Adopted op |’§CE§§W}§ %—.°§6CER1ES FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Official Reso utio




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MISCELLANEQUS GROCERIES FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

MIVILA FOODS

Res-Pg:m.1:12

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Proposed

Delivery A.R.O. Comments.

J 59 | Coffee, Maxwell 3 _ CASE $145.85 $437.55

House, or Equal,
URN pouch {24 -
10 oz.
pouches/case)

Brand/Packaging

ROYAL TREASURE,
24/1407

- 60 Single-Use Coffee 50 BX $54.95 $2,747.50
J * | Pods, K-Cup or
Equal, Medium
' Roast, 12
Pods/Box

DUNKIN DONUTS,
72CT

: liquid packs, No
\/ Refrigeration
| needed, Individual
servings 0.27 fl oz
pack/180 per case

k 61 Coffee Creamer, 4 CASE $25.85 $103.40

COFFEEMATE,
180/.3750Z

62 Decaf Coffee, 3 . BX $156.85 $470.55

4 Maxwell House,
\/ or Equal, URN
pouch (24 - 10 oz.
pouches/case)

ROYAL TREASURE,
24/1402

4 63 | Hot Chocolate, 9 BX $59.85 $538.65
\/ Swiss Miss {60 -1
oz. packs/box)

NESTLE'S, 6/50CT

V4 64 Tea Bags, 10 CASE $54.90 $549.00

\/ Individual Bags
{100bags/box, 10
boxes/case) :

LIPTON, 10/100CT

‘"t"OduceP'REPOSAL BehTvAENTI02PORT
Adopted

oopte R@g@,u%ﬁg@ggﬁg@ﬁ@ﬁ&mms FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Page 13
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MIVILA FOODS

<

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT | | Res-Pg:m.1-13
Bid No. TBD o ‘ ' | o ot
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES - | | -

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments

Brand/Packaging

, | Soda, Assorted $178.50 COKE, DIET COKE,

\/ Varieties, 2 Ltr. , T SPRITE, 4/2UITER
" Bottle, Must Be .

< Able to Provide
Cola, Diet-Cola,
and Citrus Type
such as Sprite;
Type of Soda shall
be indicated on
the Purchase ~
Order. ‘

Bottled Servings, . [24/16.90Z
Spring Water, '
NOT purified, 24 -
16.9 oz bottles
per case

\/ 66 Water, Individual 50 CASE $7.95 $397.50 TPURE LIFE,

SECTION IX - CONDIMENTS, DRESSINGS, SAUCES, SEASONINGS AND SPICES

A 67 BBQ Sauce, Honey 4 CASE $59.85 $239.40 CATTLEMAN'S, . | mississiepi
. \/ Flavored (4 - 1 : 4/1GAL _ HONEY
. gallon ;

containers/case)

68 Cheese Sauce, 5 R CASE $69.85 $349.25 CHEF MATE,

\/ Chef Mate, or 6/#10
Equal (6/10)
/ 69 Chili Sauce (6/10) 4 CASE $42.85 $171.40 - FURMANO, 6/#10 ‘ I
70 Disposable ' 1 CASE $59.85 $59.85 . PACKER'S LABEL,
\/ Pepper Shakers ) 48/1.50Z
(48/1 02.)
71 Disposable Salt 1 CASE : $25.85 $25.85 PACKER'S LABEL
Shakers (48/4 oz.) | - . . 48/402

Introduce@ROPOSAL BXDEIAMART2BEPORT
Adopted qnyy _ : J
o R%l%é@flﬁ;%@%(gg} @¥BCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES
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| - MIVILA FOODS ' Bac.Parm 4.4
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT o S R -ReS‘Pg-m-1-14

Bid No. TBD
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES:

i : ]
Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Commaents
: Brand/Packaging

Garlic, Crushed $119.40 GREAT GARLIC,
. / (12-11b. © |12/1602
g ’ jars/case)
73 Heinz, Hot Sauce 4 CASE $14.85 $59.40 : ' SALAD FRESH,

Portion Control ' : {200/36M
packets, 3 grams . ’ : o
per packet, (200 ’ : . l R
packets/case) .

74 Hot Sauce ' 4 CASE $39.85 . $159.40 FRANK'S, 24/50Z
" {Original, Frank's '
(5 0z - 24 [case) .

75 Ketchup, Small A 20 CASE $39.85 $797.00 . HEINZ, 1000/9GM
Packets, 3 oz. '

packets, Heinz, or
Equal (500
packets/case)

Spaghetti Sauce
(6/10)

77 Mayonnaise, ) 10 ° CASE $49.85 $498.50 EMBASSY, 4/1
" |Hellman's, Kraft, ) ) GAL : . K
orequal (4- 1 gal. - : ) . L)
containers/case) | ) . . ‘ 0

78 Mayonnaise, 4 CASE ) $45.85 $183.40 EMBASSY, 4/1GAL
Reduced Calorie, . ) '
Hellman's, Kraft,
or Equal (4 - 1 gal.
containers/case)

/ 76 " |Low Sodium 6 CASE $39.75 $238.50 ' FURMANO, 6/#10

mrociugepmposm PEBCUANENSTRRPORT
ople
p 45 §FE;§§§§§@Q§ @ROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Official Resolu




| : MIVILA FOODS
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT :

Bid No. TBD .
MISCELLANEQOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES i

- Res-Pg:m.1-15

Line ftem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging
79 } Mayonnaise, 20 CASE $39.85 $797.00 ’ HELLMANN'S,
\/ Small Packets, ' 210/3/802
Hellman's, or
Equal (500 - 1/3
|oz. packets/case)
80 Mustard, Spicy 14 CASE A $32.95 $461.30 GULDEN'S, 500
Brown, Gulden's, COUNT
/ or Equal, Packets,
' (500
packets/case)
81 .| Pancake Syrup, 35 CASE $14.85 $519.75 EMBASSY,
individual Syrup . 100/10Z"°
Packetsor
/ Containers, 1.5
oz. each, (100
packets/case)
82 Pancake Syrup {1 7 JUG $10.40 $72.80 SUPER CHEF, 1
| Gal. Jug) GALLON
83 Relish Sweet 10 CASE $12.85 $128.50' SALAD FRESH,
Packets, 9 grams 200/9 GM
/ ea., (200
‘ - packets/case)
- 84 Salad Dressing, 2 CASE $49.85 $99.70 EMBASSY, 4/1GAL
Balsamic
Vinaigrette, Ken's -
or Equal (4 -1 gal.
bottles/case)
85 Salad Dressing, .2 . CASE $49.85 $99.70 EMBASSY, 4/1
\/ Creamy Ceasar, GAL
Kraft, or Equal, (4 |
-1 gal. ’
bottles/case)
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o o ~ MIVILA FOODS o
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT _ Resng.m.1 -16
Bid No. TBD ' :

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

i
Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging

Salad Dressings, $42.85 . $128.55 EMBASSY, 4/1
French, Kraft, or GAL

Equal, (4-1 gal. : '
bottles/case)

<

87 Salad Dressings, 4 CASE $42.85 $171.40 EMBASSY, 4/1
Italian, Kraft, or ’ ’ GAL

Equal, {4 -1 gal. '
bottles/case)

88 Salsa, Medium (6- 4 CASE $52.90 $211.60 ORTEGA, 4/1 GAL
1/2°gallon
containers/ca;e)

89 Sugar Packets, 3 . BX $13.95 . 841.85 ELZAN,
Suitable for . 2000/1/1002Z
Restaurant Use, 1 ’ ’
tsp. packets,
(2,000
packets/box)

=10 . Sugar Substitute; 1 ' BX $23.85 $23.85 SWEET SAVER,
Equal Brand or . 2000/1GM

similar, 1 . |

teaspoon each

.| packet, (2,000

packets/box)

~ S N N

Pancho Villa, or
equal {4/1 gallon
containers/case)

\/ 91  |TacoSauce, - 2 CASE $39.85 $79.70 LUCKY, 4/1GAL

92 Taco Seasoning 2 CASE $33.95 567.90 McCORMICK,
Mix (no MSG) .' 6/902
Foothill or equal
(6 - 6.6 0z/case)
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

MIVILA FOODS

-

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.1-17

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

No Bid

Proposed Delivery A.R.O.

Brand/Packaging

Comments

/
J
.. Vil
y
.
/
J

Teriyaki Sauce FINEST CHOICE,
{4/1 gallon 4/1GAL
containers/case)
94 Tomatoes, 2 CASE $32.95 $65.90 BELLA VISTA,
Crushed, 6/#10 -
Progresso, or
Equal {6/10)
95 Tomato Puree, 4 CASE $38.95 . $155.80 EMBASSY, 6/#10
Heavy Pack,’ : .
Progresso, or
equal (6/10)
[
Tomato Sauce 12 CASE $36.95 $443.40 EMBASSY, 6/#10 [
(6/10) I
SECTION X - PAPER GOODS :
97 9" Heavy Duty 5 "CASE $49.85 $249.25 PACKER'S LABEL,
. Paper Plates, (500 | 1000/9"
plates/case) ) ’
98 Aluminum Foil, 3 ROLL $59.85 $179.55 PACKER'S LABEL,
Heavy Duty 1000/8"
Reynolds #625, or
Equal (18" x 1000'
roll}
99 Cups, Cold 2 CASE $219.00 - $438.00 PACKER'S LABEL,
Drinking, Waxed 2500/90Z
Lined Paper, 9 oz.
{5,000/case) .
100 Cups, Hot liquids, 10 CASE $83.85 $838.50 PACKER'S LABEL, ‘
’ Paper, 100z, 1000/1002
Unicup or Equal
(1000/case)
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ﬁ . MIVILA FOODS | - _
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT : Res-Pg.m._1 -18

Bid No. TBD
MISCELLANEQUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

i
Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost i Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments

Brand/Packaging

Dart Soufflé Cup . $6.95 $104.25 DART, 250CT
Plastic 20z. 125 oo |
count pkg

102 Dart Soufflé Lid 15 " PKG . $6.95 $104.25 ' DART, 250CT
20z. 100 count

per pkg

103 . Foil Sheets, 9" x 10 PKG . $9.85 ~$98.50 PACKER'S LABEL,
103/4", #W710, : 200CT
200 count pke.

Medium : 20/500CT
{500/pke.,
20pkgs./case)

105 Hinged Lid Food 12 CASE $149.85 $1,798.20 PACKER'S LABEL, 9X9X3
Containers, . : 300CT '
Cardboard, 100
count

106 Paper Dinner 12 ’ CASE $49.85 $598.20 ' PACKER'S LABEL, 15X17 ’ -
Napkins, Scott, or ; ' 3000 COUNT
Equal, Size 8"x 8"
(NOT dispenser
napkins)
{750/pkg, 8
pkgs/case)

107 . Plastic Forks, 1 CASE ! $21.85 $21.85 KITCHMART, 1000
Heavy Duty, _ : COUNT

White :

(1,000/case)

/ 104 " | Muffin Liners, 2 CASE $79.85 $159.70 PACKER'S LABEL,

\/ 108 *~ Plastic Knives, 1 CASE ‘ $21.85 $21.85 SUPER WIN, 1000
" IHeavy Duty . . COUNT
(1,000/case) :
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MIVILA FOODS " Res-Pg:m.A-
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT . Res-Pg:m.1-19

Bid No. TBD | o
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES _

) !
Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost thal Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging

109 Plastic Teaspoons, 1 CASE $21.85 $21.85 KITCHMART, 1000
Heavy Duty, : COUNT
- (1,000/case) . ’

110 Plastic Bags, 1 CASE $29.85 $29.85 ’ ELKAY, 250CT
Ziploc, or equal, 1
galion size !
(250/case)

111 Plastic Bags, 1 CASE - $36.95 $36.95 . ELKAY, 100CT
Ziploc or equal, 2 ’
gallon size -
{250/case)

112 Plastic Bags, 1 CASE $36.95 $36.95 ELKAY, 500CT
“|Ziploc, or equal,
quart size
{300/case)

113 Plastic Freezer 1 BX $39.85 $39.85 ELKAY, 100CT
Bags, Ziploc, or
equal, 2 gallon
size (100/box)

114 Seal Wrap, Clear 1 ROLL $21.75 . $21.75 WESTERN, 18" X
Plastic, Reynolds, ' ’ 2000FT

or equal, 18" x -
2,000' roll

115 Sheet Pan Liners, 1 CASE $59.85. $59.85 ' NORPAK, 1000
(1,000/case) - COUNT

LSS S N

SECTION XI- CLEANERS, DETERGENTS, SOAPS AND SUPPLIES
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- ‘ ‘ MIVILA FOODS
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

BidNo.TBD - . | |
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES . : L

Res-Pg:m.1-20

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Tlotal Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
] Brand/Packaging
/ 116 - Cascade 6 CASE - $36.95 . $221.70 CASCADE, 105
Complete with : COUNT
Dawn
Dishwashing

Detergent Action
Pacs, or equal,

‘| Fresh Scent (77
~ | pacs/case)
.. ) 117 Liquid Detergent, 25 BTL $7.95 . $198.75 ' PALMOLIVE, 20
\/ Palmolive or ’ oz
equal (24 oz.
bottle)
118 Disposable Poly 12 BX $8.95 | $107.40 PACKER'S LABEL,

~

PE Gloves, Food 1000 COUNT
Service Safety . ’ .

Glove Powder &
Sulfur Free, Size L
and XL (500
gloves/box)

SECTION Xil - FLOUR AND BAKING SUPPLIES,

119 Brownie Mix (6/5 1 CASE $54.90 $54.90 CONTINENTAL
- +Ib. bags/case) - MILLS, 6/5LB
120 Brown Sugar 1 ‘ CASE $49.85 $49.85 DOMINO, 24/1LB
(24/11b. boxes
Jcase)}
\/V 121 Bulk Sugar {50 1b. 1 BAG $41.85 $41.85 DOMINO, 5018
‘ : bag) : ‘
‘ / 122 Cake Icing, Vanilla 3 ' CASE 1. $89.75 $260.25 " | GENERAL MILLS, WHITE CREME  *

{6/5 Ib. case) . 6/5L8 . ICING MiX

IntroducedpRE POSALFBIGY KIENFIRBPORT
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: : MIVILA FOODS o
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.1-21
Bid No. TBD

MISCELLANEOQUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

|
Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging

123 Cake Icing, 3 ' CASE $89.75 " $269.25 -

GENERAL MILLS, CHOCOLATE
Chocolate (6/5 Ib. o 6/5LB FUDGE ICING MIX
case) : . '
124 CakE_MiX, Vanilla 3 CASE $54.90 - $164.70 CONTINENTAL
(6/5 Ib. bags/case) . MILLS, 6/5LB
©'125 -+ | Cake Mix, Yellow 3 CASE $54.90 $164.70 ' CONTINENTAL
{(6/5 Ib. bags/case) MILLS, 6/5LB

126 Chocolate Chip 3 CASE $99.00 . $297.00 HERSHEY, 25LB
Morsels, Milk or .

Semi Sweet (20 Ib.
case)

127 Chocolate Chiﬁs 3 ‘ CASE $99.00 $297.00 HERSHEY, 25LB
Semi-Sweet (25 ) .
lb. bulk)

128 Muffin Mix, 2 . CASE $47.85 $95.70 : DAVID'S! 2/8LB . FROZEN MUFFIN
Blueberry (6/5lb ’ . - : ’ . BATTER
bags/case) :

129 Muffin Mix, Bran, 2 CASE $47.85 ’ $95.70 DAVID'S, 2/8LB ) FROZEN MUFFIN
Kosher {6- 5 lb _ BATTER
bags/case) '

130 Muffin Mix, 2 - CASE $79.85 $159.70 DAVID'S, 2/8L8 ‘ FROZEN MUFFIN
Chocolate Chip BATTER
(6/51b bags/case) ‘ ’

131 Pancake Mix, 2 BX $49.85 - $99.70 . PEARL MILLING,
Pearl Milling, or ' . . ' 6/5LB
equal (5 ib. box}

132 Powdered Sugar 1 CASE ' $45.85 $45.35 DOMINO, 24/1LB
(24/11b. ' ’
boxes/case)

S SS S A S SUS
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~ ' MIVILA FOODS .
.. PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT : Res-Pg:m.1-22
Bid No. TBD

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging

. Pudding, $99.70 . VALUE LINE,
J Chocolate, Ready 6/#10
to Serve (6/10)
/ 134 Pudding, Vanilla, 2 CASE $49.85 $99.70 ' VALUE LINE,
/ Ready to Serve ’ . 6/#10
(6/10) ' '
135 Sprinkles, 2 BTL $29.85 $59.70 ) PACKER'S LABEL,
Chocolate, 16 oz o . 10LB'
shaker bottle.
‘2 j .
136 Sprinkles, 2 BTL $29.85 : $59.70 o PACKER'S LABEL,
Rainbow, 16 oz. 10LB
shaker bottle. N ’
137 Vanilla Flavoring, 1 GAL $4.85 $4.85 VALLEY PARK, 1
Imitation {1 ) QUART
.| gallon) ' . .

SECTION XI!! - BREADS AND BREAD CRUMBS

138 6" TOl;pedO Rolls " 10 PKG $9.85 $98.50 ' 7 ROCKLAND, 12 . HEROROLLG" -
(1 dozen ’ COUNT
rolls/package) . ' :

NS S S S

139 6" Whole Wheat 200 PKG $9.85 $1,970.00 ROCKLAND, 12 - CLUB ROLL 6"
Torpedo Rolls . . COUNT WHOLE WHEAT
140 Bagels, Plain,30z. | - 15 CASE - $10.85 $162.75 ROCKLAND, 12
(48 bagels/case) . COUNT
141 Bread, Thick Cut, 200 EA $11.95 $2,390.00 ROCKLAND, 1
Texas Style (22 oz. ) LOAF
loaf :

Introducedpgo pOSAF BTN ASNIOREPORT -
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| . MIVILA FOODS o
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT : Res-Pg:m.1-23.
Bid No. TBD S v

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Line [tem Description Quantity

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total

Proposed

Delivery A.R.O.

Comments

) Brand/Packaging
) i 142 Croutons, 2 CASE $39.85 $79.70 FRESH GOURMET,
: Seasoned, 4/2.5 4/2.5LB
Ibs. -
. 143 Dinner Rolls, 75 PKG $5.95 $446.25 ROCKLAND, 12 ,
Arnold's or Equal, COUNT
12 rolls/package
144 Hamburger Rolls 250 PKG $3.95 $987.50 SABRETT, 12
y (1 dozen COUNT
[ rolls/package)
145 Hot Dog Rolls (1 1,000 PKG . $3.95 $3,950.00 SABRETT, 12
/ : dozen : COUNT.
rolls/package)
| 146 Raisin Bread Loaf, 65 . EA $9.85 ' $640.25 ROCKLAND, 1
Whole Grain, if LOAF
available (1 Ib.
loaf) !
147 Rye Bread, Fresh 175 EA $12.85 $2,248.75 ROCKLAND, 3LB
{1 Ib. loaf) - LOAF
~
148 Taco Shells, Old E} 4 CASE $21.85 587.40 MEXICAN
\/ Paso, or equal ' ORIGINAL, 200
(200 shells/case) COUNT
149 Wheat Bread, 500 Case $4.95 $2,475.00 ROCKLAND, 2802
Fresh Sandwich ’ LOAF
- Size (1 Ib. loaf)
/ 150 Whole Grain Pita 5 CASE $25.85 $129.25 MEDITERRANEAN,
Pockets, 6 inch 12/6CT
{72 pockets/case)

Introducedoqqry pOSA IFRRIEUMENFREPORT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

- MIVILA FOODS

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.1-24

Line item

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Proposed
Brand/Packaging

Delivery A.R.O.

Comments

Spunkmeyer, or
equal (3 0z./ 48
case) R

151 Whole Wheat ~ 110 PACK $7.75 $852.50 ROCKLAND, 6
: English Muffin (6 COUNT
muffins/pack)
152 Whole Wheat 225 ° PKG $7.75 $1,743.75 ROCKLAND, 12
/ Hamburger Rolls COUNT
(1 dozen
rolls/package)
153 Whole Wheat 200 PKG $6.95 $1,390.00 ROCKLAND, 12
/ Hotdog Rolls {1 - COUNT
dozen N
rolls/package)
154 Wraps, Garlic 3 .- CASE $29.85 689.55 KONTOS, 6/12
. Herb 12", 12/12 COUNT
count
155 Wraps, Spinach 3 CASE $29.85 $89.55 KONTOS, 6/12
12%,12/12 Count ' COUNT
156 Wraps, Whole 3 CASE $/23.4O $70.20 KONfOS, 6/12
/ Wheat 12", 12/12 COUNT
Count .
SECTION XIV - FROZEN FOODS
157 Bacon, Hatﬁeld{ 10 BX $85.75 $857.50 INDIANA, 151LB 14-18 SLICE
or equal {layout-
15 |b. box)
/ 158 Bagels, Otis 9 CASE $29.85 $268.65 LENDERS, 72/20Z

‘“tmd“cemPOSALgsb’@B'Mﬁg? ORT
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' ~ MIVILA FOODS
) PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:m.1-25
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SU'PPLIES

Delivery A.R.O.

Line Item Description Quantity

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Proposed

Brand/Packaging

Comments

f 159 Beef Empanadas, 10 CASE $69.85 $698.50 BAGELINO'S,
4 oz., (60 per 50/4.502
case)
160 Beef Sausage 6 ) CASE 543.90 $263.40 SOUTHERN,
Links {1 0z./10 ib. ' 5.330Z/10LB
case) ’
161 | Beef Sausage . 10 CASE ’ - $59.50 ‘ $595.00 MAID RITE, -
Patties (3 0z./10 ’ 1.60Z/10LB
Ib. case)
Lo 162 " |Breaded Chlckelj 10 | CASE $69.85 $698.50 TYSON{ 40/40Z
' |Breast 944, Tyson,
R or Equal (10 1b.
case)
163 Brea"ded Chicken 10 BX $39.10 $391.00 TYSON, 10LB
Nuggets, Tyson,
) or Equal (10 |b.
box)
4 /164 |Bread Flounder 5 CASE $69.50 $347.50 CHANNEL,
Fillets, {4 02./10 40Z/10LB
- Ib. case)
165 Breaded Veal 5 BX $59.50 $297.50 PACKER'S LABEL,
/ Patties.(4 92./10 40Z/10LB
| Ib. box)
” 166 Cheese Bites, <3 . CASE $98.90 $296.7b ANCHOR, 6/2.5LB CHEDDAR CHEESE
: / Bacon & Broccoli : W/BROCCOL,
. (6-21b BACON, &
bags/case) ONIONS'
\/ 167 Cheese Manicotti 5 BX $49.85 $249.25 DAIRY MAID, 72CT
(2 02./10 Ib. box)

IntroducpR@POSAL DSEORIENT RPPORT
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| MIVILA FOODS S .
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ' . : ‘ Res-Pg:m.1-26

Bid No. TBD
MISCELLANEQUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Proposeéd Delivéry A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging

Chicken : , $65.85 $698.50 ' BAGELINO'S,
Empanada, Lazo . . 50/4.50Z
or Equal, 20/3 oz. .

168

169 Chicken Fingers, 5 CASE $49.85 $24,9.25' . TYSON, 10LB
Pierce or Equal,
12/17 oz.

170 Chicken, 6 CASE .. . $89.75 $538.50 BARBER, 24/70Z CHICKEN KIEV
Parmesan Stuffed ’
Breasts {24 -7 oz.
per case)

171 Chicken Pot Pie . 6 ' CASE $43.85 $263.10 ' . BANQUET,
(24/7 oz. case) ) 24/70Z

172 Churros Frozen, 6 CASE $54.90 $329.40 TIO PEPE, 100CT
100 Count

173 Cookie Dough, - 6 " CASE $64.90 $?;89.40 DAVID'S, 320/10Z.
Peanut Butter, 1 ’ .
" |oz.(216/case)

174 Cookie Dough, 6 , CASE $64.950 : $389.40 : DAVDI'S, 320/10Z
Chocolate Chip, 1 : ' ’ i
o0z. (216/case)

175 Cookie Dough, . 6 CASE | $64.90 ) $389.40 DAVID'S, 320/10Z
Oatmeal Raisin, 1 . .
0z.(216/case)

176 Cookie Dough, 7 CASE ' $64.90 $454.30 DAVID'S, 320/10Z
Sugar, 1 oz. ,
% (216/case) : ) '

Sl S SO S S e e

177 Corn Dogs, 60/2.6 S CASE $59.85 - $299.25 . ’ FAIR, 48/4.040Z
OZ. . ) -

Introduced ROPOSAL EROCIMNAIGT2REPORT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORj'

Bid No. TBD

" MIVILA FOODS

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN' FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.1-27

Line [tem

178

Description

Fries, Regular Cut
3/8"{6/5 Ib. bags
case)

Quantity

10

Unit of Measure

CASE

Unit-Cost

$36.95

Total

$369.50

Proposed
Brand/Packaging

REGAL, 6/51.B

Delivery A.R.O. Comments

179

Fries, Seasoned,
Simplot or Equal,
30#

10

CASE

'$59.85

$598.50

MCCAIN, 6/4.5LB

180

French Toast
Sticks (1.25 0z./10
Ib. box)}

10

BX

$39.85

$398.50

RICH'S, 2/5LB

181

French Toast
Sticks, Whole
Grain, Aunt
Jemima or Equal,

15Ib box, (2

boxes/case)

CASE

$39.85

$199.25

BAKECRAFTERS,
5/2L8

182

Guacamole, 12/1
|b. tubs/case

CASE

$59.85

-$59.85

AVOKING, 12/11B

183

Hash Brown
Potato Patties,
Simplot, or equal
{(6/5 Ib. bags/case)

12

CASE

$47.85_

$574.20

ORE-IDA,
12/10CT, 2.2502

184

R L RN

Hot Dogs, All
Beef, Thumanns,
or equal, 10 hot
dogsina1lb.
package (30
packages/case)

100

CASE

$146.70

$14,670.00

SABARETT, 6/5LB

10/1

185

Hot Pockets Brand | |

Subs, Ham &
Cheese (2 ct./11
oz. per box)

BX

$36.95

$110.85

HOT POCKET,
12/802

Page 28
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

- MIVILA FOO’DSl

Res-Pg:m.1-28

S S S~ S

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Line item

Description

Hot Pockets Brand
Subs, Philly
Cheese Steak (2
ct./11 oz. per box)

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total No Bid

'$184.75

Proposed
Brand/Packaging

HOT POCKET,
12/80Z

Delivery A.R.O.

Comments

Hot Pockets Brand

Bean Patties,
Morning Star or
equal,
Southwestern.-
seasoned with
corn, tomatoes
and mild green
chilies, {Child
Nutrition
Labeled), 48 per
case .

FARMS, 48/2.90Z

187 BX $36.95 $18{1.75 ’ HOT POCKET,
‘ Subs, Meatballs & ' 12/80Z

Mozzarella-(2
ct./11 oz. per box)

188 Hot Pockets Brand 3 BX $36.95 /$110.85 HOT POCKET,
Subs, Pepperoni ' . 12/802
Pizza (2 ct./11 0z.
per box)- .

189 Hummus, 5 ib. tub -5 TUB $29.95 » $149.75 MEDITERRANEAN,

R 5LB

190 lalapeno Poppers, 10 BX $69.85 $698.50 FRY FOODS, 4/3LB JALAPENO .
Monterey Jack ) CHEDDAR CHEESE
(4/5 Ib. box)

191 Meatless Black 4 CASE $79.85 $319.40 MORNINGSTAR

IntroduceskanpOSAL BERTUANENTRPORT
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PROPQSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

MIVILA fOOPS Res-Pg:m.1-29

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments

Brand/Packaging

: 192 Mea;less Sausage 4 CASE $79.85 $319.40 . MORNINSTAR
Patties, Morning . ’ . . . |FARMS,
\/ Star or equal, ' 112/1.3402 I
o ) seasoned with ’ : :
. herbs and spices,
(Child Nutrition
Labeled), 112 per
case
' 193 - | Mini Potato 4 CASE $59.85 $239.40 . McCAIN, 6/3LB
. Pancakes, McCain ’ '
3 or equal (6-3 Ib.
. bags/case)
194 Mozzarella Sticks, 10 CASE $49.85 $498.50 ROYAL TREASURE,
(6-2.51b. 4/3LB .
bags/case) ' ‘
} 195 Onion Rings, 5 CASE $33.95 . $16975 ENDICO, 6/2LB EXTRUDED ONION
. Steak Cut (8/21b. '] - , . ' RINGS .
per case) ' ‘ ;.
196 Pancakes Whole N 3 CASE $36.95 $110.85 RIGHT START, :
Grain, Pearl . - 1144/1.402 G
Milling or equal, ' .
144 per case
/ 197 .| Pasta, Cavatelli, 5 CASE $36.95 $184.75 . CUCINA ROYALE,
; : 10#, Frozen . : . . 12/1607Z
/ i . .
/ 198 Pasta, Tortellini 5 - CASE $39.85 $199.25 CUCINA ROYALE,
4 Cheese, Tri-color, ) o 10LB

10#, Frozen
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. | MIVILA FOODS
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT .

Bid No. TBD : :
MISCELLANEQUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.1-30

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments

Brand/Packaging

Jelly Sandwichi, 72/2.602
Frozen, Smuckets
or Equal (72-4.8
oz. )
sandwiches/per
case)

\./ 199 - Peanut Butter and -4 CASE $69.85 $279.40 SMUACKERS,

200 Potatoes, Classic 2 CASE $39.85 $79.70 REGAL, 6/5LB DICED POTATOES || -
' Home Fries,
Sinplot or Equai (6 '

- 5 |bs/case) : o ) ' ) ) '

201 Potato Nugget 2 CASE $59.85 $119.70 McCAIN, 6/41.B
Smiles, (SNA) ’
McCain or Equal

(6-4lb
bags./case)
ZdZ Potatoes, 5 CASE $89.75 $448.75 STOUFFERS, FROZEN
Scalloped, . . : 477207 .
Dehydrated {6- : :

2.5 Ibs/case)

203 - Pizza, 5" Round 13 CASE ) $79.85 $1,038.05 ’ TONY'S, 54/5"
(5.5 oz cheese, 60° : )
per case)

204 Pizza, Ellios {51 12 CASE $85.85 $1,030.20 TONY'S 96/4.50Z
slices/case, 3 ’ '
oz./slice, 10.1 |b.

case) :

U

205 Pizza, Veggie 12 " CASE $85.85 $1,030.20 TONY'S, TURKEY SAUSAGE
4"X6" Red Baron : ' : 96/4.690Z PIZZA -

or Equal (5.7 oz,

72 per case)

1
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_ MIVILA FOODS -Pa: -
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT . | - Res-Pg:m.1-31

Bid No. TBD .
MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Proposed Delivery A.R.O. Comments
Brand/Packaging

\/ 206 sandwich Pork 5 CASE : s59.00 ~ $295.00 _ | .’ ADVANCE PIERRE,
Ribs (10 |b./case) . ) 10L8
: 207 Sandwich Chicken 10 BX : $39.85 $398.50 EMBASSY,
. Steaks, 10 |b. _|40z/10LB
. 208 Sandwich Steaks, 15 BX $54.90 $823.50 - EMBASSY,
/ All Beef (6 |b. box) : N ’ 40z/10LB
/ 209 Spring Rolls with 4 BX $79.85 $319:40 . CHEF ONE,
’ J ‘ Vegetables (2 oz. . . 200/.90Z
100/box)
210 Sitr Fry . 4 - CASE $64.90 $259.60 SIMPLOT, 12/218 ' N
Vegetables, ’ ’
Simplot or Equal’ .
{2 Ib bags, - h
12/case)
211 Sweet Potato 10 .~ CASE $33.95 $339.50 n ROOTS, 6/2LB
Fries (6/2 |b. .
) bags/case)
. 212 Turkey Bacon, -8 CASE $59.85 $478.80 . GODSHALL 2/5LBS
Perdue, or equal
(12 Ib. case)
213 - | Turkey Breakfast 1 CASE 554.90 $54.90 JIMMY DEAN, TURKEY SAGE
/ . Links, Perdue or ] 1.50Z/10LB SAUSAGE PATTIES
Equal :
2[14 Turkey Breakfast 1 CASE $54.90 $54.90 JIMMY DEAN, ' TURKEY SAGE
' Patties, Perdue or : 1.507Z/10LB . SAUSAGE PATTIES
equal ‘
/ .
215 Vegetarian 1 CASE $79.85 $79.85 MORNINSTAR .
Breakfast Patties, FARMS,
112/1.3 oz. : - 112/1.340Z
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MIVILA FOODS
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:m.1732

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost i Proposed
Brand/Packaging

216 Vegan Plant- 1 ‘CASE $74.90 $74.90 MORNINGSTAR
) Based Protein in ) FARMS,

\ Chicken Nugget ' : 212/.7602
Form, Morning : : . o

Star or equal,
{Child Nutrition . -

Labeled), 212 per -
case

Delivery A.R.O.

Comments

Flavor, 1/2 Cup
Fruit Value, USDA
(24/case)

217 Waffles, Whole 5 - CASE $27.85 $139.25 ’ RIGHT START, WHOLE GRAIN
Wheat Low fat, 18/8PK :
Eggo, or Equal '
(120 :
Waffles/Case)

SECTION XV - FROZEN DESSERTS
218 Blue Bunny Big 10 BX . $23.85' $238.50 RICH'S, 48/30Z CRUMBLED
/ Dipper Cone N ’ COOKIE CONE

(24/box)

219 Brownies, Fudge 10 CASE $54.90 $549.00 DAVID'S, 2/6LB UNICED PRE-CUT

: lced, Cut Frozen, ‘ . " |TRAY CHOCOLATE CHIP

4/5 b, ’

220 Chocolate Chip 10 . BX $49.85 $498.50 GOOD HUMOR,

. | Cookie Sandwich . 24/4.507 -
‘[ (24/box]) '

221 Chocolate Ice 10 CTN $33,95 $339.50 . . WASHBURN, 3
Cream, 1 gallon : . GALLON
carton

A 222 Frozen Fruit Juice 30 CASE $21.95° $658.50 ' SUNCUP, 72/402 SINGLE CASE
/ Cups, 4 oz., 100% FLAVORS

Juice, Multi

Introduce
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD .

MIVILA FOODS

MISCELLANEOUS GROCERIES, FROZEN FOODS AND KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.1-33

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Proposed
Brand/Packaging

Delivery A.R.O. Comments

223 Ice Cream 25 BX $23.85 $596.25 RICH'S, 24/307
Sandwich, 4 oz.
(24/box)

224 *| Klondike Bars (24 10 BX $29.85 $298.50 KLONDIKE, -

' bars/box) 24/4.502°

225 Strawberry 10 BX $39.85 $398.50 GOOD HUMOR,
Shortcake 24/402
Popsicle (24/box)

226 Vanilla Ice Cream, 5 CTN $39.85 $199.25 WAS_HBURN, 3
1 gallon carton GALLON
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