Res-Pg:h.5-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Barbara Jo Crea

08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn (732)929-2005
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines (732)505-1918
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: December 18, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES to
Continental Hardware, Inc., the sole qualified bidder. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 23 and 40
as unresponsive. They will be rebid. (B2024-189)

Official Resolution# [2024001943
Meeting Date 12/18/2024
Introduced Date 12/18/2024
Adopted Date 12/18/2024
Agenda ltem h-5

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-189
Result Adopted
cowry _ Ta T, &1 T, 2
COMMISSIONER x @0 % % |< |2
Crea v v
Quinn v v
Haines v v

Kelly v v v
Sadeghi v v |v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie |, Guatiner”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:h.5-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION
December 18, 2024
WHEREAS, on November 7, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for furnishing and delivery of LUMBER AND LUMBER

SUPPLIES for the County of Qcean; State of New Jersey; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, one response was reccived from the

following bidder:
Name of Bidder Address of Bidder
Continental Hardware, Inc, 400 Delancy Street

Newark, NJ 07105
(973) 589-3929

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the sole qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely, CONTINENTAL HARDWARE, INC,

Recommendation is made to reject ltem Nos. 23 and 40 as unresponsive. They will be rebid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into a contract, for the furnishing and delivery of Tumber and Lumber Supplies for the
County of Ocean, for the contract shall be from date of award through December 31, 2025, or
until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the
term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A, CONTINENTAL HARDWARE. INC. for one hundred, nine (109) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 24, 25,

26,27, 28,29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51,
52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69,70, 71,72, 73,74, 75, 76,
71,78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 93, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100,
101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110 and 111.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

Introduced on] December 18, 2024
Adopted on: December 18, 2024
Official ResoIlJtion#: 2024001943




Introduced on
Adopted on:
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2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successtul bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Qcean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

3. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding

sources: Bridge Department, Fire/First Aid Training Center, Parks Department Q.E,

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-189.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Bridge Department, Fire/First Aid Training Center, Patks Department and Continental

Hardware, Inc., the successful bidder.

December 18, 2024
December 18, 2024

Official Resolqifion#: 2024001943




B2024-189

CONTINENTIAL HARDWARE, INC.

Res-Pg:h.5-4

[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT-REPORT
Bid No, TBD
LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES .
LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unlt of Unit Cost  Total Cast No Bid Delivery,  Comments

Measure AR.O,

SECTION 1 - Nominal Lumber, Douglas Fir #2, or Better - HEMP FIR NOT ACCEPTABLE
ya
S 1 {2vxe precuts 100 PC $3.90 | $390.00 2 days
V/ 2 2% 4" x 8', NOT Pre-Cut ‘ 400 PC %4.15 $1,660.00 - 2 days
o 3 [rxanxao 175 pe | $s50 | 896250 2 days
W o4 |2xarxa 100 pC $7.60 | $760.00 - |2days
/
v s 2' x4" x 16' _ 150 pc - | 950 | 142500 2 days
p | ‘
W6 [2'xatxao 100 PC $13.00 | $1,30000 2 days
7 2"x6"x 8" o _ 100 PC $6.50 $650.00 2 days
\.-/ 8 |2"xexw . 100 pc | 410850 | $1,050.00 2 days
YV o9 |zxexi : 100 PC 5990 | 4990,00 2 days
Wl
\/ 10 |2"x6'x16' 150 PC §17.50 | $2,625.00 2 days
. .
o 11 [2xg'xie 150 PC 51800 | $2,70000 | |2days
\’/ 12 |2"x100x16 100 PC $37.00 | $3,70000 " {2 days
¢ o [2xiarxie ' 150 PC $4600 | $6,900.00 2 days

Introduced BFONTINENTAdnARGYYAGEINC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Adopted onfilid - LUM BEReuhli LIBVITER SUPPLIES
Official Respygéog#: 2024001943



B2024-189

CONTINENTIAL HARDWARE, INC.

[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:h.5-5

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of UnikCost  Total Cost No Bid Delivery,  Comments
Measure AR,
'/ © 14 4*x 8" x18' 1ao PC 3399'.99 439,999,010 1 weéek
Spruce
U/ 15 5/4" x 3" x 12", 8 pes/bundle 50 BoL 555.60 $2,750,00 2 days
Y4 T 5/4% 3" X 16', 8 pesfoundle 4 L 50 BOL $55.00 | $2,750.00 2 days
v w7 [siarxetxi2 | wo | AC $3000 | $3,000.00 2 days
V/ 18 Spruce Flrring Strips, #2 Grade or Batter, 1" % 2% x 12!, 12 pesfbundle 50 aDL 450,00 52,500.00 2 days
Surveyor Stake l
V/ 19 Masan Lath, 50/bundle 5 8oL 318,00 $90.00 2 days
SﬁCﬁON 2 - Pressure Treated Lumber, Cappear Base, i\lo Arsenate, Yellow Plne #2, or Batter
. 20 frxexs ' 30 | PC 4620 | $1,86000 2 days
vk x4 210 120 PC $7.26 $864.00 2 days
V' 22 [2'xaxie o ) 450 PC $13.00 | $5,850.00 2 days
'I ' 23 2" % 4" x 20'-ACQ, ' 100 PC $25.00 $2,500,00 ) 2 days
W s 4 200 rc $900 | $,80000 (2
W o5 |2vxetxa 150 Pe $12.00 | $1,800.00 2 days
S 6 |2xe'x1s 300 pC 51800 | $5,400.00 2 days
‘/ 27 2% 6" x 20ACQ, ‘ 100 PC 42850 | $2,850.00 2 days
\// 8 [2'x8'x16 ' , 200 PC 52800 | $5,60000 2 days
q 29 2" x 8" x 20-ACA, 150 - pC 533,00 54,950.00 2 days

Introducéd HENTINENEA ISR OYY ABEAINC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Adopted ongid - LUMBERAND L UMBEHSUPPLIES
Official Resglytiop#: 2024001943
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CONTINENTIAL HARDWARE, INC.

[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:h.5-6

Line Item Quantity Unit of (nit Cost  Total Cast No Bid Dalivery,  Comments
Measura AR.O,
v oo 29% 10" x 8 200 . PC 41500 | $3,00000 2 days
o
v/ 31 2"% 10" x 10" 100 PC 31980 | 31,980.00 2 days
ya
‘/ 32 2" % 10" % 16" 250 PC $34.00 | $8,500,00 2 days
/
u / 33 2% 10" % 20-AC0, 150 pC #5500 | ¢8,250.00 2 days
v _
I/ 34 2% 12" x 10" 50 PC 32400 | $1,20000 2 days
v/ a5 2"x 12" x 16' 120 pC 332,00 | 43,840.00 2 days
il V4 ]
‘/ 36 2% 12" % 20' ACO, 100 pC s7800 | $7,80000 2 days
v/ 37 4" x4 x g 100 PC 313.00 | $1,30000 2 days
ya
o 38 A'x 4" 212! 100 PC $19.00 | 31,900.00 2 days
ya N
‘/ ;39 |arxaxae 300 pC 42550 | $7,650.00 2 days
40 49 % 4% x 20'ACQ, 100 PG $100.00 | $10,000.00 1weak
VvV o oa |e"xs'xie 150 e $60.00 | $9,000,00 2 days
yd
v/ 42 8" x 6 x 18-ACQ 50 Pe 412500 | %6,250.00 2 days
‘/ 43 6" % 8" % 20AC0, 150 PC $225.00 | $33,750.00 2 weaeks
,/' a4 6" x 16" x 16'- ACQ. 50 PC $750,00 | $37,500.00 2 weeks
ra
v a4 8"%8"x16' 50 PC 425000 | $12,500,00 2 weaks
/
\/ 46 8" x 8" x 20' Treated CCA 40 50 PC $400.00 | $20,000.00 7 weeks
y ay 12" % 12" % 16-AC0, 50 pC 4700.00 | $35,000,00 3 weeks
Vd
Y T 12" x 12" % 20%ACQ, 50 PC $800.00 | $40,000.00 3 weeks

Introduced HeINTINEDIAdibARPYVEGRE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Adopted ongid - LUMBEReNNBLLE/ZRA SUPPLIES

Official Respgﬁ;&)g#: 2024001943



B2024-189

CONTINENTIAL HARDWARE, INC.

[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:h.5-7

Line [tam Descriptlon Quantity unlt of Unit Cost

Measure

Total Cost

No Bid

Delivery,
AR.Q,

Comments |

SECTION 3 - Bridge Materlal, Must Contaln 2.5 Lbs. of Dry Salt Per_Cublc Faat of Timber; Grade 2, 545
vﬁ/ 49 3" x 6" x 14' . s 50 EA $110.00 | $5,500.00 3 waaks
V/ 50 3"x8" 14! 75 EA $110.00 48,250,00 3 weeks
Vrt 51 3"x 10" x 14 ‘ ' 50 EA $140.00 $7,000.00 3 we;zks
L/ i 52 3"x 10" x 20" 50 EA $250.00 | $12,500.00 3 weeks
\ - 53 3" x 10" x 26" ) 50 EA $40C;.00 . $20,000.00 3 waeks
u 5 |oxexim 50 EA $400.00 | $20,000.00 3 weeks
V/ 55 Tongue & Groove, 2"34 6"%x12' . 100 EA 412000 | $12,000.00 3 weeks
\l/ , 56 Tangue & Groove, 2" x 8" x 12! 100 EA $120.00 | $12,000.00 3 weeks
L/ 57 Tongue & Groove, 2" x 10" x 12! 100 T EA $120.00 | $12,000.00 I weeks
\/ 58 Tangue & Groave, 2" x 10" % 16' 100 EA $120.00 | $12,000.00 3 weeks
\// .59 Tongue & Groove, 2" x 10" % 20" 100 EA 520000 | $20,000.00 3 waeks
v/ 60 . |Tongue & Groove, 4" x 10" x 18 160 EA 5460,00 | $40,000.00 3 weeks
SECTION 4 - Bridge Decking
\’/ 61 4" % 10" x 12-ACQ, #1 Danse Yellow Plne, Treated .5CF 545, Bridge Decking | 100 PC $700,00 370,00;3.00 2 weeks
V/ , 62 4" % 10" x 20ACQ, #1 Dense Yallow Pine, Treated .6CF 345, Bridge Deacking ' 100 rC 580000 | $80,000.00 3 weeks
\ / 63 4" x 10" x 16' -ACQ, #1 Dense Yellow Pine, Trreated ,GCF 545, Bridge Decking 100 PC $800.00 | S80,000,00 3 weeks
S/ECFICJN 5 - ACQ Treated Plywood
\/r 64 4" X B’ x ¥i", 5 ply, AC, ACQ, Treated Plywoord 50 PC $48.00 $2,400.00 2 days

Introduced G NTINEMEALHHRDW ABEINC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT -

Adopted orBid - LUMSERCANDeL I8 BEMSUPPLIES
Official Resp)(]gg(yl#: 2024001943




B2024-189

CONTINENTIAL HARDWARE, INC.

Res-Pg:h.5-8

[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ) %
LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantlty Unit of UnitCost  Total Cost No Bid Delivery,  Comments

_ Measure ARQ.
V| 65 A x 8 x 4", 5 ply, AC, ACQL Troatad Plywood 100 PC $50‘00 $5,000.00 2 days

SECTION 6 - Plywood, Exterlor, Fir, Good One Side, A/C Grada Stamped

W g 66 |%'xd4'x8' ; : | 50 © SHT $34.00 | $1,700.00 2 days
\ / g 67 Wxd'x 8, Luan Undelrlavment 4 75 SHT 517.00 %1,275.00 2 days
L/I PRE P . . 135 SHT 84800 | $6,480.00 2.days

/ 69 [A'xaxe ‘ 75 SHT $54.00 | $4,050.00 2 days
v f 70 |#xd4xs ' 80 SHT $60.00 | $4,800.00 2 days

SECTION 7 - Veneer Plywood and Cabinet Grade, 4' X 8' Sheets
p

v p 71 %* Dak Veneer Plywaod A/C . d 5 SHT -5170.00 $850.00 1week
\// 72| %" poplar Veneer Plywood A/C 5 SHT $100.00 | $500.00 1 waek
V, 73 .%" Walnut Venaer Plywood A/C 5 SHT 5130.00 $650,00 1 waek
V/ g <74 %" Cedar T-1-11, 8” Space Between Tangue & Groove 105 SHT 512500 | $13,125.00 2 weeks
\//; 75 #" Birch Plywood, Cablnet Grade, Good Bath Sides 5 SHT $110.00 $550.00 1waek
U’ 76 %" 0ak Plywood, Qablnet Grade, Good Both Sides ‘ 5 SHT $119.00 %585.00 1 week

SECTION 8- 1 and 5/4" Nomn(nal Size, Clear Plne, #2 Pine and Hard';vood, and Western Red Cedar Face Frame Materlals

77 5/4"x 6" % 8'-12' Lengths Only, Clear Birch, No Knots . 250 LF $15.00 $3,750,00 ' 3 days
78 5/4" x 6" x 8'-12', Clear White Oak, No Knats 50 LF 515,00 $750,00 3 days
\// 79 5/4" % 6" x 8'-12', Clear White Poplar, No Knots 3 ,200 LF £18,00 £3,600.00 3 days
\/ 80 5/4" % 6" % 12' Lengths Only, Clear White Pine, "C" Grade, No Knots l 250 LF 57.00 $1,750.00 3 days

Introduced K2 NTINESEALHW RO ABEANC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Adopted orffid - LUMBER @it 18/ 2ERSUPPLIES
Official Respéggo_[ﬁ: 2024001943



B2024-189

CONTINENTIAL HARDWARE, INC.

[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:h.5-9

LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES

Line [tem

Dascription

Quantity

Unit of
Measure,

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Dalivery,

AR.Q.

Comments

v /81 5/4" x 8" x 8'-12', Clear White Paplar, No Knots 100 LF 57.00 5700.00 3 days .
V’ a2 5/4" x 8" % 12' Lengths Only, #2 Premiurm, White Pine 10 LF ~ 4500 450,00 2 days
5E90N 9 - Drywall & Gypsum Products
p/ 8'3 loint Combound/AII Purpase, 61.7 Ib. {28 kg), Ready Mix/Non-Asbestos, Green Lid USG 25 EA 426,00 $650.00 2 days
/ 84 Ioint Compaund/Ughtwelght, Al Purposa, 4.5 gal, {£7.0 ), Ready Mix/Non-Asbestos, ‘ 25 EA $26.00 $650,00 2 days
u Blue Lid U3G
pd
p/ / 85 Matal Corner Bead for Sheetrock, 8' Lengths 60 PC 53.00 4180.00 2 days
V‘/ / 86 Sheatrack, %" x4'x @' 50 SHT $20,00 %1,000.00 ‘2 days
V/ /87 Sheetrack, %" x 4'% ', Fire Coated 60 S.HT‘ 424,00 $1,440.00 2 days
l'/'/ 88 |Sheetrock, 4" x4'% 12", Fire Coated 20 SHT $3000 | $600.00 2days
l./" 89 Sheetrock, %% 4'x &', Flre Coated 75, SHT $19.00 , | $1,425.00 2 days
\.t// a0 Sheatrock, %" x 4'% 12, flre Coated 20 SHT 430.00 S600.00 2 days
v// a1 Sheetrcck Tape, 250" Roll 20 . ROLL $3.99 $75.80 2 days
p/ 92 Purple Xp Dry;wall Panel, 1/2" X 4' X 8' 20 SHT $22.00 5440,00 2 days
SECTION 10 - "CDX" Sheathing, Pressure Treated, Mo Arsenate Plywaod, "MDO™ Medlum Density Overlay, 4'X 8' Sheets
\V/ 93 |4 CDX-FIR 25 SHT $2600 | $650.00 2 days
VC g 94 %" MDO (Medium Density Overlay), Two-Sided 25 SHT £126.00 $3,150,00 2 days
V’ g5 A MDb (Medium Density Qverlay), Two-Sided 25 SHT 4150.00 53,750.09 2 days

SECTION 11 - Molding, Clear White Flne, No Finger Joints, Random Lengths Acceptable, NOTHING less than 7

Introduced [SINTINESESbH GO ABZANC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Adopted orBid - LUMBER #NIeL I8 BERISUPPLIES ;
Official Ressiytiopy#: 2024001943



B2024-189

CONTINENTIAL HARDWARE, INC.

[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

8id No. TBD
LUMBER AND LUMBER SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:h.5-10

Line {tem Dascription

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

‘Total Cost

No Bid Delivary,  Comiments
AR,Q.

L: )5 Picture Frame Maolding, 11/16"x %" G0 LF $5.00 $300.00 2 days
\,/ 97 . |Plicture FrameMelding, 11/16"% 2 1/16" 60 LF 35,00 $300,00 2days
SECTION 12 - Mlscellaneous ”
v 38 |Corkboard, # x 3 x4 5 PC $25000 | $1,250.00 1week
u.// 99 |Cork Board, 4" x4'x 8' ) 5 PC $250.00 | $1,250.00 1 week
V// i00 Screws, 5# Boxes - 2 14" Premium Deck Screws 5. 8X $32.00 $160.00 2 days
V/ 101 Screws, 5 Bc;xes - 3" Premlum Deck Screws 5 BX 532,00 $160.00 2 days
u//foz Flashihg, 013 Gauge Alum_!num, 12" % Sﬁ' Roll 5 ROLL 569.00 534510b 2 days
W/ 103 |TemperedPegBoard, 4" x ;1' x g 10 SHT | %4000 | $40000 |2 days
SECTIQN 13 - ftems far Usa by the Flre & EMS Training Center
V/ A 104 2;' X 4" X 8 Pine - Not Treated J 60 EA $4.50 $270.00 2 days
; p
V// 105 2" x 2" x 10 Pine - NOT Treated 100 EA 57,00 $700.00 2 days
t/ 105 2" % 4* x 10' - Pine - NOT Treatad 25 EA 55.20 $130.00 2 days
,\_/ l 107 4'x 8'x 7/16" - Qriented Strand Board 150‘_; SHT - $20,00 $3,000.00 2 days
W/ 108 4'%8'x 3/8" - Regular Shestrock 15 SHT $20,00 4300.00 2 days
W o109 [#x8 x40 - plywood 25 SHT $33.00 sézs.oo 2 days
\/ ’/ 110 Screws, 5# Boxes - 2-1/2" Premium Deck sérews 4 BOX $32.00 $128.00 2 days
b/ 111 Screws, 5# Boxes, - 3" Premium Dack Screws 4 BOX 532.00 $128.0q 2 days

Introduced 4EONTINEDEGAIBARTINLMRE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Adopted ongid - LUMBEFATHEY1312BBR SLPPLIES
Official Reselytion#: 2024001943



