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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace

Cc issioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda

Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

May 21, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION
INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS to American Pipe Cleaning, LLC; Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe,
Inc.; and Vortex Services, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2025-70)

Official Resolution# |2025000657
Meeting Date 05/21/2025
Introduced Date 05/21/2025
Adopted Date 05/21/2025
Agenda Item k-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-70
Result Adopted
COUNTY gaﬁguww@
COMMISSIONER g o g g}é s % g;
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v v
Bacchione v v
Haines v v|v

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guaar”

Clerk Of The Board
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Adopted on:
Official Resoly

t

Res-Pg:k.4-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

Ino _ B%O},’i - 10

RESOLUTION
May 21, 2025

WHEREAS, on April 1, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed
bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND
TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
American Pipe Cleaning, LLC Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe, Inc
122 Highway 34 1566 Harding Highway

Howell, NJ 07727 Newfield, NJ 08344

(732) 751-0006 (856) 697-1900

Vortex Services, LLC
210 Bennett Road
Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 625-9300

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted namely that of, AMERICAN PIPE CLEANING,
LLC,; MOBILE DREDGING & VIDEO PIPE, INC., and VORTEX SERVICES, LLC be
accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into a contract, accepting the bid for the Storm Drain Cleaning and Television Inspection
at Various Locations, County of Ocean, for the contract period shall be from July 1, 2025
through June 30, 2026, a period of one (1) year, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise
stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A.
40A:11-15.

A. VORTEX SERVICES, LLC for ten (10) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9 and 10 as a primary contract.
Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 1,2, 3,4, 5,6, 7, 8, 9 and 10) of $1,048,100.00.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

May 21, 2025
May 21, 2025
on#: 2025000657
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B. AMERICAN PIPE CLEANING, LLC for ten (10) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7, 8,9 and 10 as a secondary contract.
Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 1,2, 3,4, 5, 6,7, 8,9 and 10) of $1,556,000.00.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. MOBILE DREDGING & VIDEO PIPE, INC. for ten (10) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7, 8,9 and 10 as a secondary contract.
Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 1,2, 3, 4,5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10) of $1,332,000.00.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for services and equipment to be acquired by this contract shall
be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance
with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Contracts will be awarded to the bidders offering the lowest price per item
to the County. Additionally, the County reserves the option to award contracts to both a
primary and a secondary contractor. Initially, orders will be placed with the primary
contractors. In cases where the primary contractors cannot fulfill the work promptly, the

County retains the right to seek services from the secondary contractor.

4. Funds for the services and equipment shall be available within the following

funding source: Engineering O.E.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-70.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Engineering Department and the successful bidders.

Introduced on May 21, 2025
Adopted on: May 21, 2025
Official Resolytjon#: 2025000657
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[MOBILE DREDGING & VIDEO PIPE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

Confirmed

12. Submission of Bid Package* .
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed : \

STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS COUNTY LOCATIONS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments
Measure

"y 1 Cleaning, Storm Drain - Half Day 20 UNIT $1,900.00 | $38,000.00
1// 2 Cleaning, Storm Drain - Whole Day 40 UNIT $2,800.00 | $112,000.00

L/ 3 Cleaning and Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Half Day 20 UNIT $3,700.00 | $74,000.00

u 4 Cleaning and Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Whole Day 40 UNIT $5,600.00 | $224,000.00

u 5 Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Half Day 50 UNIT $1,900.00 | $95,000.00

U 6 Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Whole Day 150 UNIT $2,800.00 | $420,000.00

U 7 Traffic Directors, Flaggers - Hour 300 HR $210.00 $63,000.00

l/ 8 Traffic Directors, Uniformed - Hour ‘ 300 HR $200.00 | $60,000.00 ~
iy 9 Maintaining and Protecting Traffic - Half Day 20 UNIT $3,300.00 | $66,000.00

Introducerion———May 212025

AdoptedM®OBILE DRED&IRG 2ADEO PIPE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resokiignty HARAMAEBEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS
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[MOBILE DREDGING & VIDEO PIPE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments

Measure

Maintaining and Protecting Traffic - Whole Day $4,500.00

$180,000.00

TOTAL - $1,332,000.00

Introdueed-ep————May-21,2026
AdoptetM@BILE DRE Mayt3, &Y5DEO PIPE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Officialfitgsottisri BRAGAPLEFTANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS
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[AMERICAN PIPE CLEANING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

Res-Pg:k.4-6

Confirmed

12. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.

Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

8 ICE TABLES
STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS COUNTY LOCATIONS

Descriptio Qua 0 otal Co o Bid o
u 1 Cleaning, Storm Drain - Half Day 20 UNIT $1,800.00 | $36,000.00
\ 2 Cleaning, Storm Drain - Whole Day © 40 UNIT $3,600.00 | $144,000.00
\l 3 Cleaning and Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Half Day 20 UNIT $3,600.00 [ $72,000.00
Y 4 Cleaning and Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Whole Day 40 UNIT $7,200.00 | $288,000.00
v 5 Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Half Day 50 UNIT $1,800.00 | $90,000.00
u ‘ 6 Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Whole Day 150 UNIT $3,600.00 | $540,000.00 |
\ V 7 Traffic Directors, Flaggers - Hour 300 HR $185.00 $55,500.00
\ 8 Traffic Directors, Uniformed - Hour 300 HR $235.00 $70,500.00
Y 9 Maintaining and Protecting Traffic - Half Day 20 UNIT $2,600.00 | $52,000.00
Introduce -

Adopted AMERICAN RI&¥ 23, 2ARENG LLC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Regolutferth 29RMRPESEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS
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[AMERICAN PIPE CLEANING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid  Comments
Measure
W 10 Maintaining and Protecting Traffic - Whole Day 40 UNIT $5,200.00 | $208,000.00
TOTAL $1,556,000.00 1

Introduced-oni—May 21, 2025
Adopted AMERICAN M&E 21, RA2ENG LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official iRegolytien#i39RHMPEIEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS
Page 7




[VORTEX SERVICES LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

Res-Pg:k.4-8

11. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*
Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or

executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

12. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this

solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.

Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

Line Item

Description

Quantity

Unit of

Measure

Unit Cost

STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS COUNTY LOCATIONS

Total Cost

v 1 Cleaning, Storm Drain - Half Day 20 UNIT $1,155.00 | $23,100.00
\’/ 2 Cleaning, Storm Drain - Whole Day 40 UNIT $2,255.00 | $90,200.00
v 3 Cleaning and Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Half Day 20 UNIT $2,255.00 | $45,100.00
N 4 Cleaning and Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Whole Day 40 UNIT $4,455.00 | $178,200.00

// 5 Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Half Day 50 UNIT $1,155.00 | $57,750.00
W, 6 Television Inspection, Storm Drain - Whole Day 150 UNIT $2,255.00 | $338,250.00

Introdu

s op————May 21,2025
Adopted\VVARTEX SERMHUYES1| LORRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Bgpokigniiy ZAZAMAEPEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS
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: ' Res-Pg:k.4-9
[VORTEX SERVICES LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

STORM DRAIN CLEANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

tine ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments |
Measure
9 7 Traffic Directors, Flaggers - Hour 300 HR $165.00 | $49,500.00
/
L/. 8 "| Traffic Directors, Uniformed - Hour 300 HR $200.00 | $60,000.00
U 9 Maintaining and Protecting Traffic - Half Day 20 UNIT $2,100.00 | $42,000.00
U / 10 Maintaining and Protecting Traffic - Whole Day 40 UNIT $4,100.00 | $164,000.00
TOTAL $1,048,100.00 —‘

Introducedon:—— May 21,2025

Adopted[VORTEX SERRIERS, OBRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggolutiengi 280009 EANING AND TELEVISION INSPECTION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS
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