Res-Pg:k.4-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

08754-2191

(732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi

Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: August 6, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS
BEADS to Crown USA Incorporated; Ennis-Flint, Inc.; Ingevity Corporation; LBS Enterprises LLC DBA
Allstates Coatings; National Highway Products, Inc.; and Potters Industries LLC, the lowest qualified bidders.
(B2025-107)

Official Resolution# (2025001103
Meeting Date 08/06/2025
Introduced Date 08/06/2025
Adopted Date 08/06/2025
Agenda ltem k-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-107
Result Adopted
COUNTY g s g o lw [ !5;
COMMISSIONER § a g gi ﬁ g %
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v v
Bacchione v v |v
Haines v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guainer”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolufi

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RA0S- 107

NO.

RESOLUTION
August 6, 2025

WHEREAS, on June 10, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES
AND GLASS BEADS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Crown USA Incorporated Ennis-Flint, Inc.
6867 Mountainbrook Drive 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste. 370
Columbus, GA 31904 Greensboro, NC 27410
(706) 553-9500 (800) 331-8118
Ingevity Corporation LBS Enterprises LLC dba
4920 O’Hear Avenue, Suite 400 Allstates Coatings
North Charleston, SC 29405 100 North Lee Drive
(334) 245-1138 Gladewater, TX 75467
(903) 845-6436
National Highway Products, Inc. Potters Industries, LLC
301 Riverside Drive 3222 Phoenixville Pike, Suite 103
Millville, NJ 08332 Malvern, PA 19355
(856-) 692-7572 (445) 895-3236
The Sherwin-Williams Company Swarco Industries LLC
101 Prospect Avenue, 1500 Midland 270 Rutherford Lane
Cleveland, OH 44115 Columbia, TN 38401
(800) 597-2929 (931) 388-5900

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications in each instance, be accepted, namely, CROWN USA INCORPORATED;
ENNIS-FLINT, INC.; INGEVITY CORPORATION; LBS ENTERPRISES LLC DBA
ALLSTATES COATINGS; NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC. and POTTERS
INDUSTRIES, LLC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting bids for the Furnishing and Delivery of Traffic Marking
Supplies and Glass Beads for the County of Ocean, for the contract shall be for a one (1) year
term beginning August 21, 2025 and ending August 20, 2026, or until delivery is complete
unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract
pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

August 6, 2025
August 6, 2025
bn#: 2025001103




Res-Pg:k.4-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 AUGUST 6, 2025

A. CROWN USA INCORPORATED for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 4

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. ENNIS-FLINT, INC for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 17.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. INGEVITY CORPORATION for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 20.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. LBS ENTERPRISES LLC DBA ALLSTATES COATINGS for seven (7)

items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1,2,3,13, 14, 18 and 19.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

E. NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC for seven (7) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 5,6,7,8,11, 15 and 16.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

F. POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 9,10 12 and 21.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.4, the County has established a reasonable
estimated maximum dollar value of $397,400.00 for the term of this contract, based on
historical procurement data for comparable goods or services. The County further reserves
the right to increase quantities by up to twenty percent (20%) of the maximum awarded

amount at the unit prices bid, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.3.

3. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital

accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Engineering.

Introduced on: August 6, 2025
Adopted on: August 6, 2025
Official Resolufion#: 2025001103




Res-Pg:k.4-4
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 AUGUST 6, 2025

4. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-107.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Engineering and the successful bidders.

Introduced on] August 6, 2025
Adopted on: August 6, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001103




' ‘Res-Pg:k.4-5
[INGEVITY CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Line tem Description

Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments

Measure AR.O.:

{ Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 250 Gallon Tote

$3,312.50 {$165,625.00

19 Waterborne Acrylic‘Ponmer High Build Paint, Yellow, 5 Gallon Pail 50 PAIL $73.75 $3,687.50 |14 ARO
\/ 20 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 5 Gallon Pail 50 PAIL $15.50 $775.00 |14 ARO
21 Waterborne Paint Drying Agent, Visilok, Per Pound LB No Bid No Bid X

Introduced-epi———August6;2025 -
Adopted IMGEVITY CORiQSAST 2abid RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Begotvtiant 2RARGNMNS SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS
" Page?




' . : Res-Pg:k.4-6
[ENNIS-FLINT, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT :

Bid No. TBD |
TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments
Measure AR.O.;

Line item Description Quantity

Jet Dry Water Base White Traffic Marking Compound, S Galloﬁ Can, Fast Dry 20 CAN - §72.50 $1,456.00
2 . Jet Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast Dry 20 y CAN $70.00 $1,400.00
3 Jet Dry Water B.ase White Traffic Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry 15 TOTE $3,125.00 ' | $46,875.00
4 Jet Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 256 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry 15 TOTE $3,000.00 | $45,000.00
5 White Granulated Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound | 50,000 L8 .50.75 $37,500.00
6 Yellow Grénulated W;hermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pﬁund 10,000 LB $0.70 $7,000.00
7 White Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound 100,000 LB $0.875 $87,500.00
8 “| Yellow Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound 3.0,000 LB $0.875 | $26,250.00
9 Glass Beads, 2,000 pounds per sack i SACK No Bid No Bid | X
10 Glass Beads, FP-96 Typé 1Il, 2,000 pounds per sack ) : SACK No Bid No Bid ' X
11 = |Glass Beads, VisiUltra, 2,000 pounds per sack SACK No Bid | No. Bid X
12 Glass Beads, Utah Blend, 2,000 f)ounds per sack SACK No Bid A No Bid : X
13 Jet Dry Water Base Blue Traffic Paint ;I'raffic Marking Corﬁpound, S Gallon Can, Fast 20 CAN $73.75 . $1,475.00

Dry
14 let Dry Water Base Black Traffic Paint Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast 20 CAN $68.75 $1,375.00

Dry .
15 TOM Yellow Reflectors 4" Y-2 WZ, 500 Per Box BX No Bid No Bid | X
16 TOM White Reflectors 4" W-1 WZ, 500 Per Box. BX No Bid | No Bid X

,\\§_ 17 » Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, Yellow, 250 Gallon Tote 50 ) TOTE $3,187.50 [$159,375.00
18 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 250 Gallon Tote 50 TOTE ‘$3,312.50 $165,625.00
Introduced-on: Amust_s_zozs,',

g?f?pted Qles_-FLll_\l'N!Ell@ REA2ONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial fgesolutiant 202800498 SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Page 6



Res-Pg:k.4-7
[CROWN USA INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments
Measure AR.O.:

Jet Dry Water Base White Trafﬂ; Marking Compound, S Gallon Can, Fast Dry $70.00 '$1,4Q0.00 10-15 Days Crown USA

2 Jet Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast Dry 20 CAN | $68.25 | $1,365.00 |10-15 Days Crown USA

3 Jet Dry Water Base White Traffic Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tobte, Fast Dry 15 TOTE $3,050.00 | $45,750.00 | 10-15 Days ~ {Crown USA

p ;
\/ 4 Jet Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry 15 TOTE $2,925.00 | $43,875.00 |10-15 Days Crown USA

5 White Granulated Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound 50,060~ LB $0.745 $37,250.00 |10-15 Days Crown USA

6 Yellow Granulated Thermoplastic Striping Mater‘lal, Per Pound 10,000 LB $0.695 $6,950.00 |10-15 Days Crown USA ,

7 White Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound LB No Bid . No Bid - X

8 Yellow Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound LB - No Bid No Bid X

9 Glass Beads, 2,000 pounds per sack o 20 SACK | $1,300.00 $26;OO0.00 10-15 Days

10 Glass Beads, F.P—96 Type NI, 2,000 pounds per sack T SACK No Bid No Bid . X

11 Glass Beads, VisiUltra, 2,000 pounds per sack o SACK . No Bid No Bid X

12 Glass Beads, Utah Blend, 2,000 pounds per sack ' SACK No Bid No Bid X

13 Jet Dry Water Base Blue Traffic Paint Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast 20 CAN $67.75 $1,355.00 |10-15 Days Crown USA
Dry )

14 Jet Dry Water I;ase Black Traffic Paint Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast 20 CAN $63.56 $1,270.00 |10-15 Days Crown USA
Dry

15 TOM Yellow Reflectors 4" Y-2 WZ, S00 Per Box - BX No Bid No Bid ’ | X

16 TOM White Reflectors 4" W-1 WZ, 500 Per Box ©OBX ‘ No Bid No Bid ' X

17 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, Yellow, 250 Gallon Tote ° ' TOTE No Bid No Bid X

18 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 250 Gallon Tofe » - TOTE No Bid No Bid X

Introducled Attt 62095 : : : : .

Adopted@ROWN USAINOERESEBEISE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Besohifinni 2RARAANOS SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Page 6



Res-Pg:k.4-8
[LBS ENTERPRISES, LLC DBA ALLSTATES COATINGS COMPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

PRICE TABLES
TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Line Iltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments
Measure A.R.O.:

.\& 1 Jet Dry Water Base White Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast Dry ' 20 CAN $63.50 $1,270.00 |{14-30days

'\\l 2 let Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast Dry 20 CAN $64.25 $1,285.00 14;30 days

\\} 3 Jet Dry Water Base White Traffic Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry 15 TOTE $2,997.50 | $44,962.50 |14-30 days
4 Jet Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry 15 TOTE $3,020.00 | $45,300.00 |14-30days
5 White Granulated Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound LB No Bid No Bid X NO 8ID
6 Yellow Granulated Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound - LB No Bid No Bid X NO BID
7 White Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound L8 No Bid No Bid X NO BID
8 Yellow Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound LB No Bid No Bid X NO BID
9 Glass Beads, 2,000 pounds per sack . SACK No Bid - No Bid } X NOBID
10 Glass Beads, FP-96 Type Ill, 2,000 pounds per sack o SACK No Bid No Bid X NO BID
11 Glass Beads, VisiUltra, 2,000 pounds per sack SACK No Bid No Bid X NOBID
12 Glass Beads, Utah Blend, 2,000 pounds per sack SACK No 8id No Bid X NO BID

!‘ 13 Jet Dry Water Base Blue Traffic Paint Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast - 20 CAN $67.00 $1,340.00 |14-30days
™ Dry :
- .
'\\x 14 let Dry Water Base Black Traffic Paint Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast 20 . CAN " $61.50 $1,230.00 |14-30days
Dry
15 TOM Yellow Reflectors 4" Y-2 WZ, 500 Per Box : ’ . BX No Bid No Bid X NOBID
I 16 TOM White Reflectors 4" W-1 WZ, 500 Per Box BX No Bid No Bid X NO BID
Introduded on: August 6, 2025 :
Adopled ofy | BC20BA ALLSTATES COATINGS COMPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official esoFutlo
’ TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Page 6



Res-Pg:k.4-9

[LBS ENTERPRISES, LLC DBA ALLSTATES COATINGS COMPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Line [tem Description ’ Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments
Measure AR.O.:

17 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, Yellow, 250 Galldn Tote 50 TOTE $3,225.00 |$161,250.00 | 14-30 days
\/ 18 Watel"borne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 250 Gallon Tote 50 TOTE $3,200.00 {5$160,000.00|14-30 days
\_/ 19 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, Yellow, 5 Gallon Pait S50 PAIL $67.50 $3,375.00 |14-30days
20 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 5 Gallon Pail 50 PAIL $67.00 $3,350.00 }14-30days
21 Waterborne Paint Drying Agent, Visilok, Per Pound LB No Bid No Bid X NO BID
" Introduced on: August 6, 2025

g?f?g;fﬁggglmm%ﬂﬁ@%h ALLSTATES COATINGS COMPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS
Page 7



Res-Pg:k.4-10
[NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT |

Bid No: TBD
TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

11. Submission of B|d Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

" TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS
Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments
Measure AR.O.:
Jet Dry Water Base White Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast Dry 20 $68.75 $1,375.00
2 Jet Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast Dry 20 CAN $69.06 $1,381.20
3 Jet Dry Water Base White Traffic Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry 15 TOTE .$3,328.13 $49,921.95
4 - |Jet Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry 15 TOTE $3,343.75 | $50,156.25
5(/ 5 White Gra‘nulated Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound ) 50,000 LB $0.66 $33,000.00
1',/ 6 Yellow Granulated Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound 10,000 - LB $0.67 $6,700.00
T 7 White Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound : 100,000 (8 $0.86 $86,000.00
1% . .
l// 8 Yellow Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound ) 30,000 8 - $0.86 $25,v8>00.00
9 Glass Beads, 2,000 pounds per sack “ 20 SACK $1,300.00 { $26,000.00
10 Glass Beads, FP-96 Type Ili, 2,000 pounds per sack 20 SACK $1,951.81 | $39,036.20
Introduced on: August 6, 2025 -
Adopte

o BRTIANAL R AL FRODUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS
Page 6



[NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Res-Pg:k.4-11

Line Iltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments
Measure AR.O.:
\ 11 Glass Beads, VisiUltra, 2,000 pounds per sack : 10 ~ SACK $1,951.81 | $19,518.10
12 Glass Beads, Utah Blend, 2,000 pounds per sack _ 50 SACK $1,807.23 $90,361.50
13 Jet Dry Water Base Blue Traffic Paint Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast .20 CAN $69.69 $1,393.80
Dry . . - . .
14 Jet Dry Water Base Black Traffic Paint Traffic Markmg Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast 20 "CAN $68.75 $1,375.00
Dry
/ B
\/ 15 TOM Yellow Reflectors 4" Y-2 WZ, 500 Per Box : .20 BX $280.00 $5,600.00
\/ 16 TO.M White Reflectors 4" W-1 WZ, 500 Per Box 10 BX $280.00 $2,800.00
17 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, Yellow, 250 Gallon Tote 50 TOTE $3,539.16 |$176,958.00
18 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 250 Gallon Tote 50 TOTE $3,313.25 |$165,662.50
19 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, Yellow, 5 Gallon Pail 50 PAIL $75.00 $3,750.00
20 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 5 Gallon Pail s 50 PAIL $70.31 $3,515.50
21 Waterborne Paint Drying Agent, Visilok, Per Pound . 44,000 LB $3.59 $157,960.00
Introduced on: August 6, 2025 :
o
Official esol |on DUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

- TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS
Page 7



-

, Res-Pg:k.4-12
[POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD - '
TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments

Measure A.R.O.:

Jet Dry Water Base White Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast Dry NoBid | NoBid
2 let Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast Dry CAN No Bid No Bid X
3 Jet Dry Water Base White Traffic Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry TOTE No Bid No Bid X
4 Jet Dry Water Base Yellow Traffic'Marking Compound, 250 Gallon Tote, Fast Dry - " TOTE | NoBid No Bid X
S White Granulz;ted Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound L8 No Bid No Bid. ) . X
6 Yellow Granulated Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound LB No Bid No Bid X
7 White Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound LB No Bid No Bid . X
8 / Yellow Pelletized Thermoplastic Striping Material, Per Pound ‘ LB No Bid ‘No Bid X
\f 9 Glass Beads, 2,000 pounds per sack ‘ ) 20 SACK . $928.00 | $18,560.00
\/ 10 Glass Beads, FP-96 Type I, 2,000 po;Jnds per sack _ 20 SACK $1,608.00 | $32,160.00
11 (;‘;Iass Beads, VisiU.Itra, 2,000 pounds per sack_ . 10 . SACK $15,400.00 |$154,000.00
\/ 12 Glass Beads, Utah Blend, 2,000 pounds per sack A 50 SACK $1,548.00 | $77,400.00
13 let Dry Water Base Blue Traffic Paint Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast- : CAN No Bid No Bid X
Dry . ;
14 et Dry Water Base Black Traffic Paint Traffic Marking Compound, 5 Gallon Can, Fast . CAN "No Bid v No Bid ) X
o | |
15 TOM Yellow Reflectors 4" Y-2 WZ, 500 Per Box | . ' BX No Bid No Bid X
16 TOM White Reflectors 4" W-1 WZ, 500 Per Box " BX No Bid No Bid X
g 17 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, Yellow, 250 Gallon Tote ) TOTE No Bid No Bid X
Introduckd on: Augqust 6. 2025

Adopte H VA
offria EOTERSAN BEbB 155 LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Page 6



. Res-Pg:k.4-13
[POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD _

TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, No Bid Comments
Measure A.R.O.:
| Waterborne Acrylic Polymer 'High Build Paint, White, 250 Gallon Tote TOTE No Bid No Bid X
19 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, Yellow, 5 Gallon Pail PAIL No Bid No Bid X
20 Waterborne Acrylic Polymer High Build Paint, White, 5 Gallon Pail PAIL No Bid No Bid X
\M 21 Waterborne Paint Drying Agent, Visilok, Per Pound 44,000 LB $2.34 $102,960.00
Introduced on: August 6, 2025

g?f?g;?mgm%%% w@%ﬁgﬁ‘&%} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - TRAFFIC MARKING SUPPLIES AND GLASS BEADS
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