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Introduced on;:
Adopted on:
Official Resolu

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ONRES-TU-TTT. 1-2
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

NO. B&Q_@S ~1QQ

e ——

RESOLUTION

September 3, 2025

WHEREAS, on July 29, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS

EQUIPMENT for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder

Batteries Plus — 1071
255 Rt. 35, Suite #4
Eatontown, NJ 07724
732-440-4660

Eastern Warehouse Distributors LLC
355 S. Flowers Mill Road
Langhorne, PA 19047

(267) 515-1304

KC Distributors LLC
290 Hillcrest Avenue
Woodridge, NJ 07075
(201) 707-0563

Name and Address of Bidder

Tri-State Battery & Alternator
4 Westec Drive

Auburn, MA 01501

(508) 258-4557

Electro Battery Systems Incorporated
230 West Parkway, Unit 3

Pompton Plains, NJ 07444

(973) 835-3334

Van Wickle Auto Supply
201 Highway 71
Spring Lake Heights, NJ 07762
(732) 449-0100
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing

Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely that of, BATTERIES PLUS-1071 and TRI-STATE
BATTERY & ALTERNATOR be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Batteries for Various Equipment for the
County of Ocean, for the contract term of one (1) year, beginning October 1, 2025 through
September 30, 2026, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County
reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. BATTERIES PLUS — 1071 for eleven (11) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39 and 40.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section II (Item Nos. 30 - 40) of $8,110.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

September 3, 2025
September 3, 2025
ion#: 2025001275




Res-Pg:m.1-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 SEPTEMBER 3, 2025

B. TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR for thirty-four (34) items, to

wit:

ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24,
25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 41, 42, 43, 44 and 45.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section I (Item Nos. 1-29) of $88,267.25.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section III (Item Nos. 41-43) of $10,365.00.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section IV (Item Nos. 44 and 45) of $35,750.00.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the materials and services to be acquired by these contracts
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital
accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Election Board,
Vehicle Services, Solid Waste Management, Transportation Department and Parks

Department.

4. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-122.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Election Board, Vehicle Services, Solid Waste Management, Transportation Department and

Parks Department and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: September 3, 2025
Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolutipn#: 2025001275
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[BATTERIES PLUS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid  Comments
Measure

20 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 75 As Specified 10 EA $75.00 $750.00

21 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 75/86 (Dual 5 EA $75.00 $375.00
Terminal) As Specified ' ’ :

22 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 78 As Specified 15 EA | $80.00 | $1,200.00

23 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 94R As Specified 20 EA $149.00 | $2,980.00

24 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 96R As Specified 45 EA $110.00 | $4,950.00

25 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: AGM48 As Specified 35 EA $160.00 | $5,600.00

26 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: AGM 94R-850 As 30 EA .| $186.00 | $5,580.00
Specified

27 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: H7 AGM As 5 EA $160.00 $800.00
Specified ’

28 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 91, Amp Hour: 240 5 EA $90.00 $450.00
AH, 700 CCA, Cranking Amperage: 860 A, Manufacturer Part Number: 691MF, As
Specified

29 Trade-In Allowance for Section | (DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be 750 EA $1.00 $750.00
the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST _be included in
the price of the battery. :

TOTAL ) $94,783.10

SECTION Il - SPECIALTY BATTERIES

Line ftem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid  Comments
Measure

Auxiliary Battery BCl Group Number: 400 Amp Hour: 12AH, 200 CCA, Cranking Amperage:
250 A, Manufacturer Part Number: AUX14, As Specified

$215.00

Introduced on: September 3, 2025
g?ft?ptt: B’R'-I'IFERIES FBepsmbsP®REESDOCUMENT REPORT
icial Besolyiat rtP2 38K ARIOUS EQUIPMENT
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[BATTERIES PLUS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD , ‘
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:m.1-5

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid  Comments
Measure
Golf Cart Batteries BCl Group Number: 570 MF As Specified . 20 EA $60.00 $1,200.00
V-/ 32 Goif Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: GC12 As Specified 5 EA $237.00 | $1,185.00
M/ 33 Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: GC8 As Specified . 5 EA $174.00 $870.00
\‘/ 34 Golf Cart Batteries BCl Group Number: GC2 As Specified . 10 EA $135.00 | $1,350.00
\‘/ 35 Lawn Mower Batteries BCI Group Number: 36 As Specified 10 EA $60.00 $600.00
3
V/ 36 Lawn Mower Batteries BC! Group Number: 55 As Specified : 5 EA $40.00 $200.00
v/ 37 Lawn Mower Batteries BCl Group Number: U1L As Specified 20 EA $36.00 $720.00
\‘/ 38 | Military Batteries BCl Group Number: 6TL As Specified 5 EA $290.00 | $1,450.00
v/ 39 Tractor Battery BCl Group Number: 70 As Specified 3 EA $60.00 $300.00
40 Trade-In Allowance for Section |l (DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be 20 EA $1.00 $20.00
\«/ the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in
the price of the battery.
TOTAL $8,110.00

SECTION Iif - DEEP CYCLE BATTERIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid  Comments
) Measure
41 Deep Cycle Batteries BCl Group Number: 24 As Specified 35 EA $100.00 | $3,500.00
42 Deep Cycle Batteries BC Group Number: 31 As Specified 65 EA $225.00 |$14,625.00
43 Trade-In Allowance for Section 1}l (DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be 75 EA $1.00 $75.00
the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in
the price of the battery.
Introduced-en: September3;2026
Offiaal KSURIES. PAESsontoss
R TERIES. PR R RPEPENSEDOCUMENT REPORT

Official

Bid - BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT
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BATTERIES PLUS 1071 - SECTION Il SCOPE OF WORK B2025-122
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS FQUIPMENT - SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION Hgk Res-Pg:m.1-6
SECTION 1L = SPECIALTY BATTERIES

Page 1 ol 2

PEE ML 7»0 — Golf Cuart Batteries

Vhmmum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA ) 5257 (CA) 665
WVoltage: 12 LI 70

BCT Group Number: 570 MF . ot
“Battery Warrany Month ot Service: 23 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @; §° of the battery being proposed: Click or tap here to enter text. 540
Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enfer text,. Y0 awm

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost; Click or tap hicre to entey reat. LY mordhg
Vianufacturer and Brand Name:; Clickor tap here to enter text. Do cac e \
Product Code Number: SHek or tap here to enfer text. §y Y70

FEEM # 31 =~ Golf Cart Batterics

\‘J“IU_JCI 12 SLI UC \\lV ’EL P-i
BCT Group Number: GC12

Battery Svarranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text, \50 AN

Wureanty Period for 100% tuil Replacenient @ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here to enter fext, \ L rmortlg
Visnufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap bere to enter text. Yo mee ™\

Preduct Code Number: Slick or tap here to enter fext. LT (C \WV - ELCT

FTENV 4 32 - Golf Cart Batterics

Valkage: 8 | C sl1 6§
BCT Giroup Number: GCS

Batery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text. 165 a\

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here to enfer fext. VL T\D'_"\L)‘-

Vianufacturer and Brand Name: Clich or tap here to enter text, mfo\(_(\\

Product Code Number: Slek or tap here to enter text. s LT (J’(, %

1TEM r# 33 - Golf Cart Batteries

Valtage: 6 ' SLT GC O

BCT Group Number: G2

Battory Warranty Month of Serviee, 24 Months
RL'\'cr\'c ('upacitv' Click or tap here to enter fext. L\§ aw

Woarranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @; No Additional Cost:
Click or tap here to enter text, b_, rw_&\\

Click or tap here to enter text. \'L otk

Vianufacturer and Brand Nuame:
Product Code Numbey: CHick ot tap here to enter text. 'S (L |y 0

Introduced on: September 3, 2025
Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275



BATTER1ES BATTERIES BLUY40; llmsﬁFH%!'éSQEE Q- WORK Page 2 01’282025;22 Parm.1-7
SECTION 11 - SPECIALTY BATTERIES Bl
ITEM # 34 — Lawn Mower Batteries
Minimum Cold Crinking Amps (CCAY: 200
Voltage: 12 SLTUAA
BCI Group Number; U1L
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ (1° of the battery being proposed: Click or tap here 1o entertext. . 50

Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here i enter text. 10 aw

W arranty Period for 100% Full Replacement ‘@ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here 1o enter text. © mondig
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here 1o enter text. Doca o N\

Product Code Number: € ek o fap here 1o enter text. §y T A A

ITEN # 35 — Military Batteries

Minimum Cold Cianking Amps (CCAE T80

Voltage: 12 SLYeTL
- BCT Group: 611

Battery Warrunty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CC Ay @@ 0° of the battery being proposed: Click or tap here to enter text. 790

Reserve Cupacity: Llick or tap tiere to enter text. \ L0 al

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replucement i@ No Additional Cost; Click or tap here to coter tea, 6 mently
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text. Dy eract W\

Product Code Number: Click vz fap bere fo enter text. LY. T L

ITEM #236 = Auxiliary_Batteries

Minimum Cold ('uml(zn;_-. Vmps OO0 200 »

Voltage: 12 S LT L{OD A(I/\!\_ A\)\L

Reserse Capacity: I8

BCT Croup: 400

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Culd Cranking Amps (CCA) . 0° of the battery being proposed: Click or tap here to enter text. 200

Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text. L O \r (PR .
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cast; Clck or tap here to enter text. 36 MYt g
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text. D¢ a ce \\

Praduct Code Number: Clich or tap here fo enter text. < LT HOQ NG M - Auy

Introduced on: September 3, 2025
Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275
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[TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid.No. TBD
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

SCOPE_OF_WORK_—__SECTION_IlI_-_DEEP__CYCLE_-_BATTERIES_F‘OR_VARIOUS_EQUIPMENT_—_2025_(2).docx
Please Note: Responses to this question may be publicly displayed after the due date has passed.

12. ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTATION .
Please add any additional documentation you wish to be considered here.
Core_Deduction_quinity_discrepancy.docx
-13. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*
'Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid

package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

14. Submission of Bid Package*
By submlttmg a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all requ1red documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO'NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting @ manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed ,

“PRICE TABLES
SECTION | - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES

line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid  Comments

Measure
Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 4D As Specified $158.00 | $3,160.00

Introduc d-on:
Adopte

Official RERREAHE: BﬁggBYZ&Q;ALTERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Page 6
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[TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ' ’
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:m.1-9

Line Item

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Comments

/ 2 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 8D, Minimum CCA 25 EA $174.00 | $4,350.00
Ay 1100, As Specified

/ 3 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 8D, Minimum CCA 20 EA $204.00 | $4,080.00
M 1400, As Specified
v/ 4 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 24 As S.pecified 15 EA $96.00 $1,440.00
V/ 5 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BC Group‘ Number: 24F As Specified 10 EA $96.00 $960.0Q
v/ 6 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 26 As Specified 10 EA $83.00 $830.00
\‘/ 7 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 27 As Specified S EA $103.00 $515.00
\‘/ 8 Automotivé and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCIlGroup Number: 27F As Specified 5 EA $103.00 $515.00
\// 9 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 30H As Specified 5 EA $120.00 $600.00
\// 10 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 31 As Specified 150 EA " $100.00 |$15,000.00
v/ 11 Automptive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 31P As Specified 40 EA - $100.00 | $4,000.00
\,/ 12 Automotive and Heavy Duty 'Equipme'nt Batteries BCI}Group Number: 34 As Specified 34 EA $107.00 $3,538.00
\’/ 13 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 41 As Specified s EA $40.00 $200.00
\,/ . 14 Automnotive and Heévy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number? 47 As Specified 25 EA $112.00 | $2,800.00
\’/ 15 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 48 As Specified ) EA $118.00 $590.00
M/, 16 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 49 As Specified 15 EA $138.00 $2,070:00
\_‘/ 17 Automotive and Heaw Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group &umber: 58 As Specified 10 EA $78.00 $780.00
b// 18 Automotive and Heavy 'Duty Equipment Batteries Bél Group Number: 58R As Specified 30 EA $88.00 $2,é40.00
\/// 19 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 65 As Specified 275 EA $110.00 |$30,250.00

Introducpd on: September 3, 2025
Adopte

e AT B AT  Beh L TERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT
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[TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:m.1-10

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost NoBid  Comments
Measure
Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BClI Group Number: 75 As Specified $97.00 $970.00
. /21 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BC! Group Number: 75/86 {Dual 5 EA $112.00 | $560.00
U Terminal} As Specified
.u/J 22 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 78 As Specified 15 EA $105.00 | $1,575.00
\,/ 23 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 94R As Specified 20 EA $145.00 | $2,900.00
V/ 24~ |Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 96R As Specified 45 EA $101.00 | $4,545.00
v/ 25 Automaotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: AGM48 As Specified 35 EA $159.99 | $5,599.65
/ 26 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: AGM 94R-850 As 30 EA $179.99 | $5,399.70
\ Specified
\// 27 Automotive and Heavy Duty Eqmpment Batteries BCl Group Number: H7 AGM As 5 EA- $179.99 $899.95
Speclf ed .
© 28 Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCl Group Number: 91, Amp Hour: 240 5 EA ‘ $179.99 $899.95
L/ AH, 700 CCA, Cranking Amperage: 860 A, Manufacturer Part Number: 691MF, As )
|Specified
/ 29 Trade-In Allowance for Section | (DEDUCT} As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be 750 EA -$18.00 -
Y the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in $13,500.00
the price of the battery.
TOTAL : _ . 1$88,267.25

SECTION Il - SPECIALTY BATTERIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost
Measure

Auxiliary Battery BCl Group Number: 400 Amp Hour: 12AH, 200 CCA, Cranking Amperage $103.00 $515.00
250 A, Manufacturer Part Number: AUX14, As Specified

No Bid

Comments B

Introduced-on: Scptcm'ucl 3; 2025

Adopted-on- Septembrer-3;2

Official RohltfolfB é,iﬁ\iﬁd\f.TERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT
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[TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '

Res-Pg:m.1-11

BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid  Comments
Measure
31 Golf Cart Batteries BCl Group Number: 570 MF As Specified 20 EA $86.00 | $1,720.00
32 Golf Cart Batteries BCl Group Number: GC12 As Specified 5 EA $210.00 | $1,050.00
33 Golf Cart Batteries BClI Group Number: GC8 As Specified 5 EA $158.00 »$790.00
34 Golf Cart Batteries BCl Group Number: GC2 As Specified 10 £A $148.00 | $1,480.00
35 Lawn Mower Batteries 8Cl Group Number: 36 As Specified 10 EA $104.00 | $1,040.00
36 Lawn Mower Batteries BCl Group Number: 55 As Specified : . .5 EA $120.00 $600.00
37 Lawn Mower Batteries BCI Grbup Number: U1L As Specified 20 EA $47.00 $940.00
38 Military Batteries BCl Group Number: 6TL As Specified 5 EA $210.00 | $1,050.00
39 Tractor Battery BClI Group Number: 70 As Specified S EA $40.00 $200.00
40 Trade-In Allowance for Section Il {DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be 20 EA -$18.00 | -$360.00
the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in
the price of the battery.
TOTAL $9,025_.00

SECTION 111 - DEEP CYCLE BATTERIES

Line Item Description Quantity

Unit of

Unit Cost

Tota! Cost

No Bid  Comments

Measure
\// 41 Deep Cycle Batteries BCI Group Number: 24 As Specified - 35 EA $97.00 | $3,395.00
z
\// 42 Deep Cycle Batteries BCl Group Number: 31 As Specified ’ ’ 65 EA $128.00 | $8,320.00
/_43 Trade-In Allowance for Section ltl {DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be 75 EA -$18.00 |-$1,350.00
v the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in
the price of the battery.

Introduced on: September 3, 2025
Adoptcd ol mber 3,

Official REBITAHE:BAOREOBY286AL TERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT
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Introduced on: September 3,-2025
Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275



Res-Pg:m.1-13
[TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid  Comments

Measure

TOTAL ‘ ' - , $10,365.00

SECTION IV - VOTING MACHINE BATTERIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid Comments
Measure
Voting Machine Batteries As Specified (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) $39,000.00
45 Trade-In Allowance for Section IV {DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be 650 EA -$5.00 {-$3,250.00
U the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in

the price of the battery.

TOTAL . $35,750.00
Introduced on: September 3, 2025

Adoptct"run. September 3, 2025~
Official ﬁBBbﬁIﬁﬁﬁ;BngﬁB’{z%ALTERNATOR LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT
Page 10



TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION | SCOPE OF WORK B2025-122
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I Res'ngﬁ'g‘é11'3#7

SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES

ITEM #1 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1000

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 4D

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: Click or tag here to enter text.
Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text.

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here to enter text.
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text.

Product Code Number: Click or tap here to enter text.

ITEM # 2 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1100

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 8D '

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: Click or tap here to enter text.
Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text.

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Addltlonal Cost: Click or tap here to enter text.
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text.

Product Code Number: Click or tap here to enter text.

ITEM # 3 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1400

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 8D

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: Click or tap here to enter text.
Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text.

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here to enter text.
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text.

Product Code Number: Click or tap here to enter text.

ITEM # 4 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 24 -

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: Click or tag here to enter text.

Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text.
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here to enter text.

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text.

Product Code Number: Cllck or tap here to enter text.
Introduced on: September 3,

Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275




TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION | SCOPE OF WORK B2025-122
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I Res-Pgim.1-16,
SECTION I — AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT’D)

ITEM # 5 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batternes
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 24F

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: Click or tap here to enter text.
Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text.

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost Cllck or tap here to enter text.
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text. '
Product Code Number: Click or tap here to enter text.

ITEM # 6 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batterles
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 540

Voltage: 12 :

BCI Group Number: 26

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed Cllck or tap here to enter text.
Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text. ~
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here to enter text.
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text. :
Product Code Number: Click or tap here to enter text.

ITEM # 7 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 710

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 27

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery béing proposed: Click or tap here to enter text.

Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text.

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here to enter text.
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text.

Product Code Number: Click or tap here to enter text.

ITEM # 8 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 710

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 27F

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: Click or tap here to enter text.
Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text.

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: Click or tap here to enter text.
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Click or tap here to enter text.

Product Code Number: Click or tap here to enter text.

Introduced on: September 3, 2025
- Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275



TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION | SCOPE OF WORK
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I

SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES

ITEM # 1 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1000

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 4D

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposedi 1050
Reserve Capacity: 290

- Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 Months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Easrpenn/ Maxpower-D
Product Code Number: 904D

ITEM # 2 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1100

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 8D

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 1100
Reserve Capacity: 320

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 momnths

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 908D

"ITEM # 3 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1400
Voltage: 12.
BCI Group Number: 8D
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 1400
Reserve Capacity: 400

. Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: XHSD

ITEM # 4 - Automotive and Heavy Dugx Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650

Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 24
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 750
Reserve Capacity: 160
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

hrofuct Gode Number: 624,

Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275
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TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION | SCOPE OF WORK
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I
SECTIONI - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT’D)

ITEM # 5 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 24F

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 750

Reserve Capacity: 160

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/ultrapower

Product Code Number: 624F

ITEM # 6 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 540

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 26

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery bemg proposed: 550

Reserve Capacity: 80

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: 526

ITEM # 7 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Crankmg Amps (CCA): 710

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 27

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

- Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed 750

Reserve Capacity: 120 -

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower :

Product Code Number: 527 ‘

ITEM # 8 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 710

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 27F

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 750
Reserve Capacity: 120
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 527F
Introduced on: September 3, 2025

Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275
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TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION | SCOPE OF WORK
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I
SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT’D)

ITEM # 9 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 3OH

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 760

Reserve Capacity: 170

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Eastpenn/Maxpower-D

Product Code Number: 1030H

ITEM # 10 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) 950

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 31

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery bemg proposed: 950
Reserve Capaclty 190

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 9318

ITEM # 11 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 950

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 31P

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battei'y being proposed: 950
Reserve Capacity: 190

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 931P '

ITEM # 12 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries -
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 800

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 34

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed 800

Reserve Capacity: 120
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

ARSRIRLECode RTFAMT ke

Official Resolution#: 2025001275
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TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION | SCOPE OF WORK
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I
SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT’D)

- ITEM #13 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650 .

Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 41
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 650
Reserve Capacity: 105

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 541

ITEM # 14 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 600

Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 47
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 600
Reserve Capacity: 100

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 547

ITEM # 15 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 680

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 48

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 680

Reserve Capacity: 120

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: 548

ITEM # 16 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 900

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 49

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed 900 .
Reserve Capacity: 140
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Addltlonal Cost: 12 months
;%’(a uf facturer §n §§me Sebang/ Ultrapower

2’30 de Numh s:r 354825 : :

Official Resolution#: 2025001275
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TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION | SCOPE OF WORK
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I

SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT’D)

ITEM # 17 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 500

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 58

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed 540
Reserve Capacity: 80

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: sebang/Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 558

ITEM # 18 - ' Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) 580

Voltage: 12
- BCI Group Number: 58R
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 580
Reserve Capacity: 80 |
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/ Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 558R

ITEM # 19 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 850

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 65

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

- Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery bemg proposed: 850
Reserve Capacity: 135
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower
Product Code Number: 665

ITEM # 20 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batterle
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650

Voltage: 12

'BCI Group Number: 75

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 690

Reserve Capacity: 100

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: 675
Introduced on; September 3, 2025
Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275
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TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECT ION | SCOPE OF WORK B2025-122
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I Res-P@age.4 27

SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT’D) #

ITEM # 21 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 525

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 75/86 (Dual Termmal)

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 650
Reserve Capacity: 90

‘Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Addltlonal Cost: Click or tap here to enter text,
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Eastpenn/Maxpower-D

Product Code Number: 675DT

ITEM # 22 — Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 690 / (CA) 820

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 78

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 770
Reserve Capacity: 120

"~ Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: 678

ITEM # 23 — Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA):765

Cranking Amp: 910

Voltage: 12 '

BCI Group Number 94R

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 780

Reserve Capacity: 160 '
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: 594R

ITEM # 24 — Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) 590

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 96R

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 620

Reserve Capacity: 95 :
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

WSS Code RITTREST8

Official Resolution#: 2025001275



TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION |1 SCOPE OF WORK
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT- SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION I
SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT’D)

ITEM # 25 — Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 760 '
Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: AGM48

. Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 760

Reserve Capacity: 70

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: CA48

ITEM # 26 — Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 850

Voltage: 12

Reserve Capacity: 150

BCI Group Number: AGM94R

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 850

Reserve Capacity: 80 '

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: CA94R

ITEM # 27 — Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 800

Voltage: 12

Reserve Capacity: 140

BCI Group Number: H7 AGM

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 850

Reserve Capacity: 80 '

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
‘ Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: CA94R

ITEM # 28 — Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries
Minimum Cold Crankmg Amps (CCA): 700

Voltage: 12

Reserve Capacity: 100

BCI Group Number: 91

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 700

Reserve Capacity: 100
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months

nYlanufagturer and RrapdName: Eastpenn/Maxpower-D

onredaet Code Negitiher? EMF
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TRI-STATE BATTERY & ALTERNATOR - SECTION [ll SCOPE OF WORK

BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT — SCOPE OF WORK — SECTION III
SECTION III — DEEP CYCLE BATTERIES

ITEM # 41 — Deep Cycle Batteries
Minimum Cold Cranking Amps: 400

Voltage 12
BCI Group Number 24 v
- Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 625
Reserve Capacity: 120 : '

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower

Product Code Number: Ev24

ITEM # 42 — Deep Cycle Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps: Minimum of 800
Voltage 12 '

BCI Group: 31 .
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 816

Reserve Capacity: 215 Reserve Capacity: must be over 200

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 Months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Sebang/Ultrapower :

Product Code Number: EV31

ITEM # 43 — Trade-In Allowance for Section III (DEDUCT)

B2025-122
Res-Pg:m.1-23
age 1 of 1

The Trade-In Allowance shall be the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST

be included in the price of the battery.

Introduced on: September 3, 2025
Adopted on: September 3, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001275



