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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly

Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

April 2, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES to Plastic

Express, Inc.; The Hungry Puppy Corp. and Ray Allen Manufacturin

g, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. No

bids were received for ltem Nos. 8, 32, 49, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 97, 98, 119, 120, 121, 122,
123, 124, 125, 126, 135 and 136. They will be rebid. Item No. 147 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors.

(B2025-45)
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michaite \. Guanor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on]
Adopted on:
Official Resolu

t

™
CONTRACT NO.MUST BEON ?
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

o D035~ 45

RESOLUTION
April 2, 2025

WHEREAS, on February 25, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES
for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following

bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Plastic Express, Inc. The Hungry Puppy Corp

667 Lehigh Avenue 1288 State Highway 33
Union, NJ 07083 Farmingdale, NJ 07727
(718) 499-1119 (732) 938-4470

Ray Allen Manufacturing, LLC
975 Ford St

Colorado Springs, CO 80915
(719) 380-0404

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely that of, PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC., THE HUNGRY
PUPPY CORP and RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING, LLC, be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of K9 Dog Food and Supplies, for the County
of Ocean, for the contract period from May 1, 2025 through April 30, 2026, or until delivery is
complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the
contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15. No bids were received for items 8, 32, 49, 82, 83, 84,
85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 97, 98, 119, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 135 and 136. All no

bid items will be rebid. Item No. 147 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors.

A. PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. for seven (7) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 14, 24, 25, 27, 34, 35 and 40.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

April 2, 2025
April 2, 2025

on#: 2025000415




Introduced on
Adopted on:
Official Resoly

t

~ Res-Pg:m.14-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 APRIL 2, 2025

B. THE HUNGRY PUPPY for forty (40) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 26, 28, 29,
30, 31, 33, 36, 38, 39, 41, 50, 64, 65, 116, 142, 143, 144, 146 and 147.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C.RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING, LLC for seventy-three (73) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 37, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 66,
67, 68, 69, 70,71, 72,73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79, 80, 81, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 99, 100, 101, 102,
103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113,114, 115, 117, 118, 127, 128, 129, 130,
131,132,133, 134, 137, 138, 139, 140 and 141.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the equipment and supplies to be acquired by this contract shall
be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with
the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the services shall be available within the following funding
Sources: Sheriff’s Office O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-45.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Sheriff’s Department and the successful bidders.

April 2, 2025
April 2, 2025
on#: 2025000415




: Res-Pg:m.14-4
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD : '

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

Grooming & Beds
37 Furminator, Long 20 EA $30.00 $600.00
/ Hair-M, Brush, As
\V Specified, or
Equal
38 Kuranda EA No Bid No Bid X
Orthopedic Dog ‘
Bed, 40 x 25,

Aluminum w/
Smoke Heavy-
Duty Vinyl, As
Specified, or
Equal

39 MidWest Quiet EA No Bid No Bid X
Time Ombre Swirl d

Gray Pet Bed,
40in x 27in, As
Specified, or
Equal

40 Bags on Board 1 PKG No Bid No Bid X
Refill Rolls, Blue,
15 Bags/Roll, 21
Rolls/Pkg., As
Specified, or
Equal

41 Ethical Products EA No Bid No Bid X
SPOT Grey
Snuggler Bones
Blanket, Size 40in
x 60in, As
Specified, or
Equal

o

Leashes; Collars & Muzzles’

Introduced-on: April 2 2025
AdoptedRAY ALLEN MipiN@FZ025URING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official RegolyontiG2RERIBPAND SUPPLIES
Page 12




: Res-Pg:m.14-5
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

42 ActiveDogs Form EA No Bid No Bid : X
Fitted Service Dog
Active Cut Vest,
Navy Blue, X-
Large, As
Specified, or
Equal

43 AS.AT. Lead, 20 10 "~ EA $25.00 $250.00
Lx1/2" W, As )
\// Specified, or

Equal

44 AS.AT. Lead, 25' 10 EA $32.00 $320.00

/ Lx 1/2" W, As

V1 Specified, or
Equal

45 ASAT. Lead, 6'L 20 EA $19.00 $380.00
/ X 3/4 W, with O-
Vi Ring, As Specified,
or Equat

46 AS.AT. Waist 20 EA $15.00 $300.00
/ Lead, 36'Lx 1/2" ’
V Wide, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-oni———April-2,2025 -
AdoptefRdriY ALLEN MANIEAGIBJRING LLC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official ggsoldiends 2BEAIMAD SUPPLIES
Page 13




, Res-Pg:m.14-6
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid Delivery AR.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

47 1.D. Collar, Black 20 EA $55.00 $1,100.00
2", with Metal
Cobra Buckle, to
include: Sheriff
Reflective I.D.

Ve Panel 8"x2" Black
\ Letters on Silver
Reflective panel,
Black 8"x2" Yellow
Letters with Black
Background, As
Specified, or
Equal

48 Cobra ID Collar 5 EA ' $58.00 $290.00
with Handle,
Black, As
V] ' Specified, or
Equal

49 Collar Badge EA No 8id No Bid X
Holder K98, As
Specified, or
Equal

50 Collar, Coastal Pet ’ EA No Bid No Bid X
Products, Coastal ’
Double Nylon,
20", Hunter, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 51 Dogtra 1900S 10 EA $230.00 $2,_300.00
v Handsfree E- -

Collar, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introd : it
Adoptem\f ALLEN mNLﬂf&ﬁﬂ-&lRlNG LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official RelsokBiowc FOWMID SUPPLIES
Page 14
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: Res-Pg:m.14-7
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD _ ’

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

52 Dogtra 1900X » 10 EA $145.00 $1,450.00

Additional
/ Receiver, As
Specified, or
1Equal

S3. Dogtra 1900X 1- 10 x EA $230.00 $2,300.00
/ Dog Unit 1" Full

Titanium Contact
Points, As

Specified, or
Equal

54 Dogtra 1900X 1- 10 EA $230.00 $2,300.00
. Dog Unit Titanium
/ "{Enhanced Contact
M Wings, As
Specified, or
Equal

55 Dogtra 1900X 2- 10 EA $355.00 $3,550.00 °
Dog Unit

/ Enhanced
\ Titanium Contact

Wings, As
Specified, or
Equal

Holster, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 56 Dogtra E-Collar 10 EA $35.00 $350.00

Collar, Ranger
Green, 16 inch, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 57 Dominant Dog 20 £A : $18.00 $360.00
\

Introduced-on:—— April 2,.2025
Adopted dAY ALLEN MpM@F202BURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official BrgolkYantc2P8IBPARD SUPPLIES
Page 15




[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.14-8

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost

58 Dominant Dog 20 EA $18.00 $360.00

Collar, Ranger : ‘
/ Green, 17 inch, As
Specified, or
Equal

No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

59 Dominant Dog 20 : EA $18.00 $360.00
/ Collar, Ranger

Green, 18 inch, As
Specified, or
Equal

Garmin 1.D. Collar
(specify color), As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 60 E-Lusive 2.0 5 . EA $85.00 $425.00

61 E-Collar, Mini &- 10 . ) EA $20.00 $200.00

Lusive, EL-1DC, As -
/ Specified, or
Equal

62 Garmin Pro 550 5 EA $390.00 $1,950.00
o / Electronic Collar,
\, As Specified, or

Equal

63 Garmin PT10 -5 EA - $140.00 $700.00
Additional )
-'\’ ’ Receiver GA1209,
As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-on: April 22025
Adopted [BRY ALLEN Afp#iN2JRAZH URING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rggplytionity 34258A844RD SUPPLIES

Page 16



Res-Pg:m.14-9
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD :
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

Harness, Coastal EA
Pet Products,
Coastal Sport
Wrap Adjustable,
Medium, Black, As
Specified, or
Equal

65 Harness, Coastal | EA No Bid No Bid X
Pet Products,
Coastal K9
Explorer
Reflective
Padded, 30" - 1",
Fern, As
Specified, or
Equal

66 Herm Sprenger 15 . EA $48.00 $720.00
Black Stainless
/ Pinch Collar

3.2mm, As
M Specified, or
Equal

67 Herm Sprenger 10 EA $77.00 $770.00

Neck-Tech Sport
/ Martingale

\ Stainless Steel

Collar, 24", As

Specified, or
Equal

68 Herm Sprenger S EA $88.00 $440.00
/ Neck-Tech, Black,

S/S Collar with

Cliclock Buckle
24", As Specified,
or Equal

Introdueed-er——April 22026
Adopted BAY ALLEN Mg DFA25URING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Begolutionti2PERIBPAND SUPPLIES
Page 17




Res-Pg:m.14-10

[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
KS DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

$780.00 -

Herm Sprenger
/ Stainless Steel

VI Pinch Collar, 3.2

MM, As Specified,

or Equal

70 Lead - Classic 20 EA $31.00 $620.00
/ Lead, 5 feet with
v 1inch Bolt, As

Specified, or
Equal

71 Lead - Extending 20 EA $37.00 $740.00
Lead, 26 feet,
Black, As
Specified, or
Equal

N

72 Lead - Nylon Lead, 20 EA $22.00 $440.00
15'Lx 1" W, As )
Specified, or
Equal

73 Lead - Nylon Lead, 20 EA $30.00 $600.00
33'Lx1"W, As
Specified, or
Equal

74 Lead - Tubular 20 EA $21.00 $420.00
Nylon Tracking ‘
Line, 15'x 1", As
Specified, or
Equal

75 Lead - Waist Lead T 20 EA $15.00 $300.00
w/ Ring, 36 inch,
W As Specified, or

: Equal

NN NN

Introdueed-on:

Adopted BAY ALLEN Wi GFABEURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RegolwonthRPZROLIAND SUPPLIES

Page 18



Res-Pg:m.14-11
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

76 Leash, Flex 20 EA $37.00 $740.00
Retractable, Large )

FL-80, As
Specified, or
Equal

77 Leash, Obedience, 25 EA $25.00 $625.00
with O-Ring, :

3221R, As
Specified, or
Equal

78 Leather Agitation 20 EA $60.00 - $1,200.00
’ Collar, Heavy
/ Duty, 2" wide with
24" Handle, As

Specified, or
Equal

79 Leather Collar, 5 EA $23.00 $115.00
Single Layer, 66-
11S-BLA, As
Specified, or
Equal

80 Leather Padded 20 EA $85.00 $1,700.00

/ Tracking Harness,
Ny Size will be '

Specified on
Purchase Order,
As Specified, or
Equal

Muzzle, German
\ Shepherd, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 81 Leather Police 10 EA $120.00 $1,200.00

Introduced-oni———April2, 2025
AdoptedAY ALLEN MpiidF262BURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official BrsolutiqnéG20879804ARD SUPPLIES
Page 19




A Res-Pg:m.14-12
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery AR.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

88 Modern icon EA No Bid 8 No Bid X
Patrol Harness
with ISC Klick-Lock
Buckles, As
Specified, or
Equal

89 Modern Icon ' EA No Bid No Bid X

Rapid :
Deployment Lead,
All Sizes, As
Specified, or
Equal

90 Modern Icon EA No Bid . NoBid X
Tracking Harness
with ISC Kfick-Lock
Buckles, As
Specified, or
Equal

91 Modern Icon EA No Bid No Bid X
Waist Lead, All
Sizes, As
Specified, or
Equal

. {Frame with Metal

Cobra Buckles, As
M Specified, or
Equal

93 Stainless Steel 10 EA $16.00 $160.00
Choke Collar, |
Black, 18", As
V

Specified, or
Equal

/ 92 Nomad Harness 10 EA $250.00 $2,500.00

Introdu :

ced-ep————Apri 22026
Adopted BAY ALLEN MpiNUF203EURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BagolutiqniG202F9BOARD SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:m.14-13
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Totat No Bid Delivery AR.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

94 Stainless Steel 10 . EA

Choke Collar,
/ _ Black, 20", As
M Specified, or
Equal

95 Stainless Steel 10 EA $78.00 $780.00
/ Pinch Collar,
\

$170.00

Black, 4.0mm, As
Specified, or
Equal

Collar Strap, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 96 Tactical Bungee E- 5 _ EA $22.00 $110.00
v

97 Tactical Bungee EA No Bid No Bid X
Leash Belt Holder,
Black, As
Specified, or
Equal

98 Tactical Bungee ’ EA No Bid No Bid - X
Leash, Black, As
Specified, or
Equal

99 Tactical Patrol 20 EA : $250.00 $5,000.00
Harness with :

/ Cobra Buckle,
N\ Black, As
Specified, or
Equal

_ |ALO225, As
Specified, or
£qual

/ 100 VIP IR Light 15 EA $170.00 $2,550.00

" Introd :

AdoptedfohY ALLEN MAMBFA6Z8IRING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Brgolutiandi3 30360004 SUPPLIES
Page 22




‘ ' Res-Pg:m.14-14
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD :

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

Training Alds

101 Belgian Bite Suite 5 EA $1,300.00 $6,500.00

/ - Full Bedy, As
\”

Specified, or
Equal

Bite Sleeve, Level
4, Jute Hard, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 102 Belgian Style Arm _ 10 EA $85.00 $850.00
\

103 Belgian Style Arm 10 EA $92.00 $920.00
Bite Sleeve, Level
/ 5, Jute Extra Hard,
As Specified, or
Equal

104 Belgian Style Leg 10 EA $105.00 . $1,050.00

Bite Sleeve, Level
/ 4, Jute Hard,
v Adult Dog, As

Specified, or
Equal

105 PCDA - Left Bicep 5 EA $65.00 $325.00

Adjustable
/ Gauntlet, As
\' Specified, or
Equal

106 PCDA - Right 5 EA $65.00 $325.00
Bicep Adjustable
Gauntlet, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-eni——April2,2026-
Adopted[BrtY ALLEN NpAiN2!/2885 URING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rygolutto ity 2425009448 D SUPPLIES
Page 23



_ Res-Pg:m.14-15
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Line Item Description Quantity Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

107 PCDA Left
Forearm
Adjustable
Gauntlet, As
Specified, or

Equal

$325.00

Forearm
Adjustable
Gauntlet, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 108 PCDA Right ' S EA $65.00 $325.00

109 Blast Hose 20 EA’ $14.00 $280.00
Reward Toy, 10", ’
As Specified, or
Equal

110 Canvas Narcotic 10 PACK $27.00 _5270.00
Bag, 4" x 5", (6)
Per Pack, As
Specified, or
Equal

111 Euro Ball with 20 EA . $10.00 $200.00

Rope and Handle, :
2.75", As
Specified, or
Equal

112 I-Clicker, Clicker ) 20 EA $7.00 $140.00

Training, As )
Specified, or
‘Equal

TSNS

Introdueed-er——April-2-2025
Adoptec{l&ﬁ?f ALLEN MMU,FMEURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official RegaldtiantsG2P2RIPPAND SUPPLIES
Page 24



Res-Pg:m.14-16
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

Kong, Large, $360.00

/ Black, with Rope
Handle, 4"H x 2-
M 3/4" W, As

Specified, or
Equal

114 Kong, Large, Red, 20 EA $18.00 $360.00
’ with Rope Handle,

\% 4"H x 2-3/4" W,
As Specified, or
Equal

115 Kong, X-Large, 20 EA $18.00 $360.00
/ Black, 5"H x 4 : : :

Vi 1/2" W, As
Specified, or
Equal

116 Kong, X-Large, 20 EA $18.00 $360.00
Red, 5"Hx 4 1/2"
W, As Specified,
or Equal

117 Syntek Tug 20 EA $17.00 $340.00
/ Handle, 2" x 12",

As Specified, or
Equal

118 Synthetic Bite Bar, 20 EA $90.00 $1,800.00
\’/ 2-handle, As

Specified, or
Equal

119 Synthetic Tug EA No Bid No Bid X
Handles, 24", (2) :
Handles, 6" Wide,
As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-on- April 2, 2025
AdoptefRé¥ ALLEN MWNLEERAOTSIRING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Fgsojdionts 2038649MIB SuPPLIES
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Res-Pg:m.14-17
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

127 NMFRAME-BLK: 20 EA $250.00 $5,000.00
Nomad Frame
Harness, As
Specified, or
Equal

128 HS5015324: Herm 20 EA $77.00 $1,540.00
Sprenger Neck
Tech Martingale
S/S Collar with
Swivel 24", As
Specified, or
Equal

129 DC1900SP - HF 20 EA $260.00 $5,200.00

Dogtra 19005 ;
Handsfree Plus
B&L, As Specified,
or Equal

130 DC1902SP-HF 20 EA $400.00 $8,000.00
Dogtra 1900S 2
Dog Handsfree, As
Specified, or
Equal

131 SRK-BB: SIRIUS 20 EA $75.00 $1,500.00
BREAKER BAR, As
Specified, or
Equal

132 CGSK-9DCHB: SK- 20 EA $35.00 $700.00
9 DOGTRA
HOLSTER - Black,
As Specified, or
Equal

NN~

Introdused-en-— April 2, 2025 . :
Adopted BAY ALLEN MpiN2F2025URING LLC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official BegelutiantG2PERIBPAND SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:m.14-18
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT :
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

tine item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

133 66-11S-BLA: 20 ) EA $23.00 $460.00
MILITARY SPEC
SINGLE LAYER
u COLLAR 22" -
Black, As
Specified, or
Equal

Pro 550 Remote
U Electronic Collar,
As Specified, or
Equal

/ 134 GAS550-Garmin 20 EA $390.00 $7,800.00

135 BWO0008024 Level EA No Bid No Bid X
4 intermediate
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

136 TOY0003017-M EA No Bid No Bid X
Squish Ball with
Strap - Medium,
As Specified, or
Equal

Cloth, Large, As
\ Specified, or .
Equal

/ 137 Narc Bags Duck 5 EA $27.00 $135.00

138 Nylon Adjustable 10 ‘ EA $20.00 $200.00

* / . Vet Muzzle, As

Specified, or .
Equal

Black, As
-|Specified, or
Equal

/ 139 Guardian Harness, 5 EA $100.00 $500.00

Introduced-eni——April2,2026
Adopted BAY ALLEN Mgl 3 F2025URING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Regolytion®2PEREPPAND SUPPLIES
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: Res-Pg:m.14-19
[RAY ALLEN MANUFACTURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Iltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments
140 30'x 1" Tubular 10 ' EA $25.00 $250.00°
Tracking Line, As )
\ Specified, or :
Equal
141 15'x 1" Tubular 15 - EA $20.00 $300.00
Tracking Line, As
. Specified, or '
Equal
142 Kong Core EA No Bid No Bid X

Strength Bamboo
Bone Dog Toy,
Large, As
Specified, or
Equal

143 Kong ChewsStix EA No Bid No Bid X
Stick Dog Toy,
Large, As
Specified, or
Equal

144 KONG Floppy EA No 8id No Bid X
Knots Hippo Dog .

Toy, As Specified,
or Equal

145 KONG Cozie Ultra EA No Bid No Bid X
Max Moose Plush
Dog Toy, As
Specified, or
Equal

146 Kong Wubba ; EA No Bid . No Bid X
Friends Dog Toy,
As Specified, or
Equal

Introdh\.cu o 202

AdoptedRAY ALLEN MMQFQ@EURING LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Brbolnt ¥ 30369004MD SUPPLIES
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, Res-Pg:m.14-20
[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

$155.09

$775.45 10-14 Business
Days

13 Royal Canin
German
Shepherd, Adult,
301b., As
Specified, or
Equal

14 Inception Pet 15 BAG $69.67 $1,045.05 10-14 Business

Foods - WhiteFish Days
/ ' Recipe 27 |b., As

Specified, or

Equal

15 Science Diet Adult 15 BAG ’ $114.20 $1,713.00 10-14 Business
Light Small Bites Days

Chicken Meal &
Barley Recipe Dry
Dog Food, 30 1b.,
As Specified, or
Equal

16 Science Diet Adult 15 BAG $114.20 $1,713.00 : 10-14 Business
Light Chicken - |Days

Meal & Barley
Recipe Dry Dog
Food, 30lb., As
Specified, or
Equal

17 Science Diet Adult 10 CASE $70.89 $708.90 - . 10-14 Business
Perfect Weight ) i Days

Hearty Vegetable :
& Chicken Stew
Wet Dog Food,
13-0z., Case of 12,
As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-on:

- AdoptelPASTIC EXPRESH2|62ERESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResoSiOWG FBHWMND SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:m.14-21
[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

tine ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

18 Science Diet, ) 10 CASE $59.05 $590.50 10-14 Business
Mature Adult : Days
Savory Stew with
Beef & Vegetables
Wet Dog Food,
13-o0z., Case of 12, «
As Specified, or
Equal

19 Science Diet Adult 10 CASE $67.68 $676.80 10-14 Business
Sensitive Stomach . Days

& Skin Tender
Turkey & Rice
Stew Wet Dog
Food, 13-0z., Case
of 12, As
Specified, or
Equal

20 Science Diet Adult 10 CASE $69.20 $692.00 10-14 Business
Sensitive Stomach : Days
& Skin Salmon &
Vegetable Entrée
Wet Dog Food 13-
oz, Case of 12, As
Specified, or
Equal

21 Science Diet Adult 24 BAG $118.43 $2,842.32 10-14 Business
Large Breed Lamb Days

Meal & Brown
Rice Recipe Dry
Dog Food, 33 |b.
Bag, As Specified,
or Equal

22 Milk Bone Biscuit 20 BAG $21.12 $422.40 : 10-14 Business
Treats, Large, 10 ’ Days

Ib., As Specified,
or Equal

Introducedon:

Adopted BkAS TIC EXPRESP2 b2k RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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. Res-Pg:m.14-22
[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

23 Milk Bone Biscuit BAG No Bid No Bid
Treats, Large, 4
Ib., As Specified,
or Equal

24 Benebone 20 . BAG $18.68 $373.60 . 10-14 Business
Wishbone, : Days
Jumbo-Bacon, ’
\/ Chicken or Peanut
Butter Chews, As
Specified, or

Equal

25 Blue Buffalo 15 PKG $7.02 $105.30 10-14 Business
Health Bars Dog Days 4
Biscuits Pumpkin

Vi & Cinnamon, 1 Ib. :

Pkg., As Specified,
or Equal

26 Blue Buffalo 15 PKG $21.14 $317.10 10‘.14 Business
Health Bars Dog A Days

Biscuits Apples &
Yogurt, 3.5 |b., As =
Specified, or

Equal
27 Blue Buffalo - 15 PKG $7.02 ‘ $105.30 10-14 Business
Health Bars Dog ' Days
\ Biscuits Banana &

Yogurt, 1 Ib. Pkg.,
As Specified, or
Equal

28 Greenies Regular 15 PKG $46.32 $694.80 10-14 Business
(for dogs 25-50 Days

|b.) Dental Treats,
360z, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introdueed-oni——APpril-2,2026 -
Adopted BLASTIC EXPR&5S2,1D28 RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD |
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.14-23

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid

No Bid

29 Large Tre.af Tote, EA No Bid X
As Specified, or

Equal

Delivery A.R.O.

Mrf./Packaging

Comments

No Bid

30 Rubber Feed 20 EA $21.56 $431.20
Bowl, 4 Quart, As '
Specified, or

Equal

10-14 Business.
Days

Fortex

31 "| Loving Pets Black EA No Bid No Bid X
Label Wooden
Woof Diner, 2
Quart, As
Specified, or

Equal

No Bid

32 Stainless Steel Flat EA No Bid No Bid X
: Side Pails, 6

Quart; 192 oz., As
Specified, or

Equal

No Bid

33 Stainless Steel No- 20 EA
Tip Feed Dish, 3
Quart, 96 0z., As
Specified, or
Equal

$35.09 $701.80

10-14 Business

- | Days

ProSelect

34 Stainless Steel 10 . EA $28.40

$284.00
/ Pails, 6 Quart, As '
Specified, or

10-14 Business
Days

ProSelect

.35 Vittles Vault, 50 5 BAG $52.16 $260.80

Ib., As Specified,
or Equal

Equal
N4

10-14 Business
Days

36 Vittles Vault, 60 5 ? BAG $77.31 $386.55
’ Ib., As Specified,

or Equal

10-14 Business
Days

Introducéedon:— ApFi2,2025—

Adopted BDASTIC EXPRESS, IM28 RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.14-24
[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost i Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

Grooming & Beds

37 Furminator, Long 20 EA $32.43 $648.60 10-14 Business
Hair-M, Brush, As Days
Specified, or
Equal

38 Kuranda v EA No Bid " NoBid X ‘ No Bid
Orthopedic Dog '
Bed, 40 x 25,
Aluminum w/
Smoke Heavy-
Duty Vinyl, As
Specified, or
Equal

39 MidWest Quiet EA No Bid No Bid X No 8id
Time Ombre Swirl
Gray Pet Bed,
40in x 27in, As
Specified, or
Equal

40 Bags on Board 15 PKG T 826.27 $394.05 10-14 Business
Refill Rolls, Blue, Days
15 Bags/Roll, 21

V Rolls/Pkg., As :

Specified, or
Equal

41 Ethical Products EA No Bid No Bid X No Bid

SPOT Grey :
Snuggler Bones
Blanket, Size 40in
X 60in, As
Specified, or
Equal

Leashe’s.,’{i"c"allla,rs &Muzzles -

Introduced-oni———April-2,2026
Adopted BhASTIC EXPRIrS, 12024 RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT 2

Official Regolydont; 2AZROGPAND SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:m.14-25
[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

Food, Bowls and Stdréﬁé '

1 Fromm 4-Star, 60 BAG $56.99 $3,419.40
WhiteFish Potato,

/ 261b., As
l, Specified, or

Equal

. 2 Purina Proplan 60 BAG $71.99 $4,319.40
Shred Chicken
/ ; and Rice, 35 Ib.,
’ As Specified, or
Equal

3 Purina Pro Plan 25 BAG $39.99 $999.75 **Bag size
Shred Chicken . . changed - now is

/ and Rice, 18 Ib., : 15b

As Specified, or ' '

Equal

4 ProPlan Sport 70 BAG $65.99 $4,619.30
Active, 26/16 All
\// Life Stages,
Chicken, 37.5 |b.,
: As Specified, or
Equal

S Fromm Gold 15 BAG : $49.99 $749.85
/ ) Adult, Chicken &

Barley, 30 1b., As
\/ Specified, or
Equal

6 Nutro Senior, 20 BAG $79.99 $1,599.80 There is no LARGE
/ Large Breed, breed Senior

v ' Lamb & Rice; 30 Lamb, only Senior
Ib., As Specified, Lamb

or Equal

Introduced-on:————April-2,2025.
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~ Res-Pg:m.14-26
{THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery AR.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

$1,199.85

Quantity

Purina ProPlan
Senior, Bright

/ Mind 7+, Chicken
v & Rice, 30 Ib., As
Specified, or
Equal

8 Kinetic Perform BAG No Bid No Bid X
Active 26k,
Chicken, 35 Ib., As
Specified, or
Equal

9 Hills Prescription 20 BAG $132.99 $2,659.80
/ Diet, d/d, Potato :

& Duck, 25 Ib., As
Specified, or
Equal

10 Hills Prescription 19 BAG $58.99 $1,120.81
/ Diet, d/d, Potato : -

& Duck, 8 Ib., As
Specified, or
Equal

11 Hill's Natural 10 BAG $5.99 $99.90

Flexi-Stix Beef
\// Jerky Treats Dog
Treats, 7.1 oz., As

Specified, or
Equal

/ 12 Nutro Adult, Large 15 BAG $74.99 $1,124.85
Breed, Chicken &

Rice, 30 1b., As
Specified, or
Equal

Introdueed-or———April-2,2026
Adopted Brif HUNGRXgHYBPXGBESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.14-27
[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description [6UELIY

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments
$549.95 '

Royal Canin $109.99

German

/ Shepherd, Adult,
301b, As

Specified, or

Equal

14 Inception Pet 15 BAG $69.99 $1,049.85
Foods - WhiteFish
Recipe 27 Ib., As
Specified, or
Equal

15 Science Diet Adult 15 BAG $80.99 $1,214.85
Light Small Bites ’
/ Chicken Meal &
M Barley Recipe Dry
Dog Food, 301b.,

As Specified, or
Equal

16 Science Diet Adult 15 BAG $80.99 $1,214.85
Light Chicken
/ | Meal & Barley
\,' Recipe Dry Dog
Food, 30lb., As

Specified, or
Equal

17 Science Diet Adult 10 CASE v $49.99 $499.90

Perfect Weight
Hearty Vegetable
\/ ) & Chicken Stew

Wet Dog Food,
13-0z., Case of 12,
As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-eni———April 2, 2025
Adopted[ditE HUNG RpRUBR6RRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.14-28

[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Iltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid

Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

18 Science Diet
Mature Adult
Savory Stew with
Beef & Vegetables
/ Wet Dog Food,
v 13-0z., Case of 12,
As Specified, or
Equal

CASE $40.99 $409.90

19 Science Diet Adult 10 " CASE . $48.99 $489.90
Sensitive Stomach '
& Skin Tender
Turkey & Rice
Stew Wet Dog
l/ Food, 13-0z., Case
of 12, As
Specified, or
Equal

20 Science Diet Adult 10 CASE $48.99 $489.90

Sensitive Stomach
& Skin Salmon &
\ Vegetable Entrée

Wet Dog Food 13-
oz, Case of 12, As
Specified, or
Equal

21 Science Diet Adult 24 BAG $83.99 $2,015.76
Large Breed Lamb
Meal & Brown

L Rice Recipe Dry

Dog Food, 33 |b.

Bag, As Specified,
or Equal

22 Milk Bone Biscuit 20 BAG i $19.99 $399.80
' Treats, Large, 10

Ui Ib., As Specified,
or Equal

Introduced-on-: Alr_\ril '), 2025
Adopted[dhiE HUNGRAURRIPRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Regolylippity RRIBIHRD SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:m.14-29
[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

23 Milk Bone Biscuit ] $279.80
/ Treats, Large, 4
\ Ib., As Specified,
or Equal
24 Benebone 20 BAG $19.99 $399.80 -
Wishbone,

Jumbo-Bacon,
Chicken or Peanut
Butter Chews, As
Specified, or
Equal

25 Blue Buffalo 15 PKG $9.98 $149.70
Health Bars Dog
Biscuits Pumpkin
& Cinnamon, 1 Ib.
Pkg., As Specified,
or Equal

26 Blue Buffalo 15 PKG $9.98 $149.70
Health Bars Dog '
: V/ Biscuits Apples &

: Yogurt, 3.5 Ib., As
Specified, or
Equal

27 Blue Buffalo 15 PKG $9.98 $149.70
Health Bars Dog
Biscuits Banana &
Yogurt, 11b. Pkg.,
As Specified, or
Equal

28 Greenies Regular 15 PKG $39.99 $599.85

(for dogs 25-50
/ Ib.) Dental Treats,
360z, As

Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-on: April 22025
AdoptelTétE HUNGRWABLIZZ 2PRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official fiesoludient 2039MD suppLIES

Page 10



[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.14-30

Line Item

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

/ 29

Description

Large Treat Tote,
As Specified, or
Equal ‘

Quantity

EA

$13.99

$69.95

No Bid Delivery A.R.O.

Mrf./Packaging Comments

W

Rubber Feed
Bowl, 4 Quart, As
Specified, or
Equal

20

EA

$6.99

$139.80

31

Loving Pets Black
Label Wooden
Woof Diner, 2
Quart, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

.$19.99

$99.95

32

Stainless Steel Flat
Side Pails, 6
Quart; 192 oz., As
Specified, or

Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

=

Stainless Steel No-
Tip Feed Dish, 3
Quart, 96 oz, As
Specified, or
Equal

20

EA

$14.99

$299.80

34

Stainless Steel
Pails, 6 Quart, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

35

Vittles Vault, 50
Ib., As Specified,
or Equal

BAG

$59.99

$299.95

/36

\Y

Introduce

Vittles Vault, 60
Ib., As Specified,
or Equal

BAG

$69.99

$349.95

Adopted[GhtE HUNGRYpPUBRERBESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rugalyter b F8LOWIAIND SUPPLIES
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Adopted biriE H

[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES -

Res-Pg:m.14-31

Line Item

Grodming:& Beds

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Delivery A.R.O.

Mrf./Packaging

Comments

37

Furminator, Long 20 EA $39.99
Hair-M, Brush, As
Specified, or
Equal

$799.80

38

Kuranda 10 EA $171.00

Orthopedic Dog
Bed, 40 x 25,
Aluminum w/
Smoke Heavy-
Duty Vinyl, As
Specified, or
Equal

$1,710.00

39

|| Specified, or

MidWest Quiet 5 EA $49.99
Time Ombre Swirl
Gray Pet Bed,
40in x 27in, As

Equal

$249.95

40

Refill Rolls, Blue,

Bags on Board 15 PKG $39.99

15 Bags/Roll, 21
Rolls/Pkg., As
Specified, or
Equal

$599.85

41

Ethical Products 3 EA $13.99
SPOT Grey :
Snuggler Bones
Blanket, Size 40in
x 60in, As
Specified, or
Equal

$41.97

£

L6

ashes; Collars &

Page 12
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Res-Pg:m.14-32
[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

1.D. Collar, Black
2", with Metal
Cobra Buckle, to
include: Sheriff
Reflective I.D.
Panel 8"x2" Black
Letters on Silver
Reflective panel,
Black 8"x2" Yellow
Letters with Black
Background; As
Specified, or
Equal

.48 Cobra 1D Collar EA No Bid No Bid X
with Handle,
Black, As
Specified, or
Equal

49 Collar Badge EA No Bid No Bid X
Holder K9B, As
Specified, or
Equal

50 Collar, Coastal Pet 5 EA $10.99 $54.95

Products, Coastal
/ Double Nylon,
\« 20", Hunter, As

Specified, or
Equal

51 Dogtra 1900S EA No Bid No 8id X
Handsfree E- ’
Collar, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introdueed-on:——April-2,-2026-
Adopted BriE HUNGRXgHIBPXGRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.14-33
[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

64 * [Harness, Coastal 5 EA $31.99 $159.95

Pet Products, ’
/ Coastal Sport

U Wrap Adjustable,

Medium, Black, As

Specified, or
Equal

65 Harness, Coastal 5 EA- $36.99 $184.95
Pet Products,
Coastal K9 .
. Explorer
/ Reflective

L Padded, 30" - 1",
Fern, As
Specified, or
Equal

66 Herm Sprenger EA No Bid No Bid X
Black Stainless
Pinch Collar
3.2mm, As
Specified, or
Equal

67 Herm Sprenger . EA No Bid No Bid X
Neck-Tech Sport '
Martingale
Stainless Steel
Collar, 24", As
Specified, or
Equal

68 Herm Sprenger EA No Bid No Bid X
Neck-Tech, Black,
S/S Collar with
Cliclock Buckle
24", As Specified,
or Equal

Introdu :

eed-on——April 22026
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Res-Pg:m.14-34
[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
'Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

112 I-Clicker, Clicker ~ EA No Bid No Bid
Training, As
Specified, or
Equal
113 Kong, Large, EA No Bid No Bid X

Black, with Rope
Handle, 4"H x 2-
3/4" W, As
Specified, or
Equal

114 Kong, Large, Red, EA No Bid No Bid X
with Rope Handle,
4"H x 2-3/4" W,
As Specified, or
Equal

115 Kong, X-Large, 20 EA $19.99 $399.80
Black, S"H x 4
1/2" W, As
Specified, or
Equal

Red, 5"H x 4 1/2"
W, As Specified,
or Equal

/ 116 Kong, X-Large, 20 EA $17.99 $359.80

117 Syntek Tug ] EA No Bid No Bid X
Handle, 2" x 12",
As Specified, or
Equal

118 Synthetic Bite Bar, EA No Bid No Bid X

2-handle, As 4
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-oni——April2,2025.
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[THE HUNGRY PUPPY]

Bid No. TBD

K9S DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Res-Pg:m.14-35

tine [tem

Description

Nylon Adjustable
Vet Muzzle, As
Specified, or
Equal

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Delivery AR.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

139

Guardian Harness,
Black, As
Specified, or

‘1Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

140

30'x 1" Tubular
Tracking Line, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

141

15'x 1" Tubular
Tracking Line, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

142

Kong Core.
Strength Bamboo
Bone Dog Toy,
Large, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

EA

$10.99

$109.90

143

Kong ChewsStix
Stick Dog Toy,
Large, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

EA

$10.99

.$109.90

144

KONG Floppy
Knots Hippo Dog
Toy, As Specified,
or Equal

10

EA

$12.99

$129.90

SIZE WAS NOT
SPECIFIED -
QUOTED LARGE

Introduced-on-
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Res-Pg:m.14-36
[THE HUNGRY PUPPY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery A.R.O. Mrf./Packaging Comments

145 KONG Cozie Ultra . EA No 8id No Bid X DISCONTINUED
Max Moose Plush V
Dog Toy, As
Specified, or
Equal

146 Kong Wubba 10 EA $13.99 $139.90

/ Friends Dog Toy,

\¥ As Specified, or
Equal :

 DISCOUNT % ON ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line Item Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments

Measure
' 147 Discount Percentage (%) for K-9 Dog Food and Supplies As Specified (NOT LESS % 10%
THAN)
X
Introduced-on- April '), ')n")l:
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