



## Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE  
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari  
Deputy Director Gary Quinn  
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea  
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines  
Commissioner John P. Kelly

101 Hooper Avenue  
Toms River, New Jersey  
08754-2191  
Tel: (732)929-2005  
Fax: (732)505-1918

### Board Meeting Agenda

Date: July 6, 2023 - 4:00 PM  
Location: Administration Building  
Room 119  
101 Hooper Avenue  
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES to Acme Supply Co., LTD; Americare Products, Inc.; Bob Barker Company, Inc.; Care Supplies, LLC; Charm-Tex, Inc.; JML Medical, Inc.; Mini Wing USA; Simplify Chemical Solutions, Inc. and Tabb Textiles Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on Item No. 60. It will not be rebid as it is no longer needed. (B2023-117)

<b>Official Resolution#</b>	<b>2023000927</b>						
Meeting Date	07/06/2023						
Introduced Date	07/06/2023						
Adopted Date	07/06/2023						
Agenda Item	I-2						
CAF #							
Purchase Req. #	B2023-117						
Result	Adopted						
<b>COUNTY COMMISSIONER</b>	<b>PRES.</b>	<b>ABS.</b>	<b>MOVE</b>	<b>SEC</b>	<b>AYE</b>	<b>NAY</b>	<b>ABST.</b>
Vicari	<				<		
Quinn	<			<	<		
Crea	<				<		
Haines	<		<		<		
Kelly	<				<		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

*Michelle I. Gunther*

---

Clerk Of The Board

CONTRACT NO MUST BE ON ALL  
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS  
No. B2023-117

RESOLUTION

July 6, 2023

WHEREAS, on May 31, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES for the County of Ocean, and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders

Name and Address of Bidder

Name and Address of Bidder

ACME Supply Co , LTD  
10 Cedar Swamp Road, Suite 7  
Glen Cove, NY 11542  
(800) 567-8025

Amercure Products, Inc  
111 Main Street  
Sultan, WA 98294  
(800) 556-6322

Bob Barker Company, Inc  
7925 Purfoy Rd  
Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526  
(800) 334-9880

Care Supplies, LLC  
67 E Centre Street  
Nutley, NJ 07110  
(212) 616-6000

Charm-Tex, Inc  
1618 Coney Island Ave  
Brooklyn, NY 11230  
(718) 252-8100

JML Medical, Inc  
1 Havenwood Court, Unit 502  
Lakewood, NJ 08701-4651  
(732) 901-1600

Mini Wing USA  
2516 Via Tejon Suite 216  
PVE CA 90274  
(424) 558-3867

Simplify Chemical Solutions, Inc  
110 3<sup>rd</sup> Ave  
Belmar, NJ 07719  
(732) 740-2539

Tabb Textiles Co , Inc  
511 Pleasant Drive  
Opelika, AL 36801  
(334) 745-6762

Kinky Trap X Trap Kink, LLC  
9220 Ocean View  
Norfolk, VA 23503  
(267) 207-0397

Performance Safety Group  
781A Rudder Road  
St Louis, MO 63026  
(636) 326-4568

Plastic Express, Inc  
667 Lehigh Avenue  
Union, NJ 07083  
(718) 499-1119, Ext 8201

United Sales USA Corp  
5902 14<sup>th</sup> Avenue, Unit 107  
Brooklyn, NY 11219  
(718) 709-5900

, and



WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely, ACME SUPPLY CO., AMERCARE PRODUCTS, INC.; BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.; CARE SUPPLIES, LLC; CHARM-TEX, INC.; JML MEDICAL, INC.; MINI WING USA; SIMPLIFY CHEMICAL SOLUTIONS, INC. and TABB TEXTILES CO., INC. No bids were received for Item No. 60, it will not be rebid as it is no longer needed.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of Penal Institutional Supplies for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through July 5, 2024, a period of one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

A. ACME SUPPLY CO., LTD for one (1) item, to wit:

ITEM NO. 40.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. AMERCARE PRODUCTS, INC. for six (6) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 2, 13, 14, 26, 32 and 44.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC. for twenty six (26) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 9, 10, 11, 12, 15, 18, 19, 24, 27, 28, 30, 31, 35, 37, 39, 41, 43, 47, 49, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55 and 59.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

D. CARE SUPPLIES, LLC for three (3) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 7, 8 and 17.

E. CHARM-TEX, INC. for nine (9) items to wit:

ITEM NOS. 20, 21, 22, 23, 42, 48, 50, 56 and 58.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

F. JML MEDICAL, INC. for eight (8) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 16, 29, 33, 34, 36, 38, 45 and 57.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

G. MINI WING USA for three (3) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 4, 5 and 6.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

H. SIMPLIFY CHEMICAL SOLUTIONS, INC. for one (1) item, to wit:

ITEM NO. 46.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

I. TABB TEXTILES CO., INC. for two (2) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 3 and 25.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-117.

4. Be it further resolved that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance, Juvenile Services and the successful bidders.



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
38	Individually Wrapped Flexi Toothbrush Standard Length, 100 toothbrushes/box, No Metal Parts, NO EXCEPTIONS		BX	No Bid	No Bid	X			
39	Lip Balm, Chapstick or equal, .15 oz., 12 per case, Bob Barker item # 14750, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
40	Personal Size Soap .75 oz., 1000/case, Individually Wrapped, DIAL, or Equal	100	CASE	\$35.00	\$3,500.00				
41	Thumb Toothbrush Individually sealed, 3" L, Bob barker, 72 toothbrushes/case, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
42	Toothpaste 2.75 oz., Clear Plastic Tube, As Specified		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
43	Toothpaste 0.85oz, Bob Barker #MST85, or Equal, Maximum Security see-through tubes, 144 per case, As Specified, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			

FEMININE HYGIENE

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
1	Individual Intake Package: MUST Include - 3 Oz., wrapped soap, clear soapbox for 6.5 oz. soap (hinged), wrapped toothbrush, 2.75 oz. toothpaste, 1.5 oz. roll-on deodorant, 5" pocket comb, state case; MUST be packaged in a clear self-sealing plastic bag; NO removable slider tab on bag.	50	PKG	\$2.25	\$112.50		Amercure AMK-6-OCE	14-21 Days	
2	Inmate Security Pens; Flexible pen, clear vinyl sleeve, black ink only, washable ink, 12 pens/box	210	BX	\$2.40	\$504.00		Amercure PEN-SEC-BK-12	7-10 Days	
<b>TOWELS</b>									
3	Bath Towel 20" x 40", 8 oz., White, 100% cotton, Minimum Qty. 10 dz., As Specified		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
4	Bath Towel 24" x 48", 14 oz., Solid Color: Blue, 100% cotton, As Specified		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
11	Cocoa Butter with Shea Body Lotion, Suave brand or equal, 10 fl. oz. 6 Btls. per case, Bob Barker Item H. 74000, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
12	Elastic Ponytail Holder, no grommets, no metal, 18 elastics/card, 12 cards/case, master case quantity 72, 6 cases per master case, Bob Barker Item 90409		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
13	Hair Clipper Cleaning/Disinfecting Spray, Germicidal, Fungicidal, Virucidal, 12 - 8 oz. bottles/case, MUST BE NON-AEROSOL, As Specified, or Equal	10	CASE	\$107.88	\$1,078.80		Wahl 3701	7-10 Days	
14	Hair Clippers, Industrial Strength, Electric, Multiple Blade Sizes, Wahl, or Equal	50	EA	\$31.50	\$1,575.00		Wahl 08472-850	7-10 Days	Taper 20000 Clipper

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
24	Inmate Mattress, DeptCor P100-3076, 30" x 76" x 3", Fire resistant, Foam Core, Vinyl Covered Mattress. MUST have a built in headrest, As Specified, or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
25	Sheet 54" x 90" Irregular, Muslin 130, Color: White, Sold by the Dozen, As Specified, or Equal		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
<b>GENERAL HYGIENE</b>									
26	Bath Soap 3 oz., Individually Wrapped, 144 Bars/Case, As Specified	250	CASE	\$36.90	\$9,225.00		Amerfresh S-3	7-10 Days ARO	
27	Juv Svc. Bath Soap Box, Hinged, Must hold 5 oz soap		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
28	Deodorants, Men's Sport Scent, Old Spice .5 oz size, 24 per case, Bob Barker Item PG162, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
29	Deodorants, Men's Speed Stick, Fresh Scent, 1.8 oz. size, 12 per Case Bob Barker Item # CG95008, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
30	Deodorants, Women's Degree or Equal, Clean Scent, .5 oz., 36 per case, Bob Barker Item # 23520, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
31	Deodorants, Women's Lady Speed Stick or equal, 1.4 oz., 12 per case, Bob Barker item CG96579, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
32	Disposable Razor, Single Edge Security Razor, BIC; Sold Individually, or Equal	50,000	EA	\$0.068	\$3,400.00		Amercure RAZ-1-1000	7-10 Days	
33	Dove Bar Soap, 2.6 oz. Individually wrapped, 36 bars/Case, Bob Barker Item 26811, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
34	Dove Bar Soap, 3.75 oz. Individually Wrapped, 36 bars/case		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
44	Individually Wrapped Sanitary Pads, unscented, beltless with adhesive strip, 576 per case, Bob Barker SN12-C, or Equal	100	CASE	\$37.50	\$3,750.00		Amerfresh AF-500	7-10 Days	
45	Plastic Applicator Box Tampons, Individually wrapped, unscented, regular size, 12 boxes of 20 tampons per case Bob Barker #811220, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
46	Super Sanitary Napkins, Individually wrapped, 140 ml absorbency, 250 per case, Bob Barker Item # SUSN250, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
<b>LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES</b>									
47	3-in-1 Laundry Soap, for Industrial Sized Washers, Sold by the Package		PKG	No Bid	No Bid	X			
48	Laundry Net with Tie Cord, 24" x 36", White, 100% durable polyester, cloth ID flag attached, As Specified		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
1	Individual Intake Package: MUST Include - 3 Oz., wrapped soap, clear soapbox for 6.5 oz. soap (hinged), wrapped toothbrush, 2.75 oz. toothpaste, 1.5 oz. roll-on deodorant, 5" pocket comb, state case; MUST be packaged in a clear self-sealing plastic bag; NO removable slider tab on bag.	50	PKG	\$1.58	\$79.00		C0144-KIT	10-14 days	Price is per each individual kit/package
2	Inmate Security Pens, Flexible pen, clear vinyl sleeve, black ink only, washable ink, 12 pens/box	210	BX	\$0.73	\$153.30		MSBP - Case of 144	5-7 days	Unit Cost given is for 12 pens. Item No. MSBP is only sold in a case of 144 pens, which is a price of \$8.76 per Case of 144.
<b>TOWELS</b>									
3	Bath Towel 20" x 40", 8 oz., White, 100% cotton, Minimum Qty. 10 dz., As Specified	50	DOZ	\$16.53	\$826.50		41400 - Dozen	5-7 days	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
4	Bath Towel 24" x 48", 14 oz., Solid Color: Blue, 100% cotton, As Specified	10	DOZ	\$54.36	\$543.60		ZBT2448LB - Case of 60	10-14 days	Sold only in a case of 60. Must order CASE. Unit Cost given is per Dozen, but since having to order by a Case of 60, Case Price is \$271.80.
5	Bath Towel, 30" x 56", Must be THIN, 100% Cotton, Packaged by the Dozen		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
6	Bath Towel, 36" x 68", 100% Cotton, Heavy Weight, Hemmed and Trimmed, As Specified		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOOS, AND SUPPLIES									
7	2-in-1 Dandruff Shampoo, Pert Plus or equal, 13.5 fl. oz., 6 btl/case Bob Barker Item 42402, or Equal	4	CASE	\$29.50	\$118.00		42402 - Case of 6	5-7 days	
8	5" Plastic Combs, 144/case, As Specified	2	CASE	\$4.43	\$8.86		C-5 - Case of 144	5-7 days	
9	5" Afro Pick Combs, Sold by the Dozen, As Specified	8	DOZ	\$2.23	\$17.84		PICK-5 - Dozen	5-7 days	



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
✓ 10	Bendable Comb, 8 1/2" size, 12 per case, Bob Barker Item FC-85	8	CASE	\$4.22	\$33.76		FC-85 - Dozen	5-7 days	
✓ 11	Cocoa Butter with Shea Body Lotion, Suave brand or equal, 10 fl. oz. 6 Btls. per case, Bob Barker Item H. 74000, or Equal	12	CASE	\$25.50	\$306.00		74000 - Case of 6	5-7 days	
✓ 12	Elastic Ponytail Holder, no grommets, no metal, 18 elastics/card, 12 cards/case, master case quantity 72, 6 cases per master case, Bob Barker item 90409	3	CASE	\$8.92	\$26.76		90409 - Case of 72 ponytail holders	5-7 days	
13	Hair Clipper Cleaning/Disinfecting Spray, Germicidal, Fungicidal, Virucidal, 12 - 8 oz. bottles/case, MUST BE NON-AEROSOL, As Specified, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
14	Hair Clippers, Industrial Strength, Electric, Multiple Blade Sizes, Wahl, or Equal	50	EA	\$16.18	\$809.00		HC1094-1 - Each	5-7 days	Remington Home Barber Kit;

Introduced on: July 6, 2023  
 Adopted by: Official Resolution # 2023009937  
 Official Resolution # 2023009937  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
15	Hair Conditioners, Lucky brand or equal, 12 fl. oz. 12 btls. per case, Bob Barker Item # LB10261, or Equal	3	CASE	\$24.68	\$74.04		LB10261 - Case of 12	5-7 days	13 oz bottles
16	Hairbrush, standard brush with nylon bristles, 8" size, 24 per case, Bob Barker Item # HB	5	CASE	\$12.28	\$61.40		HB - Case of 24	5-7 days	
17	Hairbrush, vented brush with plastic bristles, 7 3/4" size, 12 per case, Bob Barker Item HB-02	10	CASE	\$6.68	\$66.80		HB-02 - Case of 12	5-7 days	
18	Oil Moisturizer Hair Lotion, Luster brand or equal, 8 oz. 12 btls. per case, Bob Barker item L506, or Equal	4	CASE	\$69.24	\$276.96		L506 - Case of 12.	5-7 days	
19	Shampoo, White Rain Citrus, 12 -15 oz. bottles/case, As Specified, or Equal	4	CASE	\$16.50	\$66.00		60003 - Case of 6	5-7 days	Sold in a Case of 6; 15 oz Bottles
MATTRESSES, SHEETS, BLANKETS									

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
24	Inmate Mattress, DeptCor P100-3076, 30" x 76" x 3", Fire resistant, Foam Core, Vinyl Covered Mattress. MUST have a built in headrest, As Specified, or Equal	200	EA	\$82.79	\$16,558.00		PMP30754 - Each	7 days	
25	Sheet 54" x 90" Irregular, Muslin 130, Color: White, Sold by the Dozen, As Specified, or Equal	500	DOZ	\$29.70	\$14,850.00		SH5490N - Dozen	5-7 days	
<b>GENERAL HYGIENE</b>									
26	Bath Soap 3 oz., Individually Wrapped, 144 Bars/Case, As Specified	250	CASE	\$43.33	\$10,832.50		62107-C - Case of 144	5-7 days	
27	Juv Svc. Bath Soap Box, Hinged, Must hold 5 oz soap	10	DOZ	\$4.68	\$46.80		434 - Case of 12	5-7 days	
28	Deodorants, Men's Sport Scent, Old Spice .5 oz size, 24 per case, Bob Barker Item PG162, or Equal	5	CASE	\$30.24	\$151.20		PG162 - Case of 24	5-7 days	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
29	Deodorants, Men's Speed-Stick, Fresh Scent, 1.8 oz. size, 12 per Case Bob Barker Item # CG95008, or Equal	15	CASE	\$28.56	\$428.40		CG95008 - Case of 12	5-7 days	
30	Deodorants, Women's Degree or Equal, Clean Scent, .5 oz., 36 per case, Bob Barker item # 23520, or Equal	5	CASE	\$35.76	\$178.80		23520 - Case of 36	5-7 days	
31	Deodorants, Women's Lady Speed Stick or equal, 1.4 oz., 12 per case, Bob Barker Item CG96579, or Equal	5	CASE	\$24.90	\$124.50		CG96579 - Case of 12	5-7 days	
32	Disposable Razor, Single Edge Security Razor, BIC, Sold Individually, or Equal	50,000	EA	\$0.06	\$3,000.00		R600 - Case of 600	5-7 days	Sold only in a Case of 600 razors. Unit Cost given is for each razor. Price per case of 600 razors is \$36.00
33	Dove Bar Soap, 2.6 oz. Individually wrapped, 36 bars/Case, Bob Barker Item 26811, or Equal	5	CASE	\$46.53	\$232.65		26811 - Case of 36	5-7 days	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
34	Dove Bar Soap, 3.75 oz. Individually Wrapped, 36 bars/case	300	CASE	\$79.00	\$23,700.00		61127 - Case of 72	5-7 days	Sold Only in a CASE of 72. Unit Cost given is for 36 bars. Selling Unit of Measure price is \$158.00 (for 72 bars)
35	Hand Sanitizer, Deb Instant Foam, or Equal, MUST NOT Contain Alcohol, 400 mL Pump Top Bottle, 12 Bottles/Case	50	CASE	\$108.47	\$5,423.50		56815 - Case of 12	5-7 days	
36	Hand Sanitizer Gel, Institutional use, clear soft plastic squirt bottle, no pump, minimum 60% alcohol content, must fit into standard uniform pant or shirt pocket, 60-4 oz, bottles/case, Bob Barker AG46, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
37	Individual Hygiene Kit: MUST include at minimum - 1 each of the following: thumbprint toothbrush (not to exceed 3"), 6 oz. clear tube toothpaste (animal fat-free), 5" plastic comb, 4" security clear flexible pen with black ink, 0.75 oz. wrapped personal size soap, Each Kit MUST be individually sealed in a clear vinyl bag, 200 kits/box, As Specified	50	BX	\$114.00	\$5,700.00		CO143-KIT	10-14 days	Unit Cost given is for 200 kits per box. Each kit is \$0.57
38	Individually Wrapped Flexi Toothbrush Standard Length, 100 toothbrushes/box, No Metal Parts, NO EXCEPTIONS	200	BX	\$31.68	\$6,336.00		BBFH30 - Case of 144	5-7 days	Unit Cost is for a Case of 144 toothbrushes. Only sold by the Case of 144.
39	Lip Balm, Chapstick or equal, .15 oz., 12 per case, Bob Barker Item # 14750, or Equal	12	CASE	\$17.16	\$205.92		14750 - Dozen	5-7 days	
40	Personal Size Soap .75 oz., 1000/case, Individually Wrapped, DIAL, or Equal	100	CASE	\$116.20	\$11,620.00		DW06009-A - Case of 1000	5-7 days	Dial Brand Soap

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
41	Thumb Toothbrush Individually sealed, 3" L, Bob barker, 72 toothbrushes/case, or Equal	50	CASE	\$4.08	\$204.00		TH42 - Case of 72	5-7 days	
42	Toothpaste 2.75 oz., Clear Plastic Tube, As Specified		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
43	Toothpaste 0.85oz, Bob Barker #MST85, or Equal, Maximum Security see-through tubes, 144 per case, As Specified, or Equal	75	CASE	\$24.18	\$1,813.50		MST85 - Case of 144	5-7 days	
<b>FEMININE HYGIENE</b>									
44	Individually Wrapped Sanitary Pads, unscented, beltless with adhesive strip, 576 per case, Bob Barker SN12-C, or Equal	100	CASE	\$42.00	\$4,200.00		SN12-C - Case of 576	5-7 days	
45	Plastic Applicator Box Tampons, Individually wrapped, unscented, regular size, 12 boxes of 20 tampons per case Bob Barker #811220, or Equal	200	CASE	\$60.00	\$12,000.00		811218 - Case of 216	5-7 days	Unit Cost given is for a CASE of 216. Item No. 811218 is only sold in a Case of 216 tampons.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
46	Super Sanitary Napkins, Individually wrapped, 140 ml absorbency, 250 per case, Bob Barker Item # SUSN250, or Equal	4	CASE	\$23.85	\$95.40		SUSN250 - Case of 250	5-7 days	
<b>LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES</b>									
47	3-in-1 Laundry Soap, for Industrial Sized Washers, Sold by the Package	10	PKG	\$64.00	\$640.00		AC240 - Case of 100	5-7 days	Only sold by the case. There are 100 pods/packets per case. Unit Cost given is per case.
48	Laundry Net with Tie Cord, 24" x 36", White, 100% durable polyester, cloth ID flag attached, As Specified	500	EA	\$3.30	\$1,650.00		E2436 - Dozen	5-7 days	Sold ONLY by the DOZEN. Not SOLD BY THE EACH. Unit Cost given is per each.
49	Liquid Laundry Detergent, perfume & dye-free for allergy prone or sensitive skin, can be used with HE and non-HE machines, Arm & Hammer or equal. Bob Barker item # AHH#50, 50 oz. 8/case	5	CASE	\$68.31	\$341.55		Item No. 33200-50Q26 - Case of 8	5-7 days	Arm & Hammer Sensitive Skin Free & Clear Liquid Laundry Detergent 50 oz - 8 per case

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
50	Slip Lock Laundry Net, 24" x 36", Green, 100% polyester mesh, Bob Barker #G2436, or Equal	500	EA	\$2.81	\$1,405.00		G2436 - Dozen	5-7 days	Sold ONLY by the DOZEN. Not SOLD BY THE EACH. Unit Cost given is per each.
✓ 51	Slip Lock Laundry Net 30" x 48", White, 100% polyester mesh, Bob Barker #W3048, or Equal	75	EA	\$4.09	\$306.75		W3048 - Dozen	5-7 days	Sold ONLY by the DOZEN. Not SOLD BY THE EACH. Unit Cost given is per each.
<b>SHOWER ACCESSORIES - CURTAINS AND SHOWER SHOES</b>									
✓ 52	Clear Top Shower Curtain 36" x 77" with Velcro strips, 2-ply vinyl shower curtain with velcro strips, light green in color, must have clear top, Bob Barker SCVC 3677, or Equal,	225	EA	\$18.22	\$4,099.50		SCVC3677 - Each		
✓ 53	Hookless Shower Curtain, 36" x 77", with Snap Closures, Bob Barker #SC3677, or Equal	225	EA	\$17.76	\$3,996.00		SC3677 - Each		

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
54	Shower Shoes, X-Strap, S, M, L, & XL, thick molded, skid-proof sole, As Specified	2,500	PR	\$0.95	\$2,375.00		S114X-(SIZE) - Dozen		Sold only by the DOZEN PER SIZE. Not SOLD BY THE PAIR. Unit Cost given is per pair. Unit Price per our selling unit of measure of a Dozen is \$11.40
55	Standard Slip On Inmate Shoes, Oversized Sizes 14, 15 and 16, Sold by the Pair	10	PR	\$3.55	\$35.50		FPVSN2-TN-(SIZE) - Pair		Alpha Sizing. Size 2XL = size 13 and 14 shoes sizes. Size 3XL = sizes 15 and 16 shoes sizes. Color: Tan
56	Velcro Track Tabs for Track Shower Curtain System, CharmTex SXVLTAB, 3/4" Male Velcro Tab, As Specified or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
<b>GLOVES</b>									
57	Black Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powder Free and Latex Free, MUST be 6 mil OR greater, Color: Black, Sizes M - XXL, 100 gloves/box, 10 boxes/case, or Equal	500	CASE	\$74.00	\$37,000.00		ZSHD-SIZE - Case of 10 boxes		Adenna Shadow Black Nitrile Gloves. Sizes XL and 2XL contain 90 gloves per box/900 gloves per case.



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
58	Latex Housekeeping Gloves, Non-Slip, 12" Length, Universal size, 12 per case, Yellow, Charmex item # GL/Yellow, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
INMATE SUPPLIES									
59	In-ear-Earphones Headphones, 3.5 mm connectivity, by SanDisk, or Equal	20	EA	\$1.60	\$32.00		EPH - Each		
60	MP3 Player, SanDisk Clip Jam, 8 GB, B&H Video Pro-Audio, Item # SACJAM8GBBBI; SNDISK, or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
5	Bath Towel, 30" x 56", Must be THIN, 100% Cotton, Packaged by the Dozen		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
6	Bath Towel, 36" x 68", 100% Cotton, Heavy Weight, Hemmed and Trimmed, As Specified		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
<b>HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOOS, AND SUPPLIES</b>									
7	2-in-1 Dandruff Shampoo, Pert Plus or equal, 13.5 fl. oz., 6 btl/case Bob Barker item 42402, or Equal	4	CASE	\$19.99	\$79.96		Pert plus 13.5oz 6/cs	5	
8	5" Plastic Combs, 144/case, As Specified	2	CASE	\$3.25	\$6.50		New world 5" 144/cs	5	
9	5" Afro Pick Combs, Sold by the Dozen, As Specified		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
10	Bendable Comb, 8 1/2" size, 12 per case, Bob Barker Item FC-85		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
15	Hair Conditioners, Lucky brand or equal, 12 fl. oz. 12 btls. per case, Bob Barker item # LB10261, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
16	Hairbrush, standard brush with nylon bristles, 8" size, 24 per case, Bob Barker Item # HB	5	CASE	\$8.12	\$40.60		new world 24/cs	5	
17	Hairbrush, vented brush with plastic bristles, 7 3/4" size, 12 per case, Bob Barker Item HB-02	10	CASE	\$4.70	\$47.00		new world 12/cs	5	
18	Oil Moisturizer Hair Lotion, Luster brand or equal, 8 oz. 12 btls. per case, Bob Barker Item L506, or Equal	4	CASE	\$69.52	\$278.08		luster 8oz 12/cs	5	
19	Shampoo, White Rain Citrus, 12 - 15 oz. bottles/case, As Specified, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
MATTRESSES, SHEETS, BLANKETS									

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
20	Blanket 62" x 80", Not less than 65% wool, fire retardant according to Federal Flammable Fabric Act CS 191-53, Machine Washable, Over stitched ends (NOT DISASTER BLANKETS), As Specified	1,000	EA	\$5.44	\$5,440.00		BL/WB70	7-30	
21	Blanket, Prestige XL, 66" by 90", Navy OR Camel, 100% Polyester, hypoallergenic, permanently anti-static, meets or exceeds ASTM D 4151-92 flammability requirements, machine washable, tumble dry low temp, As Specified, or Equal	15	EA	\$6.90	\$103.50		BL/XLRYDER	7-30	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
22	Self Protection/Suicide Blanket, 2-layers of heavyweight 650 Denier Cordura Nylon quilted to 9.0 oz polyester batting, machine wash/dry, fire resistant; Size 54" x 80", Bob Barker Item # SB5480, As Specified, or Equal	10	EA	\$66.90	\$669.00		BL/GREEN	7-30	
23	Self Protection/Suicide Smock, 2-layers of heavyweight 650 Denier Cordura Nylon quilted to 9.0 oz polyester batting, 1 1/2" Velcro hook & loop strips that are 6" in length, machine wash/dry, fire resistant; Small - Chest 38" - 48", Standard - Chest 44" - 56", XXL - Chest 56" - 72", Bob Barker Item #5051R, As Specified, or Equal	15	EA	\$66.90	\$1,003.50		SM/GREEN	7-30	



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
38	Individually Wrapped Flexi Toothbrush Standard Length, 100 toothbrushes/box, No Metal Parts, NO EXCEPTIONS	200	BX	\$12.90	\$2,580.00			7-30	SHORT HANDLE
39	Lip Balm, Chapstick or equal, .15 oz., 12 per case, Bob Barker Item # 14750, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
40	Personal Size Soap .75 oz., 1000/case, Individually Wrapped, DIAL, or Equal	100	CASE	\$52.90	\$5,290.00			7-30	.5 oz
41	Thumb Toothbrush Individually sealed, 3" L, Bob barker, 72 toothbrushes/case, or Equal	50	CASE	\$12.90	\$645.00			7-30	144/cs
42	Toothpaste 2.75 oz., Clear Plastic Tube, As Specified	200	EA	\$52.90	\$10,580.00			7-30	52.90/CS 144/CS
43	Toothpaste 0.85oz, Bob Barker #MST85, or Equal, Maximum Security see-through tubes, 144 per case, As Specified, or Equal	75	CASE	\$28.90	\$2,167.50			7-30	
FEMININE HYGIENE									

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
44	Individually Wrapped Sanitary Pads, unscented, beltless with adhesive strip, 576 per case, Bob Barker SN12-C, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
45	Plastic Applicator Box Tampons, Individually wrapped, unscented, regular size, 12 boxes of 20 tampons per case Bob Barker #811220, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
46	Super Sanitary Napkins, Individually wrapped, 140 ml absorbency, 250 per case, Bob Barker item # SUSN250, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
<b>LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES</b>									
47	3-In-1 Laundry Soap, for Industrial Sized Washers, Sold by the Package		PKG	No Bid	No Bid	X			
48	Laundry Net with Tie Cord, 24" x 36", White, 100% durable polyester, cloth ID flag attached, As Specified	500	EA	\$2.49	\$1,245.00		BAG-TC2436WT	7-30	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
49	Liquid Laundry Detergent, perfume & dye-free for allergy prone or sensitive skin, can be used with HE and non-HE machines, Arm & Hammer or equal. Bob Barker item # AHH#50, 50 oz. 8/case		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
50	Slip Lock Laundry Net, 24" x 36", Green, 100% polyester mesh, Bob Barker #G2436, or Equal	500	EA	\$2.54	\$1,270.00		BAG-SL2436WT	7-30	
51	Slip Lock Laundry Net 30" x 48", White, 100% polyester mesh, Bob Barker #W3048, or Equal	75	EA	\$5.82	\$436.50		BAG-SL3048WT	7-30	
<b>SHOWER ACCESSORIES - CURTAINS AND SHOWER SHOES</b>									
52	Clear Top Shower Curtain 36" x 77" with Velcro strips, 2-ply vinyl shower curtain with velcro strips, light green in color, must have clear top, Bob Barker SCVC 3677, or Equal,		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
53	Hookless Shower Curtain, 36" x 77", with Snap Closures, Bob Barker #SC3677, or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
54	Shower Shoes, X-Strap, S, M, L, & XL, thick molded, skid-proof sole, As Specified	2,500	PR	\$0.99	\$2,475.00		F//XSTRAP	7-30	
55	Standard Slip On Inmate Shoes, Oversized Sizes 14, 15 and 16, Sold by the Pair		PR	No Bid	No Bid	X			
56	Velcro Track Tabs for Track Shower Curtain System, CharmTex SXVLTAB, 3/4" Male Velcro Tab, As Specified or Equal	205	EA	\$1.36	\$278.80				
<b>GLOVES</b>									
57	Black Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powder Free and Latex Free, MUST be 6 mil OR greater, Color: Black, Sizes M - XXL, 100 gloves/box, 10 boxes/case, or Equal	500	CASE	\$96.90	\$48,450.00		GL/FNITRILEBK	7-30	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
58	Latex Housekeeping Gloves, Non-Slip, 12" Length, Universal size, 12 per case, Yellow, Charmex item # GL/Yellow, or Equal	2	CASE	\$14.90	\$29.80		GL/YELLOW	7-30	
<b>INMATE SUPPLIES</b>									
59	In-ear-Earphones Headphones, 3.5 mm connectivity, by SanDisk, or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
60	MP3 Player, SanDisk Clip Jam, 8 GB, B&H Video Pro-Audio, item # SACJAM8GBBBL, SNDISK, or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
15	Hair Conditioners, Lucky brand or equal, 12 fl. oz. 12 btls. per case, Bob Barker Item # LB10261, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
✓ 16	Hairbrush, standard brush with nylon bristles, 8" size, 24 per case, Bob Barker Item # HB	5	CASE	\$7.70	\$38.50		DYNAREX 4881	3	PER BOX OF 24
17	Hairbrush, vented brush with plastic bristles, 7 3/4" size, 12 per case, Bob Barker Item HB-02		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
18	Oil Moisturizer Hair Lotion, Luster brand or equal, 8 oz. 12 btls. per case, Bob Barker item L506, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
19	Shampoo, White Rain Citrus, 12 - 15 oz. bottles/case, As Specified, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
MATTRESSES, SHEETS, BLANKETS									

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
29	Deodorants, Men's Speed Stick, Fresh Scent, 1.8 oz. size, 12 per Case Bob Barker Item # CG95008, or Equal	15	CASE	\$17.50	\$262.50		NEW WORLD STD225M	7	2.25 OUNCE 24/CS IS OUR CASE PACK PRICE QUOTED IS FOR 12 FOR COMPARISON PURPOSES
30	Deodorants, Women's Degree or Equal, Clean Scent, .5 oz., 36 per case, Bob Barker Item # 23520, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
31	Deodorants, Women's Lady Speed Stick or equal, 1.4 oz., 12 per case, Bob Barker Item CG96579, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
32	Disposable Razor, Single Edge Security Razor, BIC, Sold Individually, or Equal	50,000	EA	\$0.063	\$3,150.00		NEW WORLD RAZ-1C	7	100/BX 10BX/CS and ours is Clear
33	Dove Bar Soap, 2.6 oz. Individually wrapped, 36 bars/Case, Bob Barker Item 26811, or Equal	5	CASE	\$32.00	\$160.00		DOVE BAR SOAP 2.6 OZ BB61423	5	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
34	Dove Bar Soap, 3.75 oz. Individually Wrapped, 36 bars/case	300	CASE	\$43.20	\$12,960.00		DOVE BAR SOAP 4.75OZ BB61425-48	7	OUR BAR IS 4.75 OUNCE AND PACKED 48 PER CASE PRICE OFFERED IS FOR 36 FOR COMPARISON PURPOSES
35	Hand Sanitizer, Deb Instant Foam, or Equal, MUST NOT Contain Alcohol, 400 mL Pump Top Bottle, 12 Bottles/Case		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
36	Hand Sanitizer Gel, Institutional use, clear soft plastic squirt bottle, no pump, minimum 60% alcohol content, must fit into standard uniform pant or shirt pocket, 60-4 oz. bottles/case, Bob Barker AG46, or Equal	100	CASE	\$49.20	\$4,920.00		DERMARIITE 00104	3	OURS IS PACKED 24/CS BUT QUOTED AT CASE OF 60 FOR COMPARISON PURPOSES

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
37	Individual Hygiene Kit: MUST include at minimum - 1 each of the following: thumbprint toothbrush (not to exceed 3"), 6 oz. clear tube toothpaste (animal fat-free), 5" plastic comb, 4" security clear flexible pen with black ink, 0.75 oz. wrapped personal size soap, Each Kit MUST be individually sealed in a clear vinyl bag, 200 kits/box, As Specified		BX	No Bid	No Bid	X			
38	Individually Wrapped Flexi Toothbrush Standard Length, 100 toothbrushes/box, No Metal Parts, NO EXCEPTIONS	200	BX	\$18.60	\$3,720.00		NEW WORLD TBFLEX42	7	OURS IS PACKED 144/CS PRICED AT 100/CS FOR COMPARISON PURPOSES
39	Lip Balm, Chapstick or equal, .15 oz., 12 per case, Bob Barker Item # 14750, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
40	Personal Size Soap .75 oz., 1000/case, Individually Wrapped, DIAL, or Equal	100	CASE	\$68.90	\$6,890.00		NEW WORLD S34	7	OUR BAR IS .52OZ

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
41	Thumb Toothbrush Individually sealed, 3" L, Bob barker, 72 toothbrushes/case, or Equal	50	CASE	\$5.80	\$290.00		NEW WORLD TB-SEC	7	7
42	Toothpaste 2.75 oz., Clear Plastic Tube, As Specified	200	EA	\$0.60	\$120.00		NEW WORLD CG275	7	PACKED 144/CS
43	Toothpaste 0.85oz, Bob Barker #MST85, or Equal, Maximum Security see-through tubes, 144 per case, As Specified, or Equal	75	CASE	\$61.20	\$4,590.00		NEW WORLD CG85	7	
<b>FEMININE HYGIENE</b>									
44	Individually Wrapped Sanitary Pads, unscented, beltless with adhesve strip, 576 per case, Bob Barker SN12-C, or Equal	100	CASE	\$57.00	\$5,700.00		HOSPECO BULK576	7	
45	Plastic Applicator Box Tampons, Individually wrapped; unscented, regular size, 12 boxes of 20 tampons per case Bob Barker #811220, or Equal	200	CASE	\$58.00	\$11,600.00		HOSPECO 311220	7-14	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
55	Standard Slip On Inmate Shoes, Oversized Sizes 14, 15 and 16, Sold by the Pair		PR	No Bid	No Bid	X			
56	Velcro Track Tabs for Track Shower Curtain System, CharmTex SXVLTAB, 3/4" Male Velcro Tab, As Specified or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
<b>GLOVES</b>									
57	Black Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powder Free and Latex Free, MUST be 6 mil OR greater, Color: Black, Sizes M - XXL, 100 gloves/box, 10 boxes/case, or Equal	500	CASE	\$40.00	\$20,000.00		STRONG MFG 160X	7-10	OUR PACKED 10X100 EXCEPT 2XL WHICH COMES 10X90
58	Latex Housekeeping Gloves, Non-Slip, 12" Length, Universal size, 12 per case, Yellow, Charmex item # GL/Yellow, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
<b>INMATE SUPPLIES</b>									
59	In-ear-Earphones Headphones, 3.5 mm connectivity, by SanDisk, or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
1	Individual Intake Package: MUST include - 3 Oz., wrapped soap, clear soapbox for 6.5 oz. soap (hinged), wrapped toothbrush, 2.75 oz. toothpaste, 1.5 oz. roll-on deodorant, 5" pocket comb, state case; MUST be packaged in a clear self-sealing plastic bag; NO removable slider tab on bag.	50	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00				
2	Inmate Security Pens, Flexiblē pen, clear vinyl sleeve, black ink only, washablē ink, 12 pens/box	210	BX	\$0.00	\$0.00				
<b>TOWELS</b>									
3	Bath Towel 20" x 40", 8 oz., White, 100% cotton; Minimum Qty. 10 dz., As Specified	50	DOZ	\$17.39	\$869.50		Towel Super e40 or ALS	5-15	
4	Bath Towel 24" x 48", 14 oz., Solid Color: Blue, 100% cotton, As Specified	10	DOZ	\$27.83	\$278.30		Towel Super E48 or ALS	5-15	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
5	Bath Towel, 30" x 56", Must be THIN, 100% Cotton, Packaged by the Dozen	200	DOZ	\$27.95	\$5,590.00		towel hub 3060WH-T	5-15	30x60
6	Bath Towel, 36" x 68", 100% Cotton, Heavy Weight, Hemmed and Trimmed, As Specified	5	DOZ	\$49.99	\$249.95				
<b>HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOOS, AND SUPPLIES</b>									
7	2-in-1 Dandruff Shampoo, Pert Plus or equal, 13.5 fl. oz., 6 btl/case Bob Barker Item 42402, or Equal	4	CASE	\$0.00	\$0.00				
8	5" Plastic Combs, 144/case, As Specified	2	CASE	\$0.00	\$0.00				
9	5" Afro Pick Combs, Sold by the Dozen, As Specified	8	DOZ	\$0.00	\$0.00				
10	Bendable Comb, 8 1/2" size, 12 per case, Bob Barker Item FC-85	8	CASE	\$0.00	\$0.00				

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No, TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
44	Individually Wrapped Sanitary Pads, unscented, beltless with adhesive strip, 576 per case, Bob Barker SN12-C, or Equal	100	CASE	\$43.00	\$4,300.00		Hospeco 576/cs, individually wrapped	7 days	
45	Plastic Applicator Box Tampons, Individually wrapped, unscented, regular size, 12 boxes of 20 tampons per case Bob Barker #811220, or Equal	200	CASE	\$86.70	\$17,340.00		Hospeco, individually wrapped, 500/cs, plastic applicator	7-14 days	
46	Super Sanitary Napkins, Individually wrapped, 140 ml absorbency, 250 per case, Bob Barker Item # SUSN250, or Equal	4	CASE	\$21.38	\$85.52		Hospeco 250/cs, individually wrapped	7 days	
<b>LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES</b>									
47	3-in-1 Laundry Soap, for Industrial Sized Washers, Sold by the Package		PKG	No Bid	No Bid	X			
48	Laundry Net with Tie Cord, 24" x 36", White, 100% durable polyester, cloth ID flag attached, As Specified		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			

Introduced on: July 6, 2023  
 Adopted: PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Official Resolution #: 2023009927  
 Bid: PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No. TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
1	Individual Intake Package: MUST include - 3 Oz., wrapped soap; clear soapbox for 6.5 oz. soap (hinged), wrapped toothbrush, 2.75 oz. toothpaste, 1.5 oz. roll-on deodorant, 5" pocket comb, state case; MUST be packaged in a clear self-sealing plastic bag; NO removable slider tab on bag.		PKG	No Bid	No Bid	X			
2	Inmate Security Pens, Flexible pen, clear vinyl sleeve, black ink only, washable ink, 12 pens/box		BX	No Bid	No Bid	X			
<b>TOWELS</b>									
3	Bath Towel 20" x 40", 8 oz., White, 100% cotton, Minimum Qty. 10 dz., As Specified	50	DOZ	\$10.70	\$535.00		Tabb BT120		
4	Bath Towel 24" x 48", 14 oz., Solid Color: Blue, 100% cotton, As Specified		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Bid No: TBD  
 PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Mfr. Model & Packaging:	Delivery, A.R.O.:	Comments:
24	Inmate Mattress, DeptCor P100-3076, 30" x 76" x 3", Fire resistant, Foam Core, Vinyl Covered Mattress. MUST have a built in headrest, As Specified, or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
25	Sheet 54" x 90" Irregular, Muslin 130, Color: White, Sold by the Dozen, As Specified, or Equal	500	DOZ	\$20.75	\$10,375.00		Tabb MS122		
<b>GENERAL HYGIENE</b>									
26	Bath Soap 3 oz., Individually Wrapped, 144 Bars/Case, As Specified		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			
27	Juv Svc. Bath Soap Box, Hinged, Must hold 5 oz soap		DOZ	No Bid	No Bid	X			
28	Deodorants, Men's Sport Scent, Old Spice .5 oz size, 24 per case, Bob Barker item PG162, or Equal		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			