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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Barbara Jo Crea

Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly

Commissioner Frank Sadeghi

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

December 4, 2024 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of ROLLOFF CONTAINERS to CivicBridges; and

Rudco Products, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2024-172)

Official Resolution# (2024001814
Meeting Date 12/04/2024
Introduced Date 12/04/2024
Adopted Date 12/04/2024
Agenda ltem k-3

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-172
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER x @0 % % |< |2
Crea v v
Quinn v v
Haines v v v
Kelly v v |v
Sadeghi v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie |, Guatinor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:

Adopted on:

Res-Pg:k.3-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST B
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICESQI%HERS

.39-8\202_(t' V3iad

RESOLUTION

December 4, 2024

WHEREAS, on October 8, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for furnishing and delivery of ROLLOFF CONTAINERS for the
County of Ocean, State of New Jersey; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
CivicBridges Rudco Products, Inc.

1846 1% Street-#1006 114 East Oak Road

Idaho Falls, ID 83401 Vineland, NJ 08361

(857) 930-0257 (856) 691-0800

Monmouth Solutions, Inc. Wastequip Manufacturing Company, LLC
93 Butman Road 841 Meacham Road

Lowell, MA 01852 Statesville, NC 28677

(978) 735-3968 (980) 987-7602 Ext: 9641

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely that of CIVICBRIDGES and RUDCO
PRODUCTS, INC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into a contract for Rolloff Containers for the County of Ocean; for the contract period
from date of award through December 3, 2025, a period of one (1) year or until delivery is
complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the

contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. CIVICBRIDGES for nine (9) items to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,5,6,7,10, 11 and 13.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

December 4, 2024
December 4, 2024

Official Resdlution#: 2024001814




Introduced on
Adopted on:
Official Resoly

t

BID RESOLUTION PAGE 2 DECEMBERResoPg:k.3-3

B. RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. for five (5) items to wit:
ITEM NOS. 4, 8,9, 12 and 14.

2. Payments for the equipment and supplies to be acquired by this contract
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding

sources: Solid Waste Management O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-172.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Solid Waste Management, and the successful bidders.

December 4, 2024
December 4, 2024
on#: 2024001814




B2024-172

CIVICBRIDGES

[CIVICBRIDGES] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:k.3-4

Introduced on:

ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

Line [tem

Description

9 Yard Closed
Recycling Rolloff
Container -
Ribbed Style As
Specified, or
Equal

Unit of Measure

EA

uUnit Cost

$4,500.00

Total Cost No Bid Comments: Manufacturer:

$9,000.00

Delivery, AR.O.: Warranty:

45 Days

9 Yard Closed
Recycling Rolloff
Container - Tub
Style As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$4,200.00

$8,400.00

45 Days

12 Yard Closed
Rolloff
Container -
Ribbed Style As
Specified, or.
Equal

_EA

$5,200.00

$20,800.00

45 Days

20 Yard Open
Top Rolloff
Container -
Ribbed Style As
Specifed, or
Equal

EA

$6,200.00

$37,200.00

45 Days

20 Yard Open
Top Rolloff
Container - Tub
Style As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$5,900.00

$11,800.00

45 Days .

December 4, 2024

Adopte
Official
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B2024-172

CIVICBRIDGES

Res-Pg:k.3-5
[CIVICBRIDGES] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Comments: Manufacturer:  Delivery, AR.Q.: Warranty:

6 25 Yard Closed 2 EA $6,700.00 $13,400.00 . 45 Days
Rolloff :
Container -
Ribbed Style As
Specified, or

Equa!

-7 25 Yard Open 2 EA ' $6,400.00 $12,800.00 : 45 Days

Recycling Rolloff '
/ Container - Tub
Style As

Specified or
Equal

8 30 Yard Open 9 EA $7,500.00 $67,500.00 : 45 Days
Top Rolloff '
Container -
Ribbed Style As
Specified, or
Equal

9 30 Yard Open 2 EA $7,200.00 $14,400.00 ’ 45 Days

Top Rolloff ‘ :
Container - Tub
Style As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 10 40 Yard Closed 2 EA $8,000.00 $16,000.00 : 45 Days
V . Top Rolloff ’

Container -
Ribbed Style, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: ‘December 4, 2024 »

Adopteg9p|CBR|D. 4s20BHCUMENT REPORT
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B2024-172

CIVICBRIDGES

Res-Pg:k.3-6

[CIVICBRIDGES] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments: Manufacturer:  Delivery, AR.O.: Warranty:

11 40 Yard Closed 2 EA $7,800.00 $15,600.00 ) 45 Days
Top Rolloff . ‘
/' Container, No
v Windows -
Ribbed Style, As

Specified, or
Equal

12° 40 Yard Open 8 EA $8,300.00 $66,400.00 ' 45 Days
Top Rolloff
Container -
Ribbed Style As
Specified, or
Equal

Top Rolloff
Container - Tub
Style As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 13 40 Yard Open 2 EA $8,100.00 $16,200.00 45 Days -

14 40 Yard Octagon 2 EA $9,000.00 $18,000.00 45 Days
Rolloff ' ’ ’
Compactor
Container As
Specified or
Equal

Introduced on: "_December 4, 2024
Ad?PtE?WCBRIDG B@%ﬁﬁs%@cuww REPORT
Officlal & oRBPI A IR ANERS
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- CIVICBRIDGES
/COMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

B2024-172

Bes-P&%&?

ITEM #1 - 9 YARD CLOSED ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR

EQUAL

Size: 9 Yard

Doors per side: 2

Height Overall: 40”

Width Overall: 96”
~Length Overall: 155”

STANDARD DECK

3/16” PL Floor Sheet

3” Structural Channel on 20” Centers

3/16” PL Gussets on every other Cross Member

6” x 2” x 3/16” Tube One Piece Main Rail

Four (4) - 8” Diameter x 10” LG Heavy Duty Wheels

4” OD x 6” LG Front Roller with 1% Pin and Grease Fifting

17 Certified Hook Plate (with lifetime guarantee)

1% Certified Plate Cable Hook (with lifetime guarantee)
12" Plate Sohd Bullnose

FRONT AND SIDES

12’ Deck with 30” Inside Height (40 '2” height to roof)

11 Gauge Steel

4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Top Tube

11 Gauge 3 x 5” Formed 4-way Bend Side Stiffener on 24” Centers
Columns have notches at bottom to prevent moisture retention.

2 x 2 Formed Angle

REAR CORNER POST
Latch Side: 11 Gauge 3” x 5” Formed 4-way Bend Stiffener
Hinge Side: 3” x 6 %” x 3/16” Formed Stiffener 4-way Bend

REAR DOOR

11 Gauge Sheet with 4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Tube Frame and %” Safety
Chain

Hinges %" x 77 x 9 and %2” x 3” x 4” Plates with 2”” OD Mechanical
Tube Bushings with Grease Fittings and 1 3/16” Cold Rolled Pin
Non-Sagging Door Must Rest On Floor of Container

DOOR LOCK
Semi-Automatic Cam Locking system w1th three (3). Cams, Self-

Aligning Keeper and Vertical Lift Handle (flat bar) to assure safety

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814
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CIVICBRIDGES B2024-172

OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS A ﬁesf%?"a
ITEM #1 - 9 YARD CLOSED ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR

EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
' TOP/ROOF
11 Gauge Steel with a maximum of two (2) openings per side for a total of
four (4) openings per container X O
Single Wall Plastic Sliding Door (30 x 30”) equipped with a (lockable)
sliding bolt latch 3¢ O
9” Pitched Roof X O
PAINT '
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges X U
All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of
Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of
Low V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase
Order. (SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON '
REQUEST) » _ X - O
SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI 2245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location . X L
DELIVERY _
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully ,
assembled (no “nested” containers) : X 4
Introduced on: December 4, 2024.
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001814



CIVICBRIDGES B2024-172 :

/26MPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS | Bfg%'?gf k53-9
ITEM #2 - 9 YARD CLOSED ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
COMPLIANCE
. YES NO
Size: 9 Yard : d X (|
Doors per side: 2 ' X O
Height Overall: 40” X O
Width Overall: 96” X 0
Length Overall: 155” B¢ 0

STANDARD SPECS

Floor Plate: 7 Gauge

Cross Members: 3” Structural Channel on 16” Centers

Side Rails: 3” Channel ‘

Gussets: 7 Gauge Gusset on every channel

Main Rails: 2” x 6” x 3/16” Structural Tubing

Wheels: 8” x 10” Heavy Duty Ground Rollers - REAR ONLY
Bull Noses: 1 /4” Plate

Guide Rollers: 4” x 6” Heavy Duty Tubing with Grease Fittings
Roller Arms: %” Plate

Hook Plate: %" Plate 12” x 38” Welded Solid Rail to Rail
Cable Hook: 1 4” High Tensile Plate Inserted through Hook Plate, locked
in and welded fully on both sides

Side Sheets: 12 Gauge _ : :

Side Posts/Rear Frame: REAR ONLY - 3” x 5” 7 Gauge Posts

XXX KKKXKKNX X

XX

D

ooodoobooooono oDooboooOooooao

Top Rails: 4” x 3” 11 Gauge Structural Tubing _

Tie Down Bar: %” Hook, Every 24” X

Ladders: 5/8” Solid Round Bar

Tailgate Sheet: 12 Gauge X

Door Framing & Reinforcing: 4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Structural Tubing X

Hinges: %” Plate, 3” x 9” on door and 9” x 9” on sidewall X

Latch System: ' Heavy Duty Self-Aligning Vertical Lift X

Safety Chain: 3" High Test Chain with Receptors on both sides .

Push Plate: 3/16” x 18” x 36” X

DOOR LOCK

Semi-Automatic Cam Locking system with three (3) Cams, Self- Ahgmng

Keeper and Vertical Lift Handle (flat bar) to assure safety X O

TOP/ROOF

11 Gauge Steel with a maximum of two (2) openings per side for a total of

four (4) openings per container | X O

Single Wall Plastic Sliding Door (30” x 30”) equipped with a (lockable)

sliding bolt latch X UJ

9” Pitched Roof _ X O
Introduced on: December 4, 2024 '
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001814



CIVICBRIDGES | B2024-172

/OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Regdidk3-10
ITEM #2 - 9 YARD CLOSED ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
(CONT’D)
' COMPLIANCE
- YES NO

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges : X O

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of -
‘Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of Low
V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase Order.
(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON
REQUEST) ' X] U

" SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI z245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location X | O

DELIVERY
Container to be delivered to 51te in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) X O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814




CIVICBRIDGES
OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

ITEM #3 - 12 YARD CLOSED ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR

EQUAL

- STANDARD DECK

3/16” PL floor :

3” Structural channel on 20” Centers

3/16” PL gussets on every other cross member

Four (4) 8” diameter x 10” LG Heavy Duty Wheels

4” OD x 6” LG with one (1) %2” pin front roller and grease ﬁttmg
Hook Plate: 1” plate 6” x 15

Cable Hook: 1 '4” plate with lifetime guarantee

FRONT AND SIDES

11 Gauge steel

3”x4” x 11 Gauge Top Tube

11 Gauge 3” x 5” formed 4-way bend side stiffener on 24” centers
Columns shall have notches at bottom to prevent moisture retention
11 Gauge Formed corner post wraps around for extra strength and
stability

REAR CORNER POSTS
‘Latch Side: 3” x 4” x 11 Gauge Tube 7
Hinge Side: 3” x 8” x 3/16” formed stiffener 4-way bend

REAR DOOR .
11 Gauge Sheet with 3” x 4” x 11 Gauge Tube frame and %" safety

chain

Hinges: %2” x 9” x 9” and %" x 3” x 9” plates with 2” OD mechanical
tube

Bushings with grease fittings and one (1) 3/16” cold rolled pin
Non-Sagging Door Must Rest On Floor of Container

DOOR LOCK
Semi-automatic cam locking system with three (3) cams, self-aligning
keeper and vertical lift handle (flat bar) to assure safety

- TOP

11 Gauge Steel with three (3) openings on each side for a total of six (6)

per container
Double wall plastic sliding door (30” x 30”) equipped with a Iockable
sliding bolt latch

SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI z245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause

7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location

DELIVERY
Ootitditsed 00:be deHacerekbtd, 8084 in upright position with all doors fully

Adop December 4, 2024
AR A 0GReRSb GaRTALIETS)

B2024-172
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CIVICBRIDGES B2024-172

‘/Q‘OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Res:POK 12
ITEM #5 - 20 YARD OPEN RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED,

- OREQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

Size: 20 Yard O
Height Inside: 44” _ ]
Height Outside: 56” O
Width Overall: 83” L]
Length Overall: 22°9” O
Approximate Weight: 4,760 lbs. X O

STANDARD SPECS

Floor Plate: 7 Gauge

Cross Members: 3” Structural Channel on 16” Centers

Side Rails: 3” Channel '

Gussets: 7 Gauge Gusset on every channel

Main Rails: 2” x 6” x 3/16” Structural Tubing

Wheels: 8” x 10” Heavy Duty Ground Rollers REAR ONLY

Bull Noses: 1'2” Plate

Guide Rollers: 4” x 6” Heavy Duty Tublng with Grease Fittings

Roller Arms: %" Plate

Hook Plate: %4” Plate 12” x 38” Welded Solid Rail to Rail

Cable Hook: 1-1/2” High Tensile Plate Inserted through Hook Plate,

locked in and welded fully on both sides

Side Sheets: 12 Gauge _

Side Posts/Rear Frame: REAR ONLY — 3” x 5” 7 Gauge Posts

Top Rails: 4” x 3” 11 Gauge Structural Tubing

Tie Down Bar: %” Hook, Every 24”

Ladders: 5/8” Solid Round Bar

Tailgate Sheet: 12 Gauge o

Door Framing & Reinforcing: 4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Structural Tubing

Hinges: %" Plate, 3” x 9” on door and 9” x 9” on sidewall '
~ Latch System: ¥2” Heavy Duty Self-Aligning Vertical Lift

Safety Chain: %” High Test Chain with Receptors on both sides

Push Plate: 3/ 16” X 18” X 36”

X

MXXXKXKXKKX

X

OOoo00O0O00000n0 OoOooooooooo

NN XKXKKXKKX

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges

X
]

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of Low
V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of Low

V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on purchase order.
(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON

REQUEST) , , 0

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814



| CIVICBRIDGES
fOMPLIAN CE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS
/1

B2024-172

R Flo313

TEM #5 - 20 YARD OPEN RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED

OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

SAFETY PLACARDS _ _
ANSI 7245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location

DELIVERY _
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers)

Introduced on:‘ December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814 )

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
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CIVICBRIDGES B2024-172

OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS | Reshgle3s4
ITEM #7 - 25 YARD OPEN RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED

OREQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Size: 25 Yard X ]
Height Inside: 55” X U
Height Outside: 78 2" ]
Width Overall: 96 X ]
Length Overall: 22°9” U]
'Approximate Weight: 5,000 1bs. X (I
Doors: three (3) lockable sliding doors on each side X O

STANDARD SPECS

Floor Plate: 7 Gauge Sheet O
Cross Members: 3” Structural Channel on 16” Centers X O
Side Rails: 3” Structura] Channel O
Gussets: ¥4” Gauge Gusset on every channel O
Main Rails: 6” x 2” x 3/16” Structural Tubing ]
Wheels: 8” x 10” Heavy Duty Ground Rollers Front and Rear ]
Bull Noses: 1 ¥2” Plate O
Guide Rollers: 4” x 6” Heavy Duty Tubing w1th Grease Fittings X O
Roller Arms: %2” Plate X O
Hook Plate: % Plate 12” x 38” Welded Solid Rail to Rail J
Cable Hook: 1 ¥»” High Tensile Plate Inserted through Hook Plate, locked

in and welded fully on both sides ]
Side Sheets: 12 Gauge O
Side Posts: 12 Gauge formed plate 3” x 5”, 4-way bend, eleven (11) posts

per side ' O
Top Rails: 4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Structural Tubing X U
Stiffeners: 7 Gauge Plate ‘ O
Tailgate Sheet: 12 Gauge O
Door Framing: 4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Structural Tubing X ]
Reinforcing: 4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Structural Tubing O
Hinges: 2" Plate, 3” x 9” on door and 9” x 9” on sidewall X O
Latch System: %” Heavy Duty Self-Aligning Vertical Lift O
Safety Chain: %” High Test Chain w/ Receptors on both sides O
Roof: 12 Gauge Hip Roof with Lockable sliding lids (three (3) per side) X O
PAINT

Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges. X O

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of Low

V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase Order.

(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON '
I{ﬂmﬁﬂ‘) December 4, 2024 X O

December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814




CIVICBRIDGES B2024-172

OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS RegRg k315
TEM #7 - 25 YARD OPEN RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED,
OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE

. YES NO
SAFETY PLACARDS _ '
ANSI 7245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location : X O
DELIVERY
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) X U
Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001814




CIVICBRIDGES
OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

B2024-172

e 7O

TEM # 10 - 40 YARD CLOSED RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS

SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Size: 40 Yard

Doors per side: 3

Height Inside: 84”

- Height Outside: 99”

Width Overall: 97”

Length Overall: 275
Approximate Weight: 5,700 lbs.

STANDARD DECK

3/16” PL Floor 2 Piece

3” Structural Channel on 20” Centers.

3/16” PL Gussets on every other Cross Member

6” x 2” x 3/16” Tube One Piece Main Rails

Four (4) 8” Diameter x 10” LG Heavy Duty Wheels W/ 1-1/4” Diameter
4” OD x 4” Long Bullnose Rollers W/ 1-1/2” Greasable Pin
1” Cable Hook Plate with 1 1°4” Solid Cable Hook

1” Certified Hook Plate (with lifetime guarantee)

1% Certified Plate Cable Hook (with lifetime guarantee)
172 Plate Solid Bullnose

FRONT AND SIDES*

12 Gauge Sheet

12 Gauge Front Sheet

3”x 4” x 11 Gauge Top Tube

11 Gauge 3” x 5” Formed 4-way Bend Side Stiffener on 24” Centers
Columns have notches at bottom to prevent moisture retention.

11 Gauge Formed Corner Post wraps around for extra strength

REAR CORNER POST '
Latch Side: 3” x 4” x 11 Gauge Tube
Hinge Side: 3” x 8” x 3/16” Formed Stiffener 4-way Bend

REAR DOOR

Swing Door 40 Yard OT

Barn Style Rear Door

11 Gauge Sheet with 3” x 4” x 11 Gauge Tube Frame and %" Safety
Chain

Hinges 2" x 77 x 9” and %" x 3” x 3” Plates with 2” OD Mechanical
Tube Bushings with Grease Fittings and on 3/16” Cold Rolled Pin
Non-Sagging Door shall be designed to rest on the floor of the container

‘Introduced on: Deéember 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814
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CIVICBRIDGES ' B2024-172

%)MPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Reshg k317
TEM # 10 - 40 YARD CLOSED RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS

SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE

- YES NO
DOOR LOCK
Southern Style Latch-Hook and Pin System
Cam Action type door lock, 1-1/4” Cams on 1-1/4” Dia solid bar to 3/8”
Locking Plates. ’
Swing Handle is Securely Welded to a cam assembly rod for easy
Opening and closing operations.
Handle is secured by 1/2”x 2” bar stock with safety chain.
Semi-Automatic Cam Locking system with three (3) Cams, Self-Aligning
Keeper and a Vertical Lift Handle (flat bar) to assure safety

X X
O

X X
0O oo O

X

ROOF
4” Pitch with 12 Gauge Sheets and 3 Channel Support

X
O

WINDOW |
. Three (3) 3’x3” opening on each side o X O

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges. X O

- All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of Low

V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on purchase order.

(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON

REQUEST) . X O

SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI 7z245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location X E]

DELIVERY :
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) - ’ X O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814




. CIVICBRIDGES B2024-172

/OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Reg P k3718
ITEM # 11 - 40 YARD CLOSED RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS

SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Size: 40 Yard B O
Doors per side: 3 O
Height Inside: 84” U
Height Outside: 99” O
Width Overall: 97” X O
Length Overall: 275” O
Approximate Weight: 5,700 Ibs. X ]
STANDARD DECK
3/16” PL Floor 2 Piece O
3” Structural Channel on 20” Centers X O
3/16” PL Gussets on every other Cross Member ]
6” x 2” x 3/16” Tube One Piece Main Rails O
Four (4) 8” Diameter x 10” LG Heavy Duty Wheels W/ 1-1/4” Diameter O
4” OD x 4” Long Bullnose Rollers W/ 1-1/2” Greasable Pin
17 Cable Hook Plate with 1 1°4” Solid Cable Hook X U
1” Certified Hook Plate (with lifetime guarantee) O
1%4” Certified Plate Cable Hook (with lifetime guarantee) X O
1%” Plate Solid Bullnose ' X o
FRONT AND SIDES
12 Gauge Sheet O
12 Gauge Front Sheet X U
3” x 4” x 11 Gauge Top Tube O
11 Gauge 3” x 5” Formed 4-way Bend Side Stiffener on 24” Centers X s
Columns have notches at bottom to prevent moisture retention. O
11 Gauge Formed Corner Post wraps around for extra strength X O
REAR CORNER POST
Latch Side: 3” x 4” x 11 Gauge Tube X O
Hinge Side: 3” x 8” x 3/16” Formed Stiffener 4-way Bend O
REAR DOOR
Swing Door 40 Yard OT X O
Barn Style Rear Door - O
11 Gauge Sheet with 3” x 4” x 11 Gauge Tube Frame and %" Safety
Chain ) ' X O
Hinges %2 x 77 x 9” and %2 x 3” x 3” Plates with 2” OD Mechanical
Tube Bushings with Grease Fittings and on 3/16” Cold Rolled Pin X O
Non-Sagging Door shall be designed to rest on the floor of the container O
Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001814



CIVICBRIDGES B2024-172

/OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS RESTA KA
ITEM # 11 - 40 YARD CLOSED RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS

SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE

YES NO
DOOR LOCK
Southern Style Latch-Hook and Pin System
Cam Action type door lock, 1-1/4” Cams on 1-1/4” Dia solid bar to 3/8”
Locking Plates.
Swing Handle is Securely Welded to a cam assembly rod for easy
Opening and closing operations.
Handle is secured by 1/2” x 2” bar stock with safety chain.
Semi-Automatic Cam Locking system with three (3) Cams, Self-Aligning
Keeper and a Vertical Lift Handle (flat bar) to assure safety

X
(]

X

X KX
I W R R

ROOF ,
4” Pitch thh 12 Gauge Sheets and 3" Channel Support X U

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges. X O

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of
Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of Low
V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on purchase order.
(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON

REQUEST)

X
O

SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI 2z245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause

7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location X O

DELIVERY
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully ‘
assembled (no “nested” containers) X : O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814



CIVICBRIDGES B2024-172

/OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS ' age ké;ﬂ
ITEM #13 - 40 YARD OPEN RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED
OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

Size: 40 Yard X O
Height Inside: 86~ ]
Height Outside: 98” X O
Width Overall: 83” X - [
Length Overall: 22°9” U
Approximate Weight: 6,270 Ibs. O
STANDARD SPECS

Floor Plate: 7 Gauge X

Cross Members: 3” Structural Channel on 16” Centers

Side Rails: 3” Channel

Gussets: 7 Gauge on every channel

Main Rails: 2” x 6” x 3/16” Structural Tubing

Wheels: 8” x 10” Heavy Duty Ground Rollers REAR ONLY

Bull Noses: 1 /2 Plate

Guide Rollers: 4” x 6” Heavy Duty Tubing w1th Grease Fittings
Roller Arms: %" Plate

Hook Plate: /2" Plate 12” x 38” Welded Solid Rail to Rail

Cable Hook: 1 %2” High Tensile Plate Inserted through Hook Plate, locked
in and welded fully on both sides

Side Sheets: 12 Gauge

Side Posts/Rear Frame: REAR ONLY — 3” x 5” 7 Gauge Posts

Top Rails: 4” x 3” 11 Gauge Structural Tubing

Tie Down Bar: %’ Hook, Every 24”

Ladders: 5/8” Solid Round Bar

Tailgate Sheet: 12 Gauge

Door Framing & Reinforcing: 4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Structural Tubing
Hinges: %" Plate, 3” x 9” on door and 9” x 9” on sidewall

Latch System: %2” Heavy Duty Self-Aligning Vertical Lift

Safety Chain: %” High Test Chain with Receptors on both sides
Push Plate: 3/16” x 18” x 36”

X X X X X

OO000o0ooo0O0oOo0o0 ouooooooboo

OXXNNRXKKKX KX

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges

X
O

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase Order.

(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON : '

REQUEST) X O

SAFETY PLACARDS
AN8Iuz2d 6n30-2008cE vr%ard ,2be4- Container Label Reference Clause

ﬁ?é%&m}ggg p?geéc;eéa@&eontamer in visible location X ‘ )



CIVICBRIDGES | B2024-172

/OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS ResB 321
ITEM #13 - 40 YARD OPEN RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED,
OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
DELIVERY
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) : X ]
Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001814



B2024-172

RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC.

Res-Pg:k.3-22

[RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

Line Item Description Quantity uUnit of Measure unit Cost Total Cost Comments: Manufacturer: Delivery, AR.O.. Warranty:

1 9 Yard Closed 2 EA $7,148.00

Recycling Rolloff :
Container -
Ribbed Style As
Specified, or
Equal

Rudco Products, | 715.00 1 Year
Inc.

$14,296.00

2 9 Yard Closed EA . No Bid ~No8id X NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Recycling Rolloff : '
Container - Tub
Style As
Specified, or
Equal

3 12 Yard Closed 4 EA $6,741.00 $26,964.00 Rudco Products, | 1430.00 1 Year
Rolloff ‘ Inc.
Container - ‘
Ribbed Style As
Specified, or
Equal

4 20 Yard Open 6 EA $5,242.00 $31,452.00 Rudco Products, (2145.00 1 Year
Top Rolloff Inc.
/ Container - ' ’

- | Ribbed Style As
’ Specifed, or
Equal

N

5 * |20 Yard Open 2 EA $6,187.00 $12,374.00 Rudco Products, {715.00 1 Year
Top Rolloff Inc.
Container - Tub
Style As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: December 4, 2024

R0 PRODT o [ PRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS
- Page 7




B2024-172

RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC.

Res-Pg:k.3-23
[RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost i Comments: Manufacturer:  Delivery, AR.O.: Warranty:

6 25 Yard Closed 2 EA | $9,099.00 $18,198.00 Rudco Products, | 715.00 1 Year
Rolloff ; Inc.
Container -
Ribbed Style As
Specified, or
Equal

7 25 Yard Open EA No Bid No Bid X NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
Recycling Rolloff
Container - Tub
Style As
Specified or
Equal

8 30 Yard Open - 9 EA $5,596.00 $50,364.00 v Rudco Products, {3575.00 1 Year

Top Rolloff ' Inc.
Container -
Ribbed Style As

Specified, or
Equal

9 30 Yard Open 2 EA $7,021.00 $14,042.00 i Rudco Products, |715.00 1 Year
Top Rolloff Inc.
/ Container - Tub : .
v/ Style As

Specified, or
Equal

10 40 Yard Closed 2 EA $10,099.00 $20,198.00 Rudco Products, | 715.00 1 Year
Top Rolloff Inc.
Container -
Ribbed Style, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopte
ofﬁcialmm OOERE I PRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
- ROLLOFF CONTAINERS
Page 8




B2024-172

RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC.

Res-Pg:k.3-24

[RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ROLLOFF CONTAINERS

Line Iitem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost i Comments: Manufacturer:  Delivery, AR.O.: Warranty:

1 40 Yard Closed 2 EA $9,067.00 $18,134.00 Rudco Products, |715.00 1Year
Top Rolloff Inc.
Container, No
Windows -
Ribbed Style, As
Specified, or
Equal

12 40 Yard Open 8 . EA $6,832.00 $54,656.00 Rudco Products, [2860.00 1Year
Top Rolloff . Inc.
/ Container -
[ . Ribbed Style As ; )

Specified, or
Equal

13 40 Yard Open 2 EA $8,344.00 $16,688.00 Rudco Products, |715.00 1Year
Top Rolloff . Inc.
Container - Tub '
Style As
Specified, or
Equal

14 40 Yard Octagon 2 EA $7,913.00 $15,826.00 Rudco Products, | 715.00 1 Year
Rolloff ' Inc.
v Compactor
Container As
Specified or
Equal

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopte
Official esoFQon&om gﬁl; ]ZR%%PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
- ROLLOFF CONTAINERS
Page 9




RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. B2024-172

Res-Pg:k.3-25
/ COMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Page 6 of 27
ITEM #4 - 20 YARD OPEN TOP ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR

EQUAL
COMPLIANCE
YES NO

FLOOR 3

7 Gauge sheet, two (& pieces, 22’ long

3” structural channel :

Cross members on $§” spacing 0"

Rails: one (1) piece, 2” x 6” x 3/16” structural tube — all prime material
no splits or joints

Solid steel bullnoses inserted into tube for added strength (butt welded on
outside of tubes not acceptable)

Gussets on every other cross member, 7 Gauge

Four (4) wheels, 8” diameter x 8” long with 1 7/16” axle; full welded internal
rim; heavy duty construction. All four (4) wheels must have grease
fittings installed in axle

Rollers - 4” diameter x 4% long. 1 ¥ axle for roller with grease ﬁttmg
must be inserted through the bullnose

Hook — 1'% hi-tensile steel, inserted through 1” thick x 5” x 15” hook
plate, locked in and full welded; both sides.

Hook and hook plate must carry a lifetime guarantee.

omog

X
00 0O Aa0dx

XN >

XN R X
OO0 O O

SIDES

12 Gauge Sheet, 43 high

Structural side tubes of 13 Gauge Steel, 4-way bend, 3” deep x 5” wide,
on 24” centerlines with holes at bottom for drainage '

3” high weld at floor, all additional welds on 15” spacing, approximately
3” long.

Tie down bar on sides only

Bottom of side plate and bottom of formed tubes are full welded to floor
plate on outside.

Top horizontal structural tubes: 3 x 4 x 11 Gauge

Full length prime material, no splits or joints (formed top tube not
acceptable)

XX M & -
O 0o oo o 0O

M MA

DOOR 9

Four (%) horizontal and two (2) vertical structural tubes; all tubes shall be
prime material, one (1) piece, with no splits or joints.

Door Sheet: 12 Gauge Y

Machined hinges 8” long with grease fitting — three (&) hinges on 43”
sides and above with 1 1/16” C.R. Shafts. 'h® x 3%y 4% 4 3% ¢ 4" plae
Four (4) “J” hooks for tarping

Semi-automatic cam locking system with vertical lift handle.

Fabricated from 1% heavy steel bar, “Posi-lock” cams and %2” “Posi-
lock” keepers on door. (Only vertical lift cam lock will be acceptable)
All areas of stress must be reinforced and double welded to ensure

Int-BYX LM protection.ef the nperator.

Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814

MAD ®O
0 O OOR O}
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RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. B2024-172
' Res-Pg:k.3-26

COMPLIANCE PAGES : ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Page 7 of 27
/ ITEM #4 - 20 YARD OPEN TOP ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL (CONT’D) |

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

BULKHEAD
. Two (2) vertical and one (1) horizontal structural tube
Tubes: 12 Gauge Steel, 3” deep x 5” wide
12 Gauge Sheet with corner wraps for bulkhead and dog box of 10
Gauge Plate
Four (4) “J” hooks for tarping’

XX K
OO OO

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges -

X
O

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase .

Order. (SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON '
REQUEST) ' ; ' X O

SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI 2245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location ' X (]

DELIVERY
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) 1% O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814



RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. B2024-172
- Res-Pg:k.3-27

OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS ' Pagev 14 of 27
ITEM #8 - 30 YARD OPEN TOP ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
FLOOR 3
7 Gauge sheet, two (®) pieces, 22’ long
37 structural channel g9
Cross members on P8” spacing
Rails: one (1) piece, 2” x 6” x 3/16” structural tube — all prime material;
no splits or joints
Solid steel bullnoses inserted into tube for added strength (butt-welded
on outside of tubes not acceptable)
Gussets on every other cross member, 7 Gauge
Four (4) wheels, 8” diameter x 8” long with 1 7/16” axle; full welded internal
rim; heavy duty construction. All four (4) wheels must have grease
fittings installed in axle.
" Rollers: 4” diameter x 4 %2 long. 1 ¥ axle for roller with grease ﬁttmg must
be inserted through the bullnose
Hook: 1 %" hi-tensile steel, inserted through 1” thick x 5” x 15” hook
plate, locked in and full welded; both sides. '
Hook and hook plate must carry a lifetime guarantee.

00 O AOX

AR M OXx0O

XY XN K
oo O O

SIDES

12 Gauge Sheet, 62” high

Structural side tubes: 13 Gauge Steel, 4-way bend, 3” deep x 5” w1de
on 24” centerlines with holes at bottom for drainage

3” high weld at floor, all additional welds on 15” spacing, approxmately
3” long

Tie down bar on sides only

Bottom of side plate and bottom of formed tubes are full welded to floor
plate on outside.

Top horizontal structural tubes: 3 x4 x 11 Gauge _

Full length prime material; no sphts or joints (formed top tube not
acceptable)

XM M &

&1 b .
o oo oo o A

X

DOOR 3
. Four (@ horizontal and two (2) vertical structural tubes; all tubes shall
be prime material; one (1) piece with no splits or Jomts
-Door Sheet: 12 Gauge
Machined hinges: 8” long with grease fitting — three (3) hinges on 62”
sides and above with 1 1/16” C.R. Shafis. Y24 x 3%y 4% 4 7% x4+ Pwee
Four (4) “F” hooks for tarping '
Semi-automatic cam locking system with vertical lift handle.
Fabricated from 1 %" heavy steel bar, “Posi-lock” cams and %2” “Posi-
lock” keepers on door. (Only vertical lift cam lock will be acceptable)
All areas of stress must be reinforced and double welded for maximum
Intrbateatien of ths.opgEaiar2024

Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814
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RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. B2024-172 ‘
Res-Pg:k.3-28

COMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS | . Page 150f27
ITEM #8 - 30 YARD OPEN TOP ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL (Cont’d) |

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

BULKHEAD
- Two (2) vertical and one (1) horizontal structural tube
Tubes: 12 Gauge Steel, 3” deep x 5” wide
12 Gauge Sheet with corner wraps for bulkhead and dog box of
10 Gauge Plate '
Four (4) “J” hooks for tarping.

i B
oo 04

Al

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges.

A
O

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase

Order. (SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON

REQUEST) ’ at a

SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI 2245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location L O

DELIVERY :
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) - KN O

Introduced on: Decémber 4,2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814



RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. ' B2024-172
Res-Pg:k.3-29

OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS | Page 16 of 27
ITEM #9 - 30 YARD OPEN RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED

OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

Size: 30 Yard

Height Inside: 66”

Height Outside: 78”

Width Overall: 83" + A ¥3° fromw, 3 back
Length Overall: 22°9”

Approximate Weight: 5,620 Ibs.

HEOK D ®
oomOO0

STANDARD SPECS -

Floor Plate: 7 Gauge \g®

Cross Members: 3” Structural Channel on P§” Centers

Side Rails: 3” Channel

Gussets: 7 Gauge Gusset on every channel

Main Rails: 2” x 6” x 3/16” Structural Tubing

Wheels: 8” x 10” Heavy Duty Ground Rollers REAR ONLY

Bull Noses: 1 2” Plate

Guide Rollers: 4” x 6” Heavy Duty Tubing with Grease Fittings

Roller Arms: '4” Plate

Hook Plate: 2 Plate 12” x 38” Welded Solid Rail to Rail

Cable Hook: 1 %4” High Tensile Plate Inserted through Hook Plate, locked

in and welded fully on both sides

Side Sheets: 12 Gauge

Side Posts/Rear Frame: REAR ONLY - 3" x 5” 7 Gauge Posts

Top Rails: 4” x 3” 11 Gauge Structural Tubing

Tie Down Bar: %” Hook, Every 24” ‘lvl N

Ladders: 5/8” Solid Round Bar :

Tailgate Sheet: 12 Gauge

Door Framing & Reinforcing: 4”x 3" x 11 Gauge Structural Tubing
- Hinges: '2” Plate, 3” x 9” on door and 9” x 9” on sidewall

Latch System: '2” Heavy Duty Self-Aligning Vertical Lift

Safety Chain: %” High Test Chain with Receptors on both sides

Push Plate: 3/16” x 18” x 36”

wyriine

EEOOOCCOCO®D

KNXNRXNXXIORNXAN ODOODXNXMMEDMXXO®R
~
&
2

oo0o0ooooxkOoOooo

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges.

b2
O

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of
Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase Order.
(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON

REQUEST) ~ V! a

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814



RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. ‘ - B2024-172
Res-Pg:k.3-30

OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Page 17 of 27
ITEM #9 - 30 YARD OPEN RECYCLING ROLLOFF CONTAINER-TUB STYLE, AS SPECIFIED,
OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI z245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause _ '
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location _ = O

DELIVERY
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) ’ X a

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814



RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. | B2024-172
: Res-Pg:k.3-31

‘/éOMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Page 22 of 27
ITEM #12 - 40 YARD OPEN TOP ROLLOFF CONTAINER-RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL ' :

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

. FLOOR
7 Gauge sheet, two (2) pieces, 22’ long
3” structural channel
Cross members on 18” spacing
Rails: one (1) piece, 2” x 6” x 3/16” structural tube all prime material;
no splits or joints
Solid steel bullnoses inserted into tube for added strength (butt-welded
on outside of tubes not acceptable)
Gussets on every other cross member, 7 Gauge
Four (4) wheels, 8” diameter x 8” long with 1 7/16” axle; full welded
internal rim; heavy duty construction. All four (4) wheels must have
grease fittings installed in axle.
Rollers: 4” diameter x 4 %4” long. 1 % axle for roller with grease fitting
must be inserted through the bullnose
Hook: 1 4 hi-tensile steel, inserted through 17 thick x 5 x 15” hook
plate, locked in and full welded; both sides.
Hook and hook plate must carry a lifetime guarantee.

OO0 0O EO®A

FE X O@EO

K
ooO O O

X

SIDES

12 Gauge Sheet, 82” hlgh

Structural side tubes: 13 Gauge Steel, 4-way bend, 3” deep x 5” wide,
on 24” centerlines with holes at bottom for drainage

3” high weld at floor, all additional welds on 15” spacing, approximately
3” long. '

Tie down bar on sides only

Bottom of side plate and bottom of formed tubes are fully welded to floor
plate on outside.

Top horizontal structural tubes: 3 x4 x 11 Gauge

Full length prime material; no splits or joints (formed top tube not
acceptable) :

]

24]

My ©X
o oo oo o A

x

DOOR -

Four (4) horizontal and two (2) vertical structural tubes; all tubes shall
be prime material; one (1) piece, no splits or joints.

Door Sheet: 12 Gauge

Machined hinges: 8” long with grease fitting — three (3) hinges on 82”
sides and above with 1 1/16” C.R. Shafts.

Four (4) “J” hooks for tarping

Semi-automatic cam locking system with vertical lift handle.
Fabricated from 1 % heavy steel bar, “Posi-lock” cams and 2" “Posi-
lock” keepers on door. (Only vertical lift cam lock will be acceptable)
All areas of stress must be reinforced and double welded for maximum

intrpaotegtion of the.opesatarzoza
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814
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RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. B2024-172
Res-Pg:k.3-32

/L/OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS . Page 23 of 27
ITEM #12 - 40 YARD OPEN TOP ROLLOFF CONTAINER_RIBBED STYLE, AS SPECIFIED, OR

EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
BULKHEAD
Two (2) vertical and one (1) horizontal structural tube
Tubes: 12 Gauge Steel, 3” deep x 5” wide
12 Gauge Sheet with corner wraps for bulkhead and dog box of
10 Gauge Plate

Four (4) “J” hooks for tarping.

ad oOn0o

RN DB

PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges.

d
O

All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of

Low V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase Order.-

(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON _ _
REQUEST) L g

SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI z245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause ,
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location A a

DELIVERY
Container to be delivered to site in upright posmon with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) pd O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814



RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. ' B2024-172
Res-Pg:k.3-33

fOMPLIAN CE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Page 26 of 27

TEM #14 - 40 YARD OCTAGON ROLLOFF COMPACTOR CONTAINER, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL '

COMPLIANCE

YES
Size: 40 Yard
Height (A): 90”
OA Height Outside (B): 104”
Outside Width (C): 96”
Deck Length: 264”
Overall Length: 273”
Approximate Weight: 7,130 lbs.

NOKRE XM
Doooooof

STANDARD DECK

3/16” PL Floor Sheet

3” Structural Channel on 20” Centers

3/16” PL Gussets on every other Cross Member

6” x 2” x 3/16” Tube One Piece Main Rail

Two (2) 8” Diameter x 10” LG Rear & Two (2) 8” Diameter x 5” LG
Front Heavy Duty Wheels _
4” OD x 6” LG Front Roller with 1 Y2 Pin and Grease Fitting

1” Certified Hook Plate 6” x 15” (with lifetime guarantee)

1 Y% Certified Plate Cable Hook (with lifetime guarantee)

1 14” Plate Solid Bullnose

ARRERE AR
Ooooon0 OoOooa

FRONT AND SIDES

7 Gauge Sheet

Two (2) Fire Ports

8” Taper Front to Rear

Two (2) 6” Vertical Bulkhead Stiffeners

AXRXRN
oOood

REAR CORNER POST
Latch Side 4” x 3” x 3/16” Tube
Hinge Side 4” x 3” x 3/16” Tube

@ &
00

REAR DOOR

11 Gauge Sheet with 4” x 3” x 11 Gauge Tube Frame and %" Safety
Chain

Hinges: %” x 77 x 9” and 4" x 3” x 9” Plates with 2” OD Mechanical
Tube Bushings with Grease Fittings and on 1 3/16” Cold Rolled Pin
Compactor Door Opening Hooks

X K
a

DOOR LOCK
Semi-Automatic Cam Locking system with three (3) Cams and Self-
Aligning Keeper and Vertical Lift Handle (flat bar) is securely welded
to a cam system for easy operation. Handle is secured by a %” solid pin,
© 180 degree turn keyway locking system. > O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001814



RUDCO PRODUCTS, INC. B2024-172

Res-Pg:k.3-34
/OMPLIANCE PAGES - ROLLOFF CONTAINERS Page 27 of 27
ITEM #14 - 40 YARD OCTAGON ROLLOFF COMPACTOR CONTAINER, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL (CONT’D)
COMPLIANCE
‘ YES NO
PAINT
Container to be scraped and ground and free of sharp edges. a
All surfaces to be thoroughly cleaned and primed with one (1) coat of
Low V.0.C alkyd primer or equivalent, followed by one (1) coat of
Low V.0.C enamel or equivalent. Color to be specified on Purchase Order.
(SPECIALTY COLORS MUST BE AVAILABLE UPON _
REQUEST) Dd a
SAFETY PLACARDS
ANSI 2245.30-2008 Figure 7b — Container Label Reference Clause
7.1.5.1.2 Sticker placed on container in visible location pd a
DELIVERY ‘
Container to be delivered to site in upright position with all doors fully
assembled (no “nested” containers) , X - O
Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001814



