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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Barbara Jo Crea

08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn (732)929-2005
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines (732)505-1918
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: July 17, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS to All
American Ford and Winner Ford, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2024-117)

Official Resolution# [2024001085
Meeting Date 07/17/2024
Introduced Date 07/17/2024
Adopted Date 07/17/2024
Agenda ltem m-9

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-117
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER § % g % § % %
Crea v v
Quinn v v v
Haines v v|v
Kelly v

Sadeghi v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON
Michatie \. Guakoor”

Clerk Of The Board
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CONTRACT NO, MUST BE ON ALL
APERS, DOCUMENTS, INVQICES, V

P
‘ -

RESOLUTION
July 17,2024

WHEREAS, on June 25, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS
AND SUVS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
All American Ford Winner Ford

3698 U.5. Highway 9 250 Berlin Road

Old Bridge, NJ 08857 Cherry Hill, NJ 08034

(732) 672-1917 (856) 214-0759

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, namely that of, ALL AMERICAN FORD and WINNER FORD be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into a contract for the furnishing and delivery of MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND
SUVS for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through July 16,
2025, a period of one (1) year or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County
reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. ALL AMERICAN FORD for twenty seven (27) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 2, 2a, 2b, 2¢, 2d, 2e, 2f, 2g, 2h, 2i, 2j, 2k, 21, 2m, 2n, 20, 2p, 2q, 2r, 2s, 2t, 2u,

2v, 2w and 2x.

For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 2 - 2x) of $2,232,689.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
B. WINNER FORD for twenty six (26) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 1a, 1b, 1¢, 14, 1e, 1f, 1g, 1h, 1i, 1j, 1k, 1I, Im, In, 1o, 1p, 1q, Ir, 1s, 1t, 1u,

1v, lw, 1x and 1y.

For a Total Tump Sum Award (Item #s 1 - 1ly) of $1,237,300.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

Introduced on July 17, 2024
Adopted on: July 17, 2024
Official Resolytjon#: 2024001085
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2. Payments for the equipment and services to be acquired by this-contract
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Qcean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations
and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the equipment and services shall be available within
the following funding Sources: Vehicle Services Department O.E.

4, The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-117.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of

'Finance, Vehicles Services Department and the successtul bidders.

Introduced on: July 17, 2024
Adopted on: July 17, 2024
Official Resoluti¢n#: 2024001085
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[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

[ine ftem Description Quantity Unit of Megasure Lnit Cost Tol No Bid Year/Make/Model:  Delivery, AR.Q. Comments:

v Ford Factory 20 EA, $2.00 $40.00 . 2% discount on
Instalted factory installed
Options, As ! aptiens
Specified

) iw Diagnostie 3 SET $9,600.00 $28,800.00
W Tools/Test

. Equipment, As
Specified

1x Twao-Way Radio 20 EA $125.00 $2,500.00
Power and
Wirlng
Requiraments
for New
Vehicles, As
Specified

1y Installation of 20 EA $925.00 418,500.00
County Supptied . |
Two Way Radio ‘ : i
and Accessories, : :
As Specified

TOTAL o $1,336,457.00

FT

ITEM #2 - CURRENT MQDEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Unit Cost. No Bid

$45,488.00

Uine {tem Descnption Quantity Unit of Meastre Year/Make/Model: Delivery, AROZ  Comments?

Current Maodel 5909,760.00 -
Year, or Newer,
Ford Interceptor
Utllity, As
Specified or

Equal

OPTIONS . | - ' ‘
Introduced on® July 17, 2024~ — ' ) - . — -
Ao Eeronse pocovET RO —
W Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND 5UVS * " o 4 ; : -

Page 10
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[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MQTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

e item Description Quivantity Unit of Measura Uriit Cost, No Bid Year/Make/Model:  Delivery; ARD.:  Commants:

2a Ford Factory 20 EA $2.00 540.00 : ) 2% discount on
Installed . factory instailed
Options, As ‘ ‘ options

$pecified

2b 1Ford Protect 20 EA 54,350.00 %87,000.00
ExtraCare
Extended
| 5ervice Plan, As
Specified

2¢ Patrol Package, 20 EA ' 517,850.00 $357,000,00
As Specified

2d  |Warrants 20 EA $15950.00 | $319,000,00
Package, As
Specified

2e  |Admin Package, 20 EA $8,950.00 $179,000.00 |
As Specified o

2f Prosecutar's 20 : EA $6,450.00 $129,000.00
Package, As
Speciflad

28 Panasonic 20 EA §275.00 55,500.00
Toughbook CF-
33 Docking !
Station with
Integrated
Pawer Supply, :
As Specified ' -

SS SOS S S S

2h Ford Police 20 EA $500.00 510,000.00
\/ Interceptor %
Utility Pedestal !
System Kit, As
Specified

Introduced on: July' 17, 2024
é?f‘,’c":;,mw AR Bl HESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
IOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS
Rage 1.
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[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT ‘

‘ Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Ling ifam Deseiiption Quantity {init.of Measure, Unit Cost Total No Bid Yaar/Make/Model:  Delivery, AR.O.:  Comments:

\/ 1] Split Cage 20 EA $500.00 © $10,000.00
‘Partition :

{Installed), As

Specified

/ 2] OpenTop Tray 20 EA $1,454.15 $29,083.00 , :
A w/ Anchor . ]
|Points & Lower :
Drawar
Combination
Lock (Installed), -
As Specified

2k Freestanding 20 EA $203.15 $4,063.00
Mount Kit
{Installed), As
Specified

21 Dual Weapon, 20 EA $957.15 519,143.00
. Lock Blac = Rac

{Installed), As
Specified

Bumper with
Integrated Oual
Colar Lights
{Installed), As

; | Specified

// 2m Aluminum Push 20 EA $950.00 $19,000.00 - N

n | Dual Color LED 20 EA 51,049.00 $20,980.00 |
/ Light Bar with i
Vehicle Spacific " i
Mounts 1
{Installed), As ' ‘
Speclfied '
/ 20 Harness 20 EA $25.00 $500.00
{Installed), As :
Specified
Ly 17 2024

‘

=

Introduced-on:— ) : -
Adopte g =
oopted AT AN cﬁ\[ gqugzﬁespomm DOCUMENTREPORT . T _,1
Bid - M TOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS ,
Page 12
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[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
MQTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Une ftem Deseription Quantity Unlt of Measure, Unit Cost Total No Bid Yoar/Make/Madel: Delivery, AR Comiments?

$2,900.00 i

2p Dual Color 0 EA " sus.00
\/ Warning Light, .
As Specifiad

Installation Kit,

/ 2q ‘| Gatac AL40 20 EA 51,595.00 $31,900.00
As Specified

2 Whelen: 0 EA $950.00 $19,000.00

IX2ZAAAA Liberty :
I, Solo IX Low

Current Saries
{Installed) Light
‘Bar- 547, As
Specified

2s Light Color 20 EA % 4L00 $20.00
Optlon, As 1
Specifled

2t 54 Inch Lightbar 20 EA $1,850.00 $37,000.00
{Installed), As 4
Specified

2u Prisoner Divider 20 " EA $500.00 $1o,oooloo
Wall {Installed),
As Specified

2y Diagnostic 3 SET $9,600.00 428,800.00
Taols/Test
Equipmeant, As
Specifiad

2w Two-Way Radio 20 EA $50.00 $1,000.00
Power and
Wirlng
Requirements
for New
Vehicles, As : ‘
Specified i + i
Introduced on: July 17, 2024

odopte A1 AMERICMYPARIIERESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT, o , o ‘ S

Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS : ‘ , ' i
Page 13 i
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[ALL AMERICAN FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD | |
MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS : :

Quantity Unit of Measuire, Unit Cast. Delvery, ARQ:  Comments:

Tatal Na fid Yaar/Make/Model:

line ltem Déscription

\/ % Installation of 30 $150.00 $3,000.00
‘ County Supplied
Twa Way Radio
and Accessories, y
As specified ‘ !
TOTAL $2,232,689,00
i
I
|
1
Introduced on: Ju;y 17,2024 )
Adopte : ' P " : = : —
Official I Fé&‘f@q@&éfﬁ§PONSE DOCUMENT..REPORT ! |
Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS Lo

Page 14



| COMPLIANCE PAGES — MOTOR VERfeh AMERECANBERPs ReRR At 79

ﬁTEM #2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR., OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL,

COMPLIANCE
DESCRIPTION YES NO

Model Year 2025 or Newer Pohce Interceptor Utility
AWD 3.3L V6 Direct-Injection FFV with 10- speed automatic transmission (99B/44U)
250- Amp Alternator

HS8 AGM Battery (850 CCA/92-amp)

Suspension — Independent front & rear

Brakes
- 4-Wheel heavy duty disc w/heavy duty front and rear calipers
- Pdlice calibrated high-performance regenerative braking system
- Anti-lock brakes with Traction Control X,

Class III Trailer hitch receiver with 5,000 Ibs. towing capacity and 2 recovery hooks
(Included Class IH Trailer Tow nghtmg Package) X O

Column. Shifter X O

Headlamps
- Automatic, LED Low-and-High-Beam (Includes front headlamp/Police
Interceptor Housing)
- Pre-Drilled hole for side marker police use, does not include LED strobe, but
includes LED mg—wag functionality
- Pre-molded side warning LED holes with standard sealed capability (does not
_include LED installed lights)
- Wig-wag default is traditional ping-pong pattern; can be programmed to triple
" burst pattern or ping-pong/iriple burst. X O
Wheels
- 18" x 8.0 painted black steel with polished stainless stee] hub cover
. - Full size 18” spare tire with TPMS (Same speed rating as original tire)
- Tire —255/60R18 A/S BSW X .
Seats —
- Front — Police Grade cloth Trim, dual front buckets with reduced bolsters
- 1% row—Driver 6-way power track with 2 way power lumbar,
- 1% row — Passenger 8 Power-way power track with 2-way power recline and 2-
. way power lumbar.
- Built-in steel intrusion plate in both front-seatbacks ,
- 2% row- vinyl, 35/30/35 split bench.seat X

Flooring — Heavy Duty Thermoplastic Elastomer ' X

Speedometer — New LCD 12.3 display calibrated (includes digital readout) X
Hidden Door-lock Plunger w/rear door controls inoperable (locks, handlies and
windows) (Pkg. 52P) " o o X

Interior Lighting —
: --Qverhead console... .. ... a2 2 & = & e e
" Red/White Task L1ghtmg in Overhead Console X O

M OoxX X o M
oooo o

O

‘o0 ooOoo

Introduced on: July 17, 2024
Adopted on: July 17, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001085
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ITEM # 2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
DESCRIPTION (CONT’D)
Speed (Cruise) Control X O
AdvanceTrac with Roll Stability X O
Rearview Camera viewable in 8” center stack X I
Audio
- AM/FM
- Sync Phoenix
8” Color LCD Screen Center-stack “Smart Display” X [
Interior Color — Charcoal Black ' O
PAINT . .
Color to be specified from standard color chart on Purchase Order when ordering X ]
WARRANTY
3 year/36,000 miles bumper to bumper X O
5 year/100,000 miles power train CARE Extended service plan (zero deductible) X O
PTIONS
2A. Ford Factory Instalied Options
percentage discount from Manufacturer’s Suggested Retail Price (List Price)
Bidders shall supply list with bid ' X 1
/ 2B. Ford Protect ExtraCare Extended Service Plan
overing 113 components. 8 years/125,000 miles with $0.00 deductible. X" (]

2C. Patrol Package

In an effort to maintain consistency and uniformity among all light parterns in
emergency vehicles in the fleet, the County requires the use of SoundQff Signal
BluePrint Control System for lightbars and lighting.

Emergency Lighting Equipment (Colors to be detérmined at time of Order)
Vehicle should be configured with the following options:
‘e Ignition Security System — Button on Siren keypad activates Ignition Security
System.

o Park Flash — All warning lights flash an alternating single flash @ 1.2 FPS, Only
one color displaying per flash.

e Diagnostics and Fault Log — On board diagnostic and log to help diagnose and
record any issues.

o Remote Configuration— Vehicle Setup to have support login to electrical control
~ gystem via vehicle PC.

‘& Cat-to-Car Sync — Warning system to syne from vehicle to vehicle. Must —- - -
integrate with system deployed in current vehicles.
Introduced on: July 17, 2024

Adopted on: July 17, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001085
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ATEM #2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS
"SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

QPTIQNS (CONT’D)
2C. Patrol Package (Cont’d) —
1 - 54" Lightbar Dual Colorwith 12 LED Inboard & 24 LED Corners
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENNLBOOLCV-27Z). Includes Photo Cell Sensor
1 - Activate Factory Headlight Flasher
2 - Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single nght Kit, 9-32 VDC w/25 Five

. Wire Harness Insert White (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ELUC3H025W) with
- Waterproof Connectors

.2 - Twist-lock Adapter for LED Insert (Soundoff Signal Part Number PLUCTCL1)
2 — Single Recess Mount Light, SAE Class 1, 10-16v, Black Housing, 12 LED
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFSRS3) with Waterproof Connectors

2 - Intersector Under Mirror/Surface Mount Light, 9-32 Vde, w/ 4-Wedges, Mounting
Gasket & Hardware, 16 LEDs (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENT2B3)

2 - Single Deck/Grille Mount 12 LED Lights
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFS(GS83) with Connector
4 - Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single Light Kit
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ELUC3H025)
1 - Rear Lightbar Dual Color - Ford Utility
" (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBREFF0)

2 - 4" Fascia Light w/ Stud Mount, 18" Hard Wire w/ Sync Option, SAE Class 1 & CA
« Title 13, 9-32 Vde, Black Housing, 12 LED
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: EMPS28TS54)

2 - 6 Inch Round Interior Light Red/White Chrome Trim Ring
(Techniq Part Number: E20-WCOR-1)

1 - 200 Watt Remote Siren (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGSA07152)

- 4" Fascia Light w/ Stud Mount, 18" Hard Wire w/ Sync Option, SAE Class 1 & CA
Title 13, 9-32 Vdc, Black Housing, 12 LED .
" (Soundoff Signal Part Number; EMPS2STS4)

2 - 100 Watt Professional Siren Speaker
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSS100T) with Waterproof Connectors

2 - Vehicle Specific Bumper Mount Siren Speaker Bracket
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSSVBKO1)

1 - 200 Watt 500 Series Siren / Light Conttoller
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGSAS582RSR)

1.— Sync Module — (Soundoff Signal Part Number ENGSYMDO1)
1 — Vehicle Integration Module - (Soundoff Signal Part Number ENGLNK.002)
3 — Remote Node (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGND04101)

1 Plug & Play Engine Bay Hamess Plugs into Soundoff Node and All L1ghtheads
- = -with Waterproof Connectors - - - -

1 - Plug & Play Hatch Harness Plugs into Soundoff Node. with Waterproof Connector
ijptofised &itility Wiive Tlzoatess and Flectronics Tray

R B8 Veliplothat 18ifaber: EL WH Utility Tray)
1 - 20% Window Tint Front Windows

COMPLIANCE
YES  NO



- 1

COMPLIANCE PAGES — MOTOR VEATCE A EBEE NERRDs Re<2PigHoH172
/ TTEM #2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER. FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
PTIONS (CONT’D)

J2C. Patrol Package (Cont’d) —

Prisoner Transportation & Accessories

1 - Vehicle Specific Front Prisoner Partition with Coated Poly & Sliding Window
(Setina Part Number: PK1130ITU20TM)

1.- Vehicle Sﬁeciﬁc Rear Partition Coated Polycarbonate
(Setina Part Number: PK0316ITU202ND)

'1 - Vehicle Specific Steel Vertical Window Barriers.
(Setina Part Number: WK05141TU20)

1 - Dual T-Rail Weapon Mount System XL Lock w/ Key Override
© "(Setina Part Number: GK20041 UHKSVSCAXL)

1 - Full Replacement Transport Seat TPO Plastic, with Center Pull Seat Belts
(Setina Part Number: QK0634ITU20)

1 - Aluminum Push Bumper with 4 Integrated Dual Color Lights
(Setina Part Number;: BK20441TU20) with Waterproof Connector

Console & Computer Equipment

1 - Ford Utility Police Console Kit — (Elite Vehicle Part Number: EL Utility Console)
1 - 9" Locking Slide Arm (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7160-1216-09)

2 - Power Distribution Block w/ Negative Bus
. (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7160-0313)

1"- Faceplate for Motorola XTL 2500-5000
(Gamber-Johnson Part Nurnber: 7160-0321)

1 - Faceplate for Soundoff 480 Control Head
. ‘(Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7160-0339)

2 - Console Specific: Side Mounted Mic Clip
(Gamber-Johnson Part Number: MCS-EPICMIC)

1 - PC Antenna (Antennas Plus part Numbet: SH-T900)

1 - Mobile Radio Antenria Kit (Motorola Part Number: RAF4226A)

1 - Mobile Radio Anténna Kit (Motorola Part Number: HAE6035A)

1 - Mobile Radio GPS Kit (Motorola Part Number: HAG4000B)

1 - Install 2 County Supplied Motorola Radios X []

Introduced on: July 17, 2024
Adopted on: July 17, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001085
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I |

TEM # 2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY., AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT"D)

COMPLIANCE
— ' | YES NO

QPTIONS (CONT’D)
2D. Warrants Package
In an effort to maintain consistency and uniformity among all light patterns in

emergency vehicles in the fleet, the County requires the use of SoundQff Signal
BluePrint Control System for lightbars and lighting.

Emergency Lighting Equipment (Colors to be determined at time of Order)

Vehicle should be configured with the following options:
- o Ignition Security System — Button on Siren keypad activates Ignition Security
© System.
¢ Park Flash — All warning lights flash an alternating single flash @ 1.2 FPS, Only
one color displaying per flash.
) Dxagnostlcs and Fault Log — On board dlagnostlc and log to help d1agnose and
record any issues.
¢ Remote Configuration— Vehicle Setup to have support login to electrical control
system via vehicle PC.
s Car-to-Car Sync — Warning system to sync from vehicle to vehicle. Must
integrate with system deployed in current vehicles.
1 - Vehicle Specific Dual Color Light Bar w/ TD 12LED
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBF)

1 - Activate Factory Headlight Flasher

2 - Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single Light Kit,
9-32 VDC w/25’ Five Wire Harness Insert White
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ELUC3H025W) with Waterproof Connectors

2 - Twist-Lock Adapter for LED Insert (Soundoff Signal Part Number PLUCTCL1)

2 - Single Recess Mount Light, SAE Class 1, 10-16v, Black Housing,
_ 12 LED (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFSRS3) with Waterproof Connectors

2 - Intersector Under Mirror/Surface Mount Light, 9-32 Vide, w/ 4-Wedges,
Mounting Gasket & Hardware, 16 LEDs (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENT2B3)

2 - Single Deck/Grille Mount 12 LED Lights
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFSGS3) with Connector

4 - Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single Light Kit
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ELUC3H025)

1 - Rear Lightbar Tri Color - Ford Utility
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBRFF0)
2 - 4" Fascia Light w/ Stud Mount, 18" Hard Wire w/ Sync Option,
SAE Class 1 & CA Title 13, 9-32 Vdc, Black Housing, 12 LED
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: EMPS25TS4)
2 - 6 Inch Round Interior Light Red/White Chrome Trim Ring
(Techntiq Pait Number: E20-WCOR-]1) 1 - 200 Watt Remote Siren -
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGSA07152)

MteadiicBasnia Lightiw S08d Mount, 18" Hard Wire w/ Sync Option,

off.m;mﬁm S 28 13, 9-32 Vde, Black Housing, 12 LED
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: EMPS28TS4)



OMPLIANCE PAGES -~ MOTOR VEf el A FRICANEI RN ResPpag-h 944
ITEM # 2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT'D)

~ @PTIONS (CONT’D)
2D. Warrants Package (Cont’d)

2 - 100 Watt Professional Siren Speaker
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSS100J) With Waterproof Connectors

2 - Vehicle Specific Bumper Mount Siren Speaker Bracket
* (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSSVBK01)

1 <200 Watt 500 Series Siren / Light Controller
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGSA582RSR)

1 - Sync Module — (Soundoff Signal Part Number ENGSYMDO1)
1- Vehncle Integration Module - (Soundoff Signal Part Number ENGLNKOOZ)
'3 - Remote Node (Soundoff Signal Part' Number: ENGND04101)

| 1 - Plug & Play Engine Bay Harness — Plugs into Soundoff Node and All
Lightheads with Waterproof Connectors

1= Plug & Play Hatch Harness Plugs into Soundoff Node with Waterproof Connector

I - Ford Utility Wire Harness and Electronics Tray
_ (Elite Vehicle Part Number: EL WH Utility Tray)

1 - 20% window, Tint Front Windows

Prisoner Transportation & Accessories
1 - Vehicle Specific Front Prisoner Partition with ‘
Coated Poly & Sliding Window (Setina Part Number: PK1130ITU20TM)

1 - Vehicle Specific Rear Partition Coated Polycarbonate
(Setina Part Number: PK0316]1TU202ND)

1 - Vehicle Specific Steel Vertical Window Barriers
(Setina Part Number: WK0514ITU20)

1 - Dual T-Rail Weapon Mount System XL Lock w/ Key Override
(Setina Part Number: GK20041UHKSVSCAXL)

1 - Full Replacement Transport Seat TPO Plastic, with Center Pull Seat Belts
(Setina Part Number: QK06341TU20)

Console & Computer Equipment
1 - Ford Utility Police Console Kit (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7170-0166-01)

1 -9" Locking Slide Arm (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7160-1216-09)
1 - Faceplate for Motorola XTL 2500-5000 (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7160-0321)

1 - Faceplate for Soundoff 480 Control Head
(Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 71 60-0339)

2 = Console Specific Side Mounted Mic Clip
(Gamber-Johnson Part Number: MCS-EPICMIC)

1:- Mobile Radio Antenna Kit (Motorola Part Number: RAF4226A) -
1 - Mobile Radio Antenna Kit (Motorola Part Number; HAE6035A)
uItd ke Radic'@PR-Ri4 Motorola Part Number: HAG4000B)

dopted on: July 17, 2024

?fﬁﬁhﬁﬁﬁ?'%@tﬁuﬁwmﬁﬂwd Motorola Radios X O

COMPLIANCE,
YES NO
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/ ITEM # 2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

OPTIONS (CONT’D)
2E. Admin Package
In an effort to maintain consistency and uniformity among all light patterns in

emergency vehicles in the fleet, the County requires the use of SoundOff Signal
BluePrint Control System for lightbars and lighting.

Emergency Lighting Equipment (Colors to be determined at time of Order)

Vehicle should be configured with the following options:

o Ignition Security System — Button on Siren keypad activates Ignition Security
System.

o Park flash — All warning lights flash an alternating single flash @ 1.2 FPS, Only
one color displaying per flash

o Diagnostics and fault log — On board diagnostic and log to help diagnose and
record any issues

» Remote Configuration— Vehicle Setup to have support login to electrical control
system via vehicle PC

e Car-to-car sync — Warning system to sync from vehicle to vehicle. Must
integrate with system deployed in current vehicles.

1 - Vehicle Specific Dual Color Light Bar w/ TD 12 LED
(SoundOff Signal Part Number: ENFWBF

1 - Activate Factory Headlight Flasher

4 - Single Deck/Grille Mount 12 LED Lights
(SoundOff Signal Part Number: ENFSGS3) with Waterproof Connectors

2'- Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single Light Kit )
(SoundOff Signal Part Number: ELUC3H025W) with Waterproof Connectors

2 - Single 12LED Recess Mount Lights
(SoundOff Signal Part Number: ENFSRS3) with Waterproof Connectors

2 - Single Deck/Grille Mount 12 LED Lights
. (SoundOff Signal Part Number: ENFSGS3)

2 - Intersector Under Mirror/Surface Mount Light, 9-32 Vdc, w/ 4-Wedges,
Mounting Gasket & Hardware, 16 LEDs (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENT2B3)

2, - Single Deck/Grille Mount 12 LED Lights
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFSGS3) with Connector

4 - Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single Light Kit
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ELUC3HO025)

1 - Rear Lightbar Tri Color - Ford Utility
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBRFEQ)

2 - 4" Fascia Light w/ Stud Mount, 18" Hard Wire w/ Sync Option,
SAE Class 1 & CA Title 13, 9-32 Vdc, Black Housing, .
12 LED (Soundoff Signal Part Number: EMPS28TS4)

2 - 6 Inch Round Interior Light Red/White Chrome Trim Ring
(Techniq Part Number: E20-WCOR-1) 1 - 200 Watt Remote Siren

e SGEhAn T Sight Baffumber: ENGSA07152)

Official Resolution#: 2024001085

COMPLIANCE
YES NO



COMPLIANCE PAGES — MOTOR VERch SMFRE ME DS RedFg: A LA

"ITEM # 2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY. AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

¢ JPTIONS (CONT’D)
2E. Admin Package (Cont’d)
2 - 100 Watt Professional Siren Speaker
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSS1007) with Waterproof Connectors
2 - Vehicle Specific Bumnper Mount Siren Speaker Bracket
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSSVBKO01)
1 - 200 Watt 500 Series Siren / Light Controller
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGSA582RSR)
1 - Sync Module — (Soundoff Signal Part Number ENGSYMDO1)
1 - Vehicle Integration Module - (Soundoff Signal Part Number ENGLNK002)
3 - Remote Node (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGND04101)

1 - Plug & Play Engine Bay Harness — Plugs into Soundoff Node and All
Lightheads with Waterproof Connectors

1 - Plug & Play Hatch Harness Plugs into Soundoff Node with Waterproof Connector

1 - Ford Utility Wire Harness and Electronics Tray '
(Elite Vehicle Part Number: EL WH Utility Tray)

1 - 20% window Tint Front Windows

Console & Computer Equipment

1 - Ford Utility Police Console Kit (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7170-0166-01)

1 - 9" Locking Slide Arm (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7160-1216-09)

1 - Faceplate for Motorola XTL 2500-5000 (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7160-0321)

- Faceplate for Soundoff 480 Control Head
_(Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7160-0339)

2 - Console Specific Side Mounted Mic Clip
- (Gamber-Johnson Part Number: MCS-EPICMIC)

1 - Mobile Radio Antenna Kit (Motorola Part Number: RAF4226A)

1 - Mobile Radio Antenna Kit (Motorola Part Number: HAE6035A)

1 - Mobile Radio GPS Kit (Motorola Part Number: HAG4000B)

1 - Install 2 County Supplied Motorola Radios X O

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

Introduced on: July 17, 2024
Adopted on: July 17, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001085



COMPLIANCE PAGES — MOTOR VEH R SMERECANDRERs Re<mg:H A7

\/ ITEM # 2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS

SPECIFIED. OR EQUAL (CONT’D)
. COMPLIANCE

YES NO

HPTIONS (CONT’D)
2F.

Prosecutor’s Package
In an effort to maintain consistency and uniformity among all light patterns in
emergency vehicles in the fleet, the County requires the use of SoundQff Signal
BluePrint Control System for lightbars and lighting.

Emergency Lighting Equipment (Colors to be determined at time of Order)
Vehicle should be configured with the following options:

¢ Ignition Security System — Button on Siren keypad activates Ignition Security
System.
o Park flash — All warning lights flash an alternating single flash @ 1.2 FPS, Only
one color displaying per flash
e Diagnostics and fault log — On board diagnostic and log to help diagnose and
, record any issues
e Remote Configuration— Vehicle Setup to have support login to electrical control
" system via vehicle PC
e Car-to-car sync — Warning system to sync from vehicle to vehicle. Must
integrate with system deployed in current vehicles. No subscription fee.

1 - Vehicle Specific Dual Color Light Bar w/ TD 12LED
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBF)

4 - Single Deck/Grille Mount 12 LED Lights
. (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFSGS3)

1 - Activate Factory Headlight Flasher

4 - Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single Light Kit
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ELUC3HO025W)

2 - Single 12LED Recess Mount Lights (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFSRS3)

4 - Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single Light Kit
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ELUC3H025)

1 - Rear Lightbar Dual Color - Ford Utility (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBRF)
1 - 200 Watt Remote Siren (Sotmdoff Signal Part Number: ENGSA07152)

1 - 15 Programmable Button w/ 3 Position Slide Switch Controller
~ (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGCP18001)

2 - 100 Watt Professional Siren Speaker (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSS100N)

2 - Vehicle Specific Bumper Mount Siren Speaker Bracket
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSSVBKO1)

1 - 100 Amp Central Controller (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGCC01241)

1 - Sync Module — (Soundoff Signal Part Number ENGSYMDO01)

1 - Vehicle Integration Module - (Soundoff Signal Part Number ENGLNK002)

T}%&%Canﬂﬁﬁ%&s Kit (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGHINKO1)

opted on: 7, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001085



OMPLIANCE PAGES ~ MOTOR VEHtek AMERECANG AR ResPRug: i 0018

ITEM # 2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR. OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
PTIONS (CONT’D)
2F. Prosecutor’s Package (Cont’d)
1 - Remote Node (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGND04101)

1 - Remote Node Harness (Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGHNK02)

1 - Ford Utility Wire Harness and Electronics Tray - Ford Utility Vehicle
Specific Electronics Tray and Harness. Tray and Harness is designed for
Minimal Connection Points and Seamless Integration of Aftermarket Electronics
into Vehicle Upfitter Connectors. No Cutting or Splicing of any Vehicle Wires.
Tray - Aluminum Tray fits behind Rear OE Panel. Electronics Control System,
Power & Ground Distribution should be preinstalled onto tray. Harness —
GXL Funetion Labeled Wire. Wires should have no connections in line,
Wires terminated on both ends with Plug-N-Play Connectors. Vehicle Side
of Harness should have OEM Spec Terminals and Cormectors, terminated with
Tool Press Applicator to OE Spec.

1 - DBUtility2021 — Vehicle Specific Dash Bracket- Dash bracket consists of
Light Gauge Steel with a Black Powder Coating, It is to be mounted near the
Factory AM/FM Radio without drilling any holes in the Vehicle.

“The Bracket is to have the Amps Hole Pattern.

1 - Mobile Radio Antenna Kit (Motorola Part Number: RAF4226A)
1 - Mobile Radio Antenna Kit (Motorola Part Number: HAE6035A)
1 - Mobile Radio GPS Kit (Motorola Part Number: HAG4000B)
1 - Install County Supplied Motorola Radios
[ - 20% Window Tint Front Windows & Strip on Windshield ° X
2G. Panasonic Toughbook CF-33 Docking Station with Integrated Power Supply
(Dual RF, Standard Lock) (Installed)(Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7170-0684-02)
2H. Ford Police Interceptor Utility Pedestal System Kit
(Installed)(Gamber-Johnson Part Number: 7170-0814-01) X
2. Split Cage Partition (Installed)
(Setina Part Number; 1K0574ITU20FR) X
2J. Open Top Tray w/ Anchor Points & Lower Drawer Combination Lock

(Installed)
Setina Part Number: TK.0236ITU20) X

2K. Freestanding Mount Kit (Installed)
Setina Part Number: GF10921TU20) X

2L. Dual Weapon Lock Blac — Rac (Installed)
Setina Part Number: GK11222B) X
2M. Aluminum Push Bumper with Integrated Dual Color Lights (Installed

\/Setma Part Number: BK20441TU20) X

N. Dual Color LED Light Bar with Vehicle Specific Mounts (Installed)
oundoff Signal Part Number: EN'FWBRF) X

20. Harness (Installed) - - s in DR
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: PCPNRCNGI) X

MLM&!LMALL
speci e of order (Installed) )
?ﬁ’m’% sf?e I(Eg)r‘?lli!al%?Slé umber: EMPS28TS84) X

>
o o o o

g o o0 oo o

O



COMPLIANCE PAGES — MOTOR VEERET AMEBHCANBWRPs ResPRgs:h.0£19

/ITEM # 2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY. AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE

YES NO
OPTIONS (CONT’D)

/ 2Q. Getac A140 Installation Kit

Close to Dash Bracket (Hint Part Number TM-5126-PIU-20)
Power Supply (Lind Part Number (GE1950-3709)
KeyBoard (iKey Part Number: IK-38-TP-USB)
Docking Station — (Gamber Johnson Part Number: 7160-1247-03) X O
2R. Whelen: IX2AAAA Liberty II, Solo IX Low Current Series (Installed)
Light Bar- 54”, Fully loaded with all Amber, LED’s which includes 4 Corners,
Four (4) Front Facing and 6 Rear Facing and Bar also includes Two (2) White Take
Down Lights in Front, Two (2) White Alley Light, Corner light wired on a

eparate Switch. X O
28. Light Color Option
Red and Blue Modules in lieu of amber for Sheriff Department or OEM, keeping the

ber Rear Arrow Stick. X O

2T, 54 inch Lightbar (Installed)
Color to be determined at time of order.
Fully Populated, Dual Color, Low Profile Mount with Solar Panel.

‘Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENNLB0OLMM-29L) X O
2U. Prisoner Divider Wall (Installed)
This wall prust work with the items listed in the Prisoner Transportation & Accessories
sections in the above packages
(Setina Part Number: 2K0035ITU20PFRTM) X O

\/ZV‘. Diagnostic Tools / Test Equipment
1. Successful bidder may be required to supply between one (1) to three (3) complete
sets of OEM (Original Equipment Manufactured) test/diagnostic/programming
equipment (i.e. laptop, software, cabling, and adapters) and special tools required to
perform the full range of diagnostic and maintenance actions necessary to maintain
vehicle operability. This equipment will cover the vehicle chassis, engine, transmission,
brakes, hydraulics, and all additional equiprnent (if applicable). Examples of OEM
diagnostics are as follows: Ford IDS, Cummins Quickserv, Mack Tech Tool, John

Deere Service Advisor, Freightliner Diagnostic Link X |

/2. All laptop computers will be of the newest available technology and have sufficient

storage and memory to operate all required software. X O

3. Provide a list of all test/diagnostic/programming equipment and special tools being

supplied at the time of bid. X O

4. All software installations and activations will be completed by the successful bidder

at no cost to the County. X OJ

5. All software updates and renewal will be provided at no cost to the County for a

period of five (5) years from the acceptance of the equipment. X [l

6. All technical issues relating to test/diagnostic/programming equipment and special

tools shall be resolved by the successful bidder at no cost to the County. for-a period of - .

five (5) years from the acceptance of the equipment, X O

Terodhaining shall ke pravided on all items in this section at a County location. X O

Adopted on: July 17, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001085



GOMPLIANCE PAGES ~ MOTOR VEHICEESMERKSANG SFR - Re<2Rg: 1A 950
ITEM #2 CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY. AS
* SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
OPTIONS (CONT’D)
2W, Two-Way Radio Power and Wiring Requirements for New Vehicles
For the purpose of installing two-way radios into new County vehicles and equipment,
'the following power and wiring components shall be included:
1. #12 AWG RED wire connected to 12VDC Battery Source rated at 20 Amps.
2. #12 AWG BLACK wire connected to chassis ground.
3.#16 AWG YELLOW wire connected to 12VDC Ignition Sense rated at 5 Amps.
These wires shall be encased in plastic wire loom and routed from their source into the
cab of the vehicle and secured in the vicinity of the operator. The wiring harness shall
be clearly labeled “TWO-WAY RADIO”. The wires shall be unterminated. The 12VDC
\7\1'063 shall be protected from making contact with grounded metal surfaces. X O

2X. Installation of County Supplied Two Way Radio and Accessories

Install is to include but not limited to antenna cable, mounts, speakers, brackets, etc. For
the purpose of installing two-way radios into new County vehicles and equipment, the
following power and wiring components shall be included:

1. #12 AWG RED wire connected to 12VDC Battery Source rated at 20 Amps.

2. #12 AWG BLACK wire connected to chassis ground.

3. #16 AWG YELLOW wire connected to 12VDC Ignition Sense rated at 5 Amps.
These wires shall be encased in plastic wire loom and routed from their source into the
cab of the vehicle, The wiring harness shall be clearly labeled “TWO-WAY RADIO”,
The 12VDC sources shall be protected from making contact with grounded metal
surfaces. X O

Introduced on: July 17, 2024
Adopted on: July 17, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001085



ALL AMERICAN FORD

1
2/12/2024 2025 UTILITY POLICE INTERCEPTOR I L
(PRICE LEVEL CODE 515)
DEALER
SERIES SUGGESTED
MODEL ; BASE VEHICLE PRICE INVOICE
s wHoLbaagk | RETAL
Patice Interceptor | AWD Ka8A | Utility Police Interceptar AWD $ 48,029 $ 49,615
ALL MODELS — Destination and Delivery 1,505 1,585
PKG DEALER o, cqESTED
' TAIM SERIES | DRIVE - | PREFERRED EQUIPMENT PACKAGES INVOICE <
CODE RETAIL
s W/HOLDBACK
Palice Interceptor 65U Interior Upgrade Package $ 367 $ 390
| 66A | Front Headlamp Lighting Solution 846 800
668 Tall Lamp Lighting Sclution 405 430
66C Rear Lighting Solution 432 460
67H Ready For the Road Package 3,572 3,800
DEALER ;
prve | FEToN POWERTRAINS INvOIcE _[SUSCESTED
T W/HOLDBACK
ENGINE pawW | 3.9L Ve DI Hybrid Engine Std Std
98B | 3.3L V6 DI Engine ${2,191) $ (2,330)
99¢ 3.0L V6 EcoBoost Enging [1:K] 850
THANSMISSION 44U | 10-speed Automatic Transmigsion (with 89B/99C) N/C NG
: DEALER
OPTION SUGGESTED
MODEL TIRES INVOICE
. CODE WIHOLDBACK RETAIL
Pulice Interceptor 85k Wheel Covers (18 in, Full Fage Wheel Cover) $65 70
' ) DEALER
CEDE OTHER.OPTIONS NvoicE_{SUGGESTED
' ) W/HOLDBACK
AVAILABLE ON ALL a7y Ultimate Wiring Package $ 602 $ 640
MODELS UNLESS 67v Police Wire Hamess Gonnactor Kit - Front/Rear 188 200
OTHERWISE NOTED 41H | Engine Block Heater 179 190
153 License Plate Bracket - Front N/C N/C
942 Daytime Running Lamps 47 50
21L Fromt Warning Auxliiary Ligit 646 560
435 | Rear Auxiliary Liftgate Lights 376 400
63L Rear Quarter Glass Side Marker Lights 846 580
96T Rear Spoiler Trafflc Wamtng Lights 1,410 1,500
638 Side Marker LED - Sideview Mirrors (req. 60A) az20 340
51P Spot Lamp Prep KIt, Driver Side 132 140
s1wW Spot Lamp Prep Kit, Dual Side 264 2680
51R Spot Lamp - LED Bulb, Driver-Only (Unity) 376 400
ST Spot Lamp - LED Bulb, Driver Only (Whelen) 384 420
516 Spot Lamp - LED Bulb, Dual (driver and passenger) {Unity) 582 620
51V Spot Lamp - LED Bulb, Dual (driver and passenger) {(Whelen) 629 670
292G Glass ~ Solar Tint 2nd Row, Aear Quarter and Liltgate Window 112 120
{Deletes Privacy Glass)
2R Glass - Solar Tint 2nd Row Only, Privacy Glass on Rear Quarter 85 a0
and Liftgate Window
76D Deftector Plate 320 a40
) 47E 12.1 in. Integrated Computer Screen 3,478 3,700
#7M | 1/4'5ize Picture In Picture NIC N/C
52p Hidden Dogr-Lock Plunger w/Rear-door contrals inoperable 150 160
686G He%znoor Handles Controls Inoperable / Locks inoperable (with N/IC N/C
P) :
Rear-Daar Handles Controls Inoperable / Locks Inoperable 76 80
(without 52P)
180 Global Lock / Unlock feature NIC N/C
S9E Keyed Alike — 1435x 47 50
598 Keyed Alike — 1284x 47 50
69D Keyed Alike - 0135x 487 50
&59F Keyed Alike —0576x 47 50
54 Keyed Allke —1111x 47 50
59C Keyed Alike — 1294x 47 50
59G Keyad Alike - 0151x a7 50
16C 1st and 2nd row carpet floor covering (ingl. floor mats, front and i 150
rear)
BOF 2nd Row Cloth Seals 66 70
= 2nd-Row Cloth Seats (incl w/ 65U} Incl. . Ingl
85D | .Front.Console Plate - Delete NC NIC
85R Rear Console Plate 56 60
.y 90D .. | Balllatic Door Panals (LVL IH+) = Driver Frant Door Only 1,495 1,500 L
agE Bailistic Door Panels (LVL |li+) — Driver & Pass Frant Doors 2,979 4,170
a0F Ballistic Poor Panels (LVL [V+) — Driver Front Door Only 2,274 2,420
906 Ballistic Door Panels {LVL V+) — Driver & Pass Front Doors 4,541 4,830
Ingrgduced on: July|17,18624 | Fear Bumper Step Pad B4 100
Adopted on: July[17,18024 | Badge Delete NG NIC
Offfigi ion#: Cargp Storade Vault 253 270
02/12/24 7:26 PM ~A- Ford Divigioti




ALL AMERICAN FORD o

2/12/2024 2025 UTILITY POLICE INTERCEPTOR NFI [
PRICE LIST
{PRICE LEVEL CODE 515)
[QETan. OTHER OPTIONS (continued) | Wvoice |sucaesteo
GROE wHoLpeack | RETAL

AVAILABLE ON ALL G0R | Noise Suppression Bonds (Ground Straps) 594 $100

MODELS UNLESS 18X 100 Watt Siran/Speaker (includes bracket and pigtall) 320: as0

OTHERWISE NOTED

Infroduced on: July 17, 2024
Adopted on: July 17, 2024
101 1 B

o N
02/12/24 7:26 PM -B- Ford Division




[WINNER FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Res-Pg:m.9-23

'
|
|

11. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.

Submitting a manual response In addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
ITEM #1 - CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD EXPLORER 4WD, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Line item Description Quantity Uit of Measura Uriit Cost Na Bld Year/Make/Model:  Delivery, ARQ.  Camments:

1 Current Model 20 EA $43,717.00 $874,340.00 2025 Ford Not notad at
Year, or Newer, Explorer this time
Ford Explarer '
4WD, As
Specified or
Equal

OPTIONS

/ 1la Ford Protect 20 EA 524850.00 $57,000.00
ExtraCare

Extended
Service Plan, As
Spacified

/ 1b Mini Liberty Il 20 EA $1,230.00 424,600,00
IT9 Serles
Lightbar -
Permanent
Mount, As
Specified

Introduced on: July 17, 2024

ri

AdoptedormT: —July - - -

Offinial ROUMINESFORHBERHGNSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS
Page 6



Res-Pg:m.9-24
[WINNER FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT %
Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Line ftem Dascription Quantity Uit of Measure Linit.Cast No 8id Year/Maka/Madel; Delivery, ARO,;  Comments:

1c Whalen: 20 EA $2,255.00 $45,100.00
\/ IX2AAALA - 1
Liberty II, Sala X

N Low Current
Series Ught Bar -
54", As Specified

1d Light Color 20 EA $1.00 $20.00
Option, As
Specifled

\

le Vehicle Specific 20 EA $850.00 §17,000.00
Dual Color Light
Bar with TD
12LED, As
Specified

~

1f Single 20 EA 3875.00 $17,500.00
Deck/Grille
Mount 12 LED
Lights, As
Specifiad

1g Solid State 20 EA $200.00 $4,000.00
Headlight
Fiasher, As
Specified

1h Universal 20 EA $1,200.00 $24,000.00 !
UnderCovar
Screw-In LED
Insert 3ingle
Light Kit, As
Specified

S

1 Single 12 LED 20 "EA $400.00 58,000.00
Recess Mount
Lights, As
Specified

Introduced on: July 17,2024 :
Adopte "

official BAUDINESHFOBOR4BERESNSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Page 7




Res-Pg:m.9-25
[WINNER FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT :

Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Line lLam Dascription Quantity Unit of Measure Unlt Cost Tatal No Bid Yeai/Make/Model: Delivery, AR.0.;

EA $635.00 $12,700.00

Camments:

Rear Lightbar
Singla Colar -
Ford Utllity, As
Specified

Remote Siren,

/ 1k 200 Watt 20 EA 51,260,00 %25,200.00
As Specified

1 15 20 EA %310.00 $6,200,00
Programmable
Button with 3-
Pasition Sllde
Switch
Cantroller, As
Specified

~

im 100 Watt 20 EA $560,00 $11,200.00 '
Professional
Siren Speaker,
As Specified

n Vehicle Specific 20 EA $210,00 $4,260.00

Bumper Mount

Siren Speaker i
Bracket, As .

Specifiad .

1o 100 Amp 20 EA 422500 $4,500.00
Cantral
Controller, As
Speclfied

1p Central 20 EA 5100 $20.00
Controller
Harness Kit, As
Specified

Introduced on: July 17, 2024 g ' .
Adopte

On. - 1 b
Oficial RAUBINERFOBBIREHSSNSE DOCUMENT REPORT H
Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Page 8




[WINNER FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Res!Pg:m.9-26

Lina ltem

1q

Neseription

Notepad v
Universal

" |Computer

Cradle
(Installed), As
specified

Quantity

20

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost!
$400.00

Total
$8,000.00

N Bid

Yaar/Make/Madel;

Detfvary, ARC:

Comments:

ir

Aluminum Push
Bumper with
Integrated Dual
Color Lights
(Installed), As
Specifled

20

EA

$1,050,00

$21,000.00

J

1s

Dual Color LED
Light Bar with
Vehicle Specific
Maounts
{Installed), As
Specified

20

EA

$1,200.00

$24,000.00

1t

Harnass
(Installed), As
Specified

20

‘EA

$310,00

46,200,060

1u

‘| Dual Color

Warning Light,
As Spacified

20

EA

$200.00

$4,000.00

lv

Ford Factory
Installed
Optians, As
Spacified

20

EA

$6.00

$120.00

This is 6% off list

J
/l
J
J

1w

Diagnostic
Tools/Test
Equipment, As
Specified

SET

$7,500.00

$22,500.00

Introduced on:

July 17, 2024

Adopted-on:
Official R&4BIRY

Bid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Page 9
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[WINNER FORD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Res-Pg:m.9-27

Line ltam Descriplion Quantlty Uriit of Measure

1x Two-Way Radio 2Q EA
J Power and

Wiring
Requirements
for New
Vehiclas, As
Specified

Unit Cost
$300.00

$6,000.00

No Bid Year/Make/Modal:  Delivery, A.R.O,: Commants;

/ 1y Installation of 20 EA
County Supplied
Two Way Radia

and Accessories,
As Specified

$495.00

49,500.00

TOTAL

$1,237,300.00

ITEM #2 - CURRENT MODEL YEAR, OR NEWER, FORD INTERCEPTOR UTILITY, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Ling ltam Dascription Cluantity Unit of Measure

Current Madel EA
Year, aor Newer,
Ford Interceptor
Utility, As
Specified or
Equal

Unit Cost’
No Bld

“Total

No Bld

Nao Bid Year/Make/Model: Delivery, AR.Q.:  Commantss

QFTIONS

2a Ford Factory EA
Installed
Optlons, As
Specified

No Bid

No Bid

Introduced on: July 17, 2024

Adopt 1
Official RULURESHOBRLA63665ISE DOCUMENT REPORT
gid - MOTOR VEHICLES: CARS AND SUVS

Page 10



WINNER FORD
COMPLIANCE PAGES — MOTOR VEHICLES — CARS AND SUVS

\/ITEM # 1 CURRENT MODEL YEAR , ORNEWER, FORD EXPL.ORER 4WD, AS SPECIFIED, OR
E

QUAL

DESCRIPTION 4
Model Year 2025 or Newer Ford Explorer Active (Pkg 200A)
2.3L Ecoboost [-4 Engine with Auto Start-Stop Technology (99H)
Transmission — 10 speed automatic (44T)

" Four wheel drive (K8D)

- Standard-Duty Front and rear brake calipers
Configurable daytime running lamps

LED Taillamps with Amber turn signals
Tires— -
- - P255/65R18 All Season (A/S) BSW
- Mini Spare

Full sized spare tire (P255/65R18) not mounted on rim (Rim not needed)

Wheels — 18” Sparkle Silver-Painted Aluminum
Wiper —
- Windshield — Variable Intermittent/Continuous
- Rear Window — Single-speed Intermittent/continuous
Climate Control —
- Tri-zone Electronic Temperature control
- Cabin Particulate Air Filter
- = Rear Auxiliary controls
Instrument Panel Cluster —
- 12.3” Color LCD Productivity screen
- Message Center
- Qutside Temperature Display
- Trip Computer

Rotary Gear Shift Dial
Seats —
- Unique Cloth
- Front Row Captain’s Chairs
- 10-way Power Driver’s Seat
- 4-way manual front passenger
" - Second Row - 35/30/35 Split-fold flat and reclining outboard seats with E-Z
entry and arm rests

Steering Colurnn — Manual Tilt/Telescoping
Steering Wheel with Mounted Features
- 5-way controls

- Audio Controls

«  Cruise Controls
Windows —

- Powér—TFront and Rear =~ =

- Front Row one-touch-Up/Down Feature (door mounted controls)

Introduced on: July 17, 2024
Adopted on: July 17, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001085

Ressbg 138

COMPLIANCE

YES NO
X A
R O
X [
[
X O
X a
O
A Cl
X O
] O
X O
B 1
X O
3] O
X O
X O
< O .
X



WINNER FORD y
jomLIANCE PAGES — MOTOR VEHICLES —~ CARS AND SUVS Reg L9 £r#9

/ITEM # 1 CURRENT MODEY YEAR , OR NEWER, FORD EXPLORER 4WD, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
DESCRIPTION (CONT’D) : YES NO
"Airbags —
- " First Row: Driver and passenger Dual Stage Front, Front —seat side and
Driver/Passenger knee
- All Rows: Safety Canopy Side-curtain with rollover sensor < [
Center High-mounted stop lamp ] O
Door locks, Power
- Auto Lock/Auto unlock
- Child Safety rear 3 O
Headlamps
- LED low and High beams with courtesy delay
- - Wiper-activated 4 O
Safety Belts
= Front Row — Belt-minder
"~ Front Row — adjustable height
" - Second Row — Outboard and Center Seat shoulder
- Third row — outboard b O
Ford Co-pilot 360 Assist
. - Auto High-beam headlamps
- .. BLIS (blind spot information system) with cross-traffic alert
- Lane Keeping System —
o Lane-keeping alert
o Lane-keeping assist
o Driver alert
- Pre-Collision Assist with Automatic Emergency braking
o Pedestrian Detection
o Forward Collision Warning
o Dynamic Brake support
"~  Rear view camera I O
Front and Rear Stabilizer Bars < O
Independent Front and Rear Suspension X O
Infotainment
.= 13.2” Color LCD Touchscreen in IP Center-stack
- Alexa Built-In
- Google Built-In
o Google Assistant
o Google Maps
o Google Pay store
- Pinch-to-Zoom capability
- 911Assist
- - Apple CarPlay and Android Auto Wireless capability - - e X O
Interior Color: Dark Gray/Onyx ¢ O
Introduced on: July 17, 2024
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"ITEM # 1 CURRENT MODEL YEAR , OR NEWER,; FORD EXPL.ORER 4WD, AS SPECIFIED. OR
EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

PAINT
Color to be Specified from Standard Color Chart on Purchase Order When Ordering X O
UNDERCOATING - X O
Entire Chassis and underside of cab to be coated with tectyl 2423 or Z Guard
Product, or equal. This is a low VOC, high solids, emulsion corrosion preventative
coating. X O
WARRANTY
Bumper to Bumper: 3 Years/36,000 Miles X O
Vehicle Equipment Must Be Rustproofed and Warrantied by the Manufacturer
Against Rust for Five (5) Years or 50,000 Miles, Whichever Comes Last. This
Equipment Must Also Meet or Exceed All Applicable State, Federal and PEOSHA
Laws and Regulations X 1

PTIONS -
1A. Ford Protect ExtraCare Extended Service Plan covering 113 components. 8
years/125,000 miles with $0.00 deductible. X O
1B. Mini Liberty Il IT9 Series Light Bar- Permanent Mount

ith 15° Cable, fully lit Amber with Two Super-LED White Alley Lights installed. - X 0
1C. Whelen: IX2AAAA - Liberty 11, Solo IX Low Current Series Light Bar
547, Fully loaded with all Amber, LED’s which includes 4 corners, 4 front facing
and 6 rear facing and bar also includes two white take down lights in Front, 2 White
Alley Light, Corner light wired on a Separate switch X .

1D. Light Color Option
Red and blue modules in lieu of amber for Sheriff Depart or OEM, keeping the

amber rear arrow stick

'1E. Vehicle Specific Dual Color Light Bar w/ TD 12LED
Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBF) (qty 1)

1F. Single Deck/Grille Mount 12 L.ED Lights
Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFSGS3) (qty 4)

1G. Solid State Headlight Flasher
jSoundoff Signal Part Number: ETHFSS-SPFL).(qty 1)

1H. Universal UnderCover Screw-In LED Insert Single Light Kit
/(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ELUC3H025) (qty 8)

1). Single 12LED Recess Mount Lights
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFSRS3) (qty 2)

LJ. Rear Lightbar Single Color - Ford Utility
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBRF) (qty 1)
1K. 200 Watt Remote Siren )

Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGSA07152) (Qty 1)

. L. 15 Programmable Button with 3 Position Slide Switch Controlier
(Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGCP18001) (qty 1)

NG00 Watt PE%EM al Siren Speaker
g@mndoff SignaliBart Dasnber: ETSS100N) (qty 2)
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WINNER FORD
COMPLIANCE PAGES — MOTOR VEHICLES — CARS AND SUVS

J/ ITEM # 1 CURRENT MODEL YEAR . OR NEWER, FORD EXPLORER 4WD, AS SPECIFIED. OR

EQUAL (CONT’D)

OPTIONS (CONT’D)

J1N. Vehicle Specific Bumper Mount Siren Speaker Bracket
Soundoff Signal Part Number: ETSS19QCBKFV-BP) (qty 2)
10. 100 Amp Central Controller
Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENGCC01241) (qty 1)
1P. Central Controller Harness Kit

fSoundoff Signal Part Number: ENGHNKO1)(qgty 1)

1Q. NotePad V Universal Computer Cradle (Installed)
Gamber Johnson Part Number: 7160-0250) ’

1R. Aluminum Push Bumper with Integrated Dual Color Lights (Installed)
jSetma Part Number; BK2044ITU20)

18. Dual Color LED Light Bar with Vehicle Specific Mounts (Installed)
Soundoff Signal Part Number: ENFWBR.F)

1T. Harness (Installed)
Soundoff Signal Part Number: PCPNRCNG1)

1U. Dual Color Warning Light
Color to be specified at time of order (Installed)
/(Soundoff Signal Part Number: EMPS2S8TS4)
1V. Ford Factory Installed Options
percentage discount from Manufacturer’s Suggested Retail Price (Llst Price) \
bidders must supply list with bid

/IW. Dlagosnc Tools / Test Equipment
1. Successful bidder may be required to supply between one (1) to three (3)

complete sets of OEM (Original Equipment Manufactured)
test/diagnostic/programming equipment (i.e. laptop, software, cabling, and
adapters) and special tools required to perform the full range of diagnostic and
maintenance actions necessary to maintain vehicle operability. This equipment will
cover the vehicle chassis, engine, transmission, brakes, hydraulics, and all
additional equipment (if applicable). Examples of OEM diagnostics are as follows:
Ford IDS, Cummins Quickserv, Mack Tech Tool, John Deere Service Advisor,
Freightliner Diagnostic Link
2. All laptop computers will be of the newest available technology and have
sufficient storage and memory to operate all required software.
3. Provide a list of all test/diagnostic/programming equipment and special tools
being supplied at the time of bid.
4. All software installations and activations will be completed by the successful
bidder at no cost to the County.
5. All software updates and renewal will be provided at no cost to the County for a
period of five (5) years from the acceptance of the equipment.
6. All technical issues relating to test/diagnostic/programming equipment and
special tools shall be resolved by the successful bidder at no cost to the County for a

nhsEiRgef five (5),y5ars,fom the acceptance of the equipment.

Ageptéfrarining shallybl 1];31*134'1decl on all items in this section at a County location.
Official Resolution#: 202400
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/ITEM # 1 CURRENT MODEL YEAR , OR NEWER, FORD EXPLORER 4WD, AS SPECIFIED. OR
EQUAL (CONT’D)
COMFELIANCE

YES NO

OPTIONS (CONT’D)

/1x. Two-Way Radio Power and Wiring Requirements for New Vehicles
For the purpose of installing two-way radios into new County vehicles and

equipment, the following power and wiring components shall be included:

1. #12 AWG RED wire connected to 12VDC Battery Source rated at 20
_+ Amps.

'2.#12 AWG BLACK wire connected to chassis ground.
3. #16 AWG YELLOW wire connected to 12VDC Ignition Sense rated at 5
- Amps. .

These wires shall be encased in plastic wire loom and routed from their source into
the cab of the vehicle and secured in the vicinity of the operator. The wiring
harness shall be clearly labeled “TWO-WAY RADIO”. The wires shall be
unterminated. The 12VDC sources shall be protected from making contact with
grounded metal surfaces. X O

,/IY. Installation of County Supplied Two Way Radio and Accessories

Install is to include but not limited to antenna cable, mounts, speakers, brackets, etc.
For the purpose of installing two-way radios into new County vehicles and
equipment, the following power and wiring components shall be included:
.. 1. -#12 AWG RED wire connected to 12VDC Battery Source rated at 20
~ Amps.
2. #12 AWG BLACK wire connected to chassis ground.
3. #16 AWG YELLOW wire connected to 12VDC Ignition Sense rated at 5
; Amps.
These wires shall be encased in plastic wire loom and routed from their source into
the cab of the vehicle. The wiring harness shall be clearly labeled “TWO-WAY
* RADIO”. The 12VDC sources shall be protected from making contact with
grounded metal surfaces. X O
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Res-Pg:m.9-33
6/17/2024 2025 EXPLOFIE'B PROPRIETARY]
(PRICE LEVEL CODE 535) ‘_
SERIES i SUGGESTED
MODEL A BASE VEHICLE PRICE - REraL
Actlve AWD K70 | Active RWD {2004} % 39,755
XLT AWD K8D | Active 4WD (200A) 41,758
ST-Lins RWD | XK | ST-Line RWD (300A) 44516 |
‘ 4WD KK | ST-Line 4WD {3004 46,518
8T AWD K76 | ST RWD {400A} 55,508
| 4Wh KoG | ST.4WD (400A) 89,200 |
Platinum | _RWD K7H | Platinum RWD (600A) _51,655
WD _|_ KAH_| Plaiinum 4WD (600A) 53,653
JALL MODELS — | Dastination and Dalvary 1,585
y OPTION SUGGESTED
MDEL | ‘copE TIRES RETAIL
Active B4¥ | 20 Inch Carbonized Gray-Painted Aluminum Wheals %1385
849 | 20 Inoh Luster Nickel-Palmted Alurninum Wheels 1,385
- | Platinum 84U | 20 Inch Polished Aluminum Wheels 695
OPTION ‘ | SUGGESTED
‘ CobE | OTHER OPTIONS RETAIL
AVAILABLEGN ALL | 21D | Flatinum Lux Leater Package (98C / 68U Not Selected) $ 1,685
MODELS UNLESS Platinum Lux Leather Package (99C and 68U Selectod) N/C
OTHERWISE MOTED | 68U | Platinum Uitimate Package 4615
68A | Active Comfort Package 3,360
439 | Twin Panel Moonroof 1,695
* 68P | 8T-Line Street Pack 205
68L | ST-Line Premium Package 2,740
608 | Black Paimed Foof 4,885
168 | Ford BiweGrise Equipped (1-year Plan) 700
17H | Second Raw Captain's Chalre with E-Z Eniry and Armrest NG
143 | License Plate Bracket: N/C
168 | All-Weather Floor Mats without Carpet Mats 160
168 All-Weather Floor Mats with Carpet Mats 200
90X | Wirslesd Charger Cradit (130)
91X. | Rear Auxifary Gontrols Grexdit {1om)
PKt | Vapor Blue Metallic 4495
PD4 | Rapid Red Metaliic Tinted Clearcoat 495
PAZ | Star White Metallic Trl-Coat 785
OPTION SUGGESTED
CODE FLEET OPTIONS RETAIL
TAVAILABLE ONALL | 842 | Daytime Running Lamps {Fleat Only) $45 |
MODELS UNLESS 41H | Engine Blook Heater 190
OTHERWISE ROTED
QPTION | lsuacesTen
CODE - DEALER INSTALLED OPTIONS RETAIL
AVAILABLE ON ALL | DEHAR | Wheel Lock Kit $00
MODELS UNLESS BDGAF| Gargo Area Management System 245
OTHEAWISE NOTED |GAMAB | Houd Graphics - Matte 285
QAMAD | Hood Graphles - Ford Perfarmiance: am
BMWAB | Roof-Rail Croasbars a80
-J3CAB | Smoker's Package 100
AJEAH | Splesh Quards 230
FKAR | lliyminated Door Entry Keypad 458
BECAF | CARGO ORGANIZER SOFT SIDE &TD 150
BECAG | CARGO ORGANIZER SOFT SIDE LRA 160
'FHLAH | CARGO ORGANIZER - COOLER BAG 8 )
| FHEAC | All-weather Floot Liners — Third Fow with Second Row 125 -
'Captain‘s Chalrs.
FHEAB Aib;Veathar Flaar Liners — Third Flow with Second Aow Bench 125 |
Beats . .
AHQAB | First Ald Kit €0 .
e e AHMAE | Roadside Assletance Kit ) .
 JAJAE .| Sale Depasit- Console Vault 420 T
JLb‘, 172024 : v o
JUlG/%/26 3432 PM -A- Ford Division
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