Res-Pg:k.4-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey
Director John P. Kelly

08754-2191
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: April 16, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE
CONTAINERS to Altec Supply-A Division of Altec Industries; A&M Industrial; Continental Hardware, Inc;
Eppy's Tool & Equipment Warehouse, Inc.; Snap-On Industrial, A Division of IDSC Holdings, LLC; Van Wickle
Auto Supply, Inc./Kenneth C. Van Wickle; and Wurth USA, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2025-52)

Official Resolution# |2025000483
Meeting Date 04/16/2025
Introduced Date 04/16/2025
Adopted Date 04/16/2025
Agenda ltem k-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-52
Result Adopted
SouNTY oner 18 18 12 o Ju > [
COMMISSIONER @ [a O % > g @
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v |v
Bacchione v v v
Haines v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaite \. Guanor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on
Adopted on:
Official Resoly

t

Res-Pg:k.4-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

BAOAD -5

RESOLUTION
April 16, 2025

WHEREAS, on March 4, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND
STORAGE CONTAINERS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Altec Supply-A Division of Altec Industries A&M Industrial
210 Iverness Center Drive 37 West Cherry Street
Birmingham, AL 35242 Rahway, NJ 07065
(609) 439-3903 (732) 574-1111
Continental Hardware, Inc. Eppy’s Tool & Equipment
400 Delancy Street Warehouse, Inc.
Newark, NJ 07105 2777 US Highway 9 North
(973) 589-3929 Howell, NJ 07731

(718) 434-7878
Snap-On Industrial, Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc./
A Division of IDSC Holdings, LLC Kenneth C. Van Wickle
2801 80™ Street 201 Highway 71
Kenosha, WI 53143 Spring Lake Heights, NJ 07762
(877) 740-1900 (732) 449-0100
Wurth USA, Inc. Topline Tool Warehouse Inc.
93 Grant Street 140 Milbar Blvd
Ramsey, NJ 07446 Farmingdale, NY 11735
(201) 825-2710 (631) 249-9577

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely that of, ALTEC SUPPLY-A DIVISION OF ALTEC
INDUSTRIES, A&M INDUSTRIAL, CONTINENTAL HARDWARE, INC., EPPY’S
TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE, INC., SNAP-ON INDUSTRIAL, A DIVISION OF
IDSC HOLDINGS, LLC, VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY, INC/KENNETH C. VAN
WICKLE, AND WURTH USA, INC. be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Hand Tools, Cases and Storage
Containers for the County of Ocean, for the contract period shall be from May 1, 2025 through
April 30, 2026, a period of one (1) year, or until delivery is complete. The County reserves
the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J S.A. 40A:11-15.

April 16, 2025
April 16, 2025
on#: 2025000483




Res-Pg:k.4-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 APRIL 16, 2025

A. ALTEC SUPPLY-A DIVISION OF ALTEC INDUSTRIES for one (1) item, to

wit:

ITEM NO. 1.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. A&M INDUSTRIAL for nine (9) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 8,9,10,11, 12, 13, 14, 15 and 17.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. CONTINENTAL HARDWARE, INC. for three (3) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 16, 18 and 26.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. EPPY’S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE INC., for twenty (20) items, to

wit:
ITEM NOS. 4,6,7,8,11, 14,15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27 and 28.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

E. SNAP-ON INDUSTRIAL, A DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS LLC for thirteen

(13) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 5, 16, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27 and 28.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

F. VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY, INC./KENNETH C VAN WICKLE. for twenty
(20) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 2, 3,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15,17, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26 and 27.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

G. WURTH USA INC. for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 9, 10, 12 and 13.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

Introduced on: April 16, 2025
Adopted on: April 16, 2025
Official Resolutipn#: 2025000483




Res-Pg:k.4-4
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 APRIL 16, 2025

2. Payments for the equipment and materials to be acquired by these contracts
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding

sources: Vehicle Services O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-52.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

Introduced on April 16, 2025
Adopted on: April 16, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025000483




Res-Pg:k.4-5
[ALTEC INDUSTRIES, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD .
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

. .~ .'PRICE TABLES
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

SECTION | - TOOL SETS

/ 1 GEARWRENCH Part No. MEGAMQD1024 — 1024 Piece Megamod Master Mechanics Tool Set in 10 EA $5,683.00 | $56,830.00

A% Premium Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal
2 GEARWRENCH Part No. Megamod1268 — 1268 Piece Megamod Master Mechanics Tool Set in 10 EA $10,579.00 [$105,790.00

Premium Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal

3 GEARWRENCH Part No. Megamod873 — 873 Piece Megamod Mechanics Tool Set in Premium 10 . EA $4,705.00 | $47,050.00
Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal

SECTION Il - WRENCHES, TORQUE AND TOWING

4 Snap-On Part No. QD1R200A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib} - 1/4" Drive, +/-4% EA No Bid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 40 ft-Ib, Max Range - 200 ft-Ib, 1 ft-lb Increments

5 Snap-On Part No. BRUTUS3R300 - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib) - 1/2" Drive, +/-6% EA No Bid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 60 ft-lb, Max Range - 300 ft-Ib, 1 ft-Ib Increments

6 Snap-On Part No. TQR60OE - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib} - 3/4" Drive, +/-4% EA No Bid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-ib, Max Range - 600 ft-lb, 5 ft-lb Increments

7 Snap-On Part No. QDSR1000A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb} - 1" Drive, +/-4% EA No Bid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 1,000 ft-lIb, 5 ft-Ib Increments

Introduced_an: April 16 2025
Adopted gat TEC INDBPTIRIES 2026.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rgselutionih 33361904825 ES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS
Page 7




Res-Pg:k.4-6
[A&M INDUSTRIAL] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

SECTION Il - WRENCHES, TORQUE AND TOWING

4 Snap-On Part No. QD1R200A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1/4" Drive, +/-4% S EA $267.53 $1,337.65 Williams Div.
‘ Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 40 ft-lb, Max Range - 200 ft-lb, 1 ft-Ib Increments Snap On Part No.
1501MRMHW
S Snap-On Part No. BRUTUS3R300 - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1/2" Drive, +/- S EA $357.97 $1,789.85 Williams Div.
6% Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 60 ft-Ib, Max Range - 300 ft-ib, 1 ft-Ib increments Snap On/ Part

No.2503MFMHW

6 Snap-On Part No. TQR600E - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib} - 3/4" Drive, +/-4% S . EA $979.67 $4,898.35 Williams Div.
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-Ib, Max Range - 600 ft-Ib, 5 ft-Ib Increments Snap On Part No.
6004MFRMHW
7 Shap-On Part No. QD5R1000A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench {ft-lb) - 1" Drive, +/-4% 5 EA $2,034.62 | $10,173.10 Williams Div. of
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 1,000 ft-lb, 5 ft-lb Increments Snap On Part No.
10005MFRMHW

SECTION HI - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Percentage No Bid
Sl 8 Tool Storage % 40%
l// 9 Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" , % 40%
.\/ 10 Wrenches : % | 40%
v 11 Torque Tools % 40%
l// 12 Screwdrivers % 40%
V/ 13 Pliers % 40%
Introduced on: April 16, 2025

Adopted qa;g M |N|_3me7!ﬁ,]mE§PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResQutioRKin?PERIPE*EASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Page 8



Res-Pg:k.4-7
[A&M INDUSTRIAL] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line ltem Description Unit of Measure Percentage No Bid
\,/ 14 Punches/Chisels/Hammers % 40%
e 15 General Hand Tools (ie: files, scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, % 40%
1% diesel, other)
16 Set Building % No Bid X
\// 17 Power Tools % 20%
18 Testing & Electronics {i.e.: specialty meters, analyzers, fuel and engine systems) % No Bid X
19 Welding | % No Bid X
20 Undercar % No Bid X
21 Battery Service \ % No Bid X
22 Air Conditioning : % No Bid C X
23 Cooling % No Bid ©X
24 Shop Equipment {ie: lighting, creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, % No Bid X
presses)
25 Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, vacuums, shop fans) % No Bid X
26 Safety % 10%
27 Diagnostics . % No Bid X
28 Towing % No Bid . X
Introduced on: April 16, 2025

Adopted on; i
Ao A OO AP ONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS
Page 9



Res-Pg:k.4-8
[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

SECTION 11l - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Percentage
Tool Storage % 15%
9 Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" % 15%
10 Wrenches % 15%
11 Torque Tools % 15%
12 Screwdrivers % 15%
13 Pliers % 15%
14 Punches/Chisels/Hammers % 15%
15 General Hand Tools (ie: files, scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, % 15%
diesel, other) .
\// 16 Set Building % 15%
17 Power Tools % 13%
yd
v 18 Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, analyzers, fuel and engine systems) % 15%
19 Welding , % No Bid X
20 Undercar % No Bid X
21 Battery Service % No Bid X
22 Air Conditioning % No Bid X
Introduced on: April 16,2025

Adopted EONTINENApXI HO\RDZFARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RegQlutionfi2PER9PE48ASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Page 8



[CONTINENTAL HARDWARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Res-Pg:k.4-9

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Percentage
23 Cooling % No Bid X
24 Shop Equipment (ie: lighting, creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, % No Bid X
presses) -
. 25 Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, vacuums, shop fans) % No Bid X
,// 26 Safety % 15%
27 Diagnostics % No Bid X
28 Towing % NoBid | X

Introduced-on-

Aprild R, 2025

Adopted 4&0N_T|NEN¢'M Hé\RDEFARE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RegglutipnD2PARN0948ASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Page 9



Res-Pg:k.4-10
[EPPY'S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid.No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

13. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

“PRICE:TABLES . -
HAND TOOLS CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

SECTION |- TOOL SETS

1 GEARWRENCH Part No. MEGAMOD1024 — 1024 Piece Megamod Master Mechanics Tool Set in 10 EA $7,316.60 | $73,166.00
Premium Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal

2 GEARWRENCH Part No. Megamod1268 — 1268 Piece Megamod Master Mechanics Tool Set in 10 | EA $12,257.19 [$122,571.90
Premium Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal

3 GEARWRENCH Part No. Megamod873 — 873 Piece Megamod Mechanics Tool Set in Premium 10 EA $5,751.42 | $57,514.20
Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal

SECTION Il - WRENCHES, TORQUE AND TOWING

4 Snap-On Part No. QD1R200A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1/4" Drive, +/-4% S EA $244.95 $1,224.75 SKT77002 -

Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 40 ft-Ib, Max Range - 200 ft-lb, 1 ft-lb Increments 1/4"

\/ : Micrometer
) Adjustable

Torque

Wrench 20-

150 inch-lbs

|ntrodurnd ons Ar\rll 1R 20258
AdoptedERRY'S TOOIARrAQE/IPIKENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ROl TeA3P0@483ES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Page 7




Res-Pg:k.4-11
[EPPY'S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

Snap-On Part No. BRUTUS3R300 - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-b) - 1/2" Drive, +/-6% S EA $218.50 $1,092.50 skt77250
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 60 ft-Ib, Max Range - 300 ft-Ib, 1 ft-Ib Increments 1/2"
Micrometer
Adjustable
Torque
Wrench 30-
250 Ft-lbs

6 Snap-On Part No. TQR600E - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib) - 3/4" Drive, +/-4% 5 EA $759.95 $3,799.75 skt77600 -
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-Ib, Max Range - 600 ft-Ib, 5 ft-Ib Increments Torque
/ Wrench
Micrometer
Click Type
Adjustable
Dual Scale
3/4" Drive
100-600 Ft-
b

7 Snap-On Part No. QD5SR1000A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench {ft-{b) - 1" Drive, +/-4% S EA $748.95 $3,744.75 aff41055 -
/ Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-Ib, Max Range - 1,000 ft-Ib, 5 ft-Ib Increments 1" Dr 100-
V ' 700 Ft/lbs
Ratcheting
Torque
Wrench

SECTION 1Il - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Percentage
u 8 Tool Storage % 28.5%
9 Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" % 28.5%
10 Wrenches % 28.5%
Introduced._on: April 16,2025

Adopted [BRPY'S TOOAIIE®LROMMENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RgplytigRity 2OR5P80¢4%ES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Page 8



[EPPY'S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:k.4-12

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line item Description Unit of Measure Percentage No Bid

V 11 Torque Tools % 28.5%
12 Screwdrivers % 28.5%

13 Pliers % 28.5%

\// 14 Punches/Chisels/Hammers % 28.5%
' /' 15 G.eneral Hand Tools (ie: files, scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, % 28.5%

v diesel, other) ,

NG Set Building % 28.5%
N, Power Tools % 28.5%
’v/ 18 Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, analyzers, fuel and engine systems) % 28.5%
W 19 Welding % 28.5%
L/ 20 Undercar % 28.5%

\// 21 Battery Service % 28.5%
V/ 22 Air Conditioning % 28.5%
w23 Cooling % 28.5%

L/ 24 Shop Equipment (ie: lighting, creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, % 28.5%

presses)

\// 25 Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, vacuums, shop fans) % 28.5%
v 26 Safety % 28.5%

Introduced on:

Alnril 16 2025

Adopted[6®PY'S TOOBBIELRBASENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resplytignt FOEHPEOSSES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS -

Page 9



Res-Pg:k.4-13
[EPPY'S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line item Description Unit of Measure Percentage
v 27 Diagnostics % 28.5%
b/ 28 Towing % 28.5%

Introdueed-ep———April-46;-2026-
Adopted DRPY'S TOO IARrit @8, FUREENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Ragolutions: T2923600488ES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS
‘Page 10



[SNAP-ON INDUSTRIAL, A DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Res-Pg:k.4-14

Line Item

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Comments:

2 GEARWRENCH Part No. Megamod1268 — 1268 Piece Megamod Master Mechanics Tool Set in 10 EA $26,517.74 |$265,177.40 Snap-on Fleet
Premium Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal master pro
tool set
featuring over
700 SAE and
Metric tools
specifically
designed for
fleet
maintenance.
Includes 72"
roll cab, tools
and tool
control foam.
3 GEARWRENCH Part No. Megamod873 — 873 Piece Megamod Mechanics Tool Set in Premium 10 EA $23,009.00 |$230,090.00 Custom
Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal Ocean County
' Vehicle .
Manintenance
Set.
SECTION Il - WRENCHES, TORQUE AND TOWING
4 Snap-On Part No. QD1R200A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib) - 1/4" Drive, +/-4% 5 EA $335.20 $1,676.00
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 40 ft-Ib, Max Range - 200 ft-Ib, 1 ft-Ib Increments
/ 5 Snap-On Part No. BRUTUS3R300 - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib) - 1/2" Drive, +/-6% ) EA $536.00 $2,680.00
\/ Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 60 ft-Ib, Max Range - 300 ft-lb, 1 ft-lb Increments
6 Snap-0On Part No. TQR60OE - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib) - 3/4" Drive, +/-4% S EA $952.00 $4,760.00
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-Ib, Max Range - 600 ft-lb, S ft-Ib Increments
7 Snap-On Part No. QD5R1000A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib) - 1" Drive, +/-4% 5 EA $2,428.00 | $12,140.00
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 1,000 ft-lb, 5 ft-Ib Increments
SECTION [l - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG
Introduced_on: April 16, 2025

Adopted ONAP-ON INBWBTRIZ02A DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Regolufiats RISRYYRSES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Page 8



Res-Pg:k.4-15
[SNAP-ON INDUSTRIAL, A DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line ltem Description Unit of Measure Percentage
8 Tool Storage % 0%
9 Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" % 0%
10 Wrenches % 0%
11 Torque Tools % 0%
12 Screwdrivers % 0%
13 Pliers . ' % 0%
14 Punches/Chisels/Hammers % 0%
15 General Hand Tools (ie: files, scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, % 0%

diesel, other)

N1 Set Building : % 0%

17 Power Tools % Q%
\,/ 18 Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, analyzers, fuel and engine systems) % 0%
Yt Welding % 0%
‘// 20 Undercar % 0%
\/ 21 Battery Service % 0%
\// 22 Air Conditioning % 0%
\// 23 Cooling g % 0%

Introduced on: April 16. 2025

AdoptedigRiap-oN IMBRETR1 2025 DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS LLC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official ReSCIIRNE OB AR Es AND STORAGE CONTAINERS
Page 9



Res-Pg:k.4-16
[SNAP-ON INDUSTRIAL, A DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Percentage

/ 24 Shop Equipment (ie: lighting, creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, % 0%
Y presses)
‘/ 25 Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, vacuums, shop fans) % 0%
NV Safety % 0%
\,/ 27 Diagnostics % 0% -
L/ 28 Towing % 0%

Introduced on: April 16 2025

Adopted SNAP-ON INERIBTIRIZD28 DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Regolufionty RIZALURIES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS
Page 10 '



Res-Pg:k.4-17
[VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

' PRICE TABLES \_
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

SECTION | - TOOL SETS

1 GEARWRENCH Part No. MEGAMOD1024 — 1024 Piece Megamod Master Mechanics Tool Set in 10 EA $6,199.99 | $61,999.90
Premium Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal

. / 2 GEARWRENCH Part No. Megamod1268 — 1268 Piece Megamod Master Mechanics Tool Set in 10 EA $10,295.00 |$102,950.00
Y Premium Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal

/ 3 GEARWRENCH Part No. Megamod873 — 873 Piece Megamod Mechanics Tool Set in Premium 10 EA $4,599.95 | $45,999.50
\ Modular Foam Trays with Tool Storage, Fully Assembled, As Specified Or Equal

SECTION II - WRENCHES, TORQUE AND TOWING

4 Snap-On Part No. QD1R200A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-ib) - 1/4" Drive, +/-4% EA No Bid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 40 ft-Ib, Max Range - 200 ft-lb, 1 ft-Ib Increments

"5 Snap-On Part No. BRUTUS3R300 - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1/2" Drive, +/-6% EA . NoBid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 60 ft-lb, Max Range - 300 ft-Ib, 1 ft-Ib Increments

6 Snap-On Part No. TQR600E - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib) - 3/4" Drive, +/-4% EA No Bid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 600 ft-lb, 5 ft-Ib Increments -

7 Snap-On Part No. QDSR1000A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib) - 1" Drive, +/-4% EA No Bid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-Ib, Max Range - 1,000 ft-Ib, 5 ft-Ib Increments

Introduced on: April 16, 2025
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Res-Pg:k.4-18
[VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

SECTION 11l - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Percentage
W 8 Tool Storage _ % -50%
w 9 Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" % -55%
\/ 10 Wrenches % -55%
\,/ 11 Torque. Tools % -53%
VV 12 Screwdrivers % -55%
\//' 13 Pliers % -55%
L/ 14 Punches/Chisels/Hammers ‘ % -53%
Ve 15 General Hand Tools (ie: files, scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, % -54%
¥ diesel, other)
16 Set Building % No Bid X
\// 17 Power Tools % -54%
18 Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, analyzers, fuel and engine systems) % No Bid X
1% 19 Welding % -51%
L/ 20 Undercar % -52%
\;/ 21 Battery Service \ % -53%
\ / 22 Air Conditioning % -54%
Introduced on: April 16, 2025
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Res-Pg:k.4-19
[VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line tem Description Unit of Measure Percentage

v 23 Cooling % -51%

/ 24 Shop Equipment (ie: lighting, creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, % -55%
Y presses)
\//[ 25 | ’Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, vacuums, shop fans) % -52%
Y Safety % -53%
b/l 27 Diagnostics % -54%

28 Towing . % No Bid X
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Res-Pg:k.4-20

[WURTH USA INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD |
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

6 Snap-On Part No. TQR600E - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-Ib} - 3/4" Drive, +/-4% EA No Bid No Bid X
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-Ib, Max Range - 600 ft-lb, 5 ft-lb Increments

7 Snap-On Part No. QDSR1000A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1" Drive, +/-4% 5 EA $2,499.99 | $12,499.95 Item quoted is
Accuracy, Fixed Ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 1,000 ft-Ib, 5 ft-Ib Increments a PROTO Tw
1Dr 200-1000
Ft-Lb, mfg

#16023. Item is
backed by the
Manufacturer’s
Full Lifetime
Warranty.

SECTION 11l - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Percentage
8 Tool Storage ‘ % No Bid X
- Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" % 45%
l// 10 Wrenches % 45%
11 Torque Tools ) % No Bid X
\,/ 12 Screwdrivers % 45%
v/ 13 Pliers % 45%
14 Punches/Chisels/Hammers % No Bid X
15 General Hand Tools (ie: files, scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, % No Bid X
diesel, other)
Introduced on: . April 16. 2025
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