Res-Pg:1.5-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

Tel: (732)929-2005
Fax: (732)505-1918

April 5, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PRINTER CARTRIDGES to CVR; Star Data;

The Tree House, Inc.; Rasix Computer Center, Inc. dba Academic S
by Rama dba Signarama Freehold, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2

upplier; W.B. Mason Co., Inc. and Signs
023-53)

Official Resolution# [2023000453
Meeting Date 04/05/2023
Introduced Date 04/05/2023
Adopted Date 04/05/2023
Agenda ltem I-5

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-53
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER x |30 % % |2 |2
Joseph H. v v
Gary v v |v
Barbara Jo v v
Virginia E. v v
John P. v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie |, Guatiner”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:1.5-2

CONTRACT NO.MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

o @,

-

RESOLUTION

April 5, 2023

WHEREAS, on February 28, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PRINTER CARTRIDGES for the
County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
CVR ) Star Data Co.
1606 S. Bowling Green Dr. PO Box 12
Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Hewlett, NY 11557
(856) 857-0355 (201) 565-9876
The Tree House, Inc. Rasix Computer Center Inc. DBA
PO Box 413 Academic Supplier
Norwood, MA 02062 3519 Main St. Ste. 401
(800) 595-6651 Chula Vista, CA 91911
(800) 266-2892
W.B. Mason Co., Inc. Signs By Rama dba
59 Centre St. Signarama Freehold
Brockton, MA 02301 23 South Street
(888) 926-2766 Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 536-7575
Ribbons Express Inc. DBA Superior Office Systems
RE Business Solutions 19 Gross Avenue
1980 Old Cuthbert Rd. Edison, NJ 08837
Cherry Hill, NJ 08034 (609) 454-1189
(800) 533-9949
K&C Innovation Solutions, LLC Focus Camera LLC
2034 W. Ute St. 905 McDonald Ave. :
Tulsa, Ok 74127 Brooklyn, NY 11218
(540) 455-0595 (718) 431-7978

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest ‘qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely, CVR; STAR DATA CO.; THE'TREE
HOUSE, INC.; RASIX COMPUTER CENTER, INC., DBA ACADEMIC SUPPLIER; W.B.
MASON CO., INC. and SIGNS BY RAMA DBA SIGNARAMA FREEHOLD.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY as follows:

Introduced ol) April 5, 2023
Adopted on: April 5, 2023
Official Reso! qtion#: 2023000453
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 APRIL 5, 2023

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and
directed to enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing of Printer Cartridges for the
County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through April 4, 2024, a period
of one (1) year, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves
the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15. The County
reserves the right to extend the term of the contract for one (1) additional year by mutual

agreement between the County and the Contractor with no increase in base price, as follows:

A. CVR for one hundred fifty three (153) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 153, 154,
155, 156, 157, 158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164, 165, 166, 167, 168, 169, 170, 171, 172, 173,
174,175,176, 177, 178,179, 180, 181, 182, 183, 184, 185, 186, 187, 188, 189, 190, 191, 192,
193, 194, 195, 196, 197, 198, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205, 206, 207, 208, 209, 210, 211,
212,213,214, 215,216, 217,218, 219, 220, 221, 222, 223, 224, 225, 226, 227, 228, 229, 230,
231,232,233,234, 235,236,237, 238, 239, 240, 241, 242, 243, 244, 245, 246, 247, 248, 249,
250,251,252,253, 2’54, 255,256,257,258, 259, 260, 261, 262, 263, 264, 265, 266, 267, 268,
269, 270, 271, 272, 273, 274, 275, 276,277, 278, 279, 280, 281, 282 and 283.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section A (Item #'s 1 - 8) of $684.00. For a Total Lump Sum
Award Section B (Item #s 9 - 22) of $2,686.00. For a Total Lump Sum Award Section- G
(Item #'s 153 - 283) of $418,222.00.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
B. STAR DATA for twenty six (26) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 288,289,290, 291, 292, 293, 294, 295, 296, 297, 298, 299, 300, 301, 302, 304,
305, 306, 308, 309, 310, 312, 313, 314, 315 and 316. For a Total Lump Sum Award Section
I (Item #'s 288 - 292) of $7,823.00. For a Total Lump Sum Award Section J (Item #'s 293 -
302) of $6,303.00.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
C. THE TREE HOUSE, INC. for one hundred eleven (111) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54,
55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78,
79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101,
102, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113,114, 115,116, 117, 118, 119,
120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137,
138, 139, 140, 141, 142, 143 and 144. |
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section D (Item #'s 34 - 144) of $69,985.10.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
D. RASIX COMPUTER CENTER. INC. DBA ACADEMIC SUPPLIER for

eleven (11) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 145, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 284, 285, 286, 287 and 311.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section E (Item #'s 145 - 150) of $7,820.00. For a Total Lump

Sum Award Section H (Item #'s 284 - 287) of $2,506.35.

Introduced oh April 5, 2023
Adopted on: April 5, 2023
Official Reso] \Ftion#: 2023000453
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 APRIL 5, 2023

E. W.B. MASON CO.. INC. for thirteen (13) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 151 and 152.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section C (Item #'s 23 - 33) of $7,375.85. For a Total Lump
Sum Award Section F (Item #'s 151 and 152) of $1,243.38. |
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
F. SIGNS BY RAMA DBA SIGNARAMA FREEHOLD for two (2) items,

to wit:
ITEM NOS. 303 and 307.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Cbmmissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by
the Ocea:n’County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed
quantities shall bé indicated.

3. In the event of tie bids pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-6.1(d), bids are awarded
to the bidder(s) in closest distance to the Ocean County Administration Building, 101 Hooper
Avenue, Toms River, NJ, using the address indicated on their bid documentation.

4. Funds for the materials shall be available within the following funding
Sources: All County Departments O.E.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-53.

6. Be it further resolved that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made
available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Adjuster’s, Board of Commissioners, Bridges, Buildings & Grounds, Business Development
& Tourism, Central Supply Warehouse, Clerk of the Board, Consumer Affairs, Corrections,
County Administrator, County Clerk, County Connection, County Counsel, Cultural &
Heritage, Election Board, Employee Relations, Engineering, Extension Service, Fire Marshal
(Lakewood), Fire/First Aid Training Center, Human Services, Information Technology, |
Juvenile Services, Library, Management and Budget, Medical Examiner, Parks Department,
Planning Board, Police Academy, Printing and Graphic Arts, Prosecutor, Public Information,
Risk Management, Roads, Security, Senior Services, Shade Tree Commission, Sheriff’s 911
Communications, Sheriff’s CIU, Sheriff’s Emergency Management, Sheriff's Office,
Sheriff’s Warrants Div., Solid Waste Management, Superintendentl of Schools, Surrogate,
Tax Board, Transportation Department, Vehicle Services, Veteran's Service Bureau, Wireless

Technology and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: April 5, 2023
Adopted on: April 5, 2023
Official Resolution#: 2023000453




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT RE
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

PORT

CVR

Res-Pg:1.5-5

10. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this

solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

Line ltem Description

1 CLI221C- Cyan

SECTION A -] Il\l'KJET CARTRIDGES AND VALUE PACKS - CANON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

* "PRICE TABLES =

No Bid

Comments:

Mfr./Pkg:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

/ 5 EA © $13.00 $65.00
~
\/ 2 CLI221M - 5 EA $12.00 $60.00
Magenta
J 3 CLI221Y - Yellow 5 EA $13.00 $65.00
/ 4 CLI221GY - Gray 5 EA $13.00 $65.00
\/ 5 CL 241 - Color 7 EA $22.00 $154.00
J 6 PG! 220BK - Black v 5 EA $12.00 $60.00
/ 7 PG 240XL - Black 7 EA $20.00 $140.00
8 f’G] 35 - Black 5 EA $15.00 $75.00
TOTAL $684.00
Introduced on: April 5, 2023
. Adopted-on: April-5;202

Official RIRSORMSAk CHDC10808E REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 6



. Res-Pg:1.5-6
, ) CVR
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

SECTION B - INKJIET CARTRIDGES - EPSON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

9 EPS T676XLiZO - 5 EA $25.00 $125.00
Black

10 EPS T676XL220 - 5 EA $26:00 $130.00
Cyan

11 EPS T676XL320 - 5 EA $26.00 $130.00
Magenta ’

12 EPS T676XL420 - 5 EA $30.00 $150.00
Yellow

13 Epson 502, (3- 13 EA $35.00 $455.00
Pack: CMY '
Bottles)

(T502520-S)

14 Epson 502, Black 13 EA $20.00 $260.00
{T502120-5)

15 Epson 502, Cyan 10 EA $12.00 $120.00
(T502220-5)

16 Epson 502, 10 EA $12_.00 $120.00
Magenta
(T502320-S})

17 Epson 502, Yellow 10 EA $12.00 $120.00
(T502420-5) ‘"

18 Epson T542, Black 13 EA $12.00 $156.00
Ink Bottle

CUNN AL A AL A S AN &

19 Epson T542, Cyan 10 EA $22.00 $220.00
Ink Bottle

Introduced on: April 5, 2023
Adoptedoi: Aprit S, 2023

Official Re¥RfdSA%: obddbokbb!l REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Page 7




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER-CARTRIDGES

CVR

Res-Pg:1.5-7

Line {tem

Unit of Measure

20

Description

Epson T542,
Magenta Ink
Bottle

Quantity
10

EA

Unit Cost

$22.00 $220.00

Comments:

Mfr./Pkg:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

21

Epson T542,
Yellow Ink Bottle

10

EA

$22.00 $220.00

22

Epson 7542, (3-
Pack: CMY
Bottles)

13

EA

$20.00 $260.00

TOTAL

$2,686.00

Line Item

Description

SECTION C - EPSON STYLUS 9900 INK CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost - Total

No Bid

Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

Introduced on:

Photo Black, $141.00 ' $705.00
T596, 350ML

24 Matte Black, 5 EA $141.00 $705.00 ,
T596, 350ML

25 Light Black, T596, 5 EA $141.00° $705.00
350ML

26 Light Light Black, 5 EA $141.00 $705.00
T596, 350ML

27 Cyan - T596, 5 EA $141.00 $705.00
350ML

28 Light Cyan, T596, 5 EA $141.00 $705.00
350ML

29 Vivid Magenta, 5 EA $120.00 $600.00
7596, 350ML

April 5, 2023

Adopted 0B
" Official ReCGRRSH: QilsEAT REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 8 .



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

CVR

Res-Pg:1.5-8

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery, A.R.O:

147 CEO17A - Matte EA No Bid No Bid
Black/Chromatic
Red

148 CEOQ18A - EA No Bid No Bid
Magenta/Yellow

149 CEO19A - Light 'EA No Bid No Bid
Magenta/Light
Cyan

150 CEQ20A - Photo EA No Bid No Bid
Black/Light Gray

TOTAL $0.00

SECTION F - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - CANON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery, A.R.O.:
151 120 - Black EA No Bid No Bid
152 128 - Black EA No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $0.00

Line item

Description

SECTION G - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Unit of Measure

Quantity Unit Cost Delivery, A.R.O.:
153 C4129X - Black 2 EA $5.00 $10.00
\/ (HP 29X)
/ 154 C4182X - Black 2 EA $5.00 $10.00
1 (HP 8150)
Introduced on: April 5, 2023
Adoptedom: Aprit5,2023
Official RESSRfBionk: Didesbbbabd REPORT

Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 19



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

CVR

Res-Pg:1.5-9

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Comments: Mfr./Pke: Delivery, A.R.O.:

0 ag A0 AL AN Ak L

~ L S 4

lntrod% d on:

155 C8061X - Black 2 EA $5.00 $10.00
(HP 61X)
156 C9720A - Black 2 EA $5.00 $10.00
157 1€9721A - Cyan 2 EA $5.00 $10.00
158 C9722A - Yellow 2 EA $5.00 $10.00
159 C9723A - 2 EA $5.00 $10.00
Magenta
160 CBA40OA - Black 2 EA $140.00 $280.00
161 CB401A - Cyan 2 EA $160.00 $320.00
162° CB402A - Yellow 2 EA $160.00 $320.00
163 CBA403A - 2 EA $100.00 $200.00
Magenta
164 CC364A - Black 5 EA $100.00 $500.00
165 CC530A - Black 5 EA $70.00 $350.00
166 CC531A - Cyan 5 EA $60.00 $300.00
{ 167 CC532A - Yellow 5 EA $50.00 $250.00
168 CC533A- 5 EA $40.00 $200.00
Magenta
169 CESOX - Black 25 EA $160.00 $4,000.00
(High Yield)
170 CE250A - Black 2 EA $100.00 $200.00
171 'CE251A - Cyan 2 EA $175.00 '$350.00
April|5, 2023

Adopted-en:

Abnnl-8-2023
APH© =

Official FRRORGSAE: 20230

P

Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 20

00ESET REPORT



Res-Pg:1.5-10
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR
: Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltem Description

Quantity Unit of Measure

Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

\/ 172 CE252A - Yellow 2 EA $175.00 $350.00
\/ 173 "|CE253A - : 2 EA $200.00 $400.00
Magenta
/ 174 CE255A - Black 15 EA 7 $140.00 $2,100.00
\/ 175 CEZSSX - Black 7 ' EA $160.00 $1,120.00 A
(High Yield)
/ 176 | CE260A - Black 2 EA $130.00 $260.00
/ 177 CE261A - Cyan ' 2 EA $170.00 $340.00 .
/ 178 CE262A - YeIIowA 2 ‘ EA $180.00 $360.00
J 179 CE263A - 2 EA $200.00 $400.00 l
’ Magenta
\/ 18;) CE270A - Black 5 EA $229.00 $1,145.00
\/ 181 CE271A-Cyan 5 EA $370.00 $1,850.00
\/ 182 CE:72A - Yellow 5 ] EA $375.00 $1,875.00
\/ A 183 CE273A- 5 EA ‘ $375.00 $1,87S.00.
’ Magenta
\/ 184 CE285A - Black 2 EA $60.00 $120.00
\/ 185 CE390A - Black 2 EA | $160.00 $320.00
\/ 186 CE400A - Black 10 EA $120.00 $1,200.00
/ 187 CE401A - Cyan 5 EA $170.00 $856.00
\/ 188 CE402A - Yellow _ 5 EA $180.00 $900.00
¢ Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adopted is;

Offioial ROCORIASA: osadbiahs REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 21



, : Res-Pg:1.5-11
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT - CVR
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

J 189 CE403A - ) 5 EA 1 s185.00 $925.00
Magenta
\/ 190 CE410A - Black ’ 25 EA $79.00 $1,975.00
\/ 191 CE410X - Black 13 EA $88.00 $1,144.00
E {High Yield) .
/ 192 CE411A - Cyan 25 EA $102.00 $2,550.00
\/ - 193 CE412A - Yellow 25 EA $103.00. ) $2,575.00
194 CE413A - i 25 EA . $104.00 $2,600.00
- Magenta
\/ 195 CES05A - Black 13 EA . $76.00 $988.00
\/ 196 CE505X - Black . 5 EA $120.00 $600.00
(High Yield)
\/ 197 CE740A - Black 13 "EA $141.00 ‘ $1,833.00
/ 198 CE741A - Cyan 13 EA $249.00 $3,237.00
/ 199 CE742A - Yellow 13 EA $249.00 $3,237.00
/ 200 CE743A - 13 EA $249.00 $3,237.00
- Magenta -
/ 201 CF226A - Black 13 EA $110.00 $1,430.00
\/ 202 CF230A - Black 150 EA $48.00 $7,200.00
\/ 203 CF230X - Black 38 EA $88.00 $3,344.QO
) {High Yield)
/ 204 CF232A - Black 13 : EA $80.00 $1,040.00
Introduced on: April 5, 2023

I . Y. V. V.9

Adoptedon: Aprit5,2623—

Official FRARORGSM: DOSId00EEET REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 22



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Res-Pg:1.5-12
CVR

Line Item

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, AR.O.:
\/ 205 CF237A - Black 25 EA $161.00 $4,025.00
/ 206 CF237X - Black 25 EA $252.00 $6,300.00
" (High Yield)
\/ 207 CF251AM - (3- 6 EA $300.00 $1,800.00
Pack: CMY)
\/ 208 CF258A - Black 5 EA $95.00 $475.00
\/ 209 CF281A - Black 38 EA $150.00 $5,700.00
, / 210 CF281X - Black 13 EA $200.00 $2,600.00
(High Yield)
/ 211 CF287X - Black 13 EA $276.00 $3,588.00
(High Yield)
/ 212 CF360A - Black 25 EA $144.00 $3,600.00
213 CF360X - Black 33 EA $202.00 $6,666.00
‘ ’ (High Yield)
\/ 214 CF361A - Cyan 15 EA $165.00 $2,475.00
215 CF361X - Cyan 33 EA $279.00 $9,207.00
{High Yield)
/ 216 CF362A - Yellow 15 EA $82.00 $1,230.00
\/ 217 CF362X - Yellow 33 EA $288.00 $9,504.00
(High Yield)
J - 218 CF363A - 15 EA $165.00 $2,475.00
Magenta
A
\/ 219 CF363X - Magenta 33 EA $255.00 $8,415.00
(High Yield)
Introduced-on: Aprit5,2623
Adoptedon Aprits, 2023
Official RISORASHH: CA0eadbBats REPORT

Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 23



Res-Pg:1.5-13
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR
Bid No. TBD '
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.Q.:

\/ 220 CF410A - Black 15 EA $80.00 $1,200.00
221 CF410X - Black 33 EA $134.00 $4,422.00 -
. (High Yield)
222 CF410XD - (2- 15 EA $240.00 $3,600.00
/ Pack: High Yield
Black)
\/ 223 CF411A - Cyan 15 EA ' $90.00 $1,350.00
224 CF411X - Cyan 33 EA $20000 |  $6,600.00
) (High Yield) i
/ 225 CF412A- Yellow 15 EA $95.00 $1,425.00
' 226 ' CF412X - Yellow 33 EA $177.00 $5,841.00
B {High Yield)
/ 227 CF413A- Magenta | 15 EA | $80.00 | $1,200.00 .
228 CFA13X - Magenta 33 EA $140.00 $4,620.00
\/ (High Yield)
229 CF460X - (High 13 EA $290.00 $3,770.00
" Yield: Black) (HP
656X)
\/ 230 CF461X - (High 13 EA $400.00 $5,200.00
) Yield: Cyan) (HP !
656X)
\/ 231 CF462X - (High 13 EA $400.00 $5,200.00
Yield: Yellow) (HP
656X)
\/ 232 CF463X - (High . 13 EA $420.00 $5,460.00
Yield: Magenta)
| {HP B56X)
Introduced on: Aprill5, 2023

Adoptedon: Aprit 5, 2023

Official FRRORASA: D0530b4kAST REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 24



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

" Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

CVR

Res-Pg:1.5-14

Line item

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

\/ 233 CF500A - Black 10 EA $76.00 $760.00
. 234 CF500X - (High 33 EA $89.00 $2,937.00
\/ Yield: Black) (HP
' 202X)
/ 235 CF501A - Cyan 10 EA $76.00 $760.00
236 CF501X - (High 33 EA $78.00 $2,574.00
) Yield: Cyan) (HP
202X)
\/ 237 {CF502A - Yellow 10 EA $77.00 $770.00
238 CF502X - (High 33 EA $80.00 $2,640.00
/ Yield: Yellow) (HP
202X)
\/ 239 CF503A- Magenta 10 EA $66.00 $660.00
\/ 240 CF503X - (High 33 EA $85.00 $2,805.00
Yield: Magenta)
{HP 202X)
' 241 Q1338A - Black 5 EA $15.00 $75.00
- ] (HP 38A)
\/ 242 Q2610A - Black 5 EA $10.00 $50.00
K (HP 10A)
/ , 243 Q2612A - Black 5 EA $66.00 $330.00
(HP 12A)
\/ 244 Q5942A — Black 5 EA $200.00 $1,000.00
(HP 42A)
J 245 Q5942X - (high 5 EA $259.00 $1,295.00
Yield: Black) {HP

Ho23

lntroducEd on: : Apri
Adopte T i

520 —

Official RBSHRADAEDLICRINEAST REPORT

O =V

Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Page 25



Res-Pg:1.5-15
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

\/ 246 Q5950A — Black 5 EA $100.00 $500.00
J 247 Q5951A - Cyan 5 EA $100.00 SSO0.00
/ 248 Q5952A - Yellow 5 EA $150.00 $750.00
\/ 249 Q5953A - 5 EA $200.00 $1,000.00
Magenta
J 250 Q6000A - Black 10 EA $5.00 $50.00
\/ 251 Q6001A - Cyan 5 EA $5.00 $25.00
J 252 Q6002A - Yellow 5 EA $5.00 $25.00
253 Q6003A - 5 EA $100.00 $500.00
/ Magenta
) \/ 254 Q6470A - Black 5 EA $50,00 $250.00
\/‘ 255 Q7553A - Black 7 EA $70.00 $490.00
\/ 256 Q7581A - Cyan 5 EA $20.00 $100.00
\/ 257 Q7582A - Yellow 5 EA $20.00 $100.00
/ 258 Q7583A - 5 EA $20.00 $100.00
Magenta
/ 259 W1120A - Black 13 EA $216.00 $2,808.00
\/ 260 W2020A Black 75 EA $73.00 $5,475.00
/ 261 W2020X {High 113 EA $140.00 $15,820.00
\/- Yield: Black)
262 W2021A Cyan 75 EA $80.00 $6,000.00
Introduced on: April 5, 2023
Adoptedom: Aprit5;:-2023
Official RESIRASAY. DEOR8NaT REPORT

Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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Res-Pg:1.5-16
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT , CVR
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line [tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments: Mfr./Pka: Delivery, A.R.O.:

\/ 263 W2021X- (High 113 EA $202.00 $22,826.00
Yield: Cyan)
\/ 264 v W2022A Yellow 75 EA $94.00 $7,050.00
265 W2022X - (High 113 EA $201.00 $22,713.00 '
. ) Yield: Yellow)
/ 266 W2023A Magenta 75 ‘ EA $84.00 $6,300.00
/ 267 W2023X - (High 113 EA $202.00 $22,826.00
’ Yield: Magenta)
\/ 268 W2060A - Black 5 EA $50.00 $250.00
\/ 269 W2061A - Cyan 5 EA $50.00 $250.00
\/ 270 W?2062A - Yellow 5 EA $50.00 | $250.00
271 W2063A - 5 EA $50.00 © $250.00
. Magenta
272 W2110A - Black 25 EA | 560_.00 $1,500.00
‘ (HP 206A)
/ 273 W2111A - Cyan 25 EA $66.00 $1,650.00
5 ' {HP 206A)
274 W2112A - Yellow 25 ‘ EA - $66.00 $1,650.00
4 (HP 206A)
/ 275 W2113A - 25 EA $66.00 $1,650.00
| Magenta (HP -
206A)
\/ 276 W2120X - {(High 90 EA $209.00 $18,810.00
Yield: Black)
Introduced on: April 5, 2023
Adopted-on:- April-5,2023

Official RBQ:I?@&M#DQIQU(M@B?F REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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Res-Pg:1.5-17
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

277 W2121X - {High 90 EA $295.00 $26,550.00
Yield: Cyan)

278 W2122X - (High | 90 EA $280.00 $25,200.00
Yield: Yellow)

279 W2123X - (High 90 EA $295.00 $26,550.00

Yield: Magenta)

280 W?2310A - Black 10 i EA $66.00 $660.00

LRSS S

281 W2311A - Cyan 10 ‘ EA $49.00 $490.00
282 W2312A - Yellow 10 EA $49.00 . $490.00
T W2313A - 10 EA $49.00 $490.00
Magenta
TOTAL ‘ ' $418,222.00

SECTION H - HEWLETT PACKARD - PAGEWIDE PRINTER CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTIONS

No Bid Comments: Mfr./Pkg.: Delivery, AR.O.:

284 FGT84AN - Black EA No Bid No Bid ' X
(HP 972X)

Line Item Description

Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost

285 LOR98AN - Cyan EA No Bid No Bid X
(HP 972X) :

286 LOSO1AN - EA No Bid No Bid X
Magenta (HP .
972X)

287 LOSO4AN - Yellow EA No Bid No Bid X
(HP-972X)

Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adopte 15;

Offioial RERASAH:CA0es0bbaNS REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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' Res-Pg:1.5-18
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT : STAR DATA
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg.:

Delivery, A.R.O.:
$2,856.00

SECTION I - XEROX (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg.:

Delivery, A.R.O.:
\/ 113R00719.- Cyan . $139.00 - $1,807.00
289 113R00720 - 13 EA $1\39.00 $1,807.00
\/ Magenta
\/ 290 113R00721 - 13 ) EA $1.39.00 $1,807.00
Yellow : .
\/ 291 ' 113R00722 - 13 . EA $134.00 $1,742.00
Black
\/l 292 113R00726 - High 3 EA $220.00 $660.00
'Yield Black
TOTAL - ‘ - $7,823.00

SECTION J - BROTHER (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) "

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost | Comments: Mfr./Pkg.: Delivery, A.R.O.:

\/ TN 350-Black ' $420.00 '

\/ 294 TN 430 - Black 7 ‘EA $54.00 $378.00

: \/ 295 TN 450 - High 10 EA $48.00 - $480.00

Yield Black

\/ 296 TN 460 - Black 25 EA $75.00 $1,875.00
Introduced-on: Aprit5,2623
Adopteém April R,jﬂ')'!

Official RRROIBOGHE: R0XI00AEHST REPORT
' Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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| Res-Pg:1.5-19
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

STAR DATA

Line Item

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Comments:

Mfr./Pkg.:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

\/ 297 TN 580 - Black 2 EA $103.00 $206.00 -
J 298 TN 720 - Black 5 EA $57.00 $285.00
/ 299 DR-350 - Drum Kit 2 _EA $105.00 $210.00
/ 300 DR-400 - Drum Kit 10 EA $149.00 $1,490.00
) \/ 301 DR-420- [?rum Kit 2 EA $70.00 $140.00
| 302 DR-720 - Drum Kit 7 EA $117.00 $819.00
TOTAL $6,303.00

Line ltem

Description

Toner
#1070066386, 2
Bottles, 1 Waste
Container, NO

SUBSTITUTIONS

Quantity

SECTION K - OCE - LARGE FORMAT PRINTER

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total

No Bid

Comments:

Mfr./Pkg.:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

TOTAL

'$0.00

Line Item

' Description

SECTION L - NEW ITEMS

|Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Brother — Discount Off the Current List Price

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

No Bid

Comments:

Introduced on:

April 5, 2023

H - T L

Adoptcd Ol A

Official RROROSAK:

CHOGAODOGBET REPORT

Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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‘ _ Res-Pg:1.5-20
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ‘ STAR DATA .
Bid No. TBD :
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

\/ 305 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off % - $39.00
the Current List Price

\/ 306 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off % $42.00
the Current List Price

307 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Dell - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off the % $7.00
Current List Price

_ 308 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Epsdn - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off % $40.00
\/ the Current List Price '

AN

309 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Inklet and Value Packs - % $45.00
Discount Off the Current List Price :

\/ 310 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Printhead Cartridges - % $41.00
Discount Off the Current List Price -
311 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard — Discount Off the Current List % $43.00
Price
\/ 312 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Konica Minolta — Discount Off the Current List % $43.00
Price :
\/ 313 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Lexmark — Discount Off the Current List Price % $42.00
\/ 314 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Okidata — Discount Off the Current List Price % $42.00
\/ 315 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Ricoh — Discount Off the Current List Price % $43.00
\/ 316 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Xerox — Discount Off the Current List Price % $42.00
Introduced on: April 5, 2023
Adoptedon: Aprit 5,20

Official REORASAH: BGEBET REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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Res-Pg:1.5-21

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

THE TREE HOUSE, INC.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:
30 Vivid Light 5 — - EA $137.80 $689.00
’ Magenta, T596, ’

350ML

31 Yellow, T596, 5 EA $137.80 ' $689.00
350ML

32 ‘Green, T596, 5 EA $137.80 $689.00
350ML

33 Orange, T$96; 5 EA $137.80 . $689.00

. 350ML .

TOTAL - $7,579.00

“SECTION D - INKJET CARTRIDGES AND VALUE PACKS - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

34 3JAOOAN#140 - 50 EA $29.60 ’ $1,480.00
Cyan (HP 962XL)

Magenta (HP
962XL)

36 3JAD2AN#140 - 50" EA - $29.60 $1,480.00 )
Yellow (HP 962XL).

J 35 3JAD1AN#140 - 50 EA $29.60 - $1,480.00

37 3JA03AN#140 - 50 ’ EA $37.00 . $1,850.00
Black (HP 962XL)

J 38 3YQ26AN#140 - 7 EA $45.60 $319.20
' (4-Pack: CMYK)
(HP 910)
Introduced on: April 5,2023
Adopted-ons Apri-8,2023

Official FRRORGEM: ROTIO00ESET REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 9



Res-Pg:1.5-22

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT THE TREE HOUSE, INC.

Bid No. TBD : :
PRINTER CARTRIDGES , -

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

39 51645A - Black 7 EA $49.45 $346.15
{HP 45) ' .

40 B3B32FN - (3- 7 EA . $‘2.OOA i $14.00
Pack: CMY) {HP
933)

41 {B6Y15A - Matte 13 EA $275.00 $3,575.00

Black (HP 771A)

42 B6Y16A - Red (HP ] 7 EA $275.00 $1,925.00
_ 771A) , A

43 B6Y17A - 7 EA $275.00 $1,925.00'
Magenta {HP ' ’
771A)

44 B6Y18A - Yellow 7 EA $275.00 $1,925.00
(HP 771A)

45 B6Y19A - Lt. 7 EA $275.00 $1,925.00
Magenta {HP S
771A)

46 B6Y20A - Lt. Cyan 7 EA $275.00 $1,925.00
(HP 771A) .

47 B6Y21A - Photo 7 EA $275.00 $1,925.00

| Black {HP 771A)

48 B6Y22A - Lt. Grey 6 ' EA $275.00 $1,650.00
(HP 771A)

49 C1823D - (Tri- 5 EA | $2.00 $10.00
| Color: CMY) (HP
23)

(L A AL ARl AUl A A K

50 | C2PO5AN - Black 25 EA $36.85 $921.25
(HP 62XL)
Introducdd on: __Aprill5, 2023
Adoptedorm; Aprit5,2023

Official RRBOGESAY: 845887 REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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Res-Pg:1.5-23
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT THE TREE HOUSE, INC.
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

51 'C2PO7AN - (Tri- 25 EA $38.45 $961.25
Color: CMY) {HP : ' i
52XL)

52 C2P23AN - Black 13 EA $32.00 $416.00
(HP 934XL) (High
Yield)

53 C2P24AN - Cyan 12 EA $20.00 $240.00
(HP 935XL) : - - :

54 C2P25AN - 13 EA $20.00 $260.00
Magenta (HP
935XL)

55  |c2P26AN - Yellow 13 EA $20.00 $260.00
(HP 935XL) 4 :

56 C4902AN - Black 13 EA $2.00 = $26.00
(HP 940)

57 C4903AN - Cyan 7 EA $200 $14.00 -
(HP 940)

58 CA4904AN - 7 EA $2.00 $14.00
Magenta (HP 940)

59 CA905AN - Yellow 7 EA $2.00 $14.00
" |(HP 940)

60 C6578A - (Tri~ S EA $2.00 $10.00 -
Color: CMY) (HP ‘
78XL)

61 | C6578AN - (Tri- 5 ' EA $2.00 $10.00
Color: CMY) (HP
78XL) (High Yield)

RS RN SENES

Introduced on: April 5, 2023

‘Adopted-on: Aprit5,-2623

Official RRBEIBESWY: RO300dEET REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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Res-Pg:1.5-24
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

' THE TREE HOUSE, INC..

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

62 €6578D - (Tri- 5 EA >$2,00 $10.00
’ Color: CMY]) (HP
78)

63 C6578DN - {Tri- _ 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
Color: CMY) {HP
78) (High Yield)

64 C6615A - Black » 5 EA $2.00 ‘ $10.00
(HP 17)

(HP 15)

66 C6625A - (Tri- 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
Color: CMY) (HP
17)

67 C6656A - Black 20 ) EA $32.55 $651.00
{HP 56)

68 C6656AN - Black 30 ; EA $32.55 $976.50
(HP 56) {High
Yield)

J 65 C6615DN - Black 5 EA $2.00 $10.00

69 C6657A - (Tri- 15 EA $54.50 $817.50
- Color: CMY) (HP -
57)

\/ 70 C6657AN - (Tri- 25 EA $54.50 $1,362.50
Color: CMY) (HP -
57)

J 71 C8721WN - Black 13 EA $2.00 $26.00
(HP 02)

J 72 C8765WN — Black - 10 EA $33.30 $333.00
(HP 94) ’

Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adopted-en: April-5-2023

Official RBBQRGSTA: ROX300d4EST REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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' THE TREE HOUSE, INC Res-Pg:l.5-25
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT i ! ) .
" Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltem Description Quantity

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:
J ) 73 C8766WN - (Tri- 10 EA l $40.00 $400.00
Color: CMY) (HP |
95)
\/ 74 C8767WN —Black 18 EA $2.00 $36.00
‘ (HP 96) :
J 75 'C8771WN - Cyan 5 . EA $2.00 $10.00
- (HP 02)
J 76 C8772WN - 5 : EA $200 $10.00
C Magenta (HP 02)
\/ 77 C8773WN - 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
Yellow (HP 02)
78 C8774WN - Light - 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
- Cyan (HP 02) .
J 79 C8775WN - Light 5 EA $2.00 v $10.00
Magenta (HP 02)
80 C9353FN - [2- 20 EA $2.00 $40.00
. Pack: CMYK} {(HP
96 Black & HP 97
Tri-Color)
\/ 81 " | c9363WN - Color 18 . EA $54.50 . $981.00
(HP 97)
\/ 82 C9364WN - Black 13 : EA $32.55 $423.15
. {HP 98)
‘ 83 C9385AN - Black 10 EA $2.00 $20.00
) (HP 88)
84 C9386AN - Cyan 5 EA . $2.00 $10.00 .
(HP 88) :
Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adopted-on: Aprit-5-2023

Official RRECIBESHL R0X300aE3$T REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 13




Res-Pg:1.5-26

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT THE TREE HOUSE, INC.

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

Line item

' 85 C9387AN - 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
4 Magenta (HP 88) :
86 C9388AN - Yellow 5 EA ‘ $2.00 $10.00
: (HP 88)
‘ 87 C9391AN - Cyan 5 EA $2.00 $10.00 -
) {HP 88XL) : .
88 C9392AN - 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
p Magenta (HP '
8axL)
|
/ 89 C9393AN - Yellow 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
? {HP 88XL)
30 1€9396AN - Black "5 EA $2.00 $10.00
- (HP 88XL)

91 CEO37A - Matte 2 EA 1 $2.00 $4.00
Black Ink Tank

92 | CEO38A - Red Ink 2 EA $2.00 $4.00
. Tank

93 CEQ39A - 2 EA $2.00 $4.00
Magenta Ink Tank

Ink Tank

95 CEO41A - Light 2 EA $2.00 - $4.00
Magenta Ink Tank

96 CEQ42A - Light 2 EA $2.00 $4.00
Cyary Ink Tank

\/ 94 CE040A - Yellow | - 2 EA $2.00 $4.00

97 CEO43A - Photo 2 ' EA $2.00 . $4.00

Black Ink Tank
lntroduce|d on: April 5, 2023

Adoptedom: Aprit5,-2023
Official REBEIGQSH: DOY30HdENT REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
- Page 14




Res-Pg:1.5-27

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT THE TREE HOUSE, INC.

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

98 CEO44A - Light 2 : EA $2.00 $4.00
Gray Ink Tank

99 CH561WN - Black 2 EA $17.90 $35.80
(HP 61) ‘

100 CH562 - (Tri- 2 EA $24.05 $48.10
Color: CMY) (HP :
61)

101 CH644A 7 EA $68.85 $481.95
Maintenance
Cartridge (HP 771)

102 CNO45AN - Black ( 20 EA . $15.00 $300.00
‘HP950 XL) :

'103 CNO46AN - Cyan 20 EA $12.00 $240.00
(HP 951 XL) -

104 CNO47AN - 20 EA $12.00 $240.00
Magenta {HP 951
XL)

105 CNO48AN - Yellow 20 EA $12.00 '$240.00 R
(HP 951 XL) -

106 CNO49AN - Black 2 EA $26.65 $53.30
{HP 950)

107 CNOS0AN - Cyan 7 EA $19.00 $133.00
(HP 951)

108 CNO51 - Magenta 13 EA T $19.00 $247.00
{HP 951 XL) :

109 CNO51AN - 13 EA $19.00 $247.00
Magenta (HP 951)

A N L N NN

Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adoptedon: Aprit5;2623

Official RRRODGSHE: Qé)ﬁdbdﬁw REPORT
‘Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 15




Res-Pg:1.5-28
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT mE TREE HOUSE, INC.
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total . Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

110 CNOS2AN - Yellow 13 EA $19.00 . $247.00
. (HP 951)
111 CNO53AN - Black 25 . " EA $34.40 $860.00 <
) (HP 932 XL) '
. 112 CNO54AN - Cyan 25 . EA $16.80 $420.00
i (HP 933XL)
113 CNOS5AN - 25 : EA $16.80 + $420.00
\/ Magenta (HP
933XL)
114 CNO56AN - Yeliow 25 EA $16.80 $420.00
L (HP»933XL)
) 115 CNO57AN - Black 13 EA $19.50 $253.50
\/ (HP 932) ’
116 - CNOS8AN - Cyan 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
: {HP 933}
\/ 117 CNO59AN - 5 ] EA $2.00 $10.00
- Magenta
118 CNOG0AN - Yellow 10 EA . $2.00 $20.00
- {HP 933) :
/ 119 CNGZSAM - Black 20 EA $110.85 $2,217.00
/ 120 CN627AM - 20 EA $110.85 $2,217.00
Magenta
\/ 121 CNB628AM - 20 EA $110.85 $2,217.00
; Yellow ) . .-
\/ 122 CN625AM - Cyan 20 EA $110.85 $2,217.00
‘ : cz1308-C 13 EA : 26.90 '$349.70
lntro\ézf d on: 1,23 April g, %883 yan s s /
Adopted Aprit5,2023

Official FRRORASH: 865087 REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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‘ - , ‘ Res-Pg:1.5-29
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT - THE TREE HOUSE, INC.
Bid No. TBD ,

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltem

Description Delivery, A.R.O.:

Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments: Mfr./Pkg:

‘ 124 CZ131A- 13 $349.70 )
. ' Magenta
/ 125 CZ132A - Yellow 13 B A $26.90 $349.70
/ 126 CZ133A - Black 13 EA $52.40 ' $681.20
\/ 127 FEU15AN - Black 113 EA $28.15 $3,180.95
‘ (HP 952)
‘ 128 LOS49AN#140 - | 113 EA $19.80 $2,237.40
; Cyan (HP 952)
/ 129 1 LOS52AN#140.- 113 EA - - $19.80 52,237.40
Magenta (HP 952)
/ 130. LOSESAN#MO - 113 EA $19.80 » $2,-237.40
' Yellow (HP 952)
‘ 131 NIHB5FN - (3- 38 EA $2.00 $76.00
\/ Pack: CMY) (HP
935)
. 132 ‘N9K27AN‘- (3- 50 EA $59.45 $2,972.50
Pack: CMY) (HP )
952) {High Yield)
\/ 133 P2V68A - Cyan 5 EA $135.65 $678.25
) 134 P2VE9A - -5 : EA $135.65 $678.25
. Magenta N ’
/ 135 " |P2v70A - Yellow 5 EA $135.65 $678.25
/ 136 P2V71A - Matte 5 EA $135.65 $678.25
’ Black ’
\/ 137 P2V72A - Gray 5 -EA $135.65 | $678.25
Introducedon: April 5, 2023 :

Adoptedomm: Aprii5, 20

Official RESSRRSA-DAIRoUBRS REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 17



| . - ! Res-Pg:1.5-30
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT - THE TREE HOUSE, INC.

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES ' _ /

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

138 P2V73A- Photo 5 - EA $135.65 - $678.25 ' v -
. Black :
139 TOA39AN - (4- 13 EA . $34.20 $444.60
Pack: CMYK) {HP
|902) .
/ 140 - T6MO2AN (HP 5 ) EA $21.60 . $108.00
. 902 XL} - Cyan
141 "TEMOBAN (HP 5 EA $21.60 $108.00

902 XL) - Magenta

142 l T6M10AN. {HP | 5 EA $21.60 $108.00
902 XL) - Yellow

L0 AN A

143 TEML4AN (HP 5 EA $36.80 $184.00.
902XL) - Black . )
144 XAEQ7AN - (4- 38 EA $87.55 $3,326.90
Pack: CMYK) (HP
952)
TOTAL ' : $69,085.10

SECTION E - PRINTHEAD CARTRIDGES AND CLEANERS - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O:

145 C4§OOA - 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
Black/Yeliow
146 C4901A - 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
Magenta/Cyan ’
Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adopte : T

Offreiar BIRaRRS Ak CRLLUIERT REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 18



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT RePORT RASIX COMPUTER CENTER INT. DBA ACADEMIC SUPPLIER

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Res-Pg:1.5-31

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:
138 v P2V73A - Photo 5 EA $136.00 $680.00 ‘
Black :
139 TOA39AN - (8- 13 EA $71.00 $923.00
Pack: CMYK) (HP
902)
140 T6MO2AN (HP 5 EA $2;.00 : $110.00

902 XL} - Cyan

{ 141 TSMOGAN (HP 5 EA $22.00 . $110.00
. 902 XL) - Magenta .

142 T6M10AN (HP . 5 EA $22.00 $110.00
902 XL) - Yellow

143 T6M14AN (HP 5 EA $37.00 $185.00
902XL) - Black :
144 * |X4EQ7AN - (4- 38 EA " $88.00 $3,344.00
Pack: CMYK) (HP
952)
TOTAL ‘ ' ' $76,255.00

“SECTION E - PRINTHEAD CARTRIDGES AND CLEANERS - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O:
/ 145 C4900A - 5 . EA " $2.00 $10.00 , ’ -
’ Black/Yellow
]
\/ 146 C4901A - 5 EA $2.00 $10.00 -
Magenta/Cyan . . .
Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adoptedom; ApritS, 2023
official RRRLIBESA: 30%2d8dkddT REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT RepORT RASIX COMPUTER CENTER INT. DBA ACADEMIC SUPPLIER

Bid No. TBD
‘PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Res-Pg:1.5-32

Line [tem Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Comments:

Mfr./Pke:

Delivery, A.R.O:

147 |cEO17A-Matte 10 EA $195.00 $1,950.00
\/ ‘ Black/Chromatic
Red
\/‘ 148 CEO18A - 10 EA $195.00 $1,950.00
Magenta/Yellow
' 149 CEO19A - Light 10 - EA $195.00 $1,950.00
J Magenta/Light
: Cyan
/ 150 CEQ20A - Photo 10 EA $195.00 $1,950.00
: Black/Light Gray
TOTAL $7,820.00

Line item

Description

SECTION F - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - CANON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Comments: Delivery, A.R.O.:
151 ) 120 - Black 6 EA $173.69 $1,042.14
152 128 - Black 6 EA $84.91 $509.46
TOTAL $1,551.60

SECTION G - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description

C4129X - Black

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Comments:

Mfr./Pkg:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

$10.00
{HP 29X) .
154 C4182X - Black 2 EA $5.00 $10.00
’ (HP 8150)
Introduc : il 5, 2023
Adopted o) il ]
Offreial KEBRRSA: B HVEET REPORT

" 'Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 19



S | ' . Res-Pg:1.5-33
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT RASIX COMPUTER CENTER INT. DBA ACADEMIC SUPPLIER | 9

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

W2121X - (High. $295.00 $26,550.00
Yield: Cyan)
278 W2122X - {High 90 EA $295.00 $26,550.00
Yield: Yellow) ' '
279 W2123X ~ (High S0 . EA . $295.00 $26,550.00

Yield: Magenta)

280 W2310A - Black | 10 EA $47.51 $475.10

281 W2311A - Cyan 10 EA 45089 $508.90
282 “ W2312A - Yellow 10 - EA $50.89 $508.90
283 {w2313A- 10 EA $50.89 | $508.90
Magenta
TOTAL ‘ $421,415.53

SECTION H - HEWLETT PACKARD - PAGEWIDE PRINTER CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg.: Delivery, A.R.O.:

F6T84AN - Black 7 - $121.59 $851,13
[ (HP 972X)

285 1LOR98AN - Cyan | .5 EA $118.23 $591.15
(HP 972X)

286 LOSO1AN - 5 EA $118.23 $591.15
Magenta (HP
972X)

NENENPN

287 LOSO4AN - Yellow 4 EA $118.23 - $472.92
{HP 972X)

Introduced on: April 5, 2023 '
Adopted g ] N
oftial FRBRASA BEAJHERST REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRI_DGES
Page 28




| | ' Res-Pg:1.5-34
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT RASIX COMPUTER CENTER INT. DBA ACADEMIC SUPPLIER

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line [tem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off
the Current List Price -

306 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off % $30.00
the Current List Price’ ’ ’
307 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Dell - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off the % $5.00
Current List Price ’

308 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Epson - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off % $20.00
the Current List Price ’
309 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Inklet and Value Packs - % $36.00
Discount Off the Current List Price . ‘
310 |Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Printhead Cartridges - % $36.00
Discount Off the Current List Price g
J 311 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard — Discount Off the Current List % $46.00
| Price
312 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Konica Minolta ~ Discount Off the Current List "% $30.00
- Price
313 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Lexmark — Discount Off the Current List Price % $42.00
314 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Okidata — Discount Off the Current List Price % - $30.00
315 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Ricoh — Discount Off the Current List Price % $30.00
316 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Xerox — Discount Off the Current List Price % $30.00
Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adopted 0on;

Official REROIRRSAL BBkndiST REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 31



: . Res-Pg:1.5-35
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT : W.B. MASON CO., INC.

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:
20 Epson T542, 10 $21.43 $214.30 EPST542320S 1-3 days
Magenta Ink ’ i ;
Bottle
21 Epson T542, ) 10 EA $21.43 ‘ $214.30 EPST542420S 1-3 days

Yellow Ink Bottle

22 Epson T542, (3- 13 EA $64.28 $835.64 .EPST542520S 1-3 days
Pack: CMY
Bottles)
TOTAL $3,526.46

SECTION C - EPSON STYLUS 9900 INK CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

23 Photo Black, 5 EA $133.48 $667.40 EPST596100 1-3 days
T596, 350ML
\/ 24 Matte Black, 5 EA $133.48 $667.40 ' EPST596800 1-3 days
T596, 350ML
\/ 25 Light Black, T596, 5 EA $133.48 $667.40 ' A EPST596700 1-3 days
’ 350ML
\/ 26 Light Light Black, 5 ' EA $133.48 $667.40 EPST596900 1-3 days
’ T596, 350ML
/ 27 Cyan - T596, 5 EA $133.48 $667.40 EPST596200 1-3 days
) 350ML ’
\/ 28 Light Cyan, T596, 5 EA $140.37 $701.85 . EPST596500 1-3 days
’ 350ML"
,l
\/ 29 Vivid Magenta, 5 EA $133.48 $667.40 | - EPST596300 1-3 days
_|T596, 350ML
Introduced on: Aprill 5, 2023
Adopfnd on— AP S 2023 T

Official RERORTEA¥: CROZIOROEBE REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 8



\

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORf
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

- W.B. MASON CO., INC.

Res-Pg:1.5-36

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

30 Vivid Light . s EA $133.48 $667.40 . EPST596600 1-3 days
\/ Magenta, T596,
350ML
/ 31 Yellow, T596, 5 EA $133.48 $667.40 | EPST596400 1-3 days
. 350ML :
\/ 32~ |Green,T596, 5 EA $133.48 $667.40 . EPST596B00 1-3 days
~ 350ML
33 |orange, T596, 5 EA $133.48 $667.40 . EPSTS96A00 1-3.days
350ML
TOTAL $7,375.85

SECTION D - INKIET CARTRIDGES ‘AND VALUE PACKS - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg:

34 3JAOOAN#140 - 50 EA $30.21 $1,510.50 ) H EW3JAOOAN
Cyan {HP 962XL}

Delivery, A.R.O.:
1-3 days

35 ’ 3JAOLIAN#140 - . 50 EA : $30.21 $1,510.50 : HEW3JAO1AN
Magenta (HP
962XL)

1-3 days

36 3JA02AN#i4O - " 50 EA $30.21 $1,510.50 HEW3JAO2AN
Yellow (HP 962XL} 1

1-3 days

37 3JAD3AN#140 - 50 EA $38.38 $1,919.00 HEW3JAD3AN
Black (HP 962XL) :

1-3 days

38 3YQ26AN#140 - EA No Bid No Bid X
{(4-Pack: CMYK) :
(HP 910)

Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adopted-on: Apri-5:-2023

Official RASORASAL: DEOCIOBBET REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 9



| _ Res-Pg:1.5-37
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT » W.B. MASON CO., INC.

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER.CARTRIDGES

Line [tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O:
147 CEO17A - Matte 10 EA . $203.68 . $2,036.80 HEWCEO17A 1-3 days
Black/Chromatic ]
Red . ; ‘ 5
148 CEQ18A - 10 EA $203.70 $2,037.00 HEWCEOQ18A 1-3 days

Magenta/Yellow

149 CEOQ19A - Light 10 EA $203.68 $2,036.80 . ‘ HEWCEO19A 1-3 days
Magenta/Light
Cyan
150 CE020A - Photo 10 EA $203.70 $2,037.00 ‘ ) HEWCEO20A 1-3 days
Black/Light Gray
TOTAL $8,147.60

SECTION F - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - CANON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

\/ 151 120 - Black 6 EA $130.94 $785.64 S CNM2617B00L  |1-3 days
/ 152 1128 - Black 6 EA $76.29 $457.74 CNM3500BO01AA | 2-3 days
TOTAL : $1,243.38

SECTION G - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

% Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Delivery, A.R.O.:

153 C4129X - Black | ' EA No Bid NoBid . | X
(HP 29X)

154 C4182X - Black EA No Bid - No Bid X
(HP 8150)
Introduced on: April 5, 2023
Adoptedom: Aprit 5, 2023
Official Re¥aRfBSAk: Didadbybabl REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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' Res-Pg:1.5-38
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SIGNS BY RAMA DBA SIGNARAMA FREEHOLD

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pkg.: Deliery, A.R.O.:
293 7 TN 3;50 - Black 7 . EA $78.00 $546.00 - ‘ ; " |Brother | Within 4-5 Bus
Days
294~ TN 430 - Black 7 EA | $64.00 $448.00 " BE
295 TN 450 - High 10 EA . $63.00 $630.00 u ' v
Yield Black :
296 TN 460 - Black .25 EA $91.00 $2,275.00 " "
297 TN 580 - Black 2 EA $108.00 $216.00 " Y
298 TN 720 - Black' ! 5 EA $70.00 $350.00 ) " "
299 DR-350 - Drum Kit 2 EA $99.00 . $198.00 ' " "
300 DR-400 - Drum Kit 10 EA $127.99 _$1’279_90, " "
301 DR-420 - Drum Kit 2 EA . " $90.00 $180.00 BE "
302 |DR-720- Drum Kit 7 EA $144.99 $1,014.93 - " "
TOTAL | $7,137.83

SECTION K - OCE - LARGE FORMAT PRINTER

Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Toner $260.00
» #1070066386, 2 ’

Bottles, 1 Waste
“| Container, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

Line item Description Quantity Comments:

Mfr./Pkg.: Delivery, A.R.O.:

$2,080.00 ’ Oce' Plotwave

Within 4- 5 Bus
Days

TOTAL . $2,080.00

Introduced on: April 5, 2023

Adopted-oni———Aprit-5; 2023
- Official RSNz DON230dE4A8T REPORT
Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
Page 30




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

SIGNS BY RAMA DBA SIGNARAMA FREEHOLD

Res-Pg:1.5-39

SECTION L - NEW ITEMS

Line [tem Description Unit of Unit Cost Comments:
Measure
Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Brother — Discount Off the Current List Price All ltems 10% | .
. off MSRP
305 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off % $10.00 "
the Current List Price
306 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off % $10.00 "
the Current List Price
/ ‘ 307 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Dell - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off the % $10.00° "
™ Current List Price
308 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Epson - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off % $10.00 "
the Current List Price
309 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Inklet and Value Packs - % $10.00 N
Discount Off the Current List Price
310 Purchase of New Printer Cartridgés - Hewlett Packard - Printhead Cartridges - % $10.00 "
Discount Off the Current List Price
311 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard — Discount Off the Current List % $10.00 "
| Price
312 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Konica Minolta — Discount Off the Current List % $10.00 "
Price
\ N
313 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Lexmark — Discount Off the Current List Price % $10.00 "
314 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Okidata — Discount Off the Current List Price % $10.00 "
Introduced-on: Aprit5,2023 ‘ -
Adopted-en: Apri-5;-202

Official REORMOA: (X0

DCAOOEBE REPORT

Bid - PRINTER CARTRIDGES
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