Res-Pg:k.9-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey
Director Barbara Jo Crea

08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn (732)929-2005
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines (732)505-1918
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: March 6, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding one (1) year Contract extensions to CVR; Rasix Computer Center, Inc. dba Academic
Supplier; Signs by Rama dba Signarama Freehold; Star Data; and W.B. Mason Co., Inc. for the continued
furnishing and delivery of PRINTER CARTRIDGES, for the period of 4/5/2024 through 4/4/2025, and
authorizing an Amendatory Contract with CVR, the next lowest bidder, to provide Section D (ltem Nos. 34 -
144), as The Tree House, Inc. is unable to extend their contract pricing. (B2023-53)

Official Resolution# |2024000322
Meeting Date 03/06/2024
Introduced Date 03/06/2024
Adopted Date 03/06/2024
Agenda ltem k-9

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-53
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guestor”

Clerk Of The Board
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RESOLUTION
March 6, 2024

WHEREAS, a current contract exists for the bid titled PRINTER
CARTRIDGES which was awarded on April 5, 2023 and assigned contract number
B2023-53; and

WHEREAS, the contract terms included an award period of one (1) year
and the County reserved the right to extend the term of the contract for one (1) additional
year by mutual agreement between the County and the contractor with no increase in base
price; and

WHEREAS, the Purchasing Department is requesting approval to extend
the current contract for the additional one (1) year as mentioned above and CVR; Rasix
Computer Center, Inc. dba Academic Supplier; Signs by Rama dba Signarama Freehold,
Star Data; and W.B. Mason Co., Inc. have agreed to such terms in writing; and

WHEREAS, the Purchasing Department is also requesting approval to
issue an amendatory contract with CVR, the next low bidder, for Section D, Item #’s 34 —
144 as the original vendor, The Tree House, Inc., is unable to extend their contract pricing,
CVR has agreed to such terms in writing,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS OF THE COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY,
that the Director and Clerk of the Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into
extended contracts with Rasix Computer Center, Inc. dba Academic Supplier; Signs by
Rama dba Signarama Freehold; Star Data; and W.B. Mason Co., Inc., and enter into an
amendatory contract with CVR, for the continued furnishing and delivery of PRINTER
CARTRIDGES for the extended contract period of April 5, 2024 through April 4, 2025
under the same terms and conditions.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution
shall be made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance
Department, and CVR; Rasix Computer Center, Inc. dba Academic Supplier; Signs by
Rama dba Signarama Freehold; Star Data; and W.B. Mason Co., Inc..

Introduced on}] March 6, 2024
Adopted on: March 6, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024000322




Res-Pg:k.9-3
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR
8id No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Mgasure Unit Cost No Bid Comments: Mir./Pke; Delivary, ARO.:

30 Vivid Light 5 EA $142.00 $710.(50 f
Magenta, TS96,
350ML

31 Yellow, TS96, 5 EA 5141.00° $705.00
350ML

32 Green, T596, 5 EA $141.00 $705.00
350ML

33 Orange, T596, 5 EA $141.00 $705.00
350ML '

TOTAL . $7,655.00

SECTION D - INKIET CARTRIDGES AND VALUE PACKS - HEWLETT PACKARD {NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line lkem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Commants: M. /Pke: Delivary, A.R.0. 3

34 3IA00ANH140 - 50 EA $31.00 $1,550.00
Cyan'(HP 962XL) .

Magenta (HP
962XL)

36 3JAD2ANH140 ~ 50 EA 430,00 $1,500,00
Vellow {HP 962XL)

/ a5 JAQLANRLA0 - 50 EA $32.00 $1,600.00

37 3IAD3ANH140 - 50 EA $30.00 $1,500.00
Black (MP 862XL) '

/ 38 AVO26ANHLA0 - 7 EA $40,00 4280.00
{4-Pack: CMYK)
{HP 9.0

Introduced on: March 6, 2024
AdoptedamposAl, DGR RIPREPORT
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CVR , : Res-Pg:k.9-4
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT -

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Lina ltem Description Quantity Unit-of Measure Unit Cost Cammeants: MIr./Pkg: Delivery, AR.Ou

39 51645A - Black 7 EA $10.00 $70.00
{HP 45)

40 B3BI2FN - (3- 7 EA S80.00 $560.00
Pack: CMY} {HP
933)

41 B6Y15A - Matte 13 EA $199.00 $2,587.00
Black (HP 7714}

42 B6Y16A - Red (HP 7 EA $200.60 © $1,400.00
7714)

43 B6YL7A - 7 EA 525000 £1,750.00
Magenta (HP "
771A)

44 BGYL3A - Yellow 7 . EA $260.00 $1,820.00
(HP771A)

45 BEY19A - LL, 7 EA., $240.00 41,680.00
Magenta (HP )
17714

46 BEY20A - Lt, Cyan ‘. 7 EA $200.00 51,400.00
(HP 771A)

47 BEY21A- Photo 7 EA $280.00 51,960.00 . ‘ !
Black (HP 771A)

48 BEY22A - Lt, érey 6 EA $259.00 51,554.00
{HP 7714}

49 €1823D - (Tri- 5 EA 420,00 £100.00
Color: CI}/IY) {Hp ¢
23)

50 C2PUSAN - Black 25 EA $35.00 4875.00
(HP 62XL)

Introducedon- March 6, 2022
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o o 1 Res-Pg:k.9-5
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT : CVR .

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

line Item Deseription Quantity UnitofMeasure Linjt Cost. No Bid Comments: M /Ple: Delivery, AR.Q.:

51 C2PO7AN - (Tri- 25 . EA 430.00 $750.00
Colar: CMY) (HP
62%L)

52 C2P23AN - Black 13 EA $20.00 $260.00
(HP 934XL) {High
Yield)

53 C2P24AN - Cyan 12 EA $20.00 424000
(HP 935XL)

54 C2P25AN - 13 EA $22.00 4286,00
Magenta {HP
935XL)

55 C2P26AN - Yellow 13 EA $19.00 4247.00
{HP 935%1)

56 CAS02AN - Black 13 EA . $3.00 $39.00
(HP 940)

57 CA903AM - Cyan 7 EA 4$3.00 $21.00
{HP 940)

58 C4904AN - 7 EA 53,00 $21.00
Magenta (HP 940)

59 |CA90SAN - Yellow 7 EA $3.00 $21.00
{HP 940)

60 CER78A - (Trl- 5 EA $40.00 : $200.00
Calor: CGVY) (HP
78XL)

61 CBS78AN « {Tri- 5 EA $55.,00 $275.00
Colors CMY) (HP
78XL) (High Vield)

D A N

Introduced on: March 6, 2024
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' Res-Pg:k.9-6
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR - ,
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Itam Dascription Quantity Unit of Maasure Unit Cost Toral No &id Comments: MFr./Pke: Delivery, ARG

62 C65780 - (Tri- 5 EA 540,00 $200.0b .
Calor; CMY) (HP
78)
63 CE5780M ~ {Tri- 5 EA 42,00 %10.00
/ Color; CMY) (HP
! 78) (High Yield)
64 CEG15A - Black 5 EA 52.00 410,00
, {HP 17)
65 CEGLEDN - Black "5 ‘ EA 52,00 $10.00
{HP 15)
/ 66 CE625A - (Tri- 5 EA 48.00 $15.00
/ Color; CMY) {HP
17)
/ 67 C6E56A - Black 20 EA $33.00 £660.00
] {HP 56)
68 CEE56AN. - Black + 30 EA $35.00 51,050.00 ) f
{HP 56} (High .
4 Yield)
69 CB657A - (Tri- 15 EA 530,00 5450,00
Color: CMY) (HP
57)
70 CEESTAN - (Tri- | 25 £A $30.00 475000
. Color; CMY) {HP
57)
j 71 C8721WN —Black 13 . EA %342.60 54,446.,00
. {HP02)
/ 72 C8765WN — Black 10 EA $39.00 4390.00
{HP 94) ;
Introduced on: March 6, 2024

Adqpte ) RpeA
0ff|aal%%%ﬁ§§ﬁ#t ﬁ Mﬁﬁg EZPO RT

Page 12



' Res-Pg:k.9-7
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltam Daseription Quantity Unit of Measure. Unit Cost Camments: MFr./Pkar Delivery, AR.Q.

73 CE766WN - (Tri- 10 EA 540,00 $400.00
Color; CMY) (HP
95)

j 74 CB767WN — Black 18 EA 530,00 $540,00
(HP 96) N
j 75 C8771WN - Cyan 5 EA $10.00 $50.00 '
(HP 02)
76 CH772WN - 5 EA $10.00 £50.00
Magenta (HP 02)
77 CBI73WN- 5 EA $10.00 $50.00
Yellow (HP 02)
78 C8774WN - Light 5 EA %10.00 $50.00
Cyan (HP 02)
/ 79 CEI7SWN - Light 5 EA £10.00 550,00
: Maganta (HP 02)
20 .C9353FN -{2- 20 EA 510,00 $200.00
/ Pack: CMYK) {HP
’ 96 Black & HP 97°
Tri-Colar)
81 C93I6IWN - Color 18 - EA 520,00 $360.00 *
. (HP 97) ; ,
82 C9364WN - Black 13 EA $32.00 $416.00
{HP 98)
/ 83 C9385AN - Black 10 EA $2.00 $20.00 .
' {HP 88) { !
/ 84 C9386AN - Cyan 5 EA . 52,00 $10.00
‘ {HP 88)

Introduced on; ___ March 6, 2024
AdoptegpmpQSAL DMateh&ENIHEPORT
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Res-Pg:k.9-8
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltam Dascriptian Cluanticy Unit of Measure, Unit Cost Na Bid Cornmants: MFr./Pka: Delivery, AR.Q.:

85 Ca387AN - 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
Magenta (HP 88) '
86 C938BAN - Yellow 5 EA 4200 $10.00
(HP B88) :
87 C9391AN - Cyan 5 EA $2.00 $10.00
/ {HP 88XL) :
88 . |C9392AN- 5 EA $3.00 $15.00
\/ Magenta (HP
88XL)
a9 C9393AN - Yellow 5 - En $3.00 $15.00
{HP 88XL)
90 CY39EAN - Black 5 EA $3.00 $15.00
(HP 88XL)
91, CEOA7A - Matte | T2 EA $270,00 $540,00
; Black [nk Tank
92 CE038A - Red Ink 2 £A $270.00 $540.00
Tank
93 CEQ39A -. 2 EA $270.00 $540.00
Magenta Ink Tank ’
o4 CEO40A - Yellow 2 EA $270.00 $540.00
Ink Tank
/ 95 CE041A - Light 2 EA $200.00 $400,00
Magenta Ink Tank
\/ - 96 CEQ424 - Light 2 . EA $270,00 $540.00
Cyan ink Tank
. / 97 CE043A - Photo 2 EA $250.00 $500.00
Black [nk Tank
Introduced_an: Mardh 62024
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CWR Res-Pg:k.9-9
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line tern Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pke: Pelivery, AR.0.:

J 98 CEQ44A - Light 2 EA $200.00 $400.00
Gray Ink Tank
99 CHS61WN - Black 2 EA $40,00 $80.00
) (HP B1)
100 CHS62 <(Trl- - 2 EA $40.00 480,00 .
. Color: CMY) (HP
61
101 CHE44A 7 EA $20.00 $140,00
Maintenance
Cartridge (HP 771)
. 102 CNO4SAN - Black { 20 EA $42,00 %840.00
: HPS50 XL} d
108 CNOAGAN - Cyan 20 EA $29.00 $580.00
"H{HP 951 XL)
104 CNQ47AN - 20 EA $29.00 $580.00
Magenta (HP 951 ’
XL
105 CNOABAN - Yellow 20 EA $29.00 $580.00 ¢ .
(HP 851 XL} .
' 108 CNO49SAN - Black 2 EA $20.00 $40.00
; {HP 950} ® =
107 CNOSOAN - Cyan 7 T EA $20.00 $140.00
' (HP 951)
/ 108 CNO51 - Magenta 13 EA $10.00 $130.00
(HP 951 XL)
/ 109 CNOS1AN - 13 EA $10,00 $130.00
Magenta {HP 951} ’ i
Introduced on; March 6. 2024
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

CVR

Res-Pg:k.9-10

Lina ftem

Description

Quantity

Unit,of Measure

Unit Cost,

Commaeants: MFF./Pka: Delivery, AR.Q.:

110 CNOS2AN - Yellow 13 EA $10.00 $130,00
(HP §51)
111 CNOS3AN - Black 25 EA . 520.00 $500.00
{HP 932 XL)
112 CNOS4AN - Cyan 25 EA £30,00 $750.00 N
{HP 933XL)
" - 4
113 CNOSSAN - 25 EA 516.00 $400.00
Magenta {HP
933XLY
114 CNOSBAN - Yellow 25 EA $20.00 $500,00
(HP 933XL) ;
115 CNOGS7AN - Black 13 EA $17.00 $221.00
{HP 932)
116 CNG58AN = Cyan 5 EA $11.00 455,00
{HP 933)
117 CNOS9AN - 5 EA $12.00 $60.00 .
Magenta
118 CNOBOAN - Yellow 10 EA $12.00 $120.00
(HP 533)
119 CNE26AM - Black 20 EA $100.00 $2,000.00
120 CNGE27AM - 20 EA $110.00 $2,200.00
Magenta
121 CNG28AM - 20 EA 5108.00 $2,160.00
Yallow
122 CNE25AM - Cyan 20 EA $111.00 $3,220.00
123 CZ130A - Cyan 13 EA $19.00 %247,00
ced on: h 6, 2024
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

CVR

Res-Pg:k.9-11

tine ltem Description Quantity Unitof Measure Unit Cost Comments: Mfr./Pka: Pelivery, AR.O.:
B! CZ131A- 13 EA $20.00 £260.00

Magenta ‘

125 €Z132A - Yellow 13 " EA ' 520,00 $260.00

126 CZ133A- Black 13 EA $20.00 $260.00

127 FEU15AN - Black 113 EA '$26.00 $2,938.00
{HP 952)

128 LOS49ANH1L40 - 113 EA $17.00 51,921.00
Cyan (HP 952)

129 LOSS2AN#140 - 113 EA 517.00 $1,921.00
Magenta (HP 952)

130 LOSSSANH140 - 113 EA $17.00 $1,921.00
Yellow (HP 952)

131 NOHESEN - (3- 38 £A $25.00 $950.00
Pack: CMY) (HP
93s5)

132 NIK2ZT7AN - (3- 50 EA $25.00 $1,250,00
Pack: CMY) {(HP
952) {High Yield)

133 P2VE8A - Cyan 5 EA $140.00 $700.00

134 P2VEIA - L} EA 514000 $700.00
Maganta

135 P2V70A - Yellow S EA $140.00 4700.00

136 P2V71A - Matte 5 EA $140.00 $700.00

+ | Black :
137 P2V72A - Gray 5. EA $140.00 5700.00

UL N S N S N N N NN NN

Introduced on:

March 6, 2024

Adopted
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Res-Pg:k.9-12
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT CVR

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Meastire. Unit Cost Mo Bid Comments: Mfr./Pkg: Dellvery, ARQ.:

138 < [P2V73A - Photo 5 EA $140.00 . $700.00
Black

139 TOA39AN - (4 13 EA © $20.00 $260.00
Pack: CMYK) {HP . ’ !
902}

140 TEMO2AN (HP ‘ 5 EA 529,00 5145.00

902 XL} - Cyan

141 TEMOGAN (HP ‘ 5 EA $29.00 $145.C0
902 XL} - Magenta

142 TEM10AN (HP 5 EA $30.00 $150,00
502 XLJ - Yellow

143 TEM14AN (HP 5 EA %41.00 §205.00
902X1.) - Black

S el & &

144 XAEQTAN - (4- a8 EA $40.00 $1,520.00
Pack: CMYK) (HP
952)
TGTAL $71,957.00

-

SECTION E - PRINTHEAD CARTRIDGES AND CLEANERS - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltarn Deseription Quianfity Linit of Measure, Unit Cost Total No Bid Commants: Mfr./Pka: Dalivery, AR.Q:
145 C4900A - Ed, No Bid No Bid X
Black/Yellow
146 C4901A - N EA No Bid No Bid X
Magenta/Cyan N i
Introduced on: March 6, 2024
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