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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

February 5, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED to Driftwood Deli & Sub
Shop and Mulberry Street Italian Food Center, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on

Item Nos. 18a, 18b, 18c, 19a, 19b, 19c, 20, 21, 22a, 22b, 22c, 233,
29a, 29b, 29c, 29d, 30a, 30b, 30c, 30d, 31a, 31b, 31c, 32a, 32b, 32
and 35. They will be rebid. (B2025-12)

23b, 23c, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28a, 28b, 28c,
¢, 33a, 33b, 33c, 33d, 33e, 33f, 33g, 34

Official Resolution# [2025000131
Meeting Date 02/05/2025
Introduced Date 02/05/2025
Adopted Date 02/05/2025
Agenda ltem j-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-12
Result Adopted
COUNTY sl el B
COMMISSIONER | | ) :(é > g !
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v |v
Arace v v
Bacchione v v
Haines v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guetnor”

Clerk Of The Board
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CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUGHERS

NO. 'E:?P)ORS = \a

RESOLUTION

February 5, 2025

WHEREAS, on December 17, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED for the
County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder

Driftwood Deli & Sub Shop Mulberry Street Italian Food Center, Inc.
936 Fischer Blvd 474 Brick Blvd

Toms River, NJ 08753 Brick, NJ 08723

(732) 270-3811 (732) 477-4520

; and

WIHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, be accepted, namely that of DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP and
MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER, INC, No bids were received on [tem
Nos. 18a, 18b, 18¢c, 19a, 19b, 19¢, 20, 21, 22a, 22b, 22¢, 23a, 23b, 23¢, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28a,
28b, 28¢, 29a, 29b, 29c¢, 29d, 30a, 30b, 30c, 30d, 31a, 31b, 31c, 32a, 32b, 32¢, 33a, 33b, 33c,
33d, 33e, 33f, 33g, 34 and 35. They will be rebid

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF QOCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Meals, Delivered for the County of
Ocean, from date of award through February 4, 2026, a period of one (1) year, or until delivery
is complete unless otherwise stated, The County reserves the right to extend the term of the

contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP: for thirty-four (34) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1g, 1b, l¢, 2a, 2b, 2¢, 3, 4, 5a, 5b, 5¢, 6a, 6b, 6¢, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11a, 11¢, 12a, 12¢,
12d, 13a, 13c¢, 13d, 164, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 16¢, 16f, 16g and 17.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No, CK-02-OC.

Introduced on February 5, 2025
Adopted on: February 5, 2025
Official Reso dtion#: 2025000131




Res-Pg:j.4-3
5 S 59]

BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 FEBRUARY ,e202

B. MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER, INC: for forty-three (43)
items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1a, 1b, lc, 2a, 2b, 2¢, 3, 4, 5a, 5b, 5c, 6a, 6b, 6¢, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11a, 11b, 11c, 12a,
12b, 12¢, 12d, 13a, 13b, 13¢, 13d, 14a, 14b, 14c, 15a, 15b, 15¢, 164, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 16¢, 16f,
16g and 17.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the materials and equipment to be acquired by this contract
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding
sources: Juvenile Services O.E, Prosecutor’s Office O.E., Sheriff's Office O.E., and Solid
Waste Management O.E.

4, The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-12.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, Department ot Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Juvenile Services, Prosecutor’s Office, Sheriff’s Office, Solid Waste Management, and the

. successful bidders.

Introduced op February 5, 2025
Adopted on: February 5, 2025
Official Resolytion#: 2025000131
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[DRIFTWOOD DEL| & SUB SHOP LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

PRICE TABLES
MEALS, DELIVERED
Line [tem Description Unit of Unit Cost: No Bid Commaents:
Measure
SECTION | — VARIOQUS DEPARTMENTS
ITEM #'s 1A - 1C -~ BREAKFAST MENU
‘,,/ la Br‘"eakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA 59.95
v/ 1b Breakfast Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA 59.95
V/' 1c Breakfast Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $9.95
ITEM #'s 2A - 2C -- LUNCH MENU
u/ 2a Lunch Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $15.95
v/ 2b Lunch Menu to serve 26 to 75 peaple, price per parson : EA $15.95
v/ 2c Lunch Manu to serve 76 or more people, price par person. EA §15.95
ITEM #3 — LUNCH OPTION
\,/ 3 Lunch Option - Side Salads, price per person EA $2.50
ITEM #4 — COLD BEVERAGE SERVICE
V/_ 4 Cold Beverage Service, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $1.95
ITEM i#t's 5A - 5C - HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE
v/ 54 Hot Beverage Service to serve 1 %o 25 peaple, price per person EA 51,95
lntrodu_J:eio_n: ruary 5, 2025

F
Ad?Rte?mFde D E%X%E%OP LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Igsﬂoﬁtﬁ\r{% gg VER

Page 6
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[DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line Item Description Unit of Uhit Cost Na Bid Camments:
Measure
5h Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA 51.95
V'/ 5S¢ Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or more people, price per parson EA 51.85

[TEM #'s 6A - 6C - SELF-SERVE HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE

y/ 62 Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA 51.85

L/ 6b Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA 51.95
/

L/ éc Self-Serve Hot Beverage Servica to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA 51.95

ITEM #7 -- ASSORTED CHEESE 8 CRACKER PLATTERS

o

p/ 7 Assorted Cheese & Cracker Platter, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA 54.10

ITEM #8 - ASORTED COQKIE PLATTER

L/ 8 Assorted Cookie Platter, price per person {minimum of 10 peopla) EA $3.00

ITEM #9 -- ASSORTED VEGETABLE PLATTER

pd
\,/ 9 Assorted Vegetable Platter, price per parson (minimum of 10 people) EA 54.10

ITEM #10 -- ASSORTED FRUIT PLATTER
V4

\./ 10 Assorted Fruit Platter, price per person {minimum of 10 peopla) EA 54,10

SECTION II - VARIQUS DEPTS.

ITEM #'s 11A - 11C --BREAKFAST MENU

Introduced on: February 5, 2025

S?ffgifﬁgf%ﬂ%%%%ﬁyﬁg 2OZ6I0P LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Page 7
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[DRIFTWOOQD DELI & SUB SHOP LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Commeants:

Measure
1la Cold Breakfast, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $9.95
11b Hot Breakfast, price per person (minimum.of 10 people) EA No Bid X
1l Self-Serve Hot Beverage, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA 51.95

ITEM #'S 12A - 120 -- LUNCH MENU

‘/' 12a Cold Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 peaple) EA $15.95

12h Hot Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA No Bid X
4/‘ 12¢ Side Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.50
y/ 12d Salf-Serve Cold Baverage, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $1.95

TEM#'s 13A - 13D — DINNER MENU

l-/ 13a Cold Dinner, price per person (min]rﬁum of 10 people) EA $45,95

13h Hot Dinner, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA No Bid X
g 13¢ Side Salad, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $2.50
\../ 13d Self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $51.95

TTEM #'s 14A - 14C - PIZZA

143 Large Plain Pie and two (2} 12 oz. sodas, price per person (minimum of 10 people} EA No Bid X

14b Large Pie with one (1} topping and twa (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person {minimum EA No Bid X
of 10 people)

Introduced an: Eehruary 5 2025
Adoptd@AMFTWQOO D EXEury BEREREOP LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

OfficiapResqlitippé: 302RIPREH
Page 8
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[DRIFTWOQOD DEL| & SUB SHOP LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line ltam Description Unit of Unit Cost Na Bld Comments:

Measure

1l4c Large Ple with two (2) toppings and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person EA No Bid X
{minimum of 10 people)

SECTION 11} —- JUVENILE SERVICES

ITEM #'s 15A - 15C -- PIZZA

15a Large 16" Plain Cheese Pizza, No Toppings, price per pizza EA No Bid X
15b Large 16" Cheese Pizza with one (1) Topping, price per pizza EA No Bid X
15¢ Large 16" Cheese Pizza with two (2) Toppings, price per pizza: EA No Bid X

ITEM #'s 16A - 16G — 12" SUBMARINE SANDWICHES

V/ 16a 12" Turkey & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA 517.99
v/ 16b 12" Roast Beef & Pravolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA 517.99
"/ 16¢ 12" Ham, Caplbola & Provolone Chaese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA 515.99
v/ 1l6d 12" Ham & Amaerican Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich " EA $15.99
‘/, 16a 12" Tuna Fish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99
v/ . Lef 12" Chicken Salad Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99
\,/ 16g 12" Assorted three {3) Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99

ITEM #17 - TOSSED SALAD

V/ 17 Tossed Salad, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $2.50

Introduced on: Fehruary 5, 2025 l
Adc_;pteg%?[:mooﬁmll%y%BOSHOP LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official B QME’A%', HOANHED
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[MULBERRY ST ITALIAN FOOD CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPQRT
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Res-Pg:j.4-8

Line Item

SECTION | — VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

MEALS, DELIVERED

Dascription

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

No Bid

Comments;

ITEM #'s 1A - 1C -- BREAKFAST MENU

v la Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person B EA $13.00
vd 1b Breakfast Ménu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $13.00
V/ lc Breakfast Menu to serve 76 or mare people, price per person EA $13.00
ITEM #'s 2A - 2C — LUNCH MENU
v 2a Lunch Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $13.50
Vr 2h Lunch Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, prica per person EA 513.50
\/’ 2c Lunch Menu to serve 76 or maore people, price per person EA 513,50
ITEM #3 - LUNCH QPTION
W 3 Lunch Option - Side Salads, price per person EA 52.75
|ITEM #4 — COLD BEVERAGE.SERVICE | |
\/ 4 Cold Baverage Service, price per parsan {minimum of 10 people) EA $2.50 2 per person
ITEM #'s 5A - 5C — HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE
V/ 5a Hot Beverage Service to serve: 1to 25 people, price per person EA $2.50

Introduced on:

February 5. 2025

Adopteqyon BERRY EPTUAIAR PBRSD CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resoljtionts 232eRIAED

Page 6
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[MULBERRY ST ITALIAN FOOD CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line ltem " Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
\/’ 5b Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 Lo 75 people, price per person EA $2.50
V/ Se Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or mare people, price per person EA £2.50

[TEM #'s 6A - 6C -- SELF-SERVE HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE

V/ 6a Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $2.50
\// 6h Self-5erve Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA 52,50
v/ 6¢ Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or more paople, price per parson EA $2.50

ITEM #7 — ASSORTED CHEESE & CRACKER PLATTERS

V'/ 7 Assorted Cheese & Cracker Platter, price per person {minimum: of 10 people) EA 55.00

ITEM #8 -- ASORTED COOKIE PLATTER

/8 Assortad Cookle Platter, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA 53.75
\Y

ITEM #9 — ASSORTED VEGETABLE PLATTER

v 9 Assorted Vegetable Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA 52.50

ITEM #10 -- ASSORTED FRUIT PLATTER

\,/ 10 Assarted Fruit Platter, price per person [minimum of 10 péople) : EA 53.00

SECTION Il —- VARIOUS DEPTS.

ITEM it's 11A - 11C ~BREAKFAST MENU

Introduced on: February 5, 2025
g?f?ptﬁr%gmulm_enny qummmmm CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
tcial Rga ViRt s R RED
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[MULBERRY ST ITALIAN FOOD CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Res-Pg:j.4-10

Line ltam Descriptian Unit of Unit Cost Mo Bid Comrents:
Measure
11a Cold Breakfast, price per person {minimum of 10 peopla) EA $12.50
‘// i1h Hot Breakfast, price per person {minimurm of 10 people) EA $15,75
V/ 11c Self-Serve Hot Baverage, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $2.50
ITEM #5 12A- 12D — LUNCH MENU |
v/ 12a Cold Lunch, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $12.75
v/ 12'b Hot Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 people} EA $15.50
\,/ 12¢c Side Salad, price per person {minimurn ofllo people) EA $2.75
\,/ 12d Self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per person [minimum of 10 people) EA §2.50
ITEM #'s 13A - 13D -~ DINNER MENL
\./ 13a Cold Dinner, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $13.00
‘,// 13b Hot Dinner, price per person {minimum of 10 peaple) EA $16.50
v/ 13c Side Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.75
b/ 13d Self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per parson {minimum of 10 paople) EA $2.50
ITEM #'s 14A - 14C -~ PIZZA
v/ i4a Large Plain Ple and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $9.50
EA $11.50

b/ 14b Large Pie with one (1) topping and two {2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person (minimum:
' of 10 peaple)

Introduged on: Eebruary 5, 2025

Adoptefign}LBERRY FebTaam 8, ROZ5D CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
oficial Eepolyharyt, HAIANEH
Page 8
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[MULBERRY ST ITALIAN FOOD CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Commeénts:
Measure

Large Pie with two (2) toppings and two (2} 12 oz. sodas, price per person
(minimum of 10 people)

SECTION 11l - JUVENILE SERVICES

ITEM #'s 15A - 15C - PIZZA

V/ 153 Large 16" Plain Cheese Pizza, No Toppings, price per pizza EA 518.00
\‘/ 150 Large 16" Cheese Pizza with one (1) Topping, price perplzza EA $20.00
V/ i5¢ Large 16" Cheese Pizza with two (2) Toppings, price per pizza EA $23.00

ITEM #'s 16A - 16G — 12" SUBMARINE SANDWICHES

v 16a 12" Turkey & Provolone Chaese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA 515.00
v/’ "16h 12" Roast Beaf & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA .516.75
v/ 16¢ 12" Ham, Capicola & Provolone Chease Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $14.75
-..// 16d 12" Ham & American Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $13.75
»/ 16e 12" Tuna Fish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.75
M/‘ 16f 12" Chicken Salad Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA 516.95
\/ 16g 12" Assorted three {3) Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA | 512,50

[TEM #17 -~ TOSSED SALAD

V/ 17 Tossed Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.75 |

Introduced on: February 5, 2025
Adopted[ppni)| BERRY BrmaryAia028)D CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
official splqeiNEs 2R
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