Res-Pg:m.10-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director John P. Kelly

] o ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Virginia E. Haines Tel: (732)929-2005
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea Fax: (732)505-1918
Commissioner Gary Quinn
Commissioner Joseph H. Vicari
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: December 7, 2022 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND
MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS to Turf Equipment and Supply Company, Inc; Scoles
Floorshine Industries; Cherry Valley Tractor Sales; W. E. Timmerman Co., Inc.; Aqua Tech Hotsy, Inc., DBA
AquaTech-USA; and Atlas Welding Supply Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on
five hundred and thirty-nine (539) items. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 30c, 36¢, 76¢, 150a,
155a, 155 ...

Official Resolution# [2022001655
Meeting Date 12/07/2022
Introduced Date 12/07/2022
Adopted Date 12/07/2022
Agenda ltem m-10

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2022-163
Result Adopted
CoNTY e [E15 I ol |- B
COMMISSIONER g fg g g Q % Q
Kelly v v
Haines v v v

Crea v v
Quinn v v
Vicari v v |v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie \. Gurstnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:m.10-2

' CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

o

RESOLUTION
December 7, 2022

WHEREAS, on November 10, 2022, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS
AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS for the County of Ocean; and

Introduced on}

Adopted on:

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Turf Equipment and Supply Company, Inc. Scoles Floorshine Industries
8015 Dorsey Run Rd. PO Box 2303

Jessup, MD 20794 Farmingdale, NJ 07727

(610) 335-1634

Cherry Valley Tractor Sales

35 West Route 70

Marlton, NJ 08035
(856) 983-0111

Aqua Tech Hotsy, Inc. dba
Aquatech-USA

200B Valentine Street
Hackettstown, NJ 07840
(908) 852-6110

(732) 681-4545

W.E. Timmerman Co., Inc.
3554 Route 22 West
Whitehouse, NJ 08888
(908) 534-4126

Atlas Welding Supply Co., Inc.
808 Brook Rd.

Lakewood, NJ 08701

(732) 363-1148

Clean Energy Parts, LL.C Montage Enterprises, Inc.
620 S. Cascade Ave., #204 140 Route 94, PO Box 631
Colorado Springs, CO 80903 - Blairstown, NJ 07825

(719) 419-7188

Premier Emissions & Safety

(908) 362-5353

R.J. Sherman & Associates, Inc. dba

Inspections, LLC Vermeer North Atlantic
912 Neptune Avenue 7 Maple Avenue
Beachwood, NJ 08722 Lumberton, NJ 08048

(732) 300-8993

(800) 624-0623
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing

Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualiﬁed bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely that of, TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY
COMPANY., INC.; SCOLES FLOORSHINE INDUSTRIES; CHERRY VALLEY
TRACTOR SALES; W.E. TIMMERMAN CO., INC.; AQUA TECH HOTSY, INC., DBA
AQUATECH-USA and ATLAS WELDING SUPPLY CO., INC. be accepted.

December 7, 2022
December 7, 2022

Official Resolyifion#: 2022001655




Introduced on:
Adopted on:

BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 DECEMBRRY, 75 10-3

No bids were received for Item 3, 4a, 4b, 4c, 4d, 5a, 5b, 5¢, 5d, 6a, 6b, 6¢, 6d, 7a, 7b, 7c, 7d,
11a, 11b, 11c, 11d, 12a, 12b, 12¢, 12d, 13a, 13b, 13c, 13d, 14a, 14b, 14c, 14d, 15a, 15b, 15c,
15d, 16a, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 17a, 17b, 17c, 17d, 18a, 18b, 18c, 18d, 19a, 19b, 19¢, 19d, 20a, 20b,
20c, 20d, 21a, 21b, 21¢, 214, 23a, 23b, 23c¢, 23d, 24a, 24b, 24c, 24d, 25a, 25b, 25¢, 25d, 27a,
27b, 27¢c, 27d, 28a, 28b, 28c, 28d, 29a, 29b, 29¢, 29d, 30a, 30b, 30d, 31a, 31b, 31c, 31d, 334,
33b, 33c¢, 33d, 35a, 35b, 35c¢, 35d, 36a, 36b, 36d, 37a, 37b, 37c, 37d, 38a, 38b, 38c, 38d, 393,
39b,39c,39d,40a,4Ob,400,40d,42a,42b,42c,42d,43a,43b,43c,43d,45a,45b,45c,45d,
46a, 46b, 46¢, 46d, 47a, 47b, 47¢, 47d, 48a, 48b, 48¢, 48d, 49a, 49b, 49c¢, 49d, 50a, S0b, 50c,
50d, 51a, 51b, 51¢, 51d, 52a, 52b, 52¢, 52d, 53a, 53b, 53¢, 53d, 54a, 54b, 54c, 54d, 55a, 55b,
55¢, 55d, 56a, 56b, 56¢, 56d, 57a, 57b, 57¢, 57d, 58a, 58b, 58c¢, 58d, 59a, 59b, 59¢, 594, 60a,
60b, 60c, 60d, 61a, 61b, 61c, 61d, 62a, 62b, 62c, 62d, 64a, 64b, 64c, 64d, 65a, 65b, 65¢, 65d,
66a, 66b, 66¢, 66d, 68a, 68b, 68c, 68d, 69a, 69b, 69¢, 69d, 70a, 70b, 70c, 70d, 71a, 71b, 71c,
714, 73a, 73b, 73¢c, 73d, 74a, 74b, 74c, 74d, 75a, 75b, 75¢, 75d, 76a, 76b, 76d, 77a, 77b, 7c,
774, 82a, 82b, 82c, 82d, 83a, 83D, 83c, 83d, 84a, 84b, 84c, 84d, 85a, 85b, 85c, 85d, 86a, 86b,
86c,86d,88a,88b,880,88d,89a,89b,899,89d,90a,90b,900,90d,91a,91b,91c,91d,92a,
92b, 92c¢, 92d, 93a, 93b, 93¢, 93d, 94a, 94b, 94c, 94d, 95b, 96a, 96b, 96¢, 96d, 97a, 97b, 97c,
97d, 98a, 98b, 98¢, 98d, 99a, 99b, 99¢, 99d, 100a, 100b, 100c, 100d, 101a, 101b, 101c, 1014,
102a, 102b, 102¢c, 102d, 103a, 103b, 103c, 103d, 104a, 104b, 104c, 104d, 105a, 105b, 105c,
105d, 106a, 106b, 106c, 106d, 107a, 107b, 107c, 107d, 108a, 108b, 108c, 108d, 1092, 109b,
109¢c, 109d, 110a, 110b, 110c, 110d, 111a, 111b, 111c, 111d, 112a, 112b, 112¢, 112d, 115a,
115b, 115¢, 115d, 117a, 117b, 117¢c, 117d, 118a, 118b, 118c, 118d, 119a, 119b, 119¢, 119d,
121a, 121b, 121c, 121d, 122a, 122b, 122¢, 122d, 123a, 123b, 123c, 123d, 124a, 124b, 124c,
124d, 125a, 125b, 125¢, 125d, 126a, 126b, 126¢, 126d, 127a, 127b, 127c, 127d, 128a, 128b,
128¢, 128d, 129a, 129b, 129c, 129d, 130a, 130b, 130c, 130d, 131a, 131b, 131c, 131d, 132a,
132b, 132¢, 132d, 133a, 133b, 133c, 133d, 134a, 134b, 134c, 134d, 135a, 135b, 135c, 1354,
1364, 136b, 136¢, 136d, 138a, 138b, 138¢c, 138d, 139a, 139b, 139c, 139d, 140a, 140b, 140c,
140d, 141a, 141b, 141c, 141d, 142a, 142b, 142c, 142d, 143a, 143b, 143c, 143d, 144a, 144b,
144c, 144d, 145a, 145b, 145¢, 145d, 146a, 146b, 146¢, 146d, 147a, 147b, 147¢c, 1474, 151a,
151b, 151c¢, 151d, 152a, 152b, 152¢, 152d, 153a, 153b, 153c, 153d, 154a, 154b, 154c, 1544,
156a, 156b, 156¢, 156d, 157a, 157b, 157¢, 157d, 158a, 158b, 158¢c, 158d, 159a, 159b, 159c¢,
159d, 160a, 160b, 160c, 160d, 161a, 161b, 161c, 161d, 162a, 162b, 162c, 162d, 163a, 163D,
163c, 163d, 164a, 164b, 164c, 164d, 166a, 166b, 166¢ and 166d .

Recommendation is made to reject items 1, 30c, 36¢, 76¢, 150a, 155a, 155b, 155¢ and 155d.

All rejected items are rejected as unresponsive and will be rebid.

December 7, 2022
December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655
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All no bid items will be rebid. Items 2, 8a, 8b, 8c, 8d, 9a, 9b, 9¢, 9d, 10a, 10b, 10c, 10d, 224,
22b, 22¢,22d, 26a, 26b, 26¢, 26d, 32a, 32b, 32c, 32d, 34a, 34b, 34c, 34d, 41a, 41b, 41c, 41d,
44a, 44b, 44c, 44d, 63a, 63b, 63c, 63d, 67a, 67b, 67c, 67d, 72a, 72b, 72¢c, 72d, 78a, 78b, 78c,
78d, 79a, 79b, 79¢, 79d, 80a, 80b, 80c, 80d, 81a, 81b, 81c, 81d, 87a, 87b, 87c, 87d, 95a, 95¢c,
95d, 113a, 113b, 113¢c, 113d, 114a, 114b, 114c, 114d, 116a, 116b, 116¢, 116d, 120a, 120b,
120c, 120d, 137a, 137b, 137c, 137d, 148a, 148b, 148c, 148d, 149a, 149b, 149c, 149d, 1500,
1‘50c, 150d, 165a,165b, 165¢, and 165d will be rebid to obtain additional vendors.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into a contract, accepting the lowest bid for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT
PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS for the
County of Ocean, for the contract period from January 1st, 2023 to December 31st, 2024, a
period of two (2) years, OR until delivery is complete. The County reserves the right to extend
the term 6f the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

A. TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY COMPANY., INC. for three (3) items,

to wit:

ITEM NOS. 150b, 150c and 150d.
B. SCOLES FLOORSHINE, INC. for four (4) items; to wit:

ITEM NOS. 78a, 78b, 78c and 78d.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
C. CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES for seventy six (76) items, to

wit:

ITEM NOS. 9a, 9b, ¢, 9d, 22a, 22b, 22¢, 22d, 26a, 26b, 26¢, 26d, 32a, 32b, 32¢, 32d, 34a,

34b, 34c, 34d, 44a, 44b, 44c, 44d, 63a, 63b, 63c, 63d, 72a, 72b, 72¢, 72d, 79a, 79b, 79,

79d, 80a, 80b, 80c, 80d, 81a, 81b, 81c, 81d, 87a, 87b, 87c, 87d, 113a, 113b, 113¢, 1134,

114a, 114b, 114c, 114d, 120a, 120b, 120c, 120d, 137a, 137b, 137c, 137d, 148a, 148b, 148c,

148d, 149a, 149b, 149c, 149d, 165a, 165b, 165¢ and 165d.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
D. W.E. TIMMERMAN CQO., INC. for eight (8) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 13a, 13b, 13¢, 13d, 41a, 41b, 41c and 41d.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
E. AQUA TECH HOTSY INC., DBA AQUATECH-USA for twenty four

(24) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 8a, 8b, 8c, 8d, 10a, 10b, 10c, 10d, 32a, 32b, 32¢, 32d, 67a, 67b, 67c, 67d, 78a,

78b, 78¢, 78d, 116a, 116b, 116¢ and 116d.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
F. ATLAS WELDING SUPPLY CO., INC. for three (3) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 95a, 95¢ and 95d.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

Introduced on December 7, 2022
Adopted on: December 7, 2022
Official Resolytjon#: 2022001655




Introduced on
Adopted on:
Official Resoly

t

BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 4 DECEMERET #58-10-5

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Comimissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2022-163.

4. Be it further resolved that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made
available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Buildings and Grounds Department, County Engineer, Fire Marshal (Lakewood), County
Department of Parks and Recreation, County Road Department, Solid Waste Management,
Transportation Department and the successful bidders.

December 7, 2022
December 7, 2022
on#: 2022001655




S TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTge%fg%'ﬁ‘ M&E

Unit of Discount %

Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
149d  Toro Dingo - Percentage of Discount
Toro ' ’

$125.00

(Transportation

: A to & from shop

150a - Toro Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $275.00)

J150b  Toro Repair Service - County Location Rate  HR  $140.00
J150c  Toro Parts - Percentage of Discount Offered .

~ Delivered % 5% Five % -
N150d  Toro Parts - Percentage of Discount Offered
Pickup % 5% Five %

Touchstone Trailer
151a  Touchstone Trailer Repair Service —

Shop Rate HR  $NOBID
151b  Touchstone Trailer Repair Service —
: County Location Rate HR  $NOBID
151c  Touchstone Trailer Parts - Percentage of
. Discount Offered - Delivered % NO BID%
151d  Touchstone Trailer Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Pick up o NO BID%
Troy Bilt /
152a  Troy Bilt Repair Service - Shop Rate HR - $NOBID
152b . Troy Bilt Repair Service ~
County Location Rate HR  $NOBID
152¢  Troy Bilt Parts - Percentage of Discount
‘ Offered - Delivered % NO BID%
152d  Troy Bilt Parts - Percentage of Discount ' ,
' ‘Offered - Pick up , % : NO BID%
Turfco
153a Turfco Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $NOBID
153b  Turfco Repair Service — _
County Location Rate HR $NO BID
153¢  Turfeo Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered % NO BID%
153d  Turfco Parts - Percentage of Dlscount :
Offered - Pick up % ‘ NO BID%
Venturo -
154a  Venturo Repair Service - Shop Rate : HR  $NOBID
154b  Venturo Repair Service — _
introduced Gounty beeatbeiyRate ' HR $NO BID
Adopted on: December 7, 2022 -

Official Resolution#: 2022001655 -




SCOLES FLOORSHINE INDUSTRIES
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS®SpEQ: 194057

Adopted on: December 7, 2022
Official Resolution#: 2022001655

Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
John F. Barns ‘
$Click or tap here
75a John F. Barns Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
75b John F. Barns Repair Service - County $click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toentertext.
75¢ John F. Barns Parts — Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
75d John F. Barns Parts — Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered — Pick up % enter text.%
John Deere
$click or tap here
76a John Deere Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
76b John Deere Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toentertext.
76¢ John Deere Parts - Percentage of Dlscount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
76d John Deere Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Johnson
$Click or tap here
77a Johnson Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
77b Johnson Repair Service — $click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toenteriext.
T7c Johnson Parts — Percentage of Dlscount Click or tap here to
Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
77d Johnson Parts — Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered — Pick up % enter text.%
Karcher
J 78a Karcher Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $80.00
J78b Karcher Repair Service - County Location
Rate HR  $80.00
< 78¢ Karcher Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered % 16%
: J 78d Karcher Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Pickup - % 16%
Kawasaki
$Click or tap here
79a Kawasaki Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
79b Kawasaki Repair Service - County Location $cClick or tap here
Rate HR  toentertext.
79¢c Kawasaki Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
 Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
79d Kawasaki Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Introduced gﬁeredﬁe]cﬁ%kepp, 2022 % enter text.%




CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR .
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTRC Sph & I51978.

. "Official Resolution#: 2022001655

Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. - Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
AMH '
~ S$cClick or tap here -
6a AMH Repair Services- Shop Rate HR _toentertext.
6b AMH Repair Serv1ces- County Location $Click or tap here
: Rate HR to enter text.
6¢c AMH Parts- Percentage of D1scount : Click or tap here to
Offered- Delivered % enter text.%
6d AMH Parts- Percentage of Discount Chck or tap here to
~ Offered- Pick Up % enter text.%
Ariens '
~ $Click or tap here
Ta. Ariens Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
7o~ Ariens Repair Service - County Location $cClick or tap here
Rate HR - toentertext.
7c Ariens Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
7d Ariens Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % - enter text.%
Aladdin
' $Click or tap here
8a Aladdin Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
8b Aladdin Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR:  to entertext.
8¢ Aladdin Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
' Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
8d Aladdin Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick Up % enter text.%
Alamo Group
J 9a Alamo Group Repair Serv1ce Shop Rate HR  $100.00
J9b Alamo Group Repair Service —
County Location Rate HR  $100.00
Jd 9 Alamo Group Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Delivered % 15%
v ad Alamo Group Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Pick up % 15%
All American Series
10a All American Series Repair Service — $Click or tap here
Shop Rate ' HR  toenter text.
10b All American Series Repair Service - A $Click or tap here
, County Location Rate HR  toenter text.
10c All American Series Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered , o enter text. %
All American R arts - Percentage of : Click or tap here to
?é?p‘i‘éﬁeoﬁlscounéb%%af -%%’222: k up . % entertext.%




CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTReS-£3:4n,#0,9

Discount %

: Unit of ,
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
BCS
. $Click or tap here’
20a BCS Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
. $Click or tap here
'20b BCS Repair Service - County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
20c BCS Parts - Percentage of Discount Offered Click or tap here to
- * Delivered % enter text.%
20d 1]§C1§ Parts - Percentage of Dlscoqnt Offered Click or tap here to
‘ lck up % enter text.%
~ Baird & Slaska
$click or tap here
2la Baird & Slaska Repair Service - Shop Rate  * HR _to enter text.
21b I}?alrti& Sliaska Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
ocation Rate HR to enter text.
21c ggird & Slaska Ic’larts -l?erceéltage of Click or tap here to .
iscount Offered - Delivere % enter text. %
21d Baird & Slaska Parts - Percentage of .
Dj t Offered - Pick Click or tap here to
1scoun . ered - rick up % enter text.%
Bandit Industries, Inc
\/ 22a’ Bandit Industries, Inc. Repair Service —
Shop Rate HR  $100.00
\/ 22b Bandit Industries, Inc. Repair Service - .
County. Location Rat
ounty Location Rate | HR $100.00.
J 22¢ Bandit Industries, Inc. Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Delivered
% 0%
J22d Bandit Industries, Inc. Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Pick up o 0%
Beko
. $Click or tap here
23a Beko Trailer Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
23b Beko Trailer Repair Service - County $click or tap here
Location Rate . HR to enter text.
23c Beko Trailer Parts - Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % ' enter text.%
23d Beko Trailer Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Pick-up Click or tap here to
% enter text.%

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

December 7, 2022
December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655 -




o CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTSS-Bgi8:4£570

‘ . Unit of - Discount %
Item # Description . Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
BG Products ' -
24a BG Products Trailer Repair Service - Shop $Click or tap here
Rate_ HR  toentertext.
24b BG Products Trailer Repair Service - ' $Click or tap here -
County Location Rate HR to enter text.
24c BG Products Trailer Parts - Percentage of Click or tap Here to
Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
24d BQ Products Trailer Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Pick-up ' enter text.%
Big-Mo Trailer |
| - $Click or tap here
25a Big-Mo Trailer Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
.25b Big-Mo Trailer Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toenterfext.
25¢ Big-Mo Trailer Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered o " anter text.%
25d Big-Mo Trailer Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Pick-up % - enter text.%
Billy Goat '
262 Billy Goat Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
~/ 26b Billy Goat Repair Service - County
‘ Location Rate HR  $100.00
\/260 Billy Goat Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered % 5%
/ 26d Billy-Goat Parts - Percentage of Discount
~ Offered - Pick up % 5%
Blodgett
_ $click or tap here -
27a Blodgett Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
27b Blodgett Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
27c Blodgett Parts - Percentage of Dlscount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
27d Blodgett Parts - Percentage of Discount ) .
Offered - Pick up - Click or tap here to
% enter text.%

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

December 7, 2022
December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655




4 'CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENIRES 'Pa%er@'élfoﬁ 1

%

Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
riggs & Stratton '
‘,/;Za Briggs & Stratton Repair Service - Shop :
\/ Rate HR . $100.00
32b Briggs & Stratton Repair Service - County _
/ Location Rate HR  $100.00
V32¢ Briggs & Stratton Parts - Percentage of
' Discount Offered - Delivered % _ 5%
\AZd Briggs & Stratton Parts - Percentage of :
Discount Offered - Pick up % 5%
Budgit
‘ : $Click or tap here
33a - Budgit Repair Services- Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
33b Budgit Repair Services- County Location . - $cClick or tap here
Rate . HR = toenter text. -
- 33¢ Budgit Parts- Percentage of Discount . Click or tap here to
Offered- Delivered - % enter text.%
33d Budgit Parts- Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to -
Offered- Pick Up %  entertext.%
Bush Hog
/ 34a Bush Hog Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  §$100.00
34b Bush Hog Repair Service - County Location '
/. Rate HR _$100.00
34c Bush Hog Parts - Percentage of Discount ‘ '
/ Offered - Delivered % 5%
v 34d Bush Hog Parts - Percentage of Discount ' '
Offered - Pick up % 5%
Century Indust.
. $Click or tap here
35a  Century Indust. Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
35b-  Century Indust. Repair Service - County ' $Click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toentertext.
35¢c Century Indust. Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
35d  Century Indust. Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Champion 4
' $Click or tap here
36a Champion Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
36b Champion Repair Service - County $click or tap here
Location Rate HR  to enter text.
36¢ Champion Parts - Percentage-of Discount ' Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
3fkoducedchanpiomdantser Penggntage of Dlscount Click or tap here to
é?f?(gta?%esoff on mbg y 2022 enter text.% -




CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR |
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Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
Cues,Inc.
' _ $Click or tap here
4la Cues, Inc. Repair Service — Shop Rate HR . toentertext.
410 Cues, Inc. Repair Service ~ County ~ $Click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toentertext. »
41c Cues, Inc. Parts ~ Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
- Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
41d Cues, Inc. Parts — Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered — Pick up % enter text.%
Cushman
) $Click or fap here
42a Cushman Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
42b Cushman Repair Service — $click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
42¢ Cushman Parts - Percentage of Discount . Click or tap here to
: Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
42d  Cushman Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Plck up . % enter text.%
Dayton .
. : ~ Sclick or tap here
43a Dayton Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
43b  Dayton Repair Service - County Location $Click or tap here
' Rate HR  toentertext.
43¢ Dayton Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
43d Dayton Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Dexter
\/ 44a Dexter Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
44b Dexter Repair Service - County Location
Rate HR  $100.00
\/ 44¢ Dexter Parts - Percentage of Discount ‘
_Offered - Delivered % 0%
\/44d' Dexter Parts - Percentage of Discount
, Offered - Pick up '
’ . % 0%

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

December 7, 2022
December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655
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EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENRSS-Pgmsiérd3

Unit of Discount Yo
Item # Description 4 Meas. Unit Price . (N OT LESS THAN)

Hoffco Power

$Click or tap here

6la Hoffco Power Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
61b ~ Hoffco Power Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
Location Rate ' HR  toenter text.
6lc  Hoffco Power Parts - Percentage of : Cliék or tap here to
; ‘Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
61d  Hoffco Power Parts - Percentage of : : .
, ‘ Click or tap here t
~ Discount Offered - Pick up % _ N o;n::r t:: ‘V:
Homelite
$click or tap here
62a  Homelite Repair Service - Shop Rate - HR  toenter text.
62b Homelite Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toenter text.
62c Homelite Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
62d  Homelite Parts - Percentage of Discount l Click or taip here to
Otfered - Pick up ' % ' ' enter text.%
‘Honda (push mowers, self-propelled mowers, generators, mini tiller, water pumps, diaphragm pumps)
\/ 63a Honda Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00 .
63b Honda Repair Service —
County Location Rate HR  $100.00
\/ 63c. Honda Parts - Percentage of Discount
s N Offered - Delivered % : . 0%
' '\éﬁ Honda Parts - Percentage of Discount
’ Offered - Pickup =~ . - % ' 20%
. Honda (welder)
B $Click or tap here
64a Honda Repair Service - Shop Rate’ HR  toentertext.
64b Iéolrﬁa liepc Eztr' Ser};qcte B $Click or tap here -
ounty Location Rate HR  toentertext.
. 64c Honda Parts - Percentage of Discount :
Click or tap here t
Offered - Delivered ' % N ' o;n::r t:: (2 :

64d Honda Parts - Percentage of Discount

- -Offered - Pick up Click or tap here to

% " enter text.%

Introduced on: ‘ December 7, 2022

O ishonr e ™




CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR
" EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENR®S-Pgsan10r14

: Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
' $Click or tap here
70a Hunter Repair Service ~ Shop Rate HR  to enter text.
70b Hunter Repair Service $cClick or tap here
County Location Rate HR  to enter text.
70c Hunter Parts - Percentage of D1scount ' Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % " enter text.%
70d - Hunter Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up ' % enter text.%
Husqvarna
_ . $Click or tap here
71a Husqvamna Repair Service — Shop Rate "HR  toenter text.
71b Husqvarna Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
71c Husqvarna Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered _ % enter text.%
71d Husqvarna Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Hydraulics
722 Hydraulics Repair Service - Shop Rate HR - $100.00
Jv72b Hydraulics Repair Service - County , '
Location Rate HR  $100.00
v 72¢ Hydraulics Parts - Percentage of Discount '
Offered - Delivered % 0%
724 Hydraulics Parts - Percentage of Discount
~ Offered - Pick up % 0%
Ingersoll Rand '
73a Ingersoll Rand Repair Service — Shop Rate . $Click or tap here
_ _ ' ' HR  toenter text.
73b  Ingersoll Rand Repair Service - County $cClick or tap here
- Location Rate , HR to enter text. K
73c Ingersoll Rand Parts — Percentage of ' Click or tap here to
Discount Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
- 73d Ingersoll Rand Parts — Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered — Pick up % enter text.%
International Harvester )
74a International Harvester Repair Service - $Click or tap here
A Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
74b International Harvester Repair Service - N $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
74c International Harvester Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered ' % enter text.%
74d International Harvester Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Pick up - % enter text.%
JoltwdicdBarns  December 7,2022 - '
Adopted on: December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655
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EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENRS@S-PgEind 013

Unit of - Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
$Click or tap here : :
75a John F. Barns Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
75b John F. Barns Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toentertext.
75¢ John F. Barns Parts — Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
75d John F. Barns Parts — Percentage of , Click or tap here to
Discount Offered — Pick up ' % enter text.%
John Deere :
' $Click or tap here
76a John Deere Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
76b John Deere Repair Service - County ‘ $Click or tap here
~ Location Rate HR  toentertext.
76¢ John Deere Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
76d John Deere Parts - Percentage of D1scount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Johnson _
. , “ $Click or tap here
77a Johnson Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
7T Johnson Repair Service — $Click or tap here
. County Location Rate HR - toentertext.
77c Johnson Parts — Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
77d Johnson Parts — Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
" Offered — Pick up % enter text.%
Karcher
_ $Click or tap here
78a Karcher Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
78b Karcher Repair Service - County Location . $Click or tap here
Rate HR to enter text.
78¢c Karcher Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to .
' ' Offered - Delivered % enter text.%'
78d Karcher Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
' Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Kawasaki
J 79a Kawasaki Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
¥ 79b Kawasaki Repair Service ~ County Location
Rate HR  $100.00
d 79¢ Kawasaki Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered % 10%
‘179d Kawasaki Parts - Percentage of Discount
' Offered - Pick up % 10%

ed on: December 7, 2022
Adopted on: December 7, 2022
Official ResolL_ltion#: 2022001655
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Introduced on:
Adopted on:

December 7, 2022
December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655

Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
] 0a Kohler Repair Service - Shop Rate HR $100.00 :
+/ 80b Kohler Repair Service — o
County Location Rate HR  $100.00
: \/ 80c Kohler Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Delivered % 5%
\A§0d Kohler Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick up %, 5%
Kubota -
8la Kubota Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
J 81b Kubota Repair Service —
/ County Location Rate - HR  $100.00
8lc . Kubota Parts - Percentage of Discount
/ Offered - Delivered ' % 15%
~ 81d Kubota Parts - Percentage of Discount o
' Offered - Pick up % 15%
Layco _
82a Layco Repair Service - Shop Rate $Click or tap here.
: HR "~ to enter text.
82b Layco Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
82¢ Layco Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
82d Layco Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
- Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Lee Boy
83a Lee Boy Repair Service - Shop Rate $Click or tap here
HR  toentertext.
83b Lee Boy Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  to enter text.
83c Lee Boy Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
83d Lee Boy Parts - Percentage of Discount - Click or tap here to
' Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Lely .»
84a Lely Repair Service - Shop Rate $Click or tap here
4 HR  toenter text.
84b Lely Repair Service - County Location Rate $Click or tap here
HR to enter text. ,
84c Lely Parts - Percentage of Discount Offered Click or tap here to
- Delivered % enter text.%
84d Lely Parts - Percentage of Discount Offered ) Click or tap here to
- Pick up %, enter text.%
Lesco '




CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENRBs-Pgiand 037

_ Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
: $Click or tap here
85a Lesco Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
85b . Lesco Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  to enter text.
85c Lesco Parts - Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text'%
85d Lesco Parts ~ Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Lil Hoe
. $Click or tap here =
86a Lil Hoe Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
86b Lil Hoe Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toenterfext.
86¢c Lil Hoe Parts — Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
86d Lil Hoe Parts - Percentage of Discount _ Click or tap here to
' ‘Offered — Pick up % enter text.%
Little Wonder '
\/87a Little Wonder Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
/87b ~ Little Wonder Repair Service —
County Location Rate '
_ , HR  $100.00
\/87c Little Wonder Parts - Percentage of _
: / Discount Offered - Delivered % 5%
Vv 87d Little Wonder Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Pick up % 50
Manitowoc
B $Click or tap here
- 88a Manitowoc Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
88b  Manitowoc Repair Service — ‘$Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toenter text.
88c Manitowoc Parts — Percentage of Discount ‘
Offered — Delivered Click or tap here to
% enter text.%
88d  Manitowoc Parts — Percentage of Dlscount
Offered — Pick up Click or tap here to
% enter text.%

(A7
December 7, 2022

I\/Bh’fgtséﬂ%
Officlal Resolution#: 2022001655
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Unit of Discount %
Item # Description , Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
Rayco -
V4 1132 Rayco Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
113b  Rayco Repair Service — :
_ County Location Rate HR  $100.00
\/ 113¢  Rayco Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered % | . ' 0%
\/1 13d  Rayco Parts - Percentage of Discount : | : :
“ Offered - Picked Up | ' % - 0%
Red Max
J 1142 Red Max Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
J 14b  Red Max Repair Service — ,
County Location Rate HR  $100.00
~/1 l4c  Red Max Parts - Percentage of Discount -
Offered - Delivered % 10%
x/l 14d  Red Max Parts - Percentage of Discount - .
: Offered - Pick up % _ 10%
Reed Systems
: $click or tap here
1152  Reed Systems Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
115b  Reed Systems Repair Service — : $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
115c  Reed Systems Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
- Reed Systems Parts - Percentage of _ : | Click or tap here to
115d " piscount Offered - Pick up %, enter text.%
Riveer
$cClick or tap here
- 116a  Riveer Repair Service - Shop Rate - HR  toenter text.
116b  Riveer Repair Service — ; $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  to enter text.
116¢  Riveer Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered ' % o enter text.%
116d  Riveer Parts - Percentage of Discount | Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick Up E % enter text.%
lqtrnduond on. ngcnmhAL7, 2022
Roélbmteiion: December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655
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Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
117a . , $Click or tap here
Robinair Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
117b Robinair Repair Service — County Location $Click or tap here
. Rate HR  toenter text.
117¢ Robinair Parts - Percentage of Discount % Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered enter text.%
1174 Robinair Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick Up - % enter text.%
Roscoe x :
1 18.a $Click or.tap here
Roscoe Repair Service - Shop Rate HR ~ toentertext.
1186 Roscoe Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate to enter text.
118¢c  Roscoe Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered _ Yo enter text.%
118d  Roscoe Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick Up % enter text.%
Rudeco ’ :
119 . - $Click or tap here
" Rudco Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
119b Rudco Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate . HR  toenter text.
119c  Rudco Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
119d  Rudco Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick Up % enter text.%
Ryan '
\/120a Ryan Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
/ ‘ Ryan Repair Service - County Location :
120b  Rate HR  $100.00
A20¢ Ryan Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered \ %, 5%,
\/{20d Ryan Parts - Percentage of Discount _
Offered - Pick up % 5%
Sarlo ,
$Click or tap here
12la  Sarlo Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
-Sarlo Repair Service - County Location $ciick or tap here
121b  Rate HR  to enter text.
121c Sarlo Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
121d  Sarlo Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Introducddbigred - Biskapr 7, 2022 % enter text.%

Adopted on; December 7, 2022
SW&Q:TaMlution#: 2022001655
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Unit of ~ Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
Spanco
135a  Spanco Repair Service - Shop Rate $Click or tap here
HR  toentertext. .
135b  Spanco Repair Service — $click or tap here
' County Location Rate o HR  toenter text.
135¢  Spanco Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
135d  Spanco Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
~ Offered - Pick up ' % enter text.%
Spraying Devices Inc. (SDI)
136a  Spraying Devices Inc. (SDI) Repair Service $Click or tap here
- - Shop Rate . ‘ HR  toenter text.
136b  Spraying Devices Inc. (SDI) Repair Service $Click or tap here
- County Location Rate HR  toenter text.
136¢ Spraying Devices Inc. (SDI) Parts - Click or tap here to
_ Percentage of Discount Offered - Delivered . ¢ enter text.%
136d  Spraying Devices Inc. (SDI) Parts - Click or tap here to
~ Percentage of Discount Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
~ Stanley '
137a  Stanley Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $100.00
\/ 137b  Stanley Repair Service - County Location.
Rate ' HR  $100.00
\/ 137c  Stanley Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Delivered % 5%
\A 37d  Stanley Parts — Percentage of Discount
' Offered — Pick up % 5%
Stellar Roll-Off : .
138a  Stellar Roll-Off Repair Service - Shop Rate $click or tap here
, o ' HR  toentertext.
138b  Stellar Roll-Off Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toentertext.
138¢c  Stellar Roll-Off Parts - Percentage of Click or tap hereé to
Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
138d  Stellar Roll-Off Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Steven Green
139a  Steven Green Repair Service - Shop Rate _ $cClick or tap here
HR  toenter text.
139b  Steven Green Repair Service — _ $Click or tap here
County Location Rate ' HR  toenter text.
139c  Steven Green Parts - Percentage of Discount . Click or tap here to
_ . Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
139d  Steven Green Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
introduced@ffered pRiskbuny, 2022 ' % enter text.%
ted on: December 7, 2022

al Resolution#: 2022001655
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Item # Description

‘Unit of
Meas.

Unit Price

Discount %

145a  Tanaka Repair Service - Shop Rate

145b  Tanaka Repair Service —
County Location Rate
145¢  Tanaka Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered
145d  Tanaka Parts - Percentage of Discount
' Offered - Pick up '
Teénnant .
146a  Tennant Repair Service - Shop Rate

146b  Tennant Repair Service —
. County Location Rate
146c  Tennant Parts - Percentage of Discount .
Offered - Delivered

146d  Tennant Parts - Pércentage of Discount
Offered - Pick up

Terex
147a  Terex Repair Service — Shop Rate

147b  Terex Repair Service —
County Location Rate

147¢c  Terex Parts — Percentage of Discount
- " Offered — Delivered

147d  Terex Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick up

imberwolf

148a  Timberwolf Repair Service — Shop Rate

148b . Timberwolf Repair Service —

County Location Rate _
~/1 48c  Timberwolf Parts — Percentage of Discount
/ : Offered — Delivered

148d ]

Offered — Pick up

Toro Dingo

A49a  Toro Dingo Repair Service - Shop Rate

\/149b

Toro Dingo Repair Service - County
Location Rate

Toro Dingo - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered

\A49c
%49d Toro Dingo - Percentage of Discount
' Offered - Pick Up

THopduced on: December 7, 2022
‘Adopted on: December 7, 2022
foicial Resolution#: 2022001655

Timberwolf Parts — Percentage of Discount .

HR .
HR

%

%

%

%

HR

%

%

%

%

- HR

%

%

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

$cClick or tap here
to enter text.

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

(NOT LESS THAN)

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

$100.00

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

Click or tap here to
enter text.% .

$100.00

$100.00

0%

0%

$100.00

5%

5%




CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR

EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENT®S-Bgin79r32

: Unit of ~ Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
: $Click or tap here .
164a  Wenger Trailer Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
164b  Wenger Trailer Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
164c ~ Wenger Trailer Parts - Percentage of - Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
164d  Wenger Trailer Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Pick up %: enter text.%
Woods
\/ 165a  Woods Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $100.00
\/ 165b  Woods Repair Service — '
County Location Rate HR  $100.00
\/1 65¢c  Woods Parts - Percentage of Discount
/_ Offered - Delivered % 5%
165d  Woods Parts - Percentage of Discount
- Offered - Pick up % 5%
Yanmar
' , $Click or tap here
166a  Yanmar Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
166b  Yanmar Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate - HR  toentertext.
166c  Yanmar Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered: % enter text.%
166d  Yanmar Parts - Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%

Introduced on: December 7, 2022
. Adopted on: December 7, 2022
Official Resolution#: 2022001655_




W.E. TIMMERMAN CO., INC.

Res-Pg:m.10-23

EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS  Page 3 of 37

Item # Description

Unit of
Meas.

Unit Price

Discount %

(NOT LESS THAN)

Allis-Chalmers

11a Allis-Chalmers Repair Service - Shop Rate
11b Allis-Chalmers Repair Service - County
Location Rate _
Ilc Allis-Chalmers Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Delivered
11d Allis-Chalmers Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Pick up
- Allmand '
12a Allmand Repair Service - Shop Rate
12b Allmand Repair Service —
‘ County Location Rate
12¢ Allmand Parts - Percentage of Discount
: Offered - Delivery :
12d Allmand Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Pick Up
Altec

i3a

:§13b

\/130
s

Altec Repair Service - Shop Rate
Altec Repair Service - County Location
Rate

Altec Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Delivered

Altec Parts -Percentage of Discount Offered

Pick up

- American-Mulcher

14a

14b

14c

14d

introduced on:
Adopted on:

American-Mulcher Repair Service - Shop
Rate-

American-Mulcher Repair Service - County
Location Rate

American-Mulcher Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Delivered

American-Mulcher Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Pick up

December 7, 2022
December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655

%

%

%

%

%

%

%

%

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

$Click or tap here
to enier text.

$184

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

Click or tap here to
entertext.%

$200

$Click or tap here
1o enter text.

0%

0%

$Click or tap here
to enter text.

Click or tap here to
enter text.%

Click or tap here to
. -enter text.%




W.E. TIMMERMAN CO., INC.

: Res-Pg:m.10-24
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS Page 10 of 37

Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
Cues,Inc. "
\/ 4la Cues, Inc. Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $154
41b  Cues, Inc. Repair Service — County
- Location Rate HR  $184
Alc Cues, Inc. Parts — Percentage of Discount
.- Offered — Delivered ! % 0%
\Al d Cues, Inc. Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick up % 0%
Cushman
$Click or tap here
42a Cushman Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
42b Cushman Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toenter text.
42¢c Cushman Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
42d Cushman Pgrts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Dayton
$Click or tap here
43a Dayton Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
43b Dayton Repair Service - County Location $Click or tap here
. Rate | HR  toenter text. ‘
43¢ Dayton Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
. 43d Dayton Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Dexter
$Click or tap here
44a Dexter Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
44b Dexter Repair Service - County Location $Click or tap here
. Rate HR  toentertext. _
44c Dexter Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered ' % enter text.%
44d Dexter Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Pick up Click or tap here to
. % enter text.%
Introduced on: December 7, 2022
Adopted on: December 7, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001655




AQUA TECH HOTSY, IND. DBA AQUATECH-USA
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENRES-Pgdn. 8@325

Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
AMH '
$Click or tap here
6a AMH Repair Services- Shop Rate HR to enter text.
6b AMH Repair Services- County Location $Click or tap here
Rate HR to enter text.
6¢c AMH Parts- Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
Offered- Delivered % enter text.%
6d AMH Parts- Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
4 Offered- Pick Up % enter text.%
Ariens _
$Click or tap here
Ta Ariens Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
7b Ariens Repair Service - County Location : $click or tap here
Rate HR  toentertext. .
Tc Ariens Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
7d Ariens Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % " enter text.%
Aladdin
/82 Aladdin Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $200.00
Ab  Aladdin Repair Service —
County Location Rate HR  $200.00
\/ 8¢ Aladdin Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered o 0%
\éd Aladdin Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Pick Up % 0%
Alamo Group
$Click or tap here
9a Alamo Group Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
% Alamo Group Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toenter text.
9c Alamo Group Parts - Percentage of ‘ : Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
9d Alamo Group Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
' Discount Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
~ All American Series
10a All American Series Repair Service —
Shop Rate HR  $200.00
\/10b All American Series Repair Service -
_ County Location Rate _ HR  $200.00
~/10<: All American Series Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Delivered % 0%
} r(‘)t% duced All Amerlcan Serles Parts - Percentage of :
Adopted onﬁ}scoungzﬁ '2?2&51{ up % 0%
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Unit of Discount % -
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
Briggs & Stratton
2a  Briggs & Stratton Repair Service - Shop
Rate , HR-  $200.00
\AZb Briggs & Stratton Repair Service - County :
: Location Rate HR  $200.00
\/320 Briggs & Stratton Parts - Percentage of
"~ Discount Offered - Delivered % 0%
\/32d Briggs & Stratton Parts - Percentage of
Discount Offered - Pick up - % 0%
Budgit ' .
$Click or tap here
33a Budgit Repair Services- Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
33b Budgit Repair Services- County Location $Click or tap here
Rate HR  toentertext.
33¢  Budgit Parts- Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered- Delivered % enter text.%
33d Budgit Parts- Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
' Offered- Pick Up % enter text.%
Bush Hog
' ' _ $Click or tap here
34a Bush Hog Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
34b Bush Hog Repair Service - County Location $Click or tap here
Rate HR  toenter text.
34c Bush Hog Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
34d Bush Hog Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Century Indust.
: $Click or tap here
35a Century Indust. Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
35b Century Indust. Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
Location Rate ' - HR  to enter text.
35¢ Century Indust. Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
: Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
35d Century Indust. Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Champion . .
$Click or tap here
36a Champion Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
36b Champion Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toenter text,
36¢ Champion Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered - % enter text.%
g &Zﬁefn{’lﬁanpioﬁiﬁ%ﬁéi{ f?égen'age of Discount Click or tap here to
~ Official Res@)fifiereid 20Piekiasp enter text.%
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Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
Honda (outboard motors)
, $Click or tap here
65a Honda Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
65b Honda Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
65¢ Honda Parts — Percentage of Dlscount Click or tap here to
Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
65d Honda Parts. — Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
Offered — Pick up | % enter text.%
Hoshizaki (Kitchen Equipment)
$Click or tap here
66a Hoshizaki Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
66b Hoshizaki Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toenter text.
66¢ Hoshizaki Parts — Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
66d Hoshizaki Parts — Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
. Offered —Pick up % enter text.%
Hotsy "
\/ 67a Hotsy Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $200.00
/ 67b Hotsy Repair Service —
County Location Rate HR  $200.00
\/ 67c Hotsy Parts - Percentage of Dlscount
: - Offered - Delivered % 0%
/ 67d Hotsy Parts - Percentage of Discount
. Offered - Pick up % 0%
- HPSI
$Click or tap here
68a HPSI Repair Service - Shop Rate. HR  toenter text.
68b HPSI Repair Service — $C|i_ck or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
68c HPSI Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
-+ Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
- 68d HPSI Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Hubert o
69a Hubert Repair Service — $click or tap here
Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
69b Hubert Repair Service — : $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
69c Hubert Parts - Percentage of Discount’ Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
69d Hubert Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
introduced@ffered pRickoayy, 2022 % enter text.%
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: ‘ Unit of . Discount %
Item # .Description : Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
. $Click or-tap here :
75a John F. Barns Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
75b John F. Barns Repair Service - County $Click or tap here
Location Rate HR  toenter text.
75¢ John F. Barns Parts — Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered — Delivered _ % enter text.%
75d John F. Barns Parts — Percentage of ‘ Click of tap here to
Discount Offered — Pick up % ' enter text.%
John Deere ' '
$Click or tap here
76a  John Deere Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
76b John Deere Repair Service - County $click or tap here
Location Rate HR . toenter text.
76¢ John Deere Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % : enter text.%
76d. John Deere Parts - Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
_ Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Johnson -
$Click or tap here
T7a Johnson Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
77b Johnson Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
7l Johnson Parts — Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered — Delivered % ' . enter text.%
77d Johnson Parts — Percentage of Discount - , Click or tap here'to
Offered — Pick up . % \ ' enter text.%
- Karcher
\/7 8a Karcher Repair Service - Shop Rate HR.  $200.00
j 78b Karcher Repair Service - County Location
Rate - HR  $200.00
: ~/ 78¢c Karcher Parts - Percentage of Discount _
/ Offered - Delivered % 0%
78d Karcher Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Pick up ' % 0%
Kawasaki ‘
$Click or tap here
79a Kawasaki Repair Service - Shop Rate "HR  toenter text.
79b Kawasaki Repair Service - County Location $Click or tap here
: Rate ) HR to enter text.
79¢c Kawasaki Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
79d Kawasaki Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to -
Offered - Pick up % enter text.% .
KRG on: " Decomber 7. 2022
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Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. ~  Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
Rayco ' ‘
$Click or tap here
113a  -Rayco Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
113b  Rayco Repair Service — 5cl
: Click or tap here
C Location Rat :
. ounty Location Rate HR  toentertext. '
113¢  Rayco Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered ' A enter text.%
113d  Rayco Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Picked Up % enter text.%
Red Max :
$Click or tap here
1142 Red Max Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toenter text.
114b  Red Max Rep-alr Service — ‘ $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toenter text.
114c  Red Max Parts - Percentage of Discount ) Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
114d  Red Max Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Reed Systems
$Click or tap here
115a  Reed Systems Repair Service - Shop Rate ‘HR  toenter text.
115b  Reed Systems Repair Service — $Click or tap here
County Location Rate HR  toentertext.
115¢c  Reed Systems Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
Reed Systems Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
1154 piscount Offered - Pick up A enter text.%
Riveer |
J 116a  Riveer Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $200.00
116b  Riveer Repair Service —
County Location Rate HR $200.00
\4160 Riveer Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered % 0%
\/1 16d  Riveer Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Pick Up % 0%

Introduced on:

December 7, 2022
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Unit of Discount %
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
Mete-R-Matic/Turfco ,
Mete-R-Matic/Turfco Repair Service - Shop $Click or tap here
93a - Rate HR  to enter text.
93b Mete-R-Matic/Turfco Repair Service — . $Click or tap here
County Location Rate ' . HR  toentertext.
93¢ Mete-R-Matic/Turfco Parts - Percentage of Click or {ap here to
Discount Offered - Delivered A enter text.%
93d Mete-R-Matic/Turfco Parts - Percentage of Click or tap here to
. Discount Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Millcreek ' '
$Click or tap here
94a Millcreek Repair Service — Shop Rate . - HR  toentertext.
94b Millcreek Repair Service - County Location $cClick or tap here
Rate HR  toentertext.
94c Millcreek Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Delivered % enter text.%
94d Millcreek Parts - Percentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Offered - Pick up % enter text.%
Miller
J 952 Miller Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  $90.00
95b  Miller Repair Service — '
County Location Rate HR $
Hse Miller Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered - Delivered : % 10%
.ﬁSd Miller Parts - Percentage of Discount
. Offered - Pick up - % 10%
Milwaukee Equipment
96a Milwaukee Equipment Repair Service — $click or tap here
Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
96b Milwaukee Equipment Repair Service - $click.or tap here
" County Location Rate ' HR  toentertext.
96¢ Milwaukee Equipment Parts — Percentage of Click or tap here to
: Discount Offered — Delivered % enter text.%
96d  Milwaukee Equipment Parts — Percentage of Click or tap here to
Discount Offered — Pick up % ~ entertext.%
Monster Leaf
- : $Click or tap here
97a Monster Leaf Repair Service - Shop Rate HR  toentertext.
97b Monster Leaf Repair Service - County ~ $cClick or tap here
Location Rate _ HR  toenter text.
97c Monster Léaf Parts - Percentage of Discount ' Click or tap here to
_ Offered - Delivered _ A enter text.%
N oquceddonster séggﬁ,geq,l;,szbzgercentage of Discount Click or tap here to
Adopted o) ffered -DPdekivap?, 2022 ° % enter text.% .
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