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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of EQUI

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

December 6, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

PMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND

MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING to K. Moorea Co. LLC DBA Traffic Plan; Traffic Safety Service, LLC;
and Turf Equipment and Supply Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on ltem Nos. 12,

13a, 13b, 13c, 13d, 15a, 15b, 15¢c, 15d, 16a, 16b, 16¢c, 16d, 17a, 17

b, 17¢c, 17d, 18a, 18b, 18c, 18d, 19a, 19b,

19c, 19d, 20c, 20d, 21c, 21d, 22a, 22b, 22c, 22d, 23a, 23b, 23c, 23d, 24a, 24b, 24c, 24d, 25a, 25b, 2 ...

Official Resolution# |2023001680
Meeting Date 12/06/2023
Introduced Date 12/06/2023
Adopted Date 12/06/2023
Agenda ltem I-1

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-181
Result Adopted
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COMMISSIONER § @ g g Q § Q
Vicari v v
Quinn v v v
Crea v v
Haines v v v

Kelly v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michatte \. Guotkner”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:1.1-2

CONTRAGT NQ. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOIGES, VOUCHERS

R

RESOLUTION
December 6, 2023

WHEREAS, on October 11, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS
AND MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
K. Moorea Co. LLC DBA Traffic Plan Traffic Safety Service, LI.C
5300 Asbury Rd. 601 Hadley Rd.
Farmingdale, NJ 07727 South Plainfield, NJ 07080
{(732) 984-1697 (908) 561-4800

Turf Equipment and Supply Co., Inc.
8015 Dorsey Run Rd.

Jessup, MD 20794

(610) 335-1634

s and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely that of, K. MOOREA CO. LLC DBA TRAFFIC
PLAN; TRAFFIC SAFETY SERVICE, LLC and TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CQ.,
INC., be accepted. No bids were received on Item Nos. 12, 13a, 13b, 13¢, 134, 15a, 15b, 15¢,
15d, 16a, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 17a, 17b, 17¢, 17d, 18a, 18b, 18c, 18d, 19a, 19b, 19¢, 19d, 20c¢, 20d,
2lc, 21d, 22a, 22b, 22¢, 22d, 23a, 23b, 23c¢, 23d, 24a, 24b, 24¢, 244, 25a, 250, 25¢, 25d, 28a,
28b, 28c, 28d, 29a, 29b, 29, 29d, 30a, 30b, 30c, 30d, 34a, 34b, 34c and 34d.
Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos., 20a, 20b, 21a and 21b as they were
unresponsive. All no bid Items and all rejected Items will be rebid. Item Nos. 27a, 27b, 27¢,
27d,31a, 31b, 31¢, 31d, 32a, 32b, 32¢, 32d, 33a, 33b, 33¢, 33d, 35a, 35b, 35¢ and 35d will be
rebid to obtain additional vendors,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND
MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING for the County of Ocean, for the contract petiod
from date of award through December 5, 2025, a period of two (2) years, OR until delivery is

complete. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A.

40A:11-15,
Introduced on: December 6, 2023
Adopted on: December 6, 2023

Official Resolufibn#: 2023001680
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 DECEMBER 6, 2023

A, K. MOOREA CO. LLC DBA TRAFFIC PLAN for ten (10) items; to wit:
ITEM NOS, 3, 6, 14a, 14b, 14c, 14d, 26a, 26b, 26¢ and 26d.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
B. TRAFFIC SAFETY SERVICE. LL.C for thirty two (32) items; to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1,2,4,7,8,9, 10, 11, 14a, 14b, 14c, 14d, 26a, 26b, 26¢, 26d, 27a, 27, 27¢,
27d, 31a, 31b, 31¢, 31d, 32a, 32b, 32¢, 32d, 33a, 33b, 33¢ and 33d.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
C. TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CQ., INC. for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 35a, 35b, 35¢ and 35d.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-181.

4, BEIT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of

Finance, Engineering Department and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: December 6, 2023
Adopted on: December 6, 2023
Official Resolutipn#: 2023001680




K. MOOREA CO., LLC DBA TRAFFIC PLAN
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EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT  Page 1 of 6

PRICE SCHEDULE
ENTERING $¢.00 1S A BID. IF YOU ARE NOT BIDDING, LEAVE BLANK OR ENTER NO BID
2Yr Unit
Est. of
Item # Description Qty. Meas. Unit Price Total Price

SECTION I - ALL MAINTENANCE - VARIOUS TYFPES OF ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT

Altec 42° Bucket Truck, Model #T A45M and Model AT#37-G, Model L863

1 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 4 EA S$NOBID $NO BID

2 Annual Electrical Inspection, As ‘
Specified 4 EA §$NO BID $INO BID

American Signal Computerized LED Variable Message BoardSign #CMS-T333

3 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 12 EA  $318.00 : $3816.00

Kubota - Diesel Motor, 3 Cycle

4 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 2 EA $NQO BID $NC BID

Mark Rite Line Equipment Co. ~ Twin 1,000 Ib, Thermo Plastic Pre-Melting Kettle System 1500

5 Annual Preventative Maintenance, ‘
As Specified 2 FEA $NOBID $NO BID

Precision Solar Controls Inc. — Mini Variable Message Board

\/ 6 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 2 EA _$318.00 $636.00

Skydrill - Gas Powcered Post Pounder Model #BG-231

7 Antual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 4 EA $NOBID SNO BID

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-1548

8 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 4 EA  $NOBID, $WNO BID

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MBE2-2248
9 Annual Preventative Maintenance,

As Specified 2 EA $NOBID $NQ BID
2Y¥r Unit
Est, of
inkfsancty oReseriphiQmper 6. 2023 Qty. Meas. Unit Price Total Price

A_SE_@FBBN I — ATHedVIVENTEANCE — VARIOUS TYPES OF ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT (Cont’d)
Official Resolution#: 2023001680 )



K. MOOREA CO., LLC DBA TRAFFIC PLAN

Res-Pg:1.1-5

EQUIFMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT  Page 2 of 6
Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-3048

10 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified ) EA $NOBID $ NO BID

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Arrow Board Trailer

11 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 4 EA $NOBID $ NOBID

Stihl — Auger, Model #BT120C
12 Annual Preventative Maintenance,

As Specified 2 EA  $NOBID $ NO BID
Unit
of % Discount
Ttem # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)

SECTION II - ALL REPAIRS AND PARTS FOR VARIOUS ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT
Air Tech RT2500-B-Duo Grinder '
13a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $NO BID
13b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $NO BID
13¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered —

Delivered ' NO BID%
13d  Parts — Percentage of Discount

Offered — Pick-Up NQO BID%

American Signal Computerized LED Variable Message BoardSign #CMS-T333
14a  Repair Service — Connty Location

‘ Rate HR  $125.00
J 14b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $115.00
/ 14¢  Parts -- Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered 10%
J14d  Parts-— Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up , 10%
DCS Grinder
152 Repair Service — County Location
Rate HR $NOBID
I15b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR $NOBID
15¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered - Delivered NO BID%
| 15d  Parts - Percentage of Discount :
| Offered — Pick-Up NQO BID%
Unit
of % Discount
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
SECTION II — ALL REPAIRS AND PARTS FOR VARIOUS ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT
{Cout’d) '
Fine Line Industries - Laxy Liner
Introduced on: December 6, 2023
Adopted on: December 6, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001680



K. MOOREA CO., LLC DBA TRAFFIC PLAN

Res-Pg:1.1-6

UIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT  Page 5 of 6

26a

Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $125.00
/ 26b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR _§115.00 :
/ 26¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered 10%
/ 26d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up 10%
Skydrilt — Gas Powered Post Pounder Model #BG-231
278 Repair Service — County Location
Rate HR SNOBID
27b  Repair Service - Shop Rate HR $NO BID
27¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered NO BID%
27d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up NO BID%
Unit
of % Discount
Ttem # Description, Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)
SECTION I - ALL REPAIRS AND PARTS FOR VARIOUS ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT
{(Cont’d)
Smith Manufacturing, Inc. - LNX 8 Grinder
28a  Repair Service — County Location
Rate HR $NO BID
28b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $NO BID
28¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered NO BID%
28d  Parts - Percentage of Discount ‘
Offered — Pick-Up NO BID%
Smith Manufacturing, Inc. — SPS 10 Grinder
29a  Repair Service -- County Location
Rate HR $NO BID
29b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $NO BID
29¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered NO BID%
29d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up NO BID%
Solar Technology Inc, — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-1548
30a  Repair Service — County Location
Rate HR $NOEID
30b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $NO BID
30c  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered NQ BID%
30d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Lp NO BID%

Intrédiiead T‘Echnolﬁgxlliﬁef 6. ®aent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-2248

Adopted on:

mber 6, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001680



TRALFLC SAFETY SERVILE, LLOC

EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT Re€&:R:4¢1-7

PRICE SCHEDULE

ENTERING $0.00 IS A BID. IF YOU ARE NOT BIDDING, LEAVE BLANK OR ENTER NO BID

2Yr Unit
Est. of
Item # Description Qty. Meas. Unit Price Total Price

SECTION I - ALL MAINTENANCE - VARIOQUS TYPES OF ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT

Altec 42° Bucket Truck, Model #TA45M and Model AT#37-G, Model LS563

1 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 4 EA  $2420 $9680
/ 2 Annual Electrical Inspection, As
Specified 4 EA  $3300 $13200
American Signal Computerized LED Variable Message BoardSign #CMS-T333
3 Annual Preventative Maintenance, '
As Specified 12 EA. $836 $10032
Kubota — Diesel Motor, 3 Cycle
4 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 2 EA  $1709.40 $3418.80

Mark Rite Line Equipment Co. — Twin 1,000 lb. Thermo Plastic Pre-Melting Kettle System 1500

5 Annual Preventative Maintenance, ‘
As Specified 2 EA  $No Bid $No Bid

Precision Solar Controls Inc. — Mini Variable Message Board

6 Annual Preventative Maintenance, -
As Specified 2 EA  $1709.40 $3418.80

\;kydrill — Gas Powered Post Pounder Model #BG-231
7 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 4 EA  $1287 $5148

Solar Technology Inc. ~ Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-1548
8 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 4 EA  $1709.40 $6837.60)

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-2248
9 Annual Preventative Maintenance,

As Specified 2 EA  $1709.40 $3418.80
Introduced on: December 6, 2023
Adopted on: December 6, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001680



TRAFFIC SAFETY SERVICE, LLC R 1.1.8
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT R&5E9:¢ -

2Yr  Unit
Est. of
Item # Description Qty. Meas. Unit Price Total Price

SECTION I - ALL MAINTENANCE - VARIOUS TYPES OF ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT (Cont’d)
olar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-3048

10 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 2 EA  $1709.40 $ 3418.80

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Arrow Board Trailer

11 Annual Preventative Maintenance,
As Specified 4 BEA  $1709.40 $ 6837.60

Stihl — Auger, Model #BT120C
12 Annual Preventative Maintenance,

As Specified 2 EA $NoBid $ No Bid
Unit
of % Discount
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)

SECTION II - ALL REPAIRS AND PARTS FOR VARIOUS ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT
Air Tech RT2500-B-Duo Grinder

13a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $No Bid
13b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HER  $No Bid
13¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered —

Delivered No Bid%
13d  Parts — Percentage of Discount

Offered — Pick-Up . No Bid%

American Signal Computerized LED Variable Message Board81gu #CMS-T333
14a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $275
/ 14b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $253
l4c  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered 8%
/ 14d  Parts — Percentage of Discount |
Offered — Pick-Up 12%
DCS Grinder
15a  Repair Service — County Location
Rate HR  $NoBid
15b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR. $No Bid
15¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered No Bid»
15d  Parts — Percentage of D1scount ‘
Offered — Pick-Up No Bid%
Unit
of % Discount
k‘med ‘ﬁescm;ﬁiﬁgg:g §3§§ Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)

Official Resolution#: 2023001680



TRAFFIC SAFETY SERVICE, LLC
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT

25d  Parts — Percentage of Discount

R§2:E 9019

Offered — Pick-Up No Bid%
Precision Solar Controls Inc. — Mini Variable M‘essage Board
26a  Repair Service — County Location
Rate HR  $275
~/ 26b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $253
260 Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered 3%
26d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up 12%
Skydrill — Gas Powered Post Pounder Model #BG-231
27a  Repair Service — County Location
Rate HR 8275
/ 27b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $253
27¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered 8%
/ 27d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up 12%
Unit
of % Discount
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN)

SECTION II - ALL REPAIRS AND PARTS FOR VARIOUS ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT

{(Cont’d)
Smith Manufacturing, Inc, — LNX 8 Grinder

28a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR
28b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR
28¢c  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered
28d  Parts — Percentage of Discount

Offered — Pick-Up

Smith Manufacturing, Ine. — SPS 10 Grinder
29a  Repair Service — County Location
Rate HR
29b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR
29¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered
29d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up

Solar Technology Ine. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model ¥MB2-1548

30a Repd.ir Service — County Location
HR
'"“é’ﬁtf" oﬁepalr mber -y ﬁzgp Rate HR
Offigfpt Resopdipny: ?%i%%’ﬁf&ge of Discount Offered - Delivered

$No Bid
$No Bid
No Bidw
No Bid%
$No Bid
$No Bid
No Bid%
No Bid%
$No Bid
$No Bid
No Bidv




TRAFFIC SAFETY SERVICE, LLC

EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMEN’Bestgg 6' [4] ’71 0

30d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up No Bid%

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #¥MB2-2248
J3la Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $275
31b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $253
/ le  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered 8%
31d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered - Pick-Up ' 12%
Unit
of % Discount
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price (NOT LESS THAN) |
SECTION II - ALEL, REPAIRS AND PARTS FOR VARIOUS ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT

(Cont’d}
Solar Technology Ine, — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-3048

/ 32a  Repair Service — County Locanon

Rate HR  $275
/ 32b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $253.
32¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered 8%
/ 32d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Oftfered — Pick-Up 12%

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Sentinel Arrowboard Trailer
33a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $275
J33b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $253
/"30 Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered 8%
33d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up 12%

Stihl — Auger, Model #BT120C
J4a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $NoBid
34b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR _$No Bid
34¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered ‘ No Bid%
34d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up No Bid%
Tore Workman 2100
35a Repaxr Service — County Location
Introduced on )ecember 6, HR $N0 Bld
35tBd on: Repalr g@sﬂ g)hep Rate HR  $No Bid

0ff|C|a| Resolution#: 2023001680



TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CO., INC. |
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEFRING DEPARTMENRESPRId 11

30d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up NO BID%

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-2248
3la  Repair Service — County Location

Rate : HR $NO BID
31b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $NO BID .
3lc  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered ‘ ~ NO BID%
31d  Parts - Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up NO BID%
Unit
of % Discount
Item # Description Meas. Unit Price {NOT LESS THAN)
SECTION II - ALL REPAIRS AND PARTS FOR VARIOUS ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT
(Cont’d)

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Messenger Variable Message Board, Model #MB2-3048
52a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $NO BID
32b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $NO BID
32¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered NO BID%
32d  Parts — Percentage of Discount |
Offered — Pick-Up | NO BID%

Solar Technology Inc. — Silent Sentinel Arrowhoard Trailer |
33a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  $NO BID
33b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  §NO BID
33c¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered NO BiD%
33d  Parts - Percentage of Discount

Offered — Pick-Up NO BID%

Stihkl — Auger, Model #BT120C
34a  Repair Service — County Location

Rate HR  §NO BID
34b  Repair Service — Shop Rate HR  $NO BID
34¢  Parts — Percentage of Discount Offered — Delivered NO BID%
34d  Parts — Percentage of Discount
Offered — Pick-Up NO BID%
Tore Workman 2100
35a  Repair Service — County Location
Igtroduced t;%:ate December 6, 2023 HR %]65 00
~Adbpled onRepair Beyariver-s, 3hasp Rate HR  $150.00

Official Resolution#: 2023001680




TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CO., INC. .
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR THE ENGINEERING DEPARTMENReSpPQ 13012

35¢  Parts - Percentage of Discount Oftered — Delivered 3%
35d  Parts — Percentage of Discount ‘ :
Offered — Pick-Up 5%
Introduced on: December 6, 2023
Adopted on: December 6, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001680



