Res-Pg:k.5-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Barbara Jo Crea

08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn (732)929-2005
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines (732)505-1918
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: December 4, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of GOLF COURSE AND LANDSCAPING AND
UTILITY EQUIPMENT to Central Jersey Equipment, LLC; Ocean County Equipment, Inc. dba ACE Outdoor
Power Equipment; and Turf Equipment and Supply Company, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were
received on ltem Nos. 26, 26A, 26B, 26C, 26D, 26E, 26F, 26G, 26H, 261, 27, 27A, 27B, 27C, 27D, 27E, 27F,
27G, 27H, 271, 34, 34A and 35A. They will be rebid. (B2024-176)

Official Resolution# (2024001816
Meeting Date 12/04/2024
Introduced Date 12/04/2024
Adopted Date 12/04/2024
Agenda ltem k-5

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-176
Result Adopted
cowry —_ Ta T, T8 T, 2
COMMISSIONER | | ) :(é > g !
Crea v v
Quinn v v
Haines v v v

Kelly v v |v
Sadeghi v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michoe \. Guestnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:k.5-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

December 4, 2024

WHEREAS, on October 16, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for furnishing and delivery of GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING
AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Central Jersey Equipment, LLC Ocean County Equipment, Inc., dba
670 Route 40 ACE Outdoor Power Equipment
Elmer, NJ 08318 395 Route 9
(856) 358-2880 Bayville, NJ 08721
(732) 269-1155
Turf Equipment and Supply Company, Inc. J. Houston Holdings, LL.C
8015 Dorsey Run Road 483 N. Main Street
Jessup, MD 20794 Keller, TX 76248
(410) 799-3963 (817) 431-3341

Victoria McVay LLC dba Cartz Partz
14634 N. Cave Creek Road
Phoenix, AZ 85022
(602) 788-0355
;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely that of CENTRAL JERSEY
EQUIPMENT, LLC; OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE OUTDOOR POWER
EQUIPMENT and TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for furnishing and delivery of Golf Course, Landscaping and Utility
Equipment for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through
December 3, 2025, a period of one (1) year or until delivery is complete unless otherwise

stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A.
40A:11-15.

Introduced ign: December 4, 2024
Adopted ouJ December 4, 2024
Official Regdlution#: 2024001816

e O




Introduced on:
Adopted on:

Official Resoluq

q

BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 DECEMBER Re$2Rg:k.5-3

A. CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC for ten (10) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 6, 7, 12, 13, 14, 18, 23, 29, 31 and 40.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT, INC., DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR
EQUIPMENT for forty-four (44) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,8,9, 10, 15, 16, 17, 19, 20, 21, 22, 24, 25, 28, 28A, 28B, 28C, 28D,
28E, 28F, 30, 32, 33, 33A, 33B, 33C, 33D, 35, 36, 36A, 36B, 36C, 36D, 37, 37A, 37B, 37C,
37D, 38 and 39.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY COMPANY, INC., for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEMNO. 11.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

No bids were received for items 26, 26A, 26B, 26C, 26D, 26E, 26F, 26G, 26H,

261, 27, 27A, 27B, 27C, 27D, 27E, 27F, 27G, 27H, 271, 34, 34A and 35A. All no bid items
will be rebid.

2. Payments for the equipment and supplies to be acquired by this contract shall
be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance
with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations
and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding
sources: Buildings and Grounds Department, Parks Department, Roads Department, Security,
Solid Waste Management and Vehicle Services O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-176.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Buildings and Grounds Department, Parks Department, Roads Department, Security, Solid

Waste Management, Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

December 4, 2024
December 4, 2024
n#: 2024001816




B2024-176

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC

: .o Res-Pg:k.5-4
[CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Line [tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:

1 Line Trimmer, Red EA No Bid No Bid X
Max EXZ2605-94,
As Specified or
Equal As
Specified, or
Equal

2 Hedge Trimmer, EA No Bid No Bid X
Red Max
CHTZ75R, As
Specified, or
Equal

3, Hedge Trimmer, EA No Bid No Bid X
20" Tanaka,
Model
#TCH22EAP2, As
Specified or Equal

4 Hedge Trimmer, EA No Bid No Bid X
30" Tanaka,
Model
H#TCH22ECP2, As
Specified or Equal

5 Hedge trimmer, 15 EA $503.99 $7,559.85 Stihl HS82R
Stihi HS 82 R, 30"
blade

6 Bike Handle 50 EA $383.99 $19,199.50 Stihl FS111 Equal-New Model
Trimmer/Brush Name

/ Cutter, Stihl

Vi . FS110, As

Specified, or

Equal

Introducedon:  December 4, 2024
Adopted [FENTRAL JERSRMEQUIPMIENT LLC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Regplutient 9221 ANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Page 7




B2024-176

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC

Res-Pg:k.5-5
[CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:

7 Line Trimmer, 15 EA " $359.99 $5,399.85 Stiht | FSA135R
/ battery-powered, ’
‘/ Stihl FSA 135 R, As

Specified, or
Equal

SECTION 11 - BLOWERS

8 Leaf Blower, Billy K EA No Bid No Bid X
Goat Force™ Il
Model #F13 As
Specified, or
Equal

9 . Backpack Blower, EA No Bid No Bid X

Red Max : '
EBZ8500/RH As
*y Specified, or
Equal

10 Hand Held _ EA , No Bid No 8id X
Blower, Red Max
HB281 As
Specified, or
Equal

11 Pro Force Debris ' EA No Bid No 8id X
Blower ,Toro
44538 As
Specified, or
vKuaI

Handheld Blower,
Stihl BGA 200, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 12 Battery Operated 10 EA $383.99 $3,839.90 ' Stihl BGA200

Introduced-eni————December4,2024
Adopted [6f:NTRAL JEBSESHLUAPROBNT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Regolutiont: (2924 BIANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
Page 8 '




B2024-176

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC

. Res-Pg:k.5-6
[CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Line item Description Quantity Ynit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: ; Comments:

/ 13 Battery Operated 10 EA $559.99 $5,599.90 Stihl BGA300
Backpack Blower, ’

\/ Stihl BGA 300, As |
Specified, or

Equal

14 Battery Operated 10 EA $223.99 $2,239.90 Stihl BGAS86
Handheld Blower,

v Stihl BGA 86, As
Specified or Equal

SECTION IIl - BRUSH AND TREE EQUIPMENT

15 Brush Cutter, Billy EA No Bid No Bid . X
Goat Outback
BC2601HHC, As
Specified, or
Equal

16 Telescoping Pole 25 EA $575.99 $14,399.75 Stih} HT105 Equal-New model
Pruner, 80", Stihl ] name

HT103, As
Specified, or
Equal

17 Telescoping EA No Bid No Bid X
Power Pruner,
Echo PPT-2620H,
As Specified, or
Equal

/ 18 Chainsaw, Fult 15 EA $639.99 $9,599.85 Stihl MSA300
Battery, Stihl MSA

Vi 300 C-0, As
Specified or Equal

19 Chain Saw, EA No 8id No Bid X
Husgvarna 562XP
As Specified, or
Equal

y. W~ 18 ¥ a
=Une

Introduce r 2

doR————December
Adopted[GENTRAL JEBSENTRALAPHOBANT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rpgialutiopg:C29348H8IANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Page 9




B2024-176

' CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC

[CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:k.5-7

Line item

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer:

Comments:

20

Arborist Gas Saw,
Stihl MS201T As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$671.99

$3,359.95

Stiht

MS201T

21

Cordless
Chainsaw (with
required
accessories), Stih!
MSA 220 C-B, As
Specified or Equal

15

EA

$767.97

$11,513.55

stihl

MSA220C

22

Gas Powered
Chainsaw, Stihi
MS 362,.

‘| Complete, As

Specified, or
Equal

15

EA

$759.99

$11,399.85

Stihl

MS362 -

SECTION IV - GENERATORS

23

Generator, Honda
EU3000, 4
Wheeled Model,
As Specified, or
Equal

EA

$2,390.00

$19,120.00

Honda

EU3000

24

Generator, Honda
EB5000XK3 As
Specified, or
Equal

.EA

$2,469.00

$19,752.00

Honda

£B85000

25

Generator, Honda
Model
ED10000AN, As
Specified or Equal

EA

$5,224.00

$15,672.00

Honda .

EB10000

SECTION V - COMPRESSORS

Introduced-on:

December A 2024

Adopted [GENTRAL JBF&&YT&:@MPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggplution#: (9eAM 81ANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Page 10



B2024-176

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC

Res-Pg:k.5-8
[CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:

1.6 {40mm) $90.39 $903.90 Stihl 1.6 auger
Diameter Auger
Bit {For Dirt)

288 2.4" Diameter 10 EA $79.19 $791.90 Stih!
Auger Bit (For ) ;
Dirt}

28C 3.5" Diameter 10 EA $83.19 $831.90 Stih!
Auger Bit (For
Dirt)

28D 4.7" Diameter 10 EA $123.19 $1,231.90 Stihl
Auger Bit (For ‘
Dirt) '

28E 5.9" Diameter 10 EA $131.99 $1,319.90 : Stihl
Auger Bit (For
Dirt}

28F 7.9" Diameter 10 EA ) $140.79 $1,407.90 Stihi
Auger Bit (For : .
Dirt)

SECTION VII - MOWERS

29 . 20" Battery- 5 EA $639.99 $3,199.95 Stihl RMA510 N ~
/ Powered, Self- : )
Propelled Mower,
\/ Stihi RMA 510V,
As Specified or -
Equal '

30 42" Ride-on g EA No Bid " No Bid X

Commercial Lawn :
Mower, Walker
€231 with Bushel
Box, As Specified,
or Equal

Introduced.-an: December 4,.2024

Adopted[GBNTRAL JERSE¥NIRUILROZAT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rggolufion#c2A3AH §18NDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
Page 13




B2024-176

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC

[CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:k.5-9

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost

Manufacturer:

Comments:

a1 60" Zero Turn 8 EA $15,685.00 $125,480.00
Rear Discharge
/ Mower, Kubota
‘/ Model ZD1211R-
60R As Specified,
or Equal

John Deere

2994R 60" RD

32 72" Zero-Turn 3 EA $15,000.00 $45,000.00
Rear Discharge
Mower, Stihl
RZ972I, As
Specified, or
Equal

John Deere

2970R

SECTION Vil - UTILITY VEHICLES

33 Utility Vehicle, EA No Bid No Bid
Kubota RTV- ’
X1100CWLH As
Specified, or
Equal

OPTIONS FOR ITEM 33

33A 25x11-12 ATV, 6 SET No Bid No Bid
Ply, Front Set of
Tires

338 25 x 10-12 HDWS, . SET " No Bid No Bid
6 Ply, Front Set of
Tires

33C 25x11-12 ATV, 6 SET No Bid No Bid
Ply, Rear Set of
Tires

33D 25 x 10-12 HDWS, SET No Bid No Bid
6 Ply, Rear Set of -
Tires

Introduced-er-———Becember4,2024

. Adopted KiENTRAL J ERSRYWEQUPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggplutioni: GO2AR9ES1ANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
Page 14



B2024-176

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC

Res-Pg:k.5-10
[CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD :
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:

38 Sod Cutter, Blue EA No Bid No 8id X
Bird, Honda
Engine 5.5 HP, 18
in., As Specified or
Equal

HTEM 39

39 Walk 8ehind EA No Bid No Bid X
Edger, Husgvarna
LE475, As
Specified, or
Equal

ITEM 40.

/ 40 Battery Powered 5 EA $359.99 ) $1,799.95 Stihl SGA 85
\/ . Backpack Sprayer,

Stih] SGA 85, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introducedon: =~ December 4, 2024
Adopted fIENTRAL JERSEMBENAROENT LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT . \

i) uge 818 NDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
Official Rgpoluien#: 292490¢818NDsCAPI TY
' Page 17




CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC 82024% S76P —
COMPLIANCE PAGES - GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT Pagg 2 0f 23

SECTION I - TRIMMERS (CONT’D)

ITEM #4, HEDGE TRIMMER, 30” TANAKA, TCH22ECP2, AS SPECIFIED, OR EOUAL>

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
~ Blade Length 30 in. O X

Weight 11.4 1bs. O X
Displacement 21.1 cm? O X
Max. Strokes _ 3,760/min. - O X
Fuel Capacity - 10.1 oz 0J X
Blades Double-Sided L X
Operation Time per Tank 32 mins. U X
Exhaust Direction Forward/Angled [ X
Emission ~ Standard Phase 2 O X
Noise Level 89 dB : O X
Rear Handle 5 Position, Adjustable LJ X
Warranty 2 years UJ X

ITEM #5, HEDGE TRIMMER, STIHL HS 82R, 30” BLADE, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Displacement 22.7cc (1.4 in’) X O
Engine Power 0.7 kw (094 bhp) X O
Fuel Gas X O
Fuel Capacity 460 cc (15.6 0z) X O
Blade Length 30” X O
Strokes/Minute 3100 X O
Weight 5.7 kg with 30” Blade X ]
Warranty 2 years X O

\/ ITEM #6, BIKE HANDLE TRIMMER/BRUSH CUTTER, STIHL FS110, AS SPECIFIED. OR EQUAL

Stihl 4-MIX® Engine, meets EPA emission requirerhents, :
Auto Cut® cutting head, lightweight. ' X

O

Displacement: 1.9 cu. in. X O

Engine Power: 1.4 bhp , X O

Weight: , 12.8 1bs. (without cutting »

. attachment or deflector) X O

Fuel Capacity: 18 oz. X O
Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolutiop#: 202400181
Centrai ersey E#qulpment iLC



CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC 'BZOZ‘I-R-I 7?3 K512
€S-F(J:K.o-
COMPLIANCE PAGES - GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT Pagg 3 0f23

SECTION I — TRIMMERS (CONT’D)

/ITEM. #7, LINE TRIMMER, BATTERY-POWERED TRIMMER, STIHL FSA 135 R, AS SPECIFIED
OR EQUAL '

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Weight: 10.1 Ibs. X g
Weight (w/ AP300S): 14.1 1bs. X g
Power Source: Battery X O
Battery System: AP Series X O
Cutting Width 16.5 in. X O
Run time (w/ AP 300 S) Up to: 45 min. X O
Voltage 36 Volt X O
Front Handle : . 360-degree rotation X -
Warranty - 2 years X OJ
Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001816
-Central Jersey Equipment LLC



CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC BZOZ‘EI 7?, K513
COMPLIANCE PAGES - GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT Page 50f23

Warranty: 2 years [ X
Weight: 475 1bs. ' L] X
Width: 48 inches O X

SECTION II - BLOWERS (CONT’D)

\/ITEM #12, BATTERY OPERATED HANDHELD BLOWER, STIHL BGA 200, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL ' '

COMPLIANCE

‘ YES NO

Note: Must be used with battery belt or AR-style backpack battery.

Power Source: ~ Battery

Blowing Force: 21 Newtons X ]

Weight: 7.1 lbs X ]

Sound Pressure Rating: 59 db(A) X O

Air Speed: 188 MPH X O

Air Volume at Nozzle: 553 CFM X O
" Run Time (w/ AR 3000 L) Upto: 500 min. - X O

Voltage: 36 volt X O

Warranty: 2 years X O

ATEM #13, BATTERY OPERATED BACKPACK BLOWER, STIHL BGA 300, AS SPECIFIED, OR
EQUAL

Power Source: Battery

Blowing Force: 26 Newtons X O
Weight: 16.5 Ibs. X O
Weight (w/ AR 3000L) 37.9 Ibs.

Sound Pressure Rating: 59 db(A) X O
Air Speed: 192 MPH X O
Air Volume at Nozzle: 571 CFM X O
Run Time (w/ AR 3000 L) Upto: 140 min. X ul
Warranty: 2 years X O

\/ITEM # 14 — BATTERY OPERATED HANDHELD BLOWER, STIHL BGA 86, AS SPECIFIED OR
EQUAL

Power Source _ Battery X O
Weight 6.2 Lbs. X O
Weight (W/ Ap 300) 10 Lbs. X O
Blowing Force 15 Newtons X O
Sound Pressure Rating 58 Db(A) X O
Max. Air Velocity 154 Mph X O
Air Volume At Nozzle 459 Cfm X O
Rutofiens W/ ApDOSIRSIRI24 21 Min X O

Official Resolution#: 2024001816
Central Jersey Equipment LLC



CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC
- COMPLIANCE PAGES - GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Warranty:

Shoulder Strap Included
Side-access Chain Tensioner
Adjustable auto oiler

Two (2) guide bar studs

2 years

SECTION III - BRUSH AND TREE EQUIPMENT (CONT’D)

ATEM #18, BATTERY CHAINSAW, STIHL MSA 300 C-O, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Weight (w/ AP 500 S):

Power Source:

Powerhead Weight:

Battery System:

Guide Bar Length:

Chain Oil Capacity:

Run Time (w/ AP 500 S) up to:
Voltage:

Warranty:

Oilomatic® Chain:

14.1 Ibs.

Battery

9.9 lbs.

AP Series

16"

10.5 oz.

44 min.

36 volt

2 Years

.325 RS3 Chain

ITEM #19 CHAIN SAW, HUSQVARNA 562XP, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Cylinder displacement

Cylinder bore

Cylinder stroke

Power output

Maximum power speed
Maximum recommended engine
speed

Ignition system

Ignition module air gap

Idling speed

Spark plug

Electrode gap

0Oil tank volume

Oil pump capacity

Chain pitch

Recommended bar length, min-max
Chain speed at max power

Bar mount

Exhaust emissions (HC average)
Exhaust emissions (CO average)

Exhant-unssiong(NQ¥.ayeinge)
Eg%ﬁesolutlon# é;@??gge?ﬁg‘e)

Central Jersey Equipment LLC

59.8 cc
1.81 inch
1.42 inch
4.7 hp
9600 rpm

14000 rpm
SEM DM61
0.01"

2800 rpm
NGK CMR6H
0.02"

0.7 US pint
6-15 ml/min
3/gn

15"-28"

69.9 ft/s
Large

56 g/kWh
241 g/kWh
4.8 g/kWh
802 g/kWh

B2024-176
Res-Pg:k.5-14
Page 7 of 23

] X
O X
OJ X
O X
O X
COMPLIANCE
YES NO
X O
X U
X U
X O
X O
X O
X ]
X O

X U
X ]
o X
a X
O X
O X
] X
O X
U X
O X
O X
[l X
[ X
O X
O] X
O X
O X
[l X
O X
O X
O X
] X
U X



CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC ’BZOZ‘I-lil 76P ' i
€S-F(J:K.o-
COMPLIANCE PAGES - GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT Pagg9 of 23

SECTION IV — GENERATORS

\/ITEM #23, GENERATOR, HONDA EU3000 IS SUPERQUIET, 4 WHEELED MODEL, AS SPECIFIED,
OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
| YES NO
Engine: ~ 6.5HP X O
' Single cylinder X O
OV air cooled X O
Displacement: 196 cc. X O
AC Output: 120V, 3000 watt max. X O
DC Output: 12V, 144 watt X O
Receptacles: 20A 125V Duplex X O
, 30A 125V Locking Plug X O
Fuel capacity: - 3.4 gal. X O
Run Time: Approx. 6.9 hrs. of run time on full tank
' @ rated load X O
Dry WT: -~ 130.7 1bs. X O
Dimensions: 25.9”x 17.6” x 227 X O
Commercial Warranty: 3 yrs. ’ X a
ITEM #24, GENERATOR, HONDA EB5000XK3, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Engine: Honda iGX390 X O
Displacement: 389cc _ X O
AC Output: 120/240V 5000W max. X O
Receptacles: ' 20A 125V Duplex (2) X O
30A 125V Locking Plug X O
30A 125/250V Locking Plug X O
Fuel Capacity: 6.2 gal. X O
Run Time per Tankful: 7.0 hrs. @ rated load, 11.2 hrs @ 'z load X O
Dry Weight: 210.8 1bs. X O
- Commercial Warranty: 3 years X O
With Standard Wheel Kit , X O
ITEM #25 - HONDA GENERATOR, MODEL EB10000AN, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
Engine: Honda GX630 X O
Dli'ﬁpol@&c%glg&t December 4, 2024 688cc X S

Official Resolution#: 2024001816

AN : 1207240Wei G0BW max. (83.8/41.6A) 9000W rated (75/37.5A) X
Central Jersey Equipment LLC



CENTRAL JERSEY EQUIPMENT, LLC
COMPLIANCE PAGES - GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

MOWERS

fCTION VII -
I

B2024-176

Res-Pg:k.5-16
Page 13 of 23

TEM #29 — 20” BATTERY—POWERED SELF-PROPELLED LAW MOWER, STIHL. RMA 510 V. AS

SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Power Source:

Battery System:
Weight:

Deck Material:

Deck Width:

Cutting Width:

Cutting Height:

Self Propelling:

Cutting Positions:
Mowing Blade Speed:
Starter: _
Grass Catcher Capacity:
Area Mowed (w/ AP 300 S):

Battery

AP Series
63.9 Ibs.
Steel

2"

20"

1"-3.9”
Required

7 spring assisted
3,200 rpm
Power Switch
19.8 gal.
3,078 sq. ft.

- COMPLIANCE
YES NO
X O
X O
X O
X O
X O
X O
X O
X 0
X o
X O
X 0
X 0

ITEM #30 - 42" RIDE ON COMMERCIAL LAWN MOWER, WALKER C231 WITH BUSHEL BOX ,

AS SPECIFIED, OR EOUAL

Engine
Collection

~ Fuel System
Cooling System
Displacement
Max Power
Max Torque
Fuel Capacity
Seat

Tires
Dimensions

? Suceél E‘r:\her B(B%cember 4,2024

d’gtm December 4, 2024
Official olution#: 2024001816
Central Jersey Equipment LLC

Kohler ECH730

42” Deck Collection

EFI (Electronic Fuel Injection)
Air :

747 cc

23 HP

38.1 ft. lbs.

4.7 gal.

Comfort/Cushion

18 X 8.50-10 Turf Tire

50”H X 49.25” WX 96.25” L
10

2 Years on Entire Tractor; 3 Years on Engine

oooooooooogoo

XM oX X X X X X X X X X X X
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COMPLIANCE PAGES - GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT Page 15 of 23
SECTION VII - MOWERS (CONT’D)

V/ITEM #31 - 60" ZERO TURN REAR DISCHARGE MOWER, KUBOTA MODEL ZD1211R-60R,
- AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL - (JOHN DEERE Z994R 60” REAR DISCHARGE)

"COMPLIANCE
YES NO
DIESEL ENGINE
. Engine Model 3 Cylinder X O
Horsepower (Gross): 24.8 Gross HP @ 3000 rpm  (24.7@3200) [ X
Total Displacement ' 68.5 cu. in. Displacement ~ (77.3cuin) X O
12v 475 Amp Hour Battery: 14 Amps Charging Output (75 amp) X O]
DIMENSIONS:
Wheel Base: 56.77 (567 X
Overall Length: ' 89” X O
Overall Width (with mower): 73.8” (63.5”) X
Overall Width (w/o mower): 59.6” (63.5) O X
Overall Height (with ROPS upright) 78.7” (73”) X ]
Overall Height (with ROPS folded) 54” : 47 X O
TIRES AND WHEELS :
Front S 15 x 6.0 — 6 Flat-free (13x6.5-6 Flat free) [J v X
Rear : 26x12.0-16 (24x12-12) O X
1. WEIGHT (W/MOWER) 1750 1bs. (17201bs) X [
FLUID CAPACITY »
Dual Fuel Tanks (total cap) 12.9 gal (11.5US GAL diesel or biodiesel) [ - X
Engine Coolant: 3.96 qts (7.5 qts) X O
Crankcase with filter , 4.1 gts (3.6 qts) - X O
Transmission Case: 12.8 qts (6.3 qts) O X
TRANSMISSION ‘
Hydrostatic Drive o (2) HST w/Gear Reduction (HSTLandR [J X
B Independent)
Brake Type: ' ' Wet Multi Disks X O
Forward Speed:. 0-10.6 mph , X O
Reverse Speed: 0-5.3 mph : (4.5mph) O X
STEERING/MOTION CONTROL '
Two (2) Hand Levers, Adjustable X
Hydraulically Damped, Adjustable X
SAFETY EQUIPMENT
Electric Key Shut Off X O
Control Lever Safety Switch X O
Parking Brake Safety Switch X O
Foldable ROPS X O
POWERTAKE QFE . 4, 2024 ’ .
e : -

Central Jersey Equipment LLC
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v Res-Pg:k.5-18
COMPLIANCE PAGES - GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT Page 16 of 23
Shaft Drive Mower Deck X O
Wet Disk Clutch X O

fECTION VII - MOWERS (CON’T)

ITEM #31 - 60” ZERO TURN REAR DISCHARGE MOWER, KUBOTA MODEL ZD1211R-60R,
AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL (CONT’D) '

COMPLIANCE
- REAR DISCHARGE MOWER
* 60” Kubota PRO Deck(JOHN DEERE 7 IRON FASTBACK 7 GUAGE DECK) [ X
5.5” Deep Deck : X O
1-5” Cut Height, (1/4” adjustable increments) (1-5.5” Y4 INCREMENTS) X O
. 3 Blades ' X ]
Bolt-on Skid Bars X )
OPERATING FEATURES
Adj. Front Axle: Rigid/Oscillating ' O X
Dual Element Air Filter X O
Deluxe Suspension Seat_ . X D
Hands-free Hydraulic Deck Lift (HANDS FREE MECHANICAL DECK LIFT) O X
Hands-free Parking Brake (Hand operated parking brake) U X
Cup Holder | X U

ITEM #32 .-7;” ZERO-TURN LAWN MOWER, STIHL RZ 9721, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Power Source: Gas : X O
Engine: A Briggs & Stratton (KAWASAKI) iy X
Max Power: 40hp "~ (37 hp) X O
Deck Size: 72 in. , . X O
Fuel Capacity: 15 Gallons (11.5 gal) , O X
Dimensions: TI"Hx77"Wx 88" L(73H 77" W 87" L) U X
Warranty: 3 Years / 1,500 engine hours (unlimited hrs in X O

' first 2 years)
Ground Speed: ’ 12 mph X O
Tires: 26 x 12 Rear Tires; 12 x 6.5-6 Front Tires O X
Suspension Seat - X O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024

Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001816
Central Jersey Equipment LL.C
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SECTION X — MISCELLANEQUS EQUIPMENT (CONT’D) .
ITEM #38 - SOD CUTTER, 18 IN. BLUE BIRD, HONDA ENGINE 5.5 HP, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
: YES NO
Engine: Honda GX160 or Kohler CH255 O X
Power: 55hp U X
Drive Train: ' Chain Drive O X
Clutch Mechanism: Centrifugal, throttle controlled O X
Transmission Type 4-Speed with reverse OJ X
Gears, Forward/Reverse 4/1 O X
Product Size: 54 X24X36 U X

ITEM #39 - WALK BEHIND EDGER, HUSQVARNA LE475, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Capacity:
Working depth 4 in O X
Trimming Width 9in O X
~Cylinder displacement : 9.03 cu.inch O X
Power output 4.2 hp O X
Fuel consumption 411 g/kWh U X
Motor/engine manufacturer Briggs & Stratton O X
Gross Torque 5.5 Ib-ft O X
Transmission type Belt O X
- Consumer Warranty 2 Years - O X

\/ITEM # 40 - BATTERY-POWERED BACKPACK SPRAYER STIHL SGA 85, AS SPECIFIED, OR

EQUAL '
Weight: . 15.5 Ibs. X O
“Power Source: Battery X O
Container Capacity: 4.5 gal. X O
Working Pressure (not including liquid): 14.5 psi X O
Voltage: 36 volt . X O
Warranty: 2 Years X O
Introduced on: Dec-ember 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2_024001816
Central Jersey Equipment LLC



[OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD _
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:k.5-20

PRICE TABLES
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

B2024-176

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer:

SECTION I - TRIMMERS

Madel:

Comments:

1 Line Trimmer, Red 12 EA $285.00 $3,420.00 Red Max
4 Max EXZ2605-94, | '

/ As Specified or
Equal As
Specified, or
Equal .

BCZ265S

2 Hedge Trimmer, 15 . EA $510.00 $7,650.00
/ Red Max

V CHTZ75R, As
Specified, or
Equal

3 Hedge Trimmer, 15 EA $481.39 $7,220.85 Echo
/ 20" Tanaka, .
Mode!
HTCH22EAP2, As
Specified or Equal

HCZ210

22"/10lbs/12.50z

4 Hedge Trimmer, 15 EA $485.00 $7,275.00 Echo
/ 30" Tanaka, .
V Model
#TCH22ECP2, As
Specified or Equal

HCZ810

/ ) Hedge trimmer, 15 " EA $470.75 $7,061.25
Stihl HS 82 R, 30"
blade

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.
<

Introduced on: December 4, 2024

Adopted (DCEAN CODRFMBEIAMARENT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resolupiost: 2LAIRREB1ANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
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.Bid No. TBD
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:k.5-21

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure “Unit Cost Total Cost

6- Bike Handle 50 EA $384.29 $19,214.50
Trimmer/Brush
Cutter, Stihl
FS110, As
Specified, or
Equal

B2024-176

Manufacturer:

Comments:

7 Line Trimmer, 15 EA $399.99 $5,999.85
| battery-powered, '
Stihl FSA 135 R, As
Specified, or
Equal

SECTION H - BLOWERS

8 Leaf Blower, Billy 5 EA $1,881.50 $9,407.50
/ Goat Force™ Il
V Model #F13 As
Specified, or
Equal

Red Max

EBZ8500/RH As

Specified, or
Equal

/ 9 Backpack Blower, 20 EA $542.50 $10,850.00

10 Hand Held 20 EA © $152.00 $3,040.00

/ Blower, Red Max
\ HB281 As
Specified, or
Equal

11 Pro Force Debris EA No Bid : No Bid X

Blower ,Toro :
44538 As -
Specified, or
Equal

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.

Introduced.on: ____December 4,2024

Adopted @CEAN CODRTUNERUAPRIEAT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Repeluiont: IBHEIANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
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Bid No. TBD :
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

B2024-176

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:

12 Battery Operated 10 EA $383.99 $3,835.90 Batt. Sep.
Handheld Blower, $1139.82
Stihl BGA 200, As :
Specified, or
Equal

13 Battery Operated 10 EA $599.99 .+ $5,999.90 1Batt. Sep.

’ Backpack Blower, . ' $1139.82

Stihl BGA 300, As
Specified, or
Equal

14 Battery Operated 10 EA $223.99 $2,239.90 Batt. Sep. 224.99

Handheld Blower,
Stihl BGA 86, As
Specified or Equal

SECTION H1 - BRUSH AND TREE EQUIPMENT

/ 15 Brush Cutter, Billy 3 EA $4,071.23 $12,213.69

Goat Outback
\/ BC2601HHC, As
Specified, or
Equal

16 Telescoping Pole 25 EA $539.99 $13,499.75 Stihl HT105 17.3lbs
/ Pruner, 80", Stihl : .
Vv HT103, As .
Specified, or
Equal

Power Pruner,
Echo PPT-2620H,
As Specified, or
Equal

/ 17 Telescoping 20 EA $510.29 $10,205.80
. .

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.

Introduced on: December 4 2024
Adopted DCEAN COOBERME@IAPRAZNT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Bid No. TBD ' ’
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

B2024-176

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: : Comments:
18 Chainsaw, Full 15 £A $639.99 $9,599.85 Batt. Sep. $337.49
Battery, Stihl MSA
300 C-0, As

Specified or Equal

19 Chain Saw, 5 EA $695.99 $3,479.95 20" bar
Husqvarna 562XP ’
./ As Specified, or |
Equal

~N

20 Arborist Gas Saw, 5 EA $629.40 $3,147.00
Stihl MS201T As
Specified, or
Equa!l

\\

21 Cordless 15 : EA $635.47 $9,532.05
Chainsaw (with .
/ required
\V accessories), Stihl

MSA 220 C-B, As
Specified or Equal

22 Gas Powered 15 EA $709.25 $10,638.75
\j Chainsaw, Stihl

MS 362,
Complete, As
Specified, or
Equal

~

SECTION IV - GENERATORS

23 Generator, Honda 8 EA $1,575.00 $12,600.00 Wheels Sep.
EU3000, 4 _ $72.10
Wheeled Model, :
As Specified, or
Equal

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.

Introduced on: Dggg ber 4, 2024
AdOPteﬂgBEQICEAN COURSTYEEDMRMMT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Bid No. TBD .
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:

B2024-176

Generator, Honda | - $2,040.00 $16,320.00
/| EBSOCOXK3 As .
Specified, or
Equal

/ 25 Generator, Honda 3 EA $4,680.00 $14,040.00
V Model

ED10000AN, As
Specified or Equal

SECTION V - COMPRESSORS

26 Portable : EA No Bid No Bid X
Compressor, Atlas
Copco XAS 188,
As Specified, or

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.

Equal
OPTIONS FOR ITEM 26

26A 50' Single Hose EA No Bid No Bid X
Reel

268 50' Dual Hose EA No Bid No Bid X
Reel

26C 50' Hose EA No Bid No Bid - X

26D 100" Single Hose EA No Bid No Bid X
Reel

26E 100' Dual Hose ’ EA No Bid No Bid X
Reel

26F 100' Hose EA No Bid No Bid X

26G 2" Adjustable EA No Bid No Bid X
Bulldog Hitch :

Introducedon: ~  December 4, 2024
Adopted[@CEAN COUDNTYNEGEDRRMRMT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolytignt: 29RHH $1RNDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
Page 11
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OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.
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Bid No. TBD

GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:k.5-25

Line Item

Unit of Measure

Total Cost

Comments:

Description

SECTION Vi — AUGERS

Quantity

Unit Cost

G

V

Earth Auger, Stihl
BT 131 with 5.9"
{150 mm)
Diameter Bit, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

EA

$498.50

$4,985.00

O;TIONS FOR ITEM 28

\‘/ 28A

P

1.6 (40mm)
Diameter Auger
Bit (For Dirt)

10

EA

$86.24

$862.40

V/ 28B

2.4" Diameter
Auger Bit (For
Dirt)

10

EA

$98.75

$987.50

/ 28C
\

3.5" Diameter
Auger Bit {For
Dirt)

10

EA

$107.00

$1,070.00

/ 28D

4.7" Diameter
Auger Bit (For
Dirt)

10

EA

$115.00

$1,150.00

J 28E

5.9" Diameter
Auger Bit (For
Dirt)

10

EA

$123.00

$1,230.00

28F

7.9" Diameter
Auger Bit (For
Dirt)

10

EA

$131.00

$1,310.00

SECTION VIl - MOWERS

Introduced on:  December 4, 2024

Adopted [@CEAN CODNTANERUIPRIZNT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rgsplutien: R9RARH 81RNDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Page 13
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Bid No. TBD
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost i Manufacturer: ; Comments:

29 .20" Battery- 5 EA $399.99 Batt. Sep. $639.99
Powered, Self-
Propelled Mower,
Stihl RMA 510V,
As Specified or

Equal

$1,999.95

B2024-176

30 42" Ride-on 5 EA $14,378.50 $71,892.50
Commercial Lawn
‘ Mower, Walker
V €231 with Bushel

Box, As Specified,
or Equal

31 60" Zero Turn 8 EA $16,821.40 $134,571.20

Rear Discharge ‘ :
Mower, Kubota
Model ZD1211R-
60R As Specified,
or Equal

Rear Discharge
Mower, Stihl
RZ972l, As

| Specified, or
Equal

/ 32 72" Zero-Turn _ 3 EA $13,858.64 $41,575.92 Bobcat 9997065 ZT7000 |{Kawasaki EFf eng

SECTION Vill - UTILITY VEHICLES

/ 33 Utility Vehicle, ) EA $22,549.80 $112,749.00
Kubota RTV-

V X1100CWLH As
Specified, or
Equal

OPTIONS FOR ITEM 33

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.

Introduced on: ._.____December 4, 2024
Adopted fDCEAN CODBERMBEILALMIENT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Ofiicial Regelutiont: G%RQ?EBﬁNDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
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Bid No. TBD
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
o
N
b )
i; Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:
8 33A 25x11-12 ATV, 6 s 5 SET $415.16 $2,075.80
2a] / Ply, Front Set of
Tires
/
/ 338 25 x 10-12 HDWS, 5 SET ) $273.80 $1,369.00
v 6 Ply, Front Set of
Tires
/ : B
/ 33C - |25x11-12 ATV, 6 S . SET $415.16 $2,075.80
Vv Ply, Rear Set of : ’
Tires
/ _
N 33D 25 x 10-12 HDWS, 5 SET $273.80 $1,369.00
6 Ply, Rear Set of : :
Tires

SECTION IX - TRAILERS

34 Utility Trailer, Big EA No Bid No Bid X
Tex #10P1-20, As
Specified, or
Equal

OPTION FOR ITEM 34

34A 4' Heavy Duty . EA No Bid No Bid X
Integrated Ramp
Gate w/Gas Shock
Assist

SECTION X - MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT

ITEM 35 AND OPTIONS

s 35 Vibratory Asphalt 10 EA $1,714.00 $17,140.00
Plate, Wacker
/ Neuson WP
1550AW, As
Specified or Equal

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.

BCF2150

Comes w/whls

Introduced on: December 42024

Adopted [CEAN CODRTAMRRUPRIENT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Page 15



B2024-176
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Bid No. TBD

GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Res-Pg:k.5-28

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.

Unit Cost

Scythe,
Compatible with
KM 131R, As
Specified or Equal

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:
35 Wheel Kit KIT No Bid No Bid
ITEM 36 AND OPTIONS
36 Stihl TS 420 10 ] EA $974.99 $9,749.90
V/ Cutquik Cut-Off :
Machine, As
- | Specified or Equal
v/ 36A Stihl Cutquik Cart 10 EA $305.24 $3,052.40
with Mounting Kit
/ 368 Water Tank for 6 EA $128.99 -$§773.94
\ Cart
36C Stihl TS Wheel Kit 10 EA $115.49 $1,154.90
4
/ 36D Guide Wheel Kit 10 EA $40‘.49 $404.90
Vv for Stih! Cutquik
) cart
ITEM 37 AND OPTIONS
/" 37 . |stint 2 EA $374.99 $749.98
KombiSystem,
Powerhead KM
131R, As
Specified, or
Equal
pra
V 37A Adjustable Power 2 EA $202.49 $404.98

Introduced-en:i————December4;2024

Adopted KﬂCE.AN CODW,PMENT, INC DBA/ACE OUTDOOR POWER EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggolution#: GOMEETANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Page 16
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Bid No. TBD ‘

GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer: Comments:

378 Pole Pruner 2 EA $149.99 $299.98
’ Attachment, :

/ Compatible with
V - |KM131R, As

Specified, or
Equal

B2024-176

37C Shaft Extension, 2 EA $67.49 © $134.98
Compatible with

Vv KM 131R, As
Specified or Equal

Trimmer,
Compatible with
v KM 131R, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 37D Adjustable Hedge 2 EA $209.99 $419.98

ITEM 38

38 Sod Cutter, Blue 2 EA $4,822.24 $9,644.48 M6131
Bird, Honda :

V Engine 5.5 HP, 18
in., As Specified or
Equal

ITEM 39

v 39 Walk Behind 2 EA $1,013.22 $2,026.44 6033-00-01

Edger, Husqvarha
. LE475, As
Specified, or
Equal

ITEM 40

OCEAN COUNTY EQUIPMENT DBA ACE POWER OUTDOOR EQUIP.
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;ECTION I - TRIMMERS
ITEM #1, LINE TRIMMER, RED MAX EXZ7260S-94, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE

YES NO
Weight: 8.82 Ibs. X O
Engine: Pro-GZ25N Strato charged X O
Displacement: 25.4 cm’ O
Carburetor: Diaphragm w/purge pump X O
Horsepower: 1.27 U
Bore & Stroke: 34M x 28M X U
Ignition: Solid State _ [
Clutch: Centrifugal X ]
Fuel Capacity: 22.32 oz. U
Cutting Head: 4" X J
Muffler: _ Quiet tone with guard X O
Drive Shaft: Straight solid shaft w/ splined ends O

X O

jhall meet all EPA Pollution Standards for Phase II/Carb Tier II -
ITEM #2, HEDGE TRIMMER, RED MAX CHTZ75R, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Blade Type: Double O
Blade Length: 30" X O
Engine Size: 23.6 cc O
Engine Type: Strato-Charged® X O
Horse Power: .80 | O
Dry Weight: 13.3 Ibs. X O
Fuel Capacity: 15.2 fl. oz. O
Warranty: 2 years |

v/ITEM #3, HEDGE TRIMMER, 20” TANAKA, TCH22EAP2, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Blade Length 20 in. ]
Weight 9.5 lbs. O
Displacement 21.1 cm? X O
Max. Strokes 3,760/min. X O
Fuel Capacity 10.1 oz O
Operation Time per Tank 32 mins. ] O
Exhaust Direction Forward/Angled L]
Emission Standard Phase 2 Cl
Noise Level 87 dB X O
Rear Handle 5 Position, Adjustable X O
Warranty 2 years OJ
Introduced on: December 4, 2024

Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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SECTION I — TRIMMERS (CONT’D)
ITEM #4, HEDGE TRIMMER, 30” TANAKA, TCH22ECP2, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Blade Length 30 in. B O
Weight 11.4 Ibs. O
Displacement 21.1 cm® X O
.Max. Strokes 3,760/min. X O
Fuel Capacity 10.1 oz O
Blades Double-Sided X O
Operation Time per Tank 32 mins. (]
Exhaust Direction Forward/Angled X O
Emission Standard Phase 2 O
Noise Level 89 dB X O
Rear Handle 5 Position, Adjustable O
arranty © 2years X d
ITEM #5. HEDGE TRIMMER, STIHL HS 82R, 30” BLADE, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Displacement 22.7cc (1.4 in’) X O
Engine Power 0.7 kw (094 bhp) X O
Fuel Gas X O
Fuel Capacity 460 cc (15.6 0z) 0
Blade Length 30” U
Strokes/Minute 3100 X UJ
Weight 5.7 kg with 30” Blade X Ol
Warranty 2 years X U

ITEM #6, BIKE HANDLE TRIMMER/BRUSH CUTTER, STIHL FS110, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Stihl 4-MIX® Engine, meets EPA emission requirements,

Auto Cut® cutting head, lightweight. X OJ
Displacement: 1.9 cu. in. X U
Engine Power: 1.4 bhp O
Weight: 12.8 Ibs. (without cutting
attachment or deflector) X O
Fuel Capacity: 18 oz. X (|
Introduced on: December 4, 2024

Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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;ECTION II1 - BLOWERS
ITEM #8, LEAF BLOWER, BILLY GOAT FORCE™ II MODEL #F13, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Model No.: F1302H - 13.0 HP Honda GX O
Front Wheel: 10" x 3" pneumatic X O
Rear Wheels: : 13" x 5" pneumatic X O
Engine Base: 12 gauge steel, robotically welded D O
Discharge Size: 5" » X O
Unit Weight: 152 1bs. X OJ
‘/)imensions: 33"Lx30"Wx35"H g
ITEM #9, BACKPACK BLOWER, RED MAX EBZ8500/RH, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Engine: Strato 75.6 cm® O
Weight: 24.7 Ibs X O
Horsepower: 4.4 U
Air Speed: 206 MPH X O
Air Volume: 908 CFM X O
Fuel Capacity: 77.771l. oz X O]
Emission Durability: 300 hrs. X O
ITEM #10, HAND HELD BLOWER, RED MAX HB281, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Engine: 28 cc, 2 stroke X O
Weight: 9.4 1bs X O
Horse Power: 1.1 O
Air Speed: 170 MPH O]
Fuel Capacity: 16.9 0Z X O
Air Flow in Pipe: 425 CFM X U
Air Flow in Housing: 470 CFM X U
Standard Warranty - 2 years X U
ITEM #11, PRO FORCE DEBRIS BLOWER, TORO MODEL 44538, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Engine: - 27 hp twin cylinder air-cooled Kohler
command pro with electronic governor 0 O
Fan: Aerial flow J OJ
Height: 33 inches Ol ]
Length: 79-115 inches from adjustable tow
\ hitch to nozzle outlet O O
Nozzle Type: impact resistant plastic with 13 inch
outlet diameter U UJ
Tires: 10X10.8, 4 ply turf tire O O
Warranty: 2 years O O
Wieighted on: December 4, 2024 475 1bs. O O
\@dﬂaggc:?ggolution#: ZD;Z(::(;?J"IJ:: : R 48 inches O O
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\/SECTION III - BRUSH AND TREE EQUIPMENT
I

TEM #15, BRUSH CUTTER, BILLY GOAT OUTBACK BC2601HHC, AS SPECIFIED,
OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Engine: Honda 388cc Electric Start X O
Transaxle: Tuff Torq hydrostatic transmission
featuring fully automatic enhanced
traction control OJ
Blade Clutch: Blade brake/clutch X ]
Max. Slope: 20° X O
Cut Width: 26" O
-Cut Height: Saplings up to 2" in diameter, and
brush 6 fi. tall X Ol
Wheels Rear: , 16" diameter with puncture sealant X U
Unit Weight: 335 Ibs. O
imensions: 72" L (Overall) x 31" W x 48" H X O]
\/:TEM #16, TELESCOPING POLE PRUNER, 80”, STIHL HT103, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Automatic chain oiling, side access chain tensioner. UJ
Displacement: 1.9 cu. in., 31.4cc OJ
Engine: Stihl 4-MIX® X W
Engine Power: 1.05 Kw O
Weight with Cutting
Attachment: 16.3 lbs. O
Fuel Capacity: 18.0 oz. X O
Chain Oil Capacity: 7.4 0z, X O
Oilomatic® Chain: %" PMM?, 12" bar and chain O
X O

=

‘/haft Length 80~
ITEM #17, TELESCOPING POWER PRUNER, ECHO PPT-2620H, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Engine Displacement: 25.4 cc A X O
Carburetor (w/ purge pump): Rotary Valve-Diaphragm X ]
Fuel Capacity: 20.6 fl. oz. X O
Oil Capacity: 6.6 fl. oz. X O
Length Collapsed: 107 in. O
Length Extended: 146 in. X O
Optional Extension to be included: 4 ft. X O
Bar Length: 12 in. X O
Dry Weight (w/o bar and chain): 17 lbs. O
Warranty: 2 years X O
Shoulder Strap Included X O
Side-access Chain Tensioner O
RISl auto ofRETL S 202 X a
mo-a(aaegawdenbazmmm X O
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SECTION III - BRUSH AND TREE EQUIPMENT (CONT’D)
ITEM #18, BATTERY CHAINSAW, STIHL MSA 300 C-O, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Weight (w/ AP 500 S): 14.1 Ibs. X O
Power Source: Battery [
Powerhead Weight: 9.9 1bs. X U
Battery System: AP Series O
Guide Bar Length: 16" X U
Chain Qil Capacity: 10.5 oz. X O
Run Time (w/ AP 500 S) up to: 44 min. X O
Voltage: 36 volt O
Warranty: 2 Years [
Oilomatic® Chain: .325 RS3 Chain X U

\ATEM #19 CHAIN SAW, HUSQOVARNA 562XP, AS SPECIFIED. OR EQUAL

Cylinder displacement
Cylinder bore
Cylinder stroke
Power output
Maximum power speed
Maximum recommended engine
“speed
Ignition system
Ignition module air gap
Idling speed
Spark plug
Electrode gap
Oil tank volume
Oil pump capacity
Chain pitch
Recommended bar length, min-max
Chain speed at max power
Bar mount
Exhaust emissions (HC average)
- Exhaust emissions (CO average)
Exhaust emissions (NOx average)
Exhaust emissions (CO; average)

Equivalent vibration level (ahv,eq)
front/rear handle 2.7/3.2 m/s?

Sound pressure level at operators’ear

59.8 cc
1.81 inch
1.42 inch
4.7 hp
9600 rpm

14000 rpm
SEM DM61
0.01"

2800 rpm
NGK CMR6H
0.02"

0.7 US pint
6-15 mi/min

3/8"

15"-28"
69.9 ft/s
Large

56 g/kWh
241 g/kWh
4.8 g/kWh
802 g/kWh

106 dB(A)

Song-posver leve), ghatpntssd (LWA) 118 dB(A)

Weidst . rebgu gient
Official Rgg))flﬁ%or?#t%%OM 1(1;p )

12.57 Ibs

XRXXKX

KKK NKKNNKN X

X X X X

0000 ODoOooodoboooOooooo ogoooo
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gECTION IIT1 - BRUSH AND TREE EQUIPMENT (CONT’D)
ITEM #20, STIHL MS201T, ARBORIST GAS SAW, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE

YES NO
Displacement: 2.14 cu. in X U
Engine Power: 2.41 bhp X O
Powerhead weight: 8.16 lbs. U
Fuel capacity: 10.5 oz. X O
Chain oil capacity: 7.4 oz. O
Oilmatic® chain: 63 PS3 (30" to 40") X O
Guide bar lengths: Stihl Rollomatic®E or E light X U

/ITEM #21, STIHL, MSA 220 C-B, CORDLESS CHAINSAW, AS SPECIFIED. OR EQUAL

Weight 3.6kg U
Cutting Length/Bar Length 35 D¢ O
Rated voltage 36V X U
Sound pressure level 89 dB(A) ]
Vibration level left/right 4.8/3.6 m/s? a
Saw chain pitch 3/8” P X O
Battery technology Lithium-Ion AP System X O
Battery Life Minimum 42 Minutes X O
Included Accessories:

AL 300 Quick Charger, 220-240V U
AP 300 S 36V Lithium Ion Battery X )

/ITEM #22, STIHL MS 362, GAS POWERED CHAINSAW, COMPLETE, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Power Source Gas X O
Powerhead Weight 12.3 Ibs. X O
Guide Bar Length (Recommended) 20 in. X O
Oilomatic® Chain - 3/8” RS3 O
Chain Oil Capacity 11 oz. X O
Engine Power 4.6 bhp O
Fuel Capacity 20.3 oz. X O
Displacement 59.0 cc U
Intended Use Professional X U

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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SECTION1V - GENERATORS

ITEM #23, GENERATOR HONDA EU3000 IS SUPERQUIET, 4 WHEELED MODEL, AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Engine: 6.5 HP X U
Single cylinder X O
OV air cooled X 0J
Displacement: - 196 cc. U
AC Output: 120V, 3000 watt max. X U
DC Output: 12V, 144 watt X O
Receptacles: 20A 125V Duplex X O
30A 125V Locking Plug ]
Fuel capacity: 3.4 gal. X |
Run Time: Approx. 6.9 hrs. of run time on full tank
(@ rated load X O
Dry WT: ' 130.7 lbs. U
Dimensions: 25.97x 17.6” x 22” O
\/Comme‘rcial Warranty: 3 yrs. X O
ITEM #24, GENERATOR, HONDA EB5000XK3, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Engine: Honda iGX390 X [
Displacement: 389cc X O
AC Output: 120/240V 5000W max. X U
Receptacles: 20A 125V Duplex (2) X UJ
30A 125V Locking Plug X O
30A 125/250V Locking Plug O
Fuel Capacity: : 6.2 gal. X ]
Run Time per Tankful: 7.0 hrs. @ rated load, 11.2 hrs @ /2 load O
Dry Weight: 210.8 lbs. X U
Commercial Warranty: 3 years X ]
ith Standard Wheel Kit O U
\/IU'VTEM #25 - HONDA GENERATOR, MODEL EB10000AN, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
Engine: Honda GX630 d a
Displacement: 688cc O O
AC Output:  120/240V 10000W max. (83.8/41.6A) 9000W rated (75/37.5A) g O
Receptacles: 20A 125V GFCI Duplex (2), 30A 125V Locking Plug, 30A 125/250V
Locking Plug, S0A 125/250V Locking Plug U a
Starting System: Electric O O
Fuel Tank Capacity: 8.19 gal. £l (|
Run Time per Tankful: 5.4 hrs @ rated load, 7.9 hrs @1/2 load a O
Dimensions: (L x Wx H): 41.0" x 27.7" x 35.1" including
Ao Do ber 4 a0, hanging hook & with handlebars folded o O

Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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SECTION VI — AUGERS
ITEM #28 - EARTH AUGER, STIHL BT 131 WITH 5.9” (150mm) DIAMETER BIT, AS SPECIFIED,
OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

High Torque one-person auger; 4 MIX engine with low fuel consumption,

Low Noise and vibration level. Standard with QuickStop drill brake, long

live air filter system and support cushion. ' X O

Displacement cm 36.3 O

Power output Kw/BHP 1.4/ 1.9 |

Weight kg 10 KG X Ol

Tank volume 550.00 O

Included Bit 5.9” (150mm) diameter (for dirt) X U

QuickStop drill brake for work safety. QuickStop drill brake acts to stop

backwards rotation. A jammed drilling bit can simply be unscrewed from

the borehole X O

OPTIONS:
/ 28A. 1.6 (40mm) diameter auger bit (for dirt) X Ll
v/ 28B. 2.4 (60mm) diameter auger bit (for dirt) X O
/28C. 3.5 (90mm) diameter auger bit (for dirt) O
‘/28D. 4.7 (120 mm) diameter auger bit (for dirt) O
‘/28E. 5.9 (150mm) diameter auger bit (for dirt) O
v 28F. 7.9 (200 mm) diameter auger bit (for dirt) X ]

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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SECTION VII - MOWERS

ITEM #29 —20” BATTERY-POWERED, SELF-PROPELLED LAW MOWER, STIHL RMA 510 V, AS
SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

Power Source: Battery X U
Battery System: AP Series X ]
Weight: 63.9 lbs. X O
Deck Material: . Steel 24 O
Deck Width: 21" X O
Cutting Width: 20" X OJ
Cutting Height: 1"-3.9” X U
Self Propelling: Required
Cutting Positions: 7 spring assisted X Ol
Mowing Blade Speed: 3,200 rpm X U
Starter: Power Switch X O
Grass Catcher Capacity: 19.8 gal. X ]
Area Mowed (w/ AP 300 S): 3,078 sq. ft. X O

\/ITEM #30 - 42" RIDE ON COMMERCIAL LAWN MOWER, WALKER €231 WITH BUSHEL BOX,
AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

Engine Kohler ECH730 X O
Collection 42” Deck Collection X O
Fuel System EFI (Electronic Fuel Injection) O
Cooling System Air X O
Displacement 747 cc X O
Max Power 23 HP X OJ
Max Torque 38.1 ft. Ibs. [
Fuel Capacity 4.7 gal. X O
Seat Comfort/Cushion U]
Tires 18 X 8.50-10 Turf Tire O
Dimensions 50" H X 49.25” W X 96.25” L X O
Bushel Catcher Box 10 ‘ O
Warranty: 2 Years on Entire Tractor; 3 Years on Engine X O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024

Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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SECTION VII - MOWERS (CON’T)

ITEM #31 — 60” ZERO TURN REAR DISCHARGE MOWER, KUBOTA MODEL ZD1211R-60R
AS SPECIFIED. OR EQUAL (CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE

YES NO
REAR DISCHARGE MOWER
60” Kubota PRO Deck X O
5.5” Deep Deck U]
1-5” Cut Height, (1/4” adjustable increments) X ]
3 Blades O
Bolt-on Skid Bars X O
OPERATING FEATURES
Adj. Front Axle: Rigid/Oscillating X )
Dual Element Air Filter LJ
Deluxe Suspension Seat U
Hands-free Hydraulic Deck Lift X O
Hands-free Parking Brake X O
Cup Holder X O

/ ITEM #32 -72” ZERO-TURN LAWN MOWER, STIHL RZ 9721, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Power Source: Gas 0 O
Engine: Briggs & Stratton ] X
Max Power: 40hp O
Deck Size: 72 in. O
Fuel Capacity: 15 Gallons X OJ
Dimensions: 71"Hx 77" Wx88"L O U
Warranty: 3 Years / 1,500 engine hours O
Ground Speed: 12 mph UJ
Tires: 26 x 12 Rear Tires; 12 x 6.5-6 Front Tires O] O
Suspension Seat ] O

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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AECTION VIII — UTILITY VEHICLES
ITEM #33, UTILITY VEHICLE, KUBOTA RTV-X1100CWLH, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO

Type: 3 cylinder, water-cooled 4-cycle diesel OHV X O
Displacement: 68.5 cu. in. X D
Horsepower (HP): 24.8 @3000 rpm O
Fuel Tank Capacity: 7.9 gals. X O
Transmission: Variable hydro transmission (VHT - X) O
Max. Traveling Speed: 25 mph O
Wheels, Drive System: 4, rear 2WD or 4WD selection [
Differential Lock: Standard foot operated with

mechanical holder X O
Gear Selection: Hi-Med-Lo range forward, neutral, reverse X O
Brakes: Front/Rear Wet-disc brake O
Parking Brake: Rear wheel, hand lever X U
Steering: Hydrostatic power X O
Suspension: Front: Independent Dual A arms with

adjustable spring pre load

Rear: Independent with coil over shock O
Length: 122.5 in. X O
Width: 65.4 in. ]
Height Overall: 82.3 in. X O
Front Tread Centers: 48.8 in. O
Rear Tread Centers: 48.8 in. X U
Wheelbase: 80.5 in. Ul
Ground Clearance: Front/rear axle 10.5/10.4 in. O
Turning Diameter: 26.2 in. X ]
Max Rolling Weight: Towing capacity — 1300 lbs. U

Payload capacity — 1629 Ibs. X O
Weight: 2370 lbs. U
Cargo Bed Width x Length x Depth: 57.7 x 40.5 x 11.2 in. O
Cargo Volume: 15.2 cu. ft. O
Bed Height: Unloaded — 34.9 in. X O
Cargo Bed Load: 1102 Ibs. O
Tires, Front: TURF 25 x 10-12, 4-ply, or equal X ]
Tires, Rear: TURF 25 x 10-12, 4-ply, or equal U]
Front Guard: Standard X U
Hydraulic Bed Lift: Standard O
Speedometer: Standard OJ
Bed Liner Standard O
Color: Orange X O
Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024

Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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SECTION VII - UTILITY VEHICLES (CONT’D)

ITEM #33, UTILITY VEHICLE, KUBOTA RTV-X1100CWLH, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
(CONT’D)

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
/OPTIONS:
33A. 25x 11-12 ATV, 6 Ply - Front Set of Tires X O
/3B. 25 x 10-12 HDWS, 6 Ply — Front Set of Tires X O
j3C. 25 x 11-12 ATV, 6 Ply — Rear Set of Tires O
33D. 25 x 10-12 HDWS, 6 Ply — Rear Set of Tires X O]

Introduced on: December 4, 2024
Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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SECTION X — MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT
ITEM #35, VIBRATORY ASPHALT PLATE, WACKER NEUSON #WP 1550AW, AS SPECIFIED OR

EQUAL
COMPLIANCE
YES NO

DIMENSIONS
Length 34.5in U X
Width 19.5 in O
Height 38 in. O X
Base Plate 23inx 19.5in U X
Lowest Working Height 20 in. L X
Weight 190 1bs. [ X
ENGINE
Type Air-Cooled, 4 Cycle, Single Cylinder,

Honda Gasoline X U]
Displacement | 9.9 in® X O
Max. Power Output 5.5 hp/3,900 rpm O
Power Rate 5 hp/3,600 rpm U X
Fuel Tank Capacity 39qt O
Fuel Consumption 1.9 qt/hr ]
BASE PLATE
Water Tank Capacity 11 qt. O X
Grade Ability 30% U
Vibration Frequency 6,000 vpm O]
Compacted Area 9,750 ft*/ hr X O
Tough, wear resistant ductile iron base plate O X
Computer designed base plate has tapered
bottom and edges for high speed ]
Designed for compaction of granular and mixed
materials with some cohesive content in
confined areas X O
TRANSMISSION 4 - :
Power Train Power transmission from engine via centrifugal

clutch and V-Belt onto exiter which transmits

centrifugal force onto base plate X O
Max. Centrifugal Force 3,375 Ib. O X
Forward Speed Up to 100 ft/min O X
STANDARD FEATURES
Asphalt Water Tank Included X UJ
Straight, Center-Mounted Guide Handle X O
OPTION

“mntroguceygon: December 4, 2024
354 Wheel Kit pecember 4, 2024 X U
Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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‘/SECTION X - MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT (CONT’D)

ITEM #36, STIHL TS 420 CUTQUICK CUT-OFF MACHINE, AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE
YES NO
Displacement 66.7 cc (4.07 in® X a
Engine Power 3.2 kW (4.4 bhp) X O
Weight 9.6 kg (21.2 1bs.) Ul
Fuel Tank Capacity 710 cc (24 oz.) X Ol
Engine Speed 9,000 rpm (elec. Gov.) Ol
Max. Spindle Speed 5,350 rpm X O
Arbor Size 20 mm L]
Max. Wheel Size 350 mm (14”) O
Max. Cutting Depth 125 mm (44.9”) X U
Power Source Gas X U
OPTIONS:
'/ 36A. Stihl CutQuik Cart with Mounting Kit O
36B. Water Tank for Cart X O
'/36C. Stihl TS Wheel Kit X O
36D. Guide Wheel Kit for Cart b 0
\/ITEM #37 — STIHL. KOMBI SYSTEM POWERHEAD KM-131R, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Weight 4.4Kg (9.71bs) X U
Displacement 36.3cc (2.2cu. in.) X ]
Engine Power 1.4 kw (1.9 bhp) O
Power Source Gas Y ]
\/ OPTIONS:
37A. Adjustable Power Scythe
145°, 10” Blade X O
/ 37B. Pole Pruner
Guide Bar Length shall be 12” X O
\/ 37C. Shaft Extension :
Lengthens shaft by at least 37” < O
37D. Adjustable Hedge Trimmer
Blade length shall be 20” X U
Overall Length shall be 58.3” X O
145° working range X O
Introduced on: ecember 4, 2024

Adopted on: December 4, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001816
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TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY COMPANY

: Res-Pg:k.5-44
[TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CO.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT

tine Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost i Manufacturer: ] Comments:

7 Line Trimmer, EA No Bid " No Bid X
battery-powered, ’ )
Stihl FSA 135 R, As . )
Specified, or &

Equal ‘ :

SECTION Il - BLOWERS

8 Leaf Blower, Billy EA No Bid No Bid X

Goat Force™ ||

Model #F13 As

Specified, or
Equal

9 Backpack Blower, EA No Bid No Bid X
Red Max :

EBZ8500/RH As
Specified, or
Equal

10 Hand Held EA No Bid No Bid X
Blower, Red Max ‘ .

HB281 As

| Specified, or

Equal

11 Pro Force Debris 10 EA $10,760.74 $107,607.40 Toro 44552 Model number for
/ Blower ,Toro ' ) Pro Force Debris
‘/ 44538 As ' Blower has
Specified, or changed from
Equal : . . 44538 t0 44552.

12 Battery Operated EA No Bid No Bid X
Handheld Blower, ' '
Stihl BGA 200, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: December 4, 2024 ‘
Adopted
ok R@'?u QuIBKERPANDSBPPLY CO.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
GOLF COURSE, LANDSCAPING AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT
Page 8




TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY COMPANY B2024-176
Res-Pg:k.5-45
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SECTION I1 - BLOWERS

ITEM #8, LEAF BLOWER, BILLY GOAT FORCE"' 11 MODEL #F13, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

COMPLIANCE

YES NO
Model No.: F1302H - 13.0 HP Honda GX ) X
Front Wheel: 10" x 3" pneumatic O
Rear Wheels: 13" x 5" pneumatic O X
Engine Base: 12 gauge steel, robotically welded O X
Discharge Size: ' 5" : ' O X
Unit Weight: 152 Ibs. ([
Dimensions: 33"Lx30"Wx35"H gn X
ITEM #9, BACKPACK BLOWER, RED MAX EBZ8500/RH, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL
Engine: Strato 75.6 cm? O
Weight: 24.7 Ibs - O
Horsepower: 4.4 O
Air Speed: ‘ 206 MPH O X
Air Volume: 908 CFM O
Fuel Capacity: 77.771l. oz O X
Emission Durability: . 300 hrs. O X

ITEM #10, HAND HELD BLOWER, RED MAX HB281, AS SPECIFIED, OR EQUAL

~ Engine: 28 cc, 2 stroke U
Weight: 9.4 Ibs O
Horse Power: . 1.1 a
Air Speed: 170 MPH O X
Fuel Capacity: 16.9 OZ O
Air Flow in Pipe: 425 CFM O X
Air Flow in Housing: 470 CFM O X
Standard Warranty 2 years O

/ WM&M
Engine: 27 hp twin cylinder air-cooled Kohler

command pro with electronic governor (|

Fan: Aerial flow O X

Height: 33 inches DX O

Length: 79-115 inches from adjustable tow -

hitch to nozzle outlet tl

Nozzle Type: impact resistant plastic with 13 inch :

. outlet diameter X O

Tires: ‘ 10X10.8, 4 ply turf tire ]

Wai‘ran 2 years X [

Wasght e" " Decemberd, 204 4751bs. O

W‘if&’dh'. Resolution#: 2024001816 48 inches X |



