Res-Pg:1.4-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

Tel: (732)929-2005
Fax: (732)505-1918

May 3, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND

TOPSOIL to Brickwall Corporation; Herman's Trucking, Inc.; Mitchell
Dynamics/Silvi Materials and Stavola Construction Materials, Inc., th

Products, LLC; Constructural
e lowest qualified bidders. No bids were

received on Item Nos. 8, 9, 14A, 14B, 14C, 15A, 15B, 15C, 16A, 16B, 16C, 17C, 18A, 18B, 18C, 20A, 20B,
20C, 21A, 21B, 21C, 23A, 23B, 23C, 26A, 26B and 26C. All no bid items will be rebid. (B2023-82)

Official Resolution# [2023000597
Meeting Date 05/03/2023
Introduced Date 05/03/2023
Adopted Date 05/03/2023
Agenda ltem I-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-82
Result Adopted
COUNTY o PP R
COMMISSIONER | | ] :(é > g =
Joseph H. v v

Gary v v
Barbara Jo v v v
Virginia E. v v |v
John P. v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guestnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced o
Adopted on:
Official Resq

Res-Pg:1.4-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL

RESOLUTION
May 3, 2023

WHEREAS, on April 11, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE
AND TOPSOIL for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders for items as follows:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Brickwall Corporation Herman’s Trucking, Inc.
25 First Avenue 181 Jacobstown-Cookstown Road
Atlantic Highlands, NJ 07716 Wrightstown, NJ 08562
(732) 291-8100 (609) 758-3808
Mitchell Products, LLC. Constructural Dynamics/Silvi Materials
1205 West Main Street 355 Newbold Road
- Millville, NJ 08332 Fairless Hills, PA 19030
(856) 327-2005 (215) 295-0777
Stavola Construction Materials, Inc. Britton Industries, Inc.
175 Drift Road 227 Bakers Basin Rd.
Tinton Falls, NJ 07724 : - Lawrenceville, NJ 08648
(732) 542-2328 (844) 274-8866

;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, for the Furnishing and Delivery of Sand, Gravel,
Stone and Topsoil namely BRICKWALL CORPORATION; HERMAN’S TRUCKING,
INC.; MITCHELL PRODUCTS, LLC; CONSTRUCTURAL DYNAMICS/SILVI
MATERIALS and STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, INC. No bids were
received on Item Nos. 8, 9, 14A, 14B, 14C, 15A, 15B, 15C, 16A, 16B, 16C, 17C, 18A, 18B,
18C, 20A, 20B, 20C, 21A, 21B, 21C, 23A, 23B, 23C, 26A, 26B and 26C. All no Bid Item
Nos. will be rebid. . |

| NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF

COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as
follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed
to enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL,
STONE AND TOPSOIL for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award
through May 2, 2024, a period of one (1) year OR until delivery is complete. The County
reserves the right to extend the term of the contfact pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A: 11-15, as
follows:
i May 3, 2023

May 3, 2023
Ition#: 2023000597




Res-Pg:1.4-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 MAY 3, 2023

A. BRICKWALIL CORPORATION for three (3) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 3, 4 and 5. ’

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
B. HERMAN’S TRUCKING., INC. for fifteen (15) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 6, 10A, 10B, 10C, 12A, 12B, 12C, 13A, 13B, 13C, 22A, 22B and 22C.
C. MITCHELL PRODUCTS. LLC. for two (2) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 17A and 17B.
D. CONSTRUCTURAL DYNAMICS/SILVI MATERIALS for ten (10)

items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 11A, 11B, 11C, 19A, 19B, 19C, 24A, 25A, 25B and 25C.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
E. STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIJALS. INC. for three (3) items, to

wit:
ITEM NOS. 7, 24B and 24C.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made ﬁpon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices
and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-82.

4. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified cdpies of this Resolution
shall be made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of
Finance, County Superintendent of Buildings and Grounds, County Department of Parks and

Recreation, and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: May 3, 2023
Adopted on: May 3, 2023
Official Resolufibn#: 2023000597




BRICKWALL CORPORATION Res-Pg:l.4-4
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT V

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

_ 3/8" Waslied Stone $30.00 $2,250.00
\/ 4 ‘ Mason Sand » 1,120 TON $14.00 »$15,680.00
5 Sal;ld Grits A | 60 TON $13.00 $780.00
6" Screened Topsoil : 300 ] TON $30.00 $9,000.00
7 Stori1be Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid ' X
8 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) ‘ TON No Bid No Bid X
9 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS ) TON . No Bid No Bid X

SECTION Il - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

10A 2"-5" Delawaire River Stone, Zone 1 ' , TON No Bid X
108 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 , TON No Bid X
10C 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 ‘ TON No Bid X
11A 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 1 TON Nq Bid X
118 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 2 TON No Bid X
11C 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zohe 3 | TCN No Bid - X
12A 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 1 _TON | No Bid X

lr;troduced on: May 3, 2023

Adopted ay 3, 2023 —

Official BB DbXabtdsdyT REPORT
Bid - SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Page 7,



| HERMAN’S TRUCKING, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-5
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Documents (doc, docx, rtf, txt, s, xIsx, pdf)
Images (jpg, png, bmp, tif)

No response submitted

9. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

10. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all requwed documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submittirig a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

- SECTION | - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
J 1 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone 350 TON $;35.16 $12,306.00 Pickup at
Herman's
Wrightstown,

NJ

Introduced-ohi——May 3;2023

Adopted GROPOSAL BECS)RABAT REPORT
Official Reniglutéondp 2873008995 TONE AND TOPSOIL -

Page 6




HERMAN’S TRUCKING, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-6
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
\/ 3/4" Decorative Red Stone $4,390.00 Pickup at

Herman's
Wrightstown,
NJ

3 |3/8" Washed Stone TON No Bid No Bid X

4 Mason Sand 1,120 TON $25.23 $28,257.60 Pickup at
Herman's
Wrightstown,
NJ

5 Sand Grits TON No Bid No Bid X

'4 - A
J 6 Screened Topsoil 300 TON | $23.75 $7,125.00 Pickup at

Herman's
Wrightstown,
NJ

7 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) ' ] 450 TON $25.92 $11,664.00 Pickup at
Herman's
Wrightstown, .
NJ

8 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid X

9 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS - TON No Bid No Bid X

SECTION |l -.FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
\/ , 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1

Introduc - 3-2623

Adopted GRROPOSAL {A&CA) bABAT REPORT

Official RegielutiyiD 2023009895 TONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 7



HERMAN’S TRUCKING, INC. Rés-Pg:1.4-7
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ltem Description i A Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

J 108 [2"-5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 TON © $85.60
/ 10C 2" - 5" Delaware River étone, Zone 3 | | TON $82.60
11A | 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 1 TON $48.81
118 3/4" Cleavn Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 2 . TON $45.81
11C 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 3 TON $45.81
/ A 12A 3/4" Decorétive,Red Stone, Zone 1 TON $65.28
/ 12B 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 2 TON $57.28
12C 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 3 - TON $57.28
\/' 13A 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1 TON 568.82
_ / 138 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 | TON | $62.82
. \/ 13C 3/4" Delaware Rivér Stone, Zone 3. TON $59.82

14A 3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 1 - TON No Bid X

14B - |3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 2 TON No‘ Bid - X

14C 3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 3 ‘ TON No Bid X

15A 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X

158 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X

Introduced on: May 3, 2023
Adopted RO POSAL Ma)CH RIZRT REPORT

Official Regglutiandn 28%RIB%TONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 8




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD _
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

HERMAN’S TRUCKING, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-8

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
20A Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE hEQUIRED), TON No Bid X
Zone 1 ‘ :
208 Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid X
Zone 2
20C Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid X
Zone 3 )
21A  |Sand Grits, Zone 1 ' TON No Bid X
218 Sand Grits, Zone 2 : TON No Bid X
21C |Sand Grits, Zone 3 . TON No Bid X
J 22A Screened Topsoil, Zone 1 TON $41.75
J 22B Screened Topsoil, Zone 2 TON $38.7S
\/ 22C Screened Topsoil, Zone 3 TON $35.75
23A Soccer Field Top Dress, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 1 -
23B Soccer Field Top Dress, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE TON - ‘No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 2
23C Soccer Field Top Dress, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
‘REQUIRED), Zone 3
24A Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON $54.43 Sample
dropoff
Introduced on: May 3, 2023

Adopted eROPOSAL MRICS 9A23T REPORT
Official ResgriRih, BRANEE S ToNE AND TOPSOIL

Page 10



MITCHELL PRODUCTS, LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ftem Description Unitof Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
\ﬁ 178 GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON ST8O0 per ton
RECUIRED), Zone 2 {Forge Pond)
17¢ GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE TON NoBid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3
184 GC500 Dry Topdressing, Treated, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED], Zone 1
188 GCS00 Dry Topdressing, Treated, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid b4
REQUIRED), Zone 2
18C GCS00 Dry Topdressing, Treated, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIREDY), Zone 3
194 Mason Sand, Zone 1 TON No Bid b
188 Mason Sand, Zone 2 TON No Bid %
18C Mason Sand, Zone 3 TON Mo Bid %
204 Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMIPLE REQUIRED), TON Mo Bid *
Zone 1
208 Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE REQUIRED]), TOM No Bid X
Zone 2
200 Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON Mo Bid *
Zone 3
21 Sand Grits, Zone 1 TON Mo Bid %

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 9



MITCHELL PRODUCTS, LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
128 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 2 ’ TON No Bid X
120 3/4" Decorative Red Stone; Zone 3 TON No Bid X
13A 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid %
138 374" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 TON No Bid X
13C 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 TON No Bid %
144 3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid X
148 378" Washed Stone, Zone 2 TON NoBid X
14C 378" Washed Stone, Zorie 3 TON Ne Bid X
154 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
158 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X
15¢ 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON Mo Bid X
164 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
168 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X
16C 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
\} 17N GCBE&Q Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON $74.50 perton
REQUIRED), Zone' 1 {Atlantis)

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORY
Bid - SAND, GRAVEL, STONEAND TOPSOIL
Page 8



CONSTRUCTURAL DYNAMICS/SILVI MATERIALS Res-Pg:1.4-9
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ‘

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line item

Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

3/8" Washed Stone
4 Mason Sand 7 7 TON  No Bid No Bid X
5 Sand Grits TON No Bid No Bid X
6 | Screened Topsoil | : TON No Bid No Bid X
7 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid X
8 | White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid X
9 White Buriker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS 7 TON ! NoBid NO. Bid X

SECTION Il - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
10A 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid ' X
10B |2"-5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 ' TON No Bid X
10C . 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 TON No Bid X
\[ 11A 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 1 TON $36.66-
\[' ' 118 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 2 TON $34.96
\] 11C 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 3 TON $33.99
12A 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid X
Introduced on: May 3, 2023
Adopted PROPOS \g REPORT

Official Resolu R
Bido- SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 7



| CONSTRUCTURAL DYNAMICS/SILVI MATERIALS Res-Pg:1.4-10
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid-No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

178 GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE ' TON No Bid R X
REQUIRED), Zone 2 )

17C GC350 Dry Tobdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS.(SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3

18A GC500 Dry Topdressing, Treated, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid | X
REQUIRED), Zone 1 '

18B GC500 Dry Topdressing, Treated, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 2

18C GC500 Dry Topdressing, Treated, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3 - -~

} \/ 19A Mason Sand, Zone 1 TON I 52‘1.58
|~ 198 [Mason Sand, zone 2 ' TON | $22.10
/| 19 |MasonSand, Zone 3 TON  |* $2350
20A Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid X
Zone 1
20B Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid X
' Zone 2 :
20C Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid X
' Zone 3
21A Sand Grits, Zone 1 ] TON No Bid X
Introduced on: May 3, 2023

Adopted ppinpoSAL May BMENT REPORT

Offictal RezplERRTEs, 208AYEE EToNE AND TOPSOIL

Page 9



, CONSTRUCTURAL DYNAMICS/SILVI MATERIALS Res-Pg:1.4-11
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
21B Sand Grits, Zone 2 4 ' : TON No Bid X
21C  {sand Grits, Zone 3 TON No Bid X
22A Screened Topsoil, Zone 1 TON No Bid X
22B Screened Topsoil, Zone 2 TON No Bid X
22C  |Screened Topsoil, Zone 3 ' TON No Bid X
23A Soccer Field Top Dress, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 1
23B Soccer Field Top Dress, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 2
23C Soccer Field Top DressA, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3
\/ 24A Stone Dust {SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON $37.35
248 Stone Dust {SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zohe 2 TON $35.84
24C Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON $34.98
\/ 25A White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON - $21.58
J 25B . White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 . TON $22.10
J 25C White Beach Sand, {SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON $23.50
26A White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
Introducedon: May 3, 2023

Adopted gn;

Official ROSABES Ak BoRs0AIERT REPORT
Bid - SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 10



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No: TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, INC.

Res-Pg:1.4-12

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
3 3/8" Washed Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
4 Mason Sa‘nd TON No Bid No Bid X
5 Sand Grits TON No Bid No Bid X
6 Screened Topsoil TON No Bid No Bid X
\[ 7 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) 450 TON $18.50 $8,325.00
‘ 8 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid X
9 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS TON No Bid No Bid X

SECTION II - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY

Line ltem Description

Unit of

Unit Cost

No Bid

Comments:

Measure
10A 2"-5" D?‘Iawére River Stone, Zone 1 TON ‘No Bid
10B 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 TON | No Bid
10C 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zéne 3 TON' No Bid
11A 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid
118 3/4" Cléan Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 2 TON No Bid
11C 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 3 TON No Bid '
12A 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid

Introduced on:

May 3, 2023

offeia Robesrak douafadT REPORT
Bid - SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Page 7



STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-13
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

21B Sand Grits, Zone 2 TON No Bid X

21C  |Sand Grits, Zone 3 T TON No Bid X

22A Screened Topsail, Zone 1 TON No Bid X

228 Screened Topsoil, Zone 2 TON ‘No Bid X

22C Screened Topsoil, Zone 3 TON No Bid VX

23A Soccer Field Top Dress, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON k No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 1

23B Soccer Field Top Dress, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTiONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 2

23C Soccer Field Top Dress, USS Fairway, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3 '

24A Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON $38.50

J 24B Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON $30.25

24C | Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON ' $29.05

25A White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 ' TON No Bid X

258 White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 ' TON | No Bid X

25C White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X

26A White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 ~ TON No Bid X

Introduced on: May 3, 2023

Adopted SROPOSAL BIRLBIRIRNT REPORT
Official Regglutianit 28RMEFIETONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 10



