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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Virginia E. Haines

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191
Tel: (732)929-2005

Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea Fax: (732)505-1918

Commissioner Gary Quinn
Commissioner Joseph H. Vicari
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

March 16, 2022 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS
DEPARTMENTS to Dot Designing; Keyport Army Navy; Asia Trading Int'L dba Unipro International; Victory
Supply LLC; Bob Barker Company, Inc.; Bordova Innovations, Inc. and Smart Stitch, LLC, the lowest qualified
bidders. (B2022-33)

Official Resolution# [2022000364
Meeting Date 03/16/2022
Introduced Date 03/16/2022
Adopted Date 03/16/2022
Agenda ltem m-6

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2022-33
Result Adopted
cowry —_ Tal, T T T, [
COMMISSIONER g u‘% g g’i § % ﬁ
Kelly v

Haines v v

Crea v v
Quinn v v |v
Vicari v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON
\j\@&mz, \. G_u:&MX/

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:m.6-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
DOCUMENTS, INVQICES, VOUG

RESOLUTION

.March 16, 2022

WHEREAS, on February 8, 2022, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of WORK CLOTHES FOR
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Dot Designing Keyport Army Navy
242 Possum Hollow Road PO Box 985
Monroe Township, NJ 08831 Brick, NJ 08723
(732) 656-1100 (732) 673-5356
Asia Trading Int’L dba Victory Supply LLC
Unipro International 7025 Industrial Park Road
390 Nye Ave. Mount Pleasant, TN 38474
{ Irvington, NJ 07111 (888) 376-1205

(973) 577-1300 x 1049

Bob Barker Company, Inc. Bordova Innovations, Inc.
7925 Purfoy Road 22 Webster Ave.
Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 Brooklyn, NY 11230
(919) 346-2154 (718) 480-0290

Smart Stitch, LLC ‘ Landsman Uniforms, Inc.
129 Walters Ave. 6206 Black Horse Pike
Ewing, NJ 08648 Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234
(609) 945-1487 (609) 909-1000

Zak’s Monogramming, Inc.

DBA Initial Impact

516 Warren Ave.

Spring Lake, NJ 07762
(732) 449-4922
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, in each instance be
accepted, namely that of, DOT DESIGNING; KEYPORT ARMY NAVY; ASIA TRADING
INT’L DBA UNIPRO INTERNATIONAL; VICTORY SUPPLY LLC; BOB BARKER
COMPANY, INC.; BORDOVA INNOVATIONS, INC. and SMART STITCH, LLC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Adopted on: March 16, 2022
Official Resolujipn#: 2022000364




BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 MARCH 15‘33559"“-5'3

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting bids, for the furnishing and delivery of Work Clothes For
Various Departments for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award
through March 15, 2023, a period of one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to

N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

A.  DOT DESIGNING for forty five (45) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 5b, 10a, 10b, 47, 48a, 48b, 48c, 48d, 49, 50, 51, 52a, 52b, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58,
59, 60, 61, 62a, 62b, 67, 69, 78, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101,
102 and 117.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section VIII (Item #'s 86 - 91) of $3,095.00. For a Total Lump
Sum Award Section IX (Item #'s 92 - 102) of $2,614.15.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. KEYPORT ARMY NAVY for thirty three (33) items, to wit:

ITEMS NO. 1,2, 3,9a, 9, 11a, 11D, 14, 16, 17, 18, 19, 22, 24, 25, 26, 27, 33, 34, 35, 37, 38,
40, 41, 63, 70,71, 72,73, 74,75, 82 and 117.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. ASJA TRADING INT’L DBA UNIPRO INTERNATIONAL for twenty one °
(21) items, to wit:

ITEMS NO. 5c¢, 6, 12, 13, 20, 28, 29, 32, 36, 39, 64, 65, 76,77, 79, 80, 81, 83, 84, 85 and 117.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

D. VICTORY SUPPLY LLC for seven (7) items, to wit:

ITEMS NO. 42a, 42b, 43a, 43b, 44, 46 and 117.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

E. BOB BARKER COMPANY. INC. for sixteen (16) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 45, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109,110, 111, 112,113,114, 115, 116 and 117.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section X (Item #'s 103 - 116) of $9,825.50.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

F. BORDOVA INNOVATIONS., INC. for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 5d,7, 8 and 117.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

G. SMART STITCH, LLC for eleven (11) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 4, 5a, 15, 21, 23, 30, 31, 66, 68a, 68b and 117.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Adopted on: March 16, 2022
Official Resolufipn#: 2022000364

-




BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 MARCH 18855 9:M-6-4

2. The acceptance made in Paragraph 1. A thru G, inclusive, is made with the
understanding that the successful bidders will enter into a written contract for the faithful
performance of their bid.

3. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County. Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

4. In the event of tie bids pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-6.1(d), bids are awarded
to the bidder(s) in closest distance to the Ocean County Administration Building, 101 Hooper
Avenue, Toms River, NJ, using the address indicated on their bid documentation.

5. Funds for the materials shall be available within the following Funding
Sources: Central Supply Warehouse, Corrections, Juvenile Services, Parks Department,
Roads, Solid Waste Management, Transportation Department, Vehicle Services O.E.

6. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2022-33.

7. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution
shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Director of Purchase, Department of
Finance, Central Supply Warehouse, Corrections, Juvenile Services, Parks Department,
Roads, Solid Waste Management, Transportation Department, Vehicle Services and the

successful bidders.

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Adopted on: March 16, 2022
Official Resolutfipn#: 2022000364




' DOT DESIGNING, LLC Res-Pg:m.6-5
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD '
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

3 Trousers, As 113 EA : X
Specified, or
Equal

4 Work Pants, As 65 EA X
Specified, or
Equal

ba "T" Shirt, Short 107 -~ EA $6.00 $642.00 JERZEES 29M
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 5b "T" Shirt, Short 5 EA $6.00 $30.00 JERZEES 29M
N Sleeve, Screen

Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

5¢ "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $8.00 $40.00 JERZEES 29L
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

5d "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $8.00 $40.00 JERZEES 29L
Sleeve, Screen
Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

6 Insulated 5 EA . X
Coveralls, As
Specified, or
- Equal

7 Snow Overalls, As 4 EA X
Specified, or
Equal

Introducedon——Mareh16.-2622

AdopttR&R OSAL DA MEM T28EPORT

OfficiaBR¢soMORKCR2022¢08383R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 7




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT DOT DESIGNING, LLC Res-Pg:m.6-6

Bid No. TBD . ’
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Manufacturer

CARHART

Total Price Comments

Thermal Zip Up
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

$320.00

9a Heavyweight 75 EA $49.00 $3,675.00 CARHART
Hooded
Sweatshirt, As --
Specified, or
Equal

9b | Heavyweight 65 EA $49.00 $3,185.00 CARHART
Hooded
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

\/ 10a Hooded Pullover 20 EA $15.75 $315.00 JERZEES
Sweatshirt, As

Specified, or
Equal

\/ 10b Hooded Pullover 20 EA $15.75 $315.00 JERZEES
Sweatshirt, As

Specified, or
Equal

1la Hooded 40 EA $44.00 $1,760.00 CARHART S-4X
Sweatshirt, Zipper
Front, Midweight
As Specified, or

Equal -

11b Hooded 10 EA $44.00 $440.00 CARHART S-4X
Sweatshirt, Zipper
Front, Midweight
As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-oni——March-16;2622
AdoptERGIROSAL DOGHIMEN] RRBORT
Officiaf ResQUURRACIZ92H0FIR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Page 8




DOT DESIGNING, LLC Res-Pg:m.6-7
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line tem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

Shirt for Two (2)
Piece Inmate Suit,
As Specified, or
Equal

SECTION IV - UNDERGARMENTS

44 Women's Panties, 12 DOZ X
As Specified, or
Equal A

45 Traditional Style 144 EA X
Bra, As Specified,
or Equal

46 Cotton Brief 144 EA X
Underwear, Men
As Specified, or
Equal

SECTION V - ATHLETIC UNIFORMS

\/ ' 47 "T" Shirt, Long 400 EA $6.60 $2,640.00 ' Jerzees 29L
Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal
48a "T" Shirt, Short 400 EA $3.95 $1,580.00 Hanes 5170

. / Sleeve, As

Specified, or
Equal

48b "T" Shirt, Short 300 EA '53.95 $1,185.00 Hanes 5170
\/ Sleeve, As

Specified, or
Equal

Introdaced o, March 162022
AdoptdtR&POSAL DGad/ly|BN26E2 ORT
OfficiaBRésMORIHCROA29B83B3R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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DOT DESIGNING, LLC .
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT G G Res-Pg:m.6-8

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Unit Price Total Price

\/ "T" Shirt, Short 4 $296.25
’ Sleeve, As :

Specified, or
Equal

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Manufacturer

Comments

48d "T* Shirt, Short 80 EA $3.95 $316.00 Hanes 5170
Sleeve, As
Specified, or s
Equal

49 "T" Shirt, Short 255 EA $3.95 $1,007.25 Jerzees 29m
Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

50 Ladies Polo Shirt 25 EA $11.75 $293.75 Port Authority
{Must be Pique)
As Specified or
Equal '

NN~

51 Ladies Long 25 EA $18.00 $450.00 Port Authority
Sleeve Silk Touch
Polo, As Specified
ot Equal

i\

52a Golf Shirt, Short 25 EA $7.75 $193.75 lerzees
/ Sleeve (No :

Pocket), As ¢
Specified, or
Equal

/ 52b Golf Shirt, Short 25 EA $7.75 $193.75 Jerzees
Sleeve (No

Pocket), As

Specified or Equal

Introduced on: — March 16, 2022
AdoptB@OPOSAL DONEEN] RERORT

Officigh ResqliiRpA 22RO VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 14
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Introd

ucedom—Marct
Adoptedf 6 OSAL DGy 8 ENTzBEfO RT
OfficiaBRésoMORK CROZI9BGIEBAR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

DOT DESIGNING, LLC

Res-Pg:m.6-9

/
.
/58
/
/

Line ltem

Description

Golf Shirt with
Pocket, Short
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

$3,000.00

Manufacturer

Port Authority

Comments

54

Golf Shirt, Mens,
As Specified, or
Equal

200

EA

$13.25

$2,650.00

Ultra Club

55

Staff Shirt, Long
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

50

EA

$18.00

$900.00

Ultra Club

56

Long Sleeve
Classic Pique Polo,
Men’s, As
Specified or Equal

25

EA

$18.00

$450.00

Ultra Club

57

Crew Neck
Sweatshirt, Mens,
As Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$10.35

$258.75

lerzees

Wind Shirt,
Men'’s, As
Specified or Equal

60

EA

$28.00

$1,680.00

Ultra Club

59

Sweatpants, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$11.25

$281.25

Jerzees

60

Lifeguard Tank
Top Shirt As
Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$7.25

$181.25

Gildan

Page 15
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

DOT DESIGNING, LLC

Res-Pg:m.6-10

Line ltem

Description

"Super Sweats",
As Specified, or
Equal

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer

$340.00

Comments

/ 62a

Cadet Collar
Sweatshirt,
Quarter Zip, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$16.00 $560.00 Jerzees

\/ 62b

Cadet Collar

‘Sweatshirt,

Quarter Zip, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$16.00 $400.00 Jerzees

63

Jacket, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$24.00 $600.00 Ultra Club

64

Hooded Jacket, As
Specified, or
Equal

50

EA

65

Bib Pant, As
Specified, Or
Equal *

50

EA

66

Camouflage Cap,
As Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$8.00 $200.00 KC CAPS

\/ 67

Camouflage Hat,
As Specified, or
Equal

125

EA

$9.00 $1,125.00 Dri Duck

68a

Hat, As Specified
or Equal

20

EA

$7.50 $150.00 Hit Wear

Introdacedon

: Marcir 162622
AdoptéR6HOSAL DOGLMETAREEORT
OfficiaBRes WORIHCIDTZOOFBR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Page 16




DOT DESIGNING, LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:m.6-11

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments
Hat, As Specified, 25 EA $7.50 $187.50 Hit Wear
or Equal
69 Sports 30 . EA $10.00 $300.00 Hit Wear
\/ Performance Cap,

As Specified, or
Equal

SECTION VI - WADERS AND BOQTS

As Specified, or
Equal

70 Waders, Women, 15 PR X

Specified, or
Equal

71 Waders, Mens As 15 PR X

Specified, or
Equal

72 Chest Waders, As 15 PR X

Chest Waders, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

73 Cleated Bootfoot 15 PR X

Short, As
Specified, or
Equal

74 Boots, Mens, 75 PR X

Specified, or
Equal

75 Work Boots, As 35 PR ' X

.| SECTION VIl - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Introdueed-on—Mareh-16;-2022

AdoptERGPOSAL DOGEIMENT BBORT

OfficiaBRpsMURKHCIZ0Z209F8IR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 17




; DOT DESIGNING, LLC Res-Pg:m.6-12
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line [tem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

Cargo Shorts,
Men, As Specified )
or Equal

77 Jacket, Men and 10 EA $39.50 $395.00 Port Authority
Women as
Specified or Equal

/ 78 Long Sleeve Shirt, 20 EA $24.00 $480.00 Edwards
Men, As Specified, '
or Equal

79 Long Sleeve Shirt, 20 EA $24.00 $480.00 Edwards
Women, As
Specified, or
Equal

80 Short.Sleeve Shirt, 25 EA $24.00 $600.00 Edwards
Men, As Specified,
or Equal

81 Short Sleeve Shirt, 25. EA $24.00 $600.00 Edwards
Women, As
Specified, or
Equal

82 Sweatshirt, Men 15 EA $24.00 $360.00 Jerzees
and Women As
Specified, or
Equal

83 Golf Shirt, As 25 EA $17.00 $425.00 Gildan
Specified or Equal

84 Trousers, Mens, 15 EA $23.00 $345.00 RedKap
As Specified, or
Equal

introd . ch-16,2022

AdoptdREHPOSAL DORAARENR T28EPORT

OfficiaBResalOaC 2032008383R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 18




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

DOT DESIGNING, LLC

Res-Pg:m.6-13

Line ltem Description Est. Qty.

Trousers,
Women's, As
Specified, or
Equal

Unit of Meas. Unit Price

Total Price

Manufacturer

Comments

Line ltem

SECTION Viil - BUILDINGS & GROUNDS DEPARTMENT & ROAD DEPARTMENT

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of
Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

NoBid  Manufacturer Style

J Smock Top, As Specified or Equal $520.00 Dickies

/ 87  |Scrub Pants, As Specified, or Equal 20 EA $14.00 $280.00 Dickies

/ 88 Scrub Top with Front Pockets, As Specified, or Equal 20 EA $14.00 $280.00 Dickies

/ 89 Work Pants, As Specified, or Equal (NO DENIM) 20 EA $35.00 $700.00 Dickies

/ 90 lacket, As Specified, or Equal 10 EA $84.00 $840.00 Carhart

\/ 91 Long Sleeve Jersey Shirt, As Specified, or Equal 50 EA $9.50 $475.00 lerzees
TOTAL

$3,095.00

Line item

SECTION IX - FIRE & FIRST AID TRAINING CENTER, VEHICLE SERVICES AND ROADS

Description Est. Qty.
"T"-Shirt, Short 250
Sleeve (NO
EXCEPTIONS)

Submit price on
quantity of 1- 50

Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price

EA

$3.95 $987.50

No Bid

Manufacturer

Hanes

Comments

Introd

h-146-2022
CH 10, zuz

geed-on——Mare
AdoptEREROSAL DOGAIMENTRERORT
OfficiahRpsoiptiarC1202200G389R VARIOUS DEPARTM ENTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

DOT DESIGNING, LLC

Res-Pg:m.6-14

Line ltem

&

Description

"“T" Shirt, Long
Sleeve, As
Specified or
Equal

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

$6.33

Total Price

$189.90

No Bid

Manufacturer

Jerzees

Comments

94

~

Titan Twill
Button Down
Shirt, Men (NO
EXCEPTIONS)

EA

$20.00

$100.00

Devon Jones

95

Polo Shirt, Men
(NO
EXCEPTIONS)

EA

$19.00

$95.00

Devon Jones

96

Polo Shirt, Short
Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

30

EA

$17.50

$525.00

Spartek

Short Sleeve Polo
Shirt, Mens, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$17.50

$87.50

Sportek

98

Short Sleeve Polo
Shirt, Womens,
As Specified, or
Equal

EA

$7.25

$36.25

Gildan

99

Hooded Pull-
Over Sweatshirt,
As Specified, or
Equal

10

EA

$12.25

$122.50

Jerzees

100

/
/N
I
/
/
/

Wind Breaker, As
Specified or
Equal

10

EA

$26.00

$260.00

Ultra Club

Intro :

duced-on——Mar
Adopt@ROPOSAL DOGRHHENS] RBBORT

ch 4620292
€ 3

O =0z

Officiap ResQIUURRAC1202P009389R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES .FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS N

Line ltem

Description

Cadet Collar 1/4
Zip Sweatshirt,
As Specified or
Equal

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price Total Price No Bid

5 EA $16.50 $82.50 Jerzees

Manufacturer Comments

/ 102

Introd

geedom—Mare
AdoptRF6POSAL DO

Zip Up
Sweatshirt, As

Specified or

Equal

2 EA $64.00 $128.00 Carhart

TOTAL

$2,614.15

Line ltem

SECTION X - CORRECTIONS WORK CREW

103

Description

Jeans, Men, As
Specified, or
Equal

Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Comments

110 EA X

104

Belt, As
Specified, or
Equal

15 EA : X

105

T-Shirt, Men, As
Specified, or
Equal

60 EA X

1086

Hooded
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

60 EA X

107

Sweatshirt, Crew
Neck, As
Specified, or
Equal

60 EA | X

BAEN T2B5PORT

OfficiaBResoMORKC2032908383R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Page 21
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Res-Pg:m.6-16
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT DOT DESIGNING, LLC g

Bid No. TBD .
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Comments

$0.00

SECTION XI - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltem Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure Discount

Discount Percentage (%) for Work Clothes and Uniforms (NOT LESS THAN) As
Specified

Introdueed-oen——Mareh-16;2022

AdoptdREPOSAL DOGAISAEN T2BEPORT

OfficiaBResoMOMMCI2032009363R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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_ ( e KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY Res-Pg:m.6-17
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

10. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Curfent Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

11. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price i Manufacturer Comments

SECTION I - MALE APPAREL

/ 1 Shirt, Long Sleeve 113 EA $22.00 $2,486.00 . © | Dickies 574
~ As Specified, or .
Equal

\/ 2 Shirt, Short Sleeve 101 EA $19.00 $1,919.00 Bickies 1574
As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Adopt@R@POSAL DOBURNENGTRRRORT
OfficiahRes et afe 1 28F40%93R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY ' Res-Pg:m.6-18
PROPQSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

/ 3 Trousers, As 113 EA $23.00 $2,599.00 Dickies 1874
: Specified, or
Equal

4 Work Pants, As 65 EA $45.00 $2,925.00 Carhartt B136
Specified, or
Equal

Sa "T" Shirt, Short 107 EA $7.00 $749.00 Gildan '+ 15000
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

5b “T" Shirt, Short 5 EA $8.00 $40.00 Gildan 5000
Sleeve, Screen
Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

5c "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $11.00 $55.00 Gildan 2400
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

5d "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $12.00 $60.00 - | Gildan 2400

Sleeve, Screen :
Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

6 Insulated 5 EA $70.00 $350.00 Red Kap CT30
Coveralls, As
Specified, or
Equal

7 Snow Overalls, As 4 EA $160.00 $640.00 Carhartt 104461
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-on: March 16,2022
AdoptelREWPOSAL DOVEYH BRT2BEPORT

Officialgigso B CEOAA9R36AR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 7




KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY Res-Pg:m.6-19
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD '
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item

Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style Comments

Thermal Zip Up $60.00 $300.00
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal *

Carhartt 104078

\/ 9a Heavyweight 75 EA $48.00 $3,600.00 Carhartt 100615
Hooded ’

Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

9b Heavyweight 65 EA $48.00 $3,120.00 Carhartt 100615
/ Hooded

Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

10a Hooded Pullover 20 EA $19.00 $380.00 . lerzees 996
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

10b Hooded Pullover 20 EA $19.00 $380.00 Jerzees 996
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

1lla Hooded 40 EA $43.00 $1,720.00 Carhartt K122
\/ Sweatshirt, Zipper

Front, Midweight
As Specified, or
Equal

Sweatshirt, Zipper
Front, Midweight
As Specified, or
Equal

/ 11b Hooded 10 . " EA $43.00 $430.00 Carhartt K122

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Ad?P_tP‘RQFOSAL D_O@WETWW@PO RT
Officigh ReSAYRRACI TIFAIOFYR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY Res-Pg:m.6-20
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price i Manufacturer Comments

12 Knee Boots, 6 PR X
; Rubber As.
Specified, or
Equal

13 Slush Boots, As 34 PR $27.00 $918.00 WF B79
Specified, or :
Equal

14 Hip Boots, As 16 PR $85.00 $1,360.00 Onguard 86055
Specified, or
Equal

15 Hip Boots, As 16 PR $70.00 $1,120.00 WF B78
Specified, or
Equal

16 Hip Waders, As 8 PR $100.00 $800.00 Frogg Toggs 2716248C
Specified, or
Equal

17 Gloves, As 70 PR $8.00 $560.00 Broner 21-5013
Specified, or
Equal

18 Work Gloves {NO 440 PR $9.00 $3,960.00 Renegade 2200
EXCEPTIONS)

Y 19 Rainwear, As 27 EA $14.00 $378.00 WF 608-800S
Specified, or
Equal

N A A

20 Rainsuit, Two (2) 79 EA $24.75 $1,955.25 Frogg Toggs UL-12104-08
Piece, (NO
EXCEPTIONS)

introduced-on: March 12 2022
AdopteRINPOSAL DCMHHMEN,’I?B@O RT

Officialgfgsoly it c28PA1R3EAR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY Res-Pg:m.6-21
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments
21 Rain Wear, 33 EA $80.00 ‘ $2,640.00 WF 23221/2322WP
Comfort-Brite ’ -
Suit, As Specified,
|or Equal

SECTION It - SAFETY CLOTHING

22 Safety Back Belt, 10 CASE $15.00 $150.00 WF BSB
As Specified or
Equal

23 Class Il Mesh 42 EA $17.50 $735.00 WF 8312MZ
Surveyor's Safety

Garment, As
Specified, or
Equal

24 Class Il 50 EA $65.00 $3,250.00 2w 750C-3

A
\/ Waterproof

Jacket, As
Specified, or
Equal -

25 Class IIl Short 20 EA $16.00 $320.00 WF 8340

. / Sleeve T-Shirt, As

Specified, or
Equal

26 Class llt Long 20 EA $17.00 $340.00 WF 8342
/ Sleeve T-Shirt, As

Specified, or
Equal

27 Class [l Mesh 340 ' EA $15.00 $5,100.00 WF 8336MZ
\/ Traffic Safety

Vest, As Specified
or Equal

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Adopt®ROROSAL DOGEIEIGT20RRORT
OfficiahResER¥ 9T H8I/R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.6-22

Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

28

Line Item

Description

Disposable
Coveralls, As
Specified, or
Equal

Est. Qty. Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

Manufacturer

Style

Comments

29

Hooded Pullover
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

EA

$35.00

$350.00

WF

83668

30

Hard Hat (NO
EXCEPTIONS])

55

EA

$15.00

$825.00

Occunomix

V200

31

Hard Hat Liner As
Specified, or
Equal

30

EA

$7.00

$210.00

Occunomix

RQ301

32

Brow Pad, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

J 33

Mechanic's Style
Gloves, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

26

PR

$35.00

$910.00

Mechanix Wear

MPT-52-009

J

Protective Work
Gloves, NO
EXCEPTIONS

62

PR

$24.00

$1,488.00

Ironclad

EXO2-MIG

/ 35

Hi-Vis Work
Gloves, NO
EXCEPTIONS

40

PR

$30.00

$1,200.00

Ironclad

EXO2-HZI

36

Mechanix Hi-Vis
Work Gloves, No
EXCEPTIONS

50

PR

$39.00

$1,950.00

Mechanix Wear

SMP-91

e FiFosn AN E o

Official FlidolWQRK CeZZDBESBEOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY

Res-Pg:m.6-23

Line' ltem

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

Manufacturer

Comments

\/ 37

Work Gloves, As
Specified or Equal

10

PR

$18.00

$180.00

MCR

J 38

Knit Summer
Work Gloves, As
Specified or Equal

112

PR

$5.25

$588.00

Broner

31-350

39

Premium Goatskin
Leather Driver's
Gloves, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

PR

$11.00

$110.00

WEF

37GK

VG

Work Gloves,
Leather Palm,
Split Side As
Specified, or
Equal

24

PR

$6.00

$144.00

WF

J-56010

Jersey Gloves, As
Specified or Equal

10

PR

$2.00

$20.00

WF

-414

SECTION il - KITCHEN AND PENAL CLOTHING

42a

Pants for Two {2)
Piece Inmate Suit
As Specified, or
Equal

500

EA

42b

Pants for Two (2)
Piece Inmate Suit,
As Specified, or
Equal

2,500

EA

433

Shirt for Two (2)
Piece Inmate Suit,
As Specified, or
Equal

500

EA

Introduced-oni———March-16;2022 :
AdoptedftROPOSAL DMietiV BNIDREPORT
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\/- 63

Introduced on:

Adopt B
TR P
Bid - WORK CLOTHES

Offici

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY

Res-Pg:m.6-24

Line ltem

61

Description

"Super Sweats”,
As Specified, or
Equal

Est. Qty.
20

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Price

$20.00

Total Price

$400.00

Manufacturer

Jerzees

4997

Comments

62a

Cadet Collar
Sweatshirt,
Quarter Zip, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$17.00

$595.00

Jerzees

995M

62b

Cadet Collar
Sweatshirt,
Quarter Zip, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$17.00

$425.00

Jerzees

995M

Jacket, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$23.00

$575.00

Ultra Club

8925

64

Hooded Jacket, As
Specified, or
Equal

50

EA

$85.00

$4,250.00

Grundens

300

65

Bib Pant, As
Specified, Or
Equal

50

EA

$85.00

$4,250.00

Grundens

500

66

Camouflage Cap,
As Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

67

Camouflage Hat,
As Specified, or
Equal

125

EA

. 68a

Hat, As Specified
or Equal

20

EA

March 16, 2022
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KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY Res-Pg:m.6-25

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

7

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style Comments

Hat, As Specified,
or Equal

69 Sports 30 EA
Performance Cap,
As Specified, or
Equal

SECTION VI - WADERS AND BOOTS

70 Waders, Women, 15 PR $195.00 $2,925.00 Cabela's 2641614
As Specified, or
Equal

71 Waders, Mens As 15 PR $165.00 $2,475.00 Frogg Toggs 2713661
Specified, or .
Equal

72 Chest Waders, As 15 PR $220.00 $3,300.00 Lacrosse 191200/908250
Specified, or
Equal

73 Cleated Bootfoot 15 PR - $150.00 $2,250.00 Frogg Toggs 2713243
Chest Waders, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

A AL A

74 Boots, Mens, 75 PR $30.00 $2,250.00 Sea Gear Value Boot
Short, As
Specified, or
Equal

N

J 75 Work Boots, As 35 PR $98.00 $3,430.00 Muck CHH-000A
Specified, or
Equal

SECTION VIl - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
AdoptepRpOSAL DARIMNERT2REPORT
Official Bes Q¥ 20A39E48AR vARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY Res-Pg:m.6-26
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

Cargo Shorts,
Men, As Specified
or Equal

$104.00

77 Jacket, Men and 10 EA $39.00 $390.00 - Sanmar JP56
Women as
Specified or Equal

78 Long Sleeve Shirt, 20 EA $25.00 $500.00 Edwards 1262
Men, As Specified, '
or Equal

79 Long Sleeve Shirt, 20 EA $25.00 $500.00 Edwards 5262
Women, As .

Specified, or
Equal

80 Short-Sleeve Shirt, 25 EA $25.00 $625.00 Edwards 1212
Men, As Specified,
or Equal

81 Short Sleeve Shirt, 25 EA $25.00 $625.00 Edwards 5212
Women, As
Specified, or
Equal

iy 82 Sweatshirt, Men 15 EA $24.00 $360.00 Sanmar PCS0ZH

\/ and Women As

Specified, or
Equal

83 Golf Shirt, As 25 EA $16.00 $400.00 Gildan 3800
Specified or Equal . :

84 Trousers, Mens, 15 EA $22.00 $330.00 Red Kap PT20
As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
AdopteriRDPOSAL DOV R AP ORT
Official Resolxiine? 20#EAREHR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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KEYPORT ARMY AND NAVY Res-Pg:m.6-27
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT : ‘ :

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

TOTAL $0.00

SECTION XI - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltem Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure Discount

Discount Perceﬁtage (%) for Work Clothes and Uniforms (NOT LESS THAN) As
Specified

introducedon: ___ March 16, 2022

AdoptesiRPOSAL DOBUNES2RPORT

Officialgtgsaini 2RI PER VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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ASIA TRADING INTL DBA UNIPRO INT’L Res-Pg:m.6-28
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ,

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

3 Trousers, As 113 EA $23.11 $2,611.43 Dickies #3874 3DK-874
Specified, or ’
Equal

4 Work Pants, As 65 EA $53.42 $3,472.30 Carhartt #8136 3CH-B136
Specified, or
Equal

Sa "T" Shirt, Short ) 107 EA $7.00 $749.00 Jerzees #29M 29M
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

5b "T" Shirt, Short 5 EA $25.00 $125.00 Jerzees #29M 29M
Sleeve, Screen
Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

r 5¢ "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $7.00 $35.00 Jerzees #29LS 8BR-29LS
\/ Sleeve, As .

Specified, or
Equal

5d “T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $25.00 $125.00 Jerzees #291S 8BR-29LS
Sleeve, Screen
Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

Coveralls, As -
Specified, or
Equal

\/ 6 Insulated 5 EA $60.00 $300.00 Red Kap #CT30 | 4RK-CT30

7 Snow Overalls, As 4 EA $205.00 $820.00 Carhartt #R33 4RK-R33
Specified, or
Equal

|ntr0d||_c_e_d on: March 16,2022
Adopt@ROPOSAL DOGASENEIGTZRERORT
OfficiagResqlen¥c 3831988384R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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» ASIA TRADING INTL DBA UNIPRO INT'L Res-Pg:m.6-29
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description . : Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price i Manufacturer Comments

Knee Boots, . X Hygrade #PB
Rubber As ’
Specified, or
Equal

. 13 Slush Boots, As 34 PR $20.00 $680.00 Hygrade #SLB SLB
\/ Specified, or
Equal

14 Hip Boots, As 16 PR $60.00 $560.00 Hygrade #PB-HIP | PB-HIP
Specified, or
Equal

15 Hip Boots, As 16 PR $65.00 $1,040.00 Hygrade # SB-HIP | SB-HIP
Specified, or
Equal

16 Hip Waders, As 8 PR $110.00 $880.00 Frogg Toggs 2716248C
Specified, or ' #2716248C
Equal

17 Gloves, As 70 PR $9.50 $665.00 Tillman #10008 10008
Specified, or
Equal

18 Work Gloves (NO 440 PR $11.00 $4,840.00 Renegade #2200 (2200
EXCEPTIONS)

19 Rainwear, As 27 EA $12.00 $324.00 . Hygrade #RW300 [RW300
Specified, or
Equal

\/ 20 Rainsuit, Two (2) 79 EA $16.00 $1,264.00 Frogg Toggs UL12104-08
Piece, (NO *. |#UL12104-08
EXCEPTIONS)

Introduced-on-———March-16;2022
AdoptddRéaPOSAL DOﬁdMENTzBfPORT

Officiaffgsoly i CRAA29PEIBAR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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, ASIA TRADING INTL DBA UNIPRO INT'L Res-Pg:m.6-30
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

Disbosable $235.00 $235.00 NP 9A-Coverall-D- | NP 9A-Coverall-D-
\.A Coveralls, As ORG ORG
Specified, or
Equal
29 Hooded Pullover 10 EA $35.00 - $350.00 Radians # SI102 Slo2
J Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal
30 Hard Hat (NO 55 EA $14.00 $770.00 Reflective Appare! | HH-19955
EXCEPTIONS) HH-19955
31 Hard Hat Liner As 30 EA $9.00 $270.00 Reflective Apparel | HH-Liner
Specified, or HH-Liner
Equal
L 32 Brow:Pad, As 5 EA $2.00 $10.00 Reflective Apparel | HH-Brow
| Specified, or HH-Brow
Equal
33 Mechanic's Style 26 PR $25.00 $650.00 Mechanix MPT- M-Pact Glove
Gloves, As : 58008
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS
34 Protective Work 62 PR $27.00 $1,674.00 IronClad EX02- EX02-MIG
Gloves, NO MIG
EXCEPTIONS
35 Hi-Vis Work 40 PR $27.00 $1,080.00 IronClad EX02-HZ! | EX02-HZI
Gloves, NO .
EXCEPTIONS
J’ 36 Mechanix Hi-Vis 50 PR $27.00 $1,350.00 Mechanix SMP-91 [SMP-91
b i Work Gloves, No '
EXCEPTIONS
Introd : March 16, 2022

AdopteROIPOSAL DOCUShEGT2RRRORT
OfficialRes B cA3TIPSIYR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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T’ Res-Pg:m.6-31
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ASIA TRADING INTL DBA UNIPRO INTL g

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

37 Work Gloves, As - ] $30.00 $300.00 Mechanix MX- MX-TSCR
Specified or Equal : TSCR

38 Knit Summer - 112 PR $3.00 $336.00 Reflective Apparel | RA-KNIT
Work Gloves, As

Specified or Equal

b 39 Premium Goatskin 10 PR $7.00 $70.00 Plastex #9PL-6817 | 9PL-6817

\/ Leather Driver's

Gloves, As
Specified, or
Equal

40 Work Gloves, 24 PR $6.00 $144.00 Plastex 9PL-1040 |9PL-1040
Leather Palm,
Split Side As
Specified, or
Equal

41 Jersey Gloves, As 10 PR $11.50 $115.00 Rothco Softshell (#4464
Specified or Equal Glove #4464

SECTION IIf - KITCHEN AND PENAL CLOTHING

42a Pants for Two (2) 500 EA X
Piece [Inmate Suit
As Specified, or
Equal

42b Pants for Two (2) 2,500 EA X
Piece Inmate Suit,
As Specified, or
Equal

43a Shirt for Two (2) 500 EA X
Piece Inmate Suit,
As Specified, or
Equal

Introdueced-oni———Mareh-16;2022
AdoptdtRéIPOSAL DO@MEMTZBE?ORT
OfficiabResopOm¥C2032009363R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ASIA TRADING INTL DBA UNIPRO INTL ' Res-Pg:m.6-32

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

"Super Sweats", $400.00 Jerzees #4997M
As Specified, or 4
Equal

62a Cadet Collar 35 EA $30.00 $1,050.00 Jerzees #995M 995M
Sweatshirt,
Quarter Zip, As
Specified, or
Equal

62b Cadet Coliar 25 EA $30.00 $750.00 Jerzees #995M 995M
Sweatshirt,
Quarter Zip, As
Specified, or
Equal

63 Jacket, As 25 EA $31.00 $775.00 Ultra Club #8925 |8925
Specified, or
Equal

/ 64 Hooded Jacket, As 50 EA $65.00 $3,250.00 Grudens #300 300
: Specified, or
Equal

/ 65 Bib Pant, As 50 EA $65.00 $3,250.00 " | Grudens #500 500
' Specified, Or
Equal

66 Camouflage Cap, 25 EA $10.00 $250.00 Port Authority C820
As Specified, or #C820
Equal

67 Camouflage Hat, 125 EA $13.50 $1,687.50 Port Authority # | C820
As Specified, or ' C820
Equal

68a " | Hat, As Specified 20 EA $12.00 $240.00 Port & Company |CP96
or Equal #CPI6 .

adopted g OSAL HRAKNEGABEPORT
Official RUSGIMVEABK 6442bbis4OR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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ASIA TRADING INTL DBA UNIPRO INT'L Res-Pg:m.6-33
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style Comments

Cargo Shorts,
\/ Men, As Specified
or Equal

Women as
Specified or Equal

/' 77 Jacket, Men and 10 EA $34.00 $340.00 Port Authority 1p56

78 Long Sleeve Shirt, 20 EA $34.00 $680.00 HS Uniform 1262
Men, As Specified,
or Equal

79 Long Sleeve Shirt, 20 EA $23.50 $470.00 HS Uniform 1262

\/ Women, As

Specified, or
Equal

80 Short Sleeve Shirt, 25 EA $22.00 $550.00 HS Uniform 1212
\/ Men, As Specified,
or Equal

81 Short Sleeve Shirt, 25 EA $22.00 $550.00 HS Uniform 1212
\/ Women, As

Specified, or
Equal

82 Sweatshirt, Men 15 EA $27.00 $405.00 Jerzees 4999M
and Women As
Specified, or
Equal

\// 83 * | Golf Shirt, As 25 EA $14.28 $357.00 Gildan 82800
Specified or Equal

4 84 Trousers, Mens, 15 EA $15.00 $225.00 Red Kap PT20
\/ As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-oni— March 16,2022
AdoptRREPOSAL DOMAISAENMTREPORT

OfficiapfResaiBrC12832968383R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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ASIA TRADING INTL DBA UNIPRO INT’L Res-Pg:m.6-34
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

Trousers,
Women's, As .
Specified, or

Equal

SECTION VIII - BUILDINGS & GROUNDS DEPARTMENT & ROAD 'DEPARTMENT

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Unit Price  Total Price
Meas.

No Bid  Manufacturer Style

Smock Top, As Specified or Equal $450.00 Pinnacle 1PN-US16
87 Scrub Pants, As Specified, or Equal 20 EA $10.00 $200.00 Pinnacle 3PN-SPAS
88 Scrub Top with Front Pockets, As Specified, or Equal 20 EA $13.00 $260.00 Pinnacle 3I;N—

ST61U
89 Work Pants, As Specified, or Equal {(NO DENIM) 20 EA . X
90 Jacket, As Specified, or Equal 10 EA $88.08 $880.80 Carhartt 1131
91 Long Sleeve Jersey Shirt, As Specified, or Equal 50 . EA $11.00 $550.00 lerzees 29LS
TOTAL $2,340.80

SECTION IX - FIRE & FIRST AID TRAINING CENTER, VEHICLE SERVICES AND ROADS

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

"T"-Shirt, Short EA $3,750.00
Sleeve (NO

EXCEPTIONS)

Submit price on

quantity of 1- 50

introduced-on: March. 1‘2, 2022
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ASIA TRADING INTL DBA UNIPRO INT'L Res-Pg:m.6-35
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer

Comments

Crew Socks, As
Specified, or
Equal

TOTAL ' $15,226.25

SECTION XI - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line Item Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure Discount

Discount Percentage (%) for Work Clothes and Uniforms (NOT LESS THAN) As
Specified

Introducedon: — March 16, 2022
AdoptePROPOSAL DOGIMAB RBEPORT

Officialiitgsolytinti# cRBPRIRPEAR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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: VICTORY SUPPLY, LLC Res-Pg:m.6-36
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

Work Gloves, As
Speciﬁed‘or Equal

38 Knit Summer 112 PR . X
Work Gloves, As
Specified or Equal

39 Premium Goatskin 10 PR X
Leather Driver's
Gloves, As
Specified, or
Equal

40 Work Gloves, 24 PR X
Leather Paim,
Split Side As.
Specified, or
Equal

41 Jersey Gloves, As 10 PR . X
Specified or Equal

SECTION Il - KITCHEN AND PENAL CLOTHING

42a Pants for Two (2) 500 EA $6.24 $3,120.00 VSl UNTR Pull on style pant
N Piece Inmate Suit
As Specified, or
Equal
42b Pants for Two (2) 2,500 EA $6.77 $16,925.00 Al UNTR Pull on style pant

Piece inmate Suit,
As Specified, or
Equal

/ [ 43a Shirt for Two (2) 500 EA $5.62 $2,810.00 Vsl UNSH
Piece Inmate Suit,

As Specified, or
Equal

Introd : h16, 2022
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VICTORY SUPPLY, LLC Res-Pg:m.6-37
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT :

Bid No. TBD | -
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem Unit Price Total Price

Description Unit of Meas. Manufacturer Style Comments

Shirt for Two (2) EA $6.09 $15,225.00
Piece Inmate Suit,
As Specified, or

Equal

SECTION IV - UNDERGARMENTS

¥ 44 Women's Pant-ies, 12 DOZ $9.34 $112.08 VSI PNTYECWH —
\/ As Specified, or
Equal

45 Traditional Style 144 _EA $2.20 $316.80 VS| NBWH
Bra, As Specified, :
or Equal

/ 46 Cotton Brief 144 EA $1.10 $158.40 VS| BRWHEC
\/ ' Underwear, Men
As Specified, or
Equal

SECTION V - ATHLETIC UNIFORMS

47 "T" Shirt, Long 400 EA X
Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

48a "T" Shirt, Short 400 EA X
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

48b “T" Shirt, Short 300 EA X
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-on—— March-16,2022—
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VICTORY SUPPLY, LLC Res-Pg:m.6-38
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

SECTION XI - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltem Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure Discount

Discount Percentage (%) for Work Clothes and Uniforms {NOT LESS THAN) As
Specified

Introduced on: March 16, 2022

Adopt®R@ROSAL DOGUMNFIGT2REZORT

OfficiapResqlyHen#283398384R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page23 |




PROPOSAL DOCUMENf REPORT BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC. Res-Pg:m.6-39
Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Style Comments

Shirt for Two (2)
Piece Inmate Suit,
As Specified, or
Equal

2,500 $16,150.00 Bob Barker

Company

T(Color)s-(SIZE)

SECTION 1V - UNDERGARMENTS

44 Women's Panties, 12 DOz $10.48 $125.76 Bob Barker 'ELBLCTN-{SIZE)
As Specified, or Company
Equal

45 Traditional Style 144 _ EA $1.72 $247.68 Bob Barker EBANY-(SIZE)

/ Bra, As Specified, ' Company

or Equal

46 Cotton Brief 144 EA $1.24 $178.56 Bob Barker EBRLS-(SIZE)
Underwear, Men Company
As Specified, or
Equal

SECTION V - ATHLETIC UNIFORMS

47 "T" Shirt, Long 400 EA X
Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

48a "T" Shirt, Short 400 EA ’ X
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

48b "T" Shirt, Short 300 EA X
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

IntroduceRRAPOSAL NOEH NERI2REPORT
Adopted gy _ %QQK'Z‘@@%%P% VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
age 13 :

Official Rssolu




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.

Res-Pg:m.6-40

Line Item Description Est. Qty: Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Comments'
102 Zip Up 2 EA .
Sweatshirt, As
Specified or
Equal
TOTAL $0.00

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

SECTION X - CORRECTIONS.WORK CREW

Unlt Price

Total Price

Manufacturer

Comments

103

Jeans, Men, As
Specified, or
Equal

110

EA

$19.33

$2,126.30

Dickies

29393V(Waist){Length)

104

Belt, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

EA

$4.09

$61.35

National
Webbing

ZVBELT-BK~(SIZE)

105

T-Shirt, Men, As
Specified, or.

'Equal

60

EA

$3.69

$221.40

Bob Barker

673-(SIZE)

y 106

Hooded
Sweatshirt, As -
Specified, or
Equal

60

EA

$8.50

$510.00

Bob Barker

SSGYH-(SIZE)

107

CALA A A

Sweatshirt, Crew
Neck, As
Specified, or
Equal

60

EA

$7.80

$468.00

Bob Barker

SSGY-(SIZE)

108

Mesh Basebalf
Cap, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

DOz

$41.16

$1,029.00

Nissin Caps

Z39165-0OR

Introd :

aced-om—March 16
AdopteRFEAPOSAL DGRV RY,

DADD.
,_I_‘U“

HBEPORT

OfficialfRgsOMBRIFCROAAGEGIEAR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD o ,
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:m.6-41

Unit of Meas. Total Price No Bid

$253.20

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit Price

15-

Watch Cap, As Bob Barker
Specified, or

Edual

Manufacturer

Comments

110 Work Gloves, 15 [s]e4 $32.88 $493.20 Protective
Leather Palm, As Industrial
Specified, or ‘ Products
X Equal

LN

85-7500-L

111 Work Coat, 15 EA $21.55 $323.25 Bob Barker
Blanket Lined, As
Specified, or
Equal

AN

652-OR-{SIZE)

112 Twin Gore 150 PR $19.56 $2,934.00 Bob Barker
Boots, (NO
EXCEPTIONS)

'\

TGPD-(SIZE)

113 Thermal 150 EA $3.13 $469.50 Bob Barker
\/ Underwear

Bottoms, As
Specified, or
Equal

1120R-(SIZE)

114 Thermal 150 EA $3.47 $520.50 Bob Barker
/ Underwear,

Tops, As
Specified, or
Equal

630R-(SIZE)

4 115 Rain Poncho, As 35 EA $3.30 $115.50 Jacob Ash
\/ Specified, or
Equal

VRP-OR

\/ 116 Crew Socks, As 35 DOz $8.58 $300.30 Bob Barker
Specified, or
Equal

ocC

TOTAL

$9,825.50

Introdueed-en——Mareh-16;,-2022

AdoptERGROSAL DOGAIMENT REBORT

OfficiabRes Qi ap#C 12022000363 ous N c
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Res-Pg:m.6-42
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC. g

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

~

SECTION XI - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltem Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure Discount
117 Discount Percentage (%) for Work Clothes and Uniforms (NOT LESS THAN) As % 10%
Specified

Introducedom——March 18,2022

AdoptdR&FOSAL DGigdENT28EP ORT

OfficiaBRsOMORCR0I29B8F8BR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 23




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT- BORDOVA INNOVATIONS, INC. Res-Pg:m.6-43

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

3 Trousers, As 113 EA $27.12 $3,064.56 Edwards. 2550 .
Specified, or
Equal

4 Work Pants, As 65 EA $23.67 $1,538.55 Red Kap PT20
Specified, or
Equal

sa "T" Shirt, Short 107 EA $6.78 $725.46 Port & Company | PC54
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

Sb "T" Shirt, Short 5 EA $7.50 $37.50 Port & Company |PC54
Sleeve, Screen
Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

5¢ "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $7.83 $39.15 Port & Company | PC54LS
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

5d "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $7.50 $37.50 Port & Company |PC54LS
\/ Sleeve, Screen

Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

6 Insulated 5 EA $82.20 $411.00 Carhartt CT102776
Coveralls, As
Specified, or
Equal

\/ 7 ‘Snow Overalls, As 4 EA $69.00 $276.00 Bordova 2442-A
Specified, or
Equal

mrociu;mo:mosm DRABNERIREPORT

opte i _ :
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT BORDOVA INNOVATIONS, INC. Res-Pg:m.6-44
Bid No. TBD -

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

J Thermal Zip Up $259.70 Cornerstone
Sweatshirt, As

Specified, or
Equal

9a Heavyweight 75 EA $41.47 $3,110.25 Sport-Tek F282

Hooded ’
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

9b Heavyweight 65 EA $41.47 $2,695.55 Sport-Tek F282
Hooded :

Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

10a Hooded Pullover 20 EA $23.14 $462.80 L District DT1101
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

10b Hooded Pullover 20 EA $23.14 $462.80 District DT1101

Sweatshirt, As -
Specified, or
Equal

11la Hooded 40 EA $27.47 $1,098.80 Port & Company |PC78ZH
Sweatshirt, Zipper
Front, Midweight
As Specified, or
Equal

11b Hooded 10 EA $27.47 $274.70 Port & Company [PC78ZH
Sweatshirt, Zipper
Front, Midweight
As Specified, or
Equal

IntroduceprPOSAL Maxch 1§ RO2REPORT

Adopted gn;
olopte R%%;ég%%%@ﬁ%ﬁ VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT BORDOVA INNOVATIONS, INC. Res-Pg:m.6-45

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

SECTION XI - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line item Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure Discount
../ 117 Discount Percentage (%) for Work Clothes and Uniforms (NOT LESS THAN) As % 20%
Specified '

Introduceg RYPOSAL B MEARREPORT
Adopted

Official Rﬁ@ﬁt\%’%m%%" VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 23




SMART STITCH, LLC Res-Pg:m.6-46
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT :
Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description Est. Qty.. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

3 Trousers, As 113 EA $2,847.60 Dickies 874
Specified, or
Equal

J

\/ 4 Work Pants, As 65 EA $44.90 $2,918.50 Carhartt B136

Specified, or
Equal

Sa "T" Shirt, Short ' 107 EA $5.00 $535.00 Gildan G200

\/ Sleeve, As

Specified, or
Equal

sb "T" Shirt, Short 5 EA $8.00 $40.00 Gildan 6200
Sleeve, Screen
Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

Sc "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA $8.30 $41.50 Gildan G240
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

5d "T" Shirt, Long 5 EA ‘ $11.30 . $56.50 Gildan G240
Sleeve, Screen
Printed, As
Specified, or
Equal

6 Insulated 5 EA $71.70 - $358.50 Red Kap CT30
Coveralls, As
Specified, or
Equal

7 Snow Overalls, As 4 EA $99.00 $396.00 Carhartt CT104393
Specified, or
Equal

introducedon: March 16,2022
AdopteBRAPOSAL DOGEHK E6| REERPORT

Official figsolfiori: c2e720088HR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 7




SMART STITCH, LLC' Res-Pg:m.6-47
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ,

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

Knee Boots,
Rubber As
Specified, or
Equal

$31.45 $188.70 Work Force B76S .

13 Slush Boots, As 34 PR $20.00 $680.00 Work Force 79
Specified, or
Equal

14 Hip Boots, As 16 PR . $68.90 $1,102.40 Work Force B78
Specified, or '
Equal

\/' 15 Hip Boots, As 16 PR $68.90 $1,102.40 Work Force B78
Specified, or
Equal

16 Hip Waders, As 8 PR X
Specified, or
Equal

17 Gloves, As 70 PR X
Specified, or
Equal

18 Work Gloves (NO 440 PR X -
EXCEPTIONS)

19 Rainwear, As 27 EA $24.00 $648.00 Tingley 563217
Specified, or
Equal

20 Rainsuit, Two (2) 79 EA X
Piece, (NO
EXCEPTIONS)

Introduced on: _March 16, 2022
AdopterR@POSAL DOGUONERT2ZREPORT

OfficiaRes QB 2B33IL8HAR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 9




SMART STITCH, LLC R Pa-m.6-48
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT . es-rg.m.o-
Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Style Comments

21 Rain Wear, 33 . EA $76.90 $2,537.70
-\/ Comfort-Brite

Suit, As Specified,
or Equal

Work Force 2322J & 2324BP

SECTION Il - SAFETY CLOTHING

22 Safety Back Belt, 10 CASE $513.60 $5,136.00 ’ Work Force BSB
As Specified or
Equal

/ 23 Class 11l Mesh 42 EA $17.15 $720.30 Work Force A-8312MZ
- Surveyor's Safety

Garment, As
Specified, or
Equal

24 Class Ill 50 " EA $119.00 $5,950.00 Carhartt 105300
Waterproof
Jacket, As
Specified, or
Equal

25 Class It Short 20 EA $16.50 $330.00 Work Force A-8340
. Sleeve T-Shirt, As ’

Specified, or
Equal

26 Class’lll Long 20 EA $19.50 $390.00 Work Farce A-8342
Sleeve T-Shirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

27 Class lil Mesh 340 EA $12.00 $4,080.00 ) Occunomix ECO-GCZ3
Traffic Safety
Vest, As Specified
or Equal

Introduced on: March 16, '2022
adoptEROROSAL DOMIIAR IS RIFORT
icigifesAuiaet A1H3RL%BER vaRIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Page 10




SMART STITCH, LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.6-49
Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

28 Disposable 1 CASE . X
Coveralls, As '
Specified, or
Equal

29 Hooded Pullover 10 EA $31.00 $310.00 Occunomix LUX-SWTLH
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

J 30 Hard Hat (NO 55 EA $13.99 $769.45 Occunomix V200
EXCEPTIONS)

\ 31 Hard Hat Liner As 30 EA $5.75 $172.50 Occunomix RQ301
\/ Specified, or
Equal

32 Brow Pad, As S EA X
Specified, or
Equal

33 Mechanic's Style 26 PR X
Gloves, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

34 Protective Work 62 PR X
Gloves, NO
EXCEPTIONS

35 Hi-Vis Work 40 PR X
Gloves, NO
EXCEPTIONS

36 Mechanix Hi-Vis 50 PR X
Work Gloves, No
EXCEPTIONS

Introduced on: March 16, 2022

Adop P

Official, eﬁ%ﬁén'%?%?’eﬁ%”
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SMART STITCH, LLC )
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.6-50

Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Comments

61 "Super Sweats", 20 EA $21.90 $438.00 Jerzees 4997
As Specified, or ’

Equal

62a Cadet Collar 35 EA $19.79 $692.65 lerzees 995M
Sweatshirt,
Quarter Zip, As
Specified, or
Equal 1

62b Cadet Collar 25 EA $19.79 $494.75 Jerzees 995M
Sweatshirt,
Quarter Zip, As
Specified, or
Equal

63 Jacket, As 25 EA $27.79 $694.75 Jerzees 8925
Specified, or
Equal

64 Hooded Jacket, As 50 EA X
Specified, or
Equal

65 Bib Pant, As 50 EA X
Specified, Or
Equal

J 66 Camouflage Cap, 25 EA $4.50 $112.50 Outdoor Cap 401PC
As Specified, or
Equal

67 Camouflage Hat, 125 EA $7.90 $987.50 Outdoor Cap 401PC
As Specified, or
Equal

. !
68a Hat, As Specified 20 EA $7.00 $140.00 Port & Co 914
or Equal

- Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Adopr' d ‘
Official esg%lélgp %&63% RT
Bid - WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 16




Introduced on:

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

SMART STITCH, LLC

Res-Pg:m.6-51

Line lteam

Description

Hat, As Specified,
or Equal

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

$175.00

Manufacturer

Comments

69

Sports
Performance Cap,
As Specified, or
Equal

30

EA

$9.20

$276.00

Port & Co

cs21

SECTION VI - WADE

RS AND BOOTS

70

As Specified, or
Equal

Waders, Women,”

15

PR

71

Waders, Mens As
Specified, or
Equal

15

PR

72

Chest Waders, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

PR

73

Cleated Bootfoot
Chest Waders, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

15

PR

74

Boots, Mens,
Short, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

PR

75

Work Boots, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

PR

SECTION VII - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

March 16, 2022

R sl R I AbbUn&F PORT

Bid - WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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SMART STITCH, LLC

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.6-52
Bid No. TBD
WORK CLOTHES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
D ptio Q o O 0 Bid 0
TOTAL 50'00

SECTION XI - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltem Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure Discount
\/ 117 Discount Percentage (%) for Work Clothes and Uniforms (NOT LESS THAN) As % 10%
Specified
Introduced on: ‘March 16, 2022
Adopted on: March 16, 2022
Officist Bpexdntion CRIRASRASREPORT
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