



## Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE  
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari  
Deputy Director Gary Quinn  
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea  
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines  
Commissioner John P. Kelly

101 Hooper Avenue  
Toms River, New Jersey  
08754-2191  
Tel: (732)929-2005  
Fax: (732)505-1918

### Board Meeting Agenda

Date: May 17, 2023 - 4:00 PM  
Location: Administration Building  
Room 119  
101 Hooper Avenue  
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS to Plastic Express, Inc.; Snap-on Industrial, a Division of IDSC Holdings, LLC; White Cap LP and Wolfington Body Company, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 32, 33, 43 and 51. They will be rebid with revised specifications. Item Nos. 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75 and 76 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2023-72)

<b>Official Resolution#</b>	<b>2023000687</b>						
Meeting Date	05/17/2023						
Introduced Date	05/17/2023						
Adopted Date	05/17/2023						
Agenda Item	I-1						
CAF #							
Purchase Req. #	B2023-72						
Result	Adopted						
<b>COUNTY COMMISSIONER</b>	<b>PRES.</b>	<b>ABS.</b>	<b>MOVE</b>	<b>SEC</b>	<b>AYE</b>	<b>NAY</b>	<b>ABST.</b>
Vicari	<				<		
Quinn	<			<	<		
Crea	<				<		
Haines	<				<		
Kelly	<		<		<		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

*Michelle I. Gunther*

---

Clerk Of The Board

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS  
NO. B2023-72

RESOLUTION

May 17, 2023

WHEREAS, on March 28, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder

Name and Address of Bidder

Plastic Express, Inc.  
667 Lehigh Avenue  
Union, NJ 07083  
(718) 499-1119

Snap-on Industrial, a Division  
of IDSC Holdings, LLC  
2801 80<sup>th</sup> Street  
Kenosha, WI 53143  
(877) 740-1900

White Cap LP  
1511 Tonnelle Ave.  
North Bergen, NJ 07047  
(732) 540-5014

Wolfington Body Company, Inc.  
1315 Route 38, PO Box 160  
Mt. Holly, NJ 08060  
(609) 267-0763

Lawson Products, Inc.  
8770 W. Bryn Mawr Ave., Suite 900  
Chicago, IL 60631  
(800) 890-8198

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications, in each instance, namely that of, PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.; SNAP-ON INDUSTRIAL, A DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS, LLC; WHITE CAP LP and WOLFINGTON BODY COMPANY, INC., be accepted. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 32, 33, 43 and 51. Items 32, 33, 43 and 51 will be rebid with revised specifications. Item Nos. 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75 and 76 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Hand Tools, Cases and Storage Containers for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through May 16, 2024, a period of one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

A. PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. for three (3) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 23, 36 and 47.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. SNAP-ON INDUSTRIAL, A DIVISION OF IDSC HOLDINGS, LLC for twenty five (25) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74 and 75.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. WHITE CAP LP for fifty nine (59) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 17, 19, 20, 21, 22, 24, 25, 26, 28, 29, 30, 31, 34, 35, 37, 38, 40, 41, 42, 45, 46, 48, 49, 50, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75 and 76.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

D. WOLFINGTON BODY COMPANY, INC. for five (5) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 16, 18, 27, 39 and 44.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the equipment and materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-72.

4. **BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED** that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance, Central Supply Warehouse, Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
13	Milwaukee 1/4" drive Cordless long reach ratchet. 12V DC, 40 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2559-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$326.19	\$1,630.95		
14	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 35 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2457-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$176.78	\$883.90		
15	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2557-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$199.86	\$999.30		
16	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless long reach ratchet. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2560-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$247.87	\$1,239.35		
17	Milwaukee 3/8" cordless, impact wrench, 12V DC, 250 ft lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2554-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$260.69	\$1,303.45		
18	Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet 12V DC, 30 ft-lb fastening torque, Milwaukee part number 2456-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$195.19	\$975.95		
19	Milwaukee compact recipricating saw, 1/2 in stroke length, 3,000 max stroke per minute, Milwaukee part number 2420-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$129.69	\$648.45		
20	Milwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool, 12V, 10-1/4in L, Milwaukee part number: 2426-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$129.69	\$648.45		
21	Milwaukee rivet tool, 2,000lb pulling force 12 v DC, Milwaukee part number: 2550-20, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$326.19	\$1,630.95		
22	Milwaukee, cordless, impact wrench 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee Part Number: 2552-20; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$234.49	\$1,172.45		
23	Milwaukee Video Borescope, no battery 36 in shaft, Milwaukee Part Number: 2313-20, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$217.42	\$1,087.10		
24	Milwaukee Cordless, hydraulic driver kit with Battery, 1/4 in hex, 12V DC, 450 in-lb Max Torque. Milwaukee part number: 2551-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$252.18	\$1,260.90		
25	Milwaukee soldering iron with battery, 10-3/4" L, 90W, Milwaukee Part Number 2488-21, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$208.29	\$1,041.45		

Introduced on: May 17, 2023  
 Adopted on: May 17, 2023

Official Resolution # 2023000687

Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
26	Milwaukee cordless die grinder kit with battery, 12.0 V, right angle, 25,000 RPM no load RPM, Milwaukee part number: 2485-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$430.77	\$2,153.85		
27	Milwaukee, cordless die grinder, battery included, 12.0V, Straight, 20,000 RPM No load RPM, Milwaukee Part number: 2486-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$417.89	\$2,089.45		
28	Milwaukee 1/2" drive Cordless ratche kit with battery. 12V DC, 60 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2558-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$335.35	\$1,676.75		
29	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 35 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2457-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$220.96	\$1,104.80		
30	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2557-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$345.55	\$1,727.75		
31	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless long reach ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2560-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$428.06	\$2,140.30		
32	Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet with battery 12V DC, 30 ft-lb fastening torque, Milwaukee part number 2456-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$234.49	\$1,172.45		
33	Milwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool kit, 12V, Milwaukee part number 2426-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$207.20	\$1,036.00		
34	Milwaukee Rivet Tool Kit, 2,000lb pulling force 12 v DC, Milwaukee part number: 2550-22, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$561.99	\$2,809.95		
35	Milwaukee, cordless, impact wrench kit 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee Part Number: 2552-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$221.39	\$1,106.95		
36	Milwaukee Video Borescope, with battery 36" shaft, Milwaukee Part Number: 2317-21, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$856.23	\$4,281.15		
37	Milwaukee M18 Fuel Li-ion 1/2" Cordless, Drill/driver, bare tool. Milwaukee Part number: 2805-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$313.09	\$1,565.45		
38	Milwaukee 3/8" M18 cordless right angle drill 18.0v, bare tool. Milwaukee part number: 2615-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$150.01	\$750.05		

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution#: 2023000687

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
39	Milwaukee cordless 1" D cordless impact wrench, Milwaukee part number 2868-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$1,367.34	\$6,836.70		
40	Milwaukee Cordless 1/2" Impact wrench, 18 V DC, 1,400 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee part number: 2767-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$413.96	\$2,069.80		
41	Milwaukee 1" Cordless, Impact Wrench, 18 V DC, 1,500 ft-lbs breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2867-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$909.78	\$4,548.90		
42	Milwaukee 3/4" Cordless impact wrench, 18v DC, 1,500 ft-lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2864-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$393.49	\$1,967.45		
43	Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/4" hex 18V DC, 2,000 in-lb Max. Torque. Milwaukee Part Number 2853-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$174.19	\$870.95		
44	Milwaukee heat gun bare tool, 18V DC, Dual Temp settings, 875°F. Milwaukee part number 2688-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$169.32	\$846.60		
45	Milwaukee, Portable band saw, 18v DC, 44-7/8 in blade length. Milwaukee Part Number: 2729-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$538.34	\$2,691.70		
46	Milwaukee 9 in M18 Fuel Cordless Angle Grinder, 18.0 V voltage, 6,000 RPM No load RPM, Bare tool. Milwaukee Part Number: 2785-20	5	EA	\$430.99	\$2,154.95		
47	Milwaukee Polisher, bare tool, 18.0 Vol, 7 in size. Milwaukee Part number: 2738-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$261.84	\$1,309.20		
48	Milwaukee compact reciprocating saw, 7/8 in stroke length, 3,000 Max. Strokes per minute. Milwaukee part number: 2719-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$194.21	\$971.05		
49	Milwaukee 1" Cordless, Impact wrench with battery, 18V DC, 1,500 ft-lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2867-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$1,439.69	\$7,198.45		
50	Milwaukee 1" cordless impact wrench kit, 18V DC, 2,000 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee part number: 2868-22HD. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$1,832.69	\$9,163.45		
51	Milwaukee 1/2 in M8 FUEL hole Hawg cordless right angle drill kit, 18.0 V Voltage, battery included. Milwaukee Part Number: 2707-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$652.38	\$3,261.90		

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution #: 2023000667

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
<b>SECTION I - TOOL SETS</b>							
✓ 1	Snap-On Part No. OCVMFOPMTKFOM Optimized Tool Kit with Foam and Fully Assembled, As Specified or Equal	10	EA	\$13,443.16	\$134,431.60		Part Number OCVMFOPMTKFOM2; Delivery 180 (one hundred eighty) calendar days after receipt of a firm written purchase order for substantial delivery of the tool set(s) subject to an adjusted delivery timeline based on our supply chain's product availability
<b>SECTION II - WRENCHES, TORQUE AND TOWING</b>							
✓ 2	Snap-On Part No. QD1R200A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1/4" Drive, +/- 4% accuracy, fixed ratchet, Min Range - 40 ft-lb, Max Range - 200 ft-lb, 1 ft-lb increments	5	EA	\$314.40	\$1,572.00		Deliver for in-stock item is 14 (fourteen) to 21 (twenty-one) days after receipt of firm written purchase order
✓ 3	Snap-On Part No. BRUTUS3R300 - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1/2" Drive, +/- 6% accuracy, fixed ratchet, Min Range - 60 ft-lb, Max Range - 300 ft-lb, 1 ft-lb increments	5	EA	\$500.00	\$2,500.00		Deliver for in-stock items is 14 (fourteen) to 21 (twenty-one) days after receipt of a firm written purchase order
✓ 4	Snap-On Part No. TQR600E - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 3/4" Drive, +/- 4% accuracy, fixed ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 600 ft-lb, 5 ft-lb increments	5	EA	\$900.00	\$4,500.00		Deliver for in-stock item is 14 (fourteen) to 21 (twenty-one) days after receipt of a firm written purchase order

Introduced on: May 17, 2023  
 Adopted by: PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Official Resolution #: 2023000687

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
5	Snap-On Part No. QD5R1000A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1" Drive, +/-4% accuracy, fixed ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 1,000 ft-lb, 5 ft-lb increments	5	EA	\$2,272.00	\$11,360.00		Deliver for in-stock item is 14 (fourteen) to 21 (twenty-one) days after receipt of a firm written purchase order
<b>SECTION III - POWER TOOLS</b>							
6	Milwaukee M12 Li-Io 1/2 in Cordless Drill/Driver, bare tool, Milwaukee part number 2503-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
7	Milwaukee Cordless, hydraulic driver, 1/4 in hex, 12V DC, 450 in-lb Max Torque. Milwaukee part number: 2551-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
8	Milwaukee 3/8 in M12 cordless right angle drill, 12.0 V, Bare tool Milwaukee part number: 2415-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
9	Milwaukee Soldering Iron Kit, 10-3/4" L, 90W, Milwaukee Part Number 2488-21, NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
10	Milwaukee cordless die grinder, bare tool, 12.0 V, right angle, 25,000 RPM no load RPM, Milwaukee part number: 2485-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
11	Milwaukee, cordless die grinder, bare tool, 12.0V, Straight, 20,000RPM No load RPM, Milwaukee Part number: 2486-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
12	Milwaukee 1/2" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 60 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2558-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
13	Milwaukee 1/4" drive Cordless long reach ratchet. 12V DC, 40 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2559-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
14	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 35 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2457-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
15	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2557-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution# - 2023000687



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
55	Milwaukee compact, reciprocating saw kit, 7/8 in stroke length, 3,000 Max. Strokes per minute. Milwaukee part number: 2719-21. NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	

SECTION IV - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	No Bid
✓ 56	Tool Storage	%	0%	
✓ 57	Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2"	%	0%	
✓ 58	Wrenches	%	0%	
✓ 59	Torque Tools	%	0%	
✓ 60	Screwdrivers	%	0%	
✓ 61	Pliers	%	0%	
✓ 62	Punches/Chisels/Hammers	%	0%	
✓ 63	General Hand Tools (ie: Files, Scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, diesel, other)	%	0%	
✓ 64	Set Building	%	0%	
✓ 65	Power Tools	%	0%	
✓ 66	Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, Analyzers, fuel and engine systems)	%	0%	
✓ 67	Welding	%	0%	

Introduced on: May 17, 2023  
 Adopted by: PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
 Official Resolution #: 2023000687

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	No Bid
68	Undercar	%	0%	
69	Battery Service	%	0%	
70	Air Conditioning	%	0%	
71	Cooling	%	0%	
72	Shop Equipment (ie: Lighting, Creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, presses)	%	0%	
73	Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, Vacuums, Shop Fans)	%	0%	
74	Safety	%	0%	
75	Diagnostics	%	0%	
76	Towing	%	No Bid	X

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
1	Snap-On Part No. OCVMFOPMTKFO Optimized Tool Kit with Foam and Fully Assembled, As Specified or Equal		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
<b>SECTION II - WRENCHES, TORQUE AND TOWING</b>							
2	Snap-On Part No. QD1R200A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1/4" Drive, +/-4% accuracy, fixed ratchet, Min Range - 40 ft-lb, Max Range - 200 ft-lb, 1 ft-lb increments		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
3	Snap-On Part No. BRUTUS3R300 - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1/2" Drive, +/-6% accuracy, fixed ratchet, Min Range - 60 ft-lb, Max Range - 300 ft-lb, 1 ft-lb increments		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
4	Snap-On Part No. TQR600E - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 3/4" Drive, +/-4% accuracy, fixed ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 600 ft-lb, 5 ft-lb increments		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
5	Snap-On Part No. QD5R1000A - Adjustable Click-type Torque Wrench (ft-lb) - 1" Drive, +/-4% accuracy, fixed ratchet, Min Range - 200 ft-lb, Max Range - 1,000 ft-lb, 5 ft-lb increments		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
<b>SECTION III - POWER TOOLS</b>							
6	Milwaukee M12 Li-Io 1/2 In Cordless Drill/Driver, bare tool, Milwaukee part number 2503-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$134.89	\$674.45		
7	Milwaukee Cordless, hydraulic driver, 1/4 in hex, 12V DC, 450 in-lb Max Torque. Milwaukee part number: 2551-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$162.69	\$813.45		
8	Milwaukee 3/8 in M12 cordless right angle drill, 12.0 V, Bare tool Milwaukee part number: 2415-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$99.00	\$495.00		
9	Milwaukee Soldering Iron Kit, 10-3/4" L, 90W, Milwaukee Part Number 2488-21, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$159.00	\$795.00		
10	Milwaukee cordless die grinder, bare tool, 12.0 V, right angle, 25,000 RPM no load RPM, Milwaukee part number: 2485-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$219.00	\$1,095.00		
11	Milwaukee, cordless die grinder, bare tool, 12.0V, Straight, 20,000RPM No load RPM, Milwaukee Part number: 2486-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$181.25	\$906.25		

Introduced on: **May 17, 2023**

Adopted on: **May 17, 2023**

Official Resolution#: **2023000687**  
 Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
✓ 12	Milwaukee 1/2" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 60 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2558-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$199.00	\$995.00		
✓ 13	Milwaukee 1/4" drive Cordless long reach ratchet. 12V DC, 40 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2559-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$239.00	\$1,195.00		
✓ 14	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 35 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2457-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$144.39	\$721.95		
✓ 15	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2557-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$199.00	\$995.00		
16	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless long reach ratchet. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2560-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$269.00	\$1,345.00		
✓ 17	Milwaukee 3/8" cordless, impact wrench, 12V DC, 250 ft lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2554-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$189.99	\$949.95		
18	Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet 12V DC, 30 ft-lb fastening torque, Milwaukee part number 2456-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$189.00	\$945.00		
✓ 19	Milwaukee compact recipricating saw, 1/2 in stroke length, 3,000 max stroke per minute, Milwaukee part number 2420-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$108.99	\$544.95		
✓ 20	Milwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool, 12V, 10-1/4in L, Milwaukee part number: 2426-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$106.99	\$534.95		
✓ 21	Milwaukee rivet tool, 2,000lb pulling force 12 v DC, Milwaukee part number: 2550-20, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$269.00	\$1,345.00		
✓ 22	Milwaukee, cordless, impact wrench 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee Part Number: 2552-20, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$182.39	\$911.95		
23	Milwaukee Video Borescope, no battery 36 in shaft, Milwaukee Part Number: 2313-20, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$255.00	\$1,275.00		DISCONTINUED REPLACE 2323-21

Introduced on: **May 17, 2023**

Adopted on: **May 17, 2023**

Official Resolution#: **202300687**  
 Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
✓ 24	Milwaukee Cordless, hydraulic driver kit with Battery, 1/4 in hex, 12V DC, 450 in-lb Max Torque. Milwaukee part number: 2551-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$199.00	\$995.00		
✓ 25	Milwaukee soldering iron with battery, 10-3/4" L, 90W, Milwaukee Part Number 2488-21, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$159.00	\$795.00		
✓ 26	Milwaukee cordless die grinder kit with battery, 12.0 V, right angle, 25,000 RPM no load RPM, Milwaukee part number: 2485-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$350.54	\$1,752.70		
27	Milwaukee, cordless die grinder, battery included, 12.0V, Straight, 20,000 RPM No load RPM, Milwaukee Part number: 2486-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$343.00	\$1,715.00		
✓ 28	Milwaukee 1/2" drive Cordless ratche kit with battery. 12V DC, 60 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2558-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$323.00	\$1,615.00		
✓ 29	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 35 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2457-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$209.94	\$1,049.70		
✓ 30	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2557-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$299.00	\$1,495.00		
✓ 31	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless long reach ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2560-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$365.00	\$1,825.00		
32	Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet with battery 12V DC, 30 ft-lb fastening torque, Milwaukee part number 2456-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$169.00	\$845.00		DISCONTINUED. REPLACE 2456-20
33	Milwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool kit, 12V, Milwaukee part number 2426-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$104.99	\$524.95		DISCONTINUED REPLACE 2426-20
✓ 34	Milwaukee Rivet Tool Kit, 2,000lb pulling force 12 v DC, Milwaukee part number: 2550-22, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$413.99	\$2,069.95		
✓ 35	Milwaukee, cordless, impact wrench kit 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee Part Number: 2552-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$182.39	\$911.95		

Introduced on: **May 17, 2023**

Adopted on: **May 17, 2023**

Official Resolution#: **202300687**

Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
36	Milwaukee Video Borescope, with battery 36" shaft, Milwaukee Part Number: 2317-21, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$894.89	\$4,474.45		
✓ 37	Milwaukee M18 Fuel Li-ion 1/2" Cordless, Drill/driver, bare tool. Milwaukee Part number: 2805-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$228.94	\$1,144.70		
✓ 38	Milwaukee 3/8" M18 cordless right angle drill 18.0v, bare tool. Milwaukee part number: 2615-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$149.00	\$745.00		
39	Milwaukee cordless 1" D cordless impact wrench, Milwaukee part number 2868-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$876.79	\$4,383.95		
✓ 40	Milwaukee Cordless 1/2" Impact wrench, 18 V DC, 1,400 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee part number: 2767-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$286.89	\$1,434.45		
✓ 41	Milwaukee 1" Cordless, Impact Wrench, 18 V DC, 1,500 ft-lbs breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2867-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$759.99	\$3,799.95		
✓ 42	Milwaukee 3/4" Cordless impact wrench, 18v DC, 1,500 ft-lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2864-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$337.24	\$1,686.20		
43	Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/4" hex 18V DC, 2,000 in-lb Max. Torque. Milwaukee Part Number 2853-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$143.44	\$717.20		DISCONTINUED REPLACE 2953-20
44	Milwaukee heat gun bare tool, 18V DC, Dual Temp settings, 875°F. Milwaukee part number 2688-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$169.00	\$845.00		
✓ 45	Milwaukee, Portable band saw, 18v DC, 44-7/8 in blade length. Milwaukee Part Number: 2729-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$373.34	\$1,866.70		
✓ 46	Milwaukee 9 in M18 Fuel Cordless Angle Grinder, 18.0 V voltage, 6,000 RPM No load RPM, Bare tool. Milwaukee Part Number: 2785-20	5	EA	\$334.99	\$1,674.95		
47	Milwaukee Polisher, bare tool, 18.0 Vol, 7 in size. Milwaukee Part number: 2738-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$300.19	\$1,500.95		

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted on: May 17, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023000687  
 Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
✓ 48	Milwaukee compact reciprocating saw, 7/8 in stroke length, 3,000 Max. Strokes per minute. Milwaukee part number: 2719-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$166.24	\$831.20		
✓ 49	Milwaukee 1" Cordless, Impact wrench with battery, 18V DC, 1,500 ft-lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2867-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$1,079.19	\$5,395.95		
✓ 50	Milwaukee 1" cordless impact wrench kit, 18V DC, 2,000 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee part number: 2868-22HD. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$1,399.00	\$6,995.00		
51	Milwaukee 1/2 in M8 FUEL hole Hawg cordless right angle drill kit, 18.0 V Voltage, battery included. Milwaukee Part Number: 2707-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$299.00	\$1,495.00		DISCONTINUED REPLACE 2807-20
✓ 52	Milwaukee M18 Fuel Li-ion 1/2" Cordless Drill Kit, Battery Included. Milwaukee Part Number: 2903-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$308.99	\$1,544.95		
✓ 53	Milwaukee Cordless, Portable band saw kit, 18V DC, 44 7/8 in blade length. Milwaukee part number: 2729-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$680.00	\$3,400.00		
✓ 54	Milwaukee Full-size, reciprocating saw 1-1/4 in stroke length, 3,000 max strokes per minute. Milwaukee part number 2722-21HD. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$468.34	\$2,341.70		
✓ 55	Milwaukee compact, reciprocating saw kit, 7/8 in stroke length, 3,000 Max. Strokes per minute. Milwaukee part number: 2719-21. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$299.00	\$1,495.00		

SECTION IV - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	No Bid
✓ 56	Tool Storage	%	5%	
✓ 57	Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2"	%	10%	
✓ 58	Wrenches	%	10%	

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted on: May 17, 2023

Official Resolution# 2023000087

BID PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT  
Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	No Bid
59	Torque Tools	%	10%	
60	Screwdrivers	%	10%	
61	Pliers	%	10%	
62	Punches/Chisels/Hammers	%	10%	
63	General Hand Tools (ie: Files, Scrapers, spark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, diesel, other)	%	10%	
64	Set Building	%	10%	
65	Power Tools	%	5%	
66	Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, Analyzers, fuel and engine systems)	%	5%	
67	Welding	%	5%	
68	Undercar	%	5%	
69	Battery Service	%	5%	
70	Air Conditioning	%	5%	
71	Cooling	%	5%	
72	Shop Equipment (ie: Lighting, Creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, presses)	%	5%	
73	Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, Vacuums, Shop Fans)	%	5%	
74	Safety	%	10%	

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted on: May 17, 2023

Official Resolution # 202300057 REPORT

Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

---

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	No Bid
75	Diagnostics	%	5%	
76	Towing	%	5%	

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted on: May 17, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023000687

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
13	Milwaukee 1/4" drive Cordless long reach ratchet. 12V DC, 40 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2559-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
14	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 35 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2457-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$189.76	\$948.80		
15	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2557-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$214.90	\$1,074.50		
✓ 16	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless long reach ratchet. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2560-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$246.31	\$1,231.55		
17	Milwaukee 3/8" cordless, impact wrench, 12V DC, 250 ft lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2554-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$218.45	\$1,092.25		
✓ 18	Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet 12V DC, 30 ft-lb fastening torque, Milwaukee part number 2456-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$178.31	\$891.55		
19	Milwaukee compact recipricating saw, 1/2 in stroke length, 3,000 max stroke per minute, Milwaukee part number 2420-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$147.50	\$737.50		
20	Milwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool, 12V, 10-1/4in L, Milwaukee part number: 2426-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$128.28	\$641.40		
21	Milwaukee rivet tool, 2,000lb pulling force 12 v DC, Milwaukee part number: 2550-20, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$309.60	\$1,548.00		
22	Milwaukee, cordless, impact wrench 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee Part Number: 2552-20, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$186.84	\$934.20		
23	Milwaukee Video Borescope, no battery 36 in shaft, Milwaukee Part Number: 2313-20, NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
24	Milwaukee Cordless, hydraulic driver kit with Battery, 1/4 in hex, 12V DC, 450 in-lb Max Torque. Milwaukee part number: 2551-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$240.20	\$1,201.00		
25	Milwaukee soldering iron with battery, 10-3/4" L, 90W, Milwaukee Part Number 2488-21, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$176.01	\$880.05		

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted on: PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution#: 202300687  
 BID - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
26	Milwaukee cordless die grinder kit with battery, 12.0 V, right angle, 25,000 RPM no load RPM, Milwaukee part number: 2485-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$351.11	\$1,755.55		
27	Milwaukee, cordless die grinder, battery included, 12.0V, Straight, 20,000 RPM No load RPM, Milwaukee Part number: 2486-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$292.26	\$1,461.30		
28	Milwaukee 1/2" drive Cordless ratche kit with battery. 12V DC, 60 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2558-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$386.19	\$1,930.95		
29	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 35 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2457-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$256.48	\$1,282.40		
30	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2557-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
31	Milwaukee 3/8" drive Cordless long reach ratchet with battery. 12V DC, 55 ft-lb fastening torque. Milwaukee part number 2560-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$380.85	\$1,904.25		
32	Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet with battery 12V DC, 30 ft-lb fastening torque, Milwaukee part number 2456-21 NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
33	Milwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool kit, 12V, Milwaukee part number 2426-22 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$248.85	\$1,244.25		
34	Milwaukee Rivet Tool Kit, 2,000lb pulling force 12 v DC, Milwaukee part number: 2550-22, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$453.36	\$2,266.80		
35	Milwaukee, cordless, impact wrench kit 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee Part Number: 2552-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$316.24	\$1,581.20		
36	Milwaukee Video Borescope, with battery 36" shaft, Milwaukee Part Number: 2317-21, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$1,056.88	\$5,284.40		
37	Milwaukee M18 Fuel Li-ion 1/2" Cordless, Drill/driver, bare tool. Milwaukee Part number: 2805-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$355.42	\$1,777.10		
38	Milwaukee 3/8" M18 cordless right angle drill 18.0v, bare tool. Milwaukee part number: 2615-20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$199.95	\$999.75		

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted on: May 17, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023000687  
 Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments:
39	Milwaukee cordless 1" D cordless impact wrench, Milwaukee part number 2868-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$827.65	\$4,138.25		
40	Milwaukee Cordless 1/2" Impact wrench, 18 V DC, 1,400 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee part number: 2767-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$294.94	\$1,474.70		
41	Milwaukee 1" Cordless, Impact Wrench, 18 V DC, 1,500 ft-lbs breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2867-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$773.93	\$3,869.65		
42	Milwaukee 3/4" Cordless impact wrench, 18v DC, 1,500 ft-lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2864-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$398.48	\$1,992.40		
43	Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/4" hex 18V DC, 2,000 in-lb Max. Torque. Milwaukee Part Number 2853-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
44	Milwaukee heat gun bare tool, 18V DC, Dual Temp settings, 875°F. Milwaukee part number 2688-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$154.78	\$773.90		
45	Milwaukee, Portable band saw, 18v DC, 44-7/8 in blade length. Milwaukee Part Number: 2729-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$422.57	\$2,112.85		
46	Milwaukee 9 in M18 Fuel Cordless Angle Grinder, 18.0 V voltage, 6,000 RPM No load RPM, Bare tool. Milwaukee Part Number: 2785-20	5	EA	\$427.80	\$2,139.00		
47	Milwaukee Polisher, bare tool, 18.0 Vol, 7 in size. Milwaukee Part number: 2738-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$289.79	\$1,448.95		
48	Milwaukee compact reciprocating saw, 7/8 in stroke length, 3,000 Max. Strokes per minute. Milwaukee part number: 2719-20. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$204.99	\$1,024.95		
49	Milwaukee 1" Cordless, Impact wrench with battery, 18V DC, 1,500 ft-lb breakaway torque. Milwaukee part number: 2867-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$1,089.29	\$5,446.45		
50	Milwaukee 1" cordless impact wrench kit, 18V DC, 2,000 ft-lb breakaway torque, Milwaukee part number: 2868-22HD. NO SUBSTITUTIONS	5	EA	\$1,414.05	\$7,070.25		
51	Milwaukee 1/2 in M8 FUEL hole Hawg cordless right angle drill kit, 18.0 V Voltage, battery included. Milwaukee Part Number: 2707-22. NO SUBSTITUTIONS		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted on: May 17, 2023

Official Resolution#: 202300687

Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS