Res-Pg:i.25-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

08754-2191

(732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi

Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: December 17, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Rescinding PENAL INSTITUTION SUPPLIES NO. Il Item Nos. 12 and 34 from ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.,
as the vendor is unable to honor their contract. Recommendation is made to award ltem No. 12 to Charm-Tex,
Inc. and Item No. 34 to Bienali Promotions LLC, the next lowest qualified bidders. (B2025-147)

Official Resolution# [2025001801
Meeting Date 12/17/2025
Introduced Date 12/17/2025
Adopted Date 12/17/2025
Agenda ltem i-25

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-147
Result Adopted
COUNTY g s g o lw [ !5;
COMMISSIONER § a g gi ﬁ g %
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v v
Bacchione v v |v
Haines v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guainer”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolu

PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOI

o R02D-147

RESOLUTION
December 17, 2025

WHEREAS, on September 3, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements
therefor, sealed bids were received for furnishing and delivery of PENAL
INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, on October 15, 2025, Contract B2025-147, Item Nos. 12 and
34 were awarded to ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC., and

WHEREAS, the County Purchasing Agent has now requested Contract
B2025-147, Item Nos. 12 and 34 awarded to ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC be rescinded due
to vendor being unable to honor their contract.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as
follows:

1. The aforementioned Resolution and Contract dated October 15, 2025
awarding Item Nos. 12 and 34 awarded ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC are hereby rescinded.

2. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed
to enter into amendatory contracts with CHARM-TEX, INC., for Item No. 12 and
BIENALI PROMOTIONS LLC for Item No. 34, the next lowest qualified bidders. These
vendors have extended the contracts to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

3. All other provisions of Contract No. B2025-147 shall remain in full
force and effect.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices
and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-147.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution
shall be made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance

Department, Corrections Department, Juvenile Services and the successful bidders.

December 17, 2025
December 17, 2025

on#: 2025001801

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON Alﬁﬁé ng i i
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[BIENALI PROMOTIONS, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:i.25-3

PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. Il

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery,-A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Bath Towel, 36" x
68", 100% Cotton,
Heavy Weight,
Hemmed and
Trimmed, As
Specified, or Equal

10

DOz

$148.38

$1,483.80

HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOQS, AND SUPPLIES

12

Hair Clipper
Cleaning/Disinfecting
Spray, Germicidal,
Fungicidal, Virucidal,
12-8o0z
Bottles/Case, MUST
BE NON-AEROSOL,
As Specified, or
Equal

40

CASE

$199.00

$7,960.00

GENERAL HYGIENE

e

Deodorant,
Universal, Stick,
0.50z, Powerup, As
Specified, or Equal

100

EA

$2.74

$274.00

46

Toothpaste, 2.75 oz.,
Clear Plastic Tube, As
Specified, or Equal

25

EA

$0.99

$24.75

LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES

S0

v

Laundry Detergent,

100 oz. bottle, Must
Be Free & Sensitive,
Persil, or Equal

50

BTL

$16.64

$832.00

SHOWER ACCESSORIES - CURTAINS AND SHOWER SHOES

ced on:

December 17, 2025

I e,

ution#

Bid - PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. Il
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- Introduced on:

O CHARMT %?@é?‘féﬁ@%cwfm“"o”

[CHARM-TEX] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. i

Res-Pg:i.25-4

Line litem

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Mfr. Model &
Packaging:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

Bath Towel, 36" x
68", 100% Cotton,
Heavy Weight,
Hemmed and
Trimmed, As
Specified, or Equal

Doz

' No Bid

No 8id

HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPQOS, AND SUPPLIES

12

¥

Hair Clipper
Cleaning/Disinfecting
Spray, Germicidal,
Fungicidal, Virucidal,
12 -8 oz.
Bottles/Case, MUST
BE NON-AEROSOL,
As Specified, or
Equal

40

CASE

$149.90

$5,996.00

WAHL

7-30

H/WAHLCLINI

GENERAL HYGIENE

34

Deodorant,
Universal, Stick,
0.502, Powerup, As
Specified, or Equal

100

EA

$54.90

$5,490.00

H/CTSDO5

PACKED 144/CS

/46

Toothpaste, 2.75 oz,
Clear Plastic Tube, As
Specified, or Equal

25

EA

$72.90

$1,822.50

H/CGTP275

PACKED 144/CS

LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES

50

Laundry Detergent,

100 oz. bottle, Must
Be Free & Sensitive,
Persil, or Equal

BTL

No Bid

No Bid

SHOWER ACCESSORIES - CURTAINS AND SHOWER SHOES

December 17, 2025

Bid - PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. 1I

Page 8



