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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

October 15, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. Il to
America Global Supply LLC; Bienali Promotions, LLC; Charm-Tex, Inc.; and ICS Jail Supplies, Inc., the lowest

qualified bidders. (B2025-147)

Official Resolution# [2025001476
Meeting Date 10/15/2025
Introduced Date 10/15/2025
Adopted Date 10/15/2025
Agenda ltem I-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-147
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER § a g gi ﬁ g %
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v v
Bacchione v v |v
Haines v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guainer”

Clerk Of The Board



CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON AL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

o B0 - 147]

RESOLUTION
October 15, 2025

WHEREAS, on September 3, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PENAL INSTITUTIONAL
SUPPLIES NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
America Global Supply LLC Bienali Promotions LLC

30 Union Street, Suite 96 1811 St. Johns Avenue, Suite 201
Elizabeth, NJ 07202 Highland Park, IL 60035
(888) 455-4441 (847) 926-7766

Charm-Tex, Inc. ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.

1618 Coney Island Avenue 5804 Franklin Avenue
Brooklyn, NY 11230 Waco, Texas 76710

(718) 252-8100 (800) 524-5427

Aida Enterprises Matrix Maintenance Supply
29 Riverwalk Blvd. 3861 Sylon Blvd.
Burlington, NJ 08016 Hainesport, NJ 08036

(609) 667-9072 (609) 267-5455

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely, AMERICA GLOBAL SUPPLY LLC; BIENALI
PROMOTIONS LLC; CHARM-TEX, INC; and ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC, be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of Penal Institutional
Supplies No. II for the County of Ocean; for the contract period from date of award until June
30, 2026, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right

to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. AMERICA GLOBAL SUPPLY LLC for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 6.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. BIENALI PROMOTIONS LLC for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 50, 60, 62 AND 64.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

Introduced on October 15, 2025
Adopted on: October 15, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025001476
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C. CHARM-TEX, INC. for three (3) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 46 and 55.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC. for two (2) items to wit:
ITEM NOS. 12 and 34.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.4, the County has established a reasonable
estimated maximum dollar value of $32,700.00 for the term of this contract, based on
historical procurement data for comparable goods or services. The County further reserves
the right to increase quantities by up to twenty percent (20%) of the maximum awarded

amount at the unit prices bid, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.3.

3. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital
accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Corrections

Department and Juvenile Services Department.

4. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-147.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance Department,

Corrections Department, Juvenile Services Department and the successful bidders.

October 15, 2025
October 15, 2025
on#: 2025001476




[AMERICA GLOBAL SUPPLY LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. II
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Introduced on:

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Mfr. Model &
Packaging:

Delivery, AR.O.:

Comments:

/-

Bath Towel, 36" x
68", 100% Cotton,
Heavy Weight,
Hemmed and
Trimmed, As
Specified, or Equal

10

[sle74

$106.50

$1,065.00°

12 towels per
pack

30 days ARO

HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPQOS, AND SUPPLIES

12

Hair Clipper
Cleaning/Disinfecting
Spray, Germicidal,
Fungicidal, Virucidal,
12 -8 oz.
Bottles/Case, MUST
BE NON-AEROSOL,
As Specified, or
Equal

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

GENERAL HYGIENE

34

Deodorant,
Universal, Stick,
0.50z, Powerup, As
Specified, or Equal

EA

No 8id

No Bid

46

Toothpaste, 2.75 oz.,
Clear Plastic Tube, As
Specified, or Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES

50

Laundry Detergent,

100 oz. bottle, Must
Be Free & Sensitive,
Persif, or Equal

50

BTL

$28.91

$1,445.50

30 days ARO

SHOWER ACCESSORIES - CURTAINS AND SHOWER SHOES

October 15, 2025
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[BIENALI PROMOTIONS, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. Ii

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Bath Towel, 36" x $148.38 $1,483.80
68", 100% Cotton,
Heavy Weight,
Hemmed and
Trimmed, As
Specified, or Equal

HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOOS, AND SUPPLIES

12 Hair Clipper ' 40 CASE . $199.00 $7,960.00
' Cleaning/Disinfecting
Spray, Germicidal,
Fungicidal, Virucidal,
12 -8 oz.
Bottles/Case, MUST
BE NON-AEROSOL,
As Specified, or
Equal

GENERAL HYGIENE

34 Deodorant, 100 EA $2.74 $274.00
Universal, Stick,

0.50z, Powerup, As
Specifted, or Equal

46 Toothpaste, 2.75 oz., 25 EA $0.99 $24.75
Clear Plastic Tube, As

Specified, or Equal ) ' ¢

LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES

S0 Laundry Detergent, 50 BTL $16.64 $832.00
/ 100 oz. bottle, Must
M Be Free & Sensitive,
Persil, or Equal

SHOWER ACCESSORIES - CURTAINS AND SHOWER SHOES

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
Adopte
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[BIENALI PROMOTIONS, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD |
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. Il

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments;
Packaging:

55 Shower Curfain, ' 250 EA $252.30 $63,075.00
Breakaway, Blue, San
Suede 66" x 77" with
Velcro Strip Header
and 20" of White
1/2" Hole Mesh at
Top, As Specified, or
Equal

60 Velcro Track Tabs for 300 EA " $5.00 $1,500.00

Track Shower _
\/ - | Curtain System, 3/4"
Male Velcro Tab, As

Specified, or Equal

GLOVES
62 Gloves, Latex 10 CASE $16.14 $161.40
Housekeeping, Non-
/ Slip, 12" Length,
\/ Universal Size, 12
' Per Case, Yellow, As
Specified, or Equal
INMATE SUPPLIES
/, 64 MP3 Player, SanDisk 10 EA $120.94 $1,209.40
: ' Clip Jam, 8 GB, '
\/ SNDISK, As Specified,
or Equal
Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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[CHARM-TEX] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. II .

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO.. 1|

Ltine ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

INMATE INTAKE SUPPLIES

1 Individual Hygiene 100 < BX $135.90 $13,590.00 ‘ 7-30
Kit: MUST include at ) : .

/ MINIMUM - 1 each
\/ of the following:
Thumbprint
Toothbrush (not to
exceed 3"), 6 oz.
Clear Tube
Toothpaste (Animal-
Fat Free), S" Plastic
- | Comb, 4" Security
Clear Flexible Pen
with Black Ink, 0.75
oz. Wrapped
Personal Size Soap,
Each Kit MUST be
Individually Sealed in
a Clear Vinyl Bag,
200 Kits/Box, As
Specified, or Equal

TOWELS

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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[CHARM-TEX]
Bid No. TBD:

PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. Il

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

- Res-Pg:1.4-8

Line item

Description

Bath Towel, 36" x
68", 100% Cotton,
Heavy Weight,
Hemmed and
Trimmed, As
Specified, or Equal

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Doz

Unit Cost

" No Bid

Total Cost

No Bid

Mfr. Model &
Packaging:

Delivery, AR.O.:

Comments:

HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOOS, AND SUPPLIES

12

Hair Clipper
Cleaning/Disinfecting
Spray, Germicidal,
Fungicidal, Virucidal,
12-8oz.
Bottles/Case, MUST
BE NON-AEROSOL,
As Specified, or
Equal

40

CASE

$149.90

$5,996.00

WAHL

7-30

H/WAHLCLINI

GENERAL HYGIENE

34

Deodorant,
Universal, Stick,
0.50z, Powerup, As
Specified, or Equal

100

EA

$54.90

$5,490.00

H/CTSDOS

7-30

PACKED 144/CS

//’ 46

V

Toothpaste, 2.75 oz.,
Clear Plastic Tube, As
Specified, or Equal

25

EA

$72.90

$1,822.50

H/CGTP275

7-30

PACKED 144/CS

LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES

50

Laundry Detergent,

100 oz. bottle, Must
Be Free & Sensitive,
Persil, or Equal

BTL

No Bid

No Bid

SHOWER ACCESSORIES - CURTAINS AND SHOWER SHOES

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025
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[CHARM-TEX] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. Il

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:

Packaging:
55 Shower Curtain, 250 . EA | $49.90 $12,475.00 i 7-30
Breakaway, Blue, San '
Suede 66" x 77" with
Velero Strip Header
\ and 20" of White

1/2" Hole Mesh at
Top, As Specified, or
Equal

60 Velcro Track Tabs for 300 EA $19.08 $5,724.00 ' 7-30
Track Shower
Curtain System, 3/4"
Male Velcro Tab, As
Specified, or Equal

GLOVES

62 Gloves, Latex : CASE No Bid No Bid X
Housekeeping, Non-
Slip, 12" Length,
Universal Size, 12
Per Case, Yellow, As
Specified, or Equal

INMATE SUPPLIES

64 MP3 Player, SanDisk EA No Bid No Bid X
Clip Jam, 8 GB, *

SNDISK, As Specified,
or Equal

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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Res-Pg:1.4-10
[ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD - :
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES NO. I

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

TOWELS

6 Bath Towel, 36" x DOz No Bid No Bid : X
68", 100% Cotton,
Heavy Weight,
Hemmed and
Trimmed, As
Specified, or Equal

HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOOS, AND SUPPLIES

12 Hair Clipper 40 CASE $106.08 $4,243.20
Cleaning/Disinfecting )

Spray, Germicidal,
Fungicidal, Virucidal,
12-8oz.

Bottles/Case, MUST
BE NON-AEROSOL,
As Specified, or
Equal

GENERAL HYGIENE

i

/ 34 Deodorant, 100 EA $0.1354 $13.54 MUST ORDER PER
. Universal, Stick, CASE OF 576 EA
0.50z, Powerup, As e - @ $77.99/CS

Specified, or Equal

46 Toothpaste, 2.75 oz., 25 EA $0.6233 $15.5825 MUST ORDER PER
Clear Plastic Tube, As o . -CASE OF 144/CS

Specified, or Equal . @ 89.76/CS

LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES

50 Laundry Detergent, 50 BTL $139.88 $6,994.00
100 oz. bottle, Must
Be Free & Sensitive,
Persil, or Equal

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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