Res-Pg:k.4-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Barbara Jo Crea

08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn (732)929-2005
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines (732)505-1918
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: July 2, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE
CONTAINERS NO. Il to Continental Hardware, Inc.; Eppy's Tool & Equipment Warehouse, Inc.; Ferguson
Waterworks and US Electrical Services DBA Yale Electric Supply, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2024-100)

Official Resolution# [2024001011
Meeting Date 07/02/2024
Introduced Date 07/02/2024
Adopted Date 07/02/2024
Agenda ltem k-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-100
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER § % g % § % %
Crea v v
Quinn v v
Haines v v v
Kelly v v |v
Sadeghi v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie |, Guatiner”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:k.4-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS .-

RESOLUTION

July 2, 2024

WHEREAS, on June 4, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed
bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of HAND TOQOLS, CASES AND
STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Continental Hardware, Inc. Eppy’s Tool & Equipment
400 Delancy Street Warchouse, Inc,
Newark, NJ 07105 2777 US Hwy 9 North
(973) 589-3929 Howell, NJ 07731

(732) 942-3700
Ferguson Waterworks US Electrical Services DBA
507 Oak Glen Rd. Yale Electric Supply
Howell, NJ 07731 5 Second St.
(732) 901-4792 Trenton, NJ 08611

(609) 695-6121
FHS Retail, LLC Topline Tool Warehouse, Inc.
6 Shoshanna Dr. 140 Milbar Blvd.
Lakewood, NJ 08701 Farmingdale, NY 11735
(732) 806-0056 (631) 249-9577

;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely that of, CONTINENTAL HARDWARE, INC.;
EPPY’S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE, INC.; FERGUSON WATERWORKS and
US ELECTRICAL SERVICES DBA YALE ELECTRIC SUPPLY, be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Hand Tools, Cases and Storage
Containers No. II for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through
May 14, 2025, OR until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the
right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

Introduced on] July 2, 2024
Adopted on: July 2, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001011




Res-Pg:k.4-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 JULY 2,2024

A, CONTINENTAL HARDWARE, INC. for fourteen (14) items, to wit;
ITEM NOS. 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 72, 73 and 74.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. EPPY’S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOQUSE, INC. for twenty two
(22) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 35, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75
and 76,

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.,

C. FERGUSON WATERWORKS for three (3) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 6, 37 and 43.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

D. US ELECTRICAL SERVICES DBA YALE ELECTRIC SUPPLY
for twenty three (15) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 32, 33, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74,
75 and 76.
* This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the equipment and materials to be acquired by these contracts
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations
and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-100.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of
Finance, Central Supply Warehouse, Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

Introduced on July 2, 2024
Adopted on: July 2, 2024
Official Resoldtion#: 2024001011




Res-Pg:k.4-4
[CONTINENTAL TRADING & HARDWARE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD .
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. Il

Line ltem Dascription Cuantity Unit of Uriit Cast  Tatal Cast. No Bid Commants:

Measure

Milwaukes, cordless, impact wrench kit 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-b breakawjév torque, Milwaukee 5 EA $366.00 $1,830,00
Part Number: 2552-22, as specified or equal

37 Milwaukee M18 Fuel Li-lon 1/2" Cordless, Drill/driver, bare tool. Milwaukee Part number: 2805-20, 5 EA $285.00 | $1,425.00
as specified or equal

43 Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/ ! hex 18V DC, 2,000 in-Ib Max. Torque. Milwaukee Part Number 5 EA $169.00 3845.00_

2853-20, as specified or equal

SECTION IV - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line ltem Description Unit of Measure Percentage

/ 56 Tool Storage % 30%
\/ 57 Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" % 30%
58 Wrenches % 30%
J 59 Torque Tools % 30%
< 60 Screwdrivers % 0%
\/ 61 Pliers ‘ % 30%
\/ 62 Punches/Chisels/Hammers : % 30%
\/ 63 General Hand Tools {ie: Filas, Scrapers, spark plugs, threading :'extractors, pullers, % 30%
diesel, other)
/ 64 Set Building | % 30%
/ 65 Power Tools % 30%
Introduced on: July 2. 2024

g?f?Pt?‘gi}DNTINENTAH'YI@gEﬂfﬂE & HARDWARE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial Bes ol HRIE TABEEOUNIES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. Il

Page 7



Res-Pg:k.4-5
[CONTINENTAL TRADING & HARDWARE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. Il

Line ltem Dascription Unit of Measure Percentage Nao Rid

\/ 66 Testing & Electronics (i.e.: spacialty meters, A'.nalyzers, fuel and engine systems) % 30%
67 Welding . . 4 ” % ' No Bid X
68 Undercar | % " Nosgid X
69 Battery Service % No Bid X
70 | Air Conditioning - % No Bid X
71 Cooling % | No Bid X
\/ 72 Shop Equipment (le: Lighting, Creepérs, measuring, pick-up tools compres;ors, % 25%
presses)
. / ' / 73 Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, preséure washers, Vacuums, Shop Fans) % 30%
~/ 74 Safety | T % 30%
75 Diagnostics % No Bid ' X
76 Towing | % NoBid X
Introduced on:; July 22024 . -

Adoptef TINENTALITRARIRN & HARDWARE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Bl {ARAY TEW¢EERYES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. fl

Page 8



Res-Pg:k.4-6
[EPPY'S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. li

Lina.lten Descriptian Quandity Unitof LnitCost  Total Cost No Bid Camments:
Measure

32 Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet with battéry 12V 0C, 30 ft-ib fastening torque, Milwaukee part ‘ 5 EA 525988 $1,299.40 ' NEW

number 2456-21, a5 specified or equal NUMEBER
12566-22 (2
BATTERIES)
33 Milwaukee, Cordless oscilating tool kit, 12V, Milwaukee part number 2426-22, as specified or equal 5 EA $220.47 $1,102.35 MEW
e NUMBER
2426-21%XC
J as Milwaukee, cordless, impact wrench kit'1/4" Drive, 12 v OC, 100 ft-Ib breakaway torque, Milwaukee 5 EA ' 6259.93 41,299,685
) Part Number: 2552-22, as specified or equal ‘
37 Milwaukes M18 Fuel Li-ion 1/2" Cordless, Drill/driver, bare tool. Milwaukee Part number: 2805-20, 5 EA $235.06 $1,175.30 NEW
as specifled ar equal NUMBER
2506-20
43 |Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/4" hex 18V DC, 2,000 in-Ib Max, Torque. Milwaukee Part Number 5 EA $153.92 | $769.60

2853-20, as specified or equal

SECTION IV - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line ltem Description Unit-of Measure Percentage Mo Bid

J 56 Tool Storage % 28.5%
/ 57 Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" % 28.5%
/ 58 Wrenches % 285%
J ‘ 59 Tarque Tools | % 28.5%
-/ 60 Serewdrivers | . % 28.5%
N 61 Pliers " | % 28.5%
Introduced on: July 2, 2024 '

Adoptedgipyis T J% ?0 CSTAENT WAREHOUSE INC] ﬁESPoNSE DOCUMENT aépom
ot S bR D

. S AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. Ii
“Page 7



Res-Pg:k.4-7

[EPPY'S TOOL & EQUIPMENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. T8D
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. |l

Line ltem Description Unit of Measure Percentage

\/ 62 Punches/Chisels/Hammers % 28.5%
\/' 63 General Hand Tools {ie: Files, Scrapers, sbark plugs, threading extractors, pullers, % 28.5%
diesel, other)
S 64 Set Building % 28.5%
J 65 Power Tools: . . % 28.5%
J 66 Testing & Electronics (i.e.: specialty meters, Analyzers, fuel and engine systems) % 28.5%
\/ 67 Welding % 28.5%
< 68 Undercar | % 28.5%
J 69 Battary Service : % 28.5%
70 Air Conditioning % 28.5%
V4 71 Coofing % 28.5%
\/ 72 Shop Equipment (ie: nghting, Creepers, measuring, pick-up tools compressors, % 28.5%
presses)
\/ 73 Shop Cleaning (ie: parts, washers, pressure washers, Vacuums, Shop Fans) % 28.5%
J 74 Safety % 28.5%
J 75 Diagnostics % 28.5%
~/ 76 Towing | % 28.5%
Introduced on: July 2, 2024

Adopte
omcm,‘@ﬁbm TR BIBRENT WAREHOUSE INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
" Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. Il
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Res-Pg:k.4-8
[FERGUSON WATER WORKS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. li

9. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all tarms included with the bid package. Alt documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

10. Subrission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is.cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

TR SR RENIS i
] T AR ‘51'1 g udE
1 o
-l., ‘,‘l..{ i

HAND TOOLS CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS
Line ltam Quantity Linit of Unit Cast  Total Cosl No Rid Camments:
Measure

SECTION Il - POWER TOOLS e T 3
. Bl . "y ; ) )
6 Milwaukee M12 U-lo 1/2 in Cordless Drill/Driver, bare toal, Milwaulkee part number 2503-20, as L EA $122.34 $611.70 2503-20
. specified or equal i DISCONTINUED
- 3403-20
REPLACEMENT
32 |Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet with battery 12v DG, 30 ft-Ib fastening torque, Milwaukee part 5 EA $20351 | $3,017.55 | 2456-21
number 2456-21, as specified or equal DISCONTINUED
- 2456-20
REPLACEMENT
Introducedon: July 2, 2024 : .
Adopte

offira HEBGUSON WA WORKS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. il
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Res-Pg:k.4-9
[FERGUSON WATER WORKS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
"HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. ||

Line itam Daserlption Quantity Uriit of Unit:Cost  Total Cost, No Bid Comments:

Measure
x) ” Milwaukea, Curdless oscilating tool kit, 12V Mllwaukee part | number 2426-22, as specified or 5 EA ‘ 5198;49 ' $992.00 2426-22
aqual DISCONTINUED
: - 242620
REPLACEMENT
35 | Milwaukee, cordless, impact wrench kit 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-lb breakaway torque, 5 EA $306.34 | $1,531.70 255222
Milwaukee Part Number: 2552-22, as specified or equal DISCONTINUED
- 2552-20
REPLACEMENT
37 Milwaukee M18 Fuel U-ten 1/2" Cardless, Drill/driver, bare tool. Milwaukee Part number: 2805- ‘ 5 EA $205.86 41,029.30 2805-20
20, as specified or exqual DISCONTINUED
- 2905-20
REPLACEMENT
J 43 Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/4" hex 18V DC, 2, 000 tn-Ib Max. Torque Milwaukee Part Number | 5 . EA $131.47 $657.35 - 2853-20
' 2853-20, as specifted or equal DISCONTINUED
) - 2953-20
REPLACEMENT

SECTION IV - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Line ltem Daseription Unit of Measure Parcentage No Bid
56 Tool Starage % No Bid X
57 |Drive Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" | % No Bid X
58 Wrenches % No Bid X
59 Torque Tools h | “ | % No Bid X
60 Screwdrivers ’ % No Bid X
| 61 Pliers : | " % | nosid X
Introducéed-on:——-Juiy-2-2024 - :

Adopte
ofﬁc,a,‘ggggﬁ%; WAREEIHORKS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
“HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. I
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Res-Pg:k.4-10
[YALE ELECTRIC SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. Ii

a

9. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All clocuments should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms.must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

10. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one {1) bid subfission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

HAND TOOLS CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS

Ling Item Deseription CuaniTiy Unit of Unlt Cost  ‘Taral Cost Na Bid Camments:

NN
wrd

Meaasure
SECHON WI-POWERTOOLS- ~ » . = e .
6 Mitwaukee M12 LiHlo 1/2 in CmrdlésS‘DriH/Driver, bare toal, Milwaulkee part number 2503-20, as 5 €A 513399 $669.95 Milwaukea
specified or equal :

' / a2 Milwaukee 1/4" Drive, ratchet with batter{;‘lw oc, 30 ft-ib"'fasiening torque, Mllwadke;e part 5 EA '3133.‘99 4919.95 ' Milwaukee

number 2456-21, as specified or aqual - ¢
/ 33 Milwaukee, Cordless oscliatlng toal kit, 1iV, Mitwaukee part number 2426-232, aS specified or equal ] EA 595,99 5479.95 ' Milwaukee

Introduced on; July 2.2024 . A p—

ggf?l?tjg?te ELECTRIeYe@:93 RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial s oMU TEBL A idEs AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. i
Page 6



[YALE ELECTRIC SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. Il .

Res-Pg:k.4-11

Line ltam

Description Queantiy

Mliwaukee, cardless, impact wrench kit 1/4" Drive, 12 v DC, 100 ft-Ib bréakawav torque, Milwaukee 5

Unleof
Measure

Unilt Cost

“Fotal Cast

No fid

Comments;

35 EA '$20999 | $1,499.95 Milwaukee |,
Part Number: 2552-22, as specified or equal

37 ilwaukee M18 Fuel Lilon 1/2° Cardiess, Drill/driver, bare tool, Milwaukee Part number: 2805-20, 5 EA $359.99 | $1,79995 | Milwaukee
a5 specified or equal

43 Milwaukee Cordless Impact, 1/4" hex 18V DC, 2,000 in-lb Méx. Torque. Milwaukee Part Number 5 EA $143.99 %719.95 Milwaukee
2853-20, as specified or equal .

Lina ltem Description

SECTION IV - DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF CATALOG

Unit' of Measure

Percentage

S A

/
J
/
J

.

56 Tool Storage % 27%
57 Drivé Tools 1/4" - 2-1/2" % 27%
58 Wrenches " % 27%
59 Torqué Teols % 27%
60 Screwdrivers % 27%
61 Pliers % 27%
| 62 Punches/Chisels/Hammers % ' 27%
63 General Hand Tools kie: Files, Scrapers, spark plugs, threadlng'éxtractors, pullers, % 27%
diesel, other)
64 Set Building % 0%
65 Péwer Tools %. 27%
July 2. 2024 ' '

Introduced on:

Adoptefan ELECTRICISUPPAR RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
hicial e AR TR O A5 S AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. (I
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. , Res-Pg:k.4-12
[YALE ELECTRIC SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
HAND TOOLS, CASES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. i

Line Item Dascription Unit of Measure Parcentage

, \/ | . 66 ‘Testing & Electronics (i.e.ﬁ specialty meters, Analyzers, fuel and engine‘systemsr) % ‘ 0%
/ 67 - Welding | | : . ” T " % t 0%
\/ ‘l 68 Undercar | - ‘ % 0%
J 69 Battery Service % | 0%

J 70 iAir Conditioning | ’ ” ' % | 0%
4 A Cooling | " % 0%
/ 72 Shop Equipment (ie: Lighting, Creepers, measuring, pick~up tools compressors, ' % 27%
presses) |
\/ ‘”. 73' SHOp Cleanihg (ie: parts, wast;ers, pressure washers, Vacuums,ﬁhop Fans) 4 % 27%
/ 74 Safety | | % 27%
j 75 Diagnostics | % B 0%
4 i . . .
76 Towing % 0%
Introdug_e_d:)n' July 2, 2024 .

Ad9ptegzme ELECTAIIB@%92 RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RS oM HRIE TEBISEAES AND STORAGE CONTAINERS NO. Il
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