Res-Pg:m.7-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Toms River, New Jersey
Director John P. Kelly

08754-2191
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: September 30, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Rescinding JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES Item Nos. 3, 4, 6, 13, 18, 21,
22,25, 31, 32, 35, 40, 41, 42, 46, 48, 49, 53, 54, 55, 56, 58, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 72, 73, 78, 81, 86, 87, 91, 92,
95, 100, 102, 105, 111, 113, and 114 from Patifico Corporation as they are unable to honor their contract
pricing. Recommendation is made to award Item No. 32 to Cooper Electric Supply LLC dba Cooper Electric;
ltem Nos. 4, 22 and 53 to Qualmax Supplies; ltem Nos. 40 and 73 to Acuity Specialty Products, Inc dba Zep
Sales And Service; Item Nos. 56 and 113 to Simplify Chemical Solutions, Inc.; Item Nos. 81 and 92 to Term,
Inc t/a Allen Paper and Supply; ltem Nos. 35, 49, 54, 68, 72, and 95 to United Sales USA Corp; ltem Nos. 41,
66 and 86 to Plastic Express, Inc.; item Nos. 25, 48, 67, 111 and 114 to Imperial Bag & Paper Co. LLC; and
ltem Nos. 3, 6, 13, 18, 21, 31, 46, 55, 58, 64, 65, 78, 87, 91, 100, 102 and 105 to W.B. Mason Co. Inc. ltem
No. 42 will be rebid. (B2025-85)

Official Resolution# (2025001396
Meeting Date 09/30/2025
Introduced Date 09/30/2025
Adopted Date 09/30/2025
Agenda Item m-7

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-85
Result Adopted
SRy g 74 §3 e (W[ ’55
COMMISSIONER % % % g § % 2;
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v
Bacchione v v |v
Haines v v v

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie \. Guetar”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:

PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

NO. 6&0&3 B 85

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON Aﬂ.e§-P§ Tm

RESOLUTION

September 30, 2025

WHEREAS, on April 29, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for furnishing and delivery of JANITORIAL AND FACILITY
MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, on June 18, 2025, Contract B2025-85, Item Nos. 3, 4, 6, 13,
18, 21,22, 25,31, 32, 35, 40, 41, 42, 46, 48, 49, 53, 54, 55, 56, 58, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 72,
73, 78, 81, 86, 87, 91, 92, 95, 100, 102, 105, 111, 113, 114 were awarded to PATIFICO
CORPORATION; and

WHEREAS, the County Purchasing Agent has requested Contract B2025-
85, Item Nos. 3, 4, 6, 13, 18, 21, 22, 25, 31, 32, 35, 40, 41, 42, 46, 48, 49, 53, 54, 55, 56,
58, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 72, 73, 78, 81, 86, 87, 91, 92, 95, 100, 102, 105, 111, 113, 114
awarded to PATIFICO CORPORATION be rescinded due to vendor being unable to
honor their contract pricing.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as
follows:

1. The aforementioned Resolution and Contract dated June 18, 2025
awarding Item Nos. 3, 4, 6, 13, 18, 21, 22, 25, 31, 32, 35, 40, 41, 42, 46, 48, 49, 53, 54,
55, 56, 58, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 72, 73, 78, 81, 86, 87, 91, 92, 95, 100, 102, 105, 111, 113,
114 to PATIFICO CORPORATION is hereby rescinded.

2. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed

to enter into amendatory contracts with the next lowest bidders, as follows:

A. ACUITY SPECIALTY PRODUCTS, INC DBA ZEP SALES AND
SERVICE for Item Nos. 40 and 73.

B. COOPER ELECTRIC SUPPLY LLC DBA COOPER

ELECTRIC for Item No. 32.

C. IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO. LLC for Item Nos. 25,48, 67, 111 and 114.
D. PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. for Item Nos. 41, 66 and 86.

E. QUALMAX SUPPLIES for Item Nos. 4, 22 and 53.

F. SIMPLIFY CHEMICAL SOLUTIONS, INC. for Item Nos. 56 and 113.

G. TERM INC T/A ALLEN PAPER AND SUPPLY for Item Nos. 81 and 92.

H. UNITED SALES USA CORP. for Item Nos. 35, 49, 54, 68, 72 and 95.

1. W.B.MASON Co., Inc. for Item Nos. 3, 6, 13, 18, 21, 31, 46, 55, 58, 64, 65, 78,
87,91, 100, 102 and 105.

September 30, 2025
September 30, 2025

Official Resolutipn#: 2025001396




Res-Pg:m.7-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

3. All other provisions of the Resolution and contract documents described
above shall remain in full force and effect. Item No. 42 will be rebid.
4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices

and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-85.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution
shall be made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance
Department, Buildings & Grounds Department, Corrections Department, Juvenile
Services, Parks Department, Security Department, Sheriff’s Office, Solid Waste

Management, Vehicle Services Department and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: September 30, 2025
Adopted on: September 30, 2025
Official Resolutipn#: 2025001396




Res-Pg:m.7-4
[ACUITY SPECIALTY PRODUCTS, INC D/B/A ZEP SALES AND SERVICE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Measure

38 Ant Killing BX No Bid No Bid X X
System,
Unscented,
Combat or Equal,
6 Baits/Box, As
Specified, or
Equal

39 Bug Spray, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Aerosol Can, 3
Deepwoods or
Equal, 12 - 6 oz.
Cans/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

Aerosol Can, Insect Killer case Action Insect
Institutional 1047651 Killer 1047651
Y Grade, 12-12 0z. | * :
Cans/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal .

/O Bug Spray, 15 CASE $76.00 $1,140.00 Enforcer Dual Action |12 cans per 10 Days Enforcer Dual

41 Insect and Tick CASE No Bid No Bid X
Repellent,
Aerosol Can,
REPEL,
Permethrin
Clothing and
Gear, 12 -6 0z.
Cans/Case, NO
SUBSTITUTONS

Introduced on: September 30, 2025

Adopte i

o fficialtiée})'“_lm ggg%‘gg 1P'3 g@?ﬂu@f@ INC D/B/A ZEP SALES AND SERVICE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid 2 JANITORIAT AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Page 15




Res-Pg:m.7-5
[ACUITY SPECIALTY PRODUCTS, INC D/B/A ZEP SALES AND SERVICE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Unit of
Measure

Line ltem Unit Cost Total Cost

Description Quantity No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Gloves, -
Disposable Nitrile
POWDER FREE,
Beaded Cuff,
Color: Blue,
minimum 3 mil
Thickness, LATEX
FREE, Textured
Grip, Puncture
Resistant,
Exam/Medical
_|Grade Level
Protection, Glove
Length 9" to 9
1/2", Sizes:
Medium, Large,
X-Large, Ambitex
N400, or Equal,
100 Gloves/Box,
10 Boxes/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

HAND SANITIZERS, SOAPS, AND SUPPLIES

73 Aerosol Cleaner, 20 CASE $72.00 $1,440.00 Zep Powerhouse 12 cans/case 10 Days
Zep Powerhouse PN#28201
Heavy Duty,
\/ Product #0282,
12-24 02
Cans/Case, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

74 Detergent, Pot CASE No Bid No Bid X
and Pan, Dawn
Manual, 8 - 38
Oz. Bottles/Case,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

Introduced on: September 30, 2025
+ . Adoptediqmy Ty SPECIAPIIIROMRYES INC D/B/A ZEP SALES AND SERVICE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial Resolution 292590189 i 1Ty MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Page 24




Res-Pg:m.7-6
[ALLEN PAPER AND SUPPLY COMPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD :
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
Measure

Line Item Description Quantity

$4,825.00

Hand Sanitizer Gojo Purell Foam
Foam, Purell Soap Refill 8561-04
Instant or Equal, |- 4/1.5liter

2-40.5 Fl. oz.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

80 Hand Soap, 60, CASE $77.00 $4,620.00 SC Johnson cs

Hypoallergenic, . CLR120TF 3/1.2liter
Perfume-Free
and Dye-Free
Foam, 1.2 Liter
Cartridge, Model
# CLR120TF, 3
Cartridges/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

81 Hand Soap, Liquid 165 CASE $30.80 $5,082.00 Simoniz Complete cs
Antimicrobial, A0065004 4/1gal
Dial, MUST BE
L~ TRICLOSAN FREE,
V] 4-1Gal.
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

82 Purell Gel 10 CASE $105.60 $1,056.00 Gojo Purell Instant | cs
Cartridge Refill, 5456-04'4/1200ml
1200 ml, Model
#5456-04 Citris,
MUST FIT Purelt
Push Button
Dispenser Model
2720-12, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

Introd B 5
:d?pt"eﬁfjigz N PAPEFgE @,9{5 EhindPBbYZ@MPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

- - Official Reso) WMNITE RRAZSAMNBIACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
Page 28



[ALLEN PAPER AND SUPPLY COMPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-7

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost
Measure

Clair, Graffiti $2,397.50
Remover, Aerosol
Spray Can, Part
#CL880. 20 oz.
Can, 12
Cans/Case

Brand/Manufacturer

Simoniz $3346012
12/cs

Packaging

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

91 Floor Absorbent, 50 BAG $22.50° $1,125.00
Speedi-Dri or Oil-
Dri or Equal,
Minimum 40 lb.
Bag, As Specified
or Equal

Sheppard Oil Dry
7501 50lb bag

92 Furniture Polish, 10 CASE $45.60 '$456.00

Pledge, or Equal,

12-320z2.

'\/ Containers/Case,
NO

SUBSTITUTIONS

Pledge SCI682275
6/14.50z

93 Harrell's Pigment GAL No Bid No Bid
Cleaner Plus,
MUST Contain
Organic and
Inorganic Acids
and Synthetic
Detergents,
Including
Phosphoric Acid,
1Gal, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-on: September 30, 2025

AdoptefdhEN _PAPEIBMPBO,YZUEB\/IPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official igsolutiornis FAESAAIBBACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
Page 31



[COOPERFRIEDMAN ELECTRIC SUPPLY CO INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-8

Line Item Description

Mop, Yacht, 20
oz., Rayon with
Attached-
Wooden Handle,
As Specified, or
Equal

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Brand/Manufacturer

Comments

30 Spray Bottle,
Plastic with
Trigger Style -
Hand Sprayer, 12-
320z
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

350

CASE

$40.32

$14,112.00

Rubbermaid FG9C03060000

31 Sprayer, Hand
Trigger Style,
MUST BE
UNIVERSAL FIT,
As Specified, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

32 Squeegee, Floor,
18" Heavy Duty
/ Channel Type
with 60" Length
Y Wooden Handle,
As Specified, or
Equal

25

EA

$15.61

$390.25

Rubbermaid FG9C2800BLA &
FG636200NAT

33 Swiffer Duster
Starter Kit, One
(1} 6" Handle, 6
Dusters/Kit, 6
Kits/Carton, As
Specified, or
Equal

No Bid

No Bid

Introduced-en:

'lﬂ’ 2025

AdopteKE@PERFRIEQ&BME&MWSU PPLY CO INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official RgsolufiantiRPARSANBINCILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Page 13



Res-Pg:m.7-9
[IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO.,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure

25 Mop Handle, Wet 125 EA $17.52 $2,190.00 NEWELL H246GRAY

Mop, Fiberglass
/ Handle, Clamp-
Style Head,
V] Rubbermaid
#FGH24600GYOO0,
As Specified, or

Equal

oz., Rayon, As
W Specified, or
Equal

/ 26 Mop Head, 16 35 boz $19.49 $682.15 JANICO 12 CFSMMOP

oz., Rayon, Cut
End, WHITE, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 27 Mop Head, 24 850 DOz $22.99 $19,541.50 JANICO 12 ‘ CFMDMOP

28 Mop He-ad, 32 30 Doz $29.99 $899.70 JANICO 12 CFLGMOP

/ . - |oz., Rayon, Cut

\/ End, WHITE, As
. Specified, or

Equal M

29 Mop, Yacht, 20 ) 00z No Bid No Bid X
oz., Rayon with
Attached
Wooden Handle,
As Specified, or
Equal

* Introduced on: September 302025

AdoptedIMPERIAL B/SRePARERT@025C] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Bepolthign#ty RASANIBPEACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
Page 12



: Res-Pg:m.7-10
[IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO.,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Measure

Towels, Hand $1,462.80 629804
Cleaning, Golo,
9" Lx 10" W, 130
Towels/Bucket, 4
Buckets/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

47 Wiping Rags, 75 BX $31.61 $2,370.75 AMERICAN WASTE |60 TERRY1619
Reclaimed, 100% & TEXTILE
Jersey Knit
Cotton, White, 1 -
25b. Box, As
Specified, or
Equal

48 Wiping Rags, 50 8X $31.61 $1,580.50 . AMERICAN WASTE 160 TERRY1619

Reclaimed, 100% & TEXTILE
Terry Cloth, 25 Ib.
'\/ Box, 170 . '

Rags/Box, As
Specified, or
Equal

DEODORIZERS, AIR FRESHENERS, CLEANSERS, AND WIPES

49 Aerosol, Airlift, 10 CASE $50.41 $504.10 SPARTAN 12/ 200z 601900
Fresh Scent, 12-
16 oz. Cans/
Case, Spartan, As
Specified, or
Equal

* Introduced-on+ S P k 'lﬂ’ 2025

Adopted!SAPERIAL BASaReRARERA; 2028 C] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Brpolptionto RORSINBPBACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
- Page 17




[IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO.,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-11

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid

Measure

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

FLOOR MATS

65 Entrance Mat, 3' EA No Bid No Bid X
X2, Brown A

Tweed with Vinyl
Backing, As
Specified, or
Equal

66 Entrance Mat, 3' EA No Bid No Bid X
X S', Brown
Tweed with Vinyl
Backing, As
Specified, or
Equa!

GLASS CLEANERS

67 Glass Cleaner, 125 CASE $20.57 $2,571.25

Zepvue R.T.U.,
/ Spray Bottle

W #1010, 12 - 32 oz.

Bottles/Case, As

Specified, or
Equal

AMERICAN
CLEANING

12 / 320z

GLASSPRO

68 Window Cleaner, 135 CASE $33.02 $4,457.70
Windex or Equal,
12-32 0z
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

MIDLAB

12 /3202

FO0044

GLOVES

o 5

cedon: .. September 30 202! -
Adopted WPERIAL BAGMeRWRERICENAE.C] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResolykiRffn RIRBIBPEACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Page 21



Res-Pg:m.7-12
[IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO.,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost Total Cost

Line Item Description Quantity No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Tornado Strike
Vacuum, HEPA
Filter Cartridge,
Item #
K28893420,
MUST FIT
Tornado Strike
Cordless Vacuum
Model # TV190-
W10-U, As
Specified or Equal

$1,062.00 TORNADO K28893420

11 Vacuum, 25 EA $203.40 $5,085.00 HOOVER 1 CHS3010
Lightweight,
Bagless, On-
Board Tools,

\/ Hoover
Commercial Task
Vac
#HVRCH53010,
As Specified, or
Equal

112 Vacuum, Tornado S EA $498.79 $2,493.95 TORNADO 1 97300
Roam Cordless
Upright CK LW
13/1, 13"
Cleaning Width
{vacuum shall
come with bags
and battery), As
Specified or Equal

= Introduced on: ____ September 30,2025
AdoptedIMPERIAL BABBEPARERT025C] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResoltHigRitH RSN BPEACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
Page 34




) Res-Pg:m.7-13
[IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO.,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Iitem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure

Vacuum, Tornado 10 EA $647.70 $6,477.00 TORNADO 1 TV190W10U
Strike Cordless
Commercial
Upright with On
Board Tools, 10"
Cleaning Width,
Model # TV190-
W10-U (vacuum
shall come with
bags and
battery), As
Specified or Equal

114 Vacuum, Upright, 20 EA $292.98 $5,859.60 TORNADO 1 98147
14.75" W
Cleaning Path, 3.8
Qt. Bag Capacity,
V 3 Stage Filtration

with HEPA and
Exhaust Filters,
Includes On-
Board Tools,
Tornado CK 14/1
PRO, As Specified,
or Equal

~ Introducedon: — September 30 2025
Adopted IMPERIAL B/ASGFReMARERICEIAS.C] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RegolykiRHH RIZPMNBPRACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
Page 35




Res-Pg:m.7-14
[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Unit of
Measure

Line ltem

Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, AR.O.  Comments

Description Quantity

Combat/45901 2-10 Business
Days

Ant Killing
System,
Unscented,
/ Combat or Equal,
LV 6 Baits/Box, As

Specified, or
Equal

$646.25

39 Bug Spray, 30 CASE $78.98 $2,369.40 Deep Woods 12-60z/Case 2-10 Business
Aerosol Can, E Days
Deepwoods or
Equal, 12 - 6 oz.
Cans/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

40 Bug Spray, 15 CASE $78.98 $1,184.70 Deep Woods 12-120z/Case 2-10 Business

Aerosol Can, . Days
Institutional
Grade, 12 - 12 oz.
Cans/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

41 Insect and Tick 25 CASE $78.98 $1,974.50 Deep Woods 12-60z2 /Case 2-10 Business
Repellent, Days
Aerosol Can,
/ REPEL,
\’ Permethrin
Clothing and
Gear, 12 -6 oz.

Cans/Case, NO
SUBSTITUTONS

Introd d : 3020265

AdoptelPbASTIC EXPREyiphed RESBONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Officialgigso)utigntsR2ARQNBIACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
Page 15 '



[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-15

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of

Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

FLOOR MATS

65 Entrance Mat, 3' 50 EA
X 2', Brown
Tweed with Vinyl
Backing, As
Specified, or
Equal

$23.89

$1,194.50

Lavex/846-23

Each

10-14 Business
Days

66 Entrance Mat, 3' 150 EA

X5', Brown
Tweed with Vinyl
U Backing, As

Specified, or
Equal

$36.52

$5,478.00

Lavex/846-35

Each

10-14 Business
Days

GLASS CLEANERS

67 Glass Cleaner, 125 CASE
Zepvue R.T.U.,
Spray Bottle
#1010, 12 - 32 oz.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

$43.28

$5,410.00

ZEP/112032

12-3202

10-14 Business
Days

68 Window Cleaner, 135 CASE
Windex or Equal,
12-320z.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

$45.04

$6,080.40

Boardwalk/4711

12-32 02

10-14 Business
Days

GLOVES

September30- 5

Introdueed-on

Adopted RS TIC EXPBESEmNE BBESPBNSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BrsolptiQIv REASHN BPEACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:m.7-16
[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of

Measure

Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

All Purpose
Cleaner, Simple
Green, MUST BE
All Natural, 6- 1 4
\/ Gallon

Containers/Case,
As Specified, or-
Equal

$2,959.60 Simple Green/489 2-10 Business
Days

87 Baking Soda, Arm CASE No Bid No Bid X
& Hammer Pure,
12-21b.
Boxes/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

88 Cleaning Powder 85 CASE $43.52 $3,699.20 Ajax/7714 24-2102 2-10 Business
with Bleach, Babo Days

or Equal, 24-21
oz. Cans/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

89 Bolex, 23 Percent 55 CASE " %41.99 $2,309.45 Misty/8799 12-32 0z 2-10 Business
Hydrochloric Acid Days

Bowl Cleaner,
Wintergreen, 32
oz. Container, 12
Containers/Case.
MUST Contain
23%HCI
Minimum, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introdueed-en- P 352625 -
AdoptedRIASTIC EXP8&StenBE: BRESPABNSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Breolytiantto RARSANBPPACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
Page 28 i




Res-Pg:m.7-17
[QUALMAX SUPPLIES] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item

Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure

Toilet Bowl Mop,
Deluxe Style with
Acid Resistant
Yarn and Fuller
Head, As
Specified, or
Equal

4 Toilet Bowl Mop 75 EA $1.85 $138.75 MEDLIFE

/ Holder, As

M Specified, or
Equal

S Toilet Bow! EA No Bid No Bid X
Plunger, without
Metal Clips, As
Speciﬁed, or
Equal

6 Toilet Seat 50 CASE $31.00 $1,550.00 kleenline 10x500
Covers, Half Fold
White Paper, 20%
Post Consumer
Materials, 100%
Recovered Paper
Fiber, Green Seal
Certified, Bay
West, 16" W x 3
®'Dx11%"H,
250 Covers/Pack,
20 Packs/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: Septemher 30,2025

_ Adopted@UALMAX SSOPEESERESPZIREE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResolieRt 25ANBIACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
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[QUALMAX SUPPLIES] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-18

Line item

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

18

Dust Pan with
Cover, Upright,
Black,
Rubbermaid
Lobby Pro #2532,
As Specified, or
Equal

75

EA

$11.00

$825.00

JANICO

20

Floor Finish, ZEP
Ovation, 5 Gallon
Pail, Product
#190135, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

75

PAIL

$98.00

$7,350.00

ZEP

21

Floor Sweéper
{Non-Electric),
Scotch-Brite
Quick #M-007-
CCW, Bissell or
Oreck Models,
MUST HAVE
MINIMUM 8.5"
WIDE CLEANING
PATH, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

22

Mop Handle, 60"
Security, Hollow
Fiberglass with
Alligator Gripper
Head,
Rubbermaid #
H146, As
Specified, or
Equal

50

EA

$8.35

$417.50

JANICO

Introduced on:

September 30, 2025

. AdopteJQUWALMAX SSHIEEBSRIE RO26SE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official ResolyliRnfo RIRERNBPBACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Page 11



Res-Pg:m.7-19
[QUALMAX SUPPLIES] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging

Measure

Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Aerosol Spray,
Lysol®

. Disinfectant, Kills

/ 99.99% of Germs,
12-19%0z.

"\/ Cans/Case, Model

#454270,NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

$6,944.00

51 Lysol Disinfectant CASE No Bid No Bid X
Max Cover Mist
Aeroso! Spray,
Kills 99% of
Viruses and
Bacteria, or
Equal, 6- 15 oz.
cans/case

52 Air Freshener, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Handheld, Claire
10 Oz. Can, 12
Cans/Case, Item #
i 10216500, As
Specified, or
Equal

53 Bleach, Clorox® 200 CASE $17.67 $3,534.00 AUSTIN
or Austin Brand,

/ 6-1 Gallon
\/ Containers/Case,

As Specified, or
Equal

54 Bleach, Clorox® 95 . CASE $25.80 $2,451.00 CLOROX
Outdoor, 3-121
oz.
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal |

Introduced-on: Sep L 30,-2025-
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[SIMPLIFY CHEMICAL SOLUTIONS INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-20

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid

Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
Measure
55 Deep Cleaner, 20 CASE $97.00 $1,940.00 ARKAD 4X1GAL 3DAYS AS SPECIFIED
Arkad Zippy, 4 - 1
Gal/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal
56 Deep Cleaner 20 CASE $44.90 $898.00 ARKAD 6X1QT 3 DAYS AS SPECIFIED
/ RTU, Arkad Zippy,
\/ 6-1Qt./Case, As
Specified, or
Equal
57 Disinfecting PACK No Bid No Bid X

Wipes, Ciorox®,
CLO-15949C, 75
Wipes/Canister, 6
Canisters/Pack,
As Specified, or
Equal

58 Oisinfecting CASE No Bid No Bid X
Wipes, Clorox®
Fresh Scent, 35
Sheets/Container,
12
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

59 Lysol Pro All CASE No Bid No Bid X
Purpose Cleaner
Sanitizing and
Disinfecting, Non
Aerosol Liquid
Spray. 32 oz., 12
Containers/Case,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

Introduced on: September 30, 2025

Adopted [SIMPLIFY CREN#ORETSILROABNS INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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[SIMPLIFY CHEMICAL SOLUTIONS INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-21

Line Item

Description

Vacuum, Tornado
Strike Cordless
Commercial
Upright with On
Board Tools, 10"
Cleaning Width,
Model # TV190-
W10-U (vacuum
shall come with
bags and
battery), As
Specified or Equal

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

$619.00

Total Cost

$6,190.00°

No Bid

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

EXACTITEM

114

Vacuum, Upright,
14.75" W
Cleaning Path, 3.8
Qt. Bag Capacity,
3 Stage Filtration
with HEPA and
Exhaust Filters,
Includes On-
Board Tools,
Tornado CK 14/1
PRO, As Specified,
or Equal

20

EA

$333.75

. $6,675.00

TORNADO

EACH

5-7 DAYS

EXACT ITEM

Introduced.on:

September 30 2025
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[UNITED SALES USA CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure

34 Swiffer Wetlet EA No Bid No Bid X
Floor Spray Mop
Starter Kit, Multi-
Surface, including
One (1) Mop, Five
(S) Mop Pads,
and One (1)
Liquid Solution,
As Specified, or
Equal

35 Swiffer Wetlet 50 CASE $58.83 $2,941.50
Heavy Duty

/ Mopping Pad
\/ Refills, 24
Pads/Box, 4
Boxes/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

36 Swiffer WetJet CASE No Bid No Bid X
Multi-Surface
Cleaner Solution
Refill - Fresh
Scent, 6
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

37 "Wet Floor" Sign, EA No Bid No Bid X
37" Maxi-Warn,
Continental #120,
ALL PLASTIC, NO
METAL PARTS, As
Specified, or
Equal

BUG SPRAYS AND INSECT REPELLENT

[UNITED SALES USA CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
Page 14



[UNITED SALES USA CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
- Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer
Measure

Packaging Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Towels, Hand
Cleaning, Golo,
9" Lx 10" W, 130
Towels/Bucket, 4
Buckets/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

47 Wiping Rags, 75 BX $30.00 $2,250.00
Reclaimed, 100%
Jersey Knit
Cotton, White, 1 -
25lb. Box, As
Specified, or
Equal

48 Wiping Rags, ) BX No Bid No Bid X
Reclaimed, 100%
Terry Cloth, 25 Ib.
Box, 170
Rags/Box, As
Specified, or
Equal

DEODORIZERS, AIR FRESHENERS, CLEANSERS, AND WIPES

49 Aerosol, Airlift, 10 CASE $30.24 $302.40
Fresh Scent, 12-

\/ 16 oz. Cans/
Case, Spartan, As

Specified, or
Equal

uced-oni———September-30,-2025
. AdopteflINTED SALESepfeiBERRL RBSPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ggsolutiaryRIA2SRRZICILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
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[UNITED SALES USA CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-23

Line item

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

S0

Aerosol Spray,
Lysol®
Disinfectant, Kills
99.99% of Germs,
12-190z.
Cans/Case, Model
#454270,NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

100

CASE

$107.06

$10,706.00

51

Lysol Disinfectant
Max Cover Mist
Aerosol Spray,
Kills 99% of
Viruses and
Bacteria, or
Equal, 6-15oz.
cans/case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid X

52

Air Freshener,
Handheld, Claire
10 0z. Can, 12
Cans/Case, Iltem #
10216500, As
Specified, or
Equal

CASE

No Bid

No Bid X

53

Bleach, Clorox®
or Austin Brand,
6-1 Gallon
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

200

CASE

$18.67

$3,734.00

54

NG

Bleach, Clorox®
Qutdoor, 3-121
oz.
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

95

CASE

$21.00

$1,995.00 ' .

Introdu

cedon: _ Septemher 30 20:
Adopted UNITED SALESHIGIMIEORP, PRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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- Res-Pg:m.7-24
[UNITED SALES USA CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD , :
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure

FLOOR MATS

65 Entrance Mat, 3' EA No Bid No Bid X
X 2', Brown
Tweed with Viny!
Backing, As
Specified, or
Equal

66 Entrance Mat, 3' EA No Bid No Bid X
X 5', Brown
Tweed with Vinyl
Backing, As
Specified, or
Equal

GLASS CLEANERS

67 Glass Cleaner, 125 CASE $20.25 $2,531.25
Zepvue R.T.U., .
Spray Bottle
#1010, 12 -32 oz.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

68 Window Cleaner, 135 CASE $19.95 $2,693.25
Windex or Equal,
12-320z.

U Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

GLOVES

Introdueed-en: Septemrer-36.2626
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: Res-Pg:m.7-25
[UNITED SALES USA CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

N

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure

7 Gloves, 65 CASE $25.30 $1,644.50
Disposable Nitrile .
POWDER FREE,
Beaded Cuff,
Color: Blue,
minimum 3 mil
Thickness, LATEX
FREE, Textured
V Grip, Puncture
Resistant,
Exam/Medical
Grade Level
Protection, Glove
Length 9"to 9
1/2", Sizes:
Medium, Large,
X-Large, Ambitex
N400, or Equal,
100 Gloves/Box,
10 Boxes/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

HAND SANITIZERS, SOAPS, AND SUPPLIES

73 Aerosol Cleaner, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Zep Powerhouse
Heavy Duty,
Product #0282,
-|12-240z.
Cans/Case, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

74 Detergent, Pot 30 CASE $48.09 $1,442.70
and Pan, Dawn ’
Manual, 8 - 38
Oz. Bottles/Case,
NO

% SUBSTITUTIONS

Introduced. on: Septemher 30 2025
_ Adopted ONITED SALESHISALEDR®. 2RBPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.7-26
[UNITED SALES USA CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
"JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
Measure
94 Peroxy HDOX, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Earth
Laboratories,
Hydrogen

Peroxide Cleaner,
Sanitizer Virucide,
Fungicide, 4-1
Gallon
Containers/Case,
EPA REGISTERED,
MUST FiT
EXISTING SYSTEM
#10072900 WITH
ALL PARTS, As
Specified, or
Equal

95 WD40 with 30 CASE $92.89 $2,786.70

Smartstraw,
/ #1078-12, or

. Equal, 12- 11 0z.

v Cans/Case, As

Specified, or
Equal

96 Zep 40 Non- CASE No Bid No Bid X
Streaking Cleaner
#0144, 12 - 24 oz.
Cans/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal «

97 Zep Double Play CASE No Bid No Bid X
#095018,4-1
Gal. Containers
With One (1)
Dispenser/Case,
NO
SUBSTITUIONS

Introducedon: __ September 30, 2025
AdoptedINITED SALESRUSALEOBR 2065PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT -
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[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-27

Line Item

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

Toilet Bowl Mop,
Deluxe Style with
Acid Resistant
Yarn and Fuller
Head, As
Specified, or
Equal

475

EA

$0.88

$418.00

Imapct

€A

IMP204

Toilet Bowl Mop
Holder, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

EA

$3.30

$247.50

Rubbermaid

EA

RCP631100WE

Toilet Bow!
Plunger, without
Metal Clips, As
Specified, or
Equal

150

EA

$2.88

$432.00

Genuine Joe

EA

(61085130

Toilet Seat
Covers, Half Fold
White Paper, 20%
Post Consumer
Materials, 100%
Recovered Paper
Fiber, Green Seal
Certified, Bay
West, 16" Wx 3
%'Dx11%"H,
250 Covers/Pack,
20 Packs/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

50

CASE

$28.64

$1,432.00

‘WB Mason

5000/CS

JSWTSCHF5000

Introduced on:

Adopte
Official
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[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD e

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of

Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

11 Broom, Corn, #6 25 Doz
with Handle,
/ Heavy Duty, Sold

by the Dozen, As
Specified, or
Equal

$100.82

$2,520.50

Boardwalk

12/CT

BWK932YCT

12 Broom, Lobby, 75 EA
Tough
Polypropylene
with Flagged
Bristles, 35" H,
Rubbermaid
Lobby Pro 6374,
As Specified, or
Equal

$5.21

$390.75

Genuine Joe

EA

GJO02410

13 Broom, Push, 24" 50 EA
(NO HANDLE), for

Multi-floor Use,
/ Libman, As
\’ Specified, or
Equal

$9.57

$478.50

Boardwalk

EA

BWK20124

14 Broom Stick, 100 EA
Fiberglass,
Threaded, As
Specified, or
Equal

$8.61

$861.00

WB Mason

EA

ATSP591705

[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
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) Res-Pg:m.7-28
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description i Unit of Unit Cost Totat Cost i Brand/Manufacturer Packaging . Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Measure

15 Broom Head, 125 CASE $62.52 $7,815.00 > Genuine Joe EA ‘GJO02410 Item
Angled Security, sold as EA for
10.5" Sweep Area 1$5.21

with
Polypropylene
Bristles, 12
Broom
Heads/Case,
Rubbermaid
#6397, As
Specified, or
Equal

16 Deck Scrub Brush 175 EA $3.37 $589.75 Genuine Joe EA GJO18416
- Brush Only (NO
HANDLE), As
Specified, or
Equal

17 Dust Brush, 75 £A $4.11 $308.25 Boardwalk EA BWK5308
Counter Brush,
Black Horse Hair
Bristles, 13 %"
length, As
Specified, or
Equal

18 Dust Pan, 12" 50 CASE $30.60 $1,530.00 Genuine Joe EA | GJO02406 Item

/ Rubbermaid sold as EA for

\/ #2005, As . $2.55
Specified, or

Equal, 12 Dust
Pans/Case -

Introducedon: _____ September 30, 2025
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Res-Pg:m.7-29
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid'No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, AR.O Comments

Measure

19 Dust Pan with 75 EA $12.11 $908.25 Winco ST WNCDP13C
Cover, Upright, ’
Black,
Rubbermaid
Lobby Pro #2532,
As Specified, or
Equal

20 Floor Finish, ZEP PAIL No Bid No 8id X
Ovation, 5 Gallon
Pail, Product
#190135, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

21 Floor Sweeper .25 EA $38.63 $965.75 Bissell . EA ' 'BSL52321
(Non-Electric),

Scotch-Brite
Quick #M-007-
CCW, Bissell or

\/ Oreck Models,
MUST HAVE
MINIMUM 9.5"
WIDE CLEANING
PATH, As
Specified, or
Equal

22 Mop Handle, 60" 50 EA $7.64 $382.00 Boardwalk EA BWK610
Security, Hollow
Fiberglass with
Alligator Gripper
Head,
Rubbermaid #
H146, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: September 30, 2025
Adopted B MASO ﬁ§R\?ﬂW3N§E BEEUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.7-30
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost i Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Measure

29 Mop, Yacht, 20 80 DOz 3 $6,102.40 Boardwalk 6/CT BWK116R item
oz., Rayon with . sold as 6/CT for
Attached , 38.14

Wooden Handle,
As Specified, or
Equal

30 Spray Bottle, 350 CASE $15.84 $5,544.00 Genuine Joe + Tolco |EA GJ085100 +
Plastic with : TOL110246 Item
Trigger Style sold as EA for

. Hand Sprayer, 12- $1.32

320z

Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

31 Sprayer, Hand 350 EA $0.67 $234.50 Tolco EA TOL110246
Trigger Style,
MUST BE

Vi UNIVERSAL FIT,
As Specified, or
Equal

32 Squeegee, Floor, 25 EA $18.75 $468.75 Ettore + Genuine EA ETO48318 +
18" Heavy Duty . ) Joe GJO66000
Channel Type
with 60" Length
Wooden Handle,
As Specified, or
Equal

33 Swiffer Duster 50 CTN $38.88 $1,944.00 Swiffer EA PGC11804BX
Starter Kit, One item sold as EA
(1) 6" Handle, 6 for $6.48
Dusters/Kit, 6 J
Kits/Carton, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: égmgmbg[ 30, 2025
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Res-Pg:m.7-31
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure

46 Towels, Hand 15 CASE $81.4426 $1,221.639 Gojo 72/BCKT, 6/CT G0J639606 Item
Cleaning, Golo, sold as 72/BCKT,

/ 9" Lx 10" W, 130 6/CT for $67.66

. Towels/Bucket, 4

M Buckets/Case, As

Specified, or

Equal

47 Wiping Rags, 75 BX $58.98 $4,423.50 Textile Waste 2518 .| TWY2190176
Reclaimed, 100% Supply
Jersey Knit
Cotton, White, 1 -
251b. Box, As
Specified, or
Equal

48 Wiping Rags, 50 BX $58.98 $2,949.00 Textile Waste 2518 TWY2190176
Reclaimed, 100% Supply
Terry Cloth, 25 Ib.
8ox, 170
Rags/Box, As
Specified, or
Equal

DEODORIZERS, AIR FRESHENERS, CLEANSERS, AND WIPES

49 Aerosol, Airlift, 10 CASE $43.32 $433.20 Glade 807, 2/PK SIN377363 Item
Fresh Scent, 12- sold as 8 0Z,

16 oz. Cans/ : 2/PK for $3.61
Case, Spartan, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: September 30, 2025
Adopted A MASOISERIIPERNIP, BBREUMENT REPORT
. official Resolufigié SORONNEP FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Page 17




[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-32

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

55

Deep Cleaner,
Arkad Zippy, 4 -1
Gal/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

20

CASE

$23.93

$478.60

NCL

4/Cs

NCL092529

56

Deep Cleaner
RTU, Arkad Zippy,
6-1Qt./Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

57

Disinfecting
Wipes, Clorox®,
CLO-15949C, 75
Wipes/Canister, 6
Canisters/Pack,
As Specified, or
Equal

850

PACK

$19.64

$16,694.00

Genuine Joe

6/CT

GIOW75F

58

Disinfecting
Wipes, Clorox®
Fresh Scent, 35
Sheets/Container,
12
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

35

CASE

$36.14

$1,264.90

Clorox

12/CT

C€LO01594

59

Lysotl Pro All
Purpose Cleaner
Sanitizing and
Disinfecting, Non
Aerosol Liquid
Spray. 32 oz,, 12
Containers/Case,
‘NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

15

CASE

$57.12

$856.80

Lysol

12/CT

RAC75352

Introduced an:
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Introducedon:  September 30, 2025
AdOPtEf:gﬂB MASONJHESFONSIORIZYMENT REPORT

SRR ORIRPRASEACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Official

[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-33

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost No Bid

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

Odor Eliminator
Air and Surface
Spray; 32 oz.
Bottle, 6
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

CASE

$26.84

$268.40

NCL

3207, 12/CT

NCL141336 Item
sold as 32 0Z,
12/CT for $53.68

61

Odor Eliminator
Gel, 8fl.oz,, 12
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

CASE

No Bid

No Bid X

62

Pine-Sol Multi-
Surface Cleaner,
80o0z,3
Bottles/Case, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

25

CASE

$34.33

$858.25

Clorox

3/cr

CLO60607

63

Zep Big John It
Portable Toilet
Deodorant —~
Concentrated
Cleaner for, Odor
Control, S Gallon
Container. NO
SUBSTITUTIONS.

CONT

No Bid

No Bid X

64

Wipes, Streak-
Free Glass &
Surface, Approx.
Size 7" x 10",
Windex or Equal,
28 Pre-Moistened
Wipes/Package, 6
Packs/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

CASE

$18.1705

$272.5575

Windex

38 SHTS/PK

SINS319251
Item sold as 38
SHTS/PK for
$4.11

Page 20




[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:m.7-34

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line ltem

FLOOR MATS

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

65

7

Entrance Mat, 3'
X 2'; Brown
Tweed with Vinyl
Backing, As
Specified, or
Equal

50

EA

$15.28

'$764.00

Guardian

EA

MLL64020330

66

Entrance Mat, 3'
X S', Brown
Tweed with Vinyl
Backing, As
Specified, or
Equal

150

EA

$37.16

" $5,574.00

Genuine Joe

EA

GJO55351

GLASS CLEANERS

67

Glass Cieaner,
Zepvue RT.U.,
Spray Bottle

#1010, 12 - 32 0z.

Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

125

CASE

$24.88

$3,110.00

NCL

320z, 12/CT

NCL404536

68

Window Cleaner,
Windex or Equal,
12-320z.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

135

CASE

$24.88

$3,358.80

NCL

3202, 12/CT

NCL404536

GLOVES
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. Res-Pg:m.7-35
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, AR.O. Comments
Measure

Hand Cleaner,
Zep Cherry Bomb

Heavy-Duty
/ Pumice, #0951, 4
% -1Gal.
Containers/Case,
NO PUMP As
Specified, or
Equal

$1,342.00 NCL202119

76 Hand Cleaner, 20 CASE $89.66 $1,793.20 Gojo 4/CT G0J095504CT
Zep Cherry Bomb ! g
Heavy-Duty
Pumice, WITH
Pump, 4 -1 Gal.
Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

77 Hand Sanitizer, 65 CASE $39.07 $2,539.55 DEB 1L, 6/CT DEBS55857

DEB InstaFOAM,
or Equal, Non
Alcohol 33.8 fl.

\/ oz. Bottles, 6
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

8 Hand Sanitizer, 10 CASE $28.56 $285.60 WB Mason 2:0Z NWLHS02150
Purell Advanced Item sold as 2
Gel, 2 oz. Flip Cap 0Z for $1.19
v Bottle, 24-2 oz.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or
Equat
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Res-Pg:m.7-36
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD .
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, AR.O. Comments
Measure
86 All Purpose 40 CASE $52.965 $2,118.60 NCL 4/cs NCL403529 item
Cleaner, Simple sold as 1 GAL,
Green, MUST BE | ' 4/CT for $35.31
All Natural, 6-1
Gallon

Containers/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

87 Baking Soda, Arm 5 CASE $26.55 $132.75 Arm & Hammer 24 1B "|cocas20084104
& Hammer Pure,

‘/ 12-21b.

) Boxes/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

88 Cleaning Powder 85 CASE $30.37 $2,581.45 Ajax 24/cT CPC14278CT
with Bleach, Babo
or Equal, 24-21
oz. Cans/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

89 Bolex, 23 Percent 55 CASE $25.27 $1,389.85 NCL 32 0z, 12/CT NCL1730
Hydrochloric Acid
Bowl Cleaner,
/ Wintergreen, 32

oz. Container, 12
V Containers/Case.
MUST Contain
23% HCI
Minimum, As
Specified, or
Equal
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Res-Pg:m.7-37
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT :
Bid No. TBD .
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Line ftem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure

90 Clair, Graffiti 35 CASE $89.5059 $3,132.7065 Boardwalk 16 0Z, 12/CT BWK351ACT
Remover, Aerosol | Item sold as 16
Spray Can, Part 02Z, 12/CT for
#CL880. 20 0z. $76.08

Can, 12
Cans/Case

91 Floor Absorbent, 50 BAG $12.81 $640.50 Oil-Dri 4018 PNFOD18002

/ Speedi-Dri or Oil- .
Dri or Equal,

v Minimum 40 |b.

Bag, As Specified

or Equal - -

92 Furniture Polish, 10 . CASE $28.80 $288.00 Champion 170z CHP34109 item
Pledge, or Equal, sold as 17 OZ for
12-32 02 $2.40
Containers/Case, :
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

93 Harrell's Pigment GAL No Bid - No Bid X
Cleaner Plus,
MUST Contain
Organic and
Inorganic Acids
and Synthetic
Detergents,
Including
Phosphoric Acid,
1Gal., As
Specified, or
Equal

/
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[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:m.7-38

Line Item

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost No Bid

Brand/Manufacturer

Packaging

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

SPONGES, PADS AND SCRUBBERS

98

Absorbent Pads,
Universal for Ol
and Water,'ls" X
19", Absorbs 31.4
Gallons, 100
Pads/Pack, As
Specified, or
Equal

PACK

No Bid

No Bid X

99

d

Absorbent Pads,
OIL USE ONLY,
15" X 18",
Absorbs 21.5
Gallons, 100
Pads/Pack, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

PACK

$47.39

$1,184.75

WB Mason

100/BX

ATSP4510005

100

L

Sponge,
Cellulose, 6" x
4.25" x 1.625",
3M#C31, 24
Sponges/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

CASE

$26.05

$651.25

Boardwalk

24/cT

BWKCS2

101

Scouring Pads,
Nylon, 6" x 9",
Medium Duty, 6
Pads/Box, 10
Boxes/Case, As
Specified, or
Equal

50

CASE

$16.29

$814.50

Boardwalk

20/CT

BWK196 Item
soldas 20/CT for
$5.43

TRASH CANS AND SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:m.7-39
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
JANITORIAL AND FACILITY MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

Unit of
Measure

Line Item Description Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Brand/Manufacturer Packaging Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Outside
Receptacle,
Smoker's Cease
/ : Fire, Barco
Products

V4 #26804D, Color:
Black, Plastic, 16
%" Dia.x38 %" H,
Weight: 15 Ibs.,
As Specified, or
Equal ~

$968.30

ATSP45120

103 Trash Can with 40 EA $31.80 $1,272.00 Continental EA COCP3200GY +
Lid, Rubbermaid COCP3201GRY
"Brute" #2632, 32
Gallon, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

104 Trash Can with 75 EA $103.71 $7,778.25 Continental + EA COCPS500GRY +
Lid, Rubbermaid Rubbermaid RCP265400GY
"Brute" #2655, 55
Gallon, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

105 Waste Basket, 28 310 EA $5.03 $1,559.30 Continental EA COCP2818BK
Qt., Rubbermaid
V1 #2956, As
Specified, or
Equal

‘| VACUUMS AND SUPPLIES

106 tithium lon 10 EA $592.69 $5,926.90 Tornado EA TOR97300
Battery for !
Tornado Roam
Cordless Upright
Battery, 44V, As
Specified or Equal
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