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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly

Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

June 18, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS
REPAIR/REPLACEMENT to B&L Tire Service, Inc. t/a B&L Towing; C.B.E.V. Enterprises/Atlantic Auto Body of
Howell; Jackson Auto Body; Central Jersey Collision dba Elizabeth Truck Center; Quality Auto Glass; STR
Auto and Collision LLC; and Trawinco, LLC dba Maaco Collision and Autopainting, the lowest qualified

bidders, in the total estimated maximum dollar value of $675,000.00. (B2025-83)
Official Resolution# [2025000825
Meeting Date 06/18/2025
Introduced Date 06/18/2025
Adopted Date 06/18/2025
Agenda ltem m-1
CAF #
Purchase Req. # B2025-83
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER % (@ g % % A
Kelly v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v |v
Bacchione v v
Haines v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

T

Deputy Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on
Adopted on:

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE O -Fy.
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

June 18, 2025

WHEREAS, on April 29, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for furnishing and delivery of VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS
AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
B&L Tire Service, Inc., t/a B&L Towing C.B.E.V Enterprises/Atlantic
100 Minue Street Atlantic Auto Body of Howell
Carteret, NJ 07008 286 Victory Road
(732) 541-0100 Howell, NJ 07731

(732) 938-6100
Jackson Auto Body Central Jersey Collision dba
133 E. Commodore Blvd Elizabeth Truck Center
Jackson, NJ 08527 878 North Avenue
(732) 928-9292 Elizabeth, NJ 07201

(908) 355-8800
Quality Auto Glass STR Auto and Collision LLC
2300 S. Clinton Avenue 242 Dover Road
South Plainfield, NJ 07080 South Toms River, NJ 08757
(908) 754-2652 (732) 240-4626
Trawinco LLC Auto Craftman and Collision
dba MAACO Collision and Auto Painting 150 Lake Avenue
1299 Route 88 Island Heights, NJ 08732
Lakewood, NJ 08701 (732) 270-8099
(732) 905-2999
E&A Supreme Auto Body Freehold Ford, Inc.
1006 W. Elizabeth Avenue 3572 Route 9
Linden, NJ 07036 Freehold, NJ 07728
(908) 862-4400 (732) 462-2982

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, namely that of, B&L. TIRE SERVICE INC. T/A B&L TOWING; C.B.E.V
ENTERPRISES/ATLANTIC AUTO BODY OF HOWELL; JACKSON AUTO BODY;
CENTRAL JERSEY COLLISION DBA ELIZABETH TRUCK CENTER; QUALITY
AUTO GLASS; STR AUTO AND COLLISION LLC and TRAWINCO LLC DBA MAACO
COLLISION AND AUTO PAINTING be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

June 18, 2025
June 18, 2025

Official Resoluqion#: 2025000825




Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolutiq

BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 JUNE 18, 20

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into a contract for furnishing and delivery of Vehicle Collision Repairs and Glass
Repair/Replacement, for the County of Ocean, for the contract period shall be for a two (2)
year term, beginning July 5, 2025 and ending July 4, 2027, or until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to

N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. B&L TIRE SERVICE, INC. T/A B&L TOWING for twenty-four (24) items to wit:
Ttem Nos. 2a, 2b, 2¢, 2d, 2e, 2f, 2g, 2h, 3a, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 3f, 3g, 3h, 4a, 4b, 4c, 4d, 4e, 41, 4g
and 4h.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 2a - 2g) of $170,850.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 3a - 3g) of $26,950.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 4a - 4g) of $16,630.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. C.B.E.V ENTERPRISES/ATLANTIC AUTO BODY OF HOWELL for eight (8)
items to wit:
Item Nos. 1a, 1b, lc, 1d, le, 1f, 1g and 1h.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 1a - 1g) of $80,772.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. JACKSON AUTO BODY for twenty-four (24) items to wit:
Item Nos. 2a, 2b, 2¢c, 2d, 2e, 2f, 2g, 2h, 3a, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 3f, 3g, 3h, 4a, 4b, 4c, 4d, 4e, 41, 4¢g
and 4h.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 2a - 2g) of $112,270.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 3a - 3g) of $19,100.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 4a - 4g) of $9,550.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. CENTRAL JERSEY COLLISION DBA ELIZABETH TRUCK CENTER for
twenty-four (24) items to wit: 2a, 2b, 2¢, 2d, 2e, 2f, 2g, 2h, 3a, 3b, 3¢, 34, 3e, 3f, 3g, 3h, 4a,
4b, 4c¢, 4d, 4e, 4f, 4g and 4h.

For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 2a - 2g) of $103,920.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 3a - 3g) of $20,585.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item #'s 4a - 4g) of $13,230.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

June 18, 2025
June 18, 2025
n#: 2025000825
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Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolu

ki

Res-Pg:m.1-4
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 JUNE 18, 2025

E. QUALITY AUTO GLASS for fourteen (14) items to wit:
Item Nos. 5a, 5b, 5¢, 5d, 5e, 5f, 5g, Sh, 5i, 5j, 5k, 51, Sm and 5n.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 5a - 5f) of $30,220.00.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

F. STR AUTO COLLISION LLC for eight (8) items to wit:
Item Nos. 1a, 1b, 1c, 14, le, 1f, 1gand 1h.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. la - 1g) of $87,755.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.G.

G. TRAWINCO LLC DBA MAACO COLLISION AND AUTO PAINTING for eight
(8) items to wit:
Item Nos. 1a, 1b, 1¢, 1d, le, 1f, 1g and 1h.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item Nos. 1a - 1g) of $80,440.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital

accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Vehicle Services.

3. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-83.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

June 18, 2025
June 18, 2025

on#: 2025000825
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[TRAWINCO LLC DBA MAACO COLLISION AND AUTO PAINTING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

No response submitted

~ 12. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*
Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

13. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES ,
SECTION I - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW)

Vendor MUST bid on item 1h in order to be considered for award of items 1a-1g.

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total NoBid Comments:
' (2) Yr.Qty. Measure
A 1a Body Labor Rate ' 1,200 $40.00 |$48,000.00
W 1b  [Frame Labor Rate 16 HR $40.00 | $640.00
P .
.\// 1c Paint Labor Rate 540 HR $40.00 |$21,600.00
Introduced on: June 18, 2025

S?f‘-’”‘i% WINCO PneyHa 2026ACO COLLISION AND AUTO PAINTING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial Besolypiont PSPPRABN RePAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Page 6



Res-Pg:m.1-6
[TRAWINCO LLC DBA MAACO COLLISION AND AUTO PAINTING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line ltem Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Tota! NoBid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

b/ 1d  |Paint Materials ' 525 HR $18.00 | $9,450.00
\// 1e Towing from Toms River, NJ . 5 EA $50.00 | $250.00 '
V/ 1f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ S EA $50.00 $250.00
M/ 1g Towing from Manchester, NI 5 EA $50.00 $250.00
TOTAL $80,440.00.

SECTION | - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 1a-1g in order to be considered for the award of item 1h.

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:

Measure (%)

1h Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?®". For bid purposes 65,000 S $1.00 10% $58,500.00
assume parts at $65,000 for a two {2) year term. .

SECTION Il - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW)

Vendor MUST bid on item 2h in order to be considered for award of items 2a-2g.

| Lineltem Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total NoBid  Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
2a Body Labor Rate » ' HR No 8id No Bid X
2b  |Frame Labor Rate ' ' ' HR NoBid | NoBid X
2c Paint Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
2d Paint Materials ’ HR No Bid No Bid X
Introduced on: June 18; 2025

Adoptedigriaw INCO JY¥reB/2R2AACO COLLISION AND AUTO PAINTING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

SeIvHant 2°%2N998%3 N REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
Page 7



. Res-Pg:m.1-7
[STR AUTO AND COLLISION LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

No response submitted

12 Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bndders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

13. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
SECTION I - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW)
‘ Vendor MUST bid on item 1h in order to be considered for award of items 1a-1g.

Line item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

v la Body Labor Rate ' 1,200 HR $40.00 |$48,000.00
u ib Frame Labor Rate 16 HR $55.00 $880.00
\,/ lc Paint Labor Rate 540 HR $40.00 {521,600.00
Introduced on: June 18, 2025
Adopted TR AUTO AN TR, [AG2ON LLC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official

3OV PRBPPREEIN REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT §
Page 6 :



Res-Pg:m.1-8
- [STR AUTO AND COLLISION LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD -
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
v 1d Paint Materials : 525 HR $30.00 |$15,750.00
V/ le Towing from Toms River, NJ ) 5 EA $80.00 $400.00
Z.

\// 1f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ S EA $125.00 $625.00
\// 1g Towing from Manchester, NJ ) 5 EA $100.00 | $500.00

* TOTAL $87,755.00

SECTION | - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW) - % DISCOUNT
Vendor MUST bid on items 1a-1g in order to be considered for the award of item 1h.

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:

Measure (%)

/ 1h Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?®". For bid purposes 65,000 S $1.00 5% $61,750.00
assume parts at $65,000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION i - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW)

Vendor MUST bid on item 2h in order to be considered for award of items 2a-2g.

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid  Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
2a Body Labor Rate ’ HR No Bid No 8id X
2b Frame Labor Rate . HR No Bid No Bid X
2c Paint Labor Rate ' HR No Bid No Bid X
2d Paint Materials ) HR No Bid No Bid X
Introducedon: __June 18, 2025

Adopted[gTR AUTO ANBe(BL2MR2DN LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggplufiontt 2°2eMARN REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
Page 7



Res-Pg:m.1-9
[QUALITY AUTO GLASS INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD . _
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total NoBid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

Towing from Manchester, NJ No 8id No Bid

" TOTAL , $0.00

SECTION IV - VEHICLE COLLISION REAPAIRS - FULL SIZED BUSES - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 4a-4g in order to be considered for the award of item 4h._

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes

|assume parts at $5,000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION V - GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Vendor MUST bid on items 5g-5n in order to be considered for award.

Line ltem Description Est. Two uUnit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

COsTs ASSOCIATED WITH GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT, AS SPECIFIED

/ Sa Windshield Repair - Single Vehicle up to Three (3) Window Defects. Price to Include all 10 EA $105.00 { $1,050.00
iV Labor and Complete Repair.

/ Sb Windshield Repair - Multiple Vehicles up to Three {3} Window Defects per Vehicle at the 5 EA $85.00 $425.00
\u ; - . s

Same Location. Price to Include all Labor and Complete Repair.

/ 5c Windshield Replacement - Hourly Labor Rate - County Location. Price shall include travel 250 HR $46.00 |$11,500.00
v time.
\’/ 5d Windshield Replacement - Hourly Labor Rate - Vendor Location 5 HR $39.00 $195.00

Introduced on: June 18, 2025

g?f?l?tjf%efuxlxu_w AUTOIAIBIIIAC ] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial Resolvfiqnt: 2%2099873N REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
~Page 10



[QUALITY AUTO GLASS INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD . |
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Res-Pg:m.1-10

Line item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
Se Urethane]DAM Primer (1.5) 20 EA $40.00 $800.00 For vehicles
requiring
ADAS
recalibration, |
we are now
\/ using a 30-
: minute Safe
Drive Away
Time
product.
/ .
\// Sf Molding Replacement for a Curved Windshield 250 EA $65.00 |$16,250.00
TOTAL . _ $30,220.00
SECTION V - GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT - % DISCOUNT
Vendor MUST bid on items 5a-5f in order to be considered for award of items 5g-5n.
Line item Description Unit of Measure Percentage
C(SSTS FOR TYPES OF GLASS; PRICED PER EACH TYPE OF GLASS, AS SPECIFIED
\// 5g DL/FL Larﬁinated Glass, Domestic or Foreign % 0%
v/ Sh DFT/FFT Flat Tempered Glass, Domestic or Foreign % 0%
\,/ 5i DT/FT Tempered Glass, Domestic or Foreign % 0%
\,/ 5j DW/FW Curved Windshield % 0%
\// 5k Sliding Rear Windows -Compact Pickup Trucks, including replacement of moldings, grommets and % 0%
other accessories.
Introduced on: June 18, 2025
Adopted AUPOeIBABEANC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

g d" ‘{}BETT’C&OE%OL(’L%?BN REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
Page 11



_ : Res-Pg:m.1-11
[QUALITY AUTO GLASS INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Percentage
/ Sliding Rear Windows - Mid-Size Pickup Trucks, including replacement of moldmgs grommetsand - % 0%
v - other accessories.
/ Sm Siiding Rear Windows for Full Sized Pickup Trucks, including replacement of moldings, grommets and % ‘ 0%
Y / other accessories.
v/ Sn Discount Percentage (%) for Glass Products Not Specified Herein (NOT LESS THAN}) : % 0%
Introduced on: June 18, 2025
Adopted :
: r@% ALITY AU 2RC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Offi |
e R VEICLE COLLISON REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Page 12



" Introdu

, _ Res-Pg:m.1-12
. [ELIZABETH TRUCK CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD :
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure '

1b Frame Labor Rate No Bid

1c Paint Labor Rate S . HR No Bid No Bid X

1d Paint Materials » ' HR No 8id No Bid X

le Towing from Toms River, NJ EA No Bid No Bid X

1f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ . EA No Bid No Bid X

1g Towing frorﬁ Manchester, NJ . EA No Bid No Bid X
TOTAL 7 - $0.00

SECTION | - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 1a-1g in order to be considered for the award of item 1h.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes
assume parts at $65,000 for a two (2} year term.

SECTION Il - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW)

Vendor MUST bid on item 2h in order to be considered for award of items 2a-2g.

Line tem Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:

{2) yr.Qty. Measure

.\/ 2a  |Body Labor Rate " | 810 HR $60,345.00
o” 2b  |Frame Labor Rate . ' 100 HR $74.50 | $7,450.00
/

Adonted BHZABETH TRTICK SHGEER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RéoIMEMHEL RIZB0RIBEBN REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
‘Page 7



. \ , Res-Pg:m.1-13
. [ELIZABETH TRUCK CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
{2) Yr.Qty. Measure

d/ 2c Paint Labor Rate $7450 | $18,625.00
\,/ 2d Paint Materials 250 HR $38.00 $9,500.00
\‘/ 2e Towing from Toms River, NJ S EA $500.00 | $2,500.00
\// 2f Towing from M;nahawkin, NJ 5 EA $600.00 | $3,000.00
\// 2g Towing from Manchester, NJ 5 EA $500.00 | $2,500.00
TOTAL i $103,920.00

SECTION i - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 2a-2g in order to be considered for the award of item 2h.

Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:
Measure (%)

Line item Description Quantity

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes
assume parts at $80,000 for a two (2) year term.

$72,000.00

SECTION [1f - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - EQUIPMENT (LOADERS, BACKHOES, ETC.)

Vendor MUST bid on item 3h in order to be cdnsidered for award of items 3a-3g.

~ Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
g (2) Yr.Qty. Measure

\ 3a Body Labor Rate 85 HR $89.50 | $7,607.50

\// 3b Frame Labor Rate 20 HR $89.50 $1,790.00

\/ 3c Paint Labor Rate 25 HR $89.50 | $2,237.50

Introduced-er———June-48:-2026 :
Adopted dALIZABETHJTRY 6% E6MTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rexglutiqn¥rc2P2500988P0N REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
Page 8 , : ;




Res-Pg:m.1-14
- [ELIZABETH TRUCK CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr. Qty. Measure
v 3d Paint Materials ' 25 HR $38.00 $950.00
\/ 3e Towing from Toms River, NJ ’ 5 EA | $500.00 | $2,500.00
V/ 3f Towing from< Manahawkin, NJ . 5 EA $600.00 | $3,000.00
\// 3g Towing from Manchester NJ . 5 EA $500.00 | $2,500.00
1 ToTaL A $20,585.00

SECTION IIl - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - EQUIPMENT (LOADERS, BACKHOES, ETC.) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 3a-3g in order to be considered for the award of item 3h.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes assume parts at $2,700.00
$3000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION IV - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - FULL SIZED BUSES
Vendor MUST bid on item 4h in order to be considered for award of items 4a-4g.

Line item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Totat No Bid Comments:

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

RV 4a Body Labor Rate 20 HR $74.50 | $1,490.00
-\"‘ 4b  |Frame Labor Rate _ 20 HR $74.50 $1,490.00
V 4c Paint Labor Rate 20 HR. $74.50 | $1,490.00
b/ 4d Paint Materials 20 HR $38.00 $760.00

Introduced-eni———June-18;2026
Adopted 6nk{ZABETHJURIdGE,@BRE ER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rgg@lutjemnifc 202500082HN REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
Page 9




[ELIZABETH TRUCK CENTER]} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Res-Pg:m.1-15

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

Unit Cost

Total No Bid  Comments:

Y 4e  |Towing from Toms River, NJ 5 EA | $500.00 | $2,500.00
v/ 4f Towing from Manahawkin, Ni ) : 5 EA $600.00 | $3,000.00
"/’ 4g Towing from Manchester, NJ 5 EA $500.00 | $2,500.00

TOTAL $13,230.00

SECTION [V - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - FULL SIZED BUSES - % DISCOUNT
Vendor MUST bid on items 4a-4g in order to be considered for the award of item 4h.

Lineltem Description Quantity Unit of
Measure

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?". For bid purposes
assume parts at $5,000 for a two (2) year term.

Unit Cost

Discount Total No Bid
{%)

$4,500.00

Comments:

SECTION V - GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Vendor MUST bid on items 5g-5n in order to be considered for award.

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

Unit Cost

Total No Bid Comments:

COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT, AS SPECIFIED

" Sa Windshield Repair - Single Vehicle up to Three (3) Window Defects. Price to Include alt EA

No Bid No Bid_ X
Labor and Complete Repair.
5b Windshield Repair - Multiple Vehicles up to Three (3) Window Defects per Vehicle at the EA - No Bid No Bid X
Same Location. Price to Include all tabor and Complete Repair.
5c Windshield Replacement - Hourly Labor Rate - County Location. Price shall include travel HR No Bid 'No Bid X
time. '
IntroduCc-u ot 18,2625

Adopted J,ELIZABETHJT,?.U@K QEMTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResgIutiEHIC RP25ONSZFON REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
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AheX¥son o BOO\}) . Res-Pg:m.1-16
" [COMPLETE COLLISION CENTER INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT ' ’
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION-REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line Iltem

Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

1d Paint Materials $40.00 $21,000.00
le Towing from Toms River, NJ 7 5 EA $85.00 $425.00
1f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ 5 EA $150.00 $750.00 ~
1g Towing from Manchester, NJ 5 EA . $85.00 $425.00
TOTAL $110,400.00

SECTION I - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 1a-1g in order to be considered for the award of item 1h.

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN For bid purposes ' ) i ' $61,750.00
assume parts at $65,000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION Il - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW)

Vendor MUST bid on item 2h in order to be considered for award of items 2a-2g.

Line ltem Description Est. Two Unit of tnit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
Body Labor Rate . . $68,445.00
V/ 2b Frame Labor Rate . 100 HR $84.50 $8,450.00
\,/ 2c Paint Labor Rate 250 HR $84.50 | $21,125.00
/
\/ 2d Paint Materials ) : 250 | HR $40.00 $10,000.00

Introdueced-on——June-48;2026
Adopted@MPLETE Cﬁ)thSDBDQENTER INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Repolutiqreh: F2027004%8% REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
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o : Res-Pg:m.1-17
" [COMPLETE COLLISION CENTER INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

| Line ltem Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

v 2e Towing from Toms River, NJ 5 EA $250.00 | $1,250.00

‘// 2f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ . 5 EA $350.00 | $1,750.00

v/ 2g Towing from Manchester, NJ . 5 EA $250.00 | $1,250.00
TOTAL . ' $112,270.00

SECTION 1 - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 2a-2g in order to be considered for the award of item 2h.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?". For bid purposes ’ $76,000.00
assume parts at $80,000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION Ili - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - EQUIPMENT (LOADERS, BACKHOES, ETC.)

Vendor MUST bid on item 3h in order to be considered for award of items 3a-3g.

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr. Qty. Measure
v 3a Body Labor Rate 85 HR - $95.00 | $8,075.00
" 3b  |Frame Labor Rate 20 HR $95.00 | $1,900.00
N 3c Paint Labor Rate . ' 25 " HR $95.00 $2,375.00
\// 3d Paint Materials . 25 HR $40.00 | $1,000.00
\// 3e Towing from Toms River, NJ 5 EA $350.00 | $1,750.00
Introduced-on: June 18 5074 .

Adopted ©@MPLETE QDhEISED20ZENTER INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BesolyHon# 2e250PREEAN REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT,
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: Res-Pg:m.1-18
" [COMPLETE COLLISION CENTER INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

V. Towing from Manahawkin, NJ 5 EA $450.00 | $2,250.00
v/ 3g Towing from Manchester NJ 5 EA $350.00 | $1,750.00
ZTOTAL $19,100.00

SECTION Il - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - EQUIPMENT (LOADERS, BACKHOES, ETC.) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 3a-3g in order to be considered for the award of item 3h.

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes assume parts at .} $2,850.00
$3000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION IV - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - FULL SIZED BUSES

Vendor MUST bid on item 4h in order to be considered for award of items 4a-4g.

Line ltem Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

V/ 4a Body Labor Rate ’ 20 HR $75.00 | $1,500.00

_Z

4 rame Labor Rate . d : .
W b F Labor R 20 HR $75.00 | $1,500.00
\// 4c Paint Labor Rate ' ) 20 HR $75.00 | $1,500.00

4 Paint Materials 40.00 800.00
y d ial 20 HR $ $
V/ 4e Towing from Toms River, NJ . 5 EA $250.00 | $1,250.00
N L af Towing from Manahawkin, NJ - 5 EA $350.00 | $1,750.00
Introduced on: June 18, 2025

Ad9ptec§9@MP_LETE_ cone|$POMZENTER INC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Offictal BeolVEANE 2LBPPRIEN REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
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Res-Pg:m.1-19
" [COMPLETE COLLISION CENTER INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT E

Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

Line Item Description

$250.00 | $1,250.00

Towing from Manchester, NJ

TOTAL " $9,550.00

SECTION IV - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - FULL SIZED BUSES - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 4a-4g in order to be considered for the award of item 4h.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:

Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes

$4,750.00
assume parts at $5,000 for a two (2) year term. .

SECTION V - GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Vendor MUST bid on items 5g-5n in order to be considered for award.

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT, AS SPECIFIED

Sa Windshield Repair - Single Vehicle up to Three (3} Window Defects. Price to Include all EA No Bid No Bid X
Labor and Complete Repair.

Sb Windshield Rebair - Multiple Vehicles up to Three (3) Window Defects per Vehicle at the EA No Bid No Bid X
Same Location. Price to Include all Labor and Complete Repair.

5c Windshield Replacement - Hourly Labor Rate - County Location. Price shall include travel HR No Bid No Bid X
time.
5d ; Windshield Repfacement - Hourly Labor Rate - Vendor Location HR No Bid No Bid X
Se Urethane/DAM Primer (1.5} - EA No Bid No Bid X
Introduced on: June 18, 2025

g?f’f’"_“i“%e%l}/l PLETE 01 IGGAPENTER INC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial Resolufiandt:, 2028099825 REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
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Res-Pg:m.1-20
. [CB.EYV ENTERPRISES/ATLANTIC AUTO BODY OF HOWELL] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

No response submitted

12. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

13 Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bjd submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

_Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
SECTION | - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW)

Vendor MUST bid.on item 1h in order to be considered for award of items 1a-1g.

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

Body Labor Rate . i $48,000.00
\// 1b | Frame Labor Rate 16 HR $42.00 $672.00
V/‘ 1c Paint Labor Rate 540 HR $40.00 |$21,600.00

IntrodM1& 2025
Adopte@®B;E.V ENTERPRISESZA28 ANTIC AUTO BODY OF HOWELL] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official gesolutia: r202399888% REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
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[QB.E.V ENTERPRISES/ATLANTIC AUTO BODY OF HOWELL] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Res-Pg:m.1-21

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
v/ 1d . |Paint Materials 525 HR $20.00 |$10,500.00
\// le Towing from Toms River, NJ 5 EA $0.00 $0.00 No charge
\// 1f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ S EA $0.00 $0.00 No Charge
V/ 1g Towing from Manchester, NJ. S EA $0.00 $0.00 No charge
TOTAL $80,772.00

SECTION | - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW) - % .DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 1a-1g in order to be considered for the award of item 1h.

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:

Measure (%)

1h Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes 65,000 S $1.00 10% $58,500.00
assume parts at $65,000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION I - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW)

Vendor MUST bid on item 2h in order to be considered for award of items 2a-2g.

Line ltem Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
2a  |Body Labor Rate MR NoBid | NoBid X
2b Frame Labor Rate . HR No Bid No Bid X
2c  |Paint Labor Rate ' ' HR NoBid | NoBid X
2d Paint Materials HR No Bid No Bid X
|ntrodurn}| on: June 18,2025

Adopted[6rB.E.V ENTERRRIBESMAFLANTIC AUTO BODY OF HOWELL] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Regolv i 2LERERN REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
Page 7 : '




: : Res-Pg:m.1-22
[B & L TIRE SERVICE T/A B&L TOWING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD -
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
1d Paint Materials 525 HR $34.00 $17,850.00
le Towing from Toms River, NJ ) S EA $250.00 $1,250.00
1f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ . 5 EA $350.00 | $1,750.00
ig Towing from Manchester, NJ S EA $250.00 | $1,250.00
TOTAL $241,600.00

SECTION | - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - AUTOMOBILE AND TRUCKS (CLASS 3 VEHICLES OR SMALLER <14,000 GVW) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 1a-1g in order to be considered for the éward ofitem 1h.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid Comments:

Measure (%)

1h Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes 65,000 S $1.00 10% $58,500.00
assume parts at $65,000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION I - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW)

Vendor MUST bid on item 2h in order to be considered for award of items 2a-2g.

Line item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total NoBid  Comments: §
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
.\// 2a Body Labor Rate : 810 HR 1 $135.00 |$109,350.00
V/ 2b Frame Labor Rate 100 HR $135.00 | $13,500.00
\// 2c Paint Labor Rate 250 HR $135.00 | $33,750.00
\// 2d Paint Materials ’ 250 HR $34.00 $8,500.00
Introduced-on: June 18,2025

Adopteidh:L TIRE SERVHEBE,208%:L TOWING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Officialdygsalitigris 243PPPAEPR REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
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Res-Pg:m.1-23
[B & L TIRE SERVICE T/A B&L TOWING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line ltem Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost No Bid  Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
V/ 2e Towing from Toms River, NJ 5 EA $350.00 | $1,750.00
V/ 2f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ » 5 ] EA $450.00 | $2,250.00
V/ 2g Towing from Manchester, N} 5 EA $350.00 $1,750.00
TOTAL . $170,850.00

SECTION Il - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS (CLASS 4 VEHICLES OR LARGER >14,000 GVW) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 2a-2g in order to be considered for the award of item 2h.

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No 8id Comments:
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes $72,000.00
assume parts at $80,000 for a two (2) year term. :

SECTION Il - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - EQUIPMENT (LOADERS, BACKHOES, ETC.)

Vendor MUST bid on item 3h in order to be considered for award of items 3a-3g.

Line item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure
AJ 3a Body Labor Rate 85 HR $145.00 {$12,325.00
\‘/ V3b Frame Labor Rate 20 HR $145.00 { $2,900.00
\'/ 3c Paint Labor Rate 25 HR $145.00 | $3,625.00
Wy 3d Paint Materials 25 HR $34.00 $850.00
\’/ 3e Towing from Toms River, NJ ’ S - EA $450.00 | $2,250.00

Introduced-er—June-48;-2026 .
Adopte{iﬂ:& LTIRE SERMK:&TMZB&L TOWING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Bepoltinng 202A00983% REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
Page 8 .




, , Res-Pg:m.1-24
[B & L TIRE SERVICE T/A B&L TOWING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT ‘
" Bid No. TBD

VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2} Yr.Qty. Measure
\/ 3f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ 5 EA $550.00 | $2,750.00
\// 3g Towing from Manchester NJ ' S EA $450.00 $‘2,250.00
TOTAL $26,950.00

SECTION 11l - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - EQUIPMENT (LOADERS, BACKHOES, ETC.) - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on ‘items 3a-3g in order to be considered for the award of item 3h.

Total

Discount
{%)

Unit of Unit Cost

Measure

Line item Description Quantity

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?®". For bid purposes assume parts at $2,850.00

$3000 for a two (2) year term.

SECTION IV - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - FULL SIZED BUSES

Vendor MUST bid on item 4h in order to be considered for award of items 4a-4g.

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total NoBid Comments:
{2) Yr. Qty. Measure
V] 4a Body Labor Rate ) 20 HR $145.00 | $2,900.00
iV ' 4b Frame Labor Rate 20 HR $145.00 | $2,900.00
-\’/ 4c Pajnt Labor Rate 20 HR $145.00 52,900.00
U ad Paint Materials ) 20 HR $34.00 $680.00
\// -de Towing from Toms River, NJ ) 5 - EA $450.00 | $2,250.00
/ 4f Towing from Manahawkin, NJ 5 EA $550.00 | $2,750.00
\ .

Introdueed-en* 82025

Adopted®& L TIRE SERHICHsT2628&L TOWING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BrpONEPIL 202500882 REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
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Res-Pg:m.1-25
[B & L TIRE SERVICE T/A B&L TOWING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

Towing from Manchester, NJ . $450.00 | $2,250.00

TOTAL . , " 1$16,630.00

SECTION IV - VEHICLE COLLISION REPAIRS - FULL SIZED BUSES - % DISCOUNT

Vendor MUST bid on items 4a-4g in order to be considered for the award of item 4h.

Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total
Measure (%)

Line ltem Description Quantity No Bid Comments:

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes
assume parts at $5,000 for a two (2) year term.

$4,750.00

SECTION V - GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
Vendor MUST bid on items 5g-5n in order to be considered for award.

Line Item Description Est. Two Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:

(2) Yr.Qty. Measure

COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT, AS SPECIFIED

Sa Windshield Repair - Single Vehicle up to Three {3} Window Defects. Price to Include all EA No Bid No Bid X
Labor and Complete Repair.

Sh | Windshield Repair - Multiple Vehicles up to Three (3) Window Defects per Vehicle at the | . ] EA No Bid No Bid X
Same Location. Price to Include all tabor and Complete Repair.

Sc Windshield Replacement - Hourly Labor Rate - County Location. Price shall include travel . HR No Bid No Bid X
time.

5d Windshield Replacement - Hourly Labor Rate - Vendor Location ’ HR No Bid No Bid X

Se - {Urethane/DAM Primer (1.5) . EA No Bid No Bid X

Introduced-eni———Juhe-48,-2026
Adopte{Bo&: L TIRE SERMI&EBTMZB&L TOWING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official iygsolutign: 2087098/3M REPAIRS AND GLASS REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
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