Res-Pg:m.2-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director John P. Kelly

] o ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Virginia E. Haines Tel: (732)929-2005
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea Fax: (732)505-1918
Commissioner Gary Quinn
Commissioner Joseph H. Vicari
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: March 16, 2022 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND

LUBRICANTS to Romeo Enterprises; Hough Petroleum Corp. and Commercial Lubricants Moove, LLC, the
lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on ltem Nos. 1, 2, 3, 19, 20, 32 and 45. All no bid items will
be rebid. (B2022-25)

Official Resolution# |2022000360
Meeting Date 03/16/2022
Introduced Date 03/16/2022
Adopted Date 03/16/2022
Agenda ltem m-2

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2022-25
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER § % g % § % %
Kelly v

Haines v v
Crea v v
Quinn v v |v
Vicari v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON
\NL\&M \. G[UW

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resoluq

Res-Pg:m.2-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
. PAPERS, DOCUMENTS. INVOICES, VOUCHERS

a5

RESOLUTION

March 16, 2022

WHEREAS, on February 1, 2022, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND
LUBRICANTS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder " Name and Address of Bidder
Romeo Enterprises Hough Petroleum Corp.

35 Dunbar Avenue 340 4' Street

Piscataway, NJ 08854 Ewing, NJ 08638

(732) 599-3475 (609) 771-1022

Commercial Lubricants Moove, LLC

229 Arlington Ave.

Staten Island, NY 10303

(718) 720-3434
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely that of, ROMEO ENTERPRISES; HOUGH
PETROLEUM CORP. and COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE, LLC be accepted. No
bids were received for Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 19, 20, 32 and 45. All no bid items will be rebid.

| NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY.

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Antifreeze, Oils and Lubricants for the
County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through March 15, 2023, a period
of one (1) year or until delivery is complete. The County reserves the right to extend the term

of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15 as follows:

March 16, 2022
March 16, 2022
n#: 2022000360




Res-Pg:m.2-
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 MARCH 16, 3825 g:m.2-3

A. ROMEO ENTERPRISES for two (2) items, to wit:

ITEMS NO. 34 and 35.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. HOUGH PETROLEUM CORP. for eight (8) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 8, 21, 22, 24, 39, 40, 46 and 47.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC for twenty eight (28)
items, to wit: .
ITEMS NO. 4,5,6,7,9, 11,12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 23, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 33, 36,
37, 38, 41, 42 and 44.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. The acceptance made in Paragraph 1, A through C, is made with the
understanding that the successful bidder(s) will enter into a written contract for the faithful
performance of their bid to supply Antifreeze, Oils and Lubricants in Ocean County during
the contract period. |

3. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2022-25.

6. Be it further resolved that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made
avéilable to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance, Vehicle

Services, and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Adopted on: March 16, 2022
Official Resolutign#: 2022000360




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

ROMEO ENTERPRISES

Res-Pg:m.2-4

Line item Description Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Transmission
Fluid, Amsoil
Signature Series
Synthetic Multi
Vehicle, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12-1
Quart
Containers/Case

$140.99

$704.95

Part #:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

Transmission 30
Fluid, Automatic
Amsoll Signature
Series Synthetic
ATF, Fuel
Efficient, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12-1
Quart
Containers/Case

\/A 35

CASE

$141.11

$4,233.30

HYDRAULIC FLUID

36 Hydraulic Fluid, 11
Tractor, Exxon
Mobil #111139
OR Chevron 1000
THF #226606, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum

DRUM

37 Hydraulic Fluid,
Tractor, Exxon
Mobil #100037
OR Chevron 1000
THF #226606, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, Bulk
Delivery

3,000

GAL

Introducedon:  March 16,2022

AdopteBRBPOSAL DOGHWBRRAZPORT
OfficialgtgsolreiFREEI22APEEAND LUBRICANTS
Page 18




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

HougH PETROLEUM CORP.

Res-Pg:m.2-5

tine ltem

Description

Engine Oil, Diesel
Mobil HDEO
15W-40 or Shell
Rotella T3 Fleet.
Oils must meet
Ford Specification
WSS-M2C171-F1,
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost
$673.75

$673.75

Shell T3 Fleet

Part #: Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Engine Oil, Diesel
Mobil HDEO
15W-40 or Shell
Rotella T3 Fleet.
Oils must meet
Ford Specification
WSS-M2C171-F1,
Virgin Stock, 6 - 1
Quart
Containers/Case

CASE

$24.99

$49.98

Shell T3 Fleet

Engine Oil,
Automotive,
Mobil Super SW-
30, GF-6, SP
Synthetic Blend,
OR Chevron
Supreme 5W-30
Motor Oil GF-86,
SP Synthetic
Blend, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum

15

DRUM

10

Synthetic Engine
0il, Chevron Delo
400 XLE, 10W-30,
55 gallon drum,
NO EXCEPTIONS

DRUM

Introduced on:

March 16, 2022

AdoptedrnpOSAL DA ERIRREPORT

Official s ol o e 42 B8 AND LUBRICANTS

Page 9




HouGgH PETROLEUM CORP. Res-Pg:m.2-6
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Brand: Part #: Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Petro-Canada
Supreme Full
Synthetic OW-20
OR Amsoil
Signature Series
Full Synthetic
OW-20 SP GF-6A
MS-6395, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
6-1Quart
Containers/Case

GREASE
21 Chassis Lube 15 CASE $155.00 $2,325.00 Shell Gadus S5V
Grease, Extreme 2202-10/14
Pressure (EP), oz. cartridges
Mobilith SHC220 per box

NLG| Grade 2 OR
Shell Gadus S5V
220 No. 2
#550036432, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stack, 12 -
0.38 kg/14 oz.
Cartridges/Case,
MUST Be
Packaged 4
Cartons of 10
Cartridges/Case

Introduced on: March 16,2022

AdopteBROPOSAL DOGLVIES REEPORT

Official iesolientik 122 981B80AND LUBRICANTS
Page 13




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

HouGgH PETROLEUM CORP.

Res-Pg:m.2-7

Line [tem

Description

Chassis Lube
Grease, Extreme
Pressure (EP),
Mobilith SHC220
NLGI Grade 2 OR
Shell Gadus S5V
220 No. 2
#550036432, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 110
Ib. Keg

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

$713.90

Total

$4,283.40

Brand:

Shell Gadus S5V
2202

Part #: Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:

23

Chassis Lube
Grease, Extreme
Pressure (EP),
Mobilith SHC220
NLGI Grade 2, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 400
Ib. Drum

10

DRUM

Chassis Lube
Grease, Extreme
Pressure (EP),
Shell Gadus SS
V220 No. 2
#550036432, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 400
Ib. Drum

DRUM

$2,396.00

$4,792.00

Shell Gadus S5
V2202

Introduced on:

March 16, 2022

Page 14

AdoptedROPOSAL DOBUNA AR RZBEPORT
OfficialgigsopePh 220808 AND LUBRICANTS




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

HOUGH PETROLEUM CORP.

Line item

38

Description

Hydraulic Fluid,
Castrol Dual
Range HV 68 or
Mobil Excel 68, 5
Gallon Pail, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

Quantity

Unit of Measure

PAIL

Unit Cost

39

Hydraulic Fluid,
Sheli Tellus
S2V68 or Mobil
Excel 68, 55
Gallon Drum, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

DRUM

$725.00

$725.00

Shell Tellus S2
VX 68

40

Hydraulic Fluid,
Shell Tellus
S2VX22 or Mobii
Excel 22, 55
Gallon Drum, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

DRUM

$935.00

$935.00

Shell Tellus S2
VX 22

41

Hydraulic Fluid,
Mobil DTE 10
Excel 32, 5 galion
pail , NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

15

PAIL

42

Hydraulic Fluid,
Wheelchair Lift,
Exxon/Mobil
Univis HVI 26, 5
gallon pail

10

PAIL

43

Hydraulic Oil,
Chevron Delo
Torque Force
Synthetic 5W-30,
55 gallon drum,
NO EXCEPTIONS

DRUM

Introducedon:  March 16,2022

Adopte®PB@POSAL DUG¢MENTREPORT

Official BesoluiaftR @RZ20WREIAND LUBRICANTS

Page 19
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Delivery, A.R.O.:




HouUuGH PETROLEUM CORP. Res-Pg:m.2-9
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Brand: Part #: Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Hydraulic Fluid,
Mobil Nuto H 46,
5 Gallon Pail, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

45 Hydraulic Oil, 5 DRUM X
Hitachi Super EX-
46HN, Zinc Free,
55 gallon drum,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)

/ 46 Ultra Pure DEF, 15 DRUM $254.65 $3,819.75 Colonial

Terracair by Chemical
Brenntag (MUST
BE 32.5% UREA
SOLUTION) OR
Blue Sky 32.5%
Diesel Exhaust
Fluid (DEF)
#30003 - 330,
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum, As
Specified, or
Equal

lntrodl,u;ecl_on.'____IMaJ:bh 16,2022
AdopteBROPOSAL DMVGEIH AN RGEPORT

OfficialiffgsoppiFk E2932A0MEAND LUBRICANTS
Page 20




HouGH PETROLEUM CORP. Res-Pg:m.2-10
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT \

Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

tine ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost i : : Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

\/ ’ Ultra Pure DEF, 10,000 GAL $3.09 $30,900.00 Colonial

Terracair by Chemical
Brenntag (MUST

BE 32.5% UREA
SOLUTION) OR
Blue Sky 32.5%
Diesel Exhaust
Fluid (DEF) Virgin
Stock, Bulk
Delivery, As
Specified, or
Equal **MUST Be
Able To Fill Tank
Using OPW2"
Stainless Steel
Adapter, SKU
OPW1672ANSS20

* Kk

Introduced-oni———March-16,-2022
AdopteBRBPOSAL DG B BREPORT

Official iasoePR 298208628 ND LUBRICANTS
Page 21




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC

Line Item Description Quantity

3 Antifreeze, Heavy 58
Duty, 50/50 Mix
with De-ionized
Water to meet
EC-1, Diesel Red,
OR Peak Final
Charge 50/50
Global ELC
#FXAOB3, MUST
BE COMPATIBLE
WITH ITEM 1A
ABOVE, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 1
Gallon Container

Unit of Measure

CONT

Unit Cost

Total

No Bid

Brand:

Part #:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

OlL
4 Engine Oil, Diesel, 4,000 GAL $12.88 $51,520.00 Exxon 105816 3 days As long as
\/ Mobil Delvac .
1300 Super CK-4, Mobil the
15W-40 OR .
rod
Chevron DELO P uctis
400 SDE 15W-40, not under
CK-4, NO
¢ rt

SUBSTITUTIONS, ShO age
Virgin Stock, Bulk
Delivery

5 Engine Oil, Diesel, 21 DRUM $765.07 $16,066.47 Exxon 122489 3 d ays As |0ng as
Mobil Delvac .
1300 Super CK-4, Mobil the
5W-40 OR .
Chevron DELO prOd uctis
400 SDE 15W-40, not under
CK-4 NO
SUBSTITUTIONS, Shortage
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum

Introducedon:  March 16, 2022

AdopteRRIDPOSAL DAOBUNHRT2REPORT
OfficialgRgsoMiPFRe 22V AnD LUBRICANTS
Page 3
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC

Res-Pg:m.

Confi

o
=]
(e)

N

Line item

Description

Engine O, Diesel,

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

$1,035.00

Brand:

122494

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

As long as

Mobil HDEO
15W-40 or Shell
Rotella T3 Fleet.
Oils must meet
Ford Specification
WSS-M2C171-F1,
Virgin Stock, 6-1
Quart
Containers/Case

Mobil Delvac X
1300 15W-40, Mobil the
CK-4 OR Chevron product is
Delo 400 SDE
15W-40, CK-4, not under
NO - shortage
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12 -
1 Quart
Containers/Case

7 Engine Oil, Diesel 1 DRUM $546.48 $546.48 Exxon 125150 3 days As Iong as

. / Mobil HDEO )

15W-40 or Shell Mobil the
Rotella T3 Fleet. product is
Oils must meet
Ford Specification not under
WSS-M2C171-F1, Shortage
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum

8 Engine Qil, Diesel 2 CASE

Introducedon:  March 16 2022
Adopte® REPOSAL DEIGLSMENZR2ZPORT

Official BrpoluRaiFR B8ZE0PAE0AND LUBRICANTS

Page 4
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC

Confide

Res-Pg:m.2-

Line Item

Description

Engine Oil,
Automotive,
Mobil Super SW-
30, GF-6, SP
Synthetic Blend,
OR Chevron
Supreme 5W-30
Motor Oil GF-6,
SP Synthetic
Blend, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum

Quantity
15

Unit of Measure

DRUM

Unit Cost
$605.00

$9,075.00

Mobil

124389

Delivery, A.R.O.:

3 days

Comments:

As long as
the
product is
not under
shortage

10

Synthetic Engine
Oil, Chevron Delo
400 XLE, 10W-30,
SS gallon drum,
NO EXCEPTIONS

DRUM

I 11

Engine Oil,
Automotive,
Mobil Super SW-
30, GF-6, SP
Synthetic Blend,
OR Chevron
Supreme 5W-30
Motor Oil GF-6,
SP Synthetic
Blend, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, Bulk
Delivery

2,000

GAL

$11.00

$22,000.00

Exxon
Mobil

124650

3 days

As long as
the
product is
not under
shortage

Introduced on:

March 16,2022

Adopte@ROPOSAL DUBLENMENRRRPORT

official giesoliianiR @22 APEPAND LUBRICANTS

Page 5
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

Res-Pg

Confidencial

'm.2-1

Line ltem

Description

Engine Qil,
Automotive,
Mobil Super 5W-
20GF-6,5P
Synthetic Blend
OR Chevron
Supreme 5W-20
GF-6 Synthetic
Blend, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

$605.00

Total
$1,210.00

Mobil

124388

Delivery, AR.O.:

3 days

Comments:

As long as
the
product is
not under
shortage

13

Engine Oil,
Automotive,
Mobil Super 5W-
20 GF-6, SP
Synthetic OR
Chevron
Supreme SW-20
GF-6 Sp
Synthetic, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, Bulk
Delivery

3,000 GAL

$11.00

$33,000.00

Exxon
Mobil

124645

3 days

As long as
the
product is
not under
shortage

14

Engine Qil,
Automotive,
Mobil Super 5W-
20 GF-6 SP
Synthetic Blend
OR Chevron
Supreme 5W-20
Motor Oil GF-6,
SP Synthetic
Blend, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 6-1
Quart
Containers/Case

20

CASE

$21.82

$436.40

Exxon
Mobil

124405

3 days

As long as
the
product is
not under
shortage

introduced on:

March 16_2022
Adopte®RAPOSAL DRIGIEMENZREPORT

Official BepoluNANR 2EZRINEOAND LUBRICANT
Page 6
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC

Res-Pg:

Confidencial
m.2-15

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Brand:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

'E‘c')'tz’;”ot:‘“‘c- Exxon 124315 |3 days As long as
Chevron Havoline Mobil the
Prods Synthetic :
5W-30 GF-6A SP p rOd uctis
OR Mobil 1 5W- not under
30 GF-6A, SP, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS, Shortage
Virgin Stock, 6- 1
Quart
Containers/Case
16 Full Synthetic 2 CASE $40.00 $80.00 Exx0 1

/ Motor Ol SW-20 Xxon 03008 3 days As long as
Chevron Havoline Mobil the
g?gssiyrgget'c product is
Mobil 1 5W-20 not under
GF-6A,SP, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS, Shortage
6-1Quart
Container/Case

17 Full Synthetic 5 DRUM $1,045.00 $5,225.00

Motor Ol 5W-20 Exxo'n 106075 3 days As long as
Chevron Havoline Mobil the
Prods Synthetic product is
Mobil 1 5W-20 not under
GF-6A, SP, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS, Shortage
55 Gallon Drum

Introducedoni— March 16,2022

AdopteQROPOSAL DM IBL'DREPO RT

Officialgigsolprei E2922080B6 AND LUBRICANTS
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Confidencial
COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC Res-Pg:m.2-16
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Brand: Part #: Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:

\/ Full Synthetic 1,000 $19.00 $1'9,OOO.OOV Exxon 110549 3 days As long as
Motor Oil, 5W-20 .
Chevron Havoline Mobil the

Prods Synthetic product is
GF-6 SP, OR

Mobil 1 5W-20 not under
GF-6A, SP, NO , shortage
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, Bulk
Delivery

e

19 Petro-Canada 5 DRUM X
Supreme Full
Synthetic OW-20
OR Amsoil
Signature Series
Full Synthetic
OW-20 SP GF-6A
MS-6395, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
55 Gallon Drums

20 Petro-Canada 15 CASE X
Supreme Full
Synthetic OW-20
OR Amsoil
Signature Series
Full Synthetic
OW-20 SP GF-6A
MS-6395, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
6-1Quart
Containers/Case

GREASE

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
AdoptegranpOSAL D@@‘WEN??@’O RT
Official fes oI PIER E2 22 0126 AND LUBRICANTS
Page 8
Confidencial




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC

Confidencial

Res-Pg:m.2-17

Line ltem Description

/ Chassis Lube

Grease, Extreme
Pressure (EP),
Mobilith SHC220
NLGI Grade 2, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 400
ib. Drum

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost
$3,064.00

$30,640.00

Exxon
Mobil

105431

Delivery, A.R.O.:

3 days

Comments:

Product
under
severe
shortage.
First
supply
might take
over 30
days

24 Chassis Lube 2
Grease, Extreme
Pressure (EP),
Shell Gadus S5
V220 No. 2
#550036432, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 400
Ib. Drum

DRUM

J e

Grease, Extreme 2
Pressure (EP), i
Mobilgrease
'XHP222 NLGI
Grade, Color:
Dark Blue OR
Chevron Delo
Grease EP 2
#235208 243, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 40-
114.10z.
Cartridges/Case,
MUST Be
Packaged 4
Cartons of 10
Cartridges/Case

CASE

$141.00

$282.00

Exxon
Mobil

121928

3 days

As long as
the
product is
not under
shortage

introd 0 ch-16, 2022

AdoptRRGPOSAL DOGASRBRTREPORT
OfficiafeslftinnRERPR2ABAND LUBRICANTS
Page 10
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COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD |
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

Confidencial

Res-Pg:m.2-18

Unit of Measure Unit Cost

tine [tem Description Quantity Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

\/ Grease, Extrt)ame $424.20 $848.40 Exxon 105841 3 days As long as
Pressure (EP), .
Mobilgrease Mobil the
XHP222 NLGI prOdUCt is
Grade, Color:
Dark Blue OR not under
Chevron DELO Shortage
Grease EP 2
#235208 625, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock,120
Ib. Drum
27 Grease, Mobilux 5 PAIL $121.50 $607.50 Exxon 105993 3 days As Iong as
\/ EP 23 OR )
Chevron Multifak Mohil the
EP 000 #274508 prOdUCt iS
565, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS, not under
Virgin Stqck, 5 shortage
Gallon Pail '
\/ 28 Grease, Moly 5 PAIL $152.00 $760.00 Exxon 106120 3 days As long as
Lithium for
Hydraulic Bridge Mobil the .
Maintenance, prod uctis
Mobilux EP 2, 5
Gallon Pail, NO not under
SUBSTITUTIONS shortage
/ ) 29 Gear Oil, 2 CASE $23.00 $46.00 Exxon 102514 3 days As long as
Mobilube HD Plus )
85W-140, API Mobil the
GL5; NO product is
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12-1 not under
Quart shortage
Containers/Case

Introduced on: March 168, 2022

AdoptRROPOSAL DOGUBHENGTZRERORT
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Page 11
Confidencial




Confidencial

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC -Pq- -
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.2-19

Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost : Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

\/f 30 Gear Oll, 2 DRUM $324.00 $648.00 - Exxon 102516 3 days As long as
Mobilube HD Plus )

85W-140, AP| Mobil the
GL5 OR Chevron product is
#223033 Delo

Gear EPS 85W- not under
140 625, NO shortage
SUBSTITUTIONS,

Virgin Stock, 120
ib. Drum

\/ 31 Gear Oil, . 6 CASE $180.00 $1,080.00 Exxon 102490 3 days As long as

Automotive, .
Limited Slip Mobil the
Application, product is
Mobil 1 Synthetic :

Gear Lubricant LS not under
75W-140, AP| GL-

5 OR Shell Shortage
Pennzoil
Platinum Axle
SAE 75W-140
#550042070, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12-1
Quart
Containers/Case

32 Gearbox Oil, 5 PAIL X
Chevron Meropa
1SO 220, 5 gallon
pail, NO
EXCEPTIONS

TRANSMISSION FLUID

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
Adoptp @POSAL DOMBICIE Af 20320RT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC

Res-Pg:

Confidencial

m.2-20

Line item

/ 33

Description Quantity

Transmission 20
Fluid, Automatic,
Mobil Delvac
Synthetic OR
Chevron (BASF}
Emgard 2805 ATF
{Meets TES-295
Warranty TI/EVO
0140 E), NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 55
Gallon Drum

Unit of Measure

DRUM

Unit.Cost
$852.50

Total

$17,050.00

No Bid

Brand:

Exxon
Mobil

Part #:

124620

Delivery, AR.O.:

3 days

Comments:

As long as
the
product is
not under
shortage

34 Transmission 5
Fluid, Amsoil
Signature Series
Synthetic Multi
Vehicle, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12-1
Quart
Containers/Case

CASE

35 Transmission 30
Fluid, Automatic
Amsoll Signature
Series Synthetic
ATF, Fuel
Efficient, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12-1
Quart
Containers/Case

CASE

HYDRAULIC FLUID

introduced on: March 16, 2022
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC

Res-Pg:

conmnaencids

m.2-21

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:
\/ 36 Hydraulic Fluid, 11 DRUM $576.73 $6,344.03 EXXO” 101139 3 dayS As Iong as
Tractor, Exxon .
Mobil #111139 Mobil the
OR Chevron 1000 prod uct is
THF #226606, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS, not under
Virgin Stock, 55 shorta ge
Gallon Drum
\/f 37 Hydraulic Fluid, 3,000 GAL $9.80 $29,400.00 Exxon 100037 3 days As long as
, Tractor, Exxon .
Mobil #100037 Mobil the
OR Chevron 1000 prod uct is
THF #226606, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS, not under
Virgin Stock, Bulk shortage
Delivery
A 38 Hydraulic Fluid, 1 PAIL $155.00 $155.00 Exxon 106130 3 days As long as
\A Castrol Dual i
) Range HV 68 or Mobil the
Mobil Ext{el 68, 5 product is
Gallon Pail, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS not under
shortage
39 IS-II:I:lrlaT\;lli;:uzluid, 1 DRUM $1,550.00 $1,550.00 Exxon 106129 3 days As long as
S2V68 or Mobil Mobil the
Excel 68, 55 product is
Gallon Drum, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS not under
shortage
40 is-ll’\\/:ﬁa_\;.l;:ruzluid, 1 DRUM $1,550.00 $1,550.00 Exxon 104032 3 days As Iong as
$2VX22 or Mobil Mobil the
Excel 22, 55 product is
Gallon Drum, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS not under
Introduced on: ' March 16, 2022 shortage
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' COMMERCIAL LUBRICANTS MOOVE LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD Res-Pg:m.2-22
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS ' '

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Delivery, AR.Q.: Comments:
\/ el ay:g;lgi;;lllgd, ' 15 PAIL $125.00. $1,875.00 Exxon 126496 3 days As long as
Excel 32, S gallon Mobil the
pall, NO product is
SUBSTITUTIONS ' d
not unaer
shortage
42 Hydraulic Flui'd, 10 PAIL $185.00 $1,850.00 Exxon 101660 3 days As long as
Wheelchair Lift, .
Exxon/Mobil ' Mobil the
Univis HVI 26, 5 product is
gellon pal not under
i : shortage
43 Hydraulic O, 5 DRUM X

Chevron Delo
Torque Force
Synthetic 5W-30,
55 gallon drum,

NO EXCEPTIONS
44 Hydraulic Fluid, 5 DRUM $45.00 $225.00 EXXOR 101574 3 days As Iong as
Mobil Nuto H 46, )
5 Gallon Pail, NO Mobil the
SUBSTITUTIONS . prOd uct is
not under
shortage
45 Hydraulic Oil, 5 DRUM X

Hitachi Super EX-
46HN, Zinc Free,
55 gallon drum,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)

Introduced on: March 16, 2022
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