Res-Pg:1.5-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari

Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Commissioner John P. Kelly

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

Tel: (732)929-2005
Fax: (732)505-1918

March 1, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED NO. Il to Mulberry Street

Italian Food Center, the lowest qualified bidder. No bids were receiv
19c¢, 20, 21, 22a, 22b, 22c, 23a, 23b, 23c, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28a, 28b,

ed on ltem Nos. 18a, 18b, 18c, 19a, 19b,
28c, 29a, 29b, 29c, 29d, 30a, 30b, 30c,

30d, 31a, 31b, 31c, 32a, 32b, 32c, 33a, 33b, 33c, 33d, 33e, 33f, 33g, 34 and 35. All no bid items will not be

rebid, as they were previously awarded. (B2023-39)

Official Resolution# [2023000331
Meeting Date 03/01/2023
Introduced Date 03/01/2023
Adopted Date 03/01/2023
Agenda ltem I-5

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-39
Result Adopted
COUNTY o PP R
COMMISSIONER | | ] :(é > g =
Joseph H. v v

Gary v v |v
Barbara Jo v v
Virginia E. v v

John P. v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guetoor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:l.5-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

CT\

RESOLUTION

March 1, 2023

WHEREAS, on February 7, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED NO. II

for the County of Ocean; and »
WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder

Mulberry Street Italian Food Center Four Seasons Diner LLC

474 Brick Blvd. 823 Fischer Blvd.

Brick, NJ 08723 Toms River, NJ 08753

(732) 477-4520 (201) 726-6257 -

;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, be accepted, namely that of, MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD
CENTER. No bids were received on item Nos. 18a, 18b, 18¢, 19a, 19b, 19¢, 20, 21, 22a, 22b,
22¢, 23a, 23b, 23c, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28a, 28b, 28c, 29a, 29b, 29¢, 294, 30a, 30b, 30c, 30d, 31a,
31b, 31c, 32a, 32b, 32¢, 33a, 33b, 33c, 33d, 33e, 33f, 33g, 34 and 35. All no bid items will
not be rebid, as they were previously awarded.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED NO. II for the
County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through January 17, 2024, or
until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the

term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

Introduced on: March 1, 2023
Adopted on: March 1, 2023
Official Resolutipn#: 2023000331




Introduced on:
Adopted on:

BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 MARCH 1, 828-Pg:1.5-3

MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER for forty three (43) items,

to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1a, 1b, 1c¢, 2a, 2b, 2c¢, 3, 4, 5a, 5b, 5¢, 6a, 6b, 6¢, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11a, 11b, 11¢, 12a,

12b, 12¢, 12d, 13a, 13b, 13c, 13d, 14a, 14b, 14c, 15a, 15b, 15¢, 16a, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 16¢, 16f,
16g and 17.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by
the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed
quantities shall be indicated. |

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-39.

4. Be it further resolved that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made
available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
and Mulberry Street Italian Food Center, the successful bidder.

March 1, 2023
March 1, 2023

Official Resoluti

W 2023000331




- MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER : Res-Pg:1.5-4
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT - -

Bid No. TBD ‘
MEALS, DELIVERED NO. |

8., Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bldders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package AH documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be date'd or-
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

- -Confirmed

9. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all reqwred documents to thls
. solicitation'must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed o {

PRICE TABLES
MEALS, DELIVERED NO. I

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Price No Bid Comments:

Measure
SECTION 1 - VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS-
* {BREAKFAST MENU

J/ la Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person o . ‘ EA $12;OO
\/ 1b \ Breakfast Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person . EA" $12.00

r - : : '

1c ‘| Breakfast Menu Io serve 76 or more people, price per person o EA - '$12.00 -
Introdue - =

o Mareh172023—
Adopte®BRIPOSAL DRIGKMENTAEPORT
Official Bpsalntiontis, 292BAPPRED NO. Il
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No, TBD

MEALS, DELIVERED NO. II,

. MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER

. Res-Pg:1.5-5

Introdu

SO AN

AL

Line ltem

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Price No Bid Comments:

LUNCH MENU
2a ‘ Lunch Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, pricé per person " EA $12.75
‘ 2b Lunch Menu'to serve 26 to 75; people, price per person .EA $12.75
- 2c Lunch Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per person ) EA $12.75
’LUI.\ICH OPTION-
37 Lunch Optfon - Svide Salads, price per person . EA $2.75 .
COLD BEVERAGE SERVICE )
4 Cold Beverage Service, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.50
HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE
Sa Hot Beverage Service to servé 1to 25 people, pri’ée per pe;rson EA 52.50
Sb Hot Beverage Service to se.rve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $2.56
5¢ Hot Bev.erage Service to serve 7'6 or more people, price per person EA $2.50
SELF;SERVE_ HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE |
Gé Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to ;erve 1 1o 25 people, price‘» per person EA $2.50
/_ 6b j Self-Serve Hot Beverage Sérvice to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $2.50
\/ 6¢ Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or m‘oré people, price per person - .EA ) $2.50

=Ueo

ced-on—Mareh-4
Adopted®BRIPOSAL DRIGdIVIENTREPORT
Official BegolNtonts, 292BAPERED NO. II
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K Introdueed-on———Mareh1,2023

MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER
'PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT )

Bid No. TBD
"MEALS, DELIVERED NO. Il

 Res-Pg:1.5-6

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Price No Bid Comments:
g Measure
ASSORTED PLATTERS ‘
\/' 7 Assorted Cheese & Cracker Platter, price per persoh (minirﬁum of 10 people) _ | 'EA - $5.00
\/ . 8 | As_sort-ed Cookie P|attér, pri;e per peréon (minimum of 10 people) ‘ EA - '$3.50
- \/, '9 . Assorted Vegetable Platter, price per person (minilem of 10 people) | : EA' $2.50
/ 10 Assorted Fruit Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) o EA $4.00
SECTION II - SHERIFF'S DEPARTMENT RADIOLOGICAL EMERGENCY RESPONSE PLAN (RERP). AND FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS UPON DECLARED STATE OF
EMERGENCY
BREAKFAST MENU
/ 1la Cold Breakfast, price per pel;So,n (minimum of 10 people) ' EA . $12.00
1;Lb Hot Breakfa’st, price per person (minimum of 10 people) o EA . $15.50 '
11c Self-Serve Hot Beverage, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.50 .
LUNCH MENU . ' - SR -
/ '1;a * | Cold Lunch, price per per‘son‘_(mi'nimum of 10 people) EA $12.75
/ 12b Hot Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 péople) ’ ' | - EA $15.50
| 12¢ Side Salad, price 'per person {minimum of 10 people) | l EA $2.75
f 12d Self-Serve Cold Beverégé, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $2.50
DINNER MENU P

AdopteBRAPOSAL D@GEHWEJ\EKEPO RT

Official fRgsofaEs, BIEIWA3E0 NO. 11
Page 7




| RRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER .
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT waf’?’ RY STT Fo Res-Pg:1.5-7

Bid No. TBD
-MEALS, DELIVERED NO. Ii

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Price No Bid Comments:
Measure

133 Cold Dinner, price per person (minimum of 10 people)

léb Hot Dinner, price per person {minimum of 10 people) : ’ . EA $16.50

13c Side Salad -price per person (rﬁinimum of 10 people)‘ EA $2.75 \
13d Self-Serve Cold Beverage price per person (mmlmum of 10 people) . ‘EA $2.50

PIZZA - EACH PIZZA SHALL SERVE TWO (2) PEOPLE

KA L AN

14a Large Plain Pie and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $9.50

145 - |large Pie with one (1) topping and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person {minimum EA $11.50 _
of 10 people) 4 . o

14c Large Pie with two (2) topplngs and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person (mlnlmum EA $13.00

- lof 10 people)

SECTION Il - JUVENILE SERVICES . - > o
WHOLE PI1ZZAS | )
\/ 15a | Large 16" Plain Cheese Pizza, No Toprpings, price pe.r .pizza ' _ EA . $17.00
15b Large 16" Cheese Eizza with one (1) Topping, price per pizza | EA - $20.00
. - _
15¢ Large 16" Cheese Pizza with two (2) Toppings, price per pizza EA $23.00°
" |SUBMARINE SANDWICHES
16a. 12" Turkey & Provelone Cheese ‘Submarin_e Sand\l;/ich, price per sandwich ' EA ' $14.50

Introdueed-on—Mareh1,2023

Adopte8RAPOSAL DG ENEQCEPO RT
Official fRgsofatien, BHII3H NO, ||
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" Bid No. TBD

 PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

MEALS, DELIVERED NO. Il -

" MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER

'Res-Pg:1.5-8

Line ltem

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Price No Bid Comments:

\/ 16b 12" Roast Béef & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $16.50
/ , 16¢ 12" Ham, Capicola & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA | $14.50
/ ,16d 12" Ham & American Cheese Su,bmaring Sandwiph, priqe per sandwich - EA $13.50 ’ i
/ 16e 12" Tuna Fish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich | EA ‘$14.50 |
16f 12" Chicken Salad Submarirré Sandwiclh, price per sandwich EA $16.50
\/ l6g 12" Assorted three (3) Cheese ,Submalrine Sandwich, priée per sandwich EA $12.00
V SALAD | . | -
17 Tossed Salad, price per person {minimum of 10 people) - ‘EA 52.75
SECTION V- KOSHER MEALS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS -
BREAKFAST MENU
18a Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA r;lo..Bid X
. . ) 5
18b Breakfast Menu to_ serve 26 to 75 people,. brice per person EA No Bid X
18c_ Breakfast Menu to ser_‘ve 76 or more people, price per person EA ‘No Bid X
LUNCH MENU - ’ / |
19a Lunch Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA No Bid X
i9b Lunch Menu to serve 26 to 75 people,,price per person EA No Bid - X

Intro +

dueed-om———Mareh1,-2023—
AdoptERSHOSAL DOGRRYHEN BRIPORT
OfficiaBRiesphrFars}: [RA2$QAREBINO. |)
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