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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Frank Sadeghi

08754-2191
Deputy Director Jennifier Bacchione (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Sam Ellenbogen
Commissioner Ray Gormley
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: March 25, 2026 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL to
Brick Wall Corporation; Britton Industries LLC; Eagles Lake Reserve, Inc.; Gibraltar Rock, Inc.; Mazza Mulich,
Inc.; and Stavola Construction Materials LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on ltem
Nos. 5, 12, 13A, 13B, 13C, 20C, 23A, 23B and 23C. Recommendation is made to reject ltem Nos. 2, 3, 11,
15A, 15B, 15C, 16A, 16B, 16C, 18A, 18B, 18C, 19A, 19B, 19C, 20A, 20B, 24A, 24B, 24C, 26A, 26B, 26C,
27A, 27B and 27C as unresponsive. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. (B2026-28)

Official Resolution# |2026000369
Meeting Date 03/25/2026
Introduced Date 03/25/2026
Adopted Date 03/25/2026
Agenda ltem n-6
CAF #
Purchase Req. # B2026-28
Result Adopted
COUNTY W W e
commIsSIONER |2 (2 13 [ ¥ |% |2
o |4 |2 (v (€ |2 |€
Sadeghi v v
Bacchione v v |v
Arace v v v
Ellenbogen v v
Gormley v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

WMichatie . Guatinor”

Clerk Of The Board
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o BIODL-23

RESOLUTION
March 25, 2026

WHEREAS, on February 10, 2026, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND
TOPSOIL for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at thé advertised time, responses were received from the
following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder

Britton Industries, Inc.
227 Bakers Basin Road
Lawrenceville, NJ 08648

Brick Wall Corporation
25 First Avenue Suite 200
Atlantic Highlands, NJ 07716

(732) 291-8100 (844) 274-8866

Eagles Lake Reserve, Inc. Gibraltar Rock, Inc.

355 Newbold Road 355 Newbold Road

Fairless Hills, PA 19030 Fairless Hills, PA 19030

(215) 295-0777 (215) 295-0777

Mazza Mulch, Inc. Stavola Construction Materials LLC
3230A Shafto Road 175 Drift Road

Tinton Falls, NJ 07753 Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

(732) 922-9292 (732) 542-2328

Herman’s Trucking, Inc. Mitchell Products LLC
181 Jacobstown Cookstown Road 1205 West Main Street
Wrightstown, NJ 08562 Millville, NJ 08332
(609) 758-3808 (856) 327-1205
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, be accepted, in each instance, namely that of BRICK WALL
CORPORATION; BRITTON INDUSTRIES, INC.; EAGLES LAKE RESERVE, INC.;
GIBRALTAR ROCK, INC.; MAZZA MULCH, INC.; and STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION
MATERIALS LLC. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 2, 3, 11, 15A, 15B, 15C,
16A, 16B, 16C, 18A, 18B, 18C, 19A, 19B, 19C, 20A, 20B, 24A, 24B, 24C, 26A, 26B, 26C,
27A, 27B and 27C as unresponsive. No bids were received on Item Nos. 5, 12, 13A, 13B,
13C, 20C, 23A, 23B and 23C. All rejected and no bid items will be rebid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Sand, Gravel, Stone and Topsoil for the
County of Ocean, for the contract period of one (1) year from April 15, 2026 through April
14, 2027 or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right

to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A: 11-15.

March 25, 2026
March 25, 2026
on#: 2026000369




| Res-Pg:n.6-3
. BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 MARCH 25, 2036

A. BRICK WALL CORPORATION for three (3) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 4, 6 and 8.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC. All orders placed through the cooperative must reference the
County Cooperative Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. BRITTON INDUSTRIES, INC. for one (1) item, to wit:

ITEM NO. 9.

C- EAGLES LAKE RESERVE, INC. for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 7,21A,21B and 21C.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC. All orders placed through the cooperative must reference the
County Cooperative Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. GIBRALTAR ROCK, INC. for eight (8) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 14A, 14B, 14C, 17A, 17B, 17C and 25A.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC. All orders placed through the cooperative must reference the
County Cooperative Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

E. MAZ7ZA MULCH, INC. for six (6) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 22A, 22B, 22C, 28A, 28B and 28C.

F. STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LLC for three (3) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 10, 25B and 25C.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC. All orders placed through the cooperative must reference the
County Cooperative Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.4, the County has established a reasonable
estimated maximum dollar value of $150,000.00 for the term of this contract, based on
historical procurement data for comparable goods or services. The County further reserves
the right to increase quantities by up to twenty percent (20%) of the maximum awarded

amount at the unit prices bid, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.3.

3. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital
accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Buildings & Grounds,

Parks Department and Road Department.

Introduced on: March 25, 2026
Adopted on: March 25, 2026
Official Resolution#: 2026000369




Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolu

- BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3

4. Payments for the materials and services to be acquired by these contracts

shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in

. accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of

Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase

t

Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

- and needed quantities shall be indicated.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

| vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2026-28.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance Department,

Buildings & Grounds, Parks Department, Road Department and the successful bidders.

March 25, 2026
March 25, 2026
on#: 2026000369

MARCH 25, Res-Pg:n.6-4




Res-Pg:n.6-5

[BRICK WALL CORP] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Confirmed .

14. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this

solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed -

_ * PRICETABLES T
SECTION | - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

Line [tem Quantity

Description

3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone 7 No Bid .
2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone v ' _ TON No 8id No Bid X
3 2" - 4" Goose Egg (round) Decorative Stone » TON No Bid No Bid X

u— 4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone ' 500 TON 5-’{6-00 $18,000.00
5 Crushed-Clam Shells for Ground Cover _ | o ' o | TON . No Bid No Bid X

v~ 6 3/8" Washéd Stone . 30 . TON . $34.00 | $1,020.00

' 7 Mason. Sand . 1,000 TON $14.50 $14,500.00

\4— 8 Sand Grits 50 TON $16.00 $800.00
9 Screened Topsoil ) 50 TON v$27>00 $1,350.00
" Introd : :

Adonoti3 RICK WALL (t\b 25 QP2NSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Offictaife = SRS RRRALSFONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 7



[BRITTON INDUSTRIES INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Res-Pg:n.6-6

Confirmed

14. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that-all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submlt a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your_bld.

Confirmed

Line Item

PRICE TABLES

SECTION I - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Comments:

1 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone 150 TON $39.50 $5,925.00

2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone 100 TON $54.95 | $5,495.00

3 2" - 4" Goose Egg (round) Decorati;/e Stone .TON No Bid _ No Bid X

4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone TON No Bid No Bid X

5 Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover TON No Bid No Bid - X

6 3/8" Washed Stone TON No Bid No 8id X

7 Mason Sand 1,000 TON $31.95 » $31,950.00

8 Sand Grits TON No Bid No Bid X~

‘// 9 Screened Topsoil 50 TON $18.50 $925.00 Price per CY

Introd

Adopte[BBATTON INCMISERIES, 2028 RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Th 252026

Officialfigsolixien#cRAFRPOZEDNE AND TOPSOIL

Page 7



[EAGLES LAKE RESERVE, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Res-Pg:n.6-7

Confirmed

14. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this

solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES.
SECTION | - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
1 | 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone TON No 8id No Bid X
2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone TON Np Bid No _Bid X
3 2"-4" G;Jose £gg {round) Decorative Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
5 Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover TON No Bid No Bid X
6 3/8" Washed Stone TON No Bid No Bid- X
\// 7 Mason Sand - 1,000 . TON $12.50 $12,500.00
8 Sand Grits TON No Bid No Bid X
9> Screened Topsoil TON No Bid No Bid X

Introduced-en:

Adopted RAGLES L

larch26,2026
LAALALELLE LR )/

t AMBRRES 2RAO26N C] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official R§%°'“§RN% 2RROAAEEr o NE AND TOPSOIL

Page 7



: , Res-Pg:n.6-8
[EAGLES LAKE RESERVE, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT )

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
16C ~ |3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 il TON No'Bid' X
17A 3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid X
178 |3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 2 - . TON No Bid X
17C  |3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 3 TON No Bid X
18A 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON " No Bid X
188 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X
18C 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
19A 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
198 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, {SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X
19C 80/20 Mix Top Dreséing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
20A GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 1 '
208 - GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE - TON No Bid - X
REQUIRED), Zone 2
20C GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON h No Bid : X
‘ REQUIRED), Zone 3 ' .
of_ 21A  |MasonSand, Zone 1 | TON $21.86
w218 Mason Sand, Zone 2 TON $22.34
Introduced on: March 25, 2026

AdOPtEC%E’RGLES LAKMR'E%QWEORQC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resoluficn¥: 202800036%5nE AND TOPSOIL

Page 9



-Res-Pg:n.6-9

[EAGLES LAKE RESERVE, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Iltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
W 21C  |MasonSand, Zone3 . ' TON $23.71
22A Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), ' TON No Bid X
Zone 1l
22B - |Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid X
Zone 2
22C Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid X
Zone 3
23A Sand Grits, Zone 1 ' TON No Bid X
238 - |Sand Grits, Zone 2 ~ TON No Bid X
23C Sand Grits, Zone3 - ' _ . TON No Bid X
24A Screened Topsoil, Zone 1 TON No Bid X
24B Screened Topsoil, Zone 2 s S TON No Bid X
24C  |Screened Topsoil, Zone 3 _ TON No Bid X
25A Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 ' TON No Bid X
258 Stone Dust {SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 . TON No Bid X
25C Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 ' TON No Bid X
26A White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 . TON $21.86
26B White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON $22.34

Introduced on: _____March 25 2026
AdoptefEG LES LAKEVRESRERY,EZQBRC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official gigsol QR c#IRFRPI3ONE AND TOPSOIL

Page 10




[GIBRALTAR ROCK, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPQRT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Res-Pg:n.6-10

Confirmed

14. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to thls

solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder-also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submlttmg a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Conflrmed

Line item

|+ 'PRICE TABLES: -

SECTION I - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Comments:

v 1 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone 150 TON 528_.50 $4,275.00
2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone TON NoBid | NoBid X
3 2" - 4" Goose Egg (round) Decorative Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone TON No Bid .No 8id X
) Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover TON No Bid No Bid X
6 ?/8" Washed Stone 30 TON $42.00 $1,260.00
7+ |Mason Sand \ TON No Bid No Bid X
8 Sand Grits TON No Bid No Bid X
9 Screened Topsoil TON No Bid No Bid X
Introducedon:————March25-2026

Adopte@@IBRALTAR AGE) REC2T2BSPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Besoltigpt: G‘f?&%‘["%‘*ﬁ’o NE AND TOPSOIL

Page 7



Res-Pg:n.6-11
[GIBRALTAR ROCK, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No 8id Comments:
Measure
10 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) ' 400 TON $25.00 $10,000.00
11 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) A ) TON .No Bid No Bid X
12 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS ) TON No Bid No Bid X

SECTION I - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
13A 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1 . TON | NoBid X
138 2"-5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 TON No Bid ‘ X
13C 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 A TON No Bid X
‘v/ 14A 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 1 TON $40.33
V/ 148 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 2 TON $41.4O
V/ 14C. 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 3 : TON $42.51
15A 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid X
158 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 2 ‘ TON No Bid X
15C 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 3 | ‘ ~ TON . | No Bid . X
16A 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1 . ‘ 7 TON No Bid X
16B 3/4" Delaware River_Stone, Zone 2 v TON No Bid X

“Introducedon:  March 25 2026
AdoptefiIBRALTAR RGEEh RSCPRIBSPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official gasoltiQi# cHR6RI035bNE AND TOPSOIL
Page 8




o Res-Pg:n.6-12
[GIBRALTAR ROCK, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT -

Bid No. TBD

SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 | TON
v/ 17A 3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 1 » TON 653.83 -
\/// 178~ |3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 2 TON $54.90
A~ 17C |3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 3 | TON $56.01
18A 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
188 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 ~ TON _ | Nosid | X
18C 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
19A 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
198 80/20 Mix Tob Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), ZOI.'IG 2 TON No Bid X
19C 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone ’3 TON No Bid X
20A GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 1 : .
208 GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 2
20C (GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE: TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3
21A Mason Sand, Zone 1 . TON No Bid X
21B Mason Sand, Zone 2 ' ' . ~ TON No Bid | oo
Introduced.on: March 25 _2026 -

Adopted®IBRALTAR M2 BECI@BSPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RepokiiRis: GHRASA03EPONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 9



Res-Pg:n.6-13
[GIBRALTAR ROCK, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

21C  |MasonSand, Zone3 o ~ TON No Bid X

22A Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No éid X
Zone 1l

22B Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid_ X
Zone 2 ’

22C Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON No Bid X
Zone 3 ' .

23A Sand Grits, Zone 1 | TON No Bid X

238 Sand Grits, Zone 2 ' ~ ' "~ TON No Bid X

23C  |Sand Grits, Zone 3 ‘ ' ' TON ~ No Bid X

24A Screened Topsoil, Zone 1 | B TON No Bid X

248 Screened Topsoil, Zone 2 - TON ‘No Bid X

24C Screened Topsoil, Zone 3 .. . TON No Bid X

\,/ 25A Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON $36.83

25B StonevDust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 - TON $37.90

25C Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone3 | TON $39.01

26A White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X

268 White Beac-h Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 | TON No Bid X

Introducedon: __March 25,2026
Adopted GHBRALTAR REfih 28ORESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official RegolyiR: GRASAP3EPONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 10 :




Res-Pg:n.6-14

[GIBRALTAR ROCK, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 ’ X
27A White Bunker Sand, As Specified; NO SUBSTITU;FIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
278 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid ’ X N
27C White Bunker Sénd, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
28A Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, (County User Department will Gua‘rantee 30 YARD No Bid X

Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 -

288 Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, (County User Department will Guarantee 30 YARD No Bid X
Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2

28C Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, (County User Department will Guaranteé 30 YARD - No Bid X
Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3

Introducedon:—__March 25 2026
Adopted®IBRALTAR MaGi) ZSIRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official BrsoliiRil: ARAGRI0SPONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 11




" Res-Pg:n.6-15
[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT ’

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

0C-02.10.26-MM,_Pay-to-Play.pdf

13. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

14. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

7 | . PRICETABLES =%~ = =
( SECTION | - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost i Comments:
Measure
1 - 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone ' ' TON No Bid No Bid X
2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone TON No Bid . No Bid X
3 2" - 4" Goose £gg (round) Decorative Stone ’ . TON No Bid No Bid X
4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone ] TON No Bid No Bid X
Introduced on: March 25, 2026
g?f?cr:: ¥ 0 lon ué@gc gg REEPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
3 S9RP3&Yone AnD TOPSOIL '

Page 7



. Res-Pg:n.6-16
[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD . v
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
5 Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover ’ TON No Bid No Bid X
6  |3/8" Washed Stone ‘ TON No Bid No Bid X
7 Mason Sand . A TON No Bid No Bid X
8 Sand Grits , ' | TON No Bid No Bid X
9 Screened Topsoil ' TON No Bid No Bid X
10 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) . . TON . No Bid No 8id X
11 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMbPiLE REQUIRED) ' " TON No Bid No 8id X
12 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, {SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS ; TON No Bid No Bid . X

SECTION Il - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

13A  |2"-5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1 S TON | NoBid - X
13B 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 v TON No Eid X
43¢ 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 TON No Bid X
14A 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 1 ; TO'NY No Bid X
148 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 2 TON No Bid X
14¢ 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 3 ' ’ TON No Bid | X
15A 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 1 : TJON N'o Bid X
Introd L

AdoptedidnzZA MULUBBEAINES] BEZPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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‘ _ Res-Pg:n.6-17
[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ,
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
15B 3/4" Decorative Red Stoné, Zone 2 ' 7 TON - No Bid X
15C 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 3 ] | TON No Bid X
16A 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone'1 : TON No Bid X
168 _ 3/4" De‘laware River Stone, Zone 2 . TON No Bid | X
16C 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 ' : TON " No Bid X
17’A 3/8" Washed' Stone, Zone 1 . ' TON No Bid X
178 |3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 2 | TON No Bid X
17C  |3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 3 . } TON No Bid X
18A 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 ‘ TON No Bid COX -
18B 70/30 Top Dressing Materi‘al, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X
18C 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 _ TON No Bid X
19A 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
198 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQU]RED), Zone 2 TON .NO Bid X
19C 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
20A GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
' REQUIRED), Zone 1 '

Introduced-er———March-25,2026
AdoptedAZZA MULREydNE5] 226°ONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Bigsolin:GRIRGRA0IGDNE AND TOPSOIL
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Res-Pg:n.6-18

[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘
SAND GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Description Unit of Unit Cost i Comments:
Measure

Line ltem

GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON _ No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 2 :
20C GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE TON No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3
21A - |Mason Sand, Zone 1 TON No Bid X
218 Mason Sand, Zone 2 ’ TON No Bid X
21C Mason Sand, Zone 3 TON No Bid . X
/ 22A Playgrbund irimber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON $23.50 cy
V Zone 1
/ 22B Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {(SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON ' $23.50 ' cY
Vi Zone 2
/ 22C Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), TON $23.50 cy
¥ Zone 3
23A Sand Grits, Zone 1 TON No Bid X
238 |Sand Grits, Zone 2 | ' TON NoBid - X
23C Sand Grits, Zone 3 TON No Bid X
24A Screened Topsoil, Zone 1 ‘ ' TON No Bid X
248 Screened Topsoil, Zone 2 ‘ TON No Bid X
24C Screened Topsoil, Zone 3 ' ' ' TON No Bid X

Introduced-on:——— _March 25,2026
AdoptedMiZZA MUURDBEIINES] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Besokitiqnf: 20868993 bNE AND TOPSOIL
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_ Res-Pg:n.6-19
[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
“SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

Line ltem Description

Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1
25B Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 . _ TON No Bid X
25C Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 | TON No Bid X
26A White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 | TON ‘ No Bid X
268 White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 » TON No Bid - X
26C  |White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON NoBid X
27A White Bunker Sar;d, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPL}E REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON‘ No Bid X
278 - White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X
27C White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
/ 28A Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, {County User Department will Guarantee 30 YARD -$18.00
v Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1
/‘ 28B Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, (County User Department wnII Guarantee 30 YARD $18.00
% ‘ Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2
L 28C Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, (County User Department will Guarantee 30 YARD $18.00
V] ‘ |Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3

Introduced-on———Mareh25,-2026
Adopted[BZZA MUnEGchE, 2BESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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[STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Res-Pg:n.6-20

tine ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
7 Mason Sand TON No Bid No Bid X
8 Sand Grits TON - No Bid No Bid X
9 Screened Topsoil TON No Bid No Bid X
\«/ 10 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) 400 TON $21.50 /$8,600.00
11 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) » TON No Bid No Bid X
12 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS TON No Bid No Bid X

SECTION Il - FURNISHING; LOADING AND DELIVERY

No Bid

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost Comments:
Measure
13A 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1 TON " No Bid
138 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 TON No Bid
13C 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 TON No Bid
14A  |3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid
14B 5/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 2 TON No Bid
14C 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 3 TON No Bid
15A° 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 1 TON No Bid
158 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 2 TON No Bid

Introduced on:

Adopted
Official
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- [STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘ o
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Res-Pg:n.6-21

Line Item

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

\// 25B Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON $33.25
% ‘ 25C Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON $32.25
26A White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
268 White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X
26C Whitg Beach Sand, {SAMPLE RfQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
27A White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 TON No Bid X
278 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE »REQUIRED), Zone 2 TON No Bid X
27C White-Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, tSAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 TON No Bid X
28A Bla_ck Root MuIéh,DoubIe Shredded, (County User Department will Gugrante'e 30 YARD No Bid X
Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1
28B Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, {County User Department will Guarantee 30 YARD No Bid X
Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 -
28C Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, (County Use_r Department will Guarantee 30 YARD | No Bid . X
Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3

Introduced on:
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