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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director John P. Kelly

] o ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Virginia E. Haines Tel: (732)929-2005
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea Fax: (732)505-1918
Commissioner Gary Quinn
Commissioner Joseph H. Vicari
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: November 16, 2022 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTION
DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE to Action Uniform Co., LLC, the lowest qualified bidder. (B2022-140)

Official Resolution# [2022001586
Meeting Date 11/16/2022
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON
Michaie \. Guaoor”

Clerk Of The Board



- Res-Pg:m.2-2

GONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

November 16, 2022

, WHEREAS, on September 20, 2022, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR THE
CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF’S OFFICE for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Action Uniform Co., LLC Uniform Warehouse, Inc.
1500 S. New Road 20701 Nordhoff Street
Pleasantville, NJ 08232 ' Chatsworth, CA 91311

(609) 573-5462 (818) 341-1500

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, be accepted, namely
that of, ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Uniforms for the Corrections
Department and Sheriff’s Office for the County of Ocean, for the contract period of one (1)
year from date of award through November 15, 2023, or until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to
N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

Introduced on| November 16, 2022
Adopted on: November 16, 2022
Official Resolﬂion#: 2022001586




Introduced on:

Res-Pg:m.2-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 NOVEMBER 16, 2022

ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC for two hundred seventy two (272) items, to

wit:

ITEM NOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24,
25, 26a, 26b, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34a, 34b, 35a, 35b, 36, 37a, 37b, 38a, 38b, 39a, 39b,
40,41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64,
65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89,
90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110,
111,112,113,114,115,116,117,118, 119, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129,
130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137, 138, 139, 140, 141, 142,143, 144, 145, 146, 147, 148,
149, 150, 151, 152, 153, 154, 155, 156, 157, 158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164, 165, 166, 167,
168, 169, 170, 171, 172, 173, 174, 175, 176, 177, 178, 179, 180, 181, 182, 183, 184, 185, 186,
187,188, 189, 190, 191, 192, 193, 194, 195, 196, 197, 198, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205,
206, 207, 208, 209, 210, 211, 212, 213, 214, 215, 216, 217, 218, 219, 220, 221, 222, 223, 224,
225,226,227,228, 229,230,231, 232,233,234, 235, 236, 237, 238, 239, 240, 241, 242, 243,
244,245, 246,247, 248, 249, 250, 251, 252, 253, 254, 255, 256, 257, 258, 259, 260, 261, 262,
263, 264, 265 and 266. For a Total Lump Sum Award of Section I (Item #'s 1 - 40) of
$109,974.00. For a Total Lump Sum Award of Section II (Item #'s 41 - 65) of $106,196.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Award of Section III (Item #'s 66 - 80) of $84,627.00. For a Totall
Lump Sum Award of Section IV (Item #'s 81- 118) of $174,678.00. For a Total Lump Sum
Award of Section V (Item #'s 119 - 135) of $34,650.00. For a Total Lump Sum Award of
Section VI (Item #'s 136 - 227) of $897,300.00. For a Total Lump Sum Award of Section VII
(Item #'s 228 - 254) of $160,300.00. For a Total Lump Sum Award of Section VIII (Item #'s
255 -265) of $71,250.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the services shall be available within the following funding
Sources: County Corrections Department and Sheriff’s Office O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2022-140.

5. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of
Finance, County Corrections Department and Sheriff’s Office and Action Uniform Co., Inc.
the successful bidder.

November 16, 2022
November 16, 2022

ipn#: 2022001586

Official Resolu




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC - Res-Pg:m.2-4

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
SECTION | - UNIFORMS FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price i Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Trousers, Class | $125.00 $3,500.00
| A As Specified,
or Equal

2 Long Sleeve 28 EA $78.00 $2,184.00 ELBECO 319N
Shirt, Class A As
Specified, or
Equal

3 Collar Insignia 28 EA $32.00 $896.00 S&W CUST
As Specified, or
Equal

3 Season Jacket 28 EA $189.00 $5,292.00 FECH 59130WP
As Specified, or
Equal

5 Field Jacket with 28 EA $79.00 $2,212.00 ROTHCO M65
Liner, M-65 BDU
Style As
Specified, or
Equal

6 Softshell Fleece 28 EA $159.00 $4,452.00 BLAUER 4660
Jacket As
Specified, or
Equal

NSNS S S

introduced.on: Novemher 16,2022

Adopted PROPOSAL DOGAMBENTBREFRRT

Official RepplugiRiifo RAA3GRFHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
Page 5




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC Res-Pg:m.2-5

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Parka As
Specified, or
Equal

28 EA $299.00 $8,372.00 5.11

8 BDU Trousers, 56 PR $85.00- $4,760.00 FECHH 49300NJFB
Class CAs
Specified, or
Equal

9 Short Sleeve 54 EA ’ $85.00 $4,590.00 FECHH 85R5826
BDU Shirt, Class
C As Specified,
or Equal

10 Long Sleeve 48 EA $79.00 $3,792.00 ELBECO K5138
Polo Shirt, Class
D As Specified,
or Equal

11 BDU Pants, Rip- 50 PR $69.00 $3,450.00 PROPPER F5252
Stop As
Specified, or
Equal

12 Tactical Pants As 50 PR $79.00 $3,950.00 . ELBECO ES702R
Specified, or
Equal

13 Tactical Pants As 50 PR $72.00 $3,600.00 5.11 74273
Specified, or
Equal

14 Tactical Polo, 75 EA $79.00 $5,925.00 ELBECO K5134
Short Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

NSNS S s S S S

Introducedon: __ November 16 2022 . ] ) -
Adopted PROPOSAL DOZEMPENTBREF2RT

Official RerolutiR#HRIARMH B HE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
Page 6 '




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC ‘ Res-Pg:m.2-6

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTI\/IENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

15 Tactical Polo,
Long Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

$79.00 $5,925.00 ELBECO

16 Tactical Boots, . 28 PR $199.00 $5,572.00 5.11 12110
As Specified

17 Raincoat As 28 EA $115.00 $3,220.00 PETRARQC LRC48RV
Specified, or
Equal

18 Rain Pants, 48 PR $69.00 $3,312.00 PETRAROC BKPP-LG
Unisex As '
Specified, or
Equal

19 Sentry R-801 48 EA $75.00 $3,600.00 KEYSTONE 0376
Pershing
Uniform Cap As
Specified, or
Equal

20 Uniform Cap, As 28 EA $24.00 $672.00 GALLS HW729
Specified :

21 Uniform Cap, As 28 EA $32.00 $896.00 YOUPONG 00061
Specified

22 Plastic Hat 48 EA $15.00 $720.00 KEYSTONE COVER-1
Cover for Sentry
R-801 Pershing
Uniform Cap As -
Specified, or
Equal

oAl N SN SN S

23 Long Sleeve 48 EA $39.00 $1,872.00 VF VFST5CK
Khaki Twill Shirt

As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-or— N be162022

Adopted BROPOSAL mmsweaﬁm RT .
Official RggplutiRnFHO RAABYEDFEGHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF S OFFICE
Page 7




Introduced-on:

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC

Res-Pg:m.2-7

UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem

Description

Khaki Twill
Trousers As
Specified, or
Equal

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

$1,872.00

No Bid

Manufacturer

Style/Model#
PT26KH

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

25

Watch Cap As
Specified, or
Equal

48

EA

$14.00

$672.00

SANMAR

6104

26a

Clip-On Neck Tie
As Specified, or
Equal

40

EA

$15.00

$600.00

S. BROOME

90010-63

26b

Clip-On Neck Tie
As Specified, or
Equal

36

EA

$9.00

$324.00

S. BROOME

90010-63

Name Tag As
Specified, or
Equal

40

EA

$13.00

$520.00

ACTION

CUST.

28

- | Tie Bar As

Specified, or
Equal

40

EA

$34.00

$1,360.00

S&W

CUST.

29

Training Belt As
Specified, or
Equal

24

EA

$26.00

$624.00

ROTHCO

60390

30

Leather Belt As
Specified, or
Equal

76

EA

$24.00

$1,824.00

PF

6001

31

J
J
J
J
S
y
/
/
J

Tactical Belt As
Specified or
Equal

50

EA

$35.00

$1,750.00

BISON

Be4

62022

Page 8

4
Novembet 1O, ZU

Adopted BROPOSAL D@WEM’I{;BM RT
Official RgrPLEANED REAROOHIBFHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC Res-Pg:m.Z-a

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line item Déscription Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Modeli#  Delivery, A.R.Q. Comments

32 Electronic 24 EA $199.00 $4,776.00
Hearing
Protector, As
Specified

TACS500

33 Alta Bat, As 24 EA $69.00 $1,656.00 5.11 G8444
Specified

34a Crew Neck T- 36 EA $22.00 $792.00 HANES 5180
Shirt As
Specified, or
Equal

34b Crew Neck T- 36 EA $22.00 $792.00 : HANES 5180
Shirt As
Specified, or
Equal

35a Gym Shorts As 36 PR $24.00 $864.00 AUGUSTA 990
Specified, or
Equal

35b Gym Shorts As 36 PR $24.00 $864.00 AUGUSTA 990
Specified, or ’
Equal

36 Baseball Cap As 36 EA $16.00 $576.00 FLEX PRO 6677
Specified, or
Equal

37a Long Sleeve 36 EA $27.00 $972.00 JERSEY 562M
Crew Neck
Sweat Shirt As
Specified, or
Equal

Ol <0 “U SO~

Introduced-on: November46,2022

Adopted IROPOSAL MIGEHENTEREPRRT
Official RgpplutipmFORAAZAIDRESHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
Page 9




ACTION UNIFORM CO.. IIC Res-Pg:m.2-9

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Long Sleeve
Crew Neck
Sweat Shirt As
Specified, or
Equal

-$972.00

38a

Pull-Over Sweat
Shirt, Hooded
As Specified, or
Equal

36

EA

$29.00

$1,044.00

JERSEY

996MR

Pull-Over Sweat
Shirt, Hooded
As Specified, or
Equal

36

EA

$29.00

$1,044.00

JERSEY

996MR

39a

Sweat Pants As
Specified, or
Equatl-

36

PR

$25.00

$900.00

JERSEY

973M

39b

Sweat Pants As
Specified, or
Equal

36

PR

$25.00

$900.00

JERSEY

973M

/

/!
S
/

/

/

40

Cargo Bag As
Specified, or
Equal

36

EA

$42.00

$1,512.00

ROTHCO

| BG687

TOTAL

$109,974.00

Introducedron:

SECTION II - UNIFORMS FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS EMERGENCY RESPONSE TEAM (CERT)

cIMDeT IU, 2V

Adonted BROPOSAL NOFMIENE HOBORT

Official RB&IUtINHORNEOGROIHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD |
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO..

[1C

Res-Pg:m.2-10

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid

Field Jacket with
Liner As
Specified, or
Equal

$2,256.00

Manufacturer

Style/Model#

Comments

42 Stretch Fit Cap 50 EA $28.00
As Specified or
Equal

$1,400.00

UA

FRIEND OR FOE

43 Tactical Polo, 24 EA $79.00
Long Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

$1,896.00

ELBECO

K5148

44 Tactical Polo, 24 EA $79.00
Short Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

$1,896.00

ELBECO

K5138

45 Tactical Long 24 EA $79.00
Sleeve As
Specified, or
Equal

$1,896.00

5.11

RAS

46 Tactical Outer 24 EA
Carrier As
Specified, or
Equal

$320.00 $7,680.00

GH

BY559

47 Tactical Pants As 24 PR $69.00
Specified, or
Equal

$1,656.00

TRUSPEC

24-7

48 Tactical Boots 48 PR
As Specified, or
Equal

$199.00 $9,552.00

ROCKYALPHA

2098

49 Tactical Carrier 24 EA
As Specified, or
Equal

$355.00 $8,520.00

\'\\\‘\\&&,\

Introduced-on: ember-46-2022

GH

TOC

AdoptedRfHOPOSAL DQ%&M;ENT&RE@QRT
Official RetgolutiqiH RRZZIVR8BHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
Page 11




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC Res-Pg:m.2-11

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description

Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price

No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Tactical Vest As
Specified, or
Equal

$979.00 $23,496.00

51 Raincoat As 24 EA $99.00 $2,376.00 "|LAWPRO M703
Specified, or
Equal

52 Watch Cap As 24 EA ' $35.00 $840.00 S.11 89250
Specified, or
Equal

53 Gloves As 24 PR $55.00 $1,320.00 5.11 89774
Specified, or
Equal

54 Balaclava As 24 EA $34.00 $816.00 BLACK HAWK 333002
Specified, or
Equal

55 Flight Suit As 24 EA $199.00 $4,776.00 TRUSPEC 27P
Specified, or
Equal

56 Knee Pads As 24 PR $69.00 $1,656.00 BLACKHAWK 8800
Specified, or .
Equal

57 Forearm Pads 24 PR $69.00 $1,656.00 DAMACUS FP10
As Specified, or
Equal

58 Elbow Pads As 24 PR $69.00 $1,656.00 BLACK HAWK 802600
Specified, or .
Equal

59 - Shin Guards As 24 PR $69.00 $1,656.00 GALLS TE222
Specified, or - 8
Equal

Introduc T N

Adopted BROPOSAL ,@;@RT

Official RBsghiutidtFEORIENECHRE HE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
Page 12




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC Res-Pg:m.2-12

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description Est, Qty. Unit of Meas. ‘Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Ballistic Helmet $525.00 $12,600.00 PASGET NIJ0106
As Specified, or | A
Equal

As Specified, or

/ . 61 Tactical Holster 48 EA $249.00 $11,952.00 SAFARILAND 604
Equal

62 Aerosol Holder 24 EA $49.00 $1,176.00 - TRUSPEC 9030
As Specified, or
Equal

As Specified, or

/ 63 Handcuff Case 24 EA $32.00 $768.00 ) TRUSPEC 9035
Equal

64 Duty Belt As 24 EA $75.00 $1,800.00 SIERRABRAVO 901060
Specified, or
Equal

~

Specified, or

/ 65 Belt Keepers As 60 EA $15.00 $900.00 5.11 27441
Equal

TOTAL $106,196.00

SECTION Ill - UNIFORMS FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS COMMUNITY EDUCATION/WORK CREW

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid

Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Fleece Jacket As EA $159.00

Specified, or Equal

$3,816.00

/

, / 67 Parka As Specified, 24 EA $299.00 $7,176.00 5.11 48001
or Equal

Introduced-on: vember |0, 202
Adopted BROPOSAL &QC&JMEME R:ﬁﬂ@ RT
Official RePIUUPHFORIAZOPOFBEHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC

Res-Pg:m.2-13

Line ltem

Description

Tactical Boots, Men
and Women As
Specified, or Equal

Est. Qty.
48

Unit of Meas.

PR’

Unit Price

$189.00

Total Price

$9,072.00

No Bid

Manufacturer

Style/Madel#

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

69

Tactical Boots As
Specified, or Equal

48

PR

$220.00

$10,560.00

ROCKY

2080

70

Badge Case As
Specified, or Equal

24

EA

$22.00

$528.00

STRONG

71300

71

Holster As
Specified, or Equal

50

EA

$199.00

$9,950.00

SAFARILAND

7367

72

Double Stack
Magazine Holder
As Specified, or
Equal

50

EA

$54.00

$2,700.00

511

90441

73

Magazine/Handcuff
Combo Pouch As
Specified, or Equal

50

EA

$75.00

$3,750.00

FOBUS

CUG1045

74

Magazine/Cuff
Combo Pouch As
Specified, or Equal

50

EA

$75.00

$3,750.00

AKER

519

75

Duty Belt As
Specified, or Equal

75

EA

$89.00

$6,675.00

LAWPRO

LP672

76

Holster As
Specified, or Equal

50

EA

$299.00

$14,950.00

SAFARILAND

73600

77

Magazine Pouch As
Specified, or Equal

50

EA

$65.00

$3,250.00

SAFARILAND

6044

78

Handcuff Case As
Specified, or Equal

S0

EA

$65.00

$3,250.00

SAFARILAND

6045

Introdu T 19
Adopted%‘%g PosaL m@%ﬁﬁiﬁm

Official RRisbiUbNIEOROA2RASBEHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
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Res-Pg:m.2-14
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC 9

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Description Est.Qty. ~ Unit of Meas. unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Line Item

Aerosol Agent Case
As Specified, or
Equal

$3,250.00 SAFARILAND

80 Belt Keeper As S0 EA $39.00 $1,950.00 SAFARILAND 6077-4
Specified, or Equal

SO

TOTAL $84,627.00

SECTION IV - UNIFORMS AND EQUIPMENT FOR THE OCEAN COUNTY FIRE MARSHAL'S OFFICE

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price

Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

8l Uniform 16 PR $125.00 $2,060.00 FECHH 47280
Trousers, As

Specified, or
Equal

82 Uniform Suit, 14 EA $898.00 $12,572.00 HOPE CUSTOM
Class A, As
Specified, or
Equal

83 Uniform Long 12 EA $89.00 $1,068.00 FECHH 35W5400
Sleeve Shirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

84 Uniform Short 12 EA $89.00 $1,068.00 FECHH 85R5400
Sleeve Shirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

SOSS S

/ 85 Dress Hat, As 35 PR $129.00 $4,515.00 KEYSTONE CUSTOM
Specified, or
Equal

Introducedony T~ November 16,2022

AdoptedfHoPOSAL B bitiaMeREGAIRT

Official REslolufidifO RR2Z2FIIBSBHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC

Res-Pg:m.2-15

UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line [tem

Description

Uniform Black
Tie, As
Specified, or
Equal

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price No Bid
$525.00

Manufacturer

S. BROOME

Style/Model#t

Comments

90072

87

Tie, Clip On, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$9.00

$315.00

S. BROOME

90001

88

Unform Men's
Boots, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$179.00

$6,265.00

BATES

E00056

89

Tactical Side Zip
Boots, Men's, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

PR

$155.00

$5,425.00

BATES

E03184

90

Uniform Shirt,
Class B, Long
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$99.00

$3,465.00

72344

91

Uniform Shirt,
Class B, Short
Sleeve, As
Specified or
Equal

35

EA

$99.00

$3,465.00

5.11

71883

92

O S~ S sl O

Uniform Pants,
Class B, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

PR

$94.00

$3,290.00

511

74338

Introduci .
Adopted BROPOSAL 1@,@%02{9”

Official RBabutidHEOBOASOBOFBEHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Res-Pg:m.2-16

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Style/Model#
Uniform Shirt, $3,290.00
\/ Fire Training,
Long Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

94 Uniform Shirt, 35 EA $94.00 $3,290.00 5.11 71391
Fire Training,
Short Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

95 Uniform Pants, 35 PR $99.00 $3,465.00 ‘ 511 74509
Fire Training, As
Specified, or
Equal

96 Belt, Tactical, As 35 EA ] $35.00 $1,225.00 BISON B64
Specified, or
Equal

Garrison, As
Specified, or
Equal

98 Polo Shirt, Short 35 EA $79.00 $2,765.00 TRUSPEC 4415
Sleeve, As .

Specified, or
Equal

99 Polo Shirt, Long 35 EA $79.00 $2,765.00 S5.11 72049
Steeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 97 Belt, Leather 35 EA $24.00 $840.00 PF 6001

100 Field Jacket, As 35 EA $79.00 $2,765.00 ROTCHO M65
Specified, or
Equal

Introdu T

AdoptedOROPOSAL #:B%Z;RT

Official Risbiutibil#O B02SAS8EHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO.. LLC Res-Pg:m.2-17

Line ltem Unit of Meas. Total Price

Description Est. Qty.

Unit Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#

Job Shirt, As 35 EA $105.00 $3,675.00 511 72314
Specified, or
Equal

Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

101

102 Heavy Weight 35 EA $28.00 $980.00 GILDEN GRO0O0O

“T" Shirt, Short ’
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

103 Heavy Weight 35 EA $30.00 $1,050.00 GILDEN G2400
"T" Shirt, Long
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

104 Mock 35 EA $40.00 $1,400.00 BLAUER 8810X
Turtleneck, As
Specified, or
Equal

105 Uniform Parka, 35 EA $389.00 $13,615.00 . 5.11 48512
As Specified, or
Equal

106 Uniform Parka, 35 EA $399.00 $13,965.00 5.11 48512
Tall, As
Specified, or
Equat

107 High Visibility 35 EA $399.00 $13,965.00 5.11 48073
Parka, As
Specified, or
Equal

108 - | Response 35 EA $205.00 $7,175.00 5.11 48016
Jacket, As
Specified, or
Equal

BiBposaL REVTVENE %QQRT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO.. 11C

Res-Pg:m.2-18

Line ltem

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

Manufacturer

Style/Model#

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

109

Ball Cap, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$45.00

$1,575.00

UA

1330607

110

Gear Bag, AMP
24, As Specified,
or Equa!l

35

EA

$205.00

$7,175.00

511

56393

111

Gear Bag, Style
#2, As Specified,
or Equal

35

EA

$199.00

$6,965.00

5.11

56176

112

Gear/Equipment
Bag, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$205.00

$7,175.00

5.11

56955

113

Clothing Duffle,
As Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$179.00

$6,265.00

56294

114

Turnout Gear
Bag, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$199.00

$6,965.00

5.11

56295

115

Long Gear Bag,
As Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$199.00

$6,965.00

5.11

56177

116

Open Gear Bag,
As Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$99.00

$3,465.00

5.11

56691

117

Turnout Gear
Duffle, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$205.00

$7,175.00

CAMS

30186

ERDPosAL WIIVENEREORT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT _ ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC ‘ Res-Pg:m.2-19

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

118 Fire Marshall $5.00 $750.00
Patch, As

Specified

TOTAL $174,678.00

SECTION V - RECRUIT UNIFORMS AND ACCESSORIES FOR THE SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ftem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
\/ 119 Black Leather 50 PR $79.00 $3,950.00 ROTHCO 5085

Oxford Shoes,
As Specified, or
Equal -

Tie, As
Specified, or
Equal

/ 120 Clip-On Neck 50 EA $9.00 $450.00 S. BROOME 90010

121 Leather Belt, As .50 EA $24.00 $1,200.00 PF 6001
Specified, or
Equal

122 Name Plate, As 50 EA $13.00 $650.00 ACTION CUST
Specified or
Equal

AN

123 Watch Cap, As 50 EA $14.00 $700.00 SANMAR 6104
Specified, or
Equal

/ 124 Baseball Cap, As 50 EA $15.00 $750.00 YOUPONG 00061
Specified, or
Equal

Adopted T 0SAL QOCINENE B EORT
Official RBDuliEORM oG ¢Had HE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

ACTION UNIFORM CO__11C

UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Res-Pg:m.2-20

Line [tem Description Est. Qty.

125 Long Sleeve 50
Khaki Twill Shirt,
As Specified, or

Equal

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price No Bid Manufacturer

$1,950.00

Style/Model#

Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

126 Khaki Twill 50
Trousers, As
Specified, or -
Equal

PR

$39.00 $1,950.00 VF

PT62KH

127 Gym Shorts, As 50
Specified, or
Equal

PR

$24.00 $1,200.00 AUGUSTA

9900

128 Crew Neck T- 50
Shirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$22.00 $1,100.00 HANES

5180

129 Sweat Pants, As 50
Specified, or
Equal

PR

$25.00 $1,250.00 JERSEY

562

130 Long Sleeve 50
Crew Neck
Sweat Shirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$27.00 $1,350.00 JERSEY

973M

131 Tactical Pants, 50
As Specified, or
Equal

PR

$69.00

$3,450.00 PROPPER

F52525

132 Waterproof 50
ECWCS Parka,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

I N

EA

$119.00 $5,950.00 TRUSPEC

2027

Adopteq BADPOSAL WOTTTHENEFSHDRT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ' :
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO_. 11C Res-Pg:m.2-21

/ 134 Microfleece 50 EA $55.00 $2,750.00 TRUSPEC 2437

/ 135 Tactical Gloves, 50 PR © 542,00 $2,100.00 ROTHCO 3450

~

/ 138 Shoulder Strap, 75 EA $89.00 $6,675.00 DON HUME s110

Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
$3,900.00

Line ltem

Waterproof
ECWCS
Trousers, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

. |Jacket Liner, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

As Specified, or
Equal

TOTAL $34,650.00

SECTION VI - UNIFORM EQUIPMENT & ACCESSORIES FOR THE SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Leather Belt, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

$5,175.00 DON HUME B125

137 Leather Duty - 75 EA $125.00 $9,375.00 DON HUME B101
Belt, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

139 Sliding "D" Rings, 75 EA $30.00 $2,250.00 DON HUME SRS50
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

BBrosAL REVIIMENE GAORT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. 11.C Res-Pg:m.2-22

Bid No. TBD .
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Belt Keepers, As X $1,200.00 DON HUME S502-4HS
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

141 Clip-On Neck Tie, 75 EA $14.00 $1,050.00 S. BROOME 45015
As Specified, or
Equal

142 Tie Bar, As 75 EA $34.00 $2,550.00 SRW cusT
Specified, or
Equal

143 Blackinton Tie 75 EA $32.00 $2,400.00 S&wW CUST
Tac, As Specified
or Equal

144 Name Plate, As 75 EA $24.00 $1,800.00 S&W NP100
Specified, or
Equal

145 Uniform 250 PR - $128.00 $32,000.00 FECHH OCSTR
Trousers, Class
A, As Specified,
NO EXCEPTIONS

146 Uniform Shirt, 250 EA $115.00 $28,750.00 FECHH X1238W71
Long Sleeve,
Class A, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

147 Uniform Shirt, 250 EA $115.00 $28,750.00 FECHH 287R7161
Short Sleeve,
Class A, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Introduci
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. 11.C

Bid No. TBD :
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Res-Pg:m.2-23

Line tem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#

148 BDU Trousers, 250 PR $115.00 $28,750.00 ELBECO E7360R
Class B, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

149 BDU Long Sleeve 75 EA $95.00 $7,125.00 BLAUER 8670
Shirt, Class B, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

150 8DU Short 75 EA $95.00 $7,125.00 BLAUER 8675
Sleeve Shirt, :
Class B, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

151 . {Turtleneck Shirt, 75 EA $45.00 $3,375.00 FECHH 52610
As Specified, or
Equal

Sport T-Shirt, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

153 Short Sleeve 75 EA $45.00 $3,375.00 SPORTEK ST350
Sport T- Shirt, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

154 Hooded 75 EA $62.00 $4,650.00 SPORTEK | ST290
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

155 Fleece Pants, As 75 PR $52.00 $3,900.00 . SPORTEK ST237
Specified, or
Equal

/ 152 Long Sleeve 75 EA $49.00 $3,675.00 SPORTEK ST350Ls

lAn(t;;:);g::; on: pOSAL ﬁ@vemzer ’%§RT l
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Res-Pg:m.2-24

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas, Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

- / As Specified, or
-y

156 Pocketed Shorts, 75 PR $39.00 $2,925.00 SPORTEK ST355P

Equal

157 Honor Guard 200 EA $645.00 $129,000.00 HOPE CuUsT
Dress Long

Sleeve Blouse,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

158 Honor Guard 200 . PR $235.00 I $47,000.00 ‘HOPE CUST
Dress Pants, As

Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

159 Honor Guard 200 PR $159.00 $31,800.00 BATES 08334
Dress Shoes, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

160 Honor Guard 200 PR $20.00 $4,000.00 VANGUARD GLOV
Dress Gloves, As

Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

/ 161 Felt Campaign 75 EA $299.00 $22,425.00 STRATTON  |STRAT4
Hat, As

Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

S AL S K

~

162 Head Strap, 1- 75 EA $18.00 $1,350.00 STRATTON HST444
Piece, for

Stratton Hats, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

\

IntroducdtRonf OSAL RGEMIENE REBRT -
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Res-Pg:m.2-25

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#

163 Head Strap, 3- 75 EA . $48.00 $3,600.00 STRATTON 3PHST
Piece, for
Stratton Hats, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

164 . [Stratton Hat 75 EA $149.00 $11,175.00 - STRATTON HP
Brim Press, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

165 Shoulder Cord 75 EA $24.00 $1,800.00 PREIMER CUST
Brass/Nickle Tip, )
As Specified

166 Bike 75 EA $95.00 $7,125.00 BLAUER 8133
Patrol/Marine
Unit, Short
Sleeve Polo,
Men's, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

167 Bike 75 EA $95.00 $7,125.00 BLAUER 8143
Patrol/Marine
Unit, Long
Sleeve Polo,
Men's, As
Specified, NO !
EXCEPTIONS

168 Bike 125 PR $115.00 $14,375.00 BLAUER 88227
Patrol/Marine
Unit Pants,
Men's/Women's,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

~ 0 SO A SN A
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Res-Pg:m.2-26
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM Co., LLC es-Pg:m

‘Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, AR.O. Comments

Bike $199.00 $14,925.00 BLAUER .
Patrol/Marine
Unit Jacket,
Men's, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

170 Bike Patrol 75 PR $229.00 $17,175.00 HAIX EAGLE
Tactical Shoes, .

As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

171 Marine Unit 75 . PR $179.00 $13,425.00 COLUMBIA DRAINMAKER
Tactical Shoes,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

172 Uniform Hat, 75 EA $89.00 $6,675.00 HAMBERGER CUST
Class A,
Officers/Cpl., As
Specified, or
Equal

173 Uniform Hat, 75 EA $125.00 $9,375.00 HAMBERGER CUsT
Class A, Sgt., Lt., ’
Capt., US.
Sheriff, As
Specified, or
Equal

174 Hat Cover, 75 EA $15.00 $1,125.00 BLAUER 107
Reversible,
Unisex, As
Specified, or
Equal

S S S S

/ 175 Cap Style #1, As 75 EA $30.00 $2,250.00 FLEXFIT 6530
’ | Specified, or
Equal

lntroduced'm::———N'ovmér 16,20
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC

Bid No. TBD »
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Res-Pg:m.2-27

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price ) i Manufacturer Style/Model#

Shirt, Class C, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
176 Cap Style #2, As 75 EA $30.00 SZ,ZS0.00_ FLEXFIT 6277
Specified, or
Equal
177 Winter Hat, As - 75 EA $34.00 $2,550.00 CONDOR 7700
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS
178 Short Sleeve 75 EA $76.00 $5,700.00 FECHH VTX4000
Polo Shirt, Class
C, As Specified,
NO EXCEPTIONS
179 Long Sleeve Polo 50 EA $76.00 $3,800.00 FECHH VTX4020P

180 Short Sleeve 50 EA $67.00 $3,350.00 PROPPER F5341
Performance
Polo Shirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

181 Long Sleeve 50 EA $67.00 $3,350.00 PROPPER F5315
Performance
Polo Shirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

182 Tactical Polo, As 75 EA $55.00 $4,125.00 HARRIGTON M211
Specified, or
Equal

183 Combat Shirt, 75 EA $115.00 $8,625.00 FECHH VTX8525
Style #1, As
Specified, or
Equal

aROPOSAL RNTVEN R ZORT
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC

Res-Pg:m.2-28

tine item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

Manufacturer

Style/Model#

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

184

Combat Shirt,
Style #2, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

EA

$129.00

$9,675.00

FIRST TACTICAL

111004

185

N

Combat Shirt,
Style #3, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

EA

$129.00

$9,675.00

5.11

72185

186

Men's/Women's
Dress Shirt, Long
Sleeve, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

EA

$55.00

$4,125.00

EDWARDS

44W7

187

Tactical Pants,
Style #1, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

PR

$69.00

$5,175.00

PROPPER

F52525

188

Tactical Pants,
Style #2, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

PR

$69.00

$5,175.00

PROPPER

K52544

189

Tactical Pants,
Style #3, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

PR

$75.00

$5,625.00

FIRST TACTIAL

114011

180

AN NG N N

Tactical Pants,
Style #4, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

PR

$195.00

$14,625.00

FIRST TACTICAL

114002

/ 191

Tactical Pants,
Style #5, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

PR

$105.00

$7,875.00

5.11

74350
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Res-Pg:m.2-29

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Style/Model#

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

192 Tactical Pants, 75 PR $89.00 $6,675.00 5.11 64369

Style #6, As '
Specified, or
Equal

193 Belt, As 75 EA $19.00 $1,425.00 PROPPER 57447
Specified, or
Equal

194 Tactical Boots, .50 PR $289.00 $14,450.00 SOLOM SAL

Style #1, As

Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

195 Thorogood 50 PR $189.00 $9,450.00 THOGOOD 6365
Boots, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

196 Bates Boots, As 50 PR $149.00 $7,450.00 BATES E03182
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

197 Danner Boots, 50 PR $185.00 $9,250.00 DANNER 25733
As Specified, NO :
EXCEPTIONS

198 Multi-Season 50 EA $369.00 $18,450.00 511 48358
Parka, As
Specified, or
Equal

199 Winter Coat, 50 EA $269.00 $13,450.00 ELBECO SH3200
: Unisex, As .
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

SOUSOUNOS S SUA S
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/ Jacket Liner, As
‘ Specified, NO

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC - Res-Pg:m.2-30

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Delivery, A.R.O.

Line ttem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price , No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model# Comments

200 Multi-Season $165.00 $8,250.00 ELBECO SH3500
Jacket As
Specified, or
Equal

201 Response Jacket, 50 EA $95.00 $4,750.00 5.11 48016

As Specified, or
Equal

202 Waterproof 75 EA $119.00 $8,925.00 TRUSPEC 2027
ECWCS Parka, As )
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

203 Waterproof 75 © PR $78.00 $5,850.00 TRUSPEC 2046
ECWCS Trousers,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

204 Microfleece 75 EA $55.00 $4,125.00 TRUSPEC 2437

EXCEPTIONS

205 Jacket, Pullover,”’ 75 EA : $155.00 $11,625.00 FECHH 57100
As Specified or
Equal

206 Rain Coat, 75 EA $149.00 $11,175.00 BLAUER 26990
Reversible,
Unisex, As
Specified, or
Equal

207 Rain Jacket Full 75 EA : $220.00 $16,500.00 FECHH VTX8800
Zip, As Specified,
NO EXCEPTIONS

C < -
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC

Res-Pg:m.2-31

Line ltem

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

No Bid Manufacturer

Style/Model#

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

208

.

Rain Pants,
Unisex, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

75

PR

$139.00

$10,425.00

BLAUER

9134

209

Communications
Sweater, Crew
Neck, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

EA

$65.00

$4,875.00

TACTSQUAD

200FB

210

Communications
Hooded
Sweatshirt, Full
Zip, As Specified,
or Equal

75

EA

$59.00

$4,425.00

JERSEY

956M

211

Communications
Hooded
Sweatshirt, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

EA

$59.00

$4,425.00

JERSEY

996M

212

G

Communications
Job Shirt, Style
#1, As Specified,
or Equal

75

EA

$89.00

$6,675.00

GAME

8025

213

N

Communications
Job Shirt, Style
#2, As Specified,
or Equal

75

EA

$105.00

$7,875.00

5.11

72314

/214

Gear Bag, As
Specified, or
Equal

75

EA

$69.00

$5,175.00

PROPPER

F5693

215

OSSN S S S S

Gloves, Style #1,
As Specified

75

PR

$59.00

$4,425.00

PF

KS6500
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIF(ORM co._llcC Res-Pg:m.2-32

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

216 Gloves, Style #2, 75 PR

As Specified

$5,175.00

rs

SOSIONOSOUSIANO S SOSOY

217 Knee Pads As 75 ' PR $29.00 $2,175.00 - FIRST TACTICAL |142502
Specified, or
Equal

- 218 Elbow Pads As 75 PR $29.00 $2,175.00 FIRST TACTICAL 145204
Specified, or
Equal

L 219 Traffic Safety 75 EA $65.00 $4,875.00 BLAUER 339RS
Vest, As
Specified, or
Equal

220 Breakaways, As 250 EA $20.00 $5,000.00 ip BR-44
Specified .

221 Citation Award, 250 EA $18.00 $4,500.00 S&wW CIT
As Specified

222 Marksmanship 250 EA $.18.00 $4,500.00 S&W MARK
Award, As
Specified

T

223 Rank Insignia, As 1,000 EA $15.00 $15,000.00 S&W RS
Specified

4 224 Lettering for 1,000 EA $15.00 $15,000.00 ACTION CUSTOM
Various Clothing
Items, As
Specified

N—

225 Sheriff's 1,000 EA $3.75 $3,750.00 ACTION CUSTOM
Shoulder Patch,

As Specified

Introduced-om: November16, 2622
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO.. 11C

Res-Pg:m.2-33

Line Item

Description

Sheriff's Star
Badge Patch, As
Specified

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

$4,000.00

No Bid Manufacturer

Style/Model#

CUSTOM

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

/ 227

Ocean County
Police Academy
Patch, As
Specified

1,000

EA

$2.75

$2,750.00

ACTION

CUSTOM

TOTAL

$897,300.00

Line ltem

SECTION VIi - TACTICAL GEAR FOR THE SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

\/ 228

Description

Nylon Duty
Outer Belt, As
Specified, or
Equal

Est. Qty.

100

EA -

$30.00

Total Price

$3,000.00

No Bid Manufacturer

BIANCHI

Style/Model#
B100

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

/ 229

Nylon Duty
Inner Belt, As
Specified, or
Equal

100

EA

$22.00

-+ $2,200.00

BIANCHI

8105

230

Nylon Silent Key
Holder, As
Specified, or
Equal

100

EA

$19.00

$1,900.00

BIANCHI

8016

\/ 231

Molle Battle
Belt, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$90.00

$9,000.00

SAFARILAND

MOLLE

Introduced-on:
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM CO..

llc

Res-Pg:m.2-34

Line item

232

Description

Gas Mask
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Est. Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

$55.00

Total Price

$5,500.00

SAFARILAND

Manufacturer

Style/Model#

Delivery, A.R.O.

233

Padded Belt
Slotted, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$133.00

$13,300.00

HISPEED

SPG44

234

Cobra 1.75"
Rigger Belt with
D-Ring, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$84.00

$8,400.00

| cosra

175

235

Single Pistol
Taco LT Molle
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$33.00

$3,300.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

236

Double Pistol
Taco LT Molle
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$50.00

$5,000.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

/ 237

Double Decker
LT Taco Molle
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$50.00

$5,000.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

N

238

/
/
/
/
/
/
V|

Multi-Access
Comm Taco
Molle Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$54.00

$5,400.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM CO.. 11.C Res-Pg:m.2-35

Bid No. TBD :
. UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#t  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Duty Extended
Pistol Taco
Molle Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

$3,900.00 HIGHGEAR

240 Kydex Duty 100 EA $44.00 $4,400.00 HIGHGEAR TACO
Handcuff Taco
Molle Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

241 Handcuff Taco 100 EA $42.00 $4,200.00 HIGHGEAR TACO
Covered Molle ‘
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

T~

242 Shot Shell Molle 100 EA $40.00 $4,000.00 HIGHGEAR TACO
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

243 Duty Double 100 EA . $58.00 $5,800.00 HIGHGEAR TACO
Smoke Grenade
Taco Molle
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

244 Tourniquet Taco 100 EA $39.00 $3,900.00 HIGHGEAR TACO -
Molle Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

SN AL

/ 245 Stun Gun Taco 100 EA ’ $49.00 $4,900.00 HIGHGEAR TACO
Molle Pouch, As

Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Introducedom——November16:-2022
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM Co.. 11

Res-Pg:m.2-36

Line ltem

Description

Est. Qty.

Mag-Net Dump
V2 Taco Molle
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Unit of Meas.

Unit Price

Total Price

$5,400.00

No Bid

Manufacturer

HIGHGEAR

Style/Model#

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

247

Single Pisto! LT
Taco Belt Pouch,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$38.00

$3,800.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

Y

AN

248

Double Pistol LT
Taco Belt Pouch,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$55.00

$5,500.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

S

AN

249

Double Decker
LT Taco Belt
Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$48.00

$4,800.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

Ay

250

Kydex Handcuff
Taco Belt Pouch,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$45.00

$4,500.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

251

Extended Pistol
Taco Belt Pouch,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$35.00

$3,500.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

SO SON

252

Kydex
Tourniquet Taco
Belt Pouch, As
Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

100

EA

$43.00

$4,300.00

HIGHGEAR

TACO

Introducedon:

A 3 40 _OnnO
NUVECTTTUCT 10, ZUVZZ

Adopted DROPOSAL B{KEHMENTEREFLIRT
Official ResblutitiO RA22FEDBBEHE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE
Page 37




A0 . Res-Pg:m.2-37
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ACTION UNIFORM O 11C g

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Sniper Waist
Pack Belt Pouch,
As Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

EA © $75.00 $7,500.00 SNIPER

254 Maxpedition 100 EA $279.00 $27,900.00 MAXPETITON
/ Ironstorm

A Adventure AGR
Bag, As

Specified, NO
EXCEPTIONS

TOTAL $160,300.00

SECTION VIl - TAILORING AND ALTERATIONS, AS NEEDED

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

255 Tailoring Pants, 500 EA $35.00 $17,500.00 ACTION
Hem and Taper,
As Specified

256 Tailoring Shirts, 500 EA $15.00 $7,500.00 ACTION
Hem and Taper,
As Specified

257 Tailoring Shirt, 500 EA $15.00 $7,500.00 ACTION
Zipper, As
Specified

258 Tailoring Shirt, 500 EA $5.00 $2,500.00 ACTION
or Jacket with
Badge Patch, As
Specified

SS OSSN
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

ACTION UNIFORM Co 11C

Res-Pg:m.2-38

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price

No Bid

Style/Model#

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

259 Tailoring Shirt or 500 EA
Jacket with
Namestrip, As
Specified

$12.00 $6,000.00

Manufacturer

ACTION

260 Talloring Shirt or 500 EA
Jacket for
Corporal or
Sergeant with
Chevrons on
Sleeve, As
Specified

$12.00 $6,000.00

~N

ACTION

261 Tailoring Shirt or 500 EA $2.50
Jacket with Hash
Marks, As
Specified

$1,250.00

ACTION

262 Tailoring Shirt or 500 EA
Jacket with Rank
Insignia on
Collar, As
Specified

$14.00 $7,000.00

ACTION

263 Tailoring Shirt or 500 EA
Jacket Rank
Insignia on
Epilates, As
Specified

$15.00 $7,500.00

OSSN

ACTION

$1,000.00

ACTION

Talloring for 500 EA

264 Removal of 500 EA $2.00
Pershing Style
Hat, As

Patches from
\/ 265 $15.00 $7,500.00
Specified

ACTION

Jackets or Shirts,
As Specified
Adopted bROPOSAL Rig2RT
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Res-Pg:m.2-39
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT | ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC 9

Bid No. TBD : :
UNIFORMS FOR THE CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Price Total Price No Bid Manufacturer Style/Model#  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

$71,250.00

SECTION IX - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltem Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure

Discount Percentage (%) for Uniforms As Specified
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