



Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE  
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Frank Sadeghi  
Deputy Director Jennifer Bacchione  
Commissioner Robert S. Arace  
Commissioner Sam Ellenbogen  
Commissioner Ray Gormley

101 Hooper Avenue  
Toms River, New Jersey  
08754-2191  
(732)929-2005  
(732)505-1918

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: May 27, 2026 - 4:00 PM  
Location: Administration Building  
Room 119  
101 Hooper Avenue  
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Rescinding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. II from MOOVE NA Distribution LLC and Prime Lube, Inc.; and rescinding Item Nos. 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 20, 24, 29, 30, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45 and 46 from Taylor Oil Co., Inc., as the vendors are unable to honor their contract pricing. Recommendation is made to award Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 25, 26, 27 and 28 to Taylor Oil Co., Inc., the next lowest qualified bidder. Item Nos. 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 29, 30, 31, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48 and 49 will be rebid.(B2026-44)

|                      |            |
|----------------------|------------|
| Official Resolution# | 2026000667 |
| Meeting Date         | 05/27/2026 |
| Introduced Date      | 05/27/2026 |
| Adopted Date         | 05/27/2026 |
| Agenda Item          | I-12       |
| CAF #                |            |
| Purchase Req. #      | B2026-44   |
| Result               | Adopted    |

| COUNTY COMMISSIONER | PRES. | ABS. | MOVE | SEC | AYE | NAY | ABST. |
|---------------------|-------|------|------|-----|-----|-----|-------|
| Sadeghi             | ✓     |      |      |     | ✓   |     |       |
| Bacchione           | ✓     |      |      |     | ✓   |     |       |
| Arace               | ✓     |      |      | ✓   | ✓   |     |       |
| Ellenbogen          | ✓     |      |      |     | ✓   |     |       |
| Gormley             | ✓     |      | ✓    |     | ✓   |     |       |

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Michelle I. Gunther

Clerk Of The Board

## RESOLUTION

May 27, 2026

WHEREAS, on April 15, 2026, the Ocean County Board of Commissioners authorized the award of Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. II, and was assigned Contract No. B2026-44; and

WHEREAS, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended that the Contracts be rescinded from MOOVE NA Distribution LLC and Prime Lube, Inc., and that Item Nos. 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 20, 24, 29, 30, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45 and 46 be rescinded from Taylor Oil Co., Inc., as the vendors are unable to honor their contract pricing.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Contracts previously awarded on April 15, 2026 to MOOVE NA Distribution LLC; and Prime Lube, Inc. are hereby rescinded in their entirety. Item Nos. 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 20, 24, 29, 30, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45 and 46 are hereby rescinded from Taylor Oil Co. Inc. Item Nos. 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 29, 30, 31, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48 and 49 will be rebid.
2. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into an Amendatory Contract with Taylor Oil Co., Inc., the next lowest qualified bidder, for Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 25, 26, 27 and 28. This vendor has extended the contracts to County Cooperative Contract System Participants, Identifier No. CK-02-OC. All orders placed through the cooperative must reference the County Cooperative Identifier No. CK-02-OC.
3. All other provisions of Contract No. B2026-44 shall remain in full force and effect.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance Department, Vehicle Services, Road Department, Bridge Department, MOOVE NA Distribution LLC, Prime Lube, Inc, and Taylor Oil Co., Inc.

## [TAYLOR OIL CO., INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. II

| Line Item         | Description                                                                                                                                                              | Estimated Qty. | Unit of Measure | Unit Cost | Total Cost  | No Bid | Brand: | Part #: | Delivery, A.R.O.: | Comments:                                                                                 |
|-------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------|-----------------|-----------|-------------|--------|--------|---------|-------------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| <b>ANTIFREEZE</b> |                                                                                                                                                                          |                |                 |           |             |        |        |         |                   |                                                                                           |
| 1                 | Antifreeze, Heavy Duty, Final Charge Global Extended Life OR Peak Global HD Final Charge ELC # FXAOB1, As Specified or Equal, Virgin Stock, Concentrated, 55 Gallon Drum | 10             | DRUM            | \$725.00  | \$7,250.00  |        | Zerex  | 895614  | 2 - 4 Days        | ZEREX™ RED HD ELC Nitrite Free 100% Concentrate 10 years / 1,000,000 miles / 20,000 hours |
| 2                 | Antifreeze, Heavy Duty, Final Charge Global Extended Life OR Peak Final Charge Glob ELC #FXAOB0, As Specified or Equal, Virgin Stock, Concentrated, Bulk Delivery        | 1,500          | GAL             | \$13.95   | \$20,925.00 |        | Zerex  | 895616  | 2 - 4 Days        | ZEREX™ RED HD ELC Nitrite Free 100% Concentrate 10 years / 1,000,000 miles / 20,000 hours |

Introduced on: May 27, 2026

Adopted by TAYLOR OIL CO. INC. May 27, 2026

Official Resolution #: 2026090667

## [TAYLOR OIL CO., INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. II

| Line Item | Description                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                 | Estimated Qty. | Unit of Measure | Unit Cost | Total Cost | No Bid | Brand:      | Part #:   | Delivery, A.R.O.: | Comments:                                                                                                          |
|-----------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------|-----------------|-----------|------------|--------|-------------|-----------|-------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| 3         | Antifreeze, Heavy Duty, 50/50 Mix with De-ionized Water to meet EC-1, Diesel Red, OR Peak Final Charge 50/50 Global ELC #FXAB50, MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH ITEM 1 ABOVE, As Specified or Equal, Virgin Stock, 1 Gallon Container                                              | 60             | CONT            | \$81.25   | \$4,875.00 |        | Zerex       | 895612    | 2 - 4 Days        | ZEREX™ RED HD ELC Nitrite Free 100% Concentrate 10 years / 1,000,000 miles / 20,000 hours                          |
| 4         | Antifreeze, Pre-Diluted 50/50, Pink, Propylene Glycol, Drum, FDA : Glycerin Free, Meets OEM Specifications, Non-Flammable, Non-Toxic, Safe for Incidental Contact with People, Pets, and Wildlife, Safe on Copper, Brass, and All Plastics (Except Acetate), 55 Gallon Drum | 5              | DRUM            | \$249.00  | \$1,245.00 |        | Prime Guard | PRIM95055 | 2 - 4 Days        | Pink RV / Marine -50°F Propylene Glycol Based - RTU - Alcohol, Odorless, & Glycerin Free. Non-toxic, non-flammable |
| OIL       |                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                             |                |                 |           |            |        |             |           |                   |                                                                                                                    |

Introduced on: May 27, 2026

Adopted on: May 27, 2026

Official Resolution #: 2026090667

## [TAYLOR OIL CO., INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. II

| Line Item | Description                                                                                                                                                                                                                           | Estimated Qty. | Unit of Measure | Unit Cost  | Total Cost | No Bid | Brand:    | Part #:   | Delivery, A.R.O.: | Comments:                                                                |
|-----------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------|-----------------|------------|------------|--------|-----------|-----------|-------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| 24        | Chassis Lube Grease, Extreme Pressure (EP), Shell Gadus S5 V220 No. 2 #550036432, As Specified or Equal, Virgin Stock, 400 lb. Drum                                                                                                   | 2              | DRUM            | \$3,149.00 | \$6,298.00 |        | Shell     | 550036432 | 2 - 4 Days        | Shell Gadus S5 V220 No. 2                                                |
| 25        | Grease, Extreme Pressure (EP), Mobilgrease XHP222 NLGI Grade, Color: Dark Blue OR Chevron Starplex EP 2 #259118-652, As Specified or Equal Virgin Stock, 40-14.1oz. Cartridges/Case, MUST Be Packaged 4 Cartons of 10 Cartridges/Case | 15             | CASE            | \$164.00   | \$2,460.00 |        | Valvoline | VV7013310 | 2 - 4 Days        | Valvoline Cerulean Blue NLGI#2 has a DIN 51285 = (Same as Mobil XHP 222) |
| 26        | Grease, Extreme Pressure (EP), Mobilgrease XHP222 NLGI Grade, Color: Dark Blue OR Chevron Starplex EP 2 #259118-873, As Specified or Equal, Virgin Stock, 120 lb. Drum                                                                | 2              | DRUM            | \$484.24   | \$968.48   |        | Valvoline | VV70130   | 2 - 4 Days        | Valvoline Cerulean Blue NLGI#2 has a DIN 51285 = (Same as Mobil XHP 222) |

Introduced on: May 27, 2026

Adopted by: TAYLOR OIL CO. INC. RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution #: 2026000667

## [TAYLOR OIL CO., INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. II

| Line Item | Description                                                                                                                                | Estimated Qty. | Unit of Measure | Unit Cost | Total Cost | No Bid | Brand:    | Part #:   | Delivery, A.R.O.: | Comments:                                                                                                         |
|-----------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------|-----------------|-----------|------------|--------|-----------|-----------|-------------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|
| 27        | Grease, Mobilux EP 23 OR Chevron Multifak EP 000 #274508 565, As Specified or Equal Virgin Stock, 5 Gallon Pail                            | 5              | PAIL            | \$174.40  | \$872.00   |        | Chevron   | 274508    | 2 - 4 Days        | Chevron Multifak EP 000 Grease                                                                                    |
| 28        | Grease, Moly Lithium for Hydraulic Bridge Maintenance, Mobilux EP 2, 5 Gallon Pail, As Specified or Equal                                  | 10             | PAIL            | \$169.25  | \$1,692.50 |        | Valvoline | VV70111   | 2 - 4 Days        | Valvoline Palladium Moly 3% Moly NLGI #2 (Mobil has no Moly in their Mobilux - Valvoline has 3% for water washout |
| 29        | Gear Oil, Mobilube HD Plus 85W-140, API GL5, As Specified or Equal, Virgin Stock, 12-1 Quart Containers/Case                               | 5              | CASE            | \$129.00  | \$645.00   |        | Mobil     | XOM102514 | 2 - 4 Days        | Mobilube HD Plus 85W140 (Case - 12 Quarts)                                                                        |
| 30        | Gear Oil, Mobilube HD Plus 85W-140, API GL5 OR Chevron #223033 Delo Gear EP5 85W-140 625, As Specified or Equal Virgin Stock, 120 lb. Drum | 10             | DRUM            | \$348.25  | \$3,482.50 |        | Valvoline | 817738    | 2 - 4 Days        | Valvoline 85W-140 Heavy Duty Gear Oil                                                                             |

Introduced on: May 27, 2026

Adopted by TAYLOR OIL CO., INC. May 27, 2026

Official Resolution #: 2026000667