Res-Pg:k.2-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey
Director John P. Kelly

08754-2191
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: April 16, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL to
Brickwall Corporation; Herman's Trucking, Inc.; Mazza Mulch, Inc.; Mitchell Products, LLC; Stavola
Construction Materials, Inc.; and Suffolk Recycling Corp., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received
on Iltem Nos. 11, 12, 13A, 13B, 13C, 16A, 16B, 16C, 18A, 18B, 18C, 19A, 19B, 19C, 20C, 23A, 23B and 23C.
They will be rebid. (B2025-48)

Official Resolution# (2025000481
Meeting Date 04/16/2025
Introduced Date 04/16/2025
Adopted Date 04/16/2025
Agenda ltem k-2

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-48
Result Adopted
SouNTY oner 18 18 12 o Ju > [
COMMISSIONER @ [a O % > g @
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v |v
Bacchione v v v
Haines v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaite \. Guanor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolu

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON A
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

[no. 8& 025 - Y48

RESOLUTION
April 16, 2025

WHEREAS, on March 4, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND
TOPSOIL for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders for items as follows:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder

Brickwall Corporation Herman’s Trucking, Inc.

25 First Avenue 181 Jacobstown Cookstown Road
Atlantic Highlands, NJ 07716 Wrightstown, NJ 08562

(732) 291-8100 (609) 758-3808

Mazza Mulch, Inc. Mitchell Products, LLC.

3230A Shafto Road 1205 West Main Street

Tinton Falls, NJ 07753 Millville, NJ 08332

(732) 922-9292 (856) 327-2005

Stavola Construction Materials, LLC Suffolk Recycling Corp.

175 Drift Road 242 Dover Road

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724 South Toms River, NJ 08757
(732) 542-2328 (732) 244-0636

Britton Industries, Inc. RWYV Land and Livestock South, Inc.
227 Bakers Basin Road 351 Pfister Road

Lawrenceville, NJ 08648 Jackson, NJ 08527

(844) 274-8866 (732) 364-1070

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, for the Furnishing and Delivery of Sand, Gravel,
Stone and Topsoil namely BRICKWALL CORPORATION; HERMAN’S TRUCKING,
INC.; MAZZA MULCH, INC.;, MITCHELL PRODUCTS, LLC; STAVOLA
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, LLC and SUFFOLK RECYCLING CORP. No bids were
received on Item Nos. 11, 12, 13A, 13B, 13C, 16A, 16B, 16C, 18A, 18B, 18C, 19A, 19B,
19C, 20C, 23A, 23B and 23C. All no bid items will be rebid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed
to enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Sand, Gravel, Stone and Topsoil for
the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through April 15, 2026, a
period of one (1) year or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County
reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N J.S A. 40A: 11-15.

April 16, 2025
April 16, 2025

pbn#: 2025000481
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A. BRICKWALL CORPORATION for three (3) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 4, 7 and 8.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
CK-02-0C.

B. HERMAN’S TRUCKING, INC. for twenty-five (25) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 3, 6, 14A, 14B, 14C, 15A, 15B, 15C, 17A, 17B, 17C, 21A, 21B, 21C, 25A,
25B, 25C, 26A, 26B, 26C, 27A, 27B and 27C.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
CK-02-0OC.

C. MAZZA MULCH, INC. for ten (10) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 9,224, 22B, 22C, 24A, 24B, 24C, 28A, 28B and 28C.

D. MITCHELL PRODUCTS, LLC for two (2) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 20A and 20B

E. STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, INC. for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 10

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
CK-02-0OC.

F. SUFFOLK RECYCLING CORP. for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 5

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
CK-02-0OC.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices
and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-48.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Buildings and Grounds Department, Roads Department, Parks Department and the successful

bidders.
Introduced on: April 16, 2025
Adopted on: April 16, 2025

Official Resolution#: 2025000481




Res-Pg:k.2-4
[BRICK WALL CORP] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Confirmed
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SECTION | - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

a2t
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Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Comments;
Measure

1 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
3 2" - 4" Goose Egg {round) decorative stone TON No Bid No Bid X
\// 4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone 500 TON $32 00 $16,000 00
5 Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover TON No Bid No Bid X
6 3/8" Washed Stone TON No 8id No Bid X
\// 7 Mason Sand 1,000 TON $14 50 $14,500 00
\// 8 Sand Grits 50 TON $16 00 $800 00
9 Screened Topsoil 100 TON $27 00 $2,700 00
10 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid X
11 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No 8id No Bid X
12 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS TON No Bid No Bid X
SECTION II - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY
Introduced on: April 16, 2025

Adopte@BRICK WALL SOHPBRESHONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResoUAigR#cERIRIO4FbNE AND TOPSOIL

Page 7



Res-Pg:k.2-5
[HERMAN'S TRUCKING & RECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT -

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

LRI

SECTION | - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLE

¥

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
V/ 1 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone 300 TON $36.75 $11,025.00
'\// 2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone 100 TON $43.00 $4,300.00
\// 3 2" - 4" Goose Egg (round) decorative stone 500 TON $70.00 $35,000.00
4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone S00 TON $65.00 $32,500.00
5 Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover TON No 8id No Bid X
\// 6 3/8" Washed Stone 30 TON $55.75 $1,672.50
7 Mason Sand . 1,000 TON $20.75 $20,750.00
8 Sand Grits - TON No Bid No Bid X
9 |Screened Topsoil ‘ 100 TON $22.00 | $2,200.00
10 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) 400 TON $28.50 $11,400.00
11 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid X
12 White Bunker-Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS TON No Bid No Bid X
Introduced on: April 16 _2025

AdoptedBRMAN'S TRUTKENE@IRERECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resokuliniy: F9Z004¢1oNE AND TOPSOIL

Page 7



Res-Pg:k.2-6
[HERMAN'S TRUCKING & RECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

SECTION [1 - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1
13B 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
13C 2" - 5" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
v/ 14A 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 1 YARD $49.50
\/ 148 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 2 YARD $46.50
W 14C  |3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone, Zone 3 YARD $44.50
\,/ 15A 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 1 YARD $52.25
\// 158 3/4" Decorative Red Stone, Zone 2 YARD $50.25
\,/ 15C 3/4" Decorati;/e Red Stone, Zone 3 YARD $49.25
16A 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 1 . YARD No Bid X
168 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
16C 3/4" Delaware River Stone, Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
\/ 17A 3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 1 | YARD $58.25 |
w178 3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 2 ‘ YARD $59.25
w o 17C 3/8" Washed Stone, Zone 3 YARD $60.25
Introduced-on: April- 16,2025

Adopted[BEERMAN'S TRUCKBNIDZE RECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Regoleliqys: GRAPEP48TONE AND TOPSOIL

Page 8



Res-Pg:k.2-7
[HERMAN'S TRUCKING & RECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD :
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

184 |70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
188 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
18C 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, {SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
19A 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
198 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
19C 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD " No Bid X
20A GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE YARD No Bid X

REQUIRED), Zone 1

20B GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE YARD No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 2

20C GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE YARD No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3
W7 21A Mason Sand, Zone 1 YARD $26.75
W’ 21B  |Mason Sand, Zone 2 YARD $28.25
W o21C Mason Sand, Zone 3 YARD $23.75
22A Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), YARD No Bid X
Zone 1l
22B Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), YARD No Bid X
Zone 2
Introduced on: April 16, 2025

Adopted [{ERMAN'S ARUICIGLNNG2E RECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rezeluiont, &R0R14E'ronE AND TOPSOIL
Page 9



_ Res-Pg:k.2-8
[HERMAN'S TRUCKING & RECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
22C Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), YARD No Bid X
Zone 3
23A 'Sand Grits, Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
23B Sand Grits, Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
23C Sand Grits, Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
24A Screened Topsoil, Zone 1 YARD $38.00
248 Screened Topsoil, Zone 2 | YARD $32.00
24C Screened Topsoil, Zone 3 YARD $31.00
v~ 25A Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD $41.00
v/ 258 Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD $33.00
V/ 25C Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD $29.50
\,/ 26A White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD $50.75
\,/ 268 White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD $51.75
\// 26C  |White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 ~ YARD $53.25
v/v 27A White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD $58.25
\// 278 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD $59.25
\,/ 27C White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD $60.75

Introduced-oRi———April-16,2025
Adopted dABRMAN'S THoiCKéNEDE5 RECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official BegQlyfpH: GRARPPLIETONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 10




Res-Pg:k.2-9
[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

SECTION I - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

tine ltem

3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone No Bid
2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
3 2" - 4" Goose Egg (round) decorative stone TON No Bid No Bid X
4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
5 Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover TON No Bid No Bid X
6 3/8" Washed Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
7 Mason Sand TON No Bid No Bid X
8 Sand Grits TON No Bid No Bid X
v/ 9 Screened Topsoil 100 TON $17.00 $1,700.00
10 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid X
11 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON ’ No Bid No Bid X
12 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS TON No Bid No Bid X
Introduced on: April 16. 2025

Ad9ptec{§nAzz_A MUREH! 18C29ESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
official Resolutiqms: 202808048% e AND TOPSOIL

Page 7



Res-Pg:k.2-10
[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

18A  |70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
18B 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
18C 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
19A 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
198 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
19C 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
20A GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE YARD No Bid X

REQUIRED), Zone 1

208 GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS {SAMPLE. YARD No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 2

20C GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE YARD No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3
21A Mason Sand, Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
218 Mason Sand, Zone 2 , YARD No Bid - X
21C Mason Sand, Zone 3 , YARD No Bid X
/ 22A Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), YARD $23.00
v Zone 1
\// 22B Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), YARD $23.00
Zone 2
Introduced on: April 16, 2025

Adopted prAZzA MUADH, 1HRI28ESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rgrolutippf, ZRANYETONE AND TOPSOIL

Page 9



Res-Pg:k.2-11
[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT - .
Bid No. TBD -
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

/ 22C Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED),

v Zone 3
23A Sand Grits, Zone 1 YARD ) No Bid X
23B Sand Grits, Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
23C Sand Grits, Zone 3 YARD No Bid X

\// 24A Screened Topsoil, Zone 1 YARD $22.00

\’/ 24B Screened Topsoil, Zone 2 YARD $22.00

\’/ 24C Screened Topsoil, Zone 3 YARD $22.00
25A Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 » YARD No Bid X
258 Stone Dust (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 _ YARD No Bid X
25C Stone Dust {SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
26A White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
268 White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
26C White Beach Sand, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
27A White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
278 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
27C White Bunker Sand, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD No Bid X

Introduced-or———April-16;2026-
Adopted MAZZA MU Xprit HéC2pBESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Regelulipus: GRAPOLAETONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 10



Res-Pg:k.2-12
[MAZZA MULCH, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, (County User Department will Guarantee 30

V] Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1

/ 28B Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, {County User Department will Guarantee 30 YARD . $17.50
v Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2
) / 28C Black Root Mulch, Double Shredded, {County User Department will Guarantee 30 YARD $17.50
v Yards Per Order), (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3

Introduced-en: A

Adopted WIAZZA MUAGH; {BGORESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Reigolurogts, 20RR09A4SITONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 11



Res-Pg:k.2-13
[MITCHELL PRODUCTS, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
188 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 \ YARD No Bid X
18C 70/30 Top Dressing Material, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
19A 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 1 ' YARD No Bid X
198 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
19C 80/20 Mix Top Dressing, NO SUBSTITUTIONS, (SAMPLE REQUIRED), Zone 3 YARD No Bid X
L 20A GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE YARD $74.50 price is per
1% REQUIRED), Zone 1 * |ton delivered
Ve 208 GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE YARD $79.05 price is per
Y REQUIRED), Zone 2 . ton delivered
20C GC350 Dry Topdressing Location, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE YARD No Bid X
REQUIRED), Zone 3
21A Mason Sand, Zone 1 YARD No Bid X
218 Mason Sand, Zone 2 YARD No Bid X
21C Mason Sand, Zone 3 . YARD No Bid X
22A Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), YARD No Bid X
Zonel '
228 |Playground Timber Turf, As Specified, NO SUBSTITUTIONS (SAMPLE REQUIRED), YARD Nb Bid X
Zone 2
Introduced on: April 16, 2025

AdoptedianfTCHELL PRSI/ 92PL.C] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official RgseI s, &HR0EL*EToNE AnD ToPSOIL

Page 9



_ Res-Pg:k.2-14
[STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LLC} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Confirmed

28 S

SECTION | - FURNISHING, PICKUP AND LOADING OF COUNTY VEHICLES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No 8id Comments:
Measure
1 3/4" Clean Gray Crushed Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone TON No Bid No B8id X
3 2" - 4" Goose Egg (round) decorative stone TON No Bid No Bid X
4 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
5 Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover TON No Bid No Bid X
6 3/8" Washed Stone TON No Bid No Bid X
7 Mason Sand TON No Bid No Bid X
8 Sand Grits TON No Bid No Bid X
9 Screened Topsoil TON No Bid No Bid X
\,/ 10 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) 400 TON $21.50 $8,600.00
11 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) . TON No Bid No Bid X
12 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS TON No Bid No Bid X

SECTION I - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY

Introduced on: April 16,2025
Adopted{STAVOLA CONSTRZT260N MATERIALS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggolutiaut; 3%80R94&'rONE AND TOPSOIL
Page 7



Res-Pg:k.2-15
[SUFFOLK RECYCLING] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SAND, GRAVEL, STONE AND TOPSOIL

Confirmed

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

1 |3/4"Clean Gray Crushed Stone ' | 300 TON $50.00 | $15,000.00
2 3/4" Decorative Red Stone 100 TON $61.75 $6,175.00
3 2" - 4" Goose Egg (round) decorative stone 500 TON $77.00 $38,500.00
4 . 3/4" Yellow Decorative Stone 500 TON $48.00 $24,000.00

\// S Crushed Clam Shells for Ground Cover 1,000 TON $75.00 $75,000.00
6 3/8" Washed Stone 30 TON $59.50 $1,785.00
7 Mason Sand 1,000 TON $39.00 $39,000.00
8 Sand Grits 50 TON $55.00 $2,750.00
9 Screened Topsoil 100 TON $47.00 $4,700.00
10 Stone Dust, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) i TON No Bid No Bid X
11 White Beach Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) TON No Bid No Bid X
12 White Bunker Sand, As Specified, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO SUBSTITUTIONS TON No Bid No Bid X

SECTION II - FURNISHING, LOADING AND DELIVERY
Introduced.on: April 16 2025

Adopted SUFFOLK REAMOLIBIGPBESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RRegolutiq: @RMIRP4&TOoNE AND TOPSOIL

Page 7



