



Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Gary Quinn
Commissioner Joseph H. Vicari

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191
Tel: (732)929-2005
Fax: (732)505-1918

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: November 2, 2022 - 4:00 PM
Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS to Bob's Uniform Shop, Inc. and Keyport Army Navy, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2022-133)

Official Resolution#	2022001498						
Meeting Date	11/02/2022						
Introduced Date	11/02/2022						
Adopted Date	11/02/2022						
Agenda Item	m-3						
CAF #							
Purchase Req. #	B2022-133						
Result	Adopted						
COUNTY COMMISSIONER	PRES.	ABS.	MOVE	SEC	AYE	NAY	ABST.
Kelly		✓					
Haines	✓				✓		
Crea	✓				✓		
Quinn	✓		✓		✓		
Vicari	✓			✓	✓		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Michelle I. Gunther

Clerk Of The Board



RESOLUTION

November 2, 2022

WHEREAS, on September 7, 2022, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder

Bob's Uniform Shop, Inc.
 PO Box 578
 Middletown, NJ 07748
 (732) 530-1212

Action Uniform Co., LLC
 1500 S. New Road
 Pleasantville, NJ 08232
 (609) 573-5462

Uniform Warehouse, Inc.
 1000 N. 10th St.
 Millville, NJ 08332
 (818) 341-1500

Name and Address of Bidder

Keyport Army Navy
 PO Box 985
 Brick, NJ 08723
 (732) 673-5356

Seaside Companies LLC
 Seaside Uniforms
 30951 Hickory Hill Rd.
 Millsboro, DE 19966
 (302) 381-1535

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, be accepted, in each instance namely that of, BOB'S UNIFORM SHOP, INC. and KEYPORT ARMY NAVY.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Uniforms for Various Departments for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through November 1, 2023, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

A. BOB'S UNIFORM SHOP, INC. for thirty seven (37) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19A, 19B, 20, 21, 22,
23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35 and 138.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section I (Item #s 1 - 35) of \$55,329.25.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. KEYPORT ARMY NAVY for one hundred (100) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 36, 37, 38, 39, 40A, 40B, 40C, 41A, 41B, 41C, 42A, 42B, 42C, 43, 44A, 44B,
45, 46A, 46B, 46C, 46D, 47A, 47B, 47C, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52A, 52B, 52C, 53A, 53B, 53C, 54,
55, 56A, 56B, 57A, 57B, 57C, 58A, 58B, 58C, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68A, 68B,
69, 70A, 70B, 70C, 70D, 70E, 70F, 70G, 70H, 71A, 71B, 71C, 72, 73A, 73B, 74, 75A, 75B,
75C, 76A, 76B, 77A, 77B, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95,
96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101A, 101B, 102, 103, 104, 105, 106A, 106B, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111,
112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118A, 118B, 119, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128,
129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137 and 138.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section II (Item #'s 36 - 39) of \$1,427.25. For a Total Lump
Sum Award Section III (Item #'s 40 - 62) of \$20,934.25. For a Total Lump Sum Award Section
IV (Item #'s 63 - 97) of \$50,054.00. For a Total Lump Sum Award Section V (Item #'s 98 -
118B) of \$13,662.00. For a Total Lump Sum Award Section VI (Item #'s 119 - 137) of
\$58,146.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the services shall be available within the following funding Sources: Clerk of the Board, Consumer Affairs, Prosecutors Office, Security Department Office O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2022-133.

5. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance, Clerk of the Board, Consumer Affairs, Prosecutors Office, Security Department and the successful bidders.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response. Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES

SECTION I - SECURITY DEPARTMENT

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 1	Trousers, Men and Women, As Specified, or Equal	150	PR	\$64.95	\$9,742.50		Elbeco	E8907	4-6 weeks	
✓ 2	Belt As Specified, or Equal	30	EA	\$21.50	\$645.00		Dutyman	1611U	4-6 weeks	
✓ 3	Long Sleeve Shirt, Men NO EXCEPTIONS	120	EA	\$72.00	\$8,640.00		Elbeco	319-3TT	4-6 weeks	
✓ 4	Short Sleeve Shirt, Men NO EXCEPTIONS	100	EA	\$68.75	\$6,875.00		Elbeco	3319-3TT	4-6 weeks	
✓ 5	Long Sleeve Shirt, Women NO EXCEPTIONS	10	EA	\$72.00	\$720.00		Elbeco	9319-3TT	4-6 weeks	
✓ 6	Short Sleeve Shirt, Women NO EXCEPTIONS	10	EA	\$68.75	\$687.50		Elbeco	9819-3TT	4-6 weeks	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid.No. TBD
 UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

BOB'S UNIFORM SHOP, INC.

Res-Pg:m.3-5

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 7	Supervisor Long Sleeve Shirt, Men NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$61.50	\$738.00		Elbeco	314-3	4-6 weeks	
✓ 8	Supervisor Short Sleeve Shirt, Men NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$48.50	\$582.00		Elbeco	3314-3	4-6 weeks	
✓ 9	Supervisor Long Sleeve Shirt, Women NO EXCEPTIONS	4	EA	\$61.50	\$246.00		Elbeco	9314-3	4-6 weeks	
✓ 10	Supervisor Short Sleeve Shirt, Women NO EXCEPTIONS	4	EA	\$48.50	\$194.00		Elbeco	9814-3	4-6 weeks	
✓ 11	Tie As Specified, or Equal	75	EA	\$6.00	\$450.00		S. Broome	900BO	4-6 weeks	
✓ 12	Raincoat As Specified, or Equal	20	EA	\$54.95	\$1,099.00		Petra Roc	LRC-48-C3	4-6 weeks	
✓ 13	Nylon Windbreaker As Specified, or Equal	40	EA	\$33.00	\$1,320.00		Liberty	560MNV	4-6 weeks	
✓ 14	Sweater, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$53.75	\$1,343.75		Liberty	140	4-6 weeks	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 15	Sports Fleece Jacket As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$29.00	\$348.00		Harrington	M990	4-6 weeks	two tone has been discotinue bidding solid color
✓ 16	Security Parka As Specified, or Equal	20	EA	\$62.50	\$1,250.00		Liberty	568MNV	4-6 weeks	
✓ 17	Three Season Jacket As Specified, or Equal	40	EA	\$55.00	\$2,200.00		Alpha	D700	4-6 weeks	
✓ 18	Bike Shorts, As Specified, or Equal	25	PR	\$68.95	\$1,723.75		Mocean	1059	4-6 weeks	
✓ 19A	Bike Pants, As Specified, or Equal	25	PR	\$89.95	\$2,248.75		Mocean	2058Z	4-6 weeks	
✓ 19B	Bike Pants, As Specified, or Equal	20	PR	\$92.50	\$1,850.00		Mocean	2058Z Tall	4-6 weeks	
✓ 20	Pants, BDU, As Specified, or Equal	25	PR	\$54.00	\$1,350.00		5:11	74251	4-6 weeks	
✓ 21	Golf Shirt, Short Sleeve, As Specified or Equal	25	EA	\$39.95	\$998.75		Cornerstone	CS410	4-6 weeks	
✓ 22	Golf Shirt, Long Sleeve, As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$43.95	\$1,098.75		Cornerstone	CS410LS	4-6 weeks	

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 23	Turtleneck Dickie As Specified, or Equal	80	EA	\$18.95	\$1,516.00		Elbeco	K8024	4-6 weeks	
✓ 24	Collar Ornament As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$22.50	\$562.50		Smith & Warren	M1502	4-6 weeks	
✓ 25	Men's Tactical Pants, As Specified	20	EA	\$55.00	\$1,100.00		5:11	74273	4-6 weeks	
✓ 26	Tie Bar with State Seal - Gold Finish As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$26.00	\$130.00		Smith & Warren	C510L	4-6 weeks	
✓ 27	Tie Bar with State Seal - Nickel Finish As Specified, or Equal	10	EA	\$23.00	\$230.00		Smith & Warren	C510L	4-6 weeks	
✓ 28	Nameplate As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$13.00	\$325.00		Reeves	0800	4-6 weeks	
✓ 29	Baseball Cap, As Specified, or Equal	40	EA	\$17.50	\$700.00		Capco	8510	4-6 weeks	
✓ 30	Ball Cap, As Specified, or Equal	30	EA	\$18.00	\$540.00		Capco	3000	4-6 weeks	
✓ 31	Safety Vest, As Specified, or Equal	10	EA	\$24.50	\$245.00		Safety Flag	PSV_GN_SEC	4-6 weeks	

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 32	Shoulder Patch, NO EXCEPTIONS	350	EA	\$2.50	\$875.00		Hero's Pride	X107667A	4-6 weeks	
✓ 33	Watch Cap, As Specified, or Equal	30	EA	\$16.00	\$480.00		Hero's Pride	6885	4-6 weeks	
✓ 34	Turtleneck, Long Sleeve As Specified, or Equal	50	EA	\$35.00	\$1,750.00		Elbeco	K8014	4-6 weeks	
✓ 35	Duty Gloves As Specified, or Equal	15	PR	\$35.00	\$525.00		HWC	NS430L	4-6 weeks	
TOTAL					\$55,329.25					

SECTION II - CLERK OF THE BOARD (MAIL SERVICES)

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
36	Short Sleeve Polo Shirt, Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$19.95	\$498.75		Bodek Rhodes	8530	4-6 weeks	
37	Short Sleeve Polo Shirt, Men As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$24.00	\$120.00		Blue Generation	7206	4-6 weeks	

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
134	Tactical Pants As Specified, or Equal	20	PR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
135	Tactical Pants As Specified, or Equal	18	PR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
136	Leather Belt NO EXCEPTIONS	18	EA	No Bid	No Bid	X				
137	TDU Belt NO EXCEPTIONS	18	EA	No Bid	No Bid	X				
TOTAL					\$0.00					

SECTION VII - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	No Bid	Comments
✓ 138	Discount Percentage (%) for Uniforms Off Catalog Price (NOT LESS THAN), As Specified	%	20%		

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
32	Shoulder Patch, NO EXCEPTIONS	350	EA	No Bid	No Bid	X				
33	Watch Cap, As Specified, or Equal	30	EA	No Bid	No Bid	X				
34	Turtleneck, Long Sleeve As Specified; or Equal	50	EA	No Bid	No Bid	X				
35	Duty Gloves As Specified, or Equal	15	PR	No Bid	No Bid	X				
TOTAL					\$0.00					

SECTION II - CLERK OF THE BOARD (MAIL SERVICES)

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
36	Short Sleeve Polo Shirt, Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$17.25	\$431.25		ULTRA CLUB	8530	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
37	Short Sleeve Polo Shirt, Men As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$17.95	\$89.75		SANMAR	K420P	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
38	Short Sleeve T-Shirt, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$12.00	\$300.00		GILDAN	G5000/G5000L	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
39	Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt, Men As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$24.25	\$606.25		GILDAN	G18600	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
TOTAL					\$1,427.25					

SECTION III - CONSUMER AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
40A	Jacket As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$89.95	\$449.75		5.11	78026	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
40B	Jacket As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$89.95	\$449.75		5.11	78026	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
40C	Jacket As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$89.95	\$449.75		5.11	78026	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
41A	Fleece Lined Jacket NO EXCEPTIONS	5	EA	\$42.00	\$210.00		DICKIES	33237	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
41B	Fleece Lined Jacket NO EXCEPTIONS	5	EA	\$42.00	\$210.00		DICKIES	33237	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

Introduced on: November 2, 2022

Adopted by: PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution # 2022061498
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

KEYPORT ARMY NAVY

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Res-Pg:m.3-12

Bid No.-TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 41C	Fleece Lined Jacket NO EXCEPTIONS	5	EA	\$42.00	\$210.00		DICKIES	33237	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 42A	Polo Shirt, Men, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	25	EA	\$37.00	\$925.00		TRU SPEC	4336	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 42B	Polo Shirt, Men, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	25	EA	\$37.00	\$925.00		TRU SPEC	4336	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 42C	Polo Shirt, Men, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	5	EA	\$37.00	\$185.00		TRU SPEC	4336	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 43	Polo Shirt, Men, Short Sleeve, As Specified, or Equal	50	EA	\$17.50	\$875.00		SPORT TEK	STR650	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 44A	Polo Shirt, Women, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	15	EA	\$37.00	\$555.00		TRU SPEC	4375	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 44B	Polo Shirt, Women, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	15	EA	\$37.00	\$555.00		TRU SPEC	4375	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 45	Polo Shirt, Women, Long Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	15	EA	\$41.00	\$615.00		TRU SPEC	4420	30 DAYS IN STCOK	

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 46A	Oxford Shirt, Long Sleeve, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$26.00	\$650.00		RED KAP	SR70/SR71	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 46B	Oxford Shirt, Long Sleeve, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$26.00	\$650.00		RED KAP	SR70/SR71	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 46C	Oxford Shirt, Long Sleeve, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$26.00	\$650.00		RED KAP	SR70/SR71	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 46D	Oxford Shirt, Long Sleeve, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$26.00	\$650.00		RED KAP	SR70/SR71	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 47A	Oxford Shirt, Short Sleeve, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$25.00	\$625.00		RED KAP	SR60/SR61	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 47B	Oxford Shirt, Short Sleeve, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$25.00	\$625.00		RED KAP	SR60/SR61	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 47C	Oxford Shirt, Short Sleeve, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	25	EA	\$25.00	\$625.00		RED KAP	SR60/SR61	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 48	Pants, PDU Duty, Women NO EXCEPTIONS	5	PR	\$51.00	\$255.00		5.11	64306	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 49	Pants, BDU NO EXCEPTIONS	10	PR	\$46.00	\$460.00		5.11	74251	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 50	Pants, PDU Duty, Men NO EXCEPTIONS	10	PR	\$51.00	\$510.00		5.11	74326	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 51	Tactical Pants, Men's, As Specified, or Equal	35	EA	\$45.00	\$1,575.00		5.11	74273	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 52A	Parka NO EXCEPTIONS	5	EA	\$199.00	\$995.00		5.11	48001	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 52B	Parka NO EXCEPTIONS	5	EA	\$199.00	\$995.00		5.11	48001	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 52C	Parka NO EXCEPTIONS	5	EA	\$199.00	\$995.00		5.11	48001	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 53A	Cap As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$12.00	\$60.00		ROTHCO	8492	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 53B	Cap As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$12.00	\$60.00		ROTHCO	8492	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 53C	Cap As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$12.00	\$60.00		ROTHCO	8492	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 54	Logger Boots NO EXCEPTIONS	5	PR	\$105.00	\$525.00		CAROLINA	CA825	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 55	Boots, Men As Specified, or Equal	5	PR	\$105.00	\$525.00		THOROGOOD	804-6190	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 56A	Sweatshirt, Mens, Front Zip As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$30.00	\$150.00		SANMAR	F217	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 56B	Sweatshirt, Mens, Front Zip As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$30.00	\$150.00		SANMAR	F217	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 57A	All Weather Jacket As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$52.00	\$260.00		SANMAR	J331	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 57B	All Weather Jacket As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$52.00	\$260.00		SANMAR	J331	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

KEYPORT ARMY NAVY

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Res-Pg:m.3-16

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 57C	All Weather Jacket As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$52.00	\$260.00		SANMAR	J331	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 58A	Long Sleeve T-Shirt As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$19.00	\$95.00		GILDAN	64400	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 58B	Long Sleeve T-Shirt As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$19.00	\$95.00		GILDAN	64400	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 58C	Long Sleeve T-Shirt As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$19.00	\$95.00		GILDAN	64400	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 59	BDU Style Pants As Specified, or Equal	5	PR	\$46.00	\$230.00		5.11	74251	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 60	Pleated Khaki Pants As Specified, or Equal	5	PR	\$31.00	\$155.00		RED KAP	PC44	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 61	Leather Belt As Specified, or Equal	10	EA	\$23.00	\$230.00		RED KAP	AB14	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 62	Unisex Oxford Style Safety Shoe As Specified, or Equal	10	EA	\$85.00	\$850.00		AVENGER	A7119	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
TOTAL					\$20,934.25					

Introduced on: November 2, 2022
 Adopted on: November 2, 2022
 Official Resolution: 2022-0119
 PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
 UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

SECTION IV - PROSECUTOR'S OFFICE AND POLICE ACADEMY

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 63	Pants NO EXCEPTIONS	24	PR	\$24.00	\$576.00		RED KAP	PT62	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 64	Pants, BDU, Rip-Stop NO EXCEPTIONS	24	PR	\$35.00	\$840.00		TRU SPEC	1324	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 65	Pants, BDU NO EXCEPTIONS	57	PR	\$50.00	\$2,850.00		5.11	74251	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 66	Pants, PDU Duty, Men NO EXCEPTIONS	40	PR	\$53.00	\$2,120.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1262480	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 67	Tactical Pants NO EXCEPTIONS	12	PR	\$52.00	\$624.00		5.11	74003	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 68A	Tactical Pants NO EXCEPTIONS	6	PR	\$50.00	\$300.00		5.11	74273	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 68B	Tactical Pants NO EXCEPTIONS	12	PR	\$50.00	\$600.00		5.11	74273	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 69	Tactical Response Uniform (TRU) Trousers NO EXCEPTIONS	6	PR	\$46.00	\$276.00		TRU SPEC	1282	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 70A	Tactical Polo, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$45.00	\$270.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279759/1290521	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 70B	Tactical Polo, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$45.00	\$270.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279759/1290521	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 70C	Tactical Polo, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$45.00	\$270.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279759/1290521	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 70D	Tactical Polo, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$45.00	\$270.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279759/1290521	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 70E	Tactical Polo, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$45.00	\$270.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279759/1290521	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 70F	Tactical Polo, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$45.00	\$270.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279759/1290521	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 70G	Tactical Polo, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$45.00	\$270.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279759/190521	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 70H	Tactical Polo, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$45.00	\$270.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279759/1290521	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 71A	Tactical Polo, Long Sleeve, Men As Specified, or Equal	36	EA	\$43.00	\$1,548.00		TRU SPEC	4357	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 71B	Tactical Polo, Long Sleeve, Men As Specified, or Equal	15	EA	\$43.00	\$645.00		TRU SPEC	4357	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

KEYPORT ARMY NAVY

Res-Pg:m.3-19

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 71C	Tactical Polo, Long Sleeve, Men As Specified, or Equal	5	EA	\$43.00	\$215.00		TRU SPEC	4357	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 72	Combat Shirt NO EXCEPTIONS	24	EA	\$47.00	\$1,128.00		TRU SOEC	2555	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 73A	Jacket As Specified, or Equal	18	EA	\$110.00	\$1,980.00		5.11	78035	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 73B	Jacket As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$95.00	\$1,140.00		5.11	78035	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 74	Jacket NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$120.00	\$1,440.00		5.11	48099	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 75A	Parka, NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$190.00	\$2,280.00		5.11	48001	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 75B	Parka NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$190.00	\$2,280.00		5.11	48001	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 75C	Parka NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$190.00	\$2,280.00		5.11	48001	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 76A	ID Panel Set, Velcro NO EXCEPTIONS	8	SET	\$20.00	\$160.00		5.11	59094	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 76B	ID Panel Set, Velcro NO EXCEPTIONS	12	SET	\$20.00	\$240.00		5.11	59094	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

KEYPORT ARMY NAVY

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:m.3-20

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 77A	Tactical Jersey Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$52.00	\$624.00		5.11	71182	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 77B	Tactical Jersey Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$52.00	\$624.00		5.11	71182	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 78	Crewneck Sweatshirt As Specified, or Equal	6	EA	\$58.00	\$348.00		CAMBER	244	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 79	Sweater, Crew Neck NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$50.00	\$300.00		TACT SQUAD	2004B	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 80	Duty Belt NO EXCEPTIONS	12	EA	\$40.00	\$480.00		DESANTIS	M20	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 81	Garrison Belt NO EXCEPTIONS	6	EA	\$40.00	\$240.00		DESANTIS	E21	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 82	Baseball Cap As Specified, or Equal	150	EA	\$15.00	\$2,250.00		SANMAR	C865	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 83	Ball Cap As Specified, or Equal	150	EA	\$8.00	\$1,200.00		SANMAR	C914	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 84	Cap As Specified, or Equal	150	EA	\$7.00	\$1,050.00		ROTHCO	8492	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 85	Shoes, Male NO EXCEPTIONS	6	PR	\$110.00	\$660.00		DR. MARTENS	12981001	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 86	Shoes, Female NO EXCEPTIONS	6	PR	\$90.00	\$540.00		NAUTILUS	1631	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 87	Boots, Male and Female NO EXCEPTIONS	6	PR	\$120.00	\$720.00		5.11	12392-12406	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 88	Pull-On Boots NO EXCEPTIONS	24	PR	\$200.00	\$4,800.00		GLOBE	GLM-1201400	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 89	Desert Boots NO EXCEPTIONS	24	PR	\$105.00	\$2,520.00		UNDER ARMOUR	3023743	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 90	Boots, Men and Women As Specified, or Equal	12	PR	\$100.00	\$1,200.00		ROCKY	2167	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 91	Unisex Boots As Specified, or Equal	6	PR	\$110.00	\$660.00		5.11	12374	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 92	Tactical Boots As Specified, or Equal	12	PR	\$105.00	\$1,260.00		UNDER ARMOUR	3023743	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 93	Logger Boots NO EXCEPTIONS	12	PR	\$105.00	\$1,260.00		CAROLINA	CA825	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 94	Boots, Women As Specified, or Equal	24	PR	\$105.00	\$2,520.00		THOROGOOD	804-6190	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 95	Socks As Specified, or Equal	36	PACK	\$15.00	\$540.00		WIGWAM	S8010	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 96	Socks As Specified, or Equal	24	PACK	\$18.00	\$432.00		5.11	10013	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 97	Socks As Specified, or Equal	24	PR	\$6.00	\$144.00		ROTHCO	6229	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
TOTAL					\$50,054.00					

SECTION V - PROSECUTOR'S OFFICE - SPECIAL OPERATIONS GROUP AND FIREARMS UNIT

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 98	Response Jacket As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$80.00	\$960.00		5.11	48016	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 99	T-Shirt, Short Sleeve Men As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$23.00	\$276.00		5.11	1351776	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 100	T-Shirt, Short Sleeve, Women As Specified, or Equal	24	EA	\$23.00	\$552.00		5.11	1351761	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 101A	T-Shirt, Long Sleeve, Men As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$33.00	\$396.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1248196	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 101B	T-Shirt, Long Sleeve, Men As Specified, or Equal	24	EA	\$40.00	\$960.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1248196	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 102	Polo Shirt, Long Sleeve As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$57.00	\$684.00		5.11	42056	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 103	Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve As Specified, or Equal	24	EA	\$41.00	\$984.00		PROPPER	F5341	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 104	Pullover Sweatshirt, Hooded As Specified, or Equal	18	EA	\$38.00	\$684.00		HANES	F170	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 105	Crewneck Sweatshirt As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$27.00	\$324.00		HANES	F260	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 106A	Windbreaker As Specified, or Equal	18	EA	\$50.00	\$900.00		SANMAR	J790	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 106B	Windbreaker As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$50.00	\$600.00		SANMAR	J790	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 107	Search Gloves, Leather As Specified, or Equal	18	PR	\$40.00	\$720.00		HATCH	SK100	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 108	Neoprene Shooting Gloves As Specified, or Equal	20	PR	\$27.00	\$540.00		HATCH	NS430	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 109	Neoprene Duty Gloves As Specified, or Equal	6	PR	\$29.00	\$174.00		HATCH	NS430L	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 110	Balaclava As Specified, or Equal	18	EA	\$9.00	\$162.00		ROTHCO	5510	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 111	Fleece Pullover As Specified, or Equal	24	EA	\$22.00	\$528.00		SANMAR	F224	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 112	Baseball Cap As Specified, or Equal	150	EA	\$15.00	\$2,250.00		SANMAR	C865	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 113	Ball Cap As Specified, or Equal	18	EA	\$12.00	\$216.00		SANMAR	C811	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 114	Fleece Cap As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$10.00	\$120.00		SANMAR	C918	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 115	Watch Cap As Specified, or Equal	12	EA	\$6.00	\$72.00		SANMAR	CP90	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 116	Knit Cap As Specified, or Equal	50	EA	\$6.00	\$300.00		SANMAR	CP91	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 117	Skull Cap As Specified, or Equal	6	EA	\$10.00	\$60.00		ROTHCO	55287	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 118A	Patch, 2" NO EXCEPTIONS	200	EA	\$1.00	\$200.00		HERO'S PRIDE	CUSTOM	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

Introduced on: November 2, 2022
 Adopted: PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
 Official Resolution #: 2022091498

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 118B	Patch, 3" NO EXCEPTIONS	200	EA	\$5.00	\$1,000.00		HERO'S PRIDE	CUSTOM	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
TOTAL					\$13,662.00					

SECTION VI - PROSECUTOR'S OFFICE - COUNTY REGIONAL S.W.A.T. TEAM AND FIREARMS UNIT

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 119	Waterproof ECWCS Parka NO EXCEPTIONS	58	EA	\$97.00	\$5,626.00		TRU SPEC	2027	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 120	Waterproof ECWCS Parka NO EXCEPTIONS	36	EA	\$102.00	\$3,672.00		TRU SPEC	2034	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 121	Waterproof ECWCS Trousers NO EXCEPTIONS	36	PR	\$73.00	\$2,628.00		TRU SPEC	2046	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 122	Waterproof ECWCS Trousers NO EXCEPTIONS	36	PR	\$75.00	\$2,700.00		TRU SPEC	2045	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 123	Fleece Jacket, Full Zip As Specified, or Equal	58	EA	\$36.00	\$2,088.00		TRI MOUNTAIN	7350	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 124	Vest, Men NO EXCEPTIONS	18	EA	\$56.00	\$1,008.00		UNDER ARMOUR	1279630	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 125	Combat Shirt NO EXCEPTIONS	80	EA	\$60.00	\$4,800.00		TRU SPEC	2567	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 126	Combat Shirt NO EXCEPTIONS	20	EA	\$67.00	\$1,340.00		TRU SPEC	2541	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 127	Boots NO EXCEPTIONS	80	PR	\$150.00	\$12,000.00		DANNER	22500	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 128	Boots As Specified, or Equal	20	PR	\$100.00	\$2,000.00		5.11	12338	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 129	Boots NO EXCEPTIONS	4	PR	\$130.00	\$520.00		DANNER	50122	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 130	Tactical Response Uniform (TRU) Shirt NO EXCEPTIONS	80	EA	\$63.00	\$5,040.00		TRU SPEC	1267	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 131	Tactical Response Uniform (TRU) Pant NO EXCEPTIONS	26	PR	\$65.00	\$1,690.00		TRU SPEC	1268	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 132	Tactical Response Uniform (TRU) Shirt NO EXCEPTIONS	30	EA	\$58.00	\$1,740.00		TRU SPEC	1282	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 133	Tactical Response Uniform Trousers As Specified, or Equal	25	PR	\$300.00	\$7,500.00		CRYE PRECISION	5124	30 DAYS IN STOCK	

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item	Description	Qty	Unit of Meas.	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Manufacturer	Style	Delivery, A.R.O.	Comments
✓ 134	Tactical Pants As Specified, or Equal	20	PR	\$70.00	\$1,400.00		VERTX	VTX8001	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 135	Tactical Pants As Specified, or Equal	18	PR	\$68.00	\$1,224.00		5.11	74434	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 136	Leather Belt NO EXCEPTIONS	18	EA	\$40.00	\$720.00		PERFECT FIT	7000	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
✓ 137	TDU Belt NO EXCEPTIONS	18	EA	\$25.00	\$450.00		5.11	59552	30 DAYS IN STOCK	
TOTAL					\$58,146.00					

SECTION VII - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	No Bid	Comments
✓ 138	Discount Percentage (%) for Uniforms Off Catalog Price (NOT LESS THAN), As Specified	%	10%		

Introduced on: November 2, 2022

Adopted on: November 2, 2022

Official Resolution#: 2022001498

BID - UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS