Res-Pg:j.7-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

December 20, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL

EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. Il to Adorama, Inc.; B&H Foto &

Electronics Corp.; Focus Camera, LLC;

and Star Data Co., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on ltem Nos. 93, 94, 101 and 102.

Recommendation is made to reject ltem Nos. 91 and 92 as unrespo
Agent to enter into negotiated contracts, in accordance with N.J.S.A

nsive. Authorizing the County Purchasing
. 40A:11-5(3) for all no bid and rejected

items, as no responsive bids were received a second time. (B2023-213)

Official Resolution# |2023001838
Meeting Date 12/20/2023
Introduced Date 12/20/2023
Adopted Date 12/20/2023
Agenda ltem -7

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-213
Result Adopted
CoNTy e [E 15 ol | B
COMMISSIONER g fég g g Q % Q
Vicari v v
Quinn v v

Crea v v |v
Haines v v

Kelly v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie \. Gurstnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:j.7-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

December 20, 2023

WHEREAS, on November 28, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND
VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Adorama, Inc. B&H Foto & Electronics Corp.
42 West 18 Street 420 9™ Ave.

New York, NY 10011 New York, NY 10001

(212) 741-0401 (212) 239-7500 ext. 2337
Focus Camera, [.1.C Star Data Co.

905 Mcdonald Ave. PO Box 12

Brooklyn, NY 11218 Hewlett, NY 11557

(718) 431-0964 (201) 565-9876

;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, be accepted, namely that of ADORAMA, INC.; B&H FOTO ELECTRONICS
CORP.; FOCUS CAMERA, LLC and STAR DATA CO. No bids were received on Item Nos.
93, 94, 101 and 102. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 91 and 92, as unresponsive,
It is requested that the County Purchasing Agent be given the authority to enter into negotiated
contracts, in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for all no bid and rejected items, as no
responsive bids were received for a second time.

WHEREAS, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) provides that, in the event no qualified bids
are received on two occasions, a governing body may enter into a negotiable contract,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of Photographic, Audio and
Visual Equipment and Supplies No. II for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from
date of award through November 14, 2024, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise
stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A.
40A:11-15 as follows:

Introduced or: December 20, 2023
Adopted on: December 20, 2023
Official Resolltion#: 2023001838




Res-Pﬂ:j.7-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 DECEMBER 20, 20

A. ADORAMA, INC. for ten (10) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 10, 11, 22, 23, 29, 31, 47, 49, 57 and 59.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. B&H FOTO & ELECTRONICS CORP, for seven (7) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 9, 52, 53, 56, 72, 73 and 77.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. FOCUS CAMERA, LLC for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 21, 43, 75 and 76.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

D. STAR DATA CO. for fourteen {14) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 12, 13, 14, 32, 42, 44, 87, 88, 89, 90, 103, 104, 105 and 106.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials and equipment to be acquired by this contract
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary pracedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations
and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-213.

4. BEIT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of

Finance, Public Information and the successful bidders.

Introduced on December 20, 2023
Adopted on: December 20, 2023
Official Resolytion#: 2023001838




ADORAMA, INC. Res-Pg:j.7-4

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD | ' )
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II |

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. (I

If providing a product other than the items spe'cified, please provide prbduct information, Upload any attachments to the Vendor
Questionnaire under "Additional Vendor Documentation” :

Line e Ieseription Quantity Lt uf Measury Ui Caast Tatol Cost MNe Bid Murtba lurer Product Name  Delivery, A R.O tarnmetl s
(Rt ed) andfor No.
{Roguired)
SECTION [ - BATTERIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
9 Battery Charger, 10 EA 451,75 $517.50 Pawerex Pawerex Maha | 30 days ARQ Offered’
Watson 3-Bay MH-C980 Turbo Altarnative
Rapid Charger for Charger-
A S AAANIMH Analyzer for 8
or Nicd AASAAS
Rechargeable Rechargeable
Batteries Batteties MFR#
MH-C980
SECTION Il - AUDIC & VIDEC SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
10 Dise, Compact, 5 PACK $12.82 564,10 Verbatim Verbatim €D- 30 days ARQ Offered
J Imitation Brand RW 80 min, Alternative
CD-RW, 25/pack 700MB High
Spead, 25 Pack
MFR# 95155
11 Disc, Compact, 5 PACK $22.26 $111.30 Verbatim "|Verbatim CD-R, )30 days ARQ Qffared”
Sony COR Media, 80 Minute, Alternatlve
J FOOMH, 50/pack 700MB 52x
Whita Inkjet
Printable, 100
Pack on Spindle §
MFR# 95251

Introduced on:

December 20, 2023

Offreia HUSBREOkD HERORT

Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. |
Page 6 - ‘




ADORAMA, INC. Res-Pg:j.7-5
PROPQSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. ||

Line Item

Neseription flnantity Unit af Maeasure Uit Cosl Tatal £ oat No Bid Manufacturer Fraduct Name — Dilivery, AL Q) Larsmoenty
(Required) anelfor Ne,
{Hequirad)
12 Disc, Mini, PACK No Bid No Bid X
Compact,
.| Recordable,
156M8, for
Mavica MCR-
1564, 50/pack
13 Disc, Minl 5ony PACK No Bid No Bid X
DVD-R, 30 min.,
1.4 6B
14 DVD-R Archival 30 PACK $34.49 $1,034.70 Verbatim Verbatim. 30 days ARO Offered
Gold, Write Once OVD+R Alternative
Recordable DVD, Recordable '
4,7GB storage Media, 4.7GB,
capacity, up ta BX 16x Branded
write speed, Surface, 25 Pack
10/pack on Spindle
MFR#t 95033
21 Hard Drive, 5 EA §111.32 855660 SanDisk SANDISK E81 30 days ARO Qffered
Portable, Model XTREME PRO Alternative
#SDSSDERL, 1 TB, PORTBLE 1TB
San Disk, or Equal S50 V2 MFRH
5DSSDEAL-
1TO0-G25
22 Mermary Card, 1 3 EA $5.74 s17.22 Transcend Transcend 4GB |30 days ARO Offered
j GB 50 for Canon : ‘Sacure Digital Alternative
Powershot ASS0 High Capacity
{SDHC) Class 10
Mernory Card
MFR#
TS4GSDHC10.

Introduced on: December 20, 2023

Adopté 2

ot HLaE Ak R Ol S EPURT
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. ||
Page 7




ADORAMA, INC. Res-Pg:j.7-6
" PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I

Line [tern Foweniption fhiantity dnit of Measure Lint Clast [atal Cost Na Bid Mamuactrer ot Mame Dulivery, AR, Commants

[Reqaire:d) andzor No,
[Requirea)

j : 23 Memary Card, 5 EA 45,74 $28.70 Transcend Transcend 4GB | 30 days ARO Offered
Promaster Secure Digital Alternative
Profassional Hi- d High Capacity
Speed Compact ' {S0HC} Class 10
Flash Memory Memaory Card
Card 4GB #8470 , , MFR#
TS4GSDHC10
29 MP3 Player, 5 EA $29.31 $146.55 SanDisk. SanDisk 8GB 30 days ARO Offered
J sanDisk Clip Jam, Clip Jam MP3 Alternative
& GB, 5anDisk, or ' Player, Black
Equal MER# SDMX26-
' 008G-G46K
3 Philips LFH334 2 EA 56.50 $13.00 Hamilton Buhl | Hamilton Buhl |30 days ARO Offered
j Headset, or equal J SchoolMate Alternative
Personal Steren
Headphones
with [n-Line
Volume MFR#
HA2V
32 Phillps LFH334 SEY No Bid No Bid X
Replacement
Headset Pads, 2
pads/sat
SECTION [V - CAMERAS, CAMCORDERS & ACCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
42 Camera, Canon 3 EA 51,522.90 $4,568.70 Canon Canon EQS 90D |30 days ARQ Offered
EOS BOD DSLR DSLR Camera Altarnative
Bundle, As ‘ with EF-5 18-
Specified, or ) 135mm f/3.5-
Equal 5.6 15 USM Lens
MFR# 3616C016

Introduced on: December 20, 2023

Adapted GbopAL#D%@ﬁ’@;ﬂi’EE%
Official | 7 8
C18 i ~ PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I
Page 8




ADORAMA, INC. Res-Pg:j.7-7
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. T8O
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. Il

e Hem M ription Gilantily Unit of Meas Lnit Cost Total Cost No Bid w1, A "reduct Name Delivery, A [0 Comments

andfor

$2,690.85 Nikon Nikat Z50 30 days ARO Offered -
Mirrorless Alternative
Camera with
NIKKOR Z DX 16~
50mem F/3.5-6.3
VR Lens MFR#
1633 ’

43 Camera, Nikon 3 3 EA 5896.95
03500 ‘

44 Camera, Nikon - 3 EA 51,196.95 $3,590.85 Nlkon | Nikon 07500 30 days ARO Offered
' 07100 DSLR with AF-5 ‘ Alternative
DX NIKKOR 18-
140mm £/3.5-
5.6G ED VR Lens
MFR# 1582

47 Nikon SG ~ 31R 15 EA $10.44 4156.60 Nikon Nikon $G-3IR 30 days ARO Offered
\/ Replacement ‘ : ’ Replacernent IR ‘ Alternative
Panel for Built-in ‘ Panel for Built-
Flash ‘ In Flash D200,

: 070s, D70
Digital Cameras
MER#E 4905

Macrao Ring Light Macro Ring LED Alternative
Light, 5600K
Color
Temperature
MFR# RING4S

\/ .4 - Bolt VM-160 LED 15 ‘ EA $25.77 $386.55 Godox Godox RING4R | 30 days ARG Offered

52 Filter, Haya 15 EA $34.49 . §517.35 Haya HOYA EVQ 30 days ARQ
62mm MD UV, . ' ) ANTISTATIC UV
Mfg # XHDG2LY G2ZMM MFRH

‘ XEVA-G2UV

Introduced on: December 20, 2023

Adopte, P

ot AL P RS He PORT .
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, ALUDIO AND VISUAL EGUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I
Page 2 .




- ADORAMA, INC. Res-Pg:j.7-8
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Ling em Deseription {Lantity Uit of i Unit Cos No Bid Manufasturen Procluct Narne Delvery, AR O Lomments

IRequired) nrdfor No,
Thequirud]
LE] Filter, Hoya 15 EA $38.66 $579.90 ' Hoya HOYA EVO 30 days AROD
&7mm HD UY, ' ANTISTATIC UY €
Mfg # XHDEIUY ' ' 67MM MFR#
' XEVA-67UY
56 Filter, Tiffen 15 EA 58,17 $122.55 Tiffen TIFFEN 62 30 days ARO
62mm SKYLIGHT MFR#
Skylight/UV Loy : 625KY
J 57 Filter, Tiffen 15 EA $16.31 $244.65 Tiffen TIFFEN 62 30 days ARQ
62mm Yellow YELLOW #8
: MFR# 628Y2
/ 59 Filter, Tiffen " 15 EA 54,75 CB7L2S Tiffen TIFFEN 67 UV 30 days ARD
67mm Uy MFRY¥ 67UVP
72 Tripod, 5 EA $245,02 §1,225.10 Manfratto Manfrotto 190X | 30 days ARD
Manfrotto 190, . ' 3-Sectlon
Aluminum 4 Aluminum
Sectlan ; Tripad with
ML19OXPRO4-BH ; MVHS00AH
Fluld Video
Head MFR#
MVKS00190X3
73 Tripod, 15 EA $189.95 52,549,25 Manfrotto Manfrotto 290 {30 days ARQ
Manfrotto Xtra 3-Section
MK29OXTAI- Aluminum
2WUS 290 Xtra Tripod with
Aluminum with ‘ ‘ 128RC Micro
128 RC Micra Fluid Head and
Fluld Head and Quick Release
Quick Release S ; ‘ MFR#
‘ r, . MEK290XTA3-
2WUS
Introduced on: December 20, 2023

Adopte P .

ot EROE NS ALPOLERIRgY e bR
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO.
Page 10 .



B & H FOTO & ELECTRONICS CORP. Res-Pg:j.7-9
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT \ .
Bid No. TBD |
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I

PHOTOGRAPHIC,‘AUE?IO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. If

If providing a prlo‘duct other than the items specified, please provide product information. Upload any attachments to the Vendor
Questionnaire under "Additional Vendor Documentation” ;

Fre [t Dispticen {Quantity Vtnt of Measure LIt et Tetal Cost N ke Manufacturer Product Natre Setwery, ARO Comment:

{Hequerad) and/ar Mo
{Requred)

SECTION 1 - BATTERIES - ALL [TEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

\/ ; 9 Battery Charger, 10 EA 929.96 $299.60 ' Watsaon AABLCD
Watson 8-Bay : :

Rapid Charger far
AA / AAA NIMH
or NiCd
Rechargeable
Batteries

SECTION 1l - AUDIO & VIDEO SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

10 Disc, Compact, ° PACK No Bid "NoBid X
" | Imitation Brand '
CD-RW, 25/pack

11 Disc, Compact, PACK No Bid NoBid X
Sony CDR Media,
700MH, S0/pack

12 |Dlsc, Minl, PACK No Bid Ne Bid i 3
Compact,
Recordable,
156M8, for
Mavica MCR-
1564, 50/pack

‘13 Disc, Mini Sony PACK Mo Bid .No Bid X
OVD-R, 30 min,,
1.4G8

Introduc
A fors deﬂmBPOSAL

Official R&QUPELQTM@AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. !
Page 6



PROPQOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

B & # FOTO & ELECTRONICS CORP.

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND -SUPPLIES NO. 1|

Res-Pg:j.7-10

Lo e

Dasgription

Lhlant.ty

Litet of Measurg

Lt Gt

Tatal Cont

No thid W anufacturoe

{Required)

Product Nams

ahilfar No.

Dulivery, ARG Commnenty

42

Camera, Canon
EOS 800 DSLA
Bundle, As
Specified, ar
Equal

EA

$1,561.32

$4,683.96

Canon

{Ruquired)
3616C016

43

Camera, Nikon
D3500Q

EA

No Bld

No Bld

Camera, Nikon
D¥100

EA

$896.95

$2,690.85

Nikon

1581

47

Nikon 5G - 31R
Replacemant
Panel for Built-ity
Flash

15

EA

-510.46

$156.90

49

Bolt Viv-160 LED
Macro Ring Light

15

EA

$52.46

$786.90

Vi

Filter, dea
62mm HD UV,
MFg # XHD62UY

15

EA

433.68

5505.20

Haoya

ANXTPLE2UY

53

&

Filter, Hoya
67mm HD LY,
Mfg # XHDG7UV

15

EA

$33.68

$508.20

Hoya

ANXTPLE7UV

56

L

Filter, Tiffen
62mm
Skylight/uv

15

EA

$7.46

$111.90

57

Filter, Tiffen
62mm Yellow

15

EA

$18.44

$276.60

59

Filter, Tiffen
&7mm Uv

15

EA

516,92

- $253.80

Introduce rﬁBIF‘OSAL B

Adopted

Official REGIRHHAT A6ETHEES AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. ||

Page 8



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

B & H FOTO & ELECTRONICS CORP.

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. 1|

Res-Pg:j.7-11

Fire ltem

Dustaphion

(Lhantity

Urit of Megaure

Uit Cost

Total $oat

No

Manufacturer

[Required)

Drenduct Name
anedfar No.
[Roquired}

Dativery, AR

Comments

72

Triped,
Manfrotto 190,
Alurminum 4
Section
M190XPRC4-BH

EA

$189.57

$947.85

73

Tripod,
Manfrotto
MK290XTA3-
2WUS 290 Xtra
Aluminum with
128 RC Micro
Fluid Head and
Quick Release

15

EA

$129.62

$1,944.30

75

Tripod,
Manfrotto-
496RC2 Compact
Ball Head W/R2

15

EA

$162.75

$2,441.25 .

Manfrotto .

MHXPROBHQ2 .

76

Kingston
Mabilelite Plus
5D Card Reader

15

EA

$9.44

$141.60

77

Abundant Supply

Company
Unidentified
Flashdrive
Organizer Case
(Black)

12

EA

$5.21

$62.52

SECTION V -« PHOTO PRINTERS AND SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Introduce .
Adopted grf?aPOSAL ﬁ 5 :
Official RE¥8IufibHAT Q6B EES AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I

Page 9

]



) ‘ FOCuS CAMERA, LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:j.7-12

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NQ. |l

Line lem Drnerption Lantity Do gf Measure Ui Coul Total £ st Mo Bid Marnbacturer Progluet Name Delivery, ARLL

(Required] arrd/or Mo,
{Reauired)

Cammenty

14 DVD-R Archival PACK No Bid No Bid X
Gaid, Write Once .

Recordable DVD,
4.7GB storage
capacity, up to 8X
write speed,
10/pack

21 Hard Drive, 5 EA - %9500 $475,00 ' SANDISK SDSSDE6L 7-10
J Portable, Modal

#SDSSDEG], 1TH,
San Disk, or Equal

22 Memary Card, 1 A No 8id No Bid X
G8 50 for Canon
. | Powershot AB50

23 Memory Card, EA No Bid No Bid X
Promaster
Professional Hi-
Speed Compact
Flash Memory
Card 4GB #8470

29 MP3 Player, 5 EA 435.00 5175.00 SANDISK SDMX26008GG46 | 7-10
sanDisk Clip Jam,
8 GB, 3anDisk, or
Equal -

31 Phillps LFH334 . EA No Bld No Bid X
Headset, or equal :

32 Philips LFH334 SET No Bid No Bid X
Replacemant P

Headset Pads, 2
pacls/set

SECTKON [V - CAMERAS, CAMCORDERS & ACCESSORIES - ALL {TEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Introduc .

Adopted 6n* POSAL @%RT

Official REsthuHbKIT CERFPHEES AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO, (|
Page 7



FOCUS CAMERA, LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPQRT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. 1l

Res-Pg:j.7-13

i ltemn Dewcuption Lhantily Unit af Measure tnit Cosl Totul Cost Nu Hid Manufacturer Praduct Narne Delivery, ARG, Comienty
{Ruguirad} anedfor Nu,
{Requited)
42 Camera, Canon 3 EA $1,568.00 54,704.00 Canon 3616C016 7-10 800 Bundle
EQS BOD DSLR ) discontinued. |
Bundle, As offered the 900
Specified, or with the 18-135
Equal thstead
43 Camera, Nikon 3 EA $996,95 $2,990.85 Nikon 1581 7-10 D3500
03500 discontinued
offered D7500
instead
44 Camera, Nikon 3 EA £996.95 $2,990.85 Nikon 1581 7-10 03500
07100 Discontinued
Offered D7500
instead
47 Nikon 5G - 31R 15 EA $13.95 $209.25 Nikon 4905 7-10 NIKON 8G-31R
Replacement
Panel for Built-in
Flash
49 Boit VM-160 LED 15 EA $65.00 $1,035,00 Bolt YM-160 7-10
Macre Ring Light
52 Filter, Hoya, 15 EA $6.50 $97.50 Tiffan 62Uve 7-10 Hoya XHD62UV
62mm HD Uy, : Is discontinued
Mfg # XHD&2UY offered Tiffen
53 Filter, Hoya 15 EA $6.50 $97.50 Tiffen 67UVP 710 Hoya XHD67UV
67mm HD UV, s " Discontinued
Mfg # XHD&7UV Offered Tiffen
56 Filter, Tiffen 15 ' EA 518.00 $270.00 Tiffen 625KY 7-10 Tiffan 62mm
62mm Skylight 1-4
skylight/Uv Filter

Introducegintatp

Adopted OSAL @@mg@u“ﬁﬁm

Official RBiHBLRIT GOBATMESEAUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I
Page 8




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

FOCUS CAMERA, LLC

Res-Pg:j.7-14

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Itne Hem Hescriplion unnhity Uit of Moasure Unil Conl Totak Cost Mo Bid Muanulacturer Product Nameoe Dolivery, A RO, Comments
{Roqured) atd/or No,
{Required)
57 Filter, Tiffen 15 EA $19.99 $299.85 Tiffen 628Y2 7-10 Tiffan 62mm
62mm Yellow Yellow 2 #8
Glass Filter
59 Fliter, Tiffen 15 EA $6.50 $97.50 Tiffen 67UvP 7-10 {Tiffen 67 UV
&7mm UV
72 Tripod, 5 EA $469.99 $2,349,95 Manfrotto M190XPRO4 7-10 Manfrotto
Manfratto 190, ' 190CXPRO 4-
Alurninum 4 - $ection Carbon
Sectlon Fiber Tripod
M190XPRO4-BH
73 Tripod, 15 EA $195.90 $2,938.50 Manfrotto MK290XTA3- 7-10 MMANFROTTO
Manfrotto 2WUS K290XTA3-
MK290XTA3- -1 2WUS
2WUS 290 Xtra
Aluminum with
128 RC Micro
Fluid Head and
Quick Release
75 Tripad, 15 EA $90.00 $1,350.00 Manfrotte MH496-BHUS | 7-10 496rc2 is
‘ Manfrotto- ‘ discantinued
496RC2 Compact offered MH496-
Ball Head W/R2 BHUS
76 Kingston 15 EA 58.00 $120.00 Kingston KINMLP 7-10 Kingston
\/ Mabilelite Plus Mabilelite Plus
‘ 5D Card Reader SO Card Reader
77 Abundant Supply EA No Bid Mo Bid C X
Company
Unidentified
Flashdrive
Organizer Case
(Black)

IntroducegignpOsaL B g&ﬁﬁﬂgm -
S R%jg,ﬁ%mré’%’ﬁ?ﬁgg (B3 AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I
age .




STAR DATA CO. | Res-Pg:j.7-15
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT e ¢
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. (I

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPM ENT AND SUPPLIES NO. [l

If providing a product other than the items specified, please provide product information. Upload any attachments to the Vendor
Questionnaire under "Additional Vendor Documentation”

Lire it Tescrntion Quantity Unt of Measura Un't Cost ictat Cost No Bid Manufarturer Segduet Naree Deivieey, AR Carmant,

{Heduired) ard/oe No
[Required)

SECTION | - BATTERIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

9 Battery Charger, 10 . EA $78.40 $784.00
Watson 8-Bay ‘
Rapid Charger for
AA / AAA NIMH
or NiCd
Rechargeable
Batteries

SECTION I1- AUDIO & VIDEQ SUPPLIES - ALL [TEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

10 Disc, Compact, 5 PACK $19.40 597,00
imitation Brand -
CO-RW, 25/pack -

11 Disc, Compact, ‘ 5 ‘ PACK $40.40 $202.00
Sony COR Madia,
TOOMH, 50/pack

12 Disc, Mini, 5 PACK $140.40 $702.00
\/ Compact,

Racordable,

‘ 156M8, for

Mawvica MCR-
1564, 50/pack

13 Dise, Mini Sony 5 PAEK $60.60 _-$303.00
DVD-R, 30 min., '
1.4G8

Introduced on: December 20, 2023
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STAR DATA CO. 4 Res-Pg:j.7-16
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT :
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I,

. neltem Nivereton Lttty Uiy af e L t [otn 51, Ny i Manatactirer g} Name o Selvery, ARO. Lammonts
[Reeqnred)

(Rmuwrvd]

14 DVD-R Archival 30 PACK $20.20 $606.00
J Goald, Write Once

Recordable DV,
4,7GB storage
capacity, up to 8X
write speed, ;
10/pack . ‘ -

21 Hard Drive, 5 EA $99,09 $495,45
Partable, Model

#SDSSDEGL, 1 TB,
san Disk, or Equal

22 Memory Card, 1 3 ‘ EA 410,00 $30.00
GB 50 for Canon
Pawershot AS50

23 Memaory Card, 5 EA $30.70 $153.50
' Promaster .
Profassional Hi-
Speed Compact
Flash Memoty

Card 4508 #8470

29 MP3 Player, 5 EA 549.09 5245.,45
SanDisk Clip Jam,
B GB, SanDisk, or
Equal

31 Philips LFH334 2 EA 56800 $136.00
Headset, or equal :

Replacement
Headsat Pads, 2
pads/set

/ 32 Phitlps LFH334 4 SET $18.00 $72.00

SECTION IV - CAMERAS, CAMCORDERS & ACCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED Oﬂ EQUAL
Introdu¢ed on: ' December 20, 2023 .
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. |l

STAR DATA CO.

Res-Pg:j.7-17

Danl Ly

Lt af Keasure

Urit Cout

Total Cast

fo il

fatirer
el

(F*cqulrr dJ

Camments

42

Camera, Canon
EQS 800D DSLR
Bundle, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$1,299.00

$3,897.00

a3

Camara, Nikon
03500

EA

$1,585.00

$4,755.00

Camera, Nikan
07100

EA

- $799.00

$2,397.00

47

Nikon 5G - 31R
Replacement
Panel for Bullt-in
Flash

15

EA

$19.00

$285.00

49

Balt VM-160 LED
Macro Ring Light

15

EA

$99.00.

$1,485.00

52

Filter, Hoya
62mm HD UV,
Mfg # XHDG2UV

EA

No Bid

No 8id

53

Fiter, Haya
67mm HD UY,
Mfg # XHD&7UV

EA

No Bld

No Bid

56

Filter, Tiffan
62Zmm
Skylight/UV -

EA

No Bid

No Bid

57

Filter, Tiffen
&2mm Yellow

EA

* No Bid

No Bid

59

Filtar, Tiffen
6mm UV

EA

Mo Bid

No 8id

Introduced on;

December 20, 2023
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STAR DATA CO. . Res-Pg:j.7-18

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line drem Deseription thantily Unit of Measure Unit Cost latal ¢ ot Nor fiid SManufacturet Procluct Name  Delvery, AR.O, Carimetks

{Regiurodd) aindfor Mo
{Reauired)

J a7 Entrust DuraGard 100 ROLL $159.50 '815,950.00
Laminate, 1 mil,

Clear, kem
#508785-501, for
use with

Datacard CD-CLM
Larninator/Printer
€080, 300
printers per roll

38 Entrust DuraGard 100 ROLL $190.90 $19,090.00
J Laminate, 0.6 mil,

halo, Item
#508808-0%2, for
use with SLM-
CLM Desktop .
Laminator,-350
prints per rall

89’ Customizad 50 ROLL $303.50 $15,175.00
i Laminates, User
J Departmait will
provide
customized
information for
irprinting;
Entrust DuraGard
Laminate, 0.6 mil,
holo, Item
#508808-032, for
use with SLM-
CLM Desktop
Laminator, 350
orints per roll

Introduced on: December 20, 2023
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STAR DATA CO. Res-Pg:j.7-19
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. Il

Line tem Deseription Lliantity Unit of Measure Umt Cost Tatal Cust Mo Bid Muanufactueor Froduct Name  Delivery, AR, Lammaoenty

{Reqguiced) atiedfor Mo,
{Required)

J 90 |0 Cards, CRE0 . 50 BX . $90.50 $4,545.00
NOCO, CR-79/CR- ’

80 Compatible tD
Cards, Item #
54563 81754,
500 Per Box

SECTION VI - MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES - ALL IFEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUUAL

#1 | Board, Savage, EA No Bid No Bld X
Photo Mount, :
Double Weight,
11" x 14", B/W
Smoath

92 Board, Savage, EA No Bid No Bid X
Phota Mount,
Dauble Welight
16" % 20", B/W
Smooth

93 Board, Savage, CTN No Bld No Bid X
Pre-Stax Pressure
Sensitive, Light
Welght, 8" x 10"

94 Crescent EA No Bid No Bid X
Maunting Board- ‘ :
8" x 10", Single,
White, Self-
Adhesive

101 Uline High-Tack PKG N Bid No Bid X
Adhesive Foarn .

Core Board - 24 x
36", 3/16" thick

SECTION Vil - DARKROOM SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
Introdu¢ed on: December 20, 2023 ]
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STAR DATA CO. Res-Pg:j.7-20
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I

/

Ptinters QL
Introduke December20.202

e [t Neseription tunanty Unit of Measure it Cost Tatal ¢ o MNe el Vianutaetare Product Name  Oehvery, A O Comments

atud/or Na,
[Hequired)

102 U3 Roll EA . No Bld No Bid X
Laminating Film .

27" W x 250" Lx
3.0 mil. Gauge
Gloss Finish

SECTION Vil - PASSPORT PHOTO SYSTEM ACCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

103 0,10 mil PVC 5 BX 585,00 $425.00
Plastic White
Graphics Quality
Cards for use in
the DataCard
CD&OO Printer
{1,000 per Box}"

104 0.30 mil PVC 5 BX 580,00 5400.00
Plastic White ’ ' ‘

Graphics Quality
Cards for use in
the DataCard
CDAO0 Printer
{500 per hox)

105 DataCard YMCKT 5 PKG $199.00 $995.00
Color Ribban Kit ' '
Optimized for use
with DataCard
CP/CD Series
Card Printers

106 DataCard YMCKT- 5 PKG $266,00 $1,330.00
KT Color Ribbon .

Kit Optimized for
tise with

DataCard CP/CD
Sarles Card

é?fféii?ﬁﬁ%%w@ﬂ%ﬁéﬂ%ﬁ
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