Res-Pg:1.2-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari

Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Commissioner John P. Kelly

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

Tel: (732)929-2005
Fax: (732)505-1918

June 21, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO.
Il to PPC Lubricants LLC and Prime Lube, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. ltem Nos. 22, 23 and 40 are
rejected as unresponsive. No bids were received on Item Nos. 26 and 43. Recommendation is made to reject
ltem Nos. 22, 23 and 40. The Purchasing Agent is given the authority to enter into a negotiated contract
pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for all no bid and rejected items, as no responsive bids were received for a

second time. (B2023-108)

Official Resolution# |2023000837
Meeting Date 06/21/2023
Introduced Date 06/21/2023
Adopted Date 06/21/2023
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie \. Gurstnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:1.2-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
DOCUMENTS, INVOIGES,

RESOLUTION

June 21, 2023

WHEREAS, on May 16, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND
LUBRICANTS NO. III for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Namne and Address of Bidder
PPC Lubricants LLC Prime Lube, Inc.

305 Micro Drive 800 Roosevelt Ave.
Jonestown, PA 17038 Carteret, NJ 07008

(800) 772-5823 (732) 343-2338

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County
Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according
to specifications, in each instance, namely that of PPC LUBRICANTS LLC and PRIME
LUBE, INC., be accepted. Item Nos. 22, 23 and 40 are rejected as unresponsive. No bids
-were received on Item Nos. 26 and 43. Recommendation is made to reject ltem Nos, 22, 23
and 40. The Purchasing Agent is given the authority to enter into a negotiated contract
pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for no bid Item Nos. 26 and 43 and rejected Item Nos. 22,

23 and 40 as no responsive bids were received for a second time,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Antifreeze, Oils and Lubricants No, III
for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through March 14, 2024,
or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend
the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15 as follows:

Introduced on June 21, 2023
Adopted on: June 21, 2023
Official Resolutjon#: 2023000837




Res-Pg:1.2-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 JUNE 21, 2023

A. PPC LUBRICANTS LLC for two (2) items, to wit:

[TEM NOS. 8and 28.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. PRIME LUBE. INC. for five (5) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 3,18, 21, 38 and 41.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantitics
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-108.

4. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Vehicle Services, and the successful bidders.

Introduced on June 21, 2023
Adopted on: June 21, 2023
Official Resolution#: 2023000837




PPC LUBRICANTS LLC Res-Pg:l.2-4
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. IlI

PRICE TABLES
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

Line ltem

Unit of Measure

Description Cuantity
ANTIFREEZE

Unit Cost

Total

Brand:

Part it

Delivery, ARG

Comments:

3 Antifreeze, 4]
Heavy Duty,
50/50 Mix with
De-lonized
Water to meet
EC-1, Diasel
Red, OR Peak
Final Charge
50/50 Global
ELC #FXABSO,
MUST BE
COMPATIBLE
WITH ITEM L
ABOVE, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 1
Gallon
Container

CONT

£76.20

$4,572.00

6/1 GAL FINAL
CHARGE
GLOBAL E/L
50/50 AF

FXABS3

576,20 PER 6/1
GA CASE

OIL

Engine OIl, 2
Diesel Mobil
HDEO 15W-40
or Shell Ratella
T3 Fleet, Qils
must meet Ford
Specification
WSS-M2C171-
F1, Virgin Stock,
6 -1 Quart
Contalners/Casa

CASE

$34.35

568,70

6/1 QT SHELL
ROTELLATATP
15W40 CK4

550049483

GREASE

Introduceéd-en: June: 21, 2023
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PPC LUBRICANTS LLC Res-Pg:1.2-5
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. IlI

28 Gear Qll, 5 CASE $144.28 $746.40 ’ 12/1 PENNZOY, |550042070
Automotive, PLAT AXLE
Limited Slip ' 75W140
Applicatlon,
Mobil 1
Synthetic Gear
Lubricant L%
75W-140, AP}
Gl-5 QR Shall
Pennzoil
Platinum Axle
SAE 75W-140
#550042070,
NG
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12-
1 Quart
Containers/Case

f Line jtem Description Cuantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Mo Bid Brand; Part it: Dealivery, AR.O.: Comments:

HYDRAULIC FLUID

38" Hydraulic Fluid, 1 DRUM $1,080.75 $1,080.75 55 GALSHELL | 550045514

Shall Tellus TELLUS S2 X 22
$2VX22 or Mobil

DTE Excel 22, 55
Gallon Drum,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

44 Hydraulic Fluid, 10 PAIL $187.45 $1,874.50 5 GAL SHELL 550048912
Wheelchalr Lift, TELLIUS 34 WX
Exxon/Maobil 32

Univis HVI 26, 5
gallon pail

Introduced on: June 21, 2023
Adoptedapmposal DIINERIERPPREPORT
icial ReSoluePEREEACUIY AND LUBRICANTS NO. 11|
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| PRIME LUBE, INC. Res-Pg:l.2-6
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. Il

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS

Line ltam Duseription Cuantity Unit of Maasure Wnit Cost Total Mo Bid Brand: Part #: Dalivery, AR.O.: Commerts:
ANTIFREEZE

,\/ 3 Antifreeze, 60 CONT 511,05 4663.00 Chavron Delo ELC 50/50
Heaavy Duty, '
50/50 Mix with
De-ionized
Water to meet
EC-1, Diesel
Red, OR Peak
Final Charge
50/50 Global
ELC #FXABSQ,
MUST BE
COMPATIBLE
WITH ITEM 1
ABOVE, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 1
. | Gallan
Container

oL

Introduced on: June 21, 2023

Adopt :
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PRIME LUBE, INC. Res-Pg:l.2-7
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. Ill

Line ltem Description Guantity Unit of Maasure Unit Cost Na 8id Brand: Part #: Delivery, AR.O. Comments:

Engine Qil,
Diesel Mobil
HDEO 15W-40
or Shel! Roteila
T4 Fleet. Olls
must meet Ford
Specification
WHS-M2CL171-
F1, Viegin stock,
6- 1 Quart
Containers/Case

GREASE

\/ 18 Chassis Lube 20 CASE $83.67 41,773.40 Shell
Grease, Extreme

Prassure (EP),
Mabilith
SHC220 NLGI
Grade 2 OR
Shell Gadus 55 v
220No. 2
#550036432,
NQ
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 12
- 0.38 kg/14 oz,
Cartridgas/Case,
MUST Ba
Packaged 4
Cartons of 10
Cartridges/Case

Introduced on: June 21, 2023

Adopted o
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. ill

PRIME LUBE, INC.

Res-Pg:1.2-8

Line ftem

Doscription

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

latal

No Bid

Brand: Part i

Nelivery, AR.O.:

Cornments:

21

Chassls tube

Grease, Extreme |,

Pressure (EP),
Shell Gadus 55
V220 No. 2
H#550036432,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock,
400 Ik, Drum

DRUM

$2,103.17

44,706.34

Shell

22

Graase, Extremae
Pressure (EP),
Mabilgrease
XHP222 NLGI
Grade 2, Calor;
Dark Blue OR
Cheyron
Starplex €P 2
#259118-652,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS,
Virgin Stock, 40-
14.10z.
Cartridges/Case,
MUST Be
Packaged 4
Cartons of 10
Cartridges/Case

CASE

$148.75

$297.50

Chevron

Introduced on:

June 21, 2023
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PRIME LUBE, INC. Res-Pg:1.2-9
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
ANTIFREEZE, OILS AND LUBRICANTS NO. Ilf

Line lLem Description Guantity Linit of Measure Unit Cost Testal Mo Bid Brand: Part if: Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:
HYDRAULIC FLUID

38 Hydraulic Fluid, 1 DRUM 5976.25 £976.25 Shell
‘ Shell Tetlus

52VX22 or Mobil
DTE Excel 22, 95
Galloh Drum,
NGO
SUBSTITUTIONS

40 Hydraulic Fluid, PAIL No Bid No 8id X
Wheelchair Lift,
Exxan/Mobil
Univis HV! 26, 5
gallon pall

Chevron Delo
Torgue Force
Synthetic SW-
30, 55 gallon
drum, NO
EXCEPTIONS

/ 41 Hydraulic O, 5 DRUM 51,703.90 $8,519.50 Chevron

43 Hydraulic Oil, DRUM No Bid No Bid X
Hitachi Super
EX-46HN, Zine
Frae, 55 gallon
drum, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

Introduced on: June 21, 2023

Adopted @n;
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