Res-Pg:j.3-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Barbara Jo Crea

Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly

Commissioner Frank Sadeghi

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

November 6, 2024 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL

EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES to Star Data Co. and Toshiba Busine

ss Solutions, a Division of Toshiba

America Business, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on Iltem Nos. 5, 9, 22, 30, 34, 40, 41,

42, 43, 46, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54,61, 72,73, 74, 76, 78, 81, 82, 83, 84,

85 and 86. Recommendation is made to

reject Item Nos. 2, 3, 4, 6, 7, 8, 24, 35, 39, 47, 48, 49, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 62, 63, 66, 75, 77, ...

Official Resolution# [2024001639
Meeting Date 11/06/2024
Introduced Date 11/06/2024
Adopted Date 11/06/2024
Agenda ltem -3

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-160
Result Adopted
COUNTY sl el B
COMMISSIONER | | ) :(é > g !
Crea v v
Quinn v v |v
Haines v v v

Kelly v

Sadeghi v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guetnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:j.3-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOIGES, VOUCHERS

2024 - 10

RESOLUTION

November 6, 2024

WHEREAS, on September 17, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND
VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

| Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Star Data Co Toshiba Business Solutions
P.O. Box 12 A Division of Toshiba America Business
Hewlett, NY 11557 319 Commerce Court/ Suite 108
(201) 565-9876 Pottstown, PA 19464

(610) 539-1456
Unique Photo
123 Route 46
Fairfield, NJ 07004
(973) 216-9421

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely that of STAR DATA CO and TOSHIBA
BUSINESS SOLUTIONS: A DIVISION OF TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS, No bids
were received for items 5, 9, 22, 30, 34, 40, 41, 42, 43, 46, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 61, 72, 73, 74,
76,78, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85 and 86. Recommendation is made to reject items 2, 3, 4, 6, 7, 8, 24,
35,39,47,48, 49, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 62, 63, 66, 75, 77,79, 80, 87 and 88 as unresponsive.
All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. Item# 121 will be rebid to obtain additional
vendors,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Photographic, Audio and Visual
Equipment and Supplies for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award
through November 5, 2025, a period of one (1) year or until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County teserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to

N.JLS.A. 40A:11-15.

Introduced on] November 6, 2024
Adopted on: November 6, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001639




BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 NOVEMBER Re®Pg:j.3-3

A. STAR DATA CQ for fifty-nine (59) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16,17, 18, 19,20, 21, 23, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 31, 32, 33,
36,37, 38, 44, 45, 64, 65, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 96, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103,
104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 115, 116, 118, 119, 120 and 121,
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK—-02--OC.

B. TOSHIBA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS, A DIVISION OF TOSHIBA AMERICA
BUSINESS for nine (9) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 95,97,98, 111, 112, 113, 114, 117 and 121.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the equipment and supplies to be acquired by this contract shall

be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance
with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations
and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding
sources: Business Development & Tourism, Consumer Affairs, County Clerk, County
Connection, Engineering, Fire Marshal, and Fire/First Aid Training Center O.E.

4. The contract numbert must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-160.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,
Business Development & Tourism, Consumer Affairs, County Clerk, County Connection,

Engineering, Fire Marshal, Fire/First Aid Training Center and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: November 6, 2024
Adopted on: November 6, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001639




[STAR DATA CO} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:j.3-4

12. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all reqwred documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
PHOTOGRAPH!C, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

If prowdmg a product other than the items specified, please provide product information. Upload any attachments to the Vendor
Questionnaire under "Additional Vendor Documentation”

P niphion Cuaniity Ut of Measy
¥

Um Cost

Nunulacturer
{Required)

SECTION | - BATTERIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

/ 1 Battery, Canon LP- 15 EA

J . E10

$55.00

$825.00

all items on bid
are guoted
exactly per spec

2 Batteries, EA
"|Rechargeable, 44,
WI-MH, 2500 mah

Mo Bid

No Bid

3 Batteries, ’ EA
Rechargeable AfA

Mo Bid

No Bid

Introduced on: November 6, 2024

-Adoptedopap DATA E%%%S@&ocumm REPORT

Official egolﬁwﬁoé

Page 6

APPIESAUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES



Res-Pg:j.3-5
{STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Lirar [ Doscriplion Quantity Uit of MWegstre Uit Cost Total Cost Ne Bid Vi, 1 P i ) Comiments

4 Batteries, EA Mo Bid No Bid X
Rechargeable for ’
Canon EOS 7D and
50 Mark [ and 1l
Camera, LP-E6N

5 Battery Charger, EA Mo Bid No Bid X
Promaster A5 ’
#4165

& Battery Charger, EA No Bid No Bid X
Canoen LC-ES, for
LP-EG Li-ion

7 Battery Charger, EA No Bid No Bid X
Canon Charger LC- '
E10

g Battery Charger, EA No Bid No Bid X
Mikon Quick
Charger MH-25

9 Battery Charger, EA No Bid Mo Bid X
Watson 8-Bay
Rapid Charger for

| AL BAS NIMH of
| MICd Rechargeable
Batteries

SECTION It - AUDIO & VIDEC SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

10 Dise, Compact, 5 PACK £18.00 $S90.00
q"// Imitation Brand
CO-Rwy, 25/pack

/ 11 Dise, Compact, 5 PACK $25.00 $125.00
Vi Seny COR Media,
FOOMH, 50/pack

Introducgd-en- Al mber6-2024

Adopted[§AR DATA K&eRERBNARDOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rpgolution#:020R489163% DI AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 7




' - : 'Res-Pg:j.3-6
[STAR DATA CQJ} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPCRT )
Bid No. TBD :

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltemn Descriplion Canlity Unit of Measure Unit Cost i Cost Mo Bid Fanufzcturar Product Mame  Delivery, AR O Cornmeonts

{Roquired] andfor Mo,
{Reguired}

12 Dise, #Aind, B PACK 893,00 $465.00
Compact,
Recordable,

v T | 1S6ME, for Mavica
MCR-1564,
S0fpack

/ 13 Disc, Minl Sony s _ - PACK $40.00 $200.00
W DVD-R, 30 min., T
1.4 GB

14 DYD-B Archival 30 PACK 52200 . $660.00

. Gold, Write Once

/ Recordable VD,
4.7GB storage

' capacky, up to 8X

write speed,
10/pack

15 UltraLife Gold 30 PACK $73.00 $2,150.00
Archival Grads - :

/ DVD-R, #
Y |vERgs35S, 4.7 68,

16%, Spindle, Gold, |-
S0/Pack

/ 16 Flash Drive, San 40 EA 56,00 5240.00
Disk Cruzer Glide <
USB 2.0, 868

17 Flash Driﬁe, San 20 I EA $7.00 $140.00
Y Disk Cruzer Glide :
USE 2.0, 16 GB

/ i3 Flashk Drive, San 20 E& $7.30 514600
Disk Cruzer, 32G8, :
Use

Introdueed-en———Nevember-6;2024

Adopted SR DATA SGYREBECBYSE20OCUMENT REPORT
Official BesolptiomtOZe4PMB3RUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 8 :




[STAR DATA CO) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD -
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:j.3-7

Liriez ltem Description Guantity uUnit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost

/' 19 Flash Drive, San 48 $336.60
i Disk Cruzer Glide ’
USE 2.0, 64 GB

Manufacturer
[Required]

Froduct Name
andfar No.
{Required)

Delivery, 4 R.0.

Cammenis

Disk Extreme USB
3.0,16GB

/ 20 Flash Drive, San 25 EA . $17.00 $425.00

21 Flash Drive, San 30 EA $55.00 $1,650.00
L Disk Extrerne USB
: 3.0,64GE

22 Hard Drive, EA Mo Bid Mo Bid
Fortable, Model

#SDSSDEGT, 178,
San Disk, or Equal

o Memory Casd, 1 - 5 EA $6.00 $30.00
GB S0 for Canon
Powershot 4550

24 Memory Card, EA Mo Bid Mo Bid
Pramaster
Praofessional Hi-
Speed Compact
Flash Miemory
Card 4GB #8470

25 Memory Card, 4 75 EA 55.00 $375.00
Vi GB Szndisk Secure
Disk

/ 26 Memory Card, 30 EA $17.00 $510.00
SanDisk Extreme - ’
v PLUS SDHC UHS-1
Card, 16 GB

Introdu . oL R, 2024

Adopted SRAR DATA SONGRESEENSE2BOCUMENT REPORT
Official Regolulignfr224P63% D10 AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 9



Res-Pg:j.3-8
[STAR DATA COJ] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD _
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Eirer Tesmy Descniption Quantiny Unit of Measure Urint Coest Tota T Melanufacturer Frodurt Rame Delivery, &.K.0. Ceormimenls

{Regquired] and/or No.
{Renuired)

27 Memory Card, 30 EA $55.00 $1,650.00
Ve SanDisk Extreme |
4 PLUS SDHC UHS-1
Card, 64 GB

28 Memaory Card, 20 E& S75.00 $1,500.00

SanDisk Extreme
Compact Flash
v Memory Card, 128
GB

29 Memory Card, 45 EA $25.00 $1,125.00
SanDisk Extreme

/ Compact Flash
L Memuory Card, 32

GB

30 MP3 Player, EA No Bid No Bid X
Sanbisk Clip Jam, &
GB, SenDisk, or
Equal

31 Moise Canceling 5 EA _ 557.00 $285.00
/ Headphones, Sony :
% Model

MDRHC7/MDRNCS

// 32 Philips LFH334 5 E& $99.,00 5495 00
Headset, or equal

33 Philips LFH334 5 SET $16.00 580,00
/ Replacement

Y Headset Pads, 2
padsfset

SECTION 1ll - PHOTOGRAPHIC PAPER AND FILM - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Introduced-oni———Neovember-6;2024

Adopted[5TAR DATA K&ieRERFGNARDOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resolytipn#-ORRARNASOAUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES a
Page 10 .




- Res-Pg:j.3-9
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOGUMENT REPORT _

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer  Product Name
{Required) andfor Na.
{Required}

Delvery, ARO. Commenis

34 - Photo Paper, 8
12" x 11" HP
#CRS644, Gloss
Finisk, 50
Sheets/Pack

35 Canon o FA No Bid No Bid X
Heavyweight ’ :
Matte Costed
Paper for Inkjet -
38" Wide Roll -
100" Long

1 36 FufiFilm Bx213 15~ EA 568.00 $1,020.00

- / DX1090 Inkjet Paper
lossy for

V/ Frontier-5 DX10G

Pringer

37 FujiFiint 51213 s EA $43.00 - $645.00
: %100 Inkjet Paper ’

/ : Glossy for

V -\ Frontier-S DX100

i Printer

38 FujiFilm 6x213 15 . EA © 548.00° $720.00
: / D¥%190 Inkjet Paper
1,/ Glassy for
FrantierS DX100
Prirter

|secmion v - CAMERAS, CAMCORDERS & ACCESSORIES - ALL [TEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

39 Camera, Canon ) E& . No Bid o Bid X
ECS SO Mark 11, As ’
Specified, or Equal

. Introduced-eni— —November.6, 2024 '
Adopted[Bh&R DATA NS BHERDOCUMENT REPORT

Official Regeluiian# 2483 R UDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 11




[STAR DATA COJ RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT |
Bid No. TBD | |
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:j.3-10

Line ltem

Description

Ouantity

Usit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Mo Bid

taanufacturer
{Required)

Froduct Mame
andfor Mo,
{Reguirad]

Delivery, AR

Commaenis

Camera, Canon
ECS 505 R DSLR,
A5 Specified, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

Camera, Canon
EOQS 70 Mark 11, As

-| Specified, or Equal

No Bid

No Bid

437

Camera, Cancn
PowerShot G7x
Mark i}

Ea

No Bid

Mo Bid

43

Camera, Canon
ECS 200D OSLR
Bundle, As

Specified, or Equal |

EA

No Bid

No Bid

Camera, Mikon

| D3500

15

$1,585.00

£23,775.0C

45

<

Camerz, Nikon
D7100

EA

5852.00

$4,295.00

a5

Camerz, Mikon
D7500 DSLRE
Camera, Body Only

Na Bid

No Bid

47

Flash - Mikon SB-
5000 AF
Speedlight Flash,
MO
SUBSTITUTIONS

EA

Ne Bid

No Bid

43

Introduced on:

Miken SG - 31R
Replacement
Panel for Built-in
Flash

NG

vember 6. 2024

Mo Bid

Nao Bid

g?f‘?Pt‘i‘%S’FEIR DATA E%WM&OCUMENT REPORT
teial RS ol o AR Ubic AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Page 12



[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:j.3-11

line tem

- Lens, Canon EF 16-

Description

35mmF2.8L1
UsSh

Ouantity

Uriit of Measure

E&

Unit Cosl

No Bid -

Total Cost

No Bid

Ma Bid

Manufacturer
{Required}

Froduct Mame  Dellvery, 0.0, Commenis
andfor Mo,

{Required]

tens, Canon EF 24-
105mm /8L IS
USK with 2 Caron
Mount, MgF#
1380C002

EA

£1,290.00

$5,450,00

€5

Lens, Canon EF 70-
200mm f2.8L 1511
USH, mMfg #
25594004

$2,030,00

$10,450.00

66

Lens - Canon - 70-
200rmm - Canon
mount

‘EA

No Bid

No Bid

&7

N

Lens, Canon EF
100-400mrm /4.5
S.6L 15 1 USM, Mig
#9524B002A4

EA

$2,355.00

$11,775.00

68

Lens, Mikon A%
DX 18-140040
Lens, {/3.5-5.6G
EDVE Lens

15 -

$495.00

$7,42500

69

NN

S

Lens, Mikon AF-P
D NIKKOR 18
S5mm §/3.5-5.66
YR Lens

20

$245.00

$4,900.00

70

~

Lens, Nikon &F
Micro Mikkor
B0mm 1:2:8 0

15

E&

$197.00

$2,955.00

Page 15

Introducedon:  Navember 6, 2024

Adopted[STAR DATA NOeRESFGNSROOCUMENT REPORT
Official RasolWeafofRAMIRSOAUDIO AND VISUAL EQUI

PMENT AND SUPPLIES



, Res-Pg:j.3-12
[STAR DATA CO] RESPOMNSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD -

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

iine Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Uit Cost Total Cost Ha Bid Manufscturer  Product Hame  Delivery, AR.Q. Camments
{Requirad}j andfor Mo,
{Required]

Lens, Nikan 70-

J $180.00
) I00mm

7z Remote, Nikon EA No Bid No Bid b4
Wireless Remote
Control fL-L

73 Tripod, Manfrotto EA Mo Bid No Bid %x
190, Aluminum 4
Section

M 1SUXPRG4-BH

74 Tripoed, Manfrotto
FMK290XTA3-
25 290 Xtra
Alurninum with
128 RC Micro Fluid
Head and Quick
Release

&

NoBid | ° Notid X

. © [ Tripod with Head, EA No Bid . Wao Bid 4
Yanguard Alta Pro !
2634GH 32 Section -
-| Aluminum Tripod
with GH-100 Pistol
Grip Ball Head

.75 Tripod, Manfrotto- EA Mo Bid Mo Bid X
’ .| 836RC2 Compact
Ball Head W/R2

77 Kingston E& No Bid No Bid x
Mobilelite Plus I ’
Catd Reader

Introduced on: November 6, 2024

Adopt ? -

O LT hR T Cob T EoNSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND \**TISUQ.L EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 16




[STAR DATA COJ RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '

Res-Pg:j.3-13

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SU Pi?L'I ES

line Item Description Cluantity Unit of Mezsure

Total Cost

Manufacturer
{Required]

Product Name
andfor No.
{Required}

Delivery, ARG

Comments

86 Filter, Promaster EA - Mo Bid
HGX, Prime UY, T
filter 55mm, Part
#6704 &s
Specified, Na
Substitution

No Bid

SECTION ¥ - PHOTO PRINTERS AND SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Smartlab Frontier-
S Imkjet Printer

87 Fujifilm BX100 E& Mo Bid

No Bid

Tank for Frontier-5
DX100 Printer

88 Fujifiim Waste Ink  EA No 8id

Ne Bid

89 Fujifilm 16393545 15 EA - 575.00
Yellow Ink
Cartridge 200l
for Fujifilm
Frontier-5 DX100

$1,125.00

Black Ink Cartridge
200mit for Fujiitm
Frontier-S DX100

£1,125.60

31 Fujifilm 16393069 15 E& S75.00
Pink ink Cartridge
W 200ml for Fujifilm
Frontier5 D¥X1C0

/ 20 Fujifilm 16393019 15 EA $75.00

$1,125.00

/ 9z Fujifim 16393021 15 EA 47500
’ Cyan Ink Cartridge

WV 200mi for Fujifilm
' Frontier-5 DX100

$1,125.00

Introduced on: November 6, 2024

Ad?Pte‘gﬂ!R DATA gﬁgﬁ? $00OCUMENT REPORT
Official Fesolfions fé,gﬁlmo AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 20 - : :



, * _ Res-Pg:j.3-14
[STAR DATA CO} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD :
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

{uantity Urit of Measure Unit €ost Totasl Cost Mo Bid B 1 2iE) b RO Comments

- Fujifilm 16393057 15 EA $75.00 $1,125.00
e Sky Blue Ink 200ml
V] for Fujifilm

- Frontier-S DX100

. 94 Fujifilm 16393033 is EA $75.00 $1,125.00
g Magenta [nk ’
b/ Cartridge 200mi
for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

95 Entrust BuraGard 150 ROLL $159.00 $23,850.00
Laminate, 1 rmil,
Clear, ltem
#508785-501, for
use with Datacard
CO-CLM
Laminator/Printer
COB00, 300
printers per roll

96 Entrust DuraGard 190 ROLL $150.00 $15,000.00
Laminate, 0.6 mil,
/ holo, Item
#508808-032, for
use with SLM-CLM
Desktop

Larninator, 350
prints per roll

Introducedon:  _November 68,2024
Adopted[STAR DATA NOVRMSFBHERBOCUMENT REPORT

Official Regoletins¥odRAPYESAUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 21 : :




, Res-Pg:j.3-15
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Linie ltem Description Quantity Uit of Measure Unit Cost Tatal Cost Mo Bid Mapufacturer  Product Mame  Delivery, ARC. Co

{Requirad] andfor Mo.
{Required]

a7 Customized 150 ROLL $300.00 $45,000.00
" |Laminates, User
Department will
provide
customized
imformation for
imprinting; Entrust
DuraGard
Laminate, {16 mil,
hele, item
#508808-032, for
tise with SLM-CLM
Desktop
Laminator, 350
prints per roll

- 98 10 Cards, CRE0 - 100 BX $S0.00 $9,000.00
MO, CR-79/CR-
20 Compatible ID
Cards, ftern #
54563 81754, 500
Fer Box

1 i
SECTION Vi - MISCELLANECQUS SUPPLIES - ALL fTEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL - ’ : :

. 99 ‘Board, Savage, | 10 EA 313.00 $130.00
Pheio Mount, :
/ ' Double Weight,
¥ 11" % 14", B/W
Smaoth

Photo Mount,
Double Weight 16"
% 20", BfW Smooth

/ 100 Board, Savage, 20 . EA $19.00 $380.00

Introduced on: November 6, 2024

o R DaTA RS EE N A BOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EGINIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 22




Res-Pg:j.3-16
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Lire ftem Desscriplion Quantity Uit of Moasure Unit Cost Total Cost Banutfacturer Product Mame  Delivery, ARG Commenls

{Required] andfor No,
[Required)

Board, Savags,
/ Pre-Stax Pressure
Vi Sensitive, Light
Weight, 8" x 10"

102 Crescent 300 EA $563 $1,683.00
. rounting Board- .
WV 8" x 10", Single,
White, Self-

Adhesive

\

163 Canon PRI - 120 5 EA ’ S$75.00 537500
1 Matte Black Ink g
- | Cartidge {130ml]

N

104 Canon PFI - 120 5 EA 575.00 $375.00
Black Ink Cartidge
{130ml}

105 Canon PF-120 10 EA ©$75.00 $750.00
- Cyan Ink Cartridge
{130mL}

106 Canon PFI-120 10 EA $75.00 | - s750.00
Magenta ink ’
Cartridge {130mL}

107 Canon PFI-120 10 - EA T $75.00 S$750.00
Yellow ink
Cartridge {130mL]

NN NNN

108 Canon 5 Ea 6900 £345.00
Maintenance .
Cartridge MC-31

Ihtroduced on: - November 6, 2024

olopted i DATA OIY RRBHNSEOCUMENT REPORT

Official A
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:j.3-17
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES™

i Berm oscription Crantity Uait of Measuse Unit Cost al Cast 2o Big Manulacturer Product Name  Delivany, ARO.

[Regred) andfor No.

{Required)

- 109 Uline High-Tack 1o PKG $88.00 $880.00
/ Adhesive Foam

Core Board - 24 x
38", 316" thick

SECTION Vil - DARKRCOM SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

115 Usi Relt 25 - E& $96.00 $2,400.00
Larninating Film )
v 27" W x 250 Lx
3.0mil. Gauge
Gloss Finish

SECTION VIl - PASSPORT PHOTO SYSTEM ACCESSORIES - ALL [TEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

111 0.10 mil PVC 35 BX $85.0C $2,975.00
Plastic ‘White
Graphics Quality
Cards for use in
the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer {1,000 per
Box]

112 0.015 mil F¥C 75 BX | . %1900 $14,175.00
Plastic White

| Graphics Quality -
Cards for dse in
the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer {1000/box}
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[STAR DATA CO]

Bid No. TBD

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:j.3-18

Introdu

Line [lem

Description

Usit of Measure

Uit Cost

Total Cost

Mo Bid

rManufecturer

[Reguired]

Praduct Mame
andfo 3
{Required}

Dedivery, &.R.0.

Comments

112

0.30 mil P¥C
Ptastic White
Graphics Quzlity
Cards for use in
the OataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer {500 per
box)

50

BX

 380.00

$4,000.00

114

DataCard YMCKT
Color Ribban Kit
COptimized for use
with DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printers

&0

PKG

$95.00

$7,600.00

115

DataCard YRACKT-
KT Calor Ribbon
Kit Optimized for
use with DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printers

S0

JSa0z.00

$10,100.50

116

Datacard Color
Ribbon, YRCKT-KT
Compatible with
COB03, ltem
rumber 535000~
Qo5

50

PKG

$199.00

- $9,950.00

117

Datacard Color
Ribbon, YMCKT-KT
Compatible with
O80T, [tem
riumber 535000-
005

50

PKG

$254.00

$13,200.00

ced on:
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7 Res-Pg:j.3-19
[STAR DATA CCO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT :
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

linz ftem Description Quantity Umit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Ma Bid Manutacturer Product Name  Delivery, A RO, {ummenls

{Required} andfon Mo
{1 eguircd]

erocodile clip with $5,650.00
- transparent strap,
/ Fitted with press
stud button, Boxed
V per 100 pieces,
Iaterial,
Kietal/PVC, [tem
number 56200-
ju e

/ 118 Table Top Passport 5 EA S80.00 $400.00
‘/, 2 Photo Die :
: Cutter Punch, 2" %
2!'

120 High Tack 300 EA $6.00 - $1,800.00
Adhesive Mount .
l/ Boards 8x10

SECTION [X - DISCOUNT % ON ITEMS NOT LISTED HERE!N-

Line ltem Description Uit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure

Discount Percentage {%) for Photographic, Audio and Visual Equipment and
Supplies (NOT LESS THAN], As Specified

Introduced on: November 6, 2024
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[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD D&Tﬁa SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REFORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

" Res-Pg:j.3-20

Introduy
Adopte|
Official

Line Hem

Description

Ouantity

unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Praducl Name
andfor No.
{Required)

Manutacturer Camments

{Required}

Delivery, AR.C.

93

Fujififm 16393057

| Sky Blue Ink Z00mi

for Fujifilm
Frortier-5 DX100

Na Bid

No Bid

94

Fujifilm 16333033
tagenta Ink
Cartridge 200ml
for Fujifilm
Frontier-S ODX100

E&

Ma Bid

o Bid

95

Ertrust DuraGard
Laminate, 1 mil,
Clear, Iltem
#508785-501, for
use with Datacard
CO-Ch
Laminator/Printer
CD80Q, 300
printers per roll

150

ROLL

$79.00

-511,850.00

96

Entrust DuraGard
Laminate, 0.6 mil,
holo, ltem
#508808-032, far
use with SLM-CLM
Deskiocp
Laminator, 350
prints per roll

100

ROLL.

$215.00

$21,500.00

6.2024
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Res-Pg:j.3-21
{TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

e [eom Description Quanlity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Mo 8id Kariufacturer Product Kame  Delvery, AR.0 Comments

[Reguiread) andfor Mo

(Regquired}

a7 Customized 150G ROLL $221.00 $33,150.00
Laminates, User ’
Department will
proside
customized
/ information for
\/ imprinting; Entrust
DuraGard
Laminate, 0.6 mil,
holo, ltem
#508808-032, for
use with SLM-CLM
Desktop
Laminator, 350
prints per roll

98 1D Cards, CR3D 100 BX $44.00 $4,400.00
/ MOCO, CR-79/CE-

‘\/ 80 Compatible I

Cards, ltem #

54563 81754, 500
Per Box g

SECTION V1 - MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES - ALL iTEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

] Board, Savage, ' EA NoBid No Bid X
Photo Mount,
Double Weight,
11" x 14", BAW
Smaoth

100 Board, Savage, EA No Bid Mo Bid X
Photo Mount, -

Double Weight 16"
x 20", B/W Smooth

Introduced on: November 6, 2024
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Res-Pg:j.3-22
[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO &ND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

-

tine [tem Crescription Cuantity Unit af Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name  Delivery, ARO. Comments

[Raquired]

{Reguired]

105 Uline High-Tack ’ PKG : Mo Bid Mo Bid X
Adhesiye Foam
Core Board - 24 %
36", 3/16" thick

SECTION Vil - DARKROOWM SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

110 Sl Rell EA ’ Ho Bid No Bid X
Laminating Film
27" W x250'Lx
3.0 mil. Gauge

Gloss Finish i

. i
SECTION VIl - PASSPORT PHOTO SYSTEM ACCESSORIES - ALL {TEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

111 0,10 mil pvC . 35 BX ' 581.0C 52,835.00
Plastic White .
Graphics Quality
\/ Cards for use in
the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer (1,000 per .
" | Box)

112 0,015 mil P¥C 75 BX . $94.00 $7,050.00
’ Plastic white '
Graphics Quality
\/ Cards for use in
the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer {1000/box}

Ir)troduced on: November 6, 2024 .
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Res-Pg:j.3-23
[TOSHiBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

line 1tem Description Cluantity Linit of Measure Uit Cost Tolal Cost Mo Bid Manutaciurer Product Name  Delivery, A B0

{Revquirend}

s 113 0.30 mil PYC 50 BX 544.00 $2,200.00
/ ) Plastic white ’

Graphics Quality
\/ Cards for use in

the DataCard

Entrust Sigma
Printer {500 per
box}

114 DataCard YMICKT 30 PKG £82.56 $6,604.80
Color Ribbon Kit
‘V Optimized for use

with Datalard
Entrust Sigma

Printers

115 DataCard YMCKT- 50 PKG $208.00 $10,400.00
KT Color Ribbon
Kit Optimized for
use with DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printers

1lg Datacard Color S0 PKG ) $241.00 $12,050.00

Ribhon, YMCKT-KT -
Compatible with
CDB00, kem
number 535000~
006

117 Datacard Color 50 PKG £189.00 $59,450.00
4 Ribbon, YMCKT-KT
\/ ‘Compatible with
CDB00, kem
number 535000~
005

Introduced on: 6, 2024
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_ Res-Pg:j.3-24
[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Linesitem Descriplion {uantity tnat of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Mo Bid Bianufaciurer Product Namo  Delvery, ARQ Comments

{Hequired] andfor Mo
{Requined)

118 Crocodile clip with PKG No Bid No Bid - X
iransparent strap,
Fitted with press
stud button, Boxed
per 100 pieces,
Material,
Metal/PVC, item
number 56200-
00Ca

119 Tabie Top Passport EA No Bid No Bid X
I Photo Die .

Cutter Punch, 2" x
2"

120 High Tack EA No Bid No Bid %
Adhesive Mount .
Boards 8x10

SECTION IX - DISCOUNT % ON ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Ne Bid Comments

Line ltem Description Linit of Parcentage

KMeasure

Discount Percentage (%) for Photographic, Audio and Visual Equipment and
Supplies {NOT LESS THAN], As Specified

Introducedon: _______November 8 2024
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