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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Gary Quinn

] ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Gerry P. Little Tel: (732)929-2005
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines Fax: (732)505-1918
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Joseph H. Vicari
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: December 15, 2021 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS to Garden
State Highway Products, Inc., the sole qualified bidder. (B2021-179)

Official Resolution# [2021001730
Meeting Date 12/15/2021
Introduced Date 12/15/2021
Adopted Date 12/15/2021
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON
Michaue \. Guashner”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:m.1-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

9

RESOLUTION

December 15, 2021

WHEREAS, on October 19, 2021, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

for the County of Ocean; and
WHEREAS, at the advertised time, one response was received from the
following bidder:
Name of Bidder . Address of Bidder
Garden State Highway Products, Inc. 301 Riverside Drive

Millville, NJ 08332
(856) 692-7572

; and

WHEREAS, after receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has
now recommended to this Board that the sole qualified bid, according to specifications, be
accepted namely that of, GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into a contract, accepting the bid for the furnishing and delivery of Completed Traffic
Signs for the County of Ocean, from date of award through December 14, 2022, a period of
one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the
right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A: 11-15, as follows:

Introduced on: December 15, 2021
Adopted on: December 15, 2021
Official Resolutipnp#: 2021001730




‘ Res-Pg:m.1-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 DECEMBER 15, 2021

GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC. for one hundred eighty eight
(188) items, to wit:
ITEMSNO. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, |
25,126,217, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49,
50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74,
75,76,717,78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99,
100, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118,
119,120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137,
138,139, 140, 141, 142, 143, 144, 145, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 151, 152, 153, 154, 155, 156,
157,158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164, 165, 166, 167, 168, 169, 170,171, 172, 173, 174, 175,
176,177,178, 179, 180, 181, 182, 183, 184, 185, 186, 187 and 188.
For a Total Lump Sum Award (Item #'s 1 - 188) of $122,533.77.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. Funds for materials shall be available within the following funding Source:
Engineering O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2021-179.

5. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of

Finance, County Engineer, and Newman Signs, Inc., the successful bidder.

Introduced on: December 15, 2021
Adopted on: December 15, 2021
Official Resolutipn#: 2021001730




. GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.1 -4
Bid No. TBD )
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

«

: . .oae s G I N L, . ST
Description ) RTINS . t Quantity . “-Unitof- T UnitCost .,  Total ,. NoBid _Comments , Delivery,
, ' ‘ . ‘ ST ¢, Measure } P E * ARO.:

Line ltem " |

A 1 R1-1 Stop, White on Red 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing- 20 EA $803.20 90-150
4 ASTM Type XI ¢ DAYS ARO
\"’/ Depending
on material

2 R1-1 Stop, White on Red 30" x 30" Alumjnum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing- 300 EA $39.04 $11,712.00 | 90-150
ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
.on Material

3 R1-1 Stop White on Red 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H38 Facing-ASTM 20 EA $58.21 $1,164.20 90-150
Type XI . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

4 R1-1 Stop, White on Red 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing- 200 EA $56.59 $11,318.00 90-150
ASTM Type IX - DAYS ARO
Depenﬂing
on Material

/ 5 R1-1 Stop, White on Red 48" x 48" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing- 10 EA $100.59 $1,005.90 90-150

ASTM Type X DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

6 R1-4 All Way, White on Red 18" x 6" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - 5 EA $6.14 $30.70 90-150

ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

7 R1-4 All Way, White on Red 18" x 6" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing - 20 EA $5.99 $119.80 90-150

ASTM Type X DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

IntroduceBRAPOSAL BRGNS, BEPORT

Adopted @ - COMPDETEDRRABFROBIGNS
Official Resplutjon#: 2021001730




GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ,
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Res-Pg:m.1-5

Line ltem

Description .~

- eoe e BEYL ey

", Unit Cost ¥

- Total., ‘ . No Bid

A e

.. Comments ’

¥

Delivery, '
P . ARO:™

J 8 R1-1 Stop, White on Red 18" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing - $14.92 $74.60 90-150
ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
\/ 9 R1-1 Stop, White on Red 48" x 48" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing 5 EA $103.47 $517.35 90-150
: ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
\/ 10 R1-5Bb Stop Here for Pedestrians Black on White / Red Stop Symbol 36" x 36" 20 EA $67.36 $1,347.20 90-150
Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
\/ 11 R1-5BbR Stop Here for Pedestrians Black on White / Red Stop Symbol 36" x 36" 20 EA $67.36 $1,347.20 90-150
Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
- Depending
on Material
12 R1-5Bb Stop Here for Pedestrian 36" x 36" Black on White / Red Symbol Aluminum 5 EA $68.90 $344.50 90-150
\/ Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type Xi DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
13 R1-5BbR Stop Here for Pedestrian 36" x 36" Black on White / Red Symbol Aluminum 5 EA $68.90 $344.50 90-150
/ Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
. Depending
' on Material
\
/ 14 R2-1 Speed Limit (XXX} Blank Speed White on Red 24" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 50 EA $34.71 $1,735.50 90-150
.80/5052 H38 Facing ASTM Typ XI DAYS ARO
‘ Depending
on Material
\/ 15 R2-1 Speed Limit (XXX} Blank Speed White on Red 24" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 5 EA $33.80 $169.00 90-150
.80/5052 H38 Facing ASTM Typ IX : DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

IntroducedRIAPOSAL BetebhivtrNE, BOPORT

Adopted @ - COMPDETEBIRRABFROBIGNS
Official Rgsglutipn#: 2021001730




GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Res-Pg:m.1-6

N /

/

VAR
/ 18
v

/|
/7
/

Line ltem Description ' " Quantity ¥ Unitof .~ “Unit Cost *" " Total U NoBid ' Comments _ Delivery, -
- a : : Ch ot b aMeasure, T e E T ARO.."
16 R2-1 Speed Limit {XXX) Blank Speed White on Red 30" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 150 EA $50.71 $7,606.50 90-150
.80/5052 H38 Facing ASTM Typ IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
R2-1 Speed Limit (XXX) Blank Speed White on Red 30" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 5 EA $52.06 $260.30 90-150
.80/5052 H38 Facing ASTM Typ XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
R3-1 No Right Turn, Red and Black on White 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- S EA $28.60 $143.00 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
' Depending
on Material
19 R3-1 No Right Turn 24"x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing - ASTM 40 EA $27.86 $1,114.40 90-150
Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
R3-1 No Right Turn, 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing ASTM 10 EA $62.68 $626.80 90-150
Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
21 R3-1 No Right Turn 36"x36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge ~.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM 5 EA $64.35 $321.75 90-150
Type Xl DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
22 R3-2 No Left Turn 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM 5 EA $28.60 $143.00 90-150
Type XI ’ . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
23 R3-2 No Left Turn 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing - ASTM 40 EA $27.86 $1,114.40 90-150
Type X DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

introduced® BRPOSAL BK2ekBAENS, BEPORT

Adopted did - COMMREGHBLERAPFOTIGNS
Official Resglfign#: 2021001730




GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC. 4 .
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.1 -7
Bid No. TBD :
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Line ltem “Deseription-« .l 0T Quantity N Unit.of |4

P d SR Measure

"Unit Cost .
T

© 7 NoBid * Comments Delivery,
‘ . ARO:T

Total

24 R3-2 No Left Turn 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM $626.80

Type IX

90-150
DAYS ARO

Depending
on Material

25 R3-2 No Left Turn 36"x36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type 5 EA $64.35 $321.75 90-150

X DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

26 R3-3 No Turns, Black on White 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 5 EA $27.76 $138.80 50-150
Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

27 R3-3 No Turns 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing - ASTM Type IX 40 EA $27.04 $1,081.60 90-150
DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

28 R3-3 No Turns 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX 20 EA $60.85 $1,217.00 90-150

: DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

29 R3-3 No Turns 36"x36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
DAYS ARC
Depending
on Material

30 R3-4 No U Turn, Red and Black on White 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 5 EA $28.60 $143.00 90-150
H-38 Facing-ASTM Type X} DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

Al S S A AL A

/ 31 R3-4 No U Turn, Red and Black on White 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 40 ’ EA $27.86 $1,114.40 90-150
H-38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO

Depending

on Material

introduced®BRPOSALBAGMHIENST FERORT

Adopted oBid - COMMEGRIMDERAFRRC2IIGNS
Official Resglyfign#: 2021001730



,,  GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ’

Bid No. TBD

COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Res-Pg:m.1-8

Line ftem Description Lo S ¥ Quantity J

' :Unit6§- ..+ Unit Cost., Tofa}l "~ NoBid * Comments - Delivery,-.
L T . w iiMeasure &7 - L v e S + _AR.O;

\/ R3-4 No U Turns 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H3é Facing - ASTM Type- 20 EA $1,253.60 90-150
IX = - - DAYS ARC
Depending
on Material
33 R3-4 No U Turns 36"x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type 5 EA © $64.35 ¢ $321.75 80-150
\/ Xl DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
34 R3-7L Left Lane Must Turn Left, Black on White 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 5 EA $43.38 $216.90 N 90-150
i / .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
35 R3-7L Left Lane Must Turn Left 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 30 EA $42.26 $1,267.80 90-150
/ Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
‘ Depending
on Material
36 R3-7R Right Lane Must Turn Right, Black on White 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 5 EA $43.38 $216.90 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI . DAYS ARO
i Depending
on Material
37 R3-7R Right Lane Must Turn Right 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 30 EA $42.26 $1,267.80 90-150
/ Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
38 R3-9b Center Lane, Black on White 24" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H-38 50 EA $40.56 $2,028.00 |- 90-150
/ Facing-ASTM Type IX ‘ DAYS ARO
: Depending
on Material
/ 39 R3-9b Center Lane, Black on White 24"x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 5 EA $41.65 $208.25 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type X DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

Introduce® BR:POSAL DEschibeE NS, BEPORT

Adopted @I - CONMPRETEDLERABFOZAGNS
Official Rﬁﬁ)élétlf@#: 2021001730




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

Res-Pg:m.1-9

Line Item . Description | ol

" Quantity h; .Unitof* © unitCost .

]

< Total i Cohmgnts " Delivery,

s 1h e ® Measure e 7o e e LARO.:
\/ R4-7 Keep Right, Black on White 24" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 5 EA $34.71 $173.55 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type XI : DAYS ARO
. Depending
on Material |
41 R4-7 Keep Right, Black on White 24" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 60 ~EA $33.80 $2,028.00 90-150
. Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
42 RS5-1 Do Not Enter, Red and Black on White 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 5 EA $43.38 $216.90 90-150
/ .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
~ Depending
on Material
43 R5-1 Do Not Enter, Red and Black on White 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 40 EA $42.26 $1,690.40 90-150
/ .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
N Depending
on Material
44 R5-1 Do Not Enter, Red and Black on White 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
\/ .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
oh Material
45 R5-1 Do Not Enter, Red and Black on White 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 40 EA $60.85 $2,434.00 : 90-150
\/ .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
‘ Depending
on Material
46 R5-3 No Motor Vehicle, Black on White 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H- 10 EA $27.04 $270.40 90-150
38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
) Depending
} on Material
47 R6~1L One Way, Black on White 36" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 6 EA $20.83 $124.98 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

introduce® BR:POSAL DB2EHDAENG, BEPORT

Adopted did - COMPRETEDLERABFOTIGNS
Official Resplutipp#: 2021001730




o GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT S ‘ ' Res-Pg:m.1-10
Bid No. TBD

COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Line Iltem - LT L Description I ”—O.uantity_ i 'Upifof'

~ Unit Cost + : -rTbt_iaI‘, z‘ No Bid Comments  Delivery,

e e M Meastre™ ., et L , : "t AROQS.

v

48 R6-1L One Way, Black on White 36" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 60 EA $20.28 $1,216.80 90-150

N Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

49 R6-1R One Way, Black on White 36" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 6 EA $20.83 $124.98 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO

) Depending
on Material

50 R6-1R One Way, Black on White 36" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 60 EA $20.28 $1,216.80 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

51 R7-1 No Parking Any Time, Red on White, Double Arrow, 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy 6 EA . $11.52 $69.12 TYPE IX 90-150
Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

\/ 52 R7-1 No Parking Any Time, Red on White, Double Arrow, 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy 20 EA $11.79 $235.80 TYPE X! 90-150

Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
B on Material
53 R7-1 No Parking Any Time, Red on White, Right Arrow, 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy 6 EA $11.79 $70.74 90-150
Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type X! DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
54 R7-1 No Parking Any Time, Red on White, Right Arrow, 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy 10 EA $11.79 $117.90 . 90-150
Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX ’ DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
55 R7-1 No Parking Any Time, Red on White, Left Arrow, 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge 10 EA $11.52 $115.20 90-150
-.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

introduce® BQ:POSAL @&EHME Ng, BEPORT

Adopted did - COM PDETEDLERASFROBIGNS
Official Rqsé)élétif?#: 2021001730




A . . GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT o N Res-Pg:m.1-11
Bid No. TBD

COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Line item , Description 7 <%, o L o Quantity » " Unitof+ *+" Unit Cost * Total - *: * NoBid

- e " LEN
5 : ~ e T ooeeon areMeasure CaT,v e R

. o e » +

Comments, ' Delivery,
L ARO.

/ 56 R7-1 No Parking Any Time, Red on White Left Arrow 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 6 EA $11.79 $70.74 90-150
~N .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI . DAYS ARO
' Depending
on Material
\/ 57 R(NJ)7-4X Red On White Double Arrow 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 6. EA $11.79 $70.74 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
- Depending
on Material
58 R(NJ)7-4L Red On White Left Arrow 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H-38 20 EA $11.52 $230.40 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
59 R(NJ)7-41, No Stopping or Standing Red on White Left Arrow 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy 12 EA $11.52 $138.24 90-150
Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
' Depending
on Material
.60 R{NJ)7-4L No Stopping or Standing, Red on White Left Arrow, 12" x 18" Aluminum 5 EA $11.79 $58.95 90-150
Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
61 R{NJ)7-4L No Stopping or Standing, Red on White Left Arrow, 18" x 24" Aluminum 25 EA $20.28 $507.00 90-150
\/ Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
< Depending
on Material
62 R{NJ)7-4X Red On White Right Arrow 18" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 20 EA $20.28 $405.60 90-150
/ 38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
{
/ 63 R{NJ}7-4R Red On White Right Arrow 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge ~ .080/5052 H- 12 EA $11.52 $138.24 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

introduced 89 POSAL@Q&HMEN’I BEPORT
Adopted obid - COMMECEMbERAFRT23IGNS
Official Repgggigg#: 2021001730




.. .. _.._ _ GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC. .
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ' ~ Res-Pgm.1-12
Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS : S

Line ltem . Description O.uéﬁyity " Unitof> " %.UnitCost | Total -~ - NoBid Comments - Delivery,”
b : . . . el Measure -, B ;e . ! AROQ.:
64 R(NJ)7-4R, No Stopping or Standing Red on White Right Arrow 12" x 18" Aluminum 90-150
\/ ‘ Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
/ 65 R(NJ)7-4R No Stopping or Standing, Red on White Right Arrow, 12" x 18" Aluminum 15 EA $11.52 $172.80 90-150
- Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
, Depending
on Material
66 R({NJ)7-4R No Stopping or Standing, Red on White Right Arrow, 18" x 24" Aluminum 25 EA $20.28 $507.00 90-150
/ Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
. on Material
67 R(NJ}7-4X Red On White Double Arrow 12" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 25 EA $11.52 $288.00 ' 90-150
\/ 38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
oh Material
68 R{NJ)7-4X Red On White Double Arrow 18" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 25 EA $20.28 $507.00 90-150
\/ 38 Facing-ASTM Type iX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
69 R{NJ)7-4X, No Stopping or Standing Red on White Double Arrow 18" x 24" Aluminum 6 EA $20.83 $124.98 ) 90-150
Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
) Depending
on Material
70 R(NJ)7-4X, No Stopping or Standing, Red on White, Left Arrow 18" x 24" Aluminum 6 EA $20.83 $124.98 90-150
Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI ' DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
/ 71 R{NJ}7-4X, No Stopping or Standing, Red on White, Right Arrow 18" x 24" Aluminum 6 EA $20.83 $124.98 90-150
Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

Introduce&BQPOSALI&Q&HMEM B&EPORT

Adopted ddid - COMMETEBLERASFCIIGNS
Official Rqsgélétifa#: 2021001730




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT - 7 Res-Pg:m.1-13
Bid No. TBD : -
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

w

Line item

Delivery, "

Description )
- A.R.O.:-

: o . L -

"~ Total : «NoBid ~ _Comments

Quantity > Unitof 7 ¢ Unit Cost *
T Measuref}-‘gu L b

1

EA $11.52 $172.80 90-150
Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO

. Depending
on Material

72 R{NJ}7-4X No Stopping or Standing, Red on White Double Arrow, 12" x 18" Aluminum 15

73 R7-8 Reserved Parking Legend-Green (retrorefl) White Symbol on Blue (retrorefl) 6 EA $11.79 $70.74 90-150
Background - White (retrorefl) 12" x 18" (No Arrow) Aluminum Alloy Gauge - DAYS ARO
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI Depending
on Material

74 R7-8 Reserved Parking Legend-Green {retrorefl), White Symbol on Blue {retrorefl) 30 EA $11.52 $345.60 90-150
Background 12" x 18" (No Arrow) Aluminum Alloy Guauge -.080/5052 H38, Facing - DAYS ARO
ASTM Type IX : Depending
on Material

- 75 R7(NJ)7-8A Penalty Plate Black on White, 10" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Guauge - 5 EA $6.29 $31.45 90-150
.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type Xi DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

\/ 76 R7(NJ)7-8A Penalty Plate Black on White, 10" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Guauge - 20 EA $5.98 $119.60 90-150

.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

77 R(NJ)7-8A Penalty Plate, Black on White 12" x 10" (current penalty standard) 6 EA $6.29 $37.74 90-150

Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI (used in conjunction DAYS ARO

with R7-8) Depending
on Material

78 R9-3a No Pedestrian, Black on White, Red Circle / diagonal 24"x 24" Aluminum Alloy 5 EA $28.60 $143.00 90-150

Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

79 R9-3a No Pedestrian, Black on White, Red Circle /diagonal 24"x 24" Aluminum Alloy 30 EA $27.86 $835.80 90-150

Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.1-14
Bid No. TBD '
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Line ltem _ - . + Description

O.uan.ti't\? UFiit of -

D . .
. . Total -, No Bid Comments " Délivery,
Tw LT T o D N Meagsuygf ’

. " ,' ’ 2 . , - AR.O.

t

80 R9-3bL Use Crosswalk, Black on White, 18"x 12" Aluminum Alloy Guéuge -.080/5052
H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI

90-150
DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

81 R9-3bL Use Crosswalk, Black on White, 18"x 12" Aluminum Alloy Guauge -.080/5052 30 EA $11.52 $345.60 90-150
H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

82 R9-3bR Use Crosswalk, Black on White, 18"x12" Aluminum Alloy Guauge -.080/5052 5 EA $11.79 $58.95 90-150
H38 Facing - ASTM Type X! DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

83 R9-3bR Use Crosswalk, Black on White, 18"x12" Aluminum Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 30 EA $11.52 $345.60 90-150
H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

\/ 84 R7-8b Van Accessible Legend-White (retrorefl), on Blue (retrorefl) Background 5 EA $4.44 $22.20 90-150

Aluminum Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

85 R7-8b Van Accessible Legend-White (retrorefl), on Blue (retrorefl) Background 20 EA $4.34 $86.80 90-150

Aluminum Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

86 R7-201 Tow-Away Zone Red on White, 12" x 6" Aluminum Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 5 EA $4.44 $22.20 90-150

H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI| DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

87 R7-201 Tow-Away Zone Red on White, 12" x 6" Aluminum Alloy Guauge - .080/5052 15 EA $4.34 $65.10 90-150

H38 Facing ~ ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD .
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Res-Pg:m.1-15

,‘lineltem

L " " Description h

" Quanti
s \“" .

ty, . Unitof~ -
"+ Measurel , *F

_ Unit Cost *

'Totgil 5 ' ;

»

- NoBid:

x

- " Comments, "t Delivery,,

. .ARO:

f] . . Lo . .1
88 R10-15 Turning Vehicles Stop for Pedestrians, 30" x 30" Top FYG Black Letters & Arrow 6 "EA $47.84 $287.04 *190-150
\/ Bottom White Type XI/Red Stop Symbol, Black Pedestrian symbol and (for) DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
89 R10-15 Turning Vehicles Stop for Pedestrians Top FYG Black Letters & Arrow Bottom 20 EA $46.77 $935.40 90-150
White Type XI / Red Stop Symbol, Black Pedestrian Symbol, 30" x-30" Aluminum Alloy DAYS ARO
Guauge - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type IX Depending
| on Material
/ 90 R12-1 Weight Limit (XXX) Tons, Black on White 24" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 6 EA $34.71 $208.26 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type Xi DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
91 R12-1 Weight Limit (XXX) Tons, Black on White 24" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 20 EA $33.80 $676.00 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
92 W1-1R Turn Symbol, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 10 EA $42.26 $422.60 90-150
/ 38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
93 W1-1L Turn Symbol, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 ) EA $43.38 $216.90 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
94 W1-1L Turn Symbol, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 10 EA $42.26 $422.60 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
§
/ 95 W1-1L Turn Symbol, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 15 EA $60.85 $912.75 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
\
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GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

" PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Res-Pg:m.1-16

. Line item . Description-+ = .. v & K "
a e Lo vk

Quantity? ‘

(K9

Measure

Unitof °;

.~Unit' Cost 7 Total

oo = .

:." NoBid ' Comments :

Delivery,
.+ ARO.

OSSOSO S SN

96 W1-1R Turn Symbol, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
97 W1-2R Curve Symbol, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H- 15 EA $60.85 $912.75 90-150
38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
98 W1-2R Curve Symbol, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H- 10 EA $42.26 $422.60 90-150
38 Facing - ASTM Type IX ) ' DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
99 W1-2R Curve Symbol, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 5 EA $43.38 $216.90 90-150
H38 Facing - ASTM Type Xi DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
100 W1-2L Curve Symbol, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
38 Facing - ASTM Type X! DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
101 W1-2L Curve Symbol, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 5 EA $43.38 $216.90 90-150
H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
102 W1-8 Chevron, Black on Yellow 18" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 5 EA $20.83 $104.15 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
103 W1-8 Chevron, Black on Yellow 18" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 20 EA $20.28 $405.60 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
- Depending
on Material
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GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

'Res-Pg:m.1-17

"Line Item

NN

NSO SO S S

Description  «*, . . Quantity. " “‘Unitof .*, UnitCost-."" Total % Comments - Delivery,
] ) T L Measure tc 00 o ) ~ ARO.:
104 W1-8 Chevron, Black on Yellow 24" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 10 EA $33.80 $338.00 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
105 W1-8 Chevron, Black on Yellow 24" x 30 " Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 5 EA $34.71 $173.55 90-150
Facing - ASTM Type Xi DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
106 W?2-1 Crossroad, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-~38 5 EA $43.38 $216.90 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
107 W2-1 Crossroad, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 10 EA $42.26 $422.60 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
108 W2-1 Crossroad, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type Xi DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
109 W2-1 Crossroad, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 10 EA $60.85 $608.50 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
110 W2-2 Sideroad, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 5 EA $43.38 $216.90 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type XI ' DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
111 W?2-2 Sideroad, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 20 EA $42.26 $845.20 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

" Res-Pg:m.1-18

Line ltem

Description” Delivery, *

AR.O.:

- .Quantity ,* © Unitof . " Unit Cost
Cee MessyE @k L

Total " NoBid . Comments -

\/ 112 W?2-2 Sideroad, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
Facing-ASTM Type X| : DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
113 W2-2 Sideroad, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 15 EA $60.85 $912.75 90-150
\/ Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
}
114 W3-1 Stop Ahead, Black on Yellow Symbol White Border on Red Background 36" x 36" 5 EA $68.90 $344.50 90-150
\/ Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
115 W3-1 Stop Ahead, Black on Yellow Symbol White Border on Red Background 36" x 36" 20 EA $67.36 $1,347.20 90-150
/ Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX : DAYS ARO
Depending,
on Material
116 W3-1 Stop Ahead, Black on Yellow Symbol White Border on Red Background 18" x 18" 10 EA $16.84 $168.40 90-150
\/ Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type X DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
117 W3-1 Stop Ahead, Black on Yellow, 36"x 36" Symbol White Border on Red Background 6 EA $68.90 $413.40 90-150
\/ Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type X ) DAYS ARO
Depending
' on Material
/ 118 W3-2 Yield Ahead, Yield Symbol White on Red, Border & Arrow Black on Yellow 36" x 10 EA $67.36 $673.60 90-150
36 " Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
119 W3-2 Yield Ahead, Yield Symbol White on Red, Border & Arrow Black on Yellow 48" x t 3 EA $68.90 $206.70 90-150
48 " Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

IntroducedfdH? POSAlDREUHHEYTBEF ORT
Adopted oitid - COMPEEFMDEFRISFE0RBIGNS
Official Regojytion: 2021001730




GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
'~ Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

- Res-Pg:m.1-19

Description

s thntity;f

2

. . Unitof.. % UnitCost "

Total

NoBid > Comments  Delivery,

W F e

«

. .y Measure 'f 5

ARQ.: .

N N N R N

120 W3-3 Signal Ahead, Symbol, Black on Yellow 36" x 36 " Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 20 EA $67.36 $1,347.20 90-150
.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX : DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
121 W3-3 Signal Ahead, Symbol, Black on Yellow 48" x 48 " Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 3 EA $68.90 $206.70 90-150
.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
122 WA4-2L Lane Reduction, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H- S EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
123 W4-2L Lane Reduction, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H- 5 EA $60.85 $304.25 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
: Depending
on Material
124 W4-2R Lane Reduction, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H- 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type X| DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
125 W4-2R Lane Reduction, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 20 EA $60.85 $1,217.00 90-150
H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
, on Material
126 W4-3L Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
127 W4-3L Black on Yellow, 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - 5 EA $60.85 $304.25 90-150
/ ASTM Type IX : DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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o GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.1-20
Bid No. TBD ‘
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Total i NoBid  Comments’ Delivery,

* . 't ARO: |

Line ftem ., Unitof * - !Unit Cost *:

sl Measure Y, o e s T

# A

7 Description  *- ", . s LT "Quantity

w " “ ~ - .- a¥ e

128. W4-3R Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM 5 $62.47 $312.35 90-150
/ Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
129 W4-3R Black on Yellow, 36"x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38 Facing - 5 EA $60.85 $304.25 90-150
/ ASTM Type IX . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
130 W6-1 Divided Highway, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H- 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type XI - DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
131 W6-1 Divided Highway, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H- 10 EA $60.85 $608.50 . |90-150
/ 38 Facing-ASTM Type IX - : DAYS ARC
Depending
on Material
132 W(NJ)8-5 Bridge Freezes Before Road Surface, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type X| DAYS ARO
 Depending
- on Material
133 W(NJ)8-5 Bridge Freezes Before Road Surface, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum 5 EA $60.85 $304.25 90-150
/ Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX ' DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
134 W11-1 Bike, Fluorescent Yellow Green 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H- 20 EA $42.26 $845.20 90-150
/ 38 Facing-ASTM Type IX ) DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
135 W11-1 Bike, Black on Flourescent Yellow Green 30"x30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 6 EA $43.38 $260.28 90-150
.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI o i N DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

Res-Pg:m.1-21

Line ltem

Description " =

T a

» . Quantity.” - unitof
_i» Measure ~ ;'

" e At
.f* UnitCost ~ ¢ Total -

. Comments . Delivery,

A.R.O.:-

136 W11-2 Pedestrian, Fluorescent Yellow Green 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 60 EA $42.26 $2,535.60 90-150
\/ .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on'Material
137 W11-2 Pedestrian, Fluorescent Yellow Green 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 40 EA $60.85 $2,434.00 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
» Depending
on Material
138 W11-2 Pedestrian, Black on Flourescent Yellow Green 30"x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge 6 EA $43.38 $260.28 90-150
/ -~ .080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
139 W11-2 Pedestrian, Black on Flourescent Yeliow Green 36"x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge 6 EA $62.47 $374.82 90-150
/ -.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type X! ' ' DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
140 W11-3 Deer, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing- 5 EA $43.38 $216.90 90-150
/ ASTM Type XI | DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
141 W11-3 Deer, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing- 20 EA $42.26 $845.20 90-150
ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
142 W11-8 Emergency Vehicle, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type X! DAYS ARO
: Depending
on Material
/ 143 W11-8 Emergency Vehicle, Black on Yellow 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 10 EA $60.85 $608.50 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX ; DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.1-22
Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS.

Line ltem . Description i C'J.uantity, ! “Unitof » & Unit Cost "¢ ."Total :‘ NoBid . Comments « Delivery,
' ’ ' T S LT “ Measures Lt T ‘; ’ ' AR.O.:
144 W13-1 Advisory Plate (blank}, Black on Yellow 18" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 5 EA $15.62 $78.10 90-150
\/ .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
145 W13-1 Advisory Plate (blank), Black on Yellow 18" x 18" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 20 EA $15.21 $304.20 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
146 W13-1 Advisory Plate (blank), Black on Yellow 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 5 EA $27.76 $138.80 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type X! . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
147 W13-1 Advisory Plate (blank) Black on Yellow 24" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 20 EA $27.04 $540.80 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
148 W15-1 Playground, Black on Yellow Fluorescent Green 36" x 36" Aluminum Alloy 5 EA $62.47 $312.35 90-150
Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI = DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
149 W15-1 Playground, Black on Flourescent Yellow Green 36"x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge 10 EA $60.85 $608.50 90-150
/ - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
150 W16-1 Share the Road, Fluorescent Yellow Green 18" x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 15 EA $20.28 $304.20 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
/ 151 W16-1 Share The Road, Black on Flourescent Yellow Green, 18"x 24" Aluminum Alloy 5 EA $20.83 $104.15 90-150
Gauge - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type X| DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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) GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT 'Res-Pg:m.1-23
Bid No. TBD _
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

“ . No Bid (‘Co;nments ¢ Delivery, *
Set AR.O.:

2. v

Line item ) ' Description s Wy el Quantity g Unitof! .o UnitCost *t Total .
, g . o © 87 W' Measure' ,, =4

5
L
{,'
i

\/ 152 W16-7p Diagonal Arrow (left), Black on Yellow Fluorescent Green 24" x 12" Aluminum 75 EA $§13.52 $1,014.00 90-150
Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX L DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

/\/ 153 W16-7p Diagonal Arrow (Left) Black on Flourescent Yellow Green, 12"x 24" Aluminum 5 EA $13.88 $69.40 90-150
Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARC
Depending
on Material

/ 154 W16-7pR Diagonal Arrow (Right) Black on Flourescent Yellow Green, 12"x 24" 5 EA $13.88 $63.40 90-150
Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

155 W16-9p Ahead, Black on Yellow Fluorescent Green 24" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 50 EA $13.48 $674.00 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
’ Depending
on Material

156 W16-9p (Ahead) Black on Flourescent Yellow Green, 12"x 24" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 50 EA $13.88 $694.00 90-150
.080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
) Depending
on Material

157 W(NJ)25-2 Hidden Driveway, Black on Yellow 30" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 10 EA $43.38 $433.80 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type XI ' . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

/

158 W(NJ)25-2 Hidden Driveway Black on Yellow, 30"x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 30 EA $42.26 $1,267.80 90-150
.080/5052 H38 Facing - ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

/ .

159 M2-1 JCT, Blue on Yellow 21" x 15"Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing- 15 EA $15.25 $228.75 90-150
/ ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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o GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ' Res-Pg:m.1-24
Bid No. TBD | |
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS | :

Line ltem T Description = 7 Tl Coae v i UpitCOSt;j'.l:,' Total l

+a

No Bid = ! Comments’. Delivery,
I T R 4 SR 5 s " . ARO:-

160 M3-1 North, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 24" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 20 - EA $13.93 $278.60 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX ' DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

161 M3-2 East, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 24" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 20 EA $13.93 $278.60 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

162 M3-3 South, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 24" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 20 EA $13.93 $278.60 90-150
.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material

/ 163 M3-4 West, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 24" x 12" Aluminum Alloy Gauge- 20 EA $13.93 $278.60 90-150

.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
.| Depending
on Material
164 M5-1 Left Turn, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" Aluminum Alloy 10 EA $15.25 $152.50 90-150
Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
165 M5-1 Right Turn, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" Aluminum Alloy 10 EA $15.25 $152.50 90-150
Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
166 M5-2 Left Turn, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" Aluminum Alloy 10 EA $15.25 $152.50 : 90-150
Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
J
/ 167 M5-2 Right Turn, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" Aluminum Alloy 10 EA $15.25 $152.50 90-150
Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
R Depending
on Material
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GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:m.1-25
Bid No. TBD '
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

3

::;._~. Total 1. WNoBid- " Comments Delivery; -

Line item . Description © + .. ¢ £ :. . duantl’ty;;:" Unit'gf‘!f”'h

B A . .
Tar n ’ < ¢ " A-.‘. PN S - Measure., * « ot R . E rARO‘

168 M6-1 Left Arrow, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" Aluminum Alloy 10 EA $15.25 $152.50 90-150
\/ Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
169 M6-3 Straight Arrow, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" Aluminum Alloy 10 EA _ $15.25 $152.50 90-150
/ Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
170 M86-4 Double Arrow, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" Aluminum Alloy 10 EA $15.25 $152.50 90-150
Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX ) DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
/ 171 M6-6 Straight and Right Arrow, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" 10 EA $15.25 $152.50 90—1§O
Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX R DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
172 M6-7 Straight and Right Arrow, County Route Marker, Yellow on Blue 21" x 15" 10 EA $15.25 $152.50 90-150
/ Aluminum Alloy Gauge-.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
173 OM-1L Object Marker, Black on Yellow 12" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 10 EA $20.83 $208.30 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type XI : DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
174 OM-1L Object Marker, Black on Yellow 12" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 12 EA $20.28 $243.36 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
/ 175 OM-1R Object Marker, Black on Yellow 12" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 6 EA $20.83 $124.98 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type X| DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Res-Pg:m.1-26

Line Item
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1

‘s . ’

. N Q

* Quantity

. s

4. Unitof " ; " Unit Cost ™4 .
Measure - . -

-

Total

P {

Comments .

R

Delivery, .
ARO:; -

176 OM-1R Object Marker, Black on Yellow 12" x 36" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H- 12 EA $20.28 $243.36 90-150
\/ 38 Facing-ASTM Type IX ’ DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
177 $3-1 School Bus Stop Ahead (Symbol), Fluorescent Yellow Green 36" x 36" Aluminum 50 EA $62.68 $3,134.00 90-150
/ Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
178 53-1 School Bus Stop Ahead {Symbol) Flourescent Yellow Green, 36"x36" Aluminum 5 EA $64.35 $321.75 90-150
/ Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
179 $1-1 School Advance Warning, Fluorescent Yellow Green 36" x 36" AluminumAlloy 50 EA $56.29 $2,814.50 90-150
/ Gauge - .080/5052 H-38 Pentagon Facing ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
180 S1-1 School Advance Warning Flourescent Yellow Green, 36"x 36" Pentagon Aluminum 20 EA $57.91 $1,158.20 90-150
/ Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
181 S4-2 When Children Are Present (plate), Fluorescent Yellow Green 24" x 10" Aluminum 20 EA $12.12 $242.40 90-150
Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
182 $4-2 When Children Are Present Flourescent Yellow Green, 24"x 10" Aluminum Alloy 20 EA $12.48 $249.60 90-150
Gauge - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type X DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
/ 183 S4-3 School (plate), Fluorescent Yellow Green 24" x 8" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - 40 EA $9.70 $388.00 90-150
1 .080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
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- ' GARDEN STATE HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
COMPLETED TRAFFIC SIGNS

Res-Pg:m.1-27

Line Item

- Description

4 Unitof .* UnitCost’: Total. :
Meastire s
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Delivery, :
+ ¥ ARO.:

/
/
VE
/
/

$4-3 School Flourescent Yellow Green, 24"x 8" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052. 90-150
H38, Facing - ASTM Type X| . DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
185 S4-5a (Blank) XXX MPH School Zone Ahead, Fluorescent Yellow Green 36" x 36" 10 EA $67.36 $673.60 90-150
Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H-38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
S4-5a {Blank) XXX MPH School Zone Ahead Flourescent Yellow Green, 36"x 36" 5 EA $68.90 $344.50 90-150
Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 H38, Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
. ' Depending
on Material
187 §5-2 End School Zone, Black on White 24" x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge -.080/5052 H- 40 EA $33.80 $1,352.00 90-150
38 Facing-ASTM Type IX DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
188 S5-2 End School Zone Black on White, 24"x 30" Aluminum Alloy Gauge - .080/5052 5 EA $34.71 $173.55 90-150
H38, Facing - ASTM Type XI DAYS ARO
Depending
on Material
TOTAL $122,533.77
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