Res-Pg:1.4-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

Tel: (732)929-2005
Fax: (732)505-1918

June 21, 2023 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
NO. Il to Castle Printing Co.; Concept Printing, Inc.; and Sharda Paper, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No
bids were received on Item Nos. 22, 32, 37, 38, 39, 40, 45, 49, 59, 61, 65, 71, 72, 73, 82, 97 and 104.

Recommendation is made to reject ltem Nos. 9, 11, 90 and 101. The

authority to enter into a negotiated contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:

as no responsive bids were received for a second time. (B2023-119)

County Purchasing Agent is given the
11-5(3) for all no bid and rejected items,

Official Resolution# |2023000839
Meeting Date 06/21/2023
Introduced Date 06/21/2023
Adopted Date 06/21/2023
Agenda ltem I-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-119
Result Adopted
CoNTy e [E 15 o Je | B
COMMISSIONER g fég g g Q % Q
Vicari v v
Quinn v v

Crea v v |v
Haines v v

Kelly v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

Michatie \. Gurstnor”

REFERENCED THEREON

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:1.4-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

o

RESOLUTION

June 21, 2023

WHEREAS, on May 31, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of SPECIALTY PAPER AND
PAPER PRODUCTS NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Castle Printing Co. Congept Printing, Inc.
1501 Rt. 46 W 40 Lydecker St.
Ledgewood, NJ 07052 Nyack, NY 10960
(973) 584-0990 (845) 353-4040
Sharda Paper, Inc.

378 Troutman Street
Brooklyn, NY 11237
(718) 628-4106 x 110

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, be accepted, in each instance, namely that of CASTLE PRINTING CQ;
CONCEPT PRINTING, INC. and SHARDA PAPER, INC. No bids were received on Item
Nos, 22, 32, 37, 38, 39, 40, 45, 49, 59, 61, 65, 71, 72, 73, 82, 97 and 104. Recommendation
is made to reject Items No. 9, 11, 90 and 101. The County Purchasing Agent is given the
authority to enter into a negotiated contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for all no bid
Item Nos. 22, 32, 37, 38, 39, 40, 45, 49, 59, 61, 65, 71, 72, 73, 82, 97 and 104 and rejected
Item Nos. 9, 11, 90 and 101, as no responsive bids were received for a second time.

WHEREAS, N.J.S.A. Chapter 40A:11-5(3) provides that, in the event no
qualified bids are received on two occasions, a governing body may enter into 2 negotiable
contract.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

Introduced on June 21, 2023
Adopted on: June 21, 2023
Official Resoluytion#: 2023000839




Res-Pg:1.4-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 JUNE 21, 2023

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting the bids for the furnishing and delivery of Specialty Paper and
Paper Products No. II for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award
through May 16, 2024 or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County
reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S, A, 40A:11-15 as foltows:

A. CASTLE PRINTING COQ. for six (6) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 4, 8, 14, 83, 119 and 124,
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. CONCEPT PRINTING. INC, for eleven (11) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 6, 7, 13, 15, 16, 18, 102, 103, 105, 118 and 124.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. SHARDA PAPER, INC., for eleven (11) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. items 3, 66, 68, 70, 74, 75, 76, 81, 91, 100 and 120,
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidder in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-119,

4. Be it further resolved that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made
available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

and the successful bidders.

Introduced on June 21, 2023
Adopted on: June 21, 2023
Official Resolution#: 2023000839




CASTLE PRINTING CO. Res-Pg:l.4-4
PROPQSAL DOCUMENT REPQRT

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I

Line lterm Dascription Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost ‘lotal Cost No Bid Delivery, ARO.:  Mir./Packaging: Carmments:

3 41/8" X9 172" 10 L] BX $137.60 $688.00 10 days 500 hox
Lb., Baronial Ivory
Linen Envelopes,
500
Envelopes/Box

4 41/2" %10 3/8", 5 CASE $137.60 $688.00 3 days 2500 carton
\1 #11 Policy

Envelopes, White,
2,500
Envelopes/Case

6 5'% 11 1/2", H14, CASE No Bid No Bid X
24 |h., Kraft
Brown Interoffice
Envalopes,
Printing on Both
Sides, 100
Envelopeas/Case
(See Diagram in
Attachments)

7 5 1/4" X7 1/4", 24 BX No 8id No Bid X
ib, CH Haywoad
White Envelopas -
A7, 250 per

Box Envelopes

8 51/2"X71/2", 28 5 BX $129.80 $649.00 10 days 300 vox
\1 Ib., Brown Kraft
Open Ended
Envelopes, 100
Envelopeas/Box

9 9" X 9" Blank CASE No Bid No Bid X
Square Envelopes,
1,000
Envelopas/Case

Introduced-on: June 242023

AdoptedRHOPOSAL DOGEIMENRREPORT

Official Regoluliqnfs 2PPIORPEI AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Ii
Page 6




CASTLE PRINTING CO. Res-Pg:1.4-5
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I

Line [tem Dascription Quantity Lnit of Measure Unit Cast Total Cost No Bid Dolivery, AR.O. Mfr./Packaging: Cornments:

91/2"Xx91/2"
Square Envelopas,
Printad on 2
Sides, 2 Colors
{Red/Black) on 1
Side, 1 Color
(Black) an 1 Sides,
1,000
Envelopes/Case,
{5ee Diagram in
Attachments)

13 10" X 10" special CASE No Bid No Bld X
Window Square
Envelopes,
Printed on 1 Side
(Black), 1,000
Envelopes/Case
(See Diagram in .
Attachments) i

Business Source
Tyvek Expansion
Envelopes,
Document,
Gusset, Pael &
Seal, White, 100
Envelopes/Case,
BSN 42201, or
Equal

\A 14 10" X 13" X 11/2" 5 CASE $490.00 $2,450.00 S days 100 box

Introduced-on-: lune 212023

Adopted®BEPOSAL DOUHSNAERIREPORT

Official Resokipati | 39230H8R%ND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il
Page 7




CASTLE PRINTING CaO. Res-Pg:I.4-6
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il

Line ftam Description Cantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, ARQ.:  Mfr./Packaging: Cornments:
a1 9" X 15 1/2", 60 CASE No Bid Na Bid X
Ib.,, Domtar
EarthCholce

HOTS, vallum,
Periwinkle, 500
Sheets/Ream, 10
Reams/Case

82 9'¥ 15 1/2", 60 " BX No Bt No Bid %
Ib., Periwiniie
HOTS Taxt Paper,
200 Sheets/Bax

83 9" ¥ 15", 60 Ib., & PKG 510800 5648,00 10 days 2500 sheets/case
J Astrabright

Celastial Blue
Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Package

a0 11"X 17", 110 |b,, CASE No Bid Mo Bid X
Futura Gloss Text,
1500 Sheets/Case

91 11" % 17" 65 1b, REAM No Bid No Bld X
Lynx White Caver,
250 Sheats/Ream

97 10X 17", REAM No Bid No Bid X
KromeKote C15
Die Cut 4 Up 10
pt/8 Shits, White,
Cut Finishes to 8
1/2" % 11", 2 Out,
200 Sheets/Ream

100 12%% 12", 1101b, CASE No 8Id No Bid X
Cardstock, Eclipse
Black, Sold by the
Case

Introduced-on: June-21,2023

Adopte®BRPOSAL DOGIIIENTREPORT

Official Rpeokuionts 3928009889 ND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I
Page 12




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. 1l

CASTLE PRINTING CO.

Res-Pg:1.4-7

Line em

Description

36" X 100", White
Wide Format
Glassy Rolls, 8 mil

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

$198.00

Total Cost No Bid

Delivery, ARQ.L:

$49,500.00

2-10 days

Mir. fPackaging: Commants:

SECTION VIl - BOXES, CHIPBOARD, TAG

120

81/2" % 14",
Nekoasa U20,
Manlla Tag CF,
250 Sheets/Ream

REAM

No Aid

No Bid X

Line ltem

Description

Unit of
Measure

Discount Percentage (%) for Specialty Paper and Paper Products {(NOT LESS THAN),
As Specified

SECTION X - DISCOUNT RATE FOR {TEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Percentage

Ne Bid Comrments;

Introduced on-

June.21 2023

Adopte@ ROPOSAL DOMEIERIREPORT
Official Bpolubienth, 392AMER%ND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il

Page 14



CONCEPT PRINTING, INC. ' Res-Pg:1.4-8
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD :
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. 1l

Lina ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR, Mfr./Packaging: Commants:

41/8"%91/2% 10
Lb., Baranial lvory
Linen Envelopes,
500
Envelopes/Box

4 41/2" X 103/8", CASE No Bid No Bid X
11 Policy
Envelopes, White,
2,500
Envalopes/Case

24 Ib,, Kraft
Brown Interaffice
Envelopes,
Printing on Both
Sides, 100
Envelopes/Case
{Saa Diagram in
Attachments}

/ 6 5" X 11 1/2", #14, 15 CASE $85.87 %1,288.05
",

7 51/4" X7 1/4", 24 25 BX $23.95 $598.75 Cougat opaque
\/ |k, ©H Haywood vallum
White Envelopes -
A7, 250 per
Box Envelopes

) 51/2"X71/2", 28 5 BX $59.8% £299.25 printmaster
|b., Brown Kraft catalog Gx9 244
Qpen Ended brown kraft {500
Envelepes, 100 per carton)

Envelapes/Box

9 9" X 9" Blank CASE No Bid No Bid X
Square Envelopes,
1,000
Envelopes/Case

Introduced on: June 21,2023
Adoptedft@PQSAL DIDAS/MEMRREPORT
Official Rezolulioniia 27398 AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il

Page 6




CONCEPT PRINTING, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-9
PROPQSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO.

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cast Tatal Cost Nev Bigd

Delivary, A.R.Q.: Mifr./Packaging: Camments:

91/2"X91/2" $138,400.00 price basad on
Square Envelopes, ‘ arder of
Printad on 2 2,000,000

Sides, 2 Colars
(Rad/Black) on 1
Side, 1 Color
{Black) on 1 Sicles,
1,000
Envelopas/Case,
(See Diagram in
Attachments)

13 10" X 10" Speclal 500 CASE 585.50 $42,750.00
Window Square .

\/ Envelopas,

' Printed on 1 Side

{Black), 1,000

Envelopes/Case

{See Diagram in
Attachments)

14 10" X 13" ¥ 11/2" CASE No Bid No Bid X
Business Source
Tyvek Expansion
Envelopas,
Pocument,
Gussat, Peal &
Seal, White, 100
Envelopes/Case,
BSN 42201, or
Exual

Introduced.on: lune 21 _2023
AdopteBMPOSAL D¢ G RIZREPORT

Official Resolubppts | 3928009889 N D PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I
Page 7 ’




CONCEPT PRINTING, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-10
PROPQOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. il

Line ltem Description

11 1/2" X 14 1/2%,
) J 28 |b., Kraft
tnteroffice
Envelopes, 8
Holes with String
and Button Seal,
100
Envelopes/Case,
Printing on Both
Sides {See
Diagram in
Attachments)

Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, A.R.Q.: MIr./Packaging: Comments:

$150.15 $2,252.25

16 17 5/8" x 11 1/2" 100 BOL $37.53 $3,753.00
/ x 11 7/16", Blank

Cartons - Brown
Kraft Envelopes,
25 boxes/bundle

SECTION I - LETTER SIZED CARDSTOCK, COVER AND SPECIALTY PAPER

J 14 81/2"X 11*, 100 15 REAM $133.91 $2,008.65
[k, Classic Linen

Cover Papear, Ayon
White, 250
Sheets/Ream

22 81/2"X 11" 110 REAM No Bid No Bid X
[b., Cardstock,
Goldenrod, 250
Sheets/Ream

32 8172"% 11", 24 REAM No Bid No Bld X
Ib., Domtar
Colarlok White,
500 Sheets/Ream

Introduced._an: June ')1, 2023

AdoptedP@fPOSAL DODE RERIBEPORT

Official Begolupera2P2HI08BRAND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. ||
Page 8




CONCEPT PRINTING, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-11
PROPQSAL DOCUMENT REPORT .

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il

Line Item Description

12 1/2" % 19", 70
Ib,, Opague
Smooth Paper,

| 1000 Sheets/Case

Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR.O.: Mfr./rackaging: Comments:

SECTION V - CERTIFICATE PAPER

102 81/2"% 11" 28 50 BX $24.28 $1,214.00
.\/ Ib., Cartificate

Paper, Parchmant
Cincture
Standard, Full
Color Various
Styles, 50
Sheats/Box

\/ 103 g1/2"X 11", 38 25 BX $44.80 $1,120.00
Ib., Certificata

Paper with Gold
Fall, Full Calor, 50
Sheets/Bax

104 81/2"x 11", 38 BX No Bld No Bid X
Ib., Cartificate
faper, Slenna, 50
Shmets/Box

105 8 1/2" X 11", 25 PKG 512,15 $303.75
. Certificate Paper,

Gold Serpentine
Border, GEO-
44407, ar Equal,
12/Pack

SECTION VIl - MAP, WIDE FORMAT, AND THERMAL PAPER

J 118 36" X 100", Satin 15 ROLL 53165.45 $2,481.75
' White Wide

Format Paper,

Sald by the Rall
Introdu 242023

AdoptePROPOSAL DO RIENTREPORT
Official Besolybipr¥a 38220098R%ND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il
Page 13



CONCEPT PRINTING, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-12
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid

Line tem Description

36" X 100", White
Wide Farmat
Glassy Rolls, 8 mil

Quantity Delivery, AR.Q.: Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

SECTION VIII - BOXES, CHIPBOARD, TAG

120 81/2"X 14", REAM No Bid No Bid X
Nekoosa U20,
Manila Tag CF,
250 Shaats/Ream

SECTION X - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line item Description Unit of Percentage Na Bid Comments:
Measure

Discount Percentage {%) for Specialty Paper and Paper Products (NOT LESS THAN],
As Specified

Introducedon:  June 21, 2023
AdoptepRUPOSAL DAMISINERIZEPORT
Offictal Brr ot PEEALIYPRIPERND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I

Page 14




SHARDA PAPER, INC. el A
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPQRT Res-Pg:1.4-13

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I

Lina Item Description Cluantity Unit of Maasure Unit Cost Total Cast

41/8"%91/2",10 $404.25
Lb,, Baronlal Ivory
Linen Envelopes,
500
Envelopes/Box

Na Bid

Delivary, ARQ.: Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

4 41/2" % 10 3/8", CASE No Bid No Bid X
#11 Poilcy
Envelopes, White,
2,500
Envelopes/Case

6 5" X 1L 172", #14, CASE No Bid No Bid X
24.1n,, Kraft
Brown Interoffice
Envelopas,
Printing n Both
Sides, 100
Envelopas/Case
(See Dlagram In
Attachments)

7 S1/4" X7 1/4", 24 BX Ne Bid No Bid X
lb, CH Heywood
White Envelopes -
A7, 250 per

Box Envelopes

] S1/2"X71/2% 28 BX No Bid' No Bid X
Ib., Brown Kraft
Open Ended

Envelopeas, 100
Envelopes/Box

9 9" X 9" Blank 2,000 CASE 577,95 $15%,900.00 500,000 Minimum
Square Envelopes, Order Required
1,000
Envelopes/Case

'“t"""‘“““ﬁ’ﬁbposxxgmgﬂg:@@\jr REPORT

Adopted on;,
Official RedHRIiGREC262300B46H-R AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I

Page 6



SHARDA PAPER, INC. .
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:1.4-14

Bid No, TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I

Lina ltem Deseription Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, A RO, MIr. fPackaging: Comments:

g1/2" X 11", 70
|b., Earth Choice
Opaque Grey
vellum, 530
Shaats/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

59 81/2" %X 11", 80 REAM No Bid No Bld X
ib., Neenah
Classic Linen
Cover, Graystone

61 g1/2" X 11", REAM Neo Bid Mo Bid X
Essay Paper,
White Sulfate,
School Smart or
equal, 500
Sheets/Ream

SECTION 1li - LEGAL SIZED CARDSTOCK, SPECIALTY BUSINESS, COLOR, AND INDEX PAPER

65 81/2" X 14", 20 CASE No Bid No Bid X
|b., Cream Paper,
1,000 Sheets/Case

\/ 66 81/2"X 14", 20 100 CASE $29.50 $2,950.00
Ib., Pink Paper,
1,000 Sheats/Case

\/ 68 §1/2"X 14", 20 100 CASE $14.30 $1,430.00
|b., White Paper,

1,000 Sheats/Case

J 70 81/2"X 14", 24 10 CASE $118.50 $1,185,00
Ib., White Paper,
5,000 Sheets/Casa

Introduced ")

Adopted oﬁ?ﬁb POSAQE’:&@M%@ REPORT

Official Re€itlitiGRECRAZBYIRAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. II
Page 10



SHARDA PAPER, INC. I
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:1.4-15

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I

Line Item escription (uantity Unit of Measure Linit Cost

8 1/2" X 14", 28
|b., White Domtar
Ledger, 500
Sheets/Reamn

Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR.Q. Mfr./Packaging: Comments;

72 81/2"% 14", 80 REAM No Bid No Bid X
|b., Natural
Parchment Text
Paper, 600
Sheets/Ream

73 81/2" % 14", 860 CASE No 8ld No Bld X
|b., Domtar
Opague Blue, 500
Sheets/Ream, 10
Reams/Case

74 81/2"X 14", 70 10 CASE $360.00 - $3,600.00
\/ ib,, Classle Crest,

Natural White,
500 Sheets/Ream,
5 Reams/Case

75 3 1/2" X 14" 70 20 CASE $162.00 $3,240.00

J Ib., Ralland Laser,
Hi-Tech, True

White 30, 500

Sheets/Ream, 4
Reams/Case

76 B1/2"X 14", 100 REAM 518.50 51,850.00
\/ B0lb,, Accent

Opaque Warm
White, Smoaoth,
250 Sheets/Ream

SECTION IV - OVERSIZED CARDSTOCK, SPECIALTY BUSINESS, COLOR AND INDEX PAPER

Adopted orp ROPOSALHBCINGERT REPORT
Official RestilitiGiRE C2OLTOOBSFER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il
Page 11



SHARDA PAPER, INC. . ]
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:1.4-16

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il

ling lem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, ARO.: Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

9" X 15 1/2%, 60 $2,550.00
|b., Domtar
EarthCholce
HOTS, Vellur,
Periwinkle, 500
Sheets/Ream, 10
Reapns/Case

82 g9" ¥ 15 1/2", 60 BX Na Bid No Bid X
Ib., Periwinkle
HOTS Text Paper,
200 Sheets/Box

a3 9" X 15", 60 1b., PKG No Bid No Bid X
Astrobright
Celestial Blue
Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Package

90 11"X17% 110 b, (3 CASE $139.00 $834.00 110# Not

Futura Gloss Text, Available Quating
1500 Sheets/Case 1004

91 11"%X 174 651b,, 5 REAM 53100 $155,00
\/ Lynx White Cover,
250 Sheets/Ream

97 11X 17, REAM No Bid No Bid X
Kromekate C15
Die Cut 4 Up 10
pt/s shits, White,
Cut Finlshas to 8
1/2" % 11", 2 Qut,
200 Sheets/Ream

100 12" X 12" 110 |b, 5 CASE 5396.00 $1,980.00 Packed 1,000

\/ Cardstock, Eclipse Sheeats/CASE
Black, Sold by the

Case

Introducedomr ——Jurnme 212023

Adopted oftROPOSALEHIGYMEHET REPORT

Official ReBititiGMECZARTIYORATER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. I
Page 12




SHARDA PAPER, INC. —
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT Res-Pg:1.4-17
Bid No. TBD

SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. Il

Line ltem Crescription

36" X 100", White

Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid
$149.75 $37,437.50

Delivery, AR.Q. Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

Minimurm 25 Rolls

Wide Format Per Order
Glassy Rells, 8 mil Cambined with
othar rolls

SECTION VIl - BOXES, CHIPBOARD, TAG

120 81/2"X 14" 10 REAM 465,00 5650.00
Nekoosa U20,
Manila Tag CF,
250 Sheets/Ream

SECTION X - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltern Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments:
Measure

Discount Percentage (%) for Speclalty Paper and Paper Products (NOT LESS THAN),
As Specified

Introduced on: 1

Adopted on: OPOSAG%@% REPORT

Official RedititiGREC2ALIVOBSIER AND PAPER PRODUCTS NO. i
Page 14



