Res-Pg:k.3-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey
Director John P. Kelly

08754-2191
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: April 16, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SNOW PLOW BLADES, GRADER BLADES
AND BOLTS to Chemung Supply Corp.; John Guire Supply, LLC; and Norcia Corporation, the lowest qualified
bidders. No bids were received on ltem Nos. 18 and 24. Recommendation is made to reject Iltem Nos. 17 and
19 as unresponsive. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid. (B2025-51)

Official Resolution# |2025000482
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaite \. Guainor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:k.3-2

TRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
APEH%.OB‘OCUMENTS. INVOICES, VOUCHERS

22025 -3

RESOLUTION

April 16, 2025

WHEREAS, on March 4, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of SNOW PLOW BLADES,
GRADER BLADES AND BOLTS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Chemung Supply Corp. John Guire Supply, LLC
2420 Corning Rd. 187 Brighton Avenue
Elmira, NY 14903 Long Branch, NJ 07740
(607) 733-5506 (732) 222-0613

Norcia Corporation Parts on a Dime

451 Black Horse Lane 1010 S. Sycamore Drive
North Brunswick, NJ 08902 Grove, Oklahoma 74244
(732) 297-1101 (855) 476-2363

Aluforce, Inc.

1123 South Service Road

W. Oakville Ontario, Canada L6L 6K4
(416) 277-5138

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely, that of CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.,
JOHN GUIRE SUPPLY, LLC and NORCIA CORPORATION. No bids were received on
Item Nos. 18 and 24. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 17 and 19. All no bid and

rejected items will be rebid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Snow Plow Blades, Grader Blades and
Bolts for the County of Ocean, for the contract period effective from May 1, 2025 through
April 30, 2026, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the

right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A 40A:11-15.

Introduced on: April 16, 2025
Adopted on: April 16, 2025
Official Resolutipn#: 2025000482
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 April 16, 2025

A. CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP. for fifteen (15) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14 and 15.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
CK-02-OC.
B. JOHN GUIRE SUPPLY, LLC for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 25.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
CK-02-0OC.

C. NORCIA CORPORATION for five (5) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 16, 20, 21, 22 and 23.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
CK-02-0OC.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

3. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding

sources: Vehicle Services O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-51.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

April 16, 2025
April 16, 2025
pon#: 2025000482
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Res-Pg:k.3-4
[JOHN GUIRE SUPPLY LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SNOW PLOW BLADES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS

Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments

Measure

Line ltem

Rubber Snow Plow Blade, 10" wide x 1%" thick x 11' long with Bolt Hole Pattern AS PER ATTACHED
SKETCH. Viking Part Number 180071, As Specified

15 Universal Curb Shoe for Gledhill Plow, Chemung Part Number, OST-1500, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X

16 Moldboard Shoe for 11’ Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number 15646-C or SAM Buyers Part Number EA No Bid No Bid X
1317140, As Specified

17 Plow Shoe (Mushroom Type) for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number SP-185-HlI, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
18 Mushroom Shoe Assembly for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number 7230-A11, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
19 Plow Shoe Bolt for Gledhill Mushroom Shoes (Square Head), Gledhill Part Number 5308-A532, As . EA No Bid No Bid X
Specified
20 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt for Western plow, %" x 2" USS Grade 5 with Nuts, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
21 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt, 2" x 4" USS Grade 5 with Nuts, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
22 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt for Steel Blades, %" x 24" L USS Grade S with Nuts, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
23 Snow Plow Blade Bolts for Gledhill Plow Rubber Blades and Curb Shoes, %" x 4" USS Grade 5 Alloy EA No Bid No Bid X

with Grade 5 Nuts, As Specified

24 8" Caster Wheel Assembly for Gledhill Plow, Gledhili Part Number, 7230-A15-8, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
/ 25 Snow Deflector for Viking Plow, %" thick x 12" wide x 11' long, Buyers Part Number 1309132, As 100 EA $191.53 | $19,153.00
\Y : o
Specified
Introduced-on- Alr_\ril 1R, 2025

Adopted HDHN GUIRRAPHIPFS,2006] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Regolufiendy RPERRPRIDES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS
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Res-Pg:k.3-5
[NORCIA CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SNOW PLOW BLADES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments

Measure

Rubber Snow Plow Blade for Gledhill plow, 10" wide x 124" thick x 9' long with Bolt Hole Pattern AS $410.00 | $20,500.00
PER ATTACHED SKETCH. Same Bolt Hole Pattern as Gledhill Part Number 7210-B9, As Specified
-
14 Rubber Snow Plow Blade, 10" wide x 1%" thick x 11' long with Bolt Hole Pattern AS PER ATTACHED S0 EA $500.00 | $25,000.00
SKETCH. Viking Part Number 180071, As Specified
15 Universal Curb Shoe for Gledhill Plow, Chemung Part Number, OST-1500, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
/ 16 Moldboard Shoe for 11' Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number 15646-C or SAM Buyers Part Number 50 EA $225.00 $11,250.00
[y 1317140, As Specified
17 Plow Shoe (Mushroom Type) for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number SP-185-HI, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
18 Mushroom Shoe Assembly for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number 7230-A11, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
19 Plow Shoe Bolt for Gledhill Mushroom Shoes {Square Head), Gledhill Part Number 5308-A532, As EA No Bid No Bid X
Specified
V/ 20 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt for Western plow, %" x 2" USS Grade 5 with Nuts, As Specified 200 EA $2.25 $450.00
V/ 21 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt, %" x 4" USS Grade 5 with Nuts, As Specified 1,000 EA $2.85 $2,850.00
VK 22 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt for Steel Blades, %" x 2%" L USS Grade 5 with Nuts, As Specified 3,000 EA $3.55 $10,650.00
V 23 Snow Plow Blade Bolts for Gledhill Plow Rubber Blades and Curb Shoes, %" x 4" USS Grade 5 Alloy 2,000 EA $4.60 $9,200.00
¥ with Grade 5 Nuts, As Specified
24 8" Caster Wheel Assembly for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number, 7230-A15-8, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
25 Snow Deflector for Viking Plow, %" thick x 12" wide x 11' long, Buyers Part Number 1309132, As 100 EA $200.00 | $20,000.00
Specified
Introduced-on: April 16, 2025

Adopted[HORCIA CORPﬂ]HATZON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggoluljoniiy 212500%48&DES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS
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' ~ Res-Pg:k.3-6
[CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

SNOW PLOW BLADES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS

SNOW PLOW BLADES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments

Measure

1 |Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 8' long with %" Top Bolt Holes for Western Plow, Western Part $70.00 $3,500.00
/ Number 49089, As Specified

2 Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 8%' long with %" Top Bolt Holes for Western Plow, Western 50 EA $72.00 $3,600.00
/" ’
U Part Number 49086, As Specified
3 Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 9' long with ten %" Top Bolt Holes for Western Plow, Western 100 EA . $76.00 $7,600.00
L/ Part Number 49251, As Specified
4 Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 8' long with %" Bolt Holes for Western Pro Plus Contractor 200 EA $81.00 $16,200.00
\’/ Grade, Part Number 66980, As Specified
/ 5 Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 8%' long with %" Bolt Holes for Western Pro Plus Contractor 100 EA $86.00 $8,600.00
W Grade, Part Number 66975, As Specified
/ 6 Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 9' long, 11 Hole for Gledhill Wing Plow, Gledhill Part Number 100 EA $92.00 $8,200.00
V1 7784-A1, As Specified
/ 7 Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 9' long with %" Bolt Holes for Western Pro Plus Contractor 100 EA $92.00 $9,200.00
U Grade, Part Number 66901, As Specified
/ 8 Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 10' long for Western Plow, Western Part Number 58818, As 100 EA $102.00 | $10,200.00
% Specified
/ 9 Snow Plow Blade, 6" wide x %" thick x 11' long with %" Bolt Holes for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part 300 EA $115.00 | $34,500.00
% Number 7784-A3, As Specified
10 Rubber Snow Plow Blade, 8" wide x 1%" thick x 8' long for Western Plow, Western Part Number 40 EA $206.00 $8,240.00
Vi 608291, As Specified
/‘ 11 Rubber Snow Plow Blade, 8" wide x 1%" thick x 8%' long for Western Plow, Western Part Number 40 EA $218.00 $8,720.00
A 608292, As Specified
V/ 12 Rubber Snow Plow Blade, 8" wide x 14" thick x 9' long for Western Plow, Western Part Number 40 EA $228.00 $9,120.00

608321,

Introdu :

cedrop——April 16,2026
Adopted[6HEMUNG SIgRPLY, 208%P] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rggolutigntly ROBRRPRISADES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS
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Res-Pg:k.3-7
[CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SNOW PLOW BLADES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments
Measure
/ 13 |Rubber Snow Plow Blade for Gledhill plow, 10" wide x 14" thick x 9' long with Bolt Hole Pattern AS | 50 | EA | $268.00 | $13,400.00
\A PER ATTACHED SKETCH. Same Bolt Hole Pattern as Gledhill Part Number 7210-B9, As Specified
/ 14 Rubber Snow Plow Blade, 10" wide x 14" thick x 11' long with Bolt Hole Pattern AS PER ATTACHED 50 EA $325.00 | $16,250.00
v SKETCH. Viking Part Number 180071, As Specified g
\ 15 Universal Curb Shoe for Gledhill Plow, Chemung Part Number, OST-1500, As Specified 200 EA $33.00 $6,600.00
16 Moldboard Shoe for 11' Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number 15646-C or SAM Buyers Part Number EA No Bid No Bid X
1317140, As Specified
T 17 Plow Shoe {Mushroom Type} for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number SP-185-HI, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
18 Mushroom Shoe Assembly for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number 7230-A11, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
19 Plow Shoe Bolt for Gledhill Mushroom Shoes (Square Head), Gledhill Part Number 5308-A532, As EA No Bid No Bid X
Specified
20 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt for Western plow, %" x 2" USS Grade 5 with Nuts, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
21 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt, %" x 4" USS Grade 5 with Nuts, As Specified . EA No Bid No Bid X
22 Snow Plow Blade Carriage Bolt for Steel Blades, %" x 2%" L USS Grade 5 with Nuts, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X
23 Snow Plow Blade Bolts for Gledhill Plow Rubber Blades and Curb Shoes, %" x 4" USS Grade S Alloy EA No Bid No Bid X

with Grade 5 Nuts, As Specified

24 8" Caster Wheel Assembly for Gledhill Plow, Gledhill Part Number, 7230-A15-8, As Specified EA No Bid No 8id X
25 Snow Deflector for Viking Plow, %" thick x 12" wide x 11' long, Buyers Part Number 1309132, As EA No Bid No Bid X
Specified

Introduced-en:i———Apri-16,2026
Adopted[GIHEMUNG APRPLY, 2623P] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rpgoluffeny PREAAPBISRDES, GRADER BLADES, AND BOLTS
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