Res-Pg:k.2-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Barbara Jo Crea

08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn (732)929-2005
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines (732)505-1918
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: April 17, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES to Plastic
Express, Inc. and The Hungry Puppy, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on item Nos. 43, 44,
45,46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 57, 58, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72,73, 74,75, 76,
77,78,79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 106, 107,
108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118, 122, 123, 125, 127, ...

Official Resolution# |2024000519
Meeting Date 04/17/2024
Introduced Date 04/17/2024
Adopted Date 04/17/2024
Agenda ltem k-2

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-54
Result Adopted
cory e Bl E ol B
COMMISSIONER § @ g g Q § Q
Crea v v
Quinn v v v
Haines v v

Kelly v v v
Sadeghi v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guestner”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolufi

Res-Pg:k.2-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
POCUMENTS, INVOICES,

RESOLUTION
April 17, 2024

WHEREAS, on March 12, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES
for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following

bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Plastic Express, Inc. The Hungry Puppy

667 Lehigh Avenue 1288 State Highway 33
Union, NJ 07083 Farmingdale, NJ 07727
(718) 499-1119 ext. 8201 (732) 938-4470

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent
has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications,
namely that of, PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. and THE HUNGRY PUPPY, be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSLEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of K9 Dog Food and Supplies, for the County
of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through April 16, 2025, a period of one
(1) year or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to
extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15. No bids were received for items
43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 57, 58, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70,
71,72, 73,74,75,76,77,78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98,
99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118, 122,
123, 125, 127, 128, 129, 131, 132 and 133. All no bid items witl be rebid. Item # 141 will be
rebid to obtain additional vendors.

A. PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. for twenty eight (28) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 12, 13, 14, 21, 22, 23, 24, 27, 28, 29, 34, 36, 39, 42, 55, 56, 59, 119, 120, 121,
124, 126, 130, 134, 135, 136 and 137.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. THE HUNGRY PUPPY for thirty six (36) items to wit:
ITEMNOS.2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9, 10,11, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 25, 26, 30, 31, 32, 33, 35, 37,
38, 40, 41, 87, 88, 89, 104, 105, 138, 139, 140 and 141.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

April 17, 2024
April 17, 2024
pn#: 2024000519




N Res-Pg:k.2-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 APRIL 17, 2024

2. Payments for the equipment and supplics to be acquired by this contract shall
be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with
the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-54,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shatl be
made available to the County Auditor, County Department ot Purchasing, Department of

Finance, Prosecutor’s Office, Sheriff’s Department and the successful bidders.

Introduced an: April 17, 2024
Adopted on: April 17, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024000519




PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:k 24
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT :
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

8. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package* ,

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

9. Submission of Bid Package™ |
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that faiture to do so may be cause for rejection,

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

K9 DOG FCOD AND SUPPLIES
Lina ltom Dieseriptian LQuantity Unit of Measure Lnit Cost Tatal Cost Mea fid Dielivery, AR O M /Packaging COMments
Food, Bowls and Storage

‘ J 1 Fromm 4-Star, 60 BAG 459,39 $3,563.40 10-14 Business
WhiteFish Potato, Days
26 b,

2 Purina Proplan 25 : BAG 586,80 $2,170.00 = 10-14 Business
shred Chicken Days
and Rice, 35 Ib.
Introduced on: April 17, 2024

o |

icial Reso SUPPLIES ' Y A1
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PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:k.2-5
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Yo pon

Cluart 1y

Ut ol BMeasarne

P vty A

W fia

Royal Canin
Garman
Shepherd, Adult,
301k,

8AG

$131.60

10-14 Business
Days

13

Milk Bane Original
Blseult Marro
Snacks, 40 oz.

20

BAG

$15.93

5318.60

10-14 Business
Days

14

Inception Pet
Foods -item
13280, WhiteFish
Reclpe 27 Ib.

15

BAG

$69.17

$1,037.55

10-14 Business
Days

15

Science Diet Adult
Light 5mall Bites
Chicken Meal &
Barley Recipe Dry
Dog Food - tem
PLU: 13502, 30ib.

15

BAG

$93.80

$1,407.00

10-14 Business
Days

16

Science Diet Adult
Light, Chicken
Meal & Barley
Racipe Dry Dog
Food - ltem PLU:
27605, 30ib.

15

8AG

$93.80

$1,407.00

10-14 Business
Days

17

Science Diet Adult
Perfect Weight
Hearty Vegetable
& Chicken Stew
Woet Dog Food -
ftern PLU; 37731,
13-0z., Case of 12

10

CASE

551,80

$518.00

10-14 Buslness
Days

Introduced on-

April 17 2024

AdoptedR@SPONSE DOGKINIE MT2REPORT

Official BeolkE WcPEUEAND suppLIES
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PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:k.2-6
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Lingr e Iescnption Quntity LniC of Maeasure Linit Cust Jatal Conl No Bid Delivery, ARG, MIr /P kaping Lutitnenty

18 Sclence Diat 10 CASE $46.20 $462.00 10-14 Business
Mature Adult Days
Savory Stew with
Beef & Vegetables
Wet Dog Food -

[tem PLU: 29544,
13-0z., Case of 12

19 Sclence Diet Adult 10 CASE 550,40 5504.00 10-14 Business
Sensltive Stomach Days
& 5kin Tender
Turkey & Rlce

Stew Wet Dog
Food - Item PLU:
44095, 13-z,
Case of 12

20 Science Diet Adult 10 CASE $50.40 4504.00 10-14 Business
Sansitive Stomach Days

8 Skin Salmon &
Vegetahle Entrée
Wet Dog Food -
Iteam PLL); 38529,
13-0z, Case of 12

21 Milk Bone Flavor 20 BAG 520,65 5413.00 10-14 Business
J Snacks Biscuit Days
Traats, Small, 7 (b,
2 Milk Bone Biscult 20 8AG $5.31 $106.20 10-14 Business
\/ Treats, Medium, Days
24 oz,
23 Milk Bane Biscuit 20 BAG 4531 4106.20 10-14 Business Comes Pack of 6
J ' Treats, Minl's, 15 ' Days
az,
24 Milk Bone Biscuit 20 BAG 520,97 $419.40 10-14 Business
Treats, Large, 10 Days
Ib.

Introduced-en: pri-172024-

Adopt i A

ofeal SESONSGDYPHNFILREPORT
Bid - K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES
Page 8




RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.

Res-Pg:k.2-7

line [tem

Descriplion

(Quankity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost Fatal Cost Ner i

Dulivary, AR,

Mfr./Packaping Cammeants

23

Milk Bone Biseult

[ Treats, Large, 4 |b.

20

BAG

514,00 $280.00 10-14 Business

Days

26

lack & Pup Elk
Antler, 8" Chews

BAG

Mo Bid No Bid X

27

Benehone
Wishbone,
Jumbo-Bacon,
Chicken or Peanut
Butter Chews

20

BAG

518,55 5371.00 10-14 Business

Days

28

Blua Buffalo
Health Bars Dog
Biscults Pumpkin
& Cinnamaon, -
Iltem PLU: 30416,
1-b pke.

15

PKG

$7.35 5110.25 10-14 Business

Days

29

Blue Buffalo
Health Bars Dog
Biscuits Banana &
Yogurt - ttem PLU:
32546, 1-lb pkg.

15

PKG

57.06 4105.90 10-14 Business

Days

Bl

Greenies Regular
{for dogs 25-50
Ib.) Dental Treats -
[tam PLU: 30539,
36 o2, i

15

PKG

545.99 $689.85 10-14 Buslness

Days

31

Large Treat Tote

EA

No dtd No Bid X

32

Rubiber Feed
bowl, 4 Quart

20

£A

519.00 $380.00 10-14 Business

Days

Introduced on:

33

Anr

Loving Pets Black
Labal Woaden
Woof Diner - item
PLU: 45219, 2 QT
L17.2024

EA

No Bid No Bid X

AdopteR@RPONSE DACUNERIAEPORT

Official Beroll 235 1 BHN %R suppLIES
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PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:k.2-8

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORY
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line Itom Dosctiption Quantity Unit of Measure unit Cost Total ¢l N Bid Polvary, A Mir Packaging Lamments

J Stalndess Steel Flat 4 741,20 10-14 Business
Side Pails, & Days d—
Quart; 192 oz, ﬂ'm
35 Stainless Steel No- 20 EA 534.85 $697.00 10-14 Business
Tip Feed Dish, 3 Days
Quart, 96 oz,
-../ 36 Stainless Steel 10 EA $34.50 $345.00 10-14 Business -
Palls, &-Cuart Days <¢ e;\..
37 Vittles Vault 50 |b. 5 BAG 576.93 $384.65 10-14 Business
Days
38 Vittles Vault 60 lb. 5 8aG 484.24 5421.20 10-14 Business
Days
Grooming & Bads
J kL] Furminator, Long 20 EA $32.20 $644.00 10-14 Business
Hair-M, Brush Days
40 Orthopedic Dog EA No Bld No Bid X
Bed, X-Large, 44"
% 27", PVYC Frame
41 MidWest Culet EA No Bid Na Bid X
| Time Ombre Swirl
Gray Pet Bed -
Itern PLU: 24804,
4Qin x 27in
/ 42 Bags on Board 19 EA 523,77 4356.55 10-14 Business
- Refill Rolls Blue Days
315 ct. - [tem PLU:
33350
Leashes, Collars 8 Muzzles
Introduced on: April 17, 2024

é?ﬁ!:i‘i%&mmné&ﬂm’@ﬁﬁmm

- K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES
Page 10



PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:k.2-9

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Lo Hers st aphion Cartity Lt ! o Lot €t Futan Cost Mo T Delivery, ARG M fPackeg np Comments

Dominant Dog
Collar, Ranger
Green, 17 inch

53 Dominant Dog EA No Bid No Bid X
Collar, Ranger
Grean, 18 inch

54 E-Lusive 2.0 EA N Bld No Bid X
Garmin L.D. Collar
{specify color)

55 Garmin Pro 550 5 EA $173.60 $868.00 10-14 Business
Electronic Collar Days

i\

56 Herm Sprenger 15 EA 459.68 58495.20 10-14 Business
\/ Black Stainless Days
Pinch Collar
3.2mm

57 Herm Sprenger EA No 8id Ne 8id X
Neck-Tech Sport
Martingale
Stainless Steel
Callar, 24"

58 Herm Sprenger €A No 8id No 8id X
Neck-Tech, Black,
$/5 Collar with
Cliclock Buckle
24"

59 Herm Sprenger 20 EA $31.28 5625.60 10-14 Business

J Stalnlass Steel Days

Pinch Coliar, 3.2
MM

60 Lead - Classk: EA No Bld No Bld X
Lead, 5 Feat with
1 Inch bolt

Introducg: April 17, 2024

d on:
o R o

Page 12




PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:k.2-10
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Lo b e Cluant ty Lt e Sloasten Lt Cost Dielivery, Ak, N R omrrents

Training Viest,
Black, 2 Small

114 Tralning Vest, EA No Bid No aid X
Black, 2 X-Large

115 Ultra Scent Case, CASE No Bid No Bid X
6 Jars/Case

116 NMFRAME-BLK: EA No Bid No Bid X
Nomad Frame
Harness

117 Plastlc Handled EA No Bid No Bid X
Dog Brush

118 HS5015324: Herm EA No Bid Na Bid X
Sprenger Neck
Tech Martingale
$/5 Collar with

Swivel 24"
/ 119 DC19005: Dogtra 20 EA 525480 45,096.00 10-14 Business
Fleld Star E-Collar Days
120 DCLS00SP - HF 20 EA $294.00 45,880.00 10-14 Business
\/ Dogtra 19005 Days
Handsfree Plus
B&RL
121 DC19025P-HF 20 EA 5446.60 $8,932.00 10-14 Business
Dogtra 19005 2 Days
Dog Handsfree
122 SRK-88: SIRIVS EA No Bid Ne Bid X
BREAKER BAR
Introduced on: April 17, 2024

AdoptepgpONSE DACUMENPHEPORT
Official Res okl FBHB%RAD suppLiES
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PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:k.2-11
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPQRT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOQOD AND SUPPLIES

Lipg e Boascnpbon Llanity Uni o Measure Lt Cost Tutal Cont Mo Delivery, A KO, M /Packaging Lommuents

123 CG5K-9DCHB: 5K-
9 DOGTRA
HOLSTER - Black

124 CGSK-90CHB: 5K- 20 EA $448.00 $8,960.00 10-14 Business
/ 9 DOGTRA Days
HOLSTER - Black

125 66-115-BLA: EA No Bld No Bld X
MILITARY SPEC
SINGLE LAYER
COLLAR 22" -
Black

126 GASSO-Garmin 20 EA $455.00 $9,100.00 10-14 Buslness
/ Pro 550 Remote Days
‘ Electronic Collar

127 BWO0O008024 Lavel EA No Bid No Bid X
4 Intermediate
Sleave

128 TOY00Q3017-M EA No Bid No Bid X
Squish Ball with
Strap - Madium

129 Kuranda Stimline EA No Bid No Btd X
Dog Bed 41° x 27¥

130 Kuranda 20 EA $238.07 $4,761.40 10-14 Business

j Aluminum dog Days
bed 44"x27"

131 Narc Bags Duck EA No Bid No 8id X
Cloth Large

132 Nylon Adjustable EA No Bid No Bid X
Vet Muzzle

Introduced on: April 17, 2024
AdoptedruspONSE DIIYTERAZREPORT
Official ReSCWie G PGP ARD suppLiEs
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RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.

Description

Qanity

[FRTIEH AT

it Ceast

Tt Cast

Dcliy, A R0

Mt slrackagirg

Guardian Harness No Bid
Black
134 30" x 1" Tubular 9 EA $50.33 5251.65 10-14 Business |
Tracking Line Days
135 15' x 1" Tubular 5 EA $34.93 5174.65 10-14 Business 4 ‘ \w ?‘:
Tracking Line Days ( \
136 Kang Core 10 EA 57.70 577.00 10-14 Business
J Strength Bamboo Days
Bone Dog Toy
Large - ltemn PLU:
46078
137 Kong Chewstix 10 EA $9.10 491,00 10-14 Business
Stick Dog Toy Days
Large - Itemn PLU:
43709
138 KONG Floppy 10 EA 522,26 $222.60 10-14 Businass
Knots Hippo Dog Days
Toy - item PLU:
38505
139 KONG Cazie Ultra 10 EA $23.79 $237.90 10-14 Business
Max Moaose Plush Days
Dog Tay - item
PLU; 44283
140 Kong Wubba 10 EA 524.64 524640 10-14 Buslness
friends Dog Toy - Days
ttern PLU: 46663

Res-Pg:k.2-12

DISCOUNT % ON ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Introduced an- April 17 2024

Adopte®BAPONSE DOBIINIERVREPORT

Official Bsolg ¥ FB3HBRAD suepLIES
Page 21




THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-13
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

8. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall compiete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

9. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

- PRICE TABLES
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES
b : Uil e Moy e
Faod, Bowls and Storage
1 Fromm 4-Star, 60 BAG $60.98 4$3,658.80
WhiteFish Patato,
261b.
J 2 Purina Proplan 25 BAG $71.99 $1,799.75
Shred Chicken
and Rice, 35 b,

Introduced on: April 17,2024
AdopteqpBPONSE DABUNENIHREPORT

Official Bepoldl ¥ FEHB%RAD suppuEs WdOf (b= \ded\ma
Page S Cd \m\cg)




THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-14
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

L lhem D niption Quantity Linit of Measure Lnit Cost Tertal € st No Hid Helivery, ARO MIr /Packaging tamimnaents

3 ProPlan Sport 30 BAG 564,99 51,949.70
\/ Active, 26/16 All

Lifa Stages,
Chicken, 37.5 tb.

4 Fromm Gold 15 BAG $54.99 582485
J Adult, Chicken &
Barley, 30 b,

5 Nutro Senlor, 15 BAG 579.99 $1,199.85 There Is no Senlor
Large Braed, lamb large breed.
Lamb & Rice, 30 {There is a Senior
Ib, Lamb OR Adult

Large breed lamb)

~

6 Purina ProPlan 15 BAG S80.99 $1,214.85
Senior, Bright
Mind 7+, Chicken
8 Rice, 30 b,

7 Kineth: Perform 50 BAG $64.99 $3,249.50
\/ Active 26k,
Chicken, 35 |b.

] Hills Prescription 15 BAG $190.99 $1,964.85
Diet, d/d, Potato
& Duck, 25 Ib.

.~

9 Hills Prescription 15 BAG 457.99 $869.85
Diat, d/fd, Potato
& Duck, 8 lb,

10 Nutro Adult 15 BAG £74.99 51,124.85
Chicken, 30 Ib,

11 Nutro Adult, Large 15 BAG 57499 $1,124.85%
Breed, Chicken &
Rice, 30 1h.

R

Introduced on: April 17, 2024

Adopteprpans WﬁﬂEPORT
Off-c'a'l%%? L

Page 6




THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-15
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
Kg DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

e drem Des:epdien Lt Ly EETIR RIATENLIY Uit Cosl Fatar Cost RTINS Deliysry, AR MV ki Lomments

12 Rayal Canin BAG No 8id No Bld X
German
Shepherd, Adult,
30 k.

13 Milk Bone Orlginal 20 BAG $19.99 $399.80

Biscuit Marro
Snacks, 40 oz,

14 Inception Pat 15 BAG 569,99 %1,049.85
Foods -ftem
13280, WhiteFish
Recipe 27 Ih.

15 Selence Diet Adult 15 BAG 578.75 51,181.25
J Light Smal! Bites

Chicken Meal &
Barley Recipe Dry
Oog Food - lkem
PLU: 13502, 30ib.

16 Science Diek Aduit 15 BAG 578,75 §1,181.25

/ Light Chicken
Meal & Barley

Recipe Dry Dog

Faod - ltem PLU;
27605, 30lb.

Perfact Weight
Hearty Vegetable
& Chicken Stew
Wet Dog Food -
Itern PLU: 37731,
13-0z, Case of 12

\/ 17 Selence Diet Adult 10 CASE $46.99 $469,90

Introduced on: April 17, 2024
gngPtﬁ PIPONSE DMMWPM;PORT
icial hesopl'a8e F5AB %D suppuEs
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THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-16

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

|t ' Jntab heasane ! Ly Delaviy ARG M Ak SR ELIRATIAN

Sclence Diet
\/ Muature Adult
Savory Stew with
Baef & Vegetables
Wet Dog Food -
Item PLLI; 29544,
13-0z., Case of 12

19 Sclence Diet Adult 10 CASE 445,99 545990
J Sansitive Stomach
& 5kin Tender
Turkey & Rice
Stew Wet Dog
Food - Itam PLL:

44095, 13-02,,
Case of 12

20 Science Diet Adult 10 CASE $45.99 $459.90
\/ Sensitive Stomach
& Skin Salmon &
Vegetable Entrée
Wet Qlog Food -

Itern PLU: 38529,
13-0z, Case of 12

21 Milk Bone Flavor 20 BAG $21.99 543980
Snacks Blscuit
Treats, Small, 7 Ib.

22 Mitk Bane Biscuit 20 BAG $8.99 $179.80
Treats, Madlum,
24 012,

23 Milk Bone Biscuit 20 BAG $6.49 $129.80
Treats, Mini's, 15
oz.

24 Milk Bone Biscuit 20 BAG 422.99 £459.80
Treats, Large, 10 |
Ib,

Introduced-omn: Aprit-17:-2024
Adoptedprp)NSE DARTMENPREPORT

Official fig=ort'BG FFAUAND suppLIEs
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THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-17
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Seapton arantily Lol ef B [FE R atal vt Ml et g, AR N fackaginy

Milk Bone Biscuit

J 5279.80
Treats, Large, 4 Ib.

26 Jack & Pup Elk 20 BAG 423,99 4579.80
\/ Antler, B* Chews

27 Benebone 20 BAG 520,98 $419.60
Wishbone,
Jumhbo-Bacon,
Chicken or Peanut
Butter Chews

28 8lue Buffalo 15 PKG $9.98 $149.70

Health Bars Dog :
Biscults Purnpkin
& Cinnamon, -
{tem PLU: 30416,
1-lb pkg.

23 Blue Buffalo 15 PKG 59.98 §$149.70
Health Bars Dog
Biscults Banana &
Yogurt - lterm PLU:
32546, 1-b pkg.

30 Greenles Regular 15 PKG 534,99 8524.85
\/ {for dogs 25-50
tb.} Dental Treats -
ltam PLU: 30539,
360z,

J a1 Large Treat Tote 5 EA, 51499 $74.95

32 Rubber Feed 20 EA $7.49 414980
\/ bowt, 4 Quart

\/ 33 Loving Pets Black 5 EA $19.99 499,95
Label Wooden

Waoof Diner - ltem
PLU: 45219, 2.QT
Introdug¢ed on: April 17, 2024

o TR or
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THE HUNGRY PUFPPY Res-Pg:k.2-18
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Line end [t ription Santity it of Moasure Unit Cost Totdl Cost Mo Bidd Dlivery, AR O, M /P kagiing Comments

a4 Stainless Steel Flat EA No Bid No Bid X
Side Pails, 6
Quart; 192 oz.

35 Stainless Steel No- 20 EA 514.99 $299.80
\/ Tip Fead Dish, 3
Quart, 96 o1,
36 Stainless Steel EA No Bid No Bid X
Pails, 6-Quart
\/ 37 Vittles Vault 50 |b. 5 BAG 559,99 529995
\/ 38 Vittles Vauit 60 ib, 5 BAG 575.99 $379.95
Grooming & Beds
39 Furminator, Long 20 EA 539,99 $799.80

Hair-M, Brush

40 Qrthapedic Dog 10 EA $69.99 $699.90

J Bed, X-Large, 44"

X 27", PVC Frame

41 MidwWast Quiet 5 EA $59.99 $299,95
© | Tima Ombre Swirl
Gray Pet Bed -
Itern PLU: 24804,
40in ¥ 27In

42 Bags on Board 15 EA $39.99 $599.85
Refill Rolls Blue
315 ct. - Item PLU:
33350

Leashes, Collars & Muzzles

43 ASAT, Lead, 20 EA No Bid No Bid X
Lx1/2"wW

Introducéed-en: Apl } 17, 2024
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THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-19
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

RN Secnploon Chidntity Uit of Kl Defovery, AR W S kgt [ SR IEITAT

73 Namad Harness EA Na Bid Nao Bid X
Frame with Metal
Cobra Buckles

80 Staintess Steel EA No Bld No Bid X
Chaoke Collar,
Black, 18"

a1 Stainless Steel EA No Bid No 8id X
Chaoke Collar,
Black, 20"

82 Stainless Steel EA No Bid No Bid X
Pinch Collar,
Black, 4.0rmm

a3 Tactical Bungee E- EA No Bid No Bid X
Collar Strap

84 Tactlcal Bungee EA No Bld Na Bid X
Leash Belt Holder,
Black

a5 Tactlcal Bungee EA No Bid No Bid X
Leash, Black

86 Tactical Patrol EA No Bld No Bid X
Harness with
Cobra Buckle,
Black

Products Coastal
Sport Wrap
Adjustable
Harness Medium
Black - (term PLU:
32261

/ 87 Coastal Pet 5 EA 432,99 $164.95

Introduced on: April 17,2024
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RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

THE HUNGRY PUPPY

Res-Pg:k.2-20
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Pnratem

Coastal Pat,
Praducts Coastal
K9 Explorer
Reflactive Padded
Harness 30" - 1"
Fern - ttem PLU:
31316

Ut of K

$199.95

Doy, &R0 M Dk Unmments

a9

Coastal Pat
Products Coastal
Double Nylon
Collar 20" Hunter
- ltemn PLU: 6595

EA

512,99

564,95

Tralning Alds

90

Balgian Bite Sulte
- Full Body

EA

No Bid

No Bid

al

Belglan Styla Arm
Bite Sleeve, Level
4, Jute Hard

EA

No Bid

No Bld

92

Belgian Style Arm
Bite Sleeve, Level
5, Jute Extra Hard

EA

No Bid

No Bid

a3

Belgian Style Leg
Bite Sleeve, Level
4, Jute Hard,
Adult Dog

EA

Nao Bid

No Bid

PCDA, - Left Bicep
Adjustable
Gauntlet

€A

No Bid

No Bid

95

PCDA - Right
Bicap Adjustable
Gaunilet

EA

No Bld

No Bld

April 17, 2024
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THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-21
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

Lot ol bt it Cos ISR Delizery, AR NS tunreEenly

PCOA Left
Forearm
Adjustable
Gauntlet

97 PCOA Right EA No 8id No Bid X
Farearm
Adfustable
Gauntlet

93 Blast Hose EA No Bid No Bid X
Reward Toy, 10"

99 Canvas Narcotic PACK No Bld No Bid X
Bag, 4" x 5", {6)
Per Pack

100 Euro Ball with EA Nao Bid No Bid X
Rope and Handle,
2.75"

101 I-Clicker, Clicker EA No Bid No 8id X
Training

102 Korg, Large, EA Na Bld No Bld X
Black, with Rope
Handle, 4"H x 2-
3/2° W

103 Kong, Large, Red, EA Mo Bid No Bid X
with Rope Handle,
4"Hx 2-3/4" W

/ 104 Kong, X-Large, 20 EA $21.99 543980
Black, S*H x 4
y2"wW

Introduced on: April 17, 2024
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THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-22
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

fane b Heweniption Culir iy it af Measure Unit ¢ osl Tatal Cast Mo Bid Delivirry, AL Mh Mackagmp Coramunty

Red, 5"Hx 4 1/2"
w

/ 105 Kong, X-Large, 20 EA 520,99 $419.80

106 Syntek Tug EA No Bid No Bid X
Handle, 2% x 12"

107 Synthetic Bite Bar, EA No Bid Nao Bid X
2-handle

108 Synthefic Tug EA No Bid No Bid X
Handles, 24", (2)
Handles, 6" Wide

109 SyntheticTug EA N6 Bid No 8id X
Handles, 12", {2)
Handles, 1.5"
Thick

110 SyntheticTug EA No Bid No Bld X
Handles, 12", (2}
Handles, 2.5"
Thick

111 Trainlng Vest, EA No Bid Nao Bid X
Black, 2 Large

112 Training Vest, €A No Bid No Bid X
Black, 2 Medium

113 Training Vest, EA No 8id No Bid X
Black, 2 Seail

114 Training Vest, EA No Bld No Bid X
Black, 2 X-Large

115 Ultra Scent Case, CASE No 8id No 8id X
& Jars/Case

Introduced on: April 17, 2024
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THE HUNGRY PUPPY Res-Pg:k.2-23
RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES

L [tem Dicrpitan Danlily Unil of Mueasure Linit Coslt Taral tonl Ny Hidd Diehviery, AR O M Backaping Carrnenty

136 Kong Core 10 EA 511,99 $119.90
Strength Bamboo
Bone Dog Toy
Large - [tem PLU:
46078

137 Kong ChewStix 10 EA 512.99 5129.90
Stick Oog Toy
Large - Item PLU:
43709

138 KONG Floppy 10 EA $14.99 514990
\/ Knots Hippo Dog

Toy - lkem PLU:
38505

4 139 KONG Cozie Ultra 10 EA 413.98 $139.80
\/ Max Maose Plush

Dog Toy - em
PLU: 44283

140 Kang Wubba 10 EA $14.99 $149.90
Friends Dog Toy -
Iter PLU): 46663

DISCOUNT % ON ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Lt of AYSREES! Lorrmerts

Measure

Doseriphion Horcontags

Discount Percentage (%) for K-9 Dog Food and Supplies {NOT LESS THAN) As
Specified
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