Res-Pg:m.3-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director John P. Kelly

] o ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Virginia E. Haines Tel: (732)929-2005
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea Fax: (732)505-1918
Commissioner Gary Quinn
Commissioner Joseph H. Vicari
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: December 7, 2022 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PROCESSING OF RECYCLABLE
MATERIALS to Brickwall Corporation; Ocean County Recycling Center, Inc.; and Herman's Trucking, Inc., the
lowest qualified bidders. (B2022-151)

Official Resolution# [2022001648
Meeting Date 12/07/2022
Introduced Date 12/07/2022
Adopted Date 12/07/2022
Agenda ltem m-3

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2022-151
Result Adopted
cowry —_ Ta T, T8 T, 2
COMMISSIONER x |30 % % |2 |2
Kelly v v
Haines v v v

Crea v v
Quinn v v
Vicari v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michatie |, Guatinor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:m.3-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ONALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOIGES, YOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

December 7, 2022

WHEREAS, on October 18, 2022, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PROCESSING OF
RECYCLABLE MATERIALS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Brickwall Corporation Ocean County Recycling Center, Inc.
25 First Avenue, Suite 200 1497 Lakewood Rd.

Atlantic Highlands, NJ 07716 Toms River, NJ 08755

(732) 291-8100 (732) 244-1716 ext. 8

Herman’s Trucking, Inc.

181 Jacobstown-Cookstown Road
Wrightstown, NJ 08562

(609) 758-3808

;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance be accepted, namely that of BRICKWALL CORPORATION;
OCEAN COUNTY RECYCLING CENTER, INC. and HERMAN’S TRUCKING, INC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed
to enter into a contract, accepting the bid for the furnishing and delivery of Processing of
Recyclable Materials for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award
through December 6, 2023 a period of one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to

N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as follows:

Introduced on: December 7, 2022
Adopted on: December 7, 2022
Official Resolutipn#: 2022001648




BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 DECEMBERES 5i@m-3-3

A. BRICKWALL CORPORATION for five (5) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4and7.
" This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. OCEAN COUNTY RECYCLING CENTER, INC. for nine (9) items,
to wit: :
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8and?9.

C. HERMAN'’S TRUCKING. INC. for eight (8) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7and9.

2. Payments for the services to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon recéipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices
and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2022-151.

4. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution
shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department
of Finance, County Supervisor of Buildings and Grounds and the successful bidders.

Introduced on;| December 7, 2022
Adopted on: December 7, 2022
Official Resolution#: 2022001648




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT BRICKWALL CORPORATION Res-Pg:m.3-4

Bid No. TBD
PROCESSING OF RECYCLABLE MATERIALS

Ling ltem Description Quantity Unit of | Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments
Measure
\/ 1 Concrete Recyclable Materials (Ton) : ' : 1,200 TON $10.00 $12,000.00
\/’ 2 Asphaltic Recyclable Materials (Ton) : ~ 1,100 TON $25.00 | $27,500.00
3 Concrete with Rebar ' - ) 550 TON $15.00 $8,250.00
\/’ 4 Concrete Pipe with Rebar . 200 - TON $15.00 $3,000.00
5 Stumps and Tree Parts ' 100 | ToN No Bid No Bid X |
6 Clean/Untreated Wood & Lumber . 25 TON _ No Bid No Bid X |
7 Mixed Concrete/Asphalt, Shall be 50/50 Concrete/Asphalt Mix ’ 2,500 TON $25.00 $62,500.00
8 Dirt 750 TON No Bid No Bid X
9 Sod Mixed with Dirt ‘ 750 TON " No 8id No Bid "X
1

Introduced oy Detember 7, 2022

AdoptddEaP OSAL DQ%AM&MH?EB@N
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

OCEAN COUNTY RECYCLING CENTER, INC. Res-Pg:m.3-5 ’
|
PROCESSING OF RECYCLABLE MATERIALS L

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments
Measure

Concrete Recyclable Materials (Ton) $18,000.00

2 Asphaltic Recyclable Materials (Ton) 1,100 TON $30.00 $33,000.00

3 Concrete with Rebar 550 TON $15.00 $8,250.00

/ 4 Concrete Pipe with Rebar . 200 TON $30.00 $6,000.00

5 A Stumps and Tree Parts . 100 TON $50.00 $5,000.00

6 Clean/Untreated Wood & Lumber . ‘ 25 TON $50.00 $1,250.00

7 Mixed Concrete/Asphalt, Shall be 50/50 Concrete/Asphalt Mix 2,500 TON $25.00 $62,500.00

8. Dirt - 750 TON $40.00 $30,000.00

9 Sod Mixed with Dirt ’ : 750 TON ) $40.00 $30,000.00 I
|
|
i
|
|
|

Introduced.on: December 7,2022

Adt_)p_teEIUDPOS_AL D (beCidvihbrii 7R REZ2R T
Official igsopRigpts 3060 AR CYCLABLE MATERIALS
Page 6 '




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PROCESSING OF RECYCLABLE MATERIALS

HERMAN’S TRUCKING, =8¢ -

Res-Pg:m.3-6

Line item Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total

No Bid

Comments

/ 1 Concrete Recyclable Materials (Ton) 1,200 TON . $0.01 $12.00

_ / 2 |Asphaltic Recyclable Materials (Ton) 1100 | ToN $14.00 | $15,400.00
/ 3 Concrete with Rebar 550 TON $5.00 $2,750.00
) / 4 Concrete Pipe with Rebar 200 TON $25.00 $5,000.00
/ 5 Stumps and Tree Parts 100 TON $55.00 $5,500.00
/ 6 Clean/Untreated Wood & Lu.mber 25 TON $50.00 $1,250.00
/ o7 Mixed Concrete/Asphalt, Shall be 50/50 Concrete/Asphalt Mix 2,500 TON $14.00 $35,000.00

8 Dirt 750 TON No Bid No Bid X
9 Sod Mixed with Dirt 750 TON $40.00 $30,000.00
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