Res-Pg:k.1-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Barbara Jo Crea

Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly

Commissioner Frank Sadeghi

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

February 7, 2024 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED to Driftwood Deli and Sub
Shop, LLC; Four Seasons Diner, LLC; and Mulberry Street italian Food Center, Inc., the lowest qualified
bidders. No bids were received on {tem Nos.18a, 18b, 18c, 19a, 19b, 19c, 20, 21, 22a, 22b, 22c¢, 23a, 23b,

23c, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28a, 28b, 28c, 29a, 29b, 29c¢, 29d, 30a, 30b, 30
33b, 33c, 33d, 33e, 33f, 33g, 34 and 35. They will be rebid. (B2024-

¢, 30d, 31a, 31b, 31c, 32a, 32b, 32c, 33a,
03)

Official Resolution# [2024000136
Meeting Date 02/07/2024
Introduced Date 02/07/2024
Adopted Date 02/07/2024
Agenda ltem k-1

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-03
Result Adopted
COUNTY sl el B
COMMISSIONER | | ) :(é > g !
Crea v v
Quinn v v
Haines v v v

Kelly v v |v
Sadeghi v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guetnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:k.1-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

February 7, 2024

WHEREAS, on December 5, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED for the
County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Driftwood Deli & Sub Shop LLC Four Seasons Diner, LLC
~ 936 Fischer Blvd. 823 Fisher Blvd.
Toms River, NJ 08753 Toms River, NJ 08753
(732) 270-3811 (201) 726-6257
Mulberry Street Italian Food Center, Inc.
474 Brick Blvd.
Brick, NJ 08723
(732) 477-4520

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely that of, DRIFTWOQOD DELI & SUB
SHOP LLC; FOUR SEASONS DINER, LLC and MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD
CENTER, INC. No bids were received on Item Nos 18a, 18b, 18¢, 19a, 19b, 19¢, 20, 21, 22a,
22b, 22¢, 23a, 23b, 23¢, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28a, 28b, 28¢, 29a, 29b, 29¢, 294, 30a, 30b, 30¢, 30d,
31a, 31b, 31¢, 32a, 32b, 32c, 33a, 33b, 33c, 33d, 33e, 33f, 33g, 34 and 35.
All no bid Item Nos. 18a, 18b, 18¢c, 19a, 19b, 19¢, 20, 21, 22a, 22b, 22¢, 23a, 23b, 23c, 24,
25,26, 27, 284, 28b, 28¢, 29a, 29b, 29¢, 294, 30a, 30b, 30¢, 30d, 314, 31b, 31¢, 32a, 32b, 32¢,
33a, 33b, 33¢, 33d, 33e, 33f, 33g, 34 and 35 will be rebid.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MEALS, DELIVERED for the County
of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through February 6, 2025, a period of
one (1) year, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the

tight to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

Introduced on: February 7, 2024
Adopted on: February 7, 2024
Official Resolutipbn#: 2024000136




BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 FEBRUARYRe$0Rg:k.1-3

A. DRIFTWOOD DELI & SUB SHOP LLC for thirty four (34) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1a, 1b, 1¢, 2a, 2b, 2¢, 3, 4, 5a, 5b, 5¢, 64, 6b, 6¢, 7, 8,9, 10, 11a, 11¢, 124, 12¢,
12d, 13a, 13¢, 13d, 16a, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 16¢, 16f, 16g and 17,

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

B. FOUR SEASONS DINER. LL.C for forty two (42) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1a, 1b, 1¢, 2a, 2b, 2¢, 3, 4, 5a, 5b, 5¢, 6a, 6b, 6¢,7, 8,9, 10, 11a, 11h, 11c, 12b,
12¢, 12d, 134, 13b, 13c, 13d, 14a, 14b, 14c, 15a, 15b, 15¢, 16a, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 16¢, 16f, 16g
and 17.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

C. MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER, INC, for forty threée (43)
items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1a, 1b, 1¢, 2a, 2b, 2c¢, 3, 4, 5a, 5b, 5¢, 6a, 6b, 6¢, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11a, 11b, 11c, 12a
12b, 12¢, 124, 13a, 13b, 13¢, 134, 14a, 14b, 14¢, 15a, 15b, 15¢, 16a, 16b, 16¢, 16d, 16e, 16f,
16g and 17.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
([ customary procedures. Delivery shalt be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by
the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed
quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

* vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-03.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of
Finance, Juvenile Services, Prosecutors Office, Sheriff’s Office, Solid Waste Management

~ and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: February 7, 2024
Adopted on: February 7, 2024
Official Resolugipn#: 2024000136
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FTW ' | Res-Pg:k.1-4
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT DRIFTWOOD DELL AND SUB SHOP 4

Bid No. TBD.

- MEALS, DELIVERED.

8. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms Included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forins are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising: Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Ed

Confirmed

9. Submlssion of Bid Package* -
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all reqmred documents to this
solicitation must be submltted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bld response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid. .

Confirmed

* PRICE TABLES

MEALS, DELIVERED B
Line ltem Dascription Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
SECTION | -~ VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
TEM #'s 1A - 1C — BREAKFAST MENU
\/ 1a Breakfast Menu to serve ‘1‘ to 25 peo;ﬁ]e, price par person ) EA $9.95 ' i
J 1b Breakfast Menu to serve 26 ta 75 people, price per persaon ’ ' . EA 59.95
\/ 1c Breakfast Menu to serve 76 or more people price per person EA $9.95
Introdueed-on— Faary-72024 :
Ado

Offi

WH&WW‘M
Bid - MEALS, DELIVERED - W, "
Page 5



- - DRIFTWOOD DELI AND SUB SHOP
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT “
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Res-Pg:k.1-5

Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

Line tem

Description

ITEM #'s 2A - 2C — LUNCH MENU

SN S

v
/
/

o)

/

2a Lunch Menu to serve 1 to 256 peaple, price per person EA $14.95
2b | Lunch Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $14.95
. 2¢ Lunch Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per person “ EA $14.95

ITEM #3 -- LUNCH OPTION |

3 Lunch Option - Side Salads, price per‘person EA $2,50
ITEM #4 -- COLD BEVERAGE SERVICE ‘J

4 Cold Beverage Service, prife per ﬁerson {minimum of 10 péople) EA' 51.95
ITEM #'s 5A - 5C - HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE \‘

Sa Hat Beverage Service to sarve 1to 25 beople. price per person EA $1.95

5b Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA 51.95

5c Hot Baverage Serwce to sérve 76 or mare people, price per person EA $1.95
ITEM #'s 6A - 6C -- SELF-SERVE HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE

6a Self-Serve Hot Beverage Servfce ta serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA 51.95

6b Self-Serve Hot Beve‘rgge\Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person | EA 51.95

ac’ Self-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 ér more people, price per person EA $1.95

Introdu

ZUZF

ced-on—February 72624
Adopted BROPOSAL B AHNTRERORT
Official wmezmqmn

Page 6
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a | DRIFTWOOD DELL AND SUB SHOP
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT '
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Res-Pg:k.1-6

Comments:

Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid

Measure

ITEM #7 — ASSORTED CHEESE & CRACKER PLATTERS
’ / ‘ 7 Assg:r’l:e_d Cheese & Cracker Platter, price per pérson {minimum of 10 people) ’ EA $4.10
ITEM #8 «IASORTED COOKIE PLATTER ]
\/ g Assorted Cookia E’latter, priéé per person (minimum of 10 people) EA | 53.00
TEM #9 ~ ASSORTED VEGETABLE PLATTER |
/ 9 Assorted Vegetable Platter, prlce'per person (minimum of 10 peaple) EA $4.10
ITEM #10 ASSORTED FRUIT PLATTER |
\/ 10 Assorted Fruit Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) ‘ EA $4'.10
SECTION Il - VARIOUS DEPTS. |
ITEM #1511 - 11C ~BREAKFAST MENU
\/ . Ila Cold Breakfast, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA ] 59.95
11b Hat Breakfast price per person (mmtmum of 10 people) EA No.Bid
J lic SeIf—Se,rve Hot Beverage, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA. $1.95
| TEM#'s 12A - 12D — LUNCH MENU“ ‘
/ 12a Cold Lunch prica per person (minimum of 10 people) AEA $14.95
12b Hot Lunch price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA - Nﬁég Blld
2‘5?&‘;3 BROPOSAL BeUMER ﬁﬁom

Official RBbHNTHE S2CXB0DPOR RE D
Page 7
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DRIFTWOOD DELLI AND SUB SHOP

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

MEALS, DELIVERED

No Bid

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost Comments:
Measure 5
.izc Side S'alad, price per person (minimum of 10 people) " EA $2.50 .
12d Self-Serve Cold Béverage, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA 51.95
ITEM #'s 13A - 13D -- DINNER MENU
13a Cold Dinner, price pér person (minimum of 10 people) EA 514.95
13h Hot Dinher, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA No Bid X
13c Side Salad, price per person {minimum of 10 p‘eople) EA " $3.50
13d self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per pérson {minimum of 10 people) EA £1.95
ITEM #'s 14A - 14C~ PiZZA .l
| l4a Large Plaln Pie and two {2) 12 oz. sodas, price per persan (rﬁinimum of 10 people) EA No Bid X
’l4b 'Larée Pie with one (1) topping and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person {(minimum EA No Bid X
of 10 paaple) |
14¢ - |Large Pie with two (2) toppings and two (2) 12 oz, sodas, price per person EA Na Bid X
(mjnimum of 10 peaple) ' '
SECTION 11l ~ JUVENILE SERVICES
ITEM #s 15A- 15C— PIZZA| o ' B
. 15a Lérge 16" Plain Chee.s.e Pizza, No Toppings, price per pizzq | EA No Bid X
15h Large 16" Chee_sé Pizza with one (1) Topplng, price per pizza EA No Bid - X

Introduceppips AL FRYCEN ENAOREPORT

Adopted

ot R aEALS oDl RRES™

Page 8
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LAY

. DRIFTWOOD DELI AND SUB SHOP

. : | . 'Res-Pg:k.1-8
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPOR'I: i
Bid No. TBD ‘
MEALS, DELIVERED
Lin ltem Dscription Unit of Ui Cost Comments:
Measure
15¢ Large 16" Cheese Plzza with twa (2) Tappings, price per pizza EA Na Bid
[TEM #'5 16A - 16G.- 12 SUBMARINE SAN DWICHES
, \/ 16a 12" Turkey & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sa.ndwich, price per sandwich EA $17.99
. / 16b - 12" Roast Beef & Prqvolonc Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $17.99
L / ' 16c . 12" Ham, Capicoia ‘& Provolone Cheese Submarlne Sandwich, price per sandwich EA ‘ $15.99
J ” 16d 12" Ham & American Cheese Submarine Sandwich price per sandwich EA $15.99
/ 16a 12" TunawFish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA $15.99
/ 16f  |12" Chicken Salad Submarine‘SandWIch, price pér sandwlich EA $15.99
. / ” 16g 12" Assorted three (3) Cheese Submarine Sandwich price per sandwich EA $15.99
ITEM #17 - TOSSED SALAD T :
17 Tossed Salad, price per person (minimum of 10 peaple) EA 52.50
SECT ION IV - KOSHER MEALS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
ITEM #'s 18A - 18C -- BREAKFAST MENU
18a Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price pcr person EA No Bid
. 18b Breakfast Menu to serve 26 to75 peaple, price per person EA No Bld4
13¢c Breakfast Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per gerson EA. No Bid
roduceHiRPOSAL pgg«;ggw@@gggpom

Adopted 0

Official R&élu%ﬁ&&@

Page 9
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FOUR SEASONS DINER, LLC . " Res-Pg:k.1-9

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No..- TBD :
MEALS, DELIVERED

8. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package* :

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

9. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this

“solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1} bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
MEALS, DELIVERED -

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Vieasure

” SECTION | - VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

[TEM #'s 1A - 1C -- BREAKFAST MENU

\/ 1a Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA 512.50
J - 1b Breakfast Menu to serve 2610 75 people, price per person " EA ‘ $12.50
1c Breakfast Menu to serve 76:0r more people, price per person EA $12.50
Introduced-on: - Iu'a'r'y (i 2024~ '
Adopte
mrm.mﬁa@@&@ﬁé\k#oémt REPORT

Bid - MEALS, DELlVERED
Page 5
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

MEALS, DELIVERED

FOUR SEASONS DINER, LLC.

Res-Pg:k.1-10

Line ltem

Description

Unit of

Unit Cost’

No Bid

Comments:

ITEM #'s 2A - 2C - LUNCH MENU

Measure

J Ja Lljnch Menu to serve 1 to 25 peogple, price per person EA *$13.25
\/ 2b Lunéh Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per p‘erson EA 513,25
\/ 2¢ Lunch Menu to serve 76 or more people, price per parson EA $13.25
ITEM #3 -- LUNCH OPTION
\/ 3 Lurich Option - Side Salads, price per person EA $3.05
ITEM it4 - COLD B€VERAGE SERVICE
j 4 Cold Beverage Servicé, price per person {minimum of 10 peaple) EA, $2.75
ITEM #'s 5A~ 5C — HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE |
, \/ 5a Hot Beverage Service Lo serve 1t0 25 lﬁeople, price per person EA - 52.75
/ 5b Hot Be'verage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person "EA $2.75
J 5¢ Hot Beverage Service to serve 76 or more people, price per p‘erson EA 52.50
ITEM #'s 6A - 6C -- SELF-SERVE HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE |
J Ga _|self-serve Hot Beverage Service to'serve 1 to 25 people, price per person " EA 52,75 '
J' 6b Salf-Serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA 52.75
J i 6ct Self-Serve Hot Baverage Service to serve 76 or more people, price per person ' EA $2.75
Introduced on: .. February 7, 2024 l
oftcial KoSEs AP o ErORT

Bid - MEALS, DELIVERED

Page 6
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

¥

FOUR SEASONS DINER, LLC

Res-Pg:k.1-11

Line [tem

Unit of

Unit Cost

Camments:

ITEM W7 - ASSORTED CHEESE & CRACKER PLATTERS

Measura

J 7 Assorted Cheese & Cracker Platter, price per person (mlmmum of 10°people) | EA 353.00
ITEM #8 -- ASORTED COOKIE PLATTER .,
/ 8 Assorted, Cookle Platter, price per person (mlnlmum of 10 people) EA 133._75
|TTEM #9 -~ ASSORTED VEGETABLE PLATTER
’ \/ “ 9 Assorted Vegetable Platter, prlce per person (mmlmum of 10 people) l- EA 42,50 )
ITEM #10 — ASS(;RTED FRUIT PLATFER |
\/ 10 Assorted Fruit Platter, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA 54.00
SECTION 1 - VARIOUS DEPTS. |
ITEM #'s 11A - 11(: --BREAKFAST MENU
\/ . 1a | Cold Breakfast, prlce per'person (mlnimum of 10 peopla) lEA,, $1l2.(;f.3
_/ 11b Hot Breakfast, prica per person {minimum of 10 people) EA $15.75
\/ 11c  |Self-Serve Hot Beverage, price per person (minimum of 10 people) ~EA $2.75
[TEM #S 1iA -12D0~ LUNCH MENU' T
12a Cold Lunch, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $13.00
J 12b Hot Lunch, price per'person {minimum of 10 people) EA H$15.50

Introduced on:

February 7, 2024

g?f?(f:zt«lel esolu on %D%MWE%RT

Bid - MEALS, DELIVERED .

Page 7



FOUR SEASONS DINER, LLC Res-Pg:k:1-12
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REFORT .

Bid No. TBD -
MEALS, DELIVERED

Lina Item Description unit of Unit Cost. No Bid Comments:

Measure
;/ 12¢ Side Salad, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA %3.00 -
\/ 12d Self-Serve Cold Beverage, price per person tminimum of 10 people) . ” EA $2.75

- |ITTEM #'s 13A - 13D — DINNER MENU

| \/ 13a Cold Dinher, price per person (minimum of 10 peaple) ‘ EA " $13.00
/ 13b | Hot Dinner, price per person'(minimum of 10 people) | EA | $16.50
\/ 13¢ Side Salad, price per person ‘(minimum:‘of'lo peop;le) : . EA 53.00
\/ 13d Self-Serve Cold Béverage, pfice per person‘ (minimum of 10 people) | EA $2.50

ITEM‘.#'S 14A - 14C -- PIZZA

14a large‘Plain Pie.and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price pér person (minimurm of 10 paople) EA $10.00

J 14b Large Pie with one (1) topping and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per parson (minlmum © EA $11.50
: of 10 peopte)
\/ 14c Large Pie with two (2} toppings and two (2} 12 oz, sodas, pride per persan EA 513.50

{minimum of 10 people)

SECTION Il -- JUVENILE SERVICES

[TEM #'s 15A - 15C <~ PIZZA

_J 1523 Large 16" Plain Cheese Pizza, No Topplngs,_brice per pizza | EA | $17.00
.J 15b Large 16" Cheese Pizza with one (1) Topping, price per pizza ) EA $20.00
Introduced on: |, February 7, 2024

S B

Page 8



FOUR SEASONS DINER, LLC Ros-Pgricills

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line ltam Dascription Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
J 15¢ Large 16" Cheese Pizza with two (2) Toppings, price per pizza ’ EA $23.00
ITEM #'s 16A - 16G — 12" SUBMARINE SANDWICHES

J 163 12" Turkey & Provolone Cheese submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich _ EA 51450

\/ 16b 12" Rogst Beef & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich . EA $16.50

2 / ' 16c 12" Ham, Capicola & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich | EA $14.50

,/ 16d 12" Ham & Amériélaln Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich EA 514.06

16e  |12" Tuna Fish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich o EA” | 51450

‘ \/ 16f 12" Chicken Salad Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich . | ; EA 516.‘00'
J l6g 12:‘ Assorted three (9;) Cheese Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich "EA $12.50 ‘

- |ITEM #17 - TOSSED SALAD
\/ 17 Tossed Salald, price pér person (minimum of 10 people). T s " EA $3.00 .

SECTION IV —- KOSHER MEALS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

ITEM #'s 18A - 18C -- BREAKFAST MENU

18a Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 peoﬁle, pt‘lce per person . P EA N‘o Bid X
13b Breakfast Menu to serve 26'to 75 people, price per person - . | . EA No Bid X
C18¢ Breakfast Menu to serve 76 ormore people, price per person EA No Bid X
Introduced on: February 7, 2024 1 . ~ ‘ T
Oticial BRI EEIPNE FEFORT R o I

Bid - MEALS, DELIVERED
Page 9



MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER, INC. Res-Pg:k.1-14

PROPOSAL-DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD'
MEALS, DELIVERED

8. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or.
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection. :

Confirmed

9. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to-this sohcutatlon, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all requwed documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do s0 may be cause for rejection,

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
MEALS, DELIVERED

Line [tem Description Unit of Unit Cast No Bid Comments:

Measure

SECTION | - VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS ' )

ITEM #'s 1A - 1C — BREAKFAST MENU .

\/ 1a Breakfast Menu to serve 1td 25 people, price per person . EA $12.00
\/f 1b Breakfast Menu to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person EA $12.00
/ 1c Breakfast Menu.to serve 76 or more people, price per person _ EA 512.00
Introduted-en: February i 2024 ;
Adopt 2024

edom——— Februar
OB I Heh P eI dO L PORT
Bid - MEALS, DELIVERED =
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MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REFORT
Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:;k.1-15

MEALS, DELIVERED

Line [tem

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Camments:

ITEM #'s 2A - 2C - LUNCH MENU

‘/ 2a Lonch Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person EA $12.75
/ 2h Luhcf’i Menu to serve 26 t0 75 people, priceper persan EA 512.75
J 2c Lunch Menu to serve 76 or more peaple, price per parson EA 512,75
ITEM #3 - LUNCH OPTION
J 3 Lunch Optioo.- Side Salads, price per persan EA - 52.75
ITEM #4 - COLD BEVERAGE SERVICE _
\/ 4 Cold Baverage Sereice, price per person {minimum of 10 people) . EA 52.50 |
ITEM #'s 5A - 5C -- HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE
\/ S5a. Hot Beverage Service to serve 1 to 25 peoplg, price per person EA $2.50
_ / 5b - Hot Beverage Service to serve 26t0 75 paople, prlce per person EA $2.50
\/ ) 5¢ Hot Beverage Serwce to serve 76 or more people, price per person EA $2.50
* |ITEM #'s 6A - 6C — SELF-SERVE HOT BEVERAGE SERVICE
\/ aa Self—serve Hot Beverage Service to serve 1 to 25Jpeople, price per person EA $2.50 '
\/ &h $elf—Sefve Hot Beverage Service to serve 26 to 75 people, price per person .. EA $2.50
/ 6¢ Self—Serve Hot Beverage Servloe to serve 76 oF more people, price per person EA §2.50

Introduced on:

February 7, 2024

Ot EOIBS Ak AR e L CORT

Bid - MEALS, DEIIVERED

Page 6
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- MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER, INC. " Res-Pg:k.1-16
.PROPOSAL DOEUMENT REPORT B

Bid No. TBD

MEALS, DELIVERED

Line [tem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Commeants:
Measure

TEM #7“ -- ASSORTED CHEESE & CRACKER PLATTERS

: / 7 Assorted Cheese & Cracker Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA Jd o« 55,00

| ITEM #8 — ASORTED COOKIE PLATTER

J 8 Assorted Cookie Platter, price per person (minimum of 10 people) EA $3.50

ITEM #9 -- ASSORTED VEGETABLE PLATTER

J a Assorted Vegetable Platter, price par person {minimum of 10 people) £A o $2.56

ITEM #10 — ASSORTED FRUIT PLATTER

10 Assarted Fruit Platter, price per person {minimum of 10 people) o EA $4.00

~N

SECTION Il - VARIOUS DEPTS. ’

ITEM #'s 11A - 11C --BREAKFAST MENU -

11a - |Cold Breakfast, price per pefson (minim‘ufn of 10 peaple) 3 EA 512.00
11b Hot Breakfast, price per person {minimum of 10 people) EA 515.50
1ic Self-Serve Hot Beverage, price pe? person {minimum of 10 people) EA . 82,50

ITEM #'S 12A - 12D —~ LUNCH MENU

SNA SN S

12a Cold Lunch, price per person {minimum of 10 people) ' o EA $12.75
:12b ~ |Hot Lunch, price per person {minimum of 10 people) : EA . $15.50
Introdl‘Jced on: February 7, 2024
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MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER, INC, _ . ~ Res-Pg:k.1-17
"PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT : - ' .

Bid No. TBD .
MEALS, DELIVERED - '

Line ltam Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:

Maasure

12¢ Side Salad price per person {minimum of 10 people) o EA 52,75

&

12d Self~Serve Cold Beverage, price per pefson (mmimum of 10 people) | ,' 2 5 EA C 52,50

TEM #'s 13A - 130 -- DINNER MENU

J 133" Cold Dinner, price per person {minimum of 10 pedple) “ . EA ' 513.00
/ 13b Hot Dinner, prlee per parson (minimum of 10 peaple} C ) EA o 516..50
\/' 13¢ ‘ ‘ Side Salad, price per perion (mlmmum of 10 people) - .' " EA 32.75
\// 13d Self~5erve Cold Beverage, ptice per person (minimum of 10 people) . ; | EA $2.50

[TEM #'s 14A - 14C — PIZZA

14a Large Plain Pie and two (2) 12 oz sodas, 'price per parson (minimum of 10 people) EA $9.50

%

14b Large Ple.with one (1) topplng and two (2) 12 oz. sodas, price per person (minlmum . EA $1:l.50
of 10 people) P

14c Large Ple with two (2) toppings and two {(2) 12 gz. sodes, price per person . " EA 513.00
(minimum of 10 peaple)

o~

SECTION IIl =~ JUVENILE SERVlCES

ITEM #'s 15A - 15C -- PlZZA

\/ 15a Large 16" Plain Cheese Pizza, No Toppings, price per pizza EA $17.50
\/ 15b Large. 16" Cheese Pizza with one (1) Topping, price per pizza ‘ EA 520,00
" Introducéd on: February 7, 2024

offcial RRaB A Ak MBOY S EPORT

Bid - MEALS, DELIVERED
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MULBERRY STREET ITALIAN FOOD CENTER, INC. Res-Pg:k.1-18

.~ PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
MEALS, DELIVERED

Ling ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

J 15¢ Large 16" Chéese Plzza with two {2) Toppings, price per pizza 4 o EA 523,00
ITEM #'s 16A - 166 - 13" SUBMARINE saNOWICHES | | - |
‘ J 16a 112" Turkey & Prbvolone Cheese Submlarine.lSandech, price per sa’ndwi:ch o EA $14.75
J 16b " |12" Roast Beef & Provolone 'Cheese'f:ubmarine Sandwich, price per sandwich . | - T ‘$:I.6‘.75
16c . |12"Ham, Capicola & Provolone Cheese Submarine Sandwich; pfic‘e perisandwicﬁl EA " $i4.75
/ 16d 12" FIa'm 2 Akﬂer}‘can Cheese Subma\_rlne S'andwlch,- pric.e per sandwich EA - 41375 °
\/ 16a 12¢ Tuﬁa Fish Submarine Sandwich, price per sandwich - EA $14.75
16f . |12" ;Zhicken Salad Submaring Sandwich, price per séndlwlcﬁ 4 | EA $F16.95
,\/ T 16g 12" Assorted three (?} Cheese Submarine S;\l‘ndwiéh, price per sandwich - EA 512.50

ITEM #17 -- TOSSED SALAD

17 Tossed Salad, ﬁrice per person (mihimum of 10 people) ! EA 52.75

N

SECTION IV - KOSHER MEALS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

ITEM #'s 18A - 18C -- BREAKFAST MENU

18a Breakfast Menu to serve 1 to 25 people, price per person ' | . EA No Bid X
~18b Breakfast Menu to serve 26 to 75 peaple, price per person b ' ' EA No Bid X
i&: Braakfast Menu to serve 76°or more people, price per peréon EA - No Bid X

Introduced on: February 7, 2024
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