Res-Pg:1.1-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Frank Sadeghi

08754-2191
Deputy Director Jennifier Bacchione (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Sam Ellenbogen
Commissioner Ray Gormley
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: March 4, 2026 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM
TISSUE AND TOWELS to Alpha |, Inc. t/a Village Office Supply; Interboro Packaging; Office Basics, Inc.;
Staples Contract & Commercial LLC; Unipak Corp.; and W.B. Mason Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.
(B2026-13)

Official Resolution# (2026000253
Meeting Date 03/04/2026
Introduced Date 03/04/2026
Adopted Date 03/04/2026
Agenda ltem I-1

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2026-13
Result Adopted
COUNTY fé s g o lw [ !5;
COMMISSIONER § a g gi ﬁ g %
Sadeghi v v
Bacchione v v v
Arace v v |v
Ellenbogen v v
Gormley v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michate . Guainer”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:

Adopted on: |

Official Resolu

Li

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder

245 Belmont Drive
Somerset, NJ 08873
(732) 564-1700

Office Basics, Inc.
22 Creek Circle
Boothwyn, PA 19061
(610) 471-1000

Unipak Corp.

P. O. Box 332

West Long Branch, NJ 07764
(888) 808-7120

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
2400 Bedle Place
Linden, NJ 07036
(908) 862-7570

Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC
255Route 1 & 9

Jersey City, NJ 07306

(201) 437-7440

Mivila Foods

226 Getty Avenue
Paterson, NJ 07503
(973) 278-4148

United Sales USA Corp.
5902 14" Avenue-Unit 107
Brooklyn, NY 11219

(718) 709-5900

March 4, 2026
March 4, 2026
on#: 2026000253

Alpha [ Inc. t/a Village Office Supply

CONTRAGT NO. MUST BE ON Bal
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, e vologRsP9-!

NO.__@_QQ‘_Q_L&:.@_———

RESOLUTION

March 4, 2026

WHEREAS, on January 6, 2026 pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of POLYETHYLENE LINERS,
BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

Name and Address of Bidder

Interboro Packaging

114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12549
(845) 782-6800

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC
500 Staples Drive

Framingham, MA 01702

(407) 475-4568

W.B. Mason Co., Inc.
59 Centre Street
Brockton, Ma 02301
(888) 926-2766

Graceful Heights Ministries Corp
509 North 31% Street

Louisville, KY 45238

(502) 509-6661

Mini Wing USA

2516 Via Tejon Suite 216

Palos Verdes Estates, CA 90274
(424) 558-3867

Taylor Oil Co., Inc.
77 Second Street
Somerville, NJ 08876
(732) 539-0663

;and




Introduced on
Adopted on:
Official Resoly
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" BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 MARCH 4, 2026

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely that of, ALPHA I INC. T/A VILLAGE
i OFFICE SUPPLY; INTERBORO PACKAGING; OFFICE BASICS, INC.; STAPLES
| CONTRACT & COMMERCIAL LLC; UNIPAK CORP.; and W.B. MASON CO., INC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Polyethylene Liners, Bathroom Tissue
and Towels for the County of Ocean, for the contract period of one (1) year from March 4,
2026 through March 3, 2027, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County
reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. ALPHA 1INC., T/A VILLAGE OFFICE SUPPLY for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 9

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. INTERBORO PACKAGING for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 5 and 6.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. OFFICE BASICS, INC for six (6) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 and 15.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. STAPLES CONTRACT & COMMERCIAL LLC for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 4.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

E. UNIPAK CORP for two (2) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 3 and 7.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

F. W. B. MASON CO., INC for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 8.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

March 4, 2026
March 4, 2026
tlon#: 2026000253
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- BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 MARCH 4, 2026

: 2. Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.4, the County has established a reasonable
i estimated maximum dollar value of $225,000.00 for the term of this contract, based on
7 historical procurement data for comparable goods or services. The County further reserves

the right to increase quantities by up to twenty percent (20%) of the maximum awarded

amount at the unit prices bid, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.3.

3. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
- through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital
- accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Buildings & Grounds,

- Central Supply Warehouse and Parks Department.

* 4. Payments for the materials and services to be acquired by these contracts
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase

Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

|
+1 and needed quantities shall be indicated.
!
5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices
and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2026-13.
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance Department,
Buildings & Grounds, Central Supply Warehouse, Parks Department and the successful
bidders.
Introduced on: March 4, 2026
Adopted on: March 4, 2026
Official Resolutipn#: 2026000253




- : Res-Pg:1.1-5
[ALPHA | INC. T/A VILLAGE OFFICE SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD
" POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

PRICE TABLES
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost i * Comments:
Measure
LINERS
1 Liners, 24" x 24", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {S) SAMPLES WITH BID 650 CASE $24.00 $15,600.00 ltem #GJO-
. . 70010-1000/case
2 Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500 Bags/Case, As Specmed MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 150 CASE $24.50 $3,675.00 ' ltem #EIO-
WITH BID ; ' ~ |HS2422408-
1000/case
3 Liners, 24" x 24", 50 Bags/Roll, 20 Rolls/Case As Speclfled MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 100 CASE $21.00 $2,100.00 Item#EJO-
WITH BID HD242406
4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5) SAMPLES WITH BID 500 CASE $38.50 $19,250.00 : Item#GJ0O-70012
= Liners, 38" x 58", 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (S5) SAMPLES WITH BID 450 CASE $35.00 $15,750.00 ) . Item#GJ0O-70014-
. 200/case
6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 Bags/Case As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 550 ) CASE $424.30. $23,265.00 ltem#Gl0O-02857- |.
WITH BID ) k 200/case
7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100 Bégs/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5) SAMPLES WITH BID - 450 CASE $30.00 $13,500.00 ltem#GJO-70013-
’ 250/case
TOWELS
8 Towels, Multi-Fold Type, Scotts Brand 01980, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000_Towe|s/Case, 4,200 CASE $68.75 }5288,750.00 Same
Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID~ i .
9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4,000 Towels/Case, Minimum, As 450 CASE $51.50 $23,175.00 item#TRK- -
\ Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID. . 105066~
3240/case
Introduced on: March 4, 2026

‘Adopted gi:pHA | INMMArGh YIBORGE OFFICE SUPPLY) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT |
Official ReReIuBaNYE FARLIERANERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Page 7



Res-Pg:1.1-6
[INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost [ Comments:

Measure

1 Liners, 24" x 24", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5) SAMPLES WITH BID 650 - CASE $17.24 $11,206.00 " |Delivery: 3-5 Days
: ‘ ' ARO, 30% Recycled
Content-EPA

Tl ' ; Compliant, 24x24,
\ ) ! : . 1.5 Mil, 500/Case,
’ ¥ . Mfr: Glopak,

1BS/Pitt/Hymopack,
As per sample #1,
INT-2424-X-Hvy

2 Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) d 150 CASE $12.34 $1,851.00 Delivery: 3-5 Days

SAMPLES WITH BID v ARO, 30% Recycled
Content-EPA

/ . . Compliant, 24x24,

’ 1 Mil, S00/Case,

Mfr: Glopak,

1BS/Pitt/Hymopack,

As per sample #2,

INT-2424-Med

3 Liners, 24" x 24';, 50 Bags/Roll, 20 Rolls/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 100 CASE $17.48 $1,748.00 Delivery: 3-5 Days
WITH BID ) ' ARO, 30% Recycled
) . Content-EPA
Compliant, 24x24,
0.5 Mil, 1000/Case,
Mfr: Glopak,
1BS/Pitt/Hymopack,
As per sample #3,
INT-2424-Reg

Introduced on: March 4. 2026
AdOPt%N’TERBORO MaTE G RTORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
it 35"&5‘[%#%?4{2&9%0%?&25 BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Page 7




; . : Res-Pg:1.1-7
[INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT. REPORT ‘

Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {S} SAMPLES WITH BID 500 CASE $53.84 - [ $26,920.00 i Delivery: 3-5 Days
ARO, 30% Recycled
Content-EPA
Compliant, 33x39,
1.5 Mil, 500/Case,
Mfr: Glopak,
IBS/Pitt/Hymopack,
As per sample #4,

| INT-3339-Exh

5 Liners, 38" x 58", 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SU BMIT'FIVE. (5) SAMPLES WITH BID | 450 CASE | $14.48 $6,516.00 Delivery: 3-5 Days
S ' ARO, 30% Recycled
. Content-EPA
Compliant, 38x58,
/ ’ 1.5 Mil, 100/Case,
Mfr: Glopak,
1BS/Pitt/Hymapack,
As per sample #5,
INT-3858-XH

6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5} ~ 550 CASE $18.24 $10,032.00 Delivery: 3-5 Days
SAMPLES WITH BID ) ARO, 30% Recycled
’ s Content-EPA
* | Compliant, 38x60,
1.5 Mil, 100/Case,
Mfr: Glopak,
1BS/Pitt/Hymopack,
. | As per sample #6,
INT-3860-XXH

7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 450 CASE $18.34 $8,253.00 Delivery: 3-5 Days

: ARO, 30% Recycled
- Content-EPA
- . g Compliant, 40x46,
1.5 Mil, 100/Case,
Mfr: Glopak,
18S/Pitt/Hymopack,
As per sample #7,
INT-4046-Super
Exh

Introduced on: 2026
Adopted ¢t ERBOROMAICRARIE CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
s e§°"15tb°L'VEﬁWEBRP&ZE?NERs BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Page 8




[OFFICE BASICS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Res-Pg:1.1-8

PRICE TABLES

POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Total Cost

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
1 Liners, 24" x 24", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE No Bid No Bid X
2 tiners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES CASE . No Bid No Bid X
WITH BID
3 Liners, 24" x 24", 50 Bags/Roll, 20 Rolls/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {S5) SAMPLES WITH CASE No Bid - No 8id X
BID .
4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE No Bid No Bid X
) Liners, 38" x 58", 100 Bags/Case, As Speciﬁéd, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {S) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE No Bid ’ ‘NO Bid X
6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST _B‘E CLEAR, 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES CASE No Bid No Bid X
WITH BID s
7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE . No Bid No Bid X
TOWELS
8 Towels, Multi-Fold Type, Scotts Brand 01980, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000 Towels/Case, CASE - No Bid- No Bid X
Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE {1) SAMPLE WITH BID )
9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4,000 Towels/Case, Minimum, As Specified, CASE No Bid No Bid X
MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID '
V/ 10 Paper Towels, 2-Ply, White Kitchen Roll Towels, 9" x 11", 80 Sheets/Roll, 36 Rolls/Case, As Specified 25 CASE $19.75 $493.75
VS paper Towels, White Roll, Bay West #314, or Equal, 6 Rolls/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE 100 CASE $22.90 | $2,250.00
V (1) SAMPLE WITH 8ID
%S 12 Paper Towels, Brown Roll, 6 Rolls/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 50 CASE $19.20 $960.00
Introducedonr: Warcir4,2026
g?f‘i’g;?f%% CE BASH qt'E‘Sr?@?\ﬁsE DOCUMENT REPORT
3 %sz CREPINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Page 7



[OFFICE BASICS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD |
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Res-Pg:1.1-9

Line item Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Comments:

BATHROOM TISSUE AND FACIAL TISSUE

¥
/ 13 Bathroom Tissue, 96 Rolls/Case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 2,000 CASE $35.25 $70,500.00
14 Bathroom Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE 150 CASE $12.68 $1,902.00 Sold 12/CS
WITH BID ’ ) : quoted as
6/CS
15 Facial Tissues, 100 Tissues/Box, 36 Boxes/Case, Minimum, As Specified 25 CA/SE $15.50 $387.50

Introduced on: March 4, 2026
AdOPte(gBeUFFICE BASNEICRES RO24SE DOCUMENT REPORT -

Official

APV RIERRAZEINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 8



Res-Pg:1.1-10

[STAPLES] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD | |
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

PRICE TABLES
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost ©~ * No Bid Comments:
Measure
LINERS
1 Liners, 24" x 24", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID ~ CAsSE No Bid No Bid X
2 Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES CASE No Bid No Bid X
WITH BID
3 Liners, 24" x 24", 50 Bags/Roll, 20 Rolls/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5} SAMPLES WITH 100 CASE $31.84 $3,184.00
BID
\/ 4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500 BagS/Case, As Speéiﬂed, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 500 CASE $27.99 $13,995.00
5 Liners, 38" x 58", 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 450 CASE $43.37 $19,516.50
6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 550 CASE . $51.89 $28,539.50
WITH 81D :
7 Liners, 40" x 46", iOO Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 450 CASE $45.19 $20,335.50
TOWELS
-8 Towels, Multi-Fold Type, Scotts Brand 01980, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000 Towels/Case, 4,200 CASE $56.25 $236,250.00
Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BB '
9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4, 000 Towels/Case, Minimum, As Specn‘"ed - CASE No Bid No Bid ) X
MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID .
10 - | Paper Towels, 2-Ply, White Kitchen Roll Towels, 9" x 11", 80 Sheets/Roll, 36 Rolls/Case, As Specified 25 CASE $36.55 $913.75
11 . Paper Towels, White Roll, Bay West #314, or Equal, 6 Rolls/Case, As Speclfed MUST SUBMIT ONE 100 CASE $32.86 $3,286.00
(1) SAMPLE WITH BID
12 Paper Towels, Brown Roll, 6 Rolls/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 50 CASE $29.86 $1,493.00
Introduced-on ch4,-2026 ‘

Adopted
Offti)ga? sto utlo %ﬁgg%E)CUMENT REPORT

-PO LYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 7



| | Res-Pg:1.1-11
[UNIPAK CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD :
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

PRICE TABLES
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line Iltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Comments:
Measure
1 Liners, 24" x 24", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 650 © CASE $14.20 $9,230.00 UPC24':15
] 250/ Case
2 Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES - 150 CASE $10.40 $1,560.00 UPC241N
WITH BID 250/ Case
3. Liners, 24" x 24", 50 Bags/Roll, 20 Rolls/Case, As Specified‘, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH 100 CASE $9.49 $949.00 UPCHD24
BID ) ; o 50Bags/Roll,
: . 20 Rolls/
: Case
4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 500 CASE $11.50 $5,750.00 ) UPC40C15
. : - 1100/ Case
5 Liners, 38" x 58", 100 Bags/Case, As Spepiﬁed, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 450 - CASE $17.88 $8,046.00 UPC60C15
' 100/ Case
6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 550 . CASE $22.48 $12,364.00 UPC60CIS5N
WITH BID . 100/ Case
7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SU BMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 450 CASE $15.20 $6,840.00 UPC48C15 "
100/ Case
TOWELS -
8 Towels, Multi-Fold Type, Scotts Brand 01980, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000 Towels/Case, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID .
9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4,000 Towels/Case, Minimum, As Specified, CASE No Bid No Bid X
MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID '

Introduced on: March 4, 2026
Adopted ofjnpAK cgg@w{'%@@mse DOCUMENT REPORT
Official R‘jﬁm ti : S
icial Resojutiont a0 %9%Pd INERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 7 :




Res-Pg:1.1-12
[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD :
POLYETHYLENE LINERS BATH ROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

PRICE TABLES ' '
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
LINERS , : \
1 Liners, 24" x Z;t", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID ’ CASE No Bid No Bid X
2 Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES . CASE No Bid No Bid X
WITH BID .
3 Lmers 24" x 24", 50 Bags/Roll 20 RoIls/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (S) SAMPLES WITH CASE No Bid No Bid X °
BID '
4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID ’ CASE No Bid No Bid X
E) Liners, 38" x 58", 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE [ No Bid No Bid X
6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 Bags/Case, As Spe;ified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES CASE No Bid No Bid X
WITH BID . . '
S 7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100 Bags/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID " CASE No Bid No Bid X
TOWELS
[ . - -
. 8 Towels, Multi-Fold Type, Scotts Brand 01980, Minimum Size: 5.4" x 12.4", 4,000 Towels/Case, 4,200 CASE $47.24  15198,408.00
\ Minimum, As Specified or £qual, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID s
A 9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9. 80" x 7.90", 4,000 Towels/Case, Minimum, As Speclfled V CASE No Bid No Bid X
’ MUSTSUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID |
10 Paper Towels, 2-Ply, Whlte Kitchen Roll Towels, 9" x 11", 80 Sheets/Roll, 36 Rolls/Case, As Specified ‘ " CASE No Bid No Bid X
11 Paper Towels, White Roll, Bay West #314, or Equal 6 Rolls/Case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE . CASE .| NoBid ~ No Bid X
{1) SAMPLE WITH BID
12 Paper Towels, Brown Roll, 6 Rolls/Case, As Speciﬂed, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID S0 CASE $23.05 $1,152.50
Introduced-on: Vtarcir4,2026 :

Adopted
Offiga? R@W?utlon% %%Ng%g% DOCUMENT REPORT

- POLYET INERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 7



