Res-Pg:m.9-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director Barbara Jo Crea

] ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn (732)929-2005
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines (732)505-1918
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: May 15, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. |l to Blue
Wave Car Wash and Quick Lube LLC; Extreme Kleen Wash and Lube; and My Own Lane LLC, the lowest
qualified bidders. Recommendation is made to reject ltem Nos. 17 and 49. Recommendation is made to
authorize the County Purchasing Agent to enter into a negotiated contract, in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11
-5(3) as no responsive bids were received for a second time on all rejected items. (B2024-77)

Official Resolution# |2024000705
Meeting Date 05/15/2024
Introduced Date 05/15/2024
Adopted Date 05/15/2024
Agenda ltem m-9

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2024-77
Result Adopted
cowry —_ Tal, T8 T, 2
COMMISSIONER | | ) :(é > g !
Crea v v
Quinn v v |v
Haines v v v

Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guestnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:m.9-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVQICES, VOUCHERS

o A0 - T |

RESOLUTION

May 15, 2024

WHEREAS, on April 16, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of CAR WASHING SERVICES
NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Blue Wave Car Wash and Quick Lube Extreme Kleen Wash and Lube
567 N Main Street 451 Rt. 37

Barnegat, NJ 08005 Toms River, NJ 08753

(609) 408-3025 (732) 288-0013

My Own Lane LLC

1818 Underwood Blvd.

Delran, NJ 08075

(609) 632-3005

; and

WEHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications in each instance, be accepted, namely, BLUE WAVE CAR WASH AND
QUICK LUBE, LLC; EXTREME KLEEN WASH AND LUBE and MY OWN LANE, LLC
Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 17 and 49. Recommendation is made to
authorize the County Purchasing Agent to enter into a negotiated contract, in accordance with
N.I.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) as no responsive bids were received for a second time for item Nos. 17
and 49.

WHEREAS, N.I.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) provides that, in the event no qualitied bids
are received on two occasions, a governing body may enter into a negotiable contract.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter inlo a contract, for the furnishing and délivery of Car Washing Services No. IT for the
County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through April 2, 2026, or until
delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term
of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

Introduced or: May 15, 2024
Adopted on: May 15, 2024
Official Resolltion#: 2024000705
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 MAY 15,2024

A. BLUE WAVE CAR WASH AND QUICK LUBE, LLC for one (1)

item, to wit:

| ITEM NO. 33.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.
B. EXTREME KLEEN WASH AND LUBE for sixteen (16) items, to wit;

ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9, 10, L1, 12, 13, 14, 15 and 16.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
C. MY OWN LANE, L1C for sixty (60) items, to wit:

ITEMNOS.2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26,

27,28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 50, 51, 52,'53,

54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63 and 64.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

| vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-77.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of

Finance, Vehicle Services, and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: May 15, 2024
Adopted on: May 15, 2024
Official Resolutipn#: 2024000705




BLUE WAVE CAR WASH AND QUICK LUBE Res-Pg:m.9-4

[BLUE WAVE CAR WASH AND QUICK LUBE LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. Il

Line. fram Description Est. City. Unitof Unit.Gost,  Total Cost: No Bid Contact  Commants

Measiye Mame and
Phone:
22 Interlar Detail - Truck/Minivan ‘ EA No Bid No Bld X
23 Interiar Detall - Full Sized Van and SUV EA No Bid No'Bld X
24 Interior Detail with Wash - Car EA No Bid No Bid X
25 (nterior Detall with Wash - Truck/Minivan EA Mo Bid No Bid X
26 intertor Datall with Wash - Fall Szed Van and SUV EA No Bid Nomid | X
27 Carpet Shampoolng - Car EA . No Bid No Bid X
28 Carpet Shampoaing - Truck/Minivan . EA No Bid No Bld X
29 |carpet Shampooing - Full Sized Van and SUV EA No Bid No Bid X
20 Seat Shampaoaing - Car EA No Bid No Bid X
3l Seat Shampoalng - Truck/Minivan EA No Bid No Bid X
32 Seat Shampooing - Full Sized Van and SUV EA Mo Bid No Bid X

SECTION Ill - Car Washing Services - Barnegat/Waretown/Staffard

\/ 33 Provide Car Washing Services, As Specified, Barnegat/Waretown/Stafford 5,000 EA $8.00 $40,000.00

34 Complete Detall - Car EA No Bid No Bid X
35 Complete Dakail - Truck/Minlvan EA No Bid No Bld X
36 Complete Detail - Full Sized Van and SUV EA Mo Bld Mo Bid X
37 |interior Detall - Car EA No Bld No Bld X
38 Interior Detail - Truck/Minlvan EA No Bid No Bid X

Introduced on: + May 15, 2024 .

Adopted-orm: Ma ! " >

Offioal HELbEHONEEZRONASH AND.QUICK LUBE LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT "

Bid - CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. Il
Page 8



EXTREME KLEEN WASH AND LUBE
[EXTREME KLEEN WASH AND LUBE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
+ CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. Il

Res-Pg:m.9-5

9. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*
Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or

executed prior to the date of advertising. Fallure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

10. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

Line. Item Description

o FPRICE TABLESYA:
CAR WASHING SERVICES

Est. Qty,

unit of

Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No 8id Contact  Commants
Nama and

SECTION ( - Cdr Washing Services - Toms River

Phone:

J 1 Provide Car Washing Services, As Specified, Toms River 5,000 EA §17.50 $87,500,00
/ 2 Complete Detall - Car 50 EA $199,00 | $9,950.00
/ 3 Complete Detall - Truck/Minivan 50 EA $22900 | 311,450.00
/ 4 Complete Detall - Full Sized Van and SUV 50 EA $249.00 | $12,450.00

Introduced on: May 15, 2024

Adoptedorm;
ot e K ER B AND LUBE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. [I
Page 6



EXTREME KLEEN WASH AND LUBE Res-Pg:m.9-6

[EXTREME KLEEN WASH AND LUBE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. ||

Line item Description Est. Oty. Unit of Unit Cost  "Total Cost No Bid Contast.  Conunments

Measure Name and
Phone:

\/ 5 nterior Detail - Car 50 EA 49900 | $4,950.00
/ 6 Interior Detall - Truck/Minivan ' 50 EA $129.00 | $6,450.00
/ 7 Interior Datail - Full Sized Van and SUV 50 EA 4149.00 $7,450.00

\/ ] Interlor Detail with Wash - Car 50 EA 5215.00 | $10,750.00
J 9 Interior Detall with Wash - Truck/Minivan 50 EA | $14400 | $7,200.00
) j 10 Interior Detall with Wash - Full Sized Van and 3UV 50 EA 4165.00 48,250,00
J 11 |Carpet shampooing - Car 20 EA $39.00 | $780.00
J 12 Carpet Shampooing - Truck/Minivan - 20 EA $49.00 $980.00
\/ 13 Carpet Shampoolng - Full Sized Van and SUY 20 EA $59.00 41,180.00
J 14 |Seat Shampooing - Car 20 EA $30.00 | $780.00
/ 15 Seat Shampooing - Truck/Minkvan 20 EA 549,00 $980.00
J 16 Seat Shampooing - Full Sized Van and SUV 20 EA 359,00 51,120,00

SECTION Il - Car Washing Seivices - Brick/takewood

17 Provide Car Washing Services, As Specified, Brick/Lakewood 5,000 EA $17.50 | $87,500.00

12 Complete Detall - Car 50 EA 5199.00 | %9,950.00

19 Complete Detail - Truck/Minivan S0 EA $229.00 | %11,450.00

20 Complate Detail - Full Sized Van and SUV 50 EA 5249.00 | 512,450.00

21 Interior Detall - Car 50 EA $99.00 $4,950.00

Introduced on: May 15, 2024

Adopt e e E KBR YA AND LUBE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. I

Page 7



MY OWN LANE, LLC Res-Pg:m.9-7

[MY OWN LANE LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
CAR WASHING SERVICES NQ. Il

No response submitted

9. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

10. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

CAR WASHING SERVICES

Line. ltem Description Q. Unit of Unit Cost  Total Gost Na Bid Contact Commants

Measure Name and
Phane:

SECTION | -~ Car Washlng Services - Toms River
1 Provide Car Washing Services, As Specified, Toms River 5,000 EA S88.00 |3440,000.00
/ 2 Complete Detail - Car 50 EA %250.00 | $12,500.00
/ 3 Complete Detail - Truck/Minivan 50 EA $300.00 | $15,000.00
Introduged on: May 15, 2024

Official KA GIYHBHWANE Adobfes PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. 1l

Page 6



MY OWN LANE, LLC Res-Pg:m.9-8

[MY OWN LANE LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. I

Line ltem Dascription st Qy: Unit.of UnitCost Total Cost’ Mo fld Contact  Comments

Measure Nama and
Phoney

\/ 4 Complete Detall - Full Sized Van and SUY 50 EA $350.00 | $17,500.00
/ 5 Interior Detall - Car ' 50 EA $20000 | $10,000.00
/ 6 Interior Detafl - Truck/Minivan 50 EA $22500 | $11,250.00
J 7 Interlor Detall - Full Slzed Van and SUV 50 EA -‘5250.00 412,500.00
J 8 Interiot Detall with Wash - Car 50 EA 421500 | $10,750.00
/ 9 Interior Detail with Wash - Truck/Minivan ‘ 50 EA $240,00 | $12,000.00
J 10 Interior Detail with Wash - Full Sized Van and SUV 50 EA $275.00 | $13,750.00
J 11 Carpet Shamfmolng - Car 20 EA $80.00 $1,600,00
W, 12 Carpet Shampoalng - Truck/Minivan . 20 EA 512000 | $2,400.00
_/ 13 Carpet Shampoalng - Full Sized Van and SUV 20 EA | $130.00 $2,600.00
WV 14 |SeatShampooing - Car B 20 EA $10000 | $2,000.00
J 15 Seat Shampoaing - Truck/Minivan 20 EA $125.00 | $2,500.00
J 16 Seat Shampaalng - Full $ized Van and SUV 20 EA 4150.00 $3,000.00
SECTION Il - Car Washing Services - Brick/Lakewnod
17 Provide Car Washing Services, As Specifled, Brick/Lakewood 5,000 EA $88.00 | $440,000.00
J 18 Complete Detalf - Car 50 EA $250.00 | $12,500.00
J 19 Completa Datail - Truck/Minivan S0 EA 530000 | $15,000.00
J 20 |Complete Detall - Full Sized Van and SUY 50 EA $35000 | $17,500.00
Introduced on: May 15, 2024

Aot N S ME SPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. Il

Page 7



MY OWN LANE, LLC Res-Pg:m.9-9

[MY OWN LANE LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid Na. TBD
CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. lI

Line ltem Deseription st Qty: Unit af Uk Cost Total Cost Na Bid Contact  Comments
Measura Nameand
Phone:

J 21 Interior Detail ~ Car ) 50 EA $200.00 | $10,000.00
J 22 Interior Detafl = Truck/Minlvan 50 EA $225.00 | $11,250.00
J 23 Interior Detall - Full Sized Van and SUV 50 EA ISZSO.OO $12,500.00
‘/ 24 |Interior Detall with Wash - Car ‘ 50 EA $215.00 | $10,750.00
/ 25 Interior Detail with Wash - Truck/Minivan 50 EA ‘ $240.00 | $12,000.00
/ 25 interiar Detall with Wash - Full Sized Van and SUV 50 EA §275.00 | $13,750.00
\/ 27 Carpet Shampooing - Car 20 EA $80.00 $1,600.00
\/ 28 Carpat Shampooing - Truck/Minkvan ' 20 EA $100.00 $2,000.00
. / 29 Carpet Shampeolng - Full Sized Van and 5UV 20 EA $130,00 | %2,600.00
j 30 Seat Shampooling - Car 20 EA 410000 | %2,000.00
\/ 31 Seat Shampoaing - Truck/Minivan 20 EA $125.00 | $2,500.00
J I 32 Seat Shampoaing - Full Sized Van and SUV 20 EA $150.00 43,000.00

SECTION 1l - Car Washing Services - Barnegat/Waratown/Staffard

33 Provide Car Washing Services, As Specified, Barnegat/Waretown/Stafford 5,000 EA 488,00 |%$440,000,00

\/ 34 Complete Detail - Car - 50 EA $250,00 | $12,500.00
‘ J 35 Complete Detail - Truck/Minivan 50 EA $300,00 | $15,000.00
‘/ 36 Complete Detail - Full Sized Van and SUV 50 EA 435000 | $17,500.00
J 37 Interior Detall - Car 50 EA $200.00 | $10,000.00

Introduced on: May 15, 2024 : '

Adopteg-orr; -
e NN A D R LS PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT A
Bid - CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. I

Page 8



MY OWN LANE, LLC Res-Pg:m.9-10

(MY QWN LANE LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. It

Line. (tam Deseription Est. Qty. Unit of Unit Cost  Total Cost Ner Bid Gontact  Commanits

Meaasure Name and
Phone:

] / 28 Interlor Detall - Truck/Minivan 50 EA '$225.00 $11,250.00
S| 2 |meerior Detail- Full sized Van and suv 50 €A $250.00 | $12,500.00
_ J 40 |interior Detall with Wash - Car 50 EA $215.00 { $10,750.00
J 41 interlor Detall with Wash - Truck/Minivan 50 EA 4240.00 | %12,000.00
42 interior Detall with Wash - Full Sized Van and 5UvV 50 EA $275.00 { $13,750.00

\/ 43 Carpet Shampoolng - Car 20 EA $80.00 $1,600.00
J 44 Carpet Shampooing - Truek/Minivan 0 EA £120.00 42,400.00
\/ 45 Carpet Shampooing - Full Slzed Van and SUV 20 EA $130.00 | $2,600.00
J| 46 |[seatshampooing - Car ' 20 EA $10000 | $2,000.00
\/ 47 Seat Shampooing - Truck/Minlvan ' 1 20 EA §125.00 | %2,500.00
J 48 Seat Shampoolng - Full Slzed Van and SUV 20 EA $150.00 $3,000.00

SECTION IV - Car Washing Services - Little Egg Harbor/Tuckerton

49 Pravide Car Washing Services, As Specified, Little Egg Harbor/Tuckerton 5,000 EA $88.00 | 5440,000,00

\/ 50 Complete Detail - Car 50 EA $250,00 | $12,500.00

J 51 | Complete Detall - Truck/Minivan ' 50 EA 530000 | $15,000,00

J 52 Complete Detall - Full Sized Van and SUV 50 EA 435000 | $17,500.00

53 Interior Detail - Car 50 EA 200,00 | $10,000.00

\/ 54 Interlor Detall - Truck/Minivan 50 EA §225.00 | $11,250.00
Introduced on: Ma"y 15, 2024

ot N AN L Sy ME S PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - CAR WASHING SERVICES NO. Il

Page 9



[MY OWN LANE LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
CAR WASHING SERVICES NQ. |l

MY OWN LANE, LLC

Res-Pg:m.9-11

Line item

Description

Est. Qiy.

Unit of
Measura

Unit Cost’

Total Cost

N Bid

Contact
Namae and
Fhane:

Comments

/ 55 Interior Detail - Full Sized Van and SUV . ) 50 EA 525000 | $12,500.00
J 56 Interior Detall with Wash - Car a0 EA $215.00 310,75-0.00
\A 57 Interior Datall with Wash - Truck/Minlvan 50 EA 5240.00 | $12,000.00
\/ 58 Intarior Detall with Wash - Full Sized Van and 53UV 50 EA $275.00 | $13,750.00
/ %9 ‘ Carpet Shampooing - Car 20 EA $80.00 51,600.00
J 60 Carpet Shampooing - Truck/Minivan 20 EA $120.00 52,400‘00‘
.\/ g 61 Carpet Shampooing - Full Sized Van and 5UV 20 EA $130.00 $2,600.00
\/ 62 Seat Shampoalng - Car 20 EA 410000 | $2,000.00
J 63 Seat Shampooing - Trusk/Minivan 20 EA 41258.00 %2,500.00
\/ 64  |Seat Shampooing - Full Sized Van and SUV 20 EA 150,00 | $3,000.00

Introduced on:

May 15, 2024

e A AL S I RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - CAR WASHING SERVICES NQ. II

Page 10
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