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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director John P. Kelly

08754-2191
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: April 2, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR
SIGN POSTS to National Highway Products, Inc. and Eberl Iron Works, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.
(B2025-36)

Official Resolution# |2025000410
Meeting Date 04/02/2025
Introduced Date 04/02/2025
Adopted Date 04/02/2025
Agenda ltem m-9

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-36
Result Adopted
COUNTY g s g o lw [ !5;
COMMISSIONER § a g gi ﬁ g %
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v |v
Bacchione v v v
Haines v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guatiner”

Clerk Of The Board
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CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

==

RESOLUTION
April 2, 2025

WHEREAS, on February 11, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND
TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS for the County of Ocean, and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
National Highway Products, Inc. Eberl Iron Works, Inc

301 Riverside Drive 128 Sycamore Street
Millville, NJ 08332 Buffalo, NY 14204

(856) 692-7572 (716) 854-7633

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance be accepted, namely, NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS,
INC. and EBERL IRON WORKS,; INC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting the bids for the furnishing and delivery of Steel Channel Posts
and Timber for Sign Posts for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award
through April 1, 2026, a period of one (1) year, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise
stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A.
40A:11-15.

A. NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC for twenty-seven (27) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 2,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28,

29, 30, 31, 32 and 33.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

Introduced on April 2, 2025
Adopted on: April 2, 2025
Official Resoldt{on#: 2025000410
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B. EBERL IRON WORKS, INC for six (6) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 3,4, 5,6, 7 and 8.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidder in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

3. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding

sources: Engineering Department O.E. and Roads Department O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-36.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

County Engineer, Road Department and the successful bidders.

Introduced on| April 2, 2025
Adopted on: April 2, 2025
Official Resolugton#: 2025000410
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[NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS

STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure
p/ 1 Timber for Sign Posts: 4" x 6" x 14" 20 EA $75.56 $1,511.20
b/ 2 Timber for Sign Posts: 4" x 4" x 12' : 20 EA $39.04 $780.80
3 Galvanized U-Channel Steel Delineator Posts: 6' long, 2%" wide, %" holes on 1" centers, 1.12 300 EA $11.51 $3,453.00
Ibs./foot
4 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: 3.5' long, 3" wide, %" holes on 1" centers 4 1,200 EA $19.56 $23,472.00
|bs./foot to match with &', 8', 10" and 12' Galvanized posts (Beveled 3.5" on one end for insertion in
ground) NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: &' long, 3-1/16" wide, %" holes on 1" centers 400 EA $21.53 $8,612.00

2.50 Ibs./foot NO SUBSTITUTIONS

6 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: 8' long, 3-1/16" wide, %" holes on 1" centers 400 EA $28.71 $11,484.00
2.50 Ibs./foot NO SUBSTITUTIONS

7 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: 10' long, 3-1/16" wide, %" holes on 1" 1,200 EA $36.15 $43,380.00
centers 2.50 Ibs./foot NO SUBSTITUTIONS :

8 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: 12' long, 3-1/16" wide, %" holes.on 1" 100 EA '$43.39 $4,339.00
centers 2.50 Ibs./foot NO SUBSTITUTIONS

v 9 Nu-Cor Lap Splice U-Channel Breakaway System: Spacer Bar %" wide x %" thick x 5" long; two {2) 1 2,400 EA $5.18 $12,432.00
v %" grade 9 bolts and self-locking flange nuts; two (2) grade 9 cut washers NO SUBSTITUTIONS
V/ 10 5/16-18 x 1" Stainless Steel Bolt (100 per Box) 1 BX $12.31 $12.31
\/ 11 5/16-18 x 1/2" Stainless Steel Bolt (100 per Box) 5 BX $14.66 $73.30
‘1/' 12 5/16-18 x 1%" Stainless Steel Bolt (100 per Box) 2 BX $18.33 $36.66
v 13 5/16-18 x 214" Stainless Steel Bolt (100 per Box) All Thread 150 BX $25.83 $3,874.50
\‘V 14 5/16-18 x 3" Stainless Steel Bolt {100 per Box) All Thread 10 BX $36.38 $363.80
Introdueed-on: Apri-2,2025

anaE

Adoptcd Oft: UZo

Official RAJHRIN S 150459804PRODUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS
Page 6



[NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS
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Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
V/ 15 5/16 -18 % 3%" Stainless Steel Bolt {100 per Box) Ali Thread 1 BX $41.08 $41.08
W al
Vv 16 5/16 x 1%" Tap Bolt Grade 9 (for Lap Splice System} (100 per Box) 5 . BX $39.00 $195.00
V 17 5/16-18 Stainless Steel Hex Nut {100 per Box) 150 BX $4.30 $645.00
V/ 18 5/16 Flange Nut, Self Locking, Grade 9 (for Lap Splice System) (100 per Box) 50 BX $15.39 $769.50
‘// 19 5/16-18 Stainless Steel Flat Washer (100 per Box) 150 BX $2.10 $315.00
V/ 20 5/16-18 Stainless Steel Lock Washer (100 per Box) 150 BX $2.67 $400.50
¢/ 21 5/16 x 1%" Stainless Steel Fender Washer (25 per Package) 2 PKG $4.29 $8.58
w/ 22 Cut Washer, Grade 9 (for Lap Splice System) {100 per Box) 5 BX $12.50 $62.50
\l/ 23 5/16 x18 x 2 1/2" Tamper-Proof-Bolts, steel, zincplated carriage bolt with square neck (100 per box) 2 BX $20.14 $40.28
V, 24 5/16 Aluminum Break Away Nut Use wrench to tighten the' nut. When nut is tight, continue twisting 2 BX $54.60 $109.20
firmly and hex head breaks off leaving conical shaped vandal proof portion of nut. (100 per box)
25 Galvanized Steel L Bracket for mounting signs on a 90° angle to U-channel post: 1 %" W x 4/5" Lx %" 150 EA $6.30 $945.00
v thick, Hole pattern: 2 ea. %" hole centered on the 1 %" dimension, 2 %" from end, both legs
26 Galvanized Steel L Bracket for mounting signs on a 45° degree angle to U-channel post: 1" W x 4/5" 100 EA $6.10 $610.00
W
L x %" thick, Hole pattern: 2 ea. %" hole centered on the 1%" dimension, 2-%" from end, both legs -
L~ 27 Twist Bracket T-18 Galvanized Steel for installing One Way signs on the top of a U-channel post at 50 EA $11.34 $567.00
vV 90° angle
28 Chevron Bracket: CAB1 Aluminum Bracket 18%" long that allows for two (2} chevrons to be installed, 40 EA $45.69 $1,827.60
“/ on a single u-channel post. Brackets must allow for the alignment of the chevrons (for 12" x 18" and
18" x 24" signs)
29 Chevron Bracket: CAB2 Aluminum Bracket 24%" long that allows for two {2) chevrons to be installed, 40 EA $51.08 $2,043.20
L/ on a single U-channel post. Brackets must allow for the alignment of the chevrons (for 18" x 24" and
24" x 30" signs) :
Introdueed-on- Apri2,-2025

Adoptca' o
fi
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[NATIONAL HIGHWAY PRODUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

Impact Recovery Systems # 165 Lag Kit for installation of # 254-R1-6-P and # 254-R1-6SCH-P NO 20 EA $10.49 $209.80
SUBSTITUTIONS

Y

31 Impact Recovery Systems # 101NS Fixed Base for installation of # 254-R1-6-P and # 254-R1-65CH-P 20 EA $17.53 $350.60
V NO SUBSTITUTIONS

/ 32 Impact Recovery Systems # 254-R1-6SCH-P School State Law Stop For Pedestrians within Crosswatk 20 EA $292.30 $5,846.00
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

33 Impact Recovery Systems # 254-R1-6-P State Stop For Pedestrians within Crosswatk NO 20 EA $292.30 $5,846.00
SUBSTITUTIONS

S

Introduced on: April 2, 2025

Adopted-en:———%ﬁ-l—ﬁ,—eees

Official RASURMARH 1E0286A0aRGODUCTS, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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[EBERL IRON WORKS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
STEEL CHANNEL POSTS AND TIMBER FOR SIGN POSTS
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Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Comments:

1 Timber for Sign Posts: 4" x 6" x 14' EA No Bid No 8id X
2 Timber for Sign Posts: 4" x 4" x 12' EA No Bid No Bid X
/ 3 Galvanized U-Channel Steel Delineator Posts: 6' long, 2%" wide, %" holes on 1" centers, 1.12 300 EA $10.63 $3,189.00
v
Ibs./foot
/ 4 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: 3.5' long, 3%" wide, %" holes on 1" centers 4 1,200 EA $19.29 $23,148.00
V Ibs./foot to match with &', 8', 10" and 12' Galvanized posts {Beveled 3.5" on one end for insertion in
ground) NO SUBSTITUTIONS
/ 5 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: &' long, 3-1/16" wide, %" holes on 1" centers 400 EA $21.00 $8,400.00
Vv 2.50 |bs./foot NO SUBSTITUTIONS
/ 6 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channe Steel Sign Posts: 8' long, 3-1/16" wide, %" holes on 1" centers 400 EA $27.55 $11,020.00
v 2.50 Ibs./foot NO SUBSTITUTIONS
/ 7 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: 10' long, 3-1/16" wide, %" holes on 1" 1,200 EA $34.43 $41,316.00
\Y centers 2.50 |bs./foot NO SUBSTITUTIONS
p.2
V/ 8 Nu-Cor Galvanized, Rib-Bak U-Channel Steel Sign Posts: 12' long, 3-1/16" wide, %" holes on 1" 100 EA $41.32 $4,132.00
centers 2.50 Ibs./foot NO SUBSTITUTIONS
9 Nu-Cor Lap Splice U-Channel Breakaway System: Spacer Bar %" wide x %" thick x 5" long; two (2} 1 2,400 EA $6.44 $15,456.00
%" grade 9 bolts and self-locking flange nuts; two {2} grade 9 cut washers NO SUBSTITUTIONS
10 5/16-18 x 1" Stainless Steel Bolt {100 per Box) 1 BX $22.00 $22.00
11 5/16-18 x 1/2" Stainless Steel Bolt {100 per Box) 5 BX $20.00 $100.00
12 5/16-18 x 1%" Stainless Steel Bolt (100 per Box) 2 BX $24.00 $48.00
13 5/16-18 x 214" Stainless Steel Bolt {100 per Box) All Thread 150 BX $36.00 $5,400.00
14 5/16-18 x 3" Stainless Stee! Bolt (100 per Box) All Thread 10 BX $46.00 $460.00
15 5/16 -18 x 3%" Stainless Steel Bolt {100 per Box) All Thread Al BX $48.00 $48.00

Introdueed-on:

Apri-2;-2025-

Adopted-orm:
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