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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director John P. Kelly

08754-2191
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: February 19, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM
TISSUE AND TOWELS to Alpha I Inc. t/a Village Office Supply; Central Poly-Bag Corp.; Eastern Janitorial
Supply, Inc.; Interboro Packaging Corp.; Plastic Express Inc.; Unipak Corp.; United Sales USA Corp. and W.B.
Mason Co., Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2025-04)

Official Resolution# |2025000209
Meeting Date 02/19/2025
Introduced Date 02/19/2025
Adopted Date 02/19/2025
Agenda ltem k-1

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-04
Result Adopted
cowry —_ Ta T, T8 T, 2
COMMISSIONER z |2 :(é > g !
Kelly v

Sadeghi v v
Arace v v |v
Bacchione v v v
Haines v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michoe \. Guestnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolufi

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder

Alpha I Inc. t/a Village Office Supply
600 Apgar Drive

Somerset, NJ 08873

(732) 564-1700

Eastern Janitorial Supply, LLC
1545 Route 9

Toms River, NJ 08755

(732) 240-6900

Plastic Express, Inc.
667 Lehigh Avenue
Union, NJ 07083
(718) 499-1119

United Sales USA Corp.
5902 14" Avenue-Unit 107
Brooklyn, NY 11219

(718) 709-5900

ACJ&R Supply, LLC
550 W Ingham Ave
Ewing, NJ 08638-5036
(609) 503-3995

Conserv Flag

1003 Illinois Street
Sidney, NE 69162
(308) 254-4720

Office Basics

22 Creek Circle
Boothwyn, PA 19061
(610) 342-7886

Summit Paper Company
3480 So. Clinton Avenue
South Plainfield, NJ 07080
(908) 753-70000

February 19, 2025
February 19, 2025
bn#: 2025000209

Res-Pg:k.1-2

[no._B0IS -0Y

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION
February 19, 2025
WHEREAS, on January 7, 2025 pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of POLYETHYLENE LINERS,

BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

Name and Address of Bidder

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
2400 Bedle Place
Linden, NJ 07036
(908) 862-7570

Interboro Packaging Corp.
114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12549
(845) 782-6800

Unipak Corp.

88 Cooper Avenue

West Long Branch, NJ 07764
(888) 808-5120

W. B. Mason Co., Inc.
59 Centre Street
Brockton, Ma 02301
(888) 926-2766

All for U Inc.

21 Granite Drive
Lakewood, NJ 08701
(732) 284-3390

Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC
255Route 1 & 9

Jersey City, NJ 07306

(201) 437-7440

Qualmax Supplies
60 Grant Avenue
Carteret, NJ 07008
(718) 305-6766

; and




Introduced on
Adopted on:
Official Resoly

t
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 FEBRUARY 19, 202

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely, ALPHA 1 INC. T/A VILLAGE OFFICE
SUPPLY; CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.; EASTERN JANITORIAL SUPPLY, LLC;
INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP.; PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.; UNIPAK CORP.;
UNITED SALES USA CORP. and W.B. MASON CO., INC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMIISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of Polyethylene Liners, Bathroom Tissue
and Towels for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award, February 19,
2025 through February 18, 2026, a period of one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to
N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15 as follows:

A. ALPHA 1 INC., T/A VILLAGE OFFICE SUPPLY for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 4
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP. for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 2, 3, 6 and 13.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. EASTERN JANITORIAL SUPPLY, LLC for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 9.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP. for two (2) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1 and S.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

E. PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 15.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

F. UNIPAK CORP,. for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 7.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

February 19, 2025
February 19, 2025
on#: 2025000209
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 FEBRUARYRI 9,20

G. UNITED SALES USA CORP. for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 10.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

H. W. B. MASON CO., INC. for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 8, 11, 12 and 14.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the services shall be available within the following funding source:

All County Departments, O. E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-04.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of
Finance, Building and Grounds Department, Central Supply Warehouse, Parks Department

and the successful bidders.

Introduced oJ;: February 19, 2025
Adopted on: February 19, 2025
Official Resolution#: 2025000209




Res-Pg:k.1-5
[ALPHA | INC. T/A VILLAGE OFFICE SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

13. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

14. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

line ltem Descnption Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments
Measure
1 Liners, 24" x 24", 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 2,000 CASE $22.50 $45,000.00 Samples ordered
2 Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 1,500 CASE $22.50 $33,750.00 Samples ordered
WITH 8ID
3 Liners, 24" x 24", S0 bags/roll, 20 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 400 CASE $28.69 $11,476.00 Samples ordered
WITH BID
\/, 4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5} SAMPLES WITH BID 1,100 CASE $18.10 $19,910.00 Samples Ordered

Introducedon: —___February 19 _2025
AdoptedAPHA | INCFERRUH 19GE02F FICE SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official RepolwBeT A2 ¥I9R2ANERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 7




Res-Pg:k.1-6
[CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

13. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package* :

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

14. Submission of Bid Package* ‘
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line item Descrniption Quantity Unit of unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments
Measure

1 Liners, 24" x 24", 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 2,000 CASE $15.60 $31,200.00
/ 2 Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH 1,500 CASE $9.80 $14,700.00

v/ BID
V/ 3 Liners, 24" x 24", 50 bags/roll, 20 rolis/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5) SAMPLES WITH BID 400 CASE $7.80 $3,120.00
4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {S) SAMPLES WITH BID 1,100 CASE $24.80 $27,280.00

Introduced on: February 19, 2025

g;‘f‘i’g:‘gg%%& goégbgﬁy RFPRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
o OB PYETAYEENE TINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 7



[CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Res-Pg:k.1-7

Unit of

Unit Cost

Iotal Cost

No Bid

Comments:

line item Description Quantity
Measure
5 Liners, 38" x 58", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {(5) SAMPLES WITH BID 800 CASE $15.40 $12,320.00
e 6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 bags/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 3,000 CASE $19.10 $57,300.00
v/ WITH BID
7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 800 CASE $13.60 $10,880.00
TOWELS
8 Scotts Brand 01980 Multi-Fold Type Towels, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000 towels/case, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID
9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4,000/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST CASE No Bid No Bid X
SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID
10 Paper Towels, 2 Ply, White Kitchen Roll Towels, 9" x 11", 80 Sheets/Roli, 36 Rolls/Case, As Specified 50 CASE $28.30 $1,415.00 Marcal
#06350; 30
rolls/case
11 White Roll Paper Towels, Bay West #314, or Equal, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) 160 CASE $39.92 $6,387.20 Nittany
SAMPLE WITH BID #NP-
9800YW
12 Brown Roll Paper Towels, 6 rolis/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 180 CASE $28.40 $5,112.00 Marcal
#P728N
BATHROOM TISSUE AND FACIAL TISSUE
/l 13 Bathroom Tissue, 96 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 6,000 CASE $50.00 |$300,000.00 Resolute
1% #235;
4.4"x3.5"
14 Jumbo Roll Bathroom Tissue, 6 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE 200 CASE $39.00 $7,800.00 Nittany
WITH BID #NP-
62000P-12
15 Facial Tissues, 36 boxes/case, Minimum, As Specified CASE No Bid No Bid X

Introduced on:

Eebruary 19. 2025

Sdopted OENTRAL PAISRBIRY (BRAIRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
tetal Bes B VETRRAENENERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Page 8



Res-Pg:k.1-8
[EASTERN JANITORIAL SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Lirne tem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

Liners, 38" x 58", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5} SAMPLES WITH BID

6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 bags/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (S} SAMPLES CASE No Bid No Bid X
WITH BID
7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE No Bid No Bid X
TOWELS
8 Scotts Brand 01980 Multi-Fold Type Towels, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000 towels/case, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID
/\ 9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4,000/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST 10,500 CASE $50.54 $530,670.00
Y SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID
10 Paper Towels, 2 Ply, White Kitchen Roll Towels, 9 x 11", 80 Sheets/Roll, 36 Rolls/Case, As Specified CASE No Bid No Bid X
11 White Roll Paper Towels, Bay West #314, or Equal, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) CASE No Bid No Bid X
SAMPLE WITH BID
12 Brown Roll Paper Towels, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID CASE No Bid No Bid X

BATHROOM TISSUE AND FACIAL TISSUE

13 Bathroom Tissue, 96 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID CASE No Bid No Bid X
14 Jumbo Roll Bathroom Tissue, 6 rolis/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE CASE No Bid No Bid X
WITH BID ;
15 Facial Tissues, 36 boxes/case, Minimum, As Specified CASE No Bid No Bid X
Introduced on: February 19, 2025

Adopted Tm;
ot P AR RERN. /AbUS bW SUBBLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Page 8



Res-Pg:k.1-9
[INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

13. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

14. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

line ftem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

1 Liners, 24" x 24", 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 2,000 CASE $15.48 $30,960.00 INT-2424-XH As per

Y sample #1 500/case Mfr:
‘/ Glopak/iBS/Pitt/Hymopack
30% Recycled content -
EPA compliant Delivery: 3-
5 Days ARO. 24x24 .85 mil

Introduced on: ____February 19 _2025
Adopted INT:ERBORO IPOYEHAS MG20ZER PORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official BesolyfienTRI294R20N ERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 7




Res-Pg:k.1-10
[INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line ltem Description Quantity unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments
Measure
2 Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) 1,500 CASE $10.34 $15,510.00 INT-2424-Med As per
SAMPLES WITH BID sample #2 500/case Mfr:
Glopak/IBS/Pitt/Hymopack
30% Recycled content -

EPA compliant Delivery: 3-
5 Days ARO. 24x24 1 mil

3 Liners, 24" x 24", 50 bags/roll, 20 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 400 CASE $19.74 $7,896.00 INT-2424-Med As per
WITH 8ID sample #3 1,000/case Mfr:
Glopak/IBS/Pitt/Hymopack
30% Recycled content -

EPA compliant Delivery: 3-
S Days ARO. 24x24 .5 mil

4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 1,100 CASE $37.24 $40,964.00 INT-3339-XH As per
sample #4 500/case Mfr:
Glopak/IBS/Pitt/Hymopack
30% Recycled content -
EPA compliant Delivery: 3-
5 Days ARO. 33x39 .9 mil

S Liners, 38" x 58", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 800 CASE $13.34 $10,672.00 INT-3858-XH As per

" sample #5 100/case Mfr:

/ Glopak/IBS/Pitt/Hymopack
30% Recycled content -

EPA compliant Delivery: 3-

5 Days ARO. 38x58 .9 mil

6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 bags/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) 3,000 CASE $17.82 $53,460.00 INT-3860-Exh As per
SAMPLES WITH BID sample #6 100/case Mfr:
Glopak/IBS/Pitt/Hymopack
30% Recycled content -

EPA compliant Delivery: 3-
5 Days ARO. 38x60 1.5 mil

Introduced on: Eebruary 19 2025
AdoptediNTERBORO FohCUaG MGREBBRPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official BeslBRaRETRRATNR2LNERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 8




[PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Res-Pg:k.1-11

12 Brown Roll Paper Towels, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 180 CASE $22.10 $3,978.00 Crystalware
- #K6800
BATHROOM TISSUE AND FACIAL TISSUE
13 Bathroom Tissue, 96 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 6,000 CASE $34.99 $209,940.00 Boardwalk -
#6145
14 Jumbo Roll Bathroom Tissue, 6 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE 200 CASE $29.99 $5,998.00 Boardwalk -
WITH BID #6102
/ 15 Facial Tissues, 36 boxes/case, Minimum, As Specified 100 CASE $14.99 $1,499.00 Silky Soft -
V #100VAP
100/box-30
bx/case
Introduced_ on: Eebruary 19, 2025
Adopte

Official

Line [tem Description Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No flid Comments:

«g%'smsnc EXPRESSaNCIY,RO2BONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
obEopETRIRENP3IRIERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 9



Res-Pg:k.1-12
[UNIPAK CORP.} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

S| Liners, 38" x 58", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 800 CASE $13.90 $11,120.00
6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 bags/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 3,000 CASE $22.90 $68,700.00
WITH BID
‘/,‘ 7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID 800 CASE $13.40 $10,720.00
TOWELS
8 Scotts Brand 01980 Multi-Fold Type Towels, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000 towels/case, CASE No Bid No Bid X

Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID

9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4,000/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST CASE No Bid No 8id X
SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID

10 Paper Towels, 2 Ply, White Kitchen Roll Towels, 9" x 11", 80 Sheets/Roll, 36 Rolls/Case, As Specified CASE No Bid No Bid X

11 White Roll Paper Towels, Bay West #314, or Equal, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) CASE No Bid No Bid X
SAMPLE WITH 8ID

12 Brown Roll Paper Towels, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID CASE No 8id No Bid X

BATHROOM TISSUE AND FACIAL TISSUE

13 Bathroom Tissue, 96 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID CASE No Bid No 8id X
14 Jumbo Roll Bathroom Tissue, 6 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE CASE No Bid No 8id X
WITH BID
15 Facial Tissues, 36 boxes/case, Minimum, As Specified CASE No 8id No Bid X
Introduced on: February 19, 2025

Adopted o} ABK cgﬁ{ﬁvg 2PBOCUMENT REPORT

Official Reso : 2
Bid < POLYET LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
Page 8



Res-Pg:k.1-13

[UNITED SALES USA CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

Liners, 38" x 58", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID $17.23 $13,784.00
6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 bags/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES 3,000 CASE $18.81 $56,430.00
WITH BID
7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5) SAMPLES WITH BID 800 CASE $14.25 $11,400.00
TOWELS
8 Scotts Brand 01980 Multi-Fold Type Towels, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000 towels/case, » 8,000 CASE $51.80 $414,400.00

Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID

9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4,000/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST 10,500 CASE $59.69 [$626,745.00
SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID
I3
vl 10 Paper Towels, 2 Ply, White Kitchen Roll Towels, 9" x 11", 80 Sheets/Roll, 36 Rolls/Case, As Specified 50 CASE $20.04 $1,002.00 30 rolls/cs
11 White Roll Paper Towels, Bay West #314, or Equal, 6 rolis/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) 160 CASE $26.86 $4,297.60

SAMPLE WITH BID

12 Brown Roll Paper Towels, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WiTH BID 180 CASE $20.17 $3,630.60

BATHROOM TISSUE AND FACIAL TISSUE

13 Bathroom Tissue, 96 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 6,000 CASE $30.00 }$180,000.00
14 Jumbo Roll Bathroom Tissue, 6 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE {1) SAMPLE 200 CASE $23.10 $4,620.00
WITH BID
15 Facial Tissues, 36 boxes/case, Minimum, As Specified 100 CASE $15.90 $1,590.00 30 boxes/cs
Introduced on: February 19, 2025

Adopte

o AiiTeD saLESSIAY QR RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS
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Res-Pg:k.1-14

[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

tine {tem Description Quantity Unit of Uit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

Liners, 24" x 24", MUST BE CLEAR, 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES
WITH BID
3 Liners, 24" x 24", 50 bags/roll, 20 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5} SAMPLES WITH CASE No Bid No Bid X
BID
4 Liners, 33" x 39", 500/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE No Bid No Bid X
5 Liners, 38" x 58", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE No Bid No Bid X
6 Liners, 38" x 60", MUST BE CLEAR, 100 bags/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE (5) SAMPLES CASE No Bid No Bid X
WITH BID
7 Liners, 40" x 46", 100/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT FIVE {5) SAMPLES WITH BID CASE No Bid No Bid X
TOWELS
n 8 Scotts Brand 01980 Multi-Fold Type Towels, Minimum Size: 9.4" x 12.4", 4,000 towels/case, 8,000 CASE $44.35 $354,800.00 KCC01980
V Minimum, As Specified or Equal, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID
9 Continuous Hand Towels, Minimum Size: 9.80" x 7.90", 4,000/case, Minimum, As Specified, CASE No Bid No Bid X
MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH 8ID
10 Paper Towels, 2 Ply, White Kitchen Roll Towels, 9" x 11", 80 Sheets/Roll, 36 Rolls/Case, As CASE No Bid No Bid X
Specified
"/ 11 White Roll Paper Towels, Bay West #314, or Equal, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE 160 CASE $32.08 $5,132.80 NPP680OYW
(1) SAMPLE WITH BID
V/‘ 12 Brown Roll Paper Towels, 6 rolls/case, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH BID 180 CASE $20.08 $3,614.40 MRCNP6800EN
BATHROOM TISSUE AND FACIAL TISSUE
13 Bathroom Tissue, 96 rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) SAMPLE WITH 6,000 CASE $31.80 [$190,800.00 ALM276
BID
Introduced on: February 19, 2025
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[WB MASON] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
POLYETHYLENE LINERS, BATHROOM TISSUE AND TOWELS

Res-Pg:k.1-15

Line ltem

Descnption

Quantity

Unit of

Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Comments:

/ 14 Jumbo Roll Bathroom Tissue, & rolls/case, Minimum, As Specified, MUST SUBMIT ONE (1) 200 CASE $20.49 $4,098.00 MRCNP73041000
V SAMPLE WITH BID
15 Facial Tissues, 36 boxes/case, Minimum, As Specified 100 CASE $18.45 $1,845.00 30 boxes per
case. Bid price
relfect 30 boxes
per case
.
Introduced on: February 19, 2025
Adopte

Official
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