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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly

Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
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101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

August 6, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES to Acme
Supply Co. Ltd.; Bob Barker Company, Inc.; Care Supplies LLC; JML Medical, Inc.; Matrix Maintenance Supply

LLC; and Unipak Corp., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2025-89)
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REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guainer”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resoluti

CONTRACT NO. MUST BEON K.
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

R 20
RESOLUTION

August 6, 2025

WHEREAS, on May 6, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed
bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES
for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
ACME Supply Co. LTD Bob Barker Company, Inc.

10 Cedar Swamp Road, Suite 7 7925 Purfoy Rd.

Glen Cove, NY 11542 Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526
(800) 567-8025 (800) 334-9880

Care Supplies LLC JML Medical, Inc.

67 E Centre Street 1 Havenwood Court, Unit 502
Nutley, NJ 07110 Lakewood, NJ 08701

(212) 616-6000 (732) 901-1600

Matrix Maintenance Supply LLC Unipak Corp.

3861 Sylon Blvd P.O. Box 332

Hainesport, NJ 08036 West Long Branch, NJ 07764
(609) 267-5455 (888) 808-5120

McKesson Medical-Surgical Parts on a Dime

Government Solutions LLC 3362 Caminito Carmel Landing
9954 Maryland Drive, Suite 5176 Del Mar, CA 92014

Henrico, VA 23233-1484 (858) 414-4042

(833) 343-2700
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely, ACME SUPPLY CO. LTD.; BOB
BARKER COMPANY, INC.; CARE SUPPLIES LLC; JML MEDICAL, INC.; MATRIX
MAINTENANCE SUPPLY LLC AND UNIPAK CORP. Recommendation is made to reject
Item Nos. 1, 6, 12, 34, 46, 50, 55, 60, 62 and 64 as unresponsive. All rejected items will be
rebid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of Penal Institutional
Supplies for the County of Ocean, for the contract shall be for a one (1) year contract term,
beginning July 1, 2025 and ending June 30, 2026, or until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to

N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

August 6, 2025
August 6, 2025
bn#: 2025001100
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Res-Pg:k.1-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 AUGUST 6, 2025

A. ACME SUPPLY CO., LTD for six (6) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 3,4,5, 21,26 and 29.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC for thirty-four (34) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 2,7,8,9, 11, 14, 15, 16, 18, 19, 20, 22, 23, 24, 25, 30, 31, 36, 37, 40, 43, 44, 45,
47,48, 51, 52, 53, 54, 56, 57, 58, 59 and 63.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. CARE SUPPLIES LLC for eight (8) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 10, 13, 17, 27, 32, 33, 35 and 41.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. JML MEDICAL, INC for three (3) items to wit:
ITEM NOS. 39, 42 and 49.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

E. MATRIX MAINTENANCE SUPPLY LLC for two (2) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 28 and 38.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-0OC.

F. UNIPAK CORP for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 61.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.4, the County has established a reasonable
estimated maximum dollar value of $58,800.00 for the term of this contract, based on
historical procurement data for comparable goods or services. The County further reserves
the right to increase quantities by up to twenty percent (20%) of the maximum awarded

amount at the unit prices bid, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.3.

3. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital
accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Corrections and

Juvenile Services.

4. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made

upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the

August 6, 2025
August 6, 2025
on#: 2025001100
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 AUGUST 6, 2025

requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-89.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Corrections, Juvenile Services and the successful bidders.

August 6, 2025
August 6, 2025
bn#: 2025001100




Res-Pg:k.1-5
[ACME SUPPLY CO., LTD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

1 Individual Hygiene BX No Bid No Bid - X
Kit: MUST include at '
MINIMUM - 1 each
of the following:
Thumbprint
Toothbrush (not to
exceed 3"), 6 oz.
Clear Tube
Toothpaste (Animal-
Fat Free), 5" Plastic
Comb, 4" Security
Clear Flexible Pen
with Black Ink, 0.75
0z. Wrapped
Personal Size Soap,
Each Kit MUST be
Individually Sealed in
a Clear Vinyl Bag,
200 Kits/Box, As
Specified, or Equal

2 Inmate Security BX No Bid No Bid X
Pens, Flexible Pen,
Clear Vinyl Sleeve,
Black Ink ONLY,
Washable Ink, 12
Pens/Box, As
Specified, or Equal

TOWELS

3 Bath Towel 20" x 25 DOZ $10.24 $256.00
1 40", 8 oz., White,
100% Cotton,
Minimum Qty. 10
dz., As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-oni———August-6,-2025-
Adopted AOME SUPPIAMGQst 6T2I2BESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Brpolptint: |IREAIGUHRENAL SUPPLIES
Page 8



Res-Pg:k.1-6
[ACME SUPPLY CO., LTD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Bath Towel 24" x $45.00 $6,975.00
48", 14 oz., Solid
\// Color: Blue, 100%
Cotton, As Specified,
or Equal

5 Bath Towel, 30" x 175 DOz $119.00 $20,825.00

/ 56", MUST BE Thin,
\/ 100% Cotton,
Packaged by the
Dozen, As Specified,
or Equal

6 Bath Towel, 36" x Doz No Bid No Bid X
68", 100% Cotton,
Heavy Weight,
Hemmed and
Trimmed, As
Specified, or Equal

HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOQS, AND SUPPLIES

7 Comb, 5" Bendable CASE No Bid No Bid X
Plastic, 12
Combs/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

8 Comb, 5" Afro Pick, . jlev4 No Bid No Bid X
Sold by the Dozen,
As Specified, or
Equal

9 Comb, 8 1/2" CASE No Bid No Bid X
Bendable, 12 per
case, As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-en:—Augst6;-2025
Adopteg[eﬁj\/l E SUPPAYiuat 6, FAORRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Regalpions R9SPOAIIAONAL SUPPLIES
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. Res-Pg:k.1-7
[ACME SUPPLY CO., LTD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:
Packaging:

Line ltem Description Quantity

Shampoo, White
Rain Citrus, 15 oz.
Bottle, 12

Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

MATTRESSES, SHEETS, BLANKETS

21 Blanket 62" x 80", 1,025 EA $5.45 $5,586.25
NOT LESS THAN 65%

/ Wool, Fire Retardant
\, according to Federal
Flammable Fabric
Act CS 191-53,
Machine Washable,
Over-stitched Ends
(NOT DISASTER
BLANKETS), As
Specified

22 - Blanket, Prestige XL, ‘EA No Bid No Bid X
66" by 90", Navy or
Camel, 100%
Polyester,
Hypoallergenic,
Permanently Anti-
static, Meets or
Exceeds ASTM D
4151-92
Flammability .
Requirements,
Machine Washable,
Tumble Dry Low
Temp, As Specified,
or Equal

Introdu :

ced-oni—August 6,-2025—
Ad9ptec{/éﬁME.SUPPA‘{x§6kt 6TIRBESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Begolptigmt: IREZPAAITIBNAL SUPPLIES
Page 12 ’
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[ACME SUPPLY CO., LTD] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ' '
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Sheet, 54" x 90"

trregular, Muslin
/ 130, Color: White,
Sold by the Dozen,
As Specified, or
Equal

$12,573.75

GENERAL HYGIENE

27 Bar Soap, Dove 2.6 CASE No Bid No Bid X
oz. Individually
Wrapped, 36
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

28 Bar Soap, Dove 3.75 CASE No Bid No Bid X
oz. Individually i
Wrapped, 36
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

29 Bar Soap, Personal 60 CASE $60.00 $3,600.00

" . |Size.750z., 1000
\ Bars/Case,
\ Individually

Wrapped, Dial, As
Specified, or Equal

30 Bath Soap, 3 0z, 25 CASE $55.00 $1,375.00
Individually
Wrapped, 144
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

31 Bath Soap Box, DOZ No Bid No Bid X
Hinged, MUST Hold ’
S oz. Soap, As
Specified, or Equal

dARME suppm,gﬁt $TRLBESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Regolptiont: (REZFAAITIONAL SUPPLIES
Page 14




. Res-Pg:k.1-9
[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD ‘
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:
Packaging:

Line Item

Description Quantity

Inmate Security 150 $105.00 MSBP - Case of 5-7 days Unit Cost
/ Pens, Flexible Pen, 144 provided is for 12
Clear Vinyl Sleeve, pens. Bob bArker
\/ Black Ink ONLY, e only sells these
Washable Ink, 12 pens in a case of
Pens/Box, As : : 144. Price per

Specified, or Equal case of 144 pens
D ¢ is $8.40.

TOWELS

3 Bath Towel 20" x 25 [s]e74 . $11.89 $297.25 Item No. 8T2040; |5-7 days
40", 8 oz., White, . Dozen
100% Cotton,
Minimum Qty. 10
dz., As Specified, or
Equal

4 Bath Towel 24" x Doz No Bid No Bid X
48", 14 oz., Solid
Color: Blue, 100%
Cotton, As Specified,
or Equal

5 Bath Towel, 30" x DOz No Bid No Bid X

‘ 56", MUST BE Thin,
100% Cotton,
Packaged by the
Dozen, As Specified,
or Equal

6 Bath Towel, 36" x DOZ No Bid No Bid X
68", 100% Cotton,
Heavy Weight,
Hemmed and
Trimmed, As
Specified, or Equal

HAIR AND BODY CARE - BRUSHES, CONDITIONERS, LOTIONS, SHAMPOQS, AND SUPPLIES

Introduced-on- August 65,2025

Adopted[B@B BARKER@MMEDZ&NC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggolyitqnit ROSFPRIMABNAL SUPPLIES
Page 8




: Res-Pg:k.1-10
[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Mode! & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

7 Comb, 5" Bendable 15 CASE $0.35 $5.25 Item No. C-5; 5-7 days Unit Cost

Plastic, 12 Case of 144 provided is for 12
/ Combs/Case, As combs. Price per
v/ Specified, or Equal : case of 144 is
$4.20. Combs are
only sold in a case
of 144.
8 Comb, 5" Afro Pick, 15 Doz $2.21 $33.15 ftem No. PICK; 5-7 days
/ Sold by the Dozen, Dozen
\/ As Specified, or
Equal
9 Comb, 8 1/2" S CASE $4.15 $20.95 item No. FC-85; | 5-7 days

\// Bendable, 12 per Dozen

case, As Specified, or

Equal
10 Cocoa Butter with 10 CASE $24.00 $240.00 Item No. 74000; |5-7 days
Shea Body Lotion, Case of 6
Suave or Equal, 10fl.
oz. Bottles, 6

Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

11 Elastic Ponytail. 5 CASE $8.92 $44.60 Iltem No. 90409; |[5-7 days

/ Holder, NO ) Case of 72
\/ Grommets, NO ponytail holders
metal, 18

Elastics/Card, 12
Cards/Case, Master
Case Quantity 72, 6
Cases/Master Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

Introdu

Adopted BOB BARKERGELNPABY28NC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Begolptiané: ROZFAAITONAL SUPPLIES
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[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-11

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.:

Packaging:

12 Hair Clipper CASE ’ No Bid No Bid ) X
Cleaning/Disinfecting .

Spray, Germicidal,
Fungicidal, Virucidal,
12 -8 o0z.
Bottles/Case, MUST
BE NON-AEROSOL,
As Specified, or

Comments:

Equal
13 Hair Clippers, 150 EA $94.46 $14,169.00 ‘ Item No. 8500;
Industrial Strength, Each

Electric, Multiple
Blade Sizes, Wahl, As
Specified, or Equal

14 Hair Conditioners, 10 CASE $19.60 $196.00 Item No. LB10261 |5-7 days
/ Lucky Brand or - Case of 12
3 Equal, 12fl. oz.
Vi Bottle, 12
Bottles/Case, As

Specified, or Equal

13 oz bottles

15 Hairbrush, 8" 5 CASE ) $9.28 $46.40 Item No. HB - 5-7 days
\// Standard Brush with ’ Caseof 24 _
Nylon Bristles, 24

Brushes/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

/ 16 Hairbrush, 7 3/4" 10 CASE $5.28 $52.80 item No. HB-02; 5-7 days
Vented Brush with Case of 12
\/ Plastic Bristles, 12
Brushes/Case, As

Specified, or Equal

.Introduced-on:—— August 6, 2025
AdoptetB&B BARKERALQNPANO2INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official f}gsopiigRt| 482 FPOMEINAL SUPPLIES
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[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-12

Line tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:
Packaging:

17 Oil Moisturizer Hair CASE $75.50 $755.00 ltem No.L506-  |5-7 days
Lotion, Luster Brand Case of 12
or Equal, 8 oz.
Bottle, 12
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

18 Shampoo, 2-in-1 10 CASE $25.50 $255.00 ‘| tem No. 42402; |5-7 days Sold in a Case of

/ Dandruff, Pert Plus Case of 6 6; 13.5 oz Bottles
V or Equal, 13.5fl. oz.

Bottle, 6
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

19 Shampoo, Maximum 10 CASE T $24.62 $246.20 Item No. S2; Case |5-7 days

. / Security Clear, 2 oz. of 96
1% Bottle, 96 )

Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

20 Shampoo, White 15 CASE. $17.50 $262.50 Item No. 60003; |5-7 days Sold in a Case of
Rain Citrus, 15 oz. .|Case of 6 . 6; 15 oz Bottles

\ Bottle, 12
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal
MATTRESSES, SHEETS, BLANKETS
21 Blanket 62" x 80", 1,025 EA $7.03 $7,205.75 Item No. 5-7 days 70% wool

NOT LESS THAN 65%
Wool, Fire Retardant
according to Federal
Flammable Fabric
Act CS 191-53,
Machine Washable,
Over-stitched Ends
(NOT DISASTER
BLANKETS), As
Specified

WB6280; Each

Introduced.on:

August 6 2025

AdoptefB@8 BARKERAI@MRANOZANC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official figsobiioRt| 8PP MBINAL SUPPLIES
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[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-13

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Totat Cost Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Blanket, Prestige XL, $1,767.00 Item No's: Colors: Camel
66" by 90", Navy or PFB6690CML and {CML) and Navy
Camel, 100% ’ PFB663ONV; Each (NV)
Polyester, '
Hypoallergenic,
/ Permanently Anti-
V1 static, Meets or
Exceeds ASTM D
4151-92
Flammability
Requirements,
Machine Washable,
Tumble Dry Low
Temp, As Specified,
or Equal

23 Self 30 EA $64.58 $1,937.40 Item No. SB5480; [5-7 days

Protection/Suicide Each
Blanket, 2-Layer
'\/ Heavyweight 650

Denier Cordura
Nylon Quilted to 9.0
oz. Polyester Batting,
Machine Wash/Dry,
Fire Resistant; Size
54" x 80", As
Specified, or Equal

Introduced-on: August 8, 2025
AdoptefB@B BARKERAIQNPBN02BNC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
OfficialfigsopieRt: 4ePPOTBINAL SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:k.1-14
[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT ‘

Bid No. TBD |
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Line Item Description

Self ) $1,937.40 Iltem No's: 505
Protection/Suicide ) and S05JR; Each
Smock, 2-Layer
Heavyweight 650
Denier Cordura
Nylon Quilted to 9.0
oz Polyester Batting,
1 %" Velcro Hook &
v Loop Strips, 6”
Length, Machine
Wash/Dry, Fire
‘Resistant; Small — '
Chest 38" — 48",
Standard — Chest 44”
— 56", XXL ~ Chest
56" —72", As
Specified, or Equal

25 Inmate Mattress, 225 EA $82.66 $18,598.50 Item No. 5-7 days
DeptCor P100-3076, PMP30754; Each
/ 30" x 76" x 3", Fire
\/ Resistant, Foam ’

Core, Vinyl Covered
Mattress. MUST
have a Built-in
Headrest, As
Specified, or Equal

26 Sheet, 54" x 90"~ 525 DOZ $27.07 . $14,211.75 ltem No. 5-7 days
Irregular, Muslin SH5490N; Dozen
130, Color: White, :
Sold by the Dozen,
As Specified, or
A&qual

GENERAL HYGIENE

Introduced-on- Augncf R, 2025 .

AdoptefBé»B BARKERALGIVPANO2BNC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:k.1-15
[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Bar Soap, Dove 2.6 No Bid X
oz. Individually -
Wrapped, 36
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

28 Bar Soap, Dove 3.75 " CASE . No Bid No 8id X
oz. Individually
Wrapped, 36
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

29 Bar Soap, Personal 60 © CASE $124.60 $7,476.00 ltem No. 5-7 days
Size .75 oz., 1000 DWO06009-A; Case
Bars/Case, of 1000
Individually

Wrapped, Dial, As
Specified, or Equal

Individually . case of 144
Wrapped, 144
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

/ 30 . Bath Soap, 3 oz., 25 CASE $42.56 $1,064.00 Item No. WA3; 5-7 days

/ 31 Bath Soap Box, 20 Doz . $4.30 $86.00 Item No. 434; 5-7 days

\/ Hinged, MUST Hold " |case of 12
5 0z. Soap, As

Specified, or Equal

32 Deodorant, Men's 110 CASE $33.04 $3,634.40 item No. PG162; |5-7 days
Sport Scent, Old case of 24
Spice .5 oz., 24 Per
Case, As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-on: August 86,2025
AdoptedR{MB BARKERAGGNAPA 12626NC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Bepoluiont: |RRZIMMHRINAL SUPPLIES
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[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-16

Line Item

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Mfr. Model &
Packaging:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

33

Deodorant, Men's
Speed Stick, Fresh
Scent, 1.8 0z., 12 Per
Case, As Specified, or
Equal

10

CASE

$31.56

$315.60

Item No.
CG95008; case of
12

5-7 days

34

Deodorant,
Universal, Stick,
0.50z, Powerup, As
Specified, or Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

35

Deodorant,
Women's Degree or
Equal, Clean Scent,
.5 0z,, 36 Per Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

110

CASE

$40.78

$4,485.80

ltem No. 23520-1;
case of 36

5-7 days

36

Deodorant,
Women's Lady
Speed Stick or Equal,
1.4 oz., 12 Per Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

CASE

$27.46

$137.30

Item No.
CG96579; case o
12 :

5-7 days

\/ 37

Disposable Razor,
Single Edge Security,
BIC, Sold
individually, MUST
BE WHITE, As
Specified, or Equal

35,000

EA

$0.06

$2,100.00

{tem No. R600;
case of 600

5-7 days

Soldonlyina
Case of 600
razors. Unit Cost
given is for each
razor. Price per
case of 600 razors
is $36.00

Introduced on:

August 6, 2025

AdoptedB®B BARKERAOOMPAINVZENC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Besokiqnt: |R3HINAL suppLIES
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Res-Pg:k.1-17
[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line ltem

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Hand Sanitizer, Deb
Instant Foam, or
Equal, MUST NOT
Contain Alcohol, 400
mL Pump Top Bottle,
12 Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

39 Hand Sanitizer Gel, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Institutional Use,
Clear Soft Plastic
Squirt Bottle, NO
Pump, MINIMUM
60% Alcohol
Content, MUST Fit
into Standard
Uniform Pant or
Shirt Pocket, 60-4 oz.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

40 Lip Balm, Chapstick, S CASE $20.29 $101.45 tem No. 14750; |5-7 days
\ or Equal, .15 0z, 12 Dozen
Per Case, As

Specified, or Equal

41 Mouth Wash, 5 CASE $31.00 $155.00 Iltem No. FMW4; [5-7 days
Alcohol Free, 4 0z,, case of 60
60 Per Case, As

Specified, or Equal

42 Shaving Cream, S CASE $42.80 $214.00 tem No. BS-06;  [5-7 days
Brushless, 0.85 oz., case of 144
144 Per Case, As ’
Specified, or Equal

Introduced-on- August.6,.2025
AdopteB& BARKER AGMEAN2025/C.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Officialgfgsobtipn#; NOPFAI TN AL SUPPLIES
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_ Res-Pg:k.1-18
[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES -

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Toothbrush, $100.80 Item No. BBFH30; Unit Cost is for a
1Individually case of 144 Case of 144
/ Wrapped Flexi, ) toothbrushes.
Standard Length, ‘ Only sold by the
M 100 Case of 144.
Toothbrushes/Box,
{NO Metal Parts, NO
EXCEPTIONS

44 Toothbrush, Thumb, 50 CASE $3.91 $195.50 . Iltem No. TH42; 5-7 days
Individually Sealed, i case of 72

/ 3" Length, 72 ,

V] i Toothbrushes/Case,

As Specified, or
Equal

45 Toothpaste, 0.850z, 30 CASE $27.14 $814.20 Item No. MST8S; |5-7 days
/ Maximum Security case of 144
' See-Through Tubes,
\/ 144
Toothbrushes/Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

46 Toothpaste, 2.75 oz., EA No Bid No Bid X
Clear Plastic Tube, As
Specified, or Equal

FEMININE HYGIENE

47 Sanitary Napkin, 60 CASE $35.32 $2,119.20 Item No. SN12-C; |5-7 days

/ Individually case of 576
P Wrapped,

Unscented, Beltless
with Adhesive Strip,
576 Per Case, As
Specified, or Equal

Introduced-on: August 8, 2025
AdoptedBMB BARKERMIGNSPHRE2ENC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Bepolutiqn: |RATFUHRINAL SUPPLIES
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[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD.
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-19

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Total Cost

Mfr. Model &
Packaging:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

48 Sanitary Napkin, 5 - CASE $27.25 $136.25 item No. SN288- |[5-7 days Unit Cost is for a
Super, Individually C; case of 288 Case of 288
\’/ Wrapped, 140 mL sanitary napkins.
Absorbency, 250 Per Only sold by the
Case, As Specified, or Case of 288
Equal
49 Tampons, Plastic 59 CASE $65.85 $3,885.15 Iitem No. 811218; |5-7 days Unit Cost given is
Applicator Box, case of 216 - for a CASE of 216.
Individually Item No. 811218
Wrapped, isonly soldina
Unscented, Regular Case of 216
Size, 20 tampons.
Tampons/Box, 12
Boxes/Case, As
Specified, or Equal
LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES
50 Laundry Detergent, } BTL No Bid No Bid
100 oz. bottle, Must
Be Free & Sensitive,
Persil, or Equal
51 Laundry Net, Slip . 700 EA $3.18 $2,226.00 Item No. G2436; |5-7 days Sold ONLY by the
. Lock, 24" x 36", Dozen DOZEN. Price per
\// Green, 100% Dozen is $38.16.
Polyester Mesh, As Not SOLD BY THE
Specified, or Equal EACH. Unit Cost
~ |givenis per each.
52 Laundry Net, Slip 700 EA $4.09 $2,863.00 Item No. W3048; |5-7 days Sold ONLY by the
/ Lock, 30" x 48", . Dozen DOZEN. Not SOLD
\/ White, 100% BY THE EACH.

Polyester Mesh, As
Specified, or Equal

Unit Cost given is
per each. Price
per Dozen is
$49.08.

Introdu: ; t 6,2025

AdoptedR®B BARKERADIGIAPE U26NC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BepolutiQnf: |RRAFFFHRINAL SUPPLIES
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[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-20

Line Item Description Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Mfr. Model &

Packaging:

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

53 Laundry Net, with 125
' Tie Cord, 24" x 36",

/ White, 100%

Vv Durable Polyester,

Cloth ID Flag

Attached, As
Specified, or Equal

EA

$2.75

$343.75

Iltem No. E2436;
Dozen

5-7 days

Sold ONLY by the
DOZEN. Not SOLD
BY THE EACH.
Unit Cost given is
per each. Price
per Dozen is
$33.00

Liquid Laundry 10
Detergent, Perfume
V & Dye-Free for
Allergy Prone or
Sensitive Skin, Can
be used with HE and
Non-HE Machines,
1Arm & Hammer or
Equal, 50 oz.
Container, 8
Containers/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

CASE

$66.78

$667.80

Item No. 33200-
50026; case of 8

5-7 days

SHOWER ACCESSORIES - CURTAINS AND SHOWER SHOES

55 Shower Curtain,
Breakaway, Blue, San
Suede 66" x 77" with
Velcro Strip Header
and 20" of White
1/2" Hole Mesh at
Top, As Specified, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

Introduced-on: Allgll:f 62025

Adopted BOB BARKERGGQUEFB\R025NC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Begolptiniii: REFPAUTRBNAL SUPPLIES
Page 19




[BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-21

Line Item

Description

Shower Curtain,
Clear Top, 36" x 77"
with Velcro Strips, 2-
ply Vinyl Shower
Curtain with Velcro
Strips, Light Green in
Color, MUST have
Clear Top, As
Specified, or Equal

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

$4,335.00

Mfr. Model &
Packaging:

Item No.
SCVC3677; Each

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Comments:

Track Shower
Curtain System, 3/4"
Male Velcro Tab, As
Specified, or Equal

57 Shower Curtain, 100 EA $17.06 $1,706.00 Item No. SC3677; |5-7 days
/ Hookless, 36" x 77", Each
v with Snap Closures,
1 As Specified, or
Equal
58 Shower Shoes, X- 2,600 PR $0.91 $2,366.00 Item No. 5114X- |5-7 days Sold only by the
Strap, S, M, L, & XL, SIZE; Dozen per . DOZEN PER SIZE.
/ Thick-Molded, Skid- SIZE Not SOLD BY THE
Proof Sole, As PAIR. Unit Cost
Specified, or Equal given is per pair.
Unit Price per our
selling unit of
measure of a
Dozen is $10.92.
59 Shoes, Standard Slip- 25 PR $3.09 $77.25 Item No. FPVSN2- |5-7 days
On Inmate, TN-SIZE; Pair
\/ Oversized Sizes 14,
15 and 16, Sold by
the Pair, As
Specified, or Equal
60 Velcro Track Tabs for EA No Bid No Bid

Introduced-on:

August § 2025

AdoptedB@B BARKERM]@IMPB\[QVZWC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolstiomit: | REGIVRINAL SUPPLIES
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Res-Pg:k.1-22
[CARE SUPPLIES,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:
Packaging:

7 Comb, 5" Bendable 15 CASE $5.70 $85.50
Plastic, 12
Combs/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

8 Comb, 5" Afro Pick, 15 Doz .$5.70 $85.50
Sold by the Dozen,
As Specified, or
Equal

9 Comb, 8 1/2" CASE No Bid No Bid X
Bendable, 12 per
case, As Specified, or
Equal

10 Cocoa Butter with 10 - CASE : $8.12 $81.20
/ Shea Body Lotion, .

Suave or Equal, 10 fl.
oz. Bottles, 6

Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

11 Elastic Ponytail CASE No Bid No Bid X
Holder, NO
Grommets, NO
metal, 18
Elastics/Card, 12
Cards/Case, Master
Case Quantity 72, 6
Cases/Master Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: August 6, 2025

AdOPtegQXRE SUPPL UStIBRESZHNSE DOCUMENT REPORT
S0
ias

Official BesoltRRt: (REINTBNAL suppLIES
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[CARE SUPPLIES,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-23

Line item

Description

Hair Clipper
Cleaning/Disinfecting
Spray, Germicidal,
Fungicidal, Virucidal,
12 -8 oz.
Bottles/Case, MUST
BE NON-AEROSOL,
As Specified, or
Equal

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Mfr. Model &
Packaging:

Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Hair Clippers,
Industrial Strength,
Electric, Multiple
Blade Sizes, Wahl, As
Specified, or Equal

150

EA

$21.26

$3,189.00

14

Hair Conditioners,
Lucky Brand or
Equal, 12 fl. oz.
Bottle, 12
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

CASE

No Bid

No 8id .

15

Hairbrush, 8"
Standard Brush with
Nylon Bristles, 24
Brushes/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

16

Hairbrush, 7 3/4"

Vented Brush with
Plastic Bristles, 12
Brushes/Case, As .
Specified, or Equél

10

CASE

$9.56

$95.60

Introduced on:

August 6, 2025

Adopte@RE SUPPLIRBIUSLIORBEPHNSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Offictal EigeoBHIQRY IRSFTPOTINAL suppLIE
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Res-Pg:k.1-24
[CARE SUPPLIES,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:
Packaging:

Oil Moisturizer Hair $631.00

/ Lotion, Luster Brand
: or Equal, 8 oz.
Bottle, 12

Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

18 Shampoo, 2-in-1 CASE No Bid No Bid X
Dandruff, Pert Plus ’
or Equal, 13.5 fl. oz.
Bottle, 6
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

19 Shampoo, Maximum CASE No Bid No Bid X
Security Clear, 2 oz. v
Bottle, 96
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

20 Shampoo, White CASE No Bid No Bid X
Rain Citrus, 15 oz. |
Bottle, 12
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

MATTRESSES, SHEETS, BLANKETS

21 Blanket 62" x 80", EA No Bid No Bid X
NOT LESS THAN 65%
Wool, Fire Retardant
according to Federal
Flammable Fabric
Act CS 191-53,
Machine Washable,
Over-stitched Ends
(NOT DISASTER
BLANKETS), As
Specified

Introduced on: August 6§ 2025
Ad(_)gteQ@QRE S_UPPLI-ESQLLSIFRMNSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BesolyBRnd: |RRZARIFRINAL SUPPLIES
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[CARE SUPPLIES,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:k.1-25

Line ltem

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Bar Soap, Dove 2.6
oz. Individually
Wrapped, 36
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

CASE

$42.65

$213.25

28

Bar Soap, Dove 3.75
oz. Individually
Wrapped, 36
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

29

Bar Soap, Personal
Size .75 oz., 1000
Bars/Case,
Individually
Wrapped, Dial, As
Specified, or Equal

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

30

Bath Soap, 3 oz,
Individually
Wrapped, 144
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

25

CASE

$95.07

$2,376.75

31

Bath Soap Box,
Hinged, MUST Hold
S 0z. Soap, As

| Specified, or Equal

20

Doz

$4.32

$86.40

32
4

Deodorant, Men's
Sport Scent, Old
Spice .5 oz., 24 Per
Case, As Specified, or
Equal

110

CASE

$28.12

$3,093.20

Introduced on:

August 6, 2025

Adopted@8RE SUPPLAMIUS BRISFEONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BesolybiRmét: | RRFANHISNAL suPPLIES
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Res-Pg:k.1-26
[CARE SUPPLIES,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Iltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:
Packaging:

33 Deodorant, Men's 10 CASE $26.17 $261.70
/ Speed Stick, Fresh

AY Scent, 1.8 oz., 12 Per
Case, As Specified, or
Equal

34 Deodorant, EA No Bid No Bid X
Universal, Stick,

0.50z, Powerup, As
Specified, or Equal

35 Deodorant, 110 CASE $28.05 $3,085.50
/ Women's Degree or

Y Equal, Clean Scent,

.5 0z., 36 Per Case,

As Specified, or
Equal

36 Deodorant, 5 CASE $27.36 $136.80
Women's Lady
Speed Stick or Equal,
1.4 0z., 12 Per Case,
As Specified, or
Equal

37 Disposable Razor, EA No Bid " No Bid X
Single Edge Security,
BIC, Sold
Individually, MUST
BE WHITE, As
Specified, or Equal

38 Hand Sanitizer, Deb CASE No Bid No 8id X
Instant Foam, or '
Equal, MUST NOT
Contain Alcohol, 400
mL Pump Top Bottle,
12 Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

Introduced on: August 6, 2025
Ad?pte (ONRE S_UPPLE%QH_SG REGAEONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Besolytigit: | RRAMRHMNAL suppLIES
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Res-Pg:k.1-27
[CARE SUPPLIES,LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:
Packaging:

Hand Sanitizer Gel,
Institutional Use,
Clear Soft Plastic
Squirt Bottle, NO
Pump, MINIMUM
60% Alcohol
Content, MUST Fit
into Standard
Uniform Pant or
Shirt Pocket, 60-4 oz.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

40 Lip Balm, Chapstick, CASE No Bid No Bid X
or Equal, .15 0z., 12
Per Case, As
Specified, or Equal

41 Mouth Wash, 5 CASE $27.04 $135.20
/ Alcohol Free, 4 oz,

Vv 60 Per Case, As
Specified, or Equal

42 Shaving Cream, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Brushless, 0.85 oz.,
144 Per Case, As

Specified, or Equal

» 43 Toothbrush, BX No Bid No Bid X
Individually
Wrapped Flexi,
Standard Length,
100
Toothbrushes/Box,
NO Metal Parts, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Introduced on: August 6. 2025
Ad(_)pte E SUPPLI&B 6RRIPHNSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Otficlal RSO MIoRT: n%g EJ AL SUPPLIES

Page 16




Res-Pg:k.1-28
[JML MEDICAL INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost i Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

38 Hand Sanitizer, Deb CASE No Bid No Bid X
Instant Foam, or ‘
Equal, MUST NOT
Contain Alcohol, 400
mL Pump Top Bottle,
12 Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

39 Hand Sanitizer Gel, ) CASE $58.80 $294.00 DERMARITE 7-10 ARO PRICE QUOTED IS
Institutional Use, ' DE00104 PER 60 QUR
/ Clear Soft Plastic : PRODUCTIS
\/ Squirt Bottle, NO PACKED 24-407
Pump, MINIMUM :
60% Alcohol

Content, MUST Fit
into Standard
Uniform Pant or
Shirt Pocket, 60-4 oz.
Bottles/Case, As_
Specified, or Equal

40 Lip Balm, Chapstick, CASE - No Bid No Bid X
or Equal, .15 0z., 12 :

Per Case, As

Specified, or Equal

41 Mouth Wash, CASE No Bid No Bid X
’ Alcohol Free, 4 oz., :
60 Per Case, As

Specified, or Equal

42 Shaving Cream, s CASE $39.00 $195.00 NEW WORLD 7-10ARO 144/Cs
\ Brushless, 0.85 oz., NWBSC85
144 Per Case, As

Specified, or Equal

Introduced on: August 6, 2025
Adopted gy MEDICAUBNST REAZONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official ReglwRndt AP2PAUTIBNAL suppLiES

Page 16




Res-Pg:k.1-29
[JML MEDICAL INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

Sanitary Napkin, $225.00 HOSPECO MTB- OUR PRICE IS FOR
Super, Individually ) 5008 250 OUR CASE IS
Wrapped, 140 mL . PACKED 500
Absorbency, 250 Per .
Case, As Specified, or
Equal

49 Tampons, Plastic 59 CASE $55.50 $3,274.50 HOSPECO 311220 |10 ARO 20/BX 12BX/CS

/ Applicator Box, SAME AS LAST
Individually YEAR

Vi Wrapped,
Unscented, Regular
Size, 20
Tampons/Box, 12
Boxes/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

LAUNDRY DETERGENT AND SUPPLIES -

50 Laundry Detergent, BTL No Bid No Bid X
100 oz. bottle, Must
Be Free & Sensitive,
Persil, or Equal

51 Laundry Net, Slip EA No Bid No Bid X
Lock, 24" x 36",
Green, 100%
Polyester Mesh, As
Specified, or Equal

52 Laundry Net, Slip . EA No Bid . NoBid X
Lock, 30" x 48", :
White, 100%
Polyester Mesh, As
Specified, or Equal

Introduced on: August 6, 2025
R JMLIM_EDIC_A&HW%QE%NSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial Besolytiond: | HP8NAL suppLIES
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, Res-Pg:k.1-30
[MATRIX MAINTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:
Packaging:

Sheet, 54" x 90"
Irregular, Muslin
130, Color: White,
Sold by the Dozen,
As Specified, or
Equal

GENERAL HYGIENE

27 Bar Soap, Dove 2.6 CASE No Bid No Bid X
oz. Individually : :
Wrapped, 36
Bars/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

28 Bar Soap, Dove 3.75 25 CASE $127.68 $3,192.00 19 cases of 3 days ARO Dove Pink 4.7502
/ oz. Individually ’ 48/$168.00 .
Vi Wrapped, 36

Bars/Case, As .
Specified, or Equal

29 Bar Soap, Personal 60 CASE $400.00 $24,000.00 1 cs of 500/$200.00 |3 days ARO .850z bars Fresh
Size .75 oz., 1000 . Scent
Bars/Case,
Individually

Wrapped, Dial, As
Specified, or Equal

30 Bath Soap, 3 oz., 25 CASE $305.28 $7,632.00 60 cases of 3 days ARO 3.50z Rosa Venus
Individually 60/$127.20 Bar Soap
Wrapped, 144
Bars/Case, As

Specified, or Equal

31 Bath Soap Box, 20 DOz $4.10 $82.00 2 cases of 3 days ARO
Hinged, MUST Hold . 100/$82.00cs
5 oz. Soap, As

Specified, or Equal

Introduced on: August 6, 2025
AdoptefhoATRIX MAINTENSAQCF025)PPLY, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

OfficialResoptiontt 92PPIHMNAL suppLIES
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. \ Res-Pg:k.1-31
[MATRIX MAINTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Model & Delivery, AR.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

38 Hand Sanitizer, Deb 5 CASE $235.98 $1,179.90 3 days ARO
/ Instant Foam, or
Equal, MUST NOT
'\/ Contain Alcohol, 400
" |mL Pump Top Bottle,

12 Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

39 Hand Sanitizer Gel, S CASE $279.50 $1,397.50 ‘ Purell 13 cases of 3 days ARO
Institutional Use, 24/5107.50
Clear Soft Plastic )

Squirt Bottle, NO
Pump, MINIMUM
60% Alcohol
Content, MUST Fit
into Standard
Uniform Pant or
Shirt Pocket, 60-4 oz.
Bottles/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

40 Lip Balm, Chapstick, 5 CASE $45.70 - 822850 2 cases of 3 days ARO

or Equal, .15 oz., 12 48/5114.24
Per Case, As e ’ Goodsense lipbalm

Specified, or Equal

.41 Mouth Wash, ) CASE $117.60 $588.00 3 days ARO
Alcohol Free, 4 oz.,
60 Per Case, As

Specified, or Equal

42 Shaving Cream, s CASE $92.16 $460.80 lcsof ’ 3 days ARO
Brushless, 0.85 oz., : . ' 720/5460.80cs

144 Per Case, As
Specified, or Equal

Introduced on: August 6, 2025
Adopteg«mmx MAINTEREARAO2])PPLY, LLC].RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Introduced 6n- Augusi s 2025

[UNIPAK CORP.] RESPONSE.DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD .
PENAL INSTITUTIONAL SUPPLIES

Line Item

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Mfr. Mode! & Delivery, A.R.O.: Comments:

Packaging:

58 Shower Shoes, X- ) PR
Strap, S, M, L, & X1,
Thick Molded, Skid-
Proof Sole, As
Specified, or Equal

59 Shoes, Standard Slip- PR No Bid No Bid X
On Inmate, '
Oversized Sizes 14,
15 and 16, Sold by
the Pair, As
Specified, or Equal

60 Velcro Track Tabs for EA No Bid No Bid X
Track Shower
Curtain System, 3/4" ) k ' \
Male Velcro Tab, As
Specified, or Equal

GLOVES h
61 Gloves, Black Nitrile 325 >CASE $38.40 $12,480.00 UPC NPF
Exam, Powder Free
and Latex Free,
N MUST be 6 mil OR

Greater, Color: §
Black, Sizes M - XXL,
100 Gloves/Box, 10
Boxes/Case, As
Specified, or Equal

62 Gloves, Latex CASE No Bid No Bid X
Housekeeping, Non-
Slip, 12" Length,
Universal Size, 12
Per Case, Yellow, As
Specified, or Equal

INMATE SUPPLIES

AdoptefLiMIPAK CORRIJRESBOR038 DOCUMENT REPORT
 Official gasopoR¥: | §83PPOMINAL SUPPLIES
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