Res-Pg:1.4-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey
Director Joseph H. Vicari

] ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn Tel: (732)929-2005
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea Fax: (732)505-1918
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: May 17, 2023 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER
PRODUCTS to Plastic Express, Inc. and Sharda Paper, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were
received on Iltem Nos. 3, 4, 6,7, 8, 9, 11, 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 22, 32, 37, 38, 39, 40, 45, 49, 59, 61, 65, 66, 68,
70,71,72,73,74,75,76, 81, 82, 83, 90, 91, 97, 100, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 118, 119, and 120. All no bid
items will be rebid. ltem No. 124 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2023-75)

Official Resolution# [2023000690
Meeting Date 05/17/2023
Introduced Date 05/17/2023
Adopted Date 05/17/2023
Agenda ltem I-4

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-75
Result Adopted
cowry —_ TaT, 81T, 2
COMMISSIONER z |2 :(é > g =
Vicari v v
Quinn v v v
Crea v v
Haines v v

Kelly v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michone \. Guetoor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:1.4-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VQUCHERS -

RESOLUTION

May 17, 2023

WHEREAS, on March 28, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of SPECIALTY PAPER AND
PAPER PRODUCTS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Plastic Express, Inc. Sharda Paper, Inc.

667 Lehigh Avenue 378 Troutman Street

Union, NJ 07083 Brooklyn, NY 11237

(718) 499-1119 Ext. 8201 (718) 628-4106 X 110

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance be accepted, namely that of PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. and
SHARDA PAPER, INC.

No bids were received for item Nos. 3,4, 6,7, 8,9, 11, 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 22,
32,37, 38, 39, 40, 45, 49, 59, 61, 65, 66, 68, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 81, 82, 83, 90, 91, 97,
100, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 118, 119 and 120. All no bid items will be rebid. Item No. 124
will be rebid to obtain additional vendors.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into a contract, accepting the bid for the furnishing and delivery of Specialty Paper and
Paper Products for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through
May 16, 2024, a period of one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated.
The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-

15 as follows:

Introduced ﬂk: May 17, 2023
Adopted on May 17, 2023
Official ResF ution#: 2023000690




Res-Pg:1.4-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 MAY 17,2023

A. PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. for nineteen (19) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 5, 10, 12, 17, 21, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 33, 41, 42, 60, 64, 67, 69, 96 and 124.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. SHARDA PAPER for fifty nine (59) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 19, 20, 23, 24, 25, 31, 34, 35, 36, 43, 44, 46, 47, 48, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55,
56,57, 58, 62,63,77,78, 79, 80, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 92, 93, 94, 95, 98, 99, 106, 107, 108,
109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 121, 122, 123 and 124.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities
shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-75.

4. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of
Finance, Clerk of the Board, Consumer Affairs, County Connection, Election Board,
Engineering, Juvenile Services, Parks Department, Planning Board, Printing and Graphic
Arts, Public Information, Roads, Solid Waste Management, Surrogate, Tax Board,
Transportation Department, Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

Introduced on: May 17, 2023
Adopted on: May 17, 2023
Official Resoluqion#: 2023000690




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ' PLASTIC EXPRESS,

Bid No. TBD ,
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

INC.

Res-Pg:1.4-4

Introdu

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost

43/4"%11",241b,,
Bright White #12
Envelopes with Left
Window, 2,500
Envelopes/Case

$129.78 $648.90

No Bid Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging:

Comments;

3 41/8"%X91/2", 10 Lb,, BX No Bid No Bid
Baronial lvory Linen
Envelopes, 500
Envelopes/Box

4 41/2"X 10 3/8", #11 CASE No Bid No Bid
Policy Envelopes, White,
2,500 Envelopes/Case

5 41/2"X103/8" #11 5 CASE $364.00 $1,820.00
Policy Envelopes, Pink,
2,500 Envelopes/Case

6 5"X111/2" #14, 24 b, CASE No Bid No Bid

Kraft Brown Interoffice
Envelopes, Printing on
Both Sides, 100
Envelopes/Case (See
Diagram in
Attachments)

7 51/4"X71/4", 24 b, BX No Bid No Bid
CH Heywood White
Envelopes - A7, 250 per
Box Envelopes

8 51/2"X71/2",281b,, BX No Bid No Bid
Brown Kraft Open '
Ended Envelopes, 100
Envelopes/Box

9 9" X 9" Blank Square CASE No Bid No Bid
Envelopes, 1,000
. Envelopes/Case
ed on: May 17, 2023

Officia RREIQRAMDSZADIERGD \EPORT

Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 6



' Res-Pg:1.4-5
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC.

Bid No.TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line [tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, A.R.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Commenits:

\/ ) 10 9" X 12" Tyvek Tamper 35 CASE $714A00
Indicating Envelopes,
500 Envelopes/Case

$24,990.00

11 91/2"X91/2" Square | CASE No Bid No Bid X
Envelopes, Printed on 2
Sides, 2 Colors
(Red/Black) on 1 Side, 1
Color (Black) on 1 Sides,
1,000 Envelopes/Case,
(See Diagram in
Attachments)

12 91/2"x121/2", 281b., 250 BX $118.58 $29,645.00
\/ Brown Kraft, 500
Envelopes/Box

13 10" X 10" Special CASE No Bid No Bid X
Window Square
Envelopes, Printed on 1
Side (Black), 1,000
Envelopes/Case (See
Diagram in
Attachments)

14 10"X13"X 11/2" ' CASE No Bid No Bid . X
Business Source Tyvek
Expansion Envelopes,
Document, Gusset, Peel
& Seal, White, 100
Envelopes/Case, BSN
42201, or Equal

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopte : 7
Official RECRGIR A DREIERS REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 7




, Res-Pqg:l.4-
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT | PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. es-Pg:1.4-6

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line ltem

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No 8id Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging:

15 111/2"X141/2", 28
~ Ib., Kraft Interoffice
Envelopes, 8 Holes with
String and Button Seal,
100 Envelopes/Case,
Printing on Both Sides
{See Diagram in
Attachments)

Comments:

16 175/8"x111/2"x 11 BDL No Bid No Bid X
7/16", Blank Cartons - ]
Brown Kraft Envelopes,
25 boxes/bundle

17 Specialty Envelopes 2,500 PKG $16.52 $41,300.00
\/ 1099 2-up and Laser

1095 Forms #DWMR: o]
Size: 5 5/8" x 97, Top )
Window Size: 33/8"x 1
1/8", Bottom Window
Size: 3 3/8"x17/16",
Top Position: 1/2" from
Left, 3 3/4" from
Bottom, Bottom
Position: 1/2" from Left,
1 1/2" from Bottom,
must have double
window for mailing tax
forms {1098, 1099,
etc.), gum-sealed, 100
Envelopes/Pack

SECTION |1 - LETTER SIZED CARDSTH OCK, COVER AND SPECIALTY PAPER

18 81/2"X 11", 1001b,, REAM No Bid ‘No Bid X
Classic Linen Cover
Paper, Avon White, 250
Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023 -
Adopted-on——May-17;-20623
OfficiaPRERMBHINDOL0IIIEOEBREPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 8




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. | | Res-Pg:1.4-7

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost - Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging:
19 81/2"x 11", 1001b., - |
Glossy Text Paper, 500

Sheets/Ream, 4
Reams/Case

Comments:

20 81/2"X 11" 100 lb., 10 CASE $125.41 $1,254.10
Lynx Cover White Paper,
200 Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

J 21 81/2"X11",1101b., 10 *REAM $16.90 $169.00
) Cardstock, Blue, 250
Sheets/Ream

22 81/2"x 11", ilO lb., REAM No Bid No Bid ’ X
Cardstock, Goldenrod, i
250 Sheets/Ream

2'3 ’ 81/2'X11", 110 Ib., REAM No Bid No Bid X
' Cardstock, Red, 250 ’
Sheets/Ream

24 81/2"x 11", 1101b., 250 REAM $14.92 $3,730.00
Cardstock, White, 250
Sheets/Ream

25 81/2"X 11" 1101b., REAM No Bid No Bid X
Domtar White Index,
250 Sheets/Ream

J 26 81/2"x 11", 1i01b., 20 REAM $16.90 $338.00
Index Paper, Various

Colors Including:

‘| Canary, Gray, Bright
White, lvory, Green,
Blue and Buff, 250
Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adoptedor; May 17,2023 —

OfficialRéLBRHOh YobAuioB3oREPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 9




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

PLASTIC EXPRESS,

INC.

Res-Pg:1.4-8

Line item

Description

81/2"x 11", 201b.,
Multipurpose Copy
Paper, Colors to include:
Blue, Pink, Buff,
Goldenrod, Canary,
lvory and Green, 500
Sheets/Ream

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost
$249.00

No Bid

Delivery, A.R.O.:

Mfr./Packaging:

Comments:

\/ 28

81/2"X 11", 24 b.,
Avon Brilliant White
Linen, 500 Sheets/Ream

45

REAM

$29.81

$1,341.45

\/ 29

81/2"X11",241b.,
Baronial Ivory Linen,
500 Sheets/Ream

10

REAM

$30.18

$301.80

30

81/2"X11" 241b,,
Premium Laser Paper,
Bright White, 500
Sheets/Ream

120

* REAM

$10.61

$1,273.20

31

81/2"x 11", 24 Ib.,
Classic Linen White
Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream

120

REAM

$10.68

$1,281.60

32

8§1/2"X 11", 24 1b.,
Domtar Colorlok White,
500 Sheets/Ream

REAM

No Bid

No Bid

J 33

81/2"X 11", 24 Ib., First
Choice Color Copy Laser
Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream

120

REAM

$9.80

$1,176.00

34

Introduted on:

81/2"X 11", 241b,,
Parchment Bond White
Light Cockle, 500
Sheets/Ream, 10

Reams/Case
May 17, 2023

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

O RO B0 DI IRaa EPORT

Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Page 10



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. . | Res-Pg:1.4-9

Bid No. TBD ,
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line [tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Total Cost

35 81/2"X 11" 24 1b,, " CASE " No Bid No Bid X
White Cover, 500
Sheets/Ream, 10

Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

Reams/Case

36 81/2"X11",281b,, REAM No Bid No Bid X
Finch Color Copy Cover, -
500 Sheets/Ream

37 81/2"x11",281b., PKG NoBid No Bid X

Hand Prints Left-Side
Border Paper,
Letterhead, Full Color
Design, One Sided, 100
Sheets/Package

38 81/2"x11", 28 1Ib., 3- BX No Bid No Bid X
Panel Hand Prints
Brochure, Full Color
Design, Two-Sided, 100
Sheets/Box

39 81/2"x 11" 381b., BX No Bid No Bid X
Hand Prints Border
Paper, Full Color Design,
100 Sheets/Box

40 81/2" X 11", 381Ib., 3- BX No Bid No Bid X
Panel Hand Prints
Brochure, Full Color
-Design, Two-Sided, 100
Sheets/Box

41 81/2"x 11", 60 lb., 100 REAM $12.66 $1,266.00
j Cardstock, White,

Glossy, 250
Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted-on——hMay-17,20623 :

Official 638256 h#E Q02 BetioBdoREPORT -
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 11




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-10

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost

Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

\/ : 81/2"X 11" 601b., 100 ' 41,834.00
Earth Choice HOTS
Lemon Text, 500
Sheets/Ream
43 81/2"X 11" 60b., Lynx 500 REAM $18.34 $9,170.00

Opaque Digital Smooth
Laser, White, 500
Sheets/Ream

44 81/2"x 11", 651b., 50 CASE $19.71 $985.50
Astroparche Cover
Paper in Blue, Natural,
Sage, and White, 250
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case *

45 81/2"x 11" 651b., CASE No Bid No Bid X
 Neenah Bright White
Cardstock, 250
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

46 81/2"x 11", 65Ib., . REAM No Bid No Bid X
Natural White, Smooth
Cover, Cougar, or Equal,
250 Sheets/Ream

47 81/2"X 11", 671b.,, 60 REAM $12.17 $730.20
Bright White Bristol
Vellum, 250
Sheets/Ream

48 81/2"X11",701b,, REAM No Bid No Bid X
Cream Paper, 500 ’
Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023
Adoptedon: May- 17,2023
OfficialFeBREOAD Qo EHuoHIOREPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 12




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-11

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, A.R.O.:  Mfr./Packaging:

Comments:

56 |81/2"x 11", 801b,, REAM No Bid
'Classic Ivory Crest, 250
Sheets/Ream
57 81/2"X11",801b., CASE No Bid No Bid X

Coated Glossy Cover
White Paper, 250
Sheets/Ream), 8

Reams/Case

58 81/2"X11",801b,, REAM No Bid No Bid X
Finch Color Copy Cover,
250 Sheets/Ream

59 81/2"X11",801b., REAM No Bid No Bid X

Neenah Classic Linen
Cover, Graystone

60 81/2"X11%,901b., 10 CASE $9,62 $96.20
J Index Cardstock, Blue,
250 Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case
61 81/2" X 11", Essay REAM No Bid . No Bid X

Paper, White Sulfate,
School Smart or equal,
500 Sheets/Ream

62 81/2" X 11", Kromekote ' REAM No Bid No Bid X
C1S, 10 pt.,, White, 200
Sheets/Ream

SECTION Il - LEGAL SIZED CARDSTOCK, SPECIALTY BUSINESS, COLOR, AND INDEX PAPER

63 81/2"X 14", 1101b., CASE No Bid No Bid X
White Index Paper, 250
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopt: . 1 : -

omaﬁi@ﬁ%ﬁéﬁ@%ﬁwom -
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 14




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. Res-Pg:1.4-12

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid

J 64'

Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Case

81/2"X 14", 201b,, Blue

150

CASE

$11.38

$1,707.00

Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

65

81/2"X 14", 201b.,
Cream Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

66

81/2"X 14", 201b,, Pink
Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

J e

81/2"X 14",201b.,
Southworth Red Ruled
Business Paper, 25%
Recycled Content, 500
Sheets/Box

50

BX

$47.57

$2,378.50

68

81/2"X 14" 201b.,
White Paper, 1,000

.Sheets/Case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

VG

81/2"X 14", 20 b,
Canary Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream

25

REAM

$11.38

$284.50

70

81/2"X 14", 241b.,
White Paper, 5,000
Sheets/Case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

71

81/2" X 14", 28 Ib,,
White Domtar Ledger,
500 Sheets/Ream

REAM

No Bid

No Bid

72

81/2"X 14" 60 b,,
Natural Parchment Text
Paper, 600
Sheets/Ream

REAM

No Bid

No Bid

Introduced on:

May 17, 2023

Official RSB RRBHD

{
GREPORT

Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Page 15



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. ReS'Pg:I'4'13

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

89 11" X 17", 100 Ib., Gloss

Cover, 750 Sheets/Case

90 11" X 17", 1101b.,, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Futura Gloss Text, 1500
Sheets/Case

91 11" X 17", 65 Ib., Lynx REAM No Bid No Bid X
White Cover, 250
Sheets/Ream

92 11" X 17", 60 1b., Blue CASE No Bid No Bid X
-| Paper, 2,500
Sheets/Case

93 11" X 17", 60 Ib., White REAM No Bid No Bid X
Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream

94 11"X 17", 1101b., 25 REAM $32.89 $822.25
White index, 250
Sheets/Ream

95 11" X 17%,1001b., CASE No Bid No Bid X
Futura Gloss Cover,
1,250 Sheets/Case

J 96 11"X 17", 24 1b., 126 ' REAM $§22.22 §2,799.72
Domtar First Choice
Laser Paper, White, 500
Sheets/Ream
97 11X 17", KromeKote REAM NoBid No Bid X

C1S Die Cut 4 Up 10
pt/8 Slits, White, Cut
Finishes to 8 1/2" X 11",
2 Out, 200 Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023
Adoptedom: May 17,2023

OfficiaPRERIARP S0 ENOREPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 18




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT N PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. | ” - Res-Pg:l.4-14

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:
118 36" X 100', Satin White . ROLL No Bid No Bid X
Wide Format Paper,
Sold by the Roll
119 - 36" X 100', White Wide ‘ ROLL I No Bid No Bid X
Format Glassy Rolls, 8
mit - ’ N

SECTION VIiI - BOXES; éHlPBQARD, TAG

120 8 1/2" X 14", Nekoosa REAM - No Bid No Bid X
U20, Manila Tag CF, 250 '
Sheets/Ream

121 81/2" X 22", ' PACK ’ No Bid No Bid X

EarthChoice Smooth L
Manila Tag, 100

Sheets/Pack
122 181/2" X 6", 125 ib., PACK - No Bid No Bid . X
: Manilla Tag, 100
Sheets/Pack
SECTION IX - MISCELLANEOUS -
123 8 1/2" X 14", White . PKG . No Bid . NoBid X

Laser Labels with Split
on Backside, 1,000
Sheets/Package

SECTION X - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltem Description Unit of Measure Percentage

Discount Percentage (%) for Specialty Paper and Paper Products (NOT LESS THAN), As Specified

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted-on: May-47-2023

Official RECORGIBAR:DIY2BI0EEYS REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 22



PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SHARDA PAPER o Res-Pg:1.4-15

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Documents (doc, docx, rtf, txt, xIs, xIsx, pdf)
Images (jpg, png, bmp, tif)

No response submitted

~ 8. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection.

Confirmed

9. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

SECTION | - ENVELOPES
\l 1 43/8"x53/4", 70 Lb,, 35 BX $38.75 $1,356.25
A2 Classic Linen, White,
250 Envelopes/Box
 Introduged on: May 17, 2023
Adopt

etdron—————May-172023
Official HRSBIRG#DBEA3bOBBEO REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 5



: Res-Pq:1.4-16
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SHARDA PAPER g

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Description

: 43/4"X 11", 24 Lb.,
\[ Bright White #12
Envelopes with Left
Window, 2,500
Envelopes/Case

Quantity Unit of Measure Total Cost

Line item No Bid

Unit Cost

Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

$404.25

3 41/8"X91/2",10 b, BX No Bid No Bid X
Baronial Ivory Linen
Envelopes, 500
‘| Envelopes/Box

4 41/2"X103/8", #11 CASE No Bid No Bid X
Policy Envelopes, White,
2,500 Envelopes/Case

5 41/2"X103/8", #11 CASE No Bid No Bid X
Policy Envelopes, Pink,
2,500 Envelopes/Case

6 5"X111/2", #14, 24 b, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Kraft Brown Interoffice
Envelopes, Printing on
Both Sides, 100
Envelopes/Case (See
Diagram in
Attachments)

7 51/4"X71/4" 24 1b, BX No Bid No Bid X
CH Heywood White .

Envelopes - A7, 250 per
Box Envelopes

8 51/2"X71/2",281b, BX No Bid No Bid X
Brown Kraft Open
Ended Envelopes, 100
Envelopes/Box

9 9" X 9" Blank Square CASE No Bid No Bid X
Envelopes, 1,000

Envelopes/Case
Introduded on: May 17, 2023

Adopted W

Official % M\%{PORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 6




| . Res-Pg:1.4-17
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SHARDA PAPER g

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost i Delivery, A.R.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

19 81/2"X 11" 100 Ib,, 4 CASE $96.00 $384.00
J ' Glossy Text Paper, 500

Sheets/Ream, 4
Reams/Case

20 81/2"X 11", 100 1b,, 10 CASE $97.35 $973.50

.\J Lynx Cover White Paper,
200 Sheets/Ream, 8

Reams/Case

21 81/2"X 11" 1101b,, . REAM No Bid No Bid X
| Cardstock, Blue, 250 ’
Sheets/Ream

22 ‘ 81/2"X 11" 1101b,, REAM No Bid : No Bid X
Cardstock, Goldenrod,
250 Sheets/Ream

23 81/2'x11",1101b., 25 REAM $18.00 $450.00
J . Cardstock, Red, 250
Sheets/Ream

24 . {81/2"X 11", 1101b., 250 REAM $12.95 $3,237.50
\/ , Cardstock, White, 250
Sheets/Ream

: 25 81/2"x 11", 1101b., 30 REAM $13.40 $402.00
-\/ Domtar White Index,
250 Sheets/Ream

26 81/2"x 11", 1101b,, - REAM No Bid No Bid X
Index Paper, Various
Colors Including:
Canary, Gray, Bright
White, lvory, Green,
Blue and Buff, 250
Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023
Adopte,
ot ESebaabhP S EPOFT
- SPECIALW PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 9




Res-Pg:1.4-18
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SHARDA PAPER

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Comments:

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging:

27 81/2"x11",201b., REAM No Bid No Bid X
Multipurpose Copy
Paper, Colors to include: |
Blue, Pink, Buff,
Goldenrod, Canary,
Ivory and Green, 500
Sheets/Ream

28 81/2"X 11", 24 Ib., 45 REAM $38.75 $1,743.75
Avon Brilliant White
Linen, 500 Sheets/Ream

29 81/2"x 11", 24 b, 10 REAM $38.75 $387.50
Baronial vory Linen,
500 Sheets/Ream

30 81/2"x 11", 24 Ib., 120 REAM $12.20 $1,464.00

Premium Laser Paper,
Bright White, 500
Sheets/Ream

31 81/2"X 11", 24 1b., 120 REAM $35.75 $4,290.00

\q Classic Linen White
Paper, 500

Sheets/Ream

32 81/2"X 11" 24 b, REAM No Bid No Bid X
Domtar Colorlok White,
500 Sheets/Ream

33 81/2"X 11", 24 1b., First 120 REAM $11.50 $1,380.00
Choice Color Copy Laser
Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream

34 81/2"X 11", 241b., 35 CASE $235.60 $8,246.00

\j Parchment Bond White
Light Cockle, 500

Sheets/Ream, 10

Reams/Case
Introduged on: May 17, 2023

Adopte‘ﬁg—‘—g T i

Official HEG BRSO O624bB68H0REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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JENT R ‘ Res-Pg:1.4-19
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ' SH_ARDA PAPER g

Bid No. TBD A
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line [tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

81/2"Xx 11" 24 1b., . . $110.35 $551.75
\/ White Cover, 500

Sheets/Ream, 10
Reams/Case

J 36 81/2"x 11", 281b., 100 REAM $12.65 $1,265.00
- Finch Color Copy Cover,
500 Sheets/Ream

37 81/2"Xx11",281b., PKG No Bid No Bid X
Hand Prints Left-Side
Border Paper,
Letterhead, Full Color
Design, One Sided, 100
Sheets/Package

38 8.1/2"X 11", 281b., 3- BX No Bid No Bid X
Panel Hand Prints ’
Brochure, Full Color
Design, Two-Sided, 100
Sheets/Box

39 81/2"X 11", 38 b, BX NoBd No Bid X
Hand Prints Border
Paper, Full Color Design,
100 Sheets/Box

40 81/2"x 11", 381b., 3- BX No Bid No Bid X
Panel Hand Prints
Brochure, Full Color
Design, Two-Sided, 100
Sheets/Box

41 81/2"x 11" 601b., REAM No Bid No Bid X
Cardstock, White,
Glossy, 250
Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023
Adopted @ROPOSAL MaCiMAORY REPORT

Offictal Resg' SRt AT PRBER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Page 11




Res-Pg:1.4-20
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SHARDA PAPER g

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line item

Description

81/2"X11% 601b.,
Earth Choice HOTS
Lemon Text, 500
Sheets/Ream

Quantity Delivery, A.R.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

Unit Cost

Unit of Measure

Total Cost

43 8 1/2" X 11", 601b., Lynx 500 REAM $10.25 $5,125.00
\/ Opaque Digital Smooth

Laser, White, 500
Sheets/Ream

44 81/2"x 11", 651b., 50 CASE $190.95 $9,547.50
\/ Astroparche Cover i

’ Paper in Blue, Natural,
Sage, and White, 250
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

45 81/2"X 11", 651b., CASE No Bid ) No Bid X
Neenah Bright White
Cardstock, 250
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

46 81/2"X 11", 65 Ib., 100 REAM $11.95 $1,195.00
- Natural White, Smooth :

Caver, Cougar, or Equal,
250 Sheets/Ream

47 81/2"X 11", 67 b, 60 REAM $8.30 $534.00
Bright White Bristol
Vellum, 250
Sheets/Ream

A

48 81/2"x11",701b,, 60 REAM $11.45 $687.00
Cream Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023
Adopted pRopOsAlL ESYURARRES REPORT

Offictal ReppISleEiat R PABER ano paPER PRODUCTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

SHARDA PAPER Res-Pg:1.4-21

Line Item

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, A.R.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

49 81/2"X 11", 701b,, CASE No Bid No Bid X
Earth Choice Opaque '
Grey Vellum, 500
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

50 81/2"X 11", 67 Ib., . 10 CASE $77.25 $772.50
\/ Domtar Earth Choice
Vellum, Blue, 250
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

S1 81/2"x 11", 67 Ib. 25 CASE $77.25 $1,931.25
J Domtar Earth Choice

: Vellum Bristol Cover -
Gray, 250 Sheets/Ream,
8 Reams/Case

52 81/2"X 11", 701b., 10 CASE $136.95 $1,369.50
Finch Opaque Smooth
White Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

53 81/2"X 11", 70 Ib,, Lynx 6 CASE $94.50 $567.00
- Opagque White, 500

Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

54 81/2"X11",701b., | 50 REAM $12.00 $600.00
Husky Opaque Offset,
Smooth White, 500
Sheets/Ream

oA S

( 55 81/2"X11",801b., 50 REAM $39.50 $1,975.00
Avon Classic Linen .
Cover Brilliant White
Paper, 250
Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adoptem———%y, 2023

Official RREROGESAY: b0690" REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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’ Res-Pg:1.4-22
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT | SHARDA PAPER g

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

81/2"x 11", 801b., 50 REAM $36.95 . $1,847.50
Classic Ivory Crest, 250
Sheets/Ream

57 81/2"X 11", 801!b., 5 CASE $88.95 , $444.75

Coated Glossy Cover
White Paper, 250
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

58 - 81/2"X11",801b., 50 REAM $12.65 $632.50
‘ Finch Color Copy Cover,
250 Sheets/Ream

59 81/2"X 11", 801b,, ~ REAM No Bid No Bid X
Neenah Classic Linen
Cover, Graystone

60 81/2"X 11" 901b., 10 CASE $86.50 $865.00
Index Cardstock, Blue,
250 Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case

61 81/2" X 11", Essay REAM No Bid No Bid X
Paper, White Sulfate,
School Smart or equal,
500 Sheets/Ream

62 8 1/2" X 11", Kromekote 100 REAM .$23.65 $2,365.00
J C1S, 10 pt., White, 200 '
Sheets/Ream

SECTION li - LEGAL SIZED CARDSTOCK, SPECIALTY BUSINESS, COLOR, AND INDEX PAPER

v

63 81/2"X 14", 1101b., 5 CASE . $169.50 $847.50
White Index Paper, 250
Sheets/Ream, 8
Reams/Case
Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted on-

offral FaBOLRSAk: DIESHEsT REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY-PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

SHARDA PAPER

Res-Pg:1.4-23

Line ltem

73

Description

81/2"X 14", 601b.,
Domtar Opaque Blue,
500 Sheets/Ream, 10
Reams/Case

Quantity

Unit of Measure

CASE

Unit Cost
No Bid

Total Cost
No Bid

No Bid

Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging:

Comments;

74

81/2"X 14", 701b.,
Classic Crest, Natural
White, 500
Sheets/Ream, 5
Reams/Case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

75

8'1/2" X 14", 701b.,
Rolland Laser, Hi-Tech,
True White 30, 500
Sheets/Ream, 4
Reams/Case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

76

81/2"X 14", 80b.,,
Accent Opaque Warm
White, Smooth, 250
Sheets/Ream

REAM

No Bid

No Bid

SECTION IV - OVERSIZED CARDSTOCK, SPECIA

LTY BUSINESS, COLOR AND INDEX PAPE

77

81/2"x 17", 201b., Blue
Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Case

100

CASE

$45.00

$4,500.00

81/2"X 17*, 20 lb., Pink
Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Case

100

CASE

$45.00

$4,500.00

79

81/2"X 17", 201b.,
White Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Case

150

CASE

$30.00

$4,500.00

U

Introduced on:

Adopted’

Official

RESHRDBDAY:

81/2"x17", 801b.,
Opaque Text, Smooth
Finish, 96 Brightness,

May WOZ%%ets/Ream

SO0.5

1,000

REAM

$45.00

$45,000.00

siotiasg REPORT

Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

'SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

SHARDA PAPER

Res-Pg:1.4-24

Line ltem

Description

9"x 15 1/2", 60 lb.,
Domtar EarthChoice
HQOTS, Vellum,
Periwinkle, 500
Sheets/Ream, 10
Reams/Case

Quantity

U}1it of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging:

Comments:

82

9" X 15 1/2",601b.,

Periwinkle HOTS Text
Paper, 200 Sheets/Box

BX

No-Bid

No Bid

83

19"X 15", 601b.,

Astrobright Celestial
Blue Paper, 1,000
Sheets/Package

PKG

No Bid

No Bid

J

11"X 17", 67 Ib., Bright
White Bristol Vellum,
250 Sheets/Ream

25

REAM

$18.85

$471.25

85

11" X 17", 67 Ib,,
Domtar Earth Choice
Vellum Bristol Cover,
Blue, 250 Sheets/Ream,
4 Reams/Case

10

CASE

$82.25

$822.50

JI

11 x 17 Domtar Earth
Choice Vellum Bristol

‘Cover, 67b - Gray, 250

Sheets/Ream, 4
Reams/Case

10

CASE

$82.25

$822.50

\/ 87'

11" X 17", 70 b., Lynx
Opague White, 500
Sheets/Ream

25

REAM

$26.70

$667.50

Vs

Introduc
Adopted on:

11"X 17", 70 lb., Husky
Opagque White, 500
Sheets/Ream

47 0922

L

25

REAM

$25.30

$632.50 -

a

T Z0z0

May 17, 2023

Official Rreyp@imm DEA2BA0E REPORT

Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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Res-Pg:1.4-25
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SHARDA PAPER es-Pg

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:
\/ 89 111" x 17", 100 Ib., Gloss 10 $50.65 $506.50 » ‘
Cover, 750 Sheets/Case

90 11"X 17", 1101b., CASE No Bid No Bid X
Futura Gloss Text, 1500
Sheets/Case

91 11" X 17", 65 b, Lynx REAM No Bid No Bid X
White Cover, 250 .
Sheets/Ream

92 11" X 17", 60b., Blue 15 CASE $109.60 $1,644.00
Paper, 2,500
Sheets/Case

93 11" X 17", 60 Ib., White 25 REAM $18.10 $452.50
Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream

94 11"X17%,1101b,, 25 REAM $25.00 ' $625.00
White Index, 250
Sheets/Ream

95 11" X 17", 100 Ib., 10 CASE $48.90 ‘$489.00
Futura Gloss Cover,
1,250 Sheets/Case

A A A

96 11" X 17", 24 1b., 126 REAM $23.50 - $2,961.00
Domtar First Choice
Laser Paper, White, 500
Sheets/Ream

97 11" X 17", KromeKote - REAM No Bid No Bid X
C1S Die Cut 4 Up 10
pt/8 Slits, White, Cut
Finishes to 8 1/2" X 11",
2 Out, 200 Sheets/Ream

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adopted 0p;

Offictal RaSEIBESH: SoRs000Ed0" REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND.PAPER PRODUCTS
Page 18




PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS-

SHARDA PAPER

Res-Pg:1.4-26

Line ltem

98

Description

12"x12",801b.,
ColorMates Smooth &
Silky Black Card Stock,

125 per package

Quantity
15

Unit of Measure

PKG

Unit Cast
$56.00

Total Cost
$840.00

Delivery, AR.O.:

Mfr./Packaging:

Comments:

99

12"X 12", 801b.,
ColorMates Smooth &
Stlky Slate Card Stock,
25 per package

15

PKG

$56.00

$840.00

100

12" X 12", 1101b,,
Cardstack, Eclipse Black,
Sold by the Case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

101

121/2"x 19", 701b.,
Opaque Smoath Paper,
1000 Sheets/Case

CASE

No Bid

No Bid

SECTION V - CERTIFICATE PAPER

102

81/2"x 11", 281b.,
Certificate Paper,
Parchment Cincture
Standard, Full Color
Various Styles, 50
Sheets/Box

BX -

No Bid

No Bid

103

81/2"x 11", 38 b.,
Certificate Paper with
Gold Foil, Full Color, 50
Sheets/Box

BX

No Bid

No Bid

104

81/2"x11",381b.,,
Certificate Paper,
Sienna, 50 Sheets/Box

BX

No Bid

No Bid

105

Introduc Ld on: May

Adoptedion: a

81/2" X 11", Certificate
Paper, Gold Serpentine
Border, GEO-44407, or
ErpiadobyPack -

2023

PKG

No Bid

No Bid

Official Regohtjont#:CRI2SAWSAA REPORT

Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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Res-Pg:1.4-27
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SHARDA PAPER g

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line ftem

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

106 8 1/2" X 11", Certificate 50 PKG . $26.95 $1,347.50

\/ Paper, 441 Series GOES,
"Monarch”, Various

Sheet and Border

Colors, 100
Sheets/Package

107 8 1/2" X 11", Certificate 60 PKG $26.95 $1,617.00
Paper, 441 Seriés GOES,
\/ “Golden Monarch",
Various Sheet and
Border Colors, 100
Sheets/Package

Paper, 441 Series GOES,
"Laser Safe", 100
Sheets/Package

\/ 108 81/2" X 11", Certificate 35 PKG $26.95 $943.25

109 81/2" X 11", Certificate 75 PKG T $26.85 $2,021.25
' J Paper, 441 Series GOES,
| "Canary-Black", 100
Sheets/Package

SECTION VI - NCR PAPER

[ 110 81/2" X 11", 80 GSM, 2- 25 CASE $143.65 © $3,591.25
\/ Part Reverse,
Canary/White, NCR
Paper, Pre-Collated,
2,500 Sets/Case; Brand:

Nekoosa, NO
|SUBSTITUTIONS

Introduced on: May 17, 2023

Adoptedon: May-172623

Official FE@&RI&%#:D@QJMOP REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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‘ Res-Pg:1.4-28
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT SHARDA PAPER .

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line Item

Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Quantity Total Cost No 8id Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging: Comments:

| 81/2" X 11", 80 GSM, 3- $161.85 $4,855.50
.
\/ Part Reverse,
. | Pink/Canary/White, NCR
Paper, Pre-Collated,
1,670 Sets/Case; Brand:

Nekoosa, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

112 81/2"X 11", 80 GSM, 4- 25 CASE $172.90 $4,322.50

Part Reverse,
\/ Goldenrod/Pink/Canary/

White, NCR Paper, Pre--
Collated, 1,250
Sets/Case; Brand:
Nekoosa, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

113 81/2" X 14", 3-Part, 10 CASE . $206.00 $2,060.00
\/ Pink/White/Canary, Pre- .

Collated, 1,670
Sets/Case

114 81/2" X 14", Nekoosa 15 REAM $18.00 $270.00
U20, Blue Carbonless CB
Paper, 500
Sheets/Ream

115 81/2" X 14", Nekoosa 15 REAM $21.50 $322.50
\/ U20, White Carbonless
CF8, 500 Sheets/Ream

116 8 1/2" X 14", Nekoosa 15 REAM $21.50 $322.50
\/ ) U20, Pink Carbonless
CFB, 500 Sheets/Ream

SECTION VIl - MAP; WIDE FORMAT, AND THERMAL PAPER

117 36" X 500', 20 1b,, 3" 15 CTN $91.00 $1,365.00
\/ Core Map Paper, 2
lntroduged on: Ma f%ﬁ?n
Adopted-on 72023

Official RReYNDIEMH DRAZS0AEIPP REPORT
Bid - SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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' ' Res-Pg:1.4-29
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT , SHARDA PAPER | g

Bid No. TBD
SPECIALTY PAPER AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Delivery, AR.O.:  Mfr./Packaging:

36" X 100', Satin White
Wide Format Paper,
Sold by the Roll

Comments:

119 36" X 100", White Wide ROLL No Bid ‘ No Bid X
Format Glassy Rolls, 8
mil

SECTION VIl - BOXES, CHIPBOARD, TAG

120 81/2" X 14", Nekoosa ' REAM No Bid No Bid X
U20, Manila Tag CF, 250
Sheets/Ream

EarthChoice Smooth L
Manila Tag, 100
Sheets/Pack

\/ T121 81/2"X 22", 5 PACK $150.00 - $750.00

122 181/2"X6", 125 b, 5 PACK $150.00 $750.00
Manilla Tag, 100
Sheets/Pack

'SECTION IX - MISCELLANEOUS  °

\/ 123 81/2" X 14", White 10 PKG $189.62 $1,896.20
Laser Labels with Split

on Backside, 1,000
Sheets/Package

SECTION X - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line ltem Description Unit of Measure Percentage

Discount Percentage (%) for Specialty Paper and Paper Products (NOT LESS THAN), As Specified

Introduced on: May 17, 2023
Adopted pROPOSAL MBZURVREAEP REPORT
Official Rgselutippt; JO%M0ERR AND PAPER PRODUCTS
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